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Shaw's life: a feminist i n spite of himself

By hi s seventiet h birthday , Bernar d Sha w wa s on e o f th e mos t famou s
people in the world. Yet despite intense scrutiny, perhaps no other figure of
his stature an d visibilit y ha s been s o thoroughly misunderstood . The only
Nobel laureat e als o t o wi n a n Academ y Awar d (fo r th e screenpla y o f
Pygmalion), h e wa s recognize d a s muc h fo r hi s wi t an d hi s eccentri c
personality as for hi s writings. Certainly the celebrity made unfailing goo d
copy as he voiced opinions on everything from European dictators to child-
raising. But for too long he insisted on caricaturing himself a s a clown and
buffoon. Lat e in life, he lamented tha t h e had been al l too persuasive, the
overexposed G . B. S. figure trivializing views of both man and artist. Then,
too, there had always been an undercurrent of antagonism toward the self-
proclaimed geniu s wh o insiste d o n th e satirist' s righ t t o skewe r societa l
foibles - tha t insistence marked him as guilty of a disconcerting detachment
from th e mas s o f hi s fello w huma n being s accordin g t o hi s detractors , a
detachment noticeable in the personal sphere as well.

In addition t o hi s ow n par t i n misleadin g critic s an d would-b e biogra -
phers, Shaw managed to elude attempts to understand him simply because
of the enormity of the task. Not only was he the author of some five dozen
plays, his mountain of writings includes five completed novels, a number of
short stories , lengthy treatises o n politics an d economics , four volume s of
theatre criticism , thre e volume s o f musi c criticism , an d a  volum e o f ar t
criticism. Ad d t o tha t tota l wel l ove r a  hundre d boo k review s an d a n
astonishing correspondenc e o f ove r a  quarte r o f a  millio n letter s an d
postcards.

Then ther e wa s th e shee r lengt h o f th e life . G . K . Chesterton' s George
Bernard Shaw preceded hi s subject' s deat h b y a ful l fort y years . As Shaw
steadfastly outlive d hi s contemporaries , h e noisil y calle d attentio n t o hi s
facades, whil e quietl y destroyin g correspondence s an d prevailin g ove r
biographers. Alway s needin g t o control , wher e hi s biograph y wa s con -
cerned, Shaw was obsessive, coercing, directing, managing. Both Archibald
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Henderson, Nort h Carolinia n mathematicia n an d three-tim e authorize d
biographer, and Hesketh Pearson, a long-time friend, more or less willingly
submitted. Afte r th e deat h o f Fran k Harris , Sha w earne d th e widow' s
gratitude b y completing hi s own biography , admittedly "quit e the oddest "
task o f hi s life (Harris , Bernard Shaw, p. 419). When American professo r
Thomas Demetriu s O'Bolge r prove d bot h independen t an d curious , Shaw
blocked publicatio n o f O'Bolger' s work . Althoug h Sha w mad e clea r tha t
his early life was less than idyllic, not until after hi s death did much darker
intimations o f famil y lif e appea r -  i n the works o f St . John Ervine , B. C.
Rosset, and John O'Donovan .

A wealth o f informatio n abou t Shaw' s lif e i s no w available . Da n H .
Laurence ha s edite d th e massiv e four-volum e Collected  Letters,  whil e
individual collection s abound . Ther e ar e correspondence s t o admirin g
women suc h a s Florenc e Farr , Elle n Terry , Mrs . Patric k Campbell , an d
Molly Tompkins; and t o men such as Frank Harris , Lord Alfred Douglas ,
German translato r Siegfrie d Trebitsch , an d actor-playwrigh t Harle y
Granville Barker . Currently , a n ongoin g ten-volum e projec t include s th e
correspondences with H. G . Wells, with film producer Gabrie l Pascal , and
with Fabian Socialists Sidney and Beatrice Webb. Shaw's diaries, edited by
Stanley Weintraub, cover the period of 1885-97 , the two volumes offerin g
a snapsho t o f Shaw's activities , rather tha n a  journal o f intimate thought s
and feelings.

A plethor a o f reminiscence s an d memoir s aboun d -  everyon e fro m
Shaw's cook, secretary, and neighbors to the famous and once famous have
recorded glimpse s o f th e man . Seriou s biographica l studie s includ e th e
thoughtful analysi s o f critic William Irvine , now a half centur y old . More
recently biographe r Margo t Peter s has spotlighted th e actresse s i n Shaw' s
life, weavin g a  richl y detaile d narrative . I n anothe r vein , bot h Danie l
Dervin and Arnold Silve r have invoked Freudian analysis to explain Shaw,
Dervin citin g unresolve d Oedipa l feeling s an d narcissism , Silve r findin g
"homicidal tendencies. " Michae l Holroyd , meanwhile , ha s followe d th e
interpretations of previous biographers, disappointing scholars.

Although man y brigh t Iris h Protestan t boy s endure d difficul t circum -
stances, i t was the relatively unknow n Bernar d Sha w who in 188 9 loudl y
proclaimed: "My business is to incarnate the Zeitgeist" (Collected  Letters,
vol. I , p . 222). Certainl y n o othe r playwrigh t ha s exercise d exactl y hi s
influence o n society . Ho w di d Sha w circumven t th e fat e tha t seeme d t o
have decreed that he live and die a clerk in Dublin?

Exploring th e man y contradiction s Sha w presente d reveal s anothe r
Shaw, hi s rea l natur e intimatel y bu t disjunctivel y connecte d wit h hi s art .
Far more enigmatic and complex than the fabricated G.B.S . image, the real
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Shaw was a  man whose relation to the feminine -  i n himself an d other s -
hailed fro m a  highl y extravagan t inne r life . A s h e struggle d heroicall y
against his own ambivalences, the artist emerged triumphant. Nurtured too
in suc h ric h soi l was Shaw the feminist , no t onl y b y the standard s o f the
nineteenth century bu t also by today's criteria a s we approach the twenty-
first century. What was the nature o f the man that elude d detectio n fo r so
long?1

Bernard Sha w was born in Dublin on July 26 , 1856 , the third child and
first son of Lucinda Elizabeth Gurl y Shaw (Bessie) and George Carr Shaw.
As a member o f the much resented Protestan t ascendancy , the Shaws laid
claim t o a  relativel y hig h run g o n th e ladde r o f prestige . Bessie , th e
motherless daughter of a country gentleman, displeased both her father and
her ver y prope r aun t whe n sh e married a  matrimonia l adventure r nearl y
twice he r age . Georg e Car r Shaw , a  civi l cler k turne d wholesal e cor n
merchant, boaste d o f hi s kinshi p t o a  baronet . Bu t th e famil y ha d mor e
pretensions than money . "I was a downstart an d the son of a  downstart, "
wailed Sha w (Prefac e t o Immaturity,  p . x).2 Yet he held t o th e unverifie d
research o f Alexande r Macintos h Sha w tha t th e Shaw s wer e descende d
from Macduff, slayer of Macbeth: "It was as good as being descended fro m
Shakespear, who m I  had unconsciousl y resolve d t o reincarnat e fro m m y
cradle" (p . xii). Indeed Sha w spen t a  lifetim e i n rivalr y wit h hi s literar y
"father," fashionin g a  dialogu e wit h hi s powerfu l precurso r tha t extend s
through th e puppe t pla y Shakes  versus Shav, written th e yea r befor e hi s
death.

Behind th e Sha w famil y fagad e o f snobber y an d pretens e lurke d th e
reality o f dail y humiliations incurre d b y both parents . George Car r Sha w
boasted of his teetotalism but slipped away to drink in solitary and morose
fashion. Hi s embarrassing alcoholis m le d to the family' s banishmen t fro m
the hom e o f th e baronet , Si r Rober t Sha w o f Bush y Park . Eve n mor e
portentously for the young Shaw, the drunken father trie d to throw his son
into a  canal . The sudde n terrible recognitio n o f hi s father' s fallibilit y wa s
aggravated b y Bessi e Shaw' s response : contemp t fo r he r husban d an d a
refusal t o comfort her young son. The man claimed to be marked for life by
that disillusionin g incident . Quit e earl y th e bo y learne d tha t hi s father' s
drunkenness ha d to be "either a  family traged y o r a  family joke, " thereby
embracing a polarized approach to life (Preface to Immaturity, p. xxvi).

Bessie Sha w offere d he r ow n humiliations . Fo r sh e defie d th e Sha w
family cree d b y singin g i n Roma n Catholi c churche s an d entertainin g
Catholic musicians in her home. Even more devastating for her son was the
menage a trois  formed wit h he r voic e teacher , Georg e J . Vandeleu r Lee ,
who moved in with the family when Shaw was ten, and soon arranged fo r
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them all to share a cottage in rural Dalkey, outside Dublin. Although Shaw
insisted tha t i t wa s a n innocen t arrangement , hi s preoccupatio n wit h hi s
mother's virtue suggests that he feared otherwise . Meanwhile the influenc e
of the mesmeric Lee on Shaw proved profound an d lifelong.

Late i n lif e Sha w claime d t o revea l " a secre t kep t fo r 8 0 years" : th e
shame h e endure d i n attendin g th e Centra l Mode l Boys ' Schoo l wit h th e
sons of Catholic tradesmen (Sixteen  Self Sketches, p. 20). As a result he was
ostracized b y the sons of Protestant gentlemen . In recalling his shame and
schoolboy difficulties , Sha w omits a crucial piece of information -  tha t he
was subjecte d t o taunt s becaus e o f a  highl y visibl e effeminacy . Tha t
effeminacy wa s th e reaso n h e wa s late r chose n t o pla y Opheli a i n a
production o f Hamlet  a t th e Dubli n Englis h Scientifi c an d Commercia l
Day School.

Although there was always money for alcohol, George Carr Shaw had no
money t o give his son a  university educatio n an d Sha w never forgav e hi s
father fo r sending him to work at age fifteen. Becoming an ill-paid clerk for
a lan d agenc y wa s on e o f th e fe w acceptabl e form s o f employmen t fo r a
gentleman's son ; the lucrativ e retai l trad e wa s contemptuously dismissed .
Despite himself , th e adolescen t Sha w prove d s o competen t tha t afte r th e
cashier absconde d wit h offic e fund s th e youn g stopga p lande d th e job .
Later transferre d t o mak e roo m fo r hi s employer' s nephew , th e incense d
Shaw claime d h e ha d resigne d t o follo w hi s self-perceive d destin y a s
Shakespeare's heir; "For London as London, or England as England, I cared
nothing. I f my subject ha d bee n science o r musi c I  should hav e made fo r
Berlin o r Leipsic . If painting,  I  should hav e made fo r Pari s . . . Bu t as the
English languag e was my weapon, ther e was nothing fo r i t bu t London. "
(Preface to Immaturity, p. xxxviii).

There was another incentiv e for Sha w to leave his native land - reunio n
with his mother. For three years earlier Bessie Shaw had abandoned her son
and husband to follow Lee to London. She took her eldest daughter Agnes,
and sent for daughter Lucinda Frances (Lucy). Shaw arrived in England just
a fe w day s afte r Agne s ha d die d fro m consumption , movin g i n wit h hi s
mother and sister. Bessie was teaching singing and Lucy was trying to make
a career singing in opera bouffe. Both women rebelled against their gender-
defined role s an d wer e crucia l i n Shaw' s sympath y wit h th e pligh t o f th e
independent woman. But it was his mother's assertion of female power and
her defianc e o f assigne d femal e role s concernin g sexuality , respectability ,
and career fulfillment tha t most affected Shaw . When Lee began forcing his
attentions o n Lucy , Bessie took th e "Method, " hi s yoga-like approac h t o
teaching voice , and se t u p sho p herself . I t was a  more radica l mov e tha n
that o f Eliz a i n Pygmalion  (anothe r Elizabeth ) wh o onl y threatene d t o
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appropriate Higgins' s metho d o f voic e articulation . I n Pygmalion,  Shaw
explores the intersection of male artistic creation and female self-creation .

During th e nex t nin e years , Sha w contribute d virtuall y nothin g t o hi s
own support, although he made desultory and mostly abortive attempts at
finding employment. His first meager pay came from actin g as ghostwriter
for Lee . His brief buzzing s as a weekly pseudonymous musi c critic for th e
soon defunc t Hornet  woul d evolv e int o th e sparklin g witticism s an d
musical perceptions of "Corneto di Bassetto" for The  Star and of G.B.S. for
The World;  his musi c criticis m woul d culminat e wit h The  Perfect  Wag-
nerite (1898), his reading of Wagner's Ring. He became a book reviewer for
the Pall  Mall  Gazette  (1885-88 ) an d a n ar t criti c fo r The  World
(1886-90). He also established himsel f a s a theatre critic , being seemingly
omnipresent i n tha t capacit y durin g a  stin t fo r th e Saturday  Review
(1895-98).

In 1880 , the budding critic had not hesitated to launch an attack on the
powerful an d preeminent actor-manager Henr y Irving for hi s "mutilation"
of Shakespear e ( a them e Sha w woul d continuall y retur n t o eve n a s h e
denounced "Bardolatry, " unconditiona l admiratio n o f th e Bard) . His las t
piece of dramatic criticism would be a May 1950 defense of his own drama
of idea s agains t a n attac k b y playwright Terenc e Rattigan . Th e nonagen -
arian drov e hom e th e point : "m y play s ar e al l talk , jus t a s Raphael' s
pictures ar e al l paint , Michae l Angelo' s statue s al l marble , Beethoven' s
symphonies all noise" {The Drama Observed, vol. IV, p. 1524). Meanwhile,
in th e intervenin g seve n decades , Sha w produce d som e fifteen  hundre d
pages o f vigorou s prose , peppere d wit h classical , literary , an d biblica l
allusions. Not content merely to review, he campaigned for his vision of the
theatre an d proselytized fo r hi s theories o f art ; he offered practica l advic e
on stag e techniqu e an d acting , celebrate d th e intensit y o f puppets , an d
analyzed th e relatio n o f th e cinem a t o th e theatre . Hi s piece s ar e s o
interlaced wit h provocativ e commentar y o n social , moral , an d artisti c
issues that they offer a  lens into the very fabric o f his society - everythin g
from die t t o th e pena l code . I n variou s guises , h e ponder s male/femal e
relations in a restrictive society: "I cannot for the life of me see why it is less
dishonorable for a woman to kiss and tell than a man"; and "Can any sane
person den y tha t a  contrac t 'fo r better , fo r worse ' destroy s al l mora l
responsiblity?" Marrie d peopl e shoul d b e "a s responsibl e fo r thei r goo d
behavior to on e another a s business partners are " (The  Drama Observed,
vol. II, p. 629; vol. Ill, p. 1036) . Outfitted wit h soun d judgment , discrimi -
nating taste , an d a n unfailin g wit , Sha w produce d th e finest  bod y o f
dramatic criticism since William Hazlitt.

But before th e mature journalis t an d criti c emerged ther e was a time of
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apprenticeship. H e spen t hi s day s a t th e Britis h Museu m Readin g Roo m
learning his craft. Hi s evenings were occupied with the myriad societies he
joined - debatin g societies , literary societies , political societies . Already he
had se t himsel f t o th e tas k tha t woul d occup y hi m fo r mor e tha n seve n
decades: fashionin g himsel f int o politica l an d socia l activist , cultura l
commentator and satirist, playwright and prophet.

Shaw's developmen t a s a  playwrigh t canno t b e understood apar t fro m
his socialism, a  cause for whic h he labored fo r mor e than sixty-fiv e years .
One Septembe r evenin g i n 1882 , h e hear d th e America n orato r Henr y
George spea k o n lan d nationalizatio n an d th e importanc e o f economic s
suddenly flashed  o n him . A  fe w month s later , afte r strugglin g wit h th e
French translation of the first volume of Capital,  he underwent a "complete
conversion" t o Mar x (Sixteen  Self Sketches,  p . 58) . Shaw, who fel t com -
pelled t o polariz e life' s possibilities , foun d Marx' s dialecti c o f histor y
psychologically appealing . Now wit h a  mission i n life , Sha w brough t th e
gospel o f Mar x t o the people , speaking i n street s an d parks , i n hall s and
drawing rooms . Lik e hi s her o Sidne y Trefusi s i n An  Unsocial  Socialist
(1883), his fifth novel, written during this time, Shaw saw his calling as that
of "saviour of mankind" (Collected Works, vol. v, p. no) .

The flirtation  wit h Mar x wa s brief . I n May , 1884 , intrigue d b y th e
pamphlet Why  are the Many Poor? he turned up at a meeting of the newly
formed Fabia n Society . Th e nam e wa s derive d fro m th e Roma n genera l
Fabius Cunctator, for the Fabians were attracted to what was believed to be
his battl e strateg y agains t invadin g Carthaginia n genera l Hannibal . Th e
Fabian credo declared: "For the right moment you must wait, as Fabius did
most patiently, when warring against Hannibal, though many censured his
delays, but when the time comes , you mus t strik e hard , a s Fabius did , o r
your waiting will be in vain, and fruitless. "

As th e socialis t group  struggle d t o defin e itsel f an d t o reconcil e it s
visionary an d practica l elements , Sha w contribute d A  Manifesto,  Fabia n
Tract no . 2 , whic h wittil y declare d tha t "Me n n o longe r nee d specia l
political privilege s t o protec t the m agains t Women , an d tha t th e sexe s
should henceforth enjo y equa l political rights." Thanks to Shaw, the equal
rights o f wome n wer e firmly  established a s a  Fabia n principl e fro m th e
outset. Meanwhile the pamphleteer was in his glory as he turned ou t trac t
after tract on socialism.

Believing tha t huma n natur e i s "onl y th e ra w materia l whic h Societ y
manufactures int o the finished rascal or the finished fellowman" (The  Road
to Equality,  p . 96), Sha w collaborate d wit h staunc h Fabia n friend s lik e
Sidney Webb, Sydney Olivier, and Graham Wallas ("the Three Musketeers
&C D'Artagnan") to forge a better society (Collected Letters, vol. 11, p. 490).
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Everywhere h e preache d tha t huma n potentia l wa s bein g stymie d an d
depraved by inequality. Challenged by hecklers or socialists of other stripes,
the accomplishe d platfor m speake r demolishe d th e oppositio n wit h hi s
devastating wit.

Although devote d t o socialism , Sha w was n o Utopian , on e o f th e fou r
chief strain s o f socialis t though t i n th e nineteet h century , alon g wit h th e
Fabian, Marxist , an d Christia n Socialist . Unlik e artist-poet-socialis t
William Morris , Sha w feare d a  "catastrophi c polic y fo r simultaneousl y
destroying existin g institution s an d replacin g the m wit h a  ready-mad e
Utopia" (Road,  p. 31) . He sough t a  revolution tha t woul d b e "gradua l i n
its operation " (Road,  p . 35) . Th e Fabia n polic y o f "permeation, " o f
infiltrating ke y organizations , fit s perfectl y wit h hi s psychological nee d t o
overturn the status quo covertly.

As a critic and platform speaker , Shaw was now a highly visible figure in
Victorian London . Fou r o f th e fiv e novel s h e had produce d methodicall y
during days spent a t the British Museum Reading Room were serialized in
little magazines. Cash el Byron's Profession, hi s fourth nove l (1883) , based
on his own acquaintance with the boxing ring, was also published i n book
form, an d t o som e popula r acclaim . I n 1901 , to protec t th e nove l fro m
theatrical piracy , h e transforme d i t int o a  play himself . Written i n blan k
verse i n on e week , i t emerge d a s The  Admirable Bashville.  However, th e
satiric vie w o f Victoria n moralit y an d sentimentalit y tha t characterize d
the novels doome d th e autho r t o remai n essentiall y unsuccessfu l a s a
novelist.

The novels , al l autobiographicall y revealing , documen t Shaw' s earl y
feminist sympathies . I n th e conclusio n o f Immaturity,  Harrie t Russel l
advises Shaw's hero, the jejune Rober t Smith , that marriag e i s "not fi t fo r
some people; and som e people ar e not fi t fo r it " (Collected  Works, vol . 1,
p. 437) . Shaw explores that view further i n The Irrational Knot, the title a
reference to the matrimonial knot. The pregnant Marian Conolly has had a
romance, left he r husband, and refuses t o return even after h e tells her she
"may have ten romances every year with othe r men.. . B e anything rathe r
than a  ladylike slave and liar" (Collected  Works, vol. II, p. 349) . Similarly
Love Among  the  Artists  praise s unconventiona l wome n wh o plac e thei r
professional identitie s before domesticity . Cash el Byron's Profession wittily
overturns cultura l stereotype s o n tw o fronts : Cashel , boxin g champio n
supreme an d Shaw' s firs t vita l genius , cheerfull y give s u p hi s caree r t o
marry Lydia Carew, who claims she wants him for eugeni c purposes -  her
intellect and his physique. In An Unsocial  Socialist, Shaw playfully satirize s
his hero as a political firebrand who , at novel' s end, has met hi s match in
the down-to-earth woman who will marry him and tame him. Throughout
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the novels , Shavia n barb s ar e aime d a t Victoria n hypocris y surroundin g
love and marriage.

Shaw's growt h a s a  write r durin g hi s apprenticeshi p perio d wa s paral -
leled by the crafting o f the persona eventually known as G.B.S. Part of that
persona involved an array of seemingly idiosyncratic personal interests and
habits. Probing them uncovers a psychological minefield .

Shaw's conversio n t o vegetarianis m i n 188 1 wa s mor e tha n a  trend y
cheap alternative to the badly boiled eggs he ate at home. His most famous
pronouncement wa s t o a  packe d meetin g o f th e newl y forme d Shelle y
Society where he trumpeted tha t he was, like Shelley, "a Socialist , Atheist ,
and Vegetarian " (Sixteen  Self  Sketches,  p . 58). I t wa s no t mer e show -
manship becaus e fo r Sha w vegetarianis m ha d link s t o th e artistic , th e
political, an d th e religious . Not onl y di d i t fue l hi s great energy , vegetar -
ianism was necessary in his quest for "fragility " (Collected  Letters, vol. II,
p. 27) . Fightin g hi s appetit e an d watchin g hi s weigh t scrupulously , h e
attacked meat-eatin g a s a  for m o f cannibalism ; i t wa s repugnan t t o hi s
nature -  th e highe r nature . H e investe d foo d an d eatin g wit h ritualisti c
meaning, embracing vegetarianism the way saints embrace vigils and fasts .
Avoiding alcohol , tea,  an d coffee , feastin g o n wheatmea l porridg e an d
lentils, h e becam e a  missionar y whos e cree d wa s celebrate d wit h barle y
water.

He longed, like his Don Juan, to escape the tyranny of the flesh with its
eternal counter-pul l t o th e ran k crawlin g undergroun d worl d o f weasels ,
stoats, and worms that made him shudder, the stupid "force s o f Death and
Degeneration" (Collected  Plays, vol. II , p. 661). From th e mir e o f suc h a
dread worl d aros e his militant antivivisectionism . Sha w explicitly equate d
experiments o n animal s wit h thos e o n huma n beings . Th e butche r use s
animal bodies as an end, the vivisectionist as a means, and both kill animals
in th e servic e o f huma n desires . Shaw' s seemin g high-minde d stan d ma y
have issue d fro m a  burie d fea r tha t th e han d tha t smot e the rabbi t coul d
well smite him. In his outrage a t vivisection, Shaw never incriminated Lee
or called him vivisector. Yet Lee experimented on cadavers and the heads of
birds in his effort t o locate the secret of bel canto. Lee's dark secret s were
all too closely associated with Bessie, his star pupil.

Shaw suffered fro m a  bout o f smallpox in May 1881 . He claimed to be
unblemished bu t i t left hi s chin and jaw pockmarked, marks concealed by
the famous beard that he then nurtured for the first time. His psychological
scars wer e deepe r an d no t s o easil y concealed . H e launche d a  lifelon g
campaign agains t doctor s a s well a s against th e vaccination tha t faile d t o
give hi m ful l protection . Th e one-hundred-pag e 191 1 Prefac e t o The
Doctor's Dilemma  an d th e 193 1 collection o f article s known a s Doctors'
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Delusions are major pros e examples of doctors as perpetrators. The theme
of victimizatio n appear s a s earl y a s a n 188 7 boo k revie w attackin g
vivisection and as late as comments in Everybody's Political What's  What?
(1944). In his hatred o f the medical professio n an d scientifi c medicine , he
specifically attacke d Edwar d Jenner, Loui s Pasteur , and Joseph Lister . The
three me n ha d on e thin g i n common : thei r fam e reste d o n controllin g
micro-organisms.

Shaw's hatre d stemme d fro m a  peculia r sens e o f bein g assaile d b y a n
unseen world of germs, which he evidenced in a virulent hypochondria. At
the sam e time , he scoffed a t tha t concep t o f tota l healt h know n a s mens
sana in corpore sano, the belie f o f Victorian intellectual s tha t trainin g the
body resulted i n a vigorous mind. For Shaw, who longed fo r th e power t o
will one's destiny, only the reverse would do: "it is the mind that makes the
body an d no t th e bod y th e mind " (Prefac e t o Doctors'  Delusions,  p. xiv
and Everybody's,  p . 247; se e als o "Th e Revolutionist' s Handbook, "
Collected Plays, vol. 11, p. 795).

In his drama, Shaw learned to take the materials of his life and transform
the virulen t int o th e playful . I n The  Philanderer  (1893), n e satirize s th e
vivisector i n th e characte r o f Dr . Paramore , whos e reputatio n rest s o n
discovering a  microb e i n th e live r tha t mean s certai n death . Whe n hi s
discovery canno t b e confirmed , h e i s inconsolable , eve n thoug h i t mean s
perfect health for his misdiagnosed patient. Four decades later, in Too True
to be  Good  (1931) , Shaw satirizes the docto r wh o cures no disease while
blaming th e microbe . Comically , Sha w ha s th e microb e appea r o n stag e
and lament that humans infect microbes, but Shaw was dead serious.

In th e earl y 1880 s Sha w immerse d himsel f i n boxing , which intereste d
him as both a science and an art. In 1883, having acquired some reputation
as a boxer, the author of Cash el Byron's Profession entered his name in the
Queensberry Amateu r Boxin g Championship s i n bot h th e middleweigh t
and heavyweight ("An y Weight") divisions. Although he was not given the
chance t o compete , Th e Fightin g Irishma n fro m th e Britis h Museu m
carefully preserve d th e program. His fascination fo r th e sport a s a trial of
skill neve r wane d a s h e commente d an d analyze d i n article s an d letters ,
always disdainin g th e slu g fest . Sha w implie d tha t boxin g was a  reenact -
ment o f primitiv e rites , a  reachin g bac k int o Gree k origin s wit h it s
celebration o f the male body. In Cash el Byron's Profession, Shaw's reveals
his masculine ideal - an d reverses the usual voyeurism of gazing at a female
- a s Lydia is dazzled by the sight of Cashel' s body, whose "manly strength
and beauty " i s compared t o th e Herme s o f Praxitele s (Collected  Works,
vol. IV, p. 38). Meanwhile in the drama, Shaw's characters use their fists or
threaten t o us e the m i n How  He  Lied  to  Her  Husband  (1904) , Major
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Barbara (1905) , The Fascinating Foundling (1909), Overruled (1912), The
Millionairess (1934), and Shakes Versus Shav (1949).

Shaw's most visible eccentricity was his adoption o f the clothing system
of Germa n healt h culturis t Dr . Gusta v Jaeger , wh o toute d th e hygieni c
effects o f wearin g wool . I n 1885 , wit h th e insuranc e mone y fro m hi s
father's death , the desperately shabby Shaw ordered new clothes. Embrac-
ing Jaegerism, he decked himself out in the knitted one-piece wool suit that
buttoned u p to th e neck and alon g one side, so that h e looked somethin g
like a  gymnast . Eventuall y h e woul d giv e u p th e extrem e styl e o f th e
combination fo r mor e conventiona l tailoring , bu t hi s favorit e outfi t
resembled a  Norfolk jacke t with knee breeches. It was no mere affectation .
Nor wa s i t simpl y par t o f th e attac k o n th e unhealth y an d irrationa l i n
dress launche d b y contemporar y dres s reformer s lik e Edwar d Carpente r
and Henry S. Salt. Shaw's wool clothes were a way to fight the dirt of life.
With wool the pores could breathe . Wool le t out bod y dir t an d secretion s
while protecting against contamination i n the external world. Carrying his
woolen bedsheets with him when he traveled, pulling on gloves to keep his
hands clean in the streets, wearing digital socks, garbed in the yellowish red
suit, the scrupulously clean Shaw was an immaculate walking mannequin ,
an elaborate advertisement for the hygienic way of life.

Despite his unflagging intellectual commitment to feminism, deep ambiv-
alences colore d hi s persona l relation s wit h women . Pursue d al l ove r
London by the most advanced women - actresses , artists, and intellectual s
- Sha w nevertheles s kep t hi s virginit y unti l ag e twenty-nine . The n h e
surrendered i t to Jane (Jenny ) Patterson, a  tempestuous Iris h widow some
fifteen year s hi s senior , an d hi s mother' s clos e friend . A  long an d storm y
affair followe d durin g whic h Sha w treate d he r a s a  mer e convenience ,
while the jealous Jenny stole his mail, stalked him, threw violent tantrums,
or pleaded pathetically for time with her young lover.

Undeterred, Sha w flirte d wit h abando n an d charme d wome n al l ove r
London. H e admitte d t o tryin g t o impres s Eleano r Marx , th e younges t
daughter o f Kar l Marx , wh o confide d i n hi m he r mos t intimat e feelings ,
including thos e concernin g he r unhapp y relation s wit h commo n la w
husband Edward Aveling. Having engaged the affections o f the irrevocably
married orato r an d socia l activis t Annie Besant , he fled i n terror afte r sh e
surprised hi m b y drawing u p a  pseudo-marriage contract . H e contentedl y
listened while writer Edith Bland told tales of husband Hubert' s infidelitie s
but refuse d t o g o an y furthe r tha n te a an d tal k wit h hi s friend' s wife ,
thereby infuriatin g her . H e acte d a s confidan t an d adviso r t o Kat e Salt ,
whose marital difficulties turne d out to stem from he r lesbianism. He stole
actress Florence Farr from William Butler Yeats, only to avoid her once she

1 2
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i Sha w in his Jaeger suit: Al Kozlik in the Shaw Festival's 1996 production of
The Simpleton of the Unexpected Isles

was divorce d fro m he r absen t husband . H e move d i n wit h th e newl y
married Ma y Morri s (daughte r o f th e grea t Willia m Morris) , destroyin g
her marriage to Henry Halliday Sparling ; years later May scoffed a s Shaw
blamed th e resul t o n a  violate d "Mysti c Betrothal " betwee n th e tw o o f
them ("Morris, " p. xxvii). All along his path were strewn the broken hearts
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of innumerable youn g Fabian women . But except fo r Jenny Patterson , hi s
love affairs remained platonic.

While the relationship with Ma y Morris was Shaw's most romanticize d
in-the-flesh lov e affair , hi s mos t etherea l romanc e too k th e for m o f hi s
correspondence wit h Elle n Terry, the famous pape r courtship betwee n th e
fledgling playwrigh t an d th e world-renowne d actress . Durin g th e year s
1895-1900, Sha w wooe d he r entirel y throug h th e mails . I n Ellen , nin e
years his senior, he found a  woman of great sympathy and understanding, a
woman t o whom h e could revea l many of hi s deepest fear s an d longings .
He wanted he r for hi s plays, but shied away from meetin g her so that she
might admire the epistolary persona h e so artfully created . Although Ellen
thought otherwise , as far a s Shaw was concerned, the correspondence was
a completely satisfactory love affair .

The Quintessence  of  Ibsenism  (1891) , Shaw' s expositio n o f Ibsen ,
contains a  chapter titled "Th e Womanly Woman." There Shaw decries the
"reckless self-abandonment " tha t transform s woman' s passionat e sexua l
desire into the "caresses of a maniac," a description that suggests more than
his revulsion towar d Jenny Patterson' s feveris h passio n {Collected  Works,
vol. xix , p . 38). I t als o reveal s hi s ow n dee p antipathie s towar d sex .
Intellectually, however , h e harbore d n o qualm s i n assertin g a  stron g
feminism. I n orde r t o emancipat e herself , Sha w though t th e Womanl y
Woman must repudiate "he r womanliness, her duty to her husband, to her
children, to society, to the law, and to everyone but herself" (p. 44).

Both hi s tangled persona l relation s wit h wome n a s well a s his feminis t
sympathies ar e eviden t ver y earl y i n hi s drama . Th e playwrigh t emerge d
with Widowers'  Houses  (1892) , originall y conceive d i n 188 4 a s a  colla -
boration wit h dram a criti c Willia m Archer , an d base d o n th e Frenc h
formula Sha w derided shortly after i n the Saturday Review as "Sardoodle-
dom." Shaw's bitter satir e on slum-landlordism, with it s resonances to his
Dublin experienc e i n the lan d agency , scandalized critics . They especiall y
detested its heroine, the darkly melodramatic Blanche Sartorius, who beats
her maid.

The offstag e dram a surroundin g hi s firs t pla y ha d it s ow n scandalou s
side sinc e Shaw' s heroin e wa s base d o n Jenn y Patterson . Moreover ,
Florence Farr , wh o playe d Blanche , wa s bein g squire d aroun d tow n b y
Shaw. One evening, a screaming, swearing Jenny burst in while Shaw was
visiting Florence . A "shocked an d upset " Sha w determined t o b e finishe d
with Jenny (Diaries,  vol . II, p. 902). That final real-life scen e is dramatized
as the triangular openin g scen e of The  Philanderer (1893) , Shaw's second
play. Leonar d Charteris , th e philanderer , i s portraye d a s cool , collected ,
and in control, exactly what his creator was not.
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Shaw's third Unpleasan t Play , Mrs. Warren's  Profession (1893), reveals
his feminist stanc e as he portrays the successful brothel-keepe r as making a
practical career choice in a society that underpays and undervalues women.
From Mr s Warren' s perspective , marriag e i s prostitution: "Th e onl y wa y
for a  woman to provide fo r hersel f decentl y i s for he r to be good to some
man that can afford t o be good to her. If she's in his own station of life, let
her mak e hi m marr y her ; bu t i f she' s far beneat h hi m sh e cant expec t it "
(Collected Plays, vol. I, p. 314).

Shaw's dissatisfactio n wit h th e Britis h idea l o f marriag e wa s lasting . In
the 191 1 Preface t o Getting  Married (1908) - th e play itself offering mor e
than a  dozen views of marriage - h e calls the difference betwee n marriag e
and prostitutio n simpl y th e "differenc e betwee n Trad e Unionis m an d
unorganized casua l labor" (Collected  Plays, vol. Ill, p. 501) . In writing the
play, Shaw was influence d b y the proddings o f actres s Janet Achurch an d
Fabian Beatrice Webb, as well as the less than respectable career moves of
his mother and his sister.

The Lor d Chamberlai n denounce d Mrs.  Warren's  Profession  a s
"immoral an d otherwis e imprope r fo r th e stage, " refusin g t o licens e th e
play. However t o those men "surprise d t o se e ladies present" a t a  private
performance o f th e pla y give n b y th e Stag e Society , Sha w declare d i n a
1902 preface to the play that it was written for women and that it had been
performed an d produce d mainl y throug h th e determinatio n o f wome n
(Collected Plays, vol. 1, p. 253).

Two othe r Sha w play s wer e t o b e banned . The  Shewing-up  of Blanco
Posnet (1909) , which th e playwrigh t calle d " a religiou s trac t i n dramati c
form," shocke d th e censo r int o declarin g i t blasphemou s becaus e o f th e
way Posnet , a n accuse d hors e thie f an d conver t t o Christianity , refer s t o
God (Collected  Plays, vol . ill , p . 674). Shortl y afte r th e banning , Sha w
flagrantly floute d th e censo r wit h Press  Cuttings (1909) . He create d tw o
characters whos e satirica l name s wer e instantl y recognizable , thereb y
brazenly violatin g th e cod e whic h forbad e offensiv e representation s o f
living persons on the stage. Shaw protested that his General Mitchener was
not th e lat e Lor d Kitchene r an d tha t Prim e Ministe r Balsquit h (wh o firs t
appears o n stag e cross-dresse d a s a  suffragette ) wa s neithe r Lor d Alfre d
Balfour nor Liberal politician Herbert Henry Asquith.

Shaw's thre e banne d play s amounte d t o 1 0 percen t o f th e thirt y play s
competely banned by the censor between 1895 a nd 1 9°9-> o u t ° f some eight
thousand plays submitted for licensing. In the one-hundred page Preface to
The Shewing-up of Blanco  Posnet, Shaw spell s ou t th e case agains t stag e
censorship, one battle in his long struggle against all forms o f censorship -
including th e censorshi p o f socia l behavior . I n hi s view , "muc h curren t
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morality a s t o economi c an d sexua l relations " wa s "disastrousl y wrong "
(Collected Plays, vol. ill, p. 698).

Despite hi s reservation s abou t marriage , i n 189 8 h e marrie d Charlott e
Payne-Townshend, a  wealthy Irishwoman who had led a largely social lif e
in London since her arrival twenty years earlier from Count y Cork. Having
been thrown togethe r wit h he r i n a  country hous e rented on e summer by
the Webbs, the eligible philanderer immediately began wooing the receptive
Charlotte. Characteristically , h e als o retreate d fro m he r fo r clos e t o tw o
years. But then his health broke down and with it, he claimed, all objection
either to his own death o r to his marriage. Charlotte' s firs t importan t rol e
as wife wa s nurse t o the bridegroom , wh o proceede d t o suffe r a  series of
accidents that kept him on crutches or in a wheelchair into the second year
of thei r marriage . Se x was ou t an d Sha w confide d tha t th e marriag e wa s
never consummated . Saf e fro m pursuin g women , th e marrie d playwrigh t
became the successful playwright .

Man and Superman (completed 1902 ) offer s glimpse s of Shaw's view of
his own marriage. John Tanner warns the poet Octaviu s that afte r a  week
of marriag e h e woul d find  eve n th e glamorou s An n Whitefiel d n o mor e
inspiring tha n a  plat e o f muffins . Do n Jua n want s t o flee  to heave n t o
escape sexual demands; there the women are so dowdy they "might be men
of fifty," that is , middle-aged an d sexually indistinguishable, like Charlotte
(Collected Plays, vol. 11, p. 683).

Shaw, having long associated th e Don Juan myth with himself , used his
play a s a  vehicl e t o elevat e hi s ambivalen t feeling s towar d wome n t o a
cosmic plane . Th e pursuin g woma n an d th e retreatin g philsophica l Do n
Juan ar e inversion s tha t revers e th e cultura l stereotyp e o f passiv e wome n
and active men. Nevertheless, Shaw reinforces the conventional dichotom y
of woma n a s body , ma n a s mind . A s the Lif e Forc e course s throug h th e
determined Ann - a  vitalist genius like Cashel Byron - sh e becomes nothing
less than Woman Incarnate relentlessly seeking her mate for the sake of the
children she will bear. In so doing, Shaw integrates the Don Juan myth into
Creative Evolution , hi s private evolutionar y myth , bot h myth s dependin g
on the power of sex.3

Like Blake, Shaw created his own system so he would not be enslaved by
another man's. Socialism and philosophy, biology and metaphysics, merged
into the religious-philosophical theory of Creative Evolution that he was to
dramatize i n Back  to  Methuselah  (1918-20) . Th e ter m declare d Shaw' s
affinity t o Henri Bergson' s identically titled book , Creative  Evolution.  But
before Bergso n ha d publishe d hi s discours e o n th e elan  vital,  Sha w ha d
already incorporate d wha t h e calle d th e Lif e Forc e int o Man  and
Superman, for Bergson's book did not appear until 1907.
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2 Eugeni c fables of female superiority: the Reverend Phosphor Hammingtap (Ben Carlson)
is borne aloft by Maya, Kanchin, and Vashti (Lisa Waines, Shaun Phillips, and Janet Lo)

in the Shaw Festival's 1996 production of The Simpleton of the Unexpected Isles

Celibate himself, Shaw's abiding interest in human sexuality is evidenced
in hi s drama , i n Creativ e Evolution , an d i n hi s consuming interes t i n the
science of eugenics . His concerns, which focus o n the need for th e human
race to evolve, are epitomized i n the figure of the superman. Like his view
of himself , Sha w sa w hi s superma n a s saint , artist , an d geniu s -  th e
complete outsider . Man y o f th e superme n Sha w admire d -  suc h a s
Shakespeare, Goethe, Michelangelo - wer e considered by certain of Shaw's
contemporaries t o b e example s o f homosexua l geniuses . Sha w wa s als o
influenced b y th e vie w o f hi s frien d Edwar d Carpenter , th e homosexua l
poet an d reforme r wh o believe d tha t th e artist' s ver y homosexualit y wa s
the source of his genius.

The youth in Dalkey had dreamed of amours on the plains of heaven; the
man worshippe d femal e beauty . Fascinate d an d inspire d b y women , th e
artist create d th e mos t powerfu l femal e character s o n th e Englis h stag e
since Shakespeare - eve n while believing that "[n]o fascinating woman ever
wants to emancipate he r sex: her object i s to gather power int o the hands
of Man , becaus e sh e knows tha t sh e can govern him " (Collected  Letters,
vol. II, p. 260). His heroines variously overturn custom, care not a whit for
propriety, o r preten d t o b e docile an d submissiv e whil e joyousl y insistin g
on their status as fully-fledged huma n beings.
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To Elle n Terry , Sha w bille d Candida  (1894 ) a s "TH E Mothe r Play "
(Collected Letters, vol. 1 , p. 641). His heroin e i s worshipped b y both he r
husband, th e Reveren d Jame s Mavo r Morell , an d th e effeminat e poe t
Marchbanks. Candida encompasse s three female role s raised to exaltatio n
- domesti c maid , enchantress , ange l -  an d th e pla y expose s patriarcha l
assumptions concernin g lov e and marriag e whe n sh e gives herself t o "th e
weaker o f th e two, " th e tearfu l Morel l (Collected  Flays, vol. I , p . 591).
Shaw later contended tha t i t was meant a s a "counterblast" to Ibsen since
in th e typica l doll' s hous e "i t i s th e ma n wh o i s th e doll, " a  vie w
representing his own experience at least (Collected Plays, vol. I, p. 603).

Lady Cicel y Waynflete (create d wit h Elle n Terry i n mind) , a woman of
the managin g typ e lik e Mrs . Warren , i s th e sol e woma n i n Captain
Brassbound's Conversion  (1899), where sh e instructs a  brigand an d over -
powers everyon e sh e meets . Wit h God' s wor k stil l t o b e done , Barbar a
Undershaft, i n Major Barbara, agree s to marry her "dea r little Dolly boy,"
but ideology more than lov e plays Cupid (Collected  Plays, vol. m, p. 184).
Lina Szczepanowska, the valiant aviator and acrobat in Misalliance (1909),
wears mal e gar b an d triumphantl y eschew s femal e role s -  especiall y
bourgeois marriage - affirmin g he r independent womanhood i n one of the
finest bravura piece s in Shaw. Similarly Joan wears clothes that reflec t he r
true role - leadin g soldiers for Go d - an d rises to lyricism as she expresses
her need for unfettered freedom , eve n at the cost of her earthly body (Saint
Joan, 1923) . Millionairess Epifania Ognisant i di Parerga Fitzfassenden i s a
judo exper t wh o talk s lik e a  ma n an d use s he r fists  o n he r passionles s
bridegroom (The  Millionairess,  1934) . Meanwhil e femal e creation s lik e
Mrs. Georg e i n Getting  Married  (1908) an d Hesion e Hushab y i n Heart-
break House (1917) are drenched i n a seemingly supernatural sexuality . In
Shaw's comic universe, women are more than equal to the ineffectual me n
around them.

Given Shaw's outspokeness on gender issues and hi s depiction o f strong
women i n hi s artisti c works , i t i s no t surprisin g tha t wome n sough t hi s
political backing . I n 191 2 whe n actres s Len a Ashwell , presiden t o f th e
female Three Arts Club, asked him to speak on equal rights for professiona l
women, he readily agreed . But he was not alway s s o agreeable where the
Woman Suffrag e Campaig n wa s concerned . Althoug h Sha w wa s i n sym-
pathy wit h th e suffragettes ' goal , h e tailored th e rol e h e played t o fit  his
own agenda. Privately to his sister, Lucy Carr Shaw, he insisted that women
were bette r of f speakin g fo r themselve s and,  besides , hi s view s o n th e
subject wer e wel l know n (Collected  Letters, vol . 11 , p. 904). Publicl y h e
exaggerated his reluctance, declaring that men at public meetings "brought
forward betwee n petticoats .  . . looked s o horribly ignominiou s and did it
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so much worse" than wome n (Fabian  Feminist,  p. 229). There were othe r
ways to help. With his assistance, American actress and feminis t Elizabet h
Robins succeeded in getting her suffrage play , Votes for Women!,  produced
at the Royal Court Theatre in 1907.4

Shaw was often prompte d b y events. In addition to numerous comments
on the subject , h e penned hal f a  dozen essays devoted to woman suffrage .
When Si r Almrot h Wrigh t posite d a  specificall y feminin e min d a s a  case
against woma n suffrage , Sha w countere d tha t woman' s min d i s "exactl y
like Man's mind" (Fabian  Feminist,  p. 244). In an address in March 1913,
he attacked th e practice o f forcibl e feedin g o f suffragettes , expandin g th e
issue of woman's rights beyond suffrage t o a more inclusive "commonsense"
issue. He asserted that "the denial of any fundamental rights " to a woman is
really " a violatio n o f th e soul " and a n attac k "o n tha t sacre d par t o f lif e
which is common to all of us"(Fabian Feminist, p. 235). In May 1913, after
the government had attempted to suppress The Suffragette, the organ of the
Woman's Socia l and Political Union, he protested the action. A few weeks
later h e wrot e thre e newspape r piece s remonstratin g agains t th e govern -
ment's barbaric treatment of suffragettes, whom he referred to as martyrs.

But Shaw also annoyed suffragettes b y suggesting that what was needed
was a "coupled vote, " every vote cast to be for a  pair consisting o f a  man
and a woman so that there would be an equal number of men and women
in th e electe d body . A  decad e afte r wome n ha d bee n enfranchise d i n
England, he returned to the idea of the "coupled vote" in the Preface to "In
Good King Charles's Golden Days" (1939) , writing that women, as he had
predicted, ha d use d thei r vot e "t o kee p wome n ou t o f Parliament "
(Collected Plays, vol. vn, p. 208).

Feminists might disagree with his assessment of the way women used the
vote; nevertheless Shaw still subscribed to the belief he had uttered in 1907
during a  rare appearance a t a  meeting of the National Union of Women's
Suffrage Societies : "I deny that any social problem will ever be satisfactorily
solved unles s women hav e thei r du e shar e i n getting i t solved . Le t u s get
this obstacle of the political slavery of women out of the way and then we
shall see all set to work on the problems - bot h sexes together with a will"
(Fabian Feminist, p. 254).

Shaw, a s always , preferre d t o lea d hi s ow n movement , no t t o marc h
under someon e else' s banner . H e sa w hi s wor k a s tha t o f guidin g th e
Fabians toward a  new society to benefi t bot h women and men. And, as is
suggested below, he also actively pursued his own covert agenda for gender
and sexual tolerance.

Shaw's feminis t commen t tha t " a woma n i s really onl y a  man i n petti -
coats" has often been noted. The ignored second half of his aphorism is just
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as striking. Writing that "a man is a woman without petticoats," he makes
the petticoat s th e essentia l mar k o f gende r (Platform  and Pulpit,  p. 174).
That is , h e confer s o n woma n th e signifyin g powe r o f gender , thereb y
reversing th e wa y gende r wa s determine d i n hi s phallocrati c society .
Similarly - an d cryptically - i n the Preface to Saint Joan, Shaw writes that
"it i s not necessar y t o wear trousers and smok e bi g cigars to liv e a  man's
life an y mor e tha n i t i s necessar y t o wea r petticoat s t o liv e a  woman's "
(Collected Plays, vol . vi, p. 35).

Decades earlier , durin g a  nois y scanda l i n 188 9 involvin g a  mal e
bordello, Shaw wrote a carefully worde d letter to the editor of Truth under
the banne r o f "mora l responsibility. " Wel l awar e tha t "me n ar e lot h t o
meddle" because the y migh t b e suspected o f actin g i n thei r ow n persona l
interest, h e nevertheless spok e ou t agains t th e "principl e o f th e law " that
inflicted "outrageou s penalties " upon consenting adults (Collected  Letters,
vol. I, pp. 230-32). The letter, which showed familiarity wit h both current
and historical views on homosexuality, was never published.

Shaw's stands o n the subjec t remaine d progressive . He became an early
member o f the British Society for th e Study of Sex Psychology, a member-
ship h e kep t s o quie t tha t i t ha s escape d th e notic e o f hi s previou s
biographers. Established in 1914 to educate the public on issues of sex, the
Society was specifically dedicate d to reforming th e laws on homosexuality .
Significantly, th e nucleus of the Society was composed o f former member s
of the Order of Chaeronea, a secret society formed i n the 1890s by literary
and professional men to work for homosexual liberation. Only a few of the
Order's members have been conclusively identified .

There is a pattern of evidence in Shaw's life, including his preoccupation
with question s o f heredity , genius , an d "inversion, " tha t suggest s tha t h e
secretly viewe d himsel f a s a  "nobl e invert " -  a n asceti c artis t whos e gift s
were linked to a homoerotic source. Of his many friendships with men, the
closest wa s wit h Harle y Granvill e Barker , twenty-on e year s hi s junior , a
young genius whose gifts he extolled.

Shaw entered int o a  triumphant theatrica l partnershi p wit h Barke r an d
John Eugen e Vedrenn e a t th e Roya l Cour t Theatr e fro m 190 4 t o 1907 .
Brilliant production s fro m Euripide s t o contemporar y drama , especiall y
Shaw, were mounted. Until then, despite success overseas, Shaw had only a
coterie following . No w hi s wor k accounte d fo r 7 0 percen t o f th e Roya l
Court performances an d established him as a successful playwright , even as
he cast, directed, and staged his own plays.

Shaw's association with Barker proved an extraordinarily productive one
as the men wrote plays in virtual dialogue with one another, themes of one
playwright resonating in the work o f the other. Shaw plays written durin g
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the Court  Theatr e year s were John Bull's  Other  Island,  How  He  Lied  to
Her Husband,  Major  Barbara, The Doctor's  Dilemma.  As the friendshi p
continued, the plays continued t o flow: Getting  Married, The  Shewing-Up
of Blanco Posnet, Misalliance, The  Dark Lady of the Sonnets, Fanny's First
Play, Androcles and the Lion, Overruled,  as well as several playlets and his
prose trac t Common  Sense  about the  War.  Having written Pygmalion,  he
fell i n lov e with hi s own creatio n on e pleasant afternoo n a s he read i t t o
Mrs. Patrick Campbell , for whom he had created Eliza Doolittle. As Shaw
raved abou t Stella , Londo n buzze d wit h gossip . Bu t the resurrecte d Do n
Juan imag e was a  sham -  th e much too publi c indiscretions onl y a  game
and so carefully reveale d to Ellen Terry for her  pleasure (Collected  Letters,
vol. in, p. i n ) .

Then disaster struck. Barker was swept off his feet by Helen Huntington,
wife o f th e America n millionaire , Arche r M . Huntington . H e divorce d
actress Lilia n McCarthy , th e tw o havin g falle n i n lov e a  decad e earlie r
playing John Tanner and Ann Whitefield during the first production of Man
and Superman.  Jealous o f Barker' s relationshi p wit h Shaw , Hele n Hun -
tington forbad e al l contac t betwee n th e tw o men . Losin g Barke r wa s a
tragedy fo r Shaw . Feeling "suicidal, " he began writing Heartbreak  House
(Bernard Shaw and Mrs. Campbell, p. 209). Captain Shotover's warning to
the cultured leisure class was also a warning to Barker, whom Shaw thought
seduced by luxury into a drifting existence: "Navigation. Learn it and live; or
leave it and be damned" (Collected  Plays, vol. v, p . 177) . The Secret Life,
Barker's hauntin g an d subtl e dram a (publishe d 1922) , can b e read a s his
melancholy response to Shaw's plea - sometime s only the unattainable can
content on e an d sometime s irrevocabl e los s bring s relief . Although Sha w
futilely hope d that the two could reconcile, Barker was a lost cause and his
creative life was submerged. Not even T. E. Lawrence (Lawrence of Arabia),
a mutual friend whos e help Shaw enlisted, could rescue Barker from wha t
Shaw viewed as a life of damnation with Helen.

As wishfulness , longing , an d didactis m merged , mor e an d mor e i n hi s
drama Sha w turne d t o allegory , a  for m h e perfecte d wit h Heartbreak
House. Indee d th e play may b e the premie r exampl e i n twentieth-centur y
drama o f didacti c intentio n shapin g art . Openl y amenabl e t o fantasy , i n
allegory Sha w had a  flexible forum t o state hi s beliefs unhampere d b y the
demands o f characte r psychology , a s i n plot-structure d works , o r th e
strictures of negative statement, as in satire.5

Shaw's longin g fo r a  bodiles s etherea l real m i s th e mos t startlin g
characteristic o f Back  to  Methuselah,  th e hug e allegor y h e calle d hi s
"Metabiological Pentateuch. " In  the  Beginning  opens i n th e Garde n o f
Eden with Adam, Eve , and th e Serpent , the very first menage a trois. It is
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the Serpen t wh o reveals the guilty secre t o f human sexualit y t o a  stricken
Eve; his laughter makes the Fall a dirty joke. In The Gospel of the Brothers
Barnabas, set i n th e firs t year s afte r Worl d Wa r I , Creativ e Evolutio n i s
posited a s promising th e longevit y neede d t o advance th e human race . In
The Thing  Happens,  two unexceptiona l character s fro m th e forme r pla y
are the seeming rulers of the British Islands in the year 2170 and an African
woman "th e real president" (Collected  Plays,  vol. v, p. 477). By 3000 AD,
The Tragedy of an Elderly Gentleman, the seemingly emotionless, soulless
longlivers outnumber the shortlivers, who are highly susceptible to discour-
agement. Finally , i n th e yea r 31,92 0 AD , As Far as Thought Can  Reach,
human beings hatch from eggs , quickly advance beyond the physical, spend
hundreds and hundreds of years in contemplation, and long for life without
flesh, "th e vortex freed fro m matter . .  . the whirlpool in pure intelligence"
(Collected Plays, vol. v, p. 630).

In Saint  Joan, Shaw' s nex t play , h e turne d fro m imaginin g a n elusiv e
bodiless futur e t o portrayin g a  historica l figure, specifically a  figure who
had bee n both elevated an d denigrate d i n the various tellings of her story .
Cutting throug h th e carapac e o f legend , Sha w depict s Joan a s a  spiritua l
heroine and an "unwomanly woman." She is both practical and passionate
by nature, a  woman whos e virginit y stem s from strength , no t fro m mer e
Victorian purity . A s sh e exercise s he r individua l wil l an d insist s o n he r
private vision, she becomes a conduit of evolutionary thought and behavior.

Joan bear s striking parallels to the playwright. Like her creator, she was
almost drowned by a terrible father, unflinchingly fights hypocrisy, is a vital
genius, is the rare Galtonic visualizer (on e whose mind's eye is like a magic
lantern), an d ha s bee n force d t o liv e precariousl y amon g thos e wh o
persecute the superior individual . Shaw's self-identification wit h his andro-
gynous heroine - martyre d for revealing her true feelings - result s in a play
where tragic overtones ar e tempered b y the satiric wit and the generically
comic form. The play opens as farce but steadily darkens until the epilogue
of Shaw's irreverent divine comedy. Then Joan's brief return to earth signals
the comi c turn , a s thos e wh o prais e he r vanis h a t th e prospec t o f he r
resurrection. Onl y in some future tim e will saints - an d geniuses - b e safe
on "this beautiful earth " (Collected Plays, vol. VI, p. 208).

Saint Joan resulted i n a  canonizatio n o f sort s fo r th e playwright , wh o
received the Nobel Prize for 1925 , but, refusing th e money, transferred th e
funds to the newly created Anglo-Swedish Literary Foundation. Meanwhile
there was creative silence while Shaw labored on The Intelligent Woman's
Guide to Socialism and Capitalism. Then Barker published His Majesty, his
last play, and Shaw responded with The Apple Cart,  and his own impotent
king. Remarkably , Shaw' s caree r stretche d forwar d anothe r tw o decades .
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Addressing th e Internationa l Congres s o f th e Worl d Leagu e fo r Sexua l
Reform, th e asceti c speake r elicite d a  laug h whe n h e presente d himsel f a s
an expert o n sex . He visited Russi a an d met Stalin , Gorki , and Stanislavsky .
He me t Ghandi . H e wrot e a  prose fable , The  Adventures  of  the  Black  Girl
in Her  Search  for  God  (1932) , an d mad e hi s firs t visi t t o Americ a th e
following year . H e wrot e a  dramati c eugeni c fable , The  Simpleton  of  the
Unexpected Isles  (1934) , to o blithel y satirize d th e Europea n dictator s i n
Geneva (1936 , final  revisio n 1947) , an d agai n wrot e hi s ow n bran d o f
history wit h "In  Good  King  Charles's  Golden  Days."  A s late a s Farfetched
Fables (1948) , he was still wedding allegory and eugenics in his drama .

The world-famou s Sha w live d hal f hi s lif e i n th e tin y villag e o f Ayo t St .
Lawrence. There h e spen t hi s days writing i n the littl e hu t tha t revolve d t o
catch th e sun . H e wrot e virtuall y t o th e en d o f hi s day s wit h a  mind clea r
and uncloude d b y age . T o celebrat e hi s ninety-fourt h birthday , h e wrot e
Why She  Would  Not.  H e wa s working o n a  rhyming pictur e guid e t o Ayo t
St. Lawrence a t th e tim e o f hi s death , th e resul t o f a  fal l i n hi s garden. O n
his deat h bed , h e spok e o f Barke r whos e deat h fou r year s earlie r ha d
prompted a  public written tribute from th e ancient playwright .

He remaine d a  vegetarian , a n antivivisectionist , a n antivaccinationist , a
wool-wearer, a  eugenicist , a  Fabian , an d a  feminist . Whateve r Shaw' s
personal unhappiness , th e extraordinaril y productiv e lif e feature d a n
upward trajectory , a s h e impose d hi s wil l an d exercise d hi s fanc y o n
seemingly intractabl e materials , spinnin g ou t gloriou s comedie s an d en -
during parables . Alway s hi s visio n o f th e stag e wa s a s th e ape x o f huma n
endeavor, a place of beauty and spirituality. Believing that the fates of artists,
homosexuals, an d wome n ar e intertwined , insistin g tha t al l grea t ar t i s
didactic, he valiantly worked for a society unblemished b y the inequalities of
class o r gender . "Thi s i s th e tru e jo y i n life , th e bein g use d fo r a  purpos e
recognized b y yourself a s a mighty one" (Collected Plays,  vol . II, p. 667).

NOTES
1 Fo r a full spelling out of the ideas in this essay, see my biography, Bernard Shaw:

The Ascent of the Superman (New Haven: Yale University Press, 1996).
2 Quotation s are from th e following: Bernard Shaw: Collected Letters, ed. Dan H.

Laurence, 4  vols . (Ne w York : Dodd , Mead , 1965 , 1972. , New York : Viking ,
1985, 1988) ; The  Bodley  Head  Bernard  Shaw: Collected  Flays  with  Their
Prefaces, ed . Da n H . Laurence , 7  vols . (London : Ma x Reinhardt , Th e Bodle y
Head, 1970-74) ; The  Collected  Works of  Bernard  Shaw, Ayot St . Lawrenc e
edition, 3 0 vols . (Ne w York : William H . Wise , 1930-32) ; Bernard  Shaw: The
Diaries, 1885-1897, ed . Stanle y Weintraub , 2  vols. (Universit y Park : Pennsyl -
vania Stat e Universit y Press , 1986) ; Bernard Shaw: The Drama  Observed,  ed.
Bernard F. Dukore, 4 vols. (University Park: Pennsylvania State University Press,
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1993); Bernard Shaw , Everybody's  Political  What's What?  (New York : Dodd ,
Mead, 1947); Fabian Feminist: Benard Shaw and Woman, ed. Rodelle Weintraub
(University Park : Pennsylvani a Stat e Universit y Press , 1977) ; Fran k Harris ,
Bernard Shaw (New York: Garden City, 1931); May Morris, "Morri s As I Knew
Him," in William Morris: Artist, Writer,  Socialist, Volume  the Second: Morris as
a Socialist, pages ix-xl; (1936, rpt. New York: Russell and Russell, 1966. Bernard
Shaw, Preface t o Doctors'  Delusions,  i n Collected  Works,  vol . xxii ; Bernard
Shaw, Preface to Immaturity, in Collected Works,  vol. I; Bernard Shaw: Platform
and Pulpit,  ed. Da n H . Laurenc e (Ne w York : Hil l an d Wang , 1961) ; Bernard
Shaw: The Road to Equality: Ten Unpublished Lectures and Essays, 1884-1918.
ed. Loui s Crompto n (Boston : Beaco n Press , 1971) ; Bernard Shaw , Sixteen Self
Sketches (London: Constable, 1949) ; Bernard Shaw and Mrs. Patrick Campbell:
Their Correspondence, ed. Alan Dent (New York: Knopf, 1952).

3 O n the role of myth in the structure o f Man and Superman, see my essay "Ann
and Superman : Type and Archetype, " i n Fabian  Feminist.  Reprinte d i n George
Bernard Shaw: Modern Critical  Views and George  Bernard Shaw's Man  and
Superman: Modern  Critical  Interpretations,  bot h ed . Harol d Bloo m (Ne w
Haven: Chelsea House, 1987).

4 O n Shaw' s reluctance , Margo t Peter s see s Sha w a s feelin g emasculate d b y the
movement as well as disagreeing with both the guerilla tactics and the conserva-
tive politics o f Emmelin e an d Christabe l Pankhurst ; se e Bernard Shaw and the
Actresses (Garden City , New York: Doubleday &  Co. , 1980) , p. 314. Katherine
E. Kelly traces Shaw's differences wit h the suffragettes an d sees a fear o f female
power an d o f feminization ; se e "Shaw on Woman Suffrage : A  Minor Playe r on
the Petticoat Platform," in The Annual of Bernard Shaw Studies, 14: 1992: Shaw
and the  Last  Hundred Years,  ed. Bernard F . Dukore (Universit y Park : Pennsyl-
vania State University Press, 1994), pp. 67-81.

5 Fo r a  structural analysi s of Heartbreak House  as allegory, see my essay "Heart-
break House: Shaw's Ship of Fools," Modern Drama, 21, 3 (1978), pp. 267-86.
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Imprinting the stage: Shaw and the
publishing trade, 1883-190 3

Shaw's efforts t o publish hi s plays for a  large reading public helped defin e
the "New" or "Modern" Drama as a reading as well as performing canon. 1

Deliberately followin g th e exampl e o f Henri k Ibse n whos e play s ofte n
circulated i n printe d translation s befor e bein g produced , Sha w aime d t o
fashion hi s plays as "high" art b y giving his published script s the materia l
look and poetic weight of fiction and poetry. Shaw promoted play publica-
tion not to devalue stage production but to reclaim for the playwright fro m
the actor-manage r bot h lega l ownershi p an d primar y authorshi p o f th e
written script . Determine d t o strengthe n playwrights ' economi c an d
cultural leverag e b y establishing thei r statu s a s authors , Sha w argue d fo r
the literary merits of drama and for the author's exclusive right to the script
as a  property. 2 Groundin g hi s economi c pla n fo r sellin g hi s labou r i n
Fabian socialist principles, Shaw anchored his aesthetic plan for publishing
his plays in a modest adaptation o f William Morris's revolutionary retur n
to the arts of papermaking, printing, and bookbinding.

By al l indications , Shaw' s progra m t o refor m th e professio n o f play -
wright was long overdue. Before 1911 , the weakness of nineteenth-century
copyright protectio n fo r dramati c script s and th e absenc e o f a  significan t
reading public for drama made it virtually impossible for most playwrights
to ear n a  sustaine d incom e fro m thei r publishe d works. 3 Playwright s no t
only faile d t o mak e mone y fro m thei r writin g bu t als o lacke d th e lega l
means to protect their rights as authors. As J. R. Stephens has noted, "For
effective copyrigh t protection , the drama require s a  formula whic h covers
not merel y th e word s o n th e pag e bu t th e representatio n o f tha t tex t i n
public performance o n the stage" (The Profession of the Playwright, p. 84).
In th e absenc e o f suc h a  formula , unethica l publisher s ha d a  lon g
established practic e o f printing versions of plays stil l in manuscript, while
unscrupulous theatr e manager s plante d group s o f longhan d writer s i n
audiences t o cop y particula r characters ' parts , which , whe n combined ,
amounted t o a  ful l manuscrip t o f a  play gotten merely fo r th e cos t of the
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copiers' labor. To the dramatist's peril, the drama posed an anomalous case
for copyrigh t legislation , which the law effectively ignore d and/or failed t o
enforce unti l the Copyright Act of 1911 , which improved dramatists ' odds
of winning damages.

By 1886, Shaw was earning the attention of literate intellectuals as an art
critic, bu t disappointin g notic e a s a  novelist , wit h editor s variousl y
informing hi m tha t reader s "ar e no t muc h intereste d i n socialism." 4

Undaunted, Shaw wrote to Hubert Bland in 1889, "My one line of progress
is fro m writin g stories , reviews , an d articles , mor e an d mor e toward s
writing fully an d exhaustively what I like."5 But what Shaw "liked" was as
influenced b y his shrewd assessment of the business of publishing as it was
by his socialism. With one eye on the popularity of Ibsen among "discrimi-
nating readers," and anothe r ey e on the censor's banning o f Ibsen' s plays,
Shaw eventually se t out to write and publish plays as mid-priced works of
literature -  a  mod e o f literar y productio n tha t publisher s an d reader s
customarily associated with prose fiction and poetry. Correctly anticipating
the dawn o f a  mass reading market, 6 Sha w looked fo r a  way to create in
England an d th e U S wha t h e believe d coul d b e a  play-readin g habit .
Writing t o publishe r T . Fisher Unwin i n September o f 1895,  Shaw hinted
broadly a t hi s interes t i n bein g published : "I f I  thought tha t peopl e wer e
picking up the French trick of reading dramatic works, I should be strongly
tempted t o publish m y plays instead o f botherin g to get them performed "
(Collected Letters, vol . I , p . $57)-7 The playwrigh t wh o coul d encourag e
this trick might realize a decent income from publicatio n right s and avoid
the pitfall s o f dramati c piracy , s o entrenche d i n th e Britis h theatr e tha t
three attempt s a t lega l refor m (1833 , 1842 , an d 1911 ) wer e neede d t o
change th e practice s o f managers , publishers , an d agent s accustome d t o
dividing among themselves the benefits owed the playwright.

Shaw improvised a strategy for writing, designing, printing, binding, and
marketing hi s play s tha t woul d recogniz e th e valu e o f hi s labo r whil e
fashioning hi s authorial persona as a literary socialist with high-art appeal .
Even as he planned to publish his plays, he pushed to have them produced
in Englan d an d th e US , hopin g the y woul d succee d i n drawin g larg e
numbers o f spectators , which they eventually did . But he recognized that ,
more ofte n tha n not , th e economics o f play production an d th e power of
the censor worked against the challenging dramatic author. Under the right
conditions, the book-sellin g marke t woul d permi t hi m greate r acces s an d
control ove r th e productio n o f hi s work s tha n th e collaborativ e an d
traditionally exploitativ e syste m of play production. I f he could write an d
publish inexpensivel y a  "literary " drama , tha t is , entertaining dram a tha t
called attentio n t o it s commerc e wit h politics , philosophy , science , an d
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fiction, he coul d extricat e hi s labo r fro m th e gri p o f th e censo r an d th e
playwriting pirates while creating for himsel f a  position in the canon of an
emerging "modern" drama.

By 1884 , whe n Shaw' s thir d novel , An  Unsocial  Socialist, was bein g
published seriall y i n To-Day,  th e ne w "Monthl y Magazin e o f Scientifi c
Socialism," h e ha d alread y decide d agains t assignin g hi s copyrigh t t o a
publisher indefinitely . H e wrote to Swan Sonnenschein &  Co . in February
of 1885 , "I am willing that you shall have the exclusive right to publish the
book for five years on the conditions named. But the copyright must remain
my property, and the book come under my control again to alter, withdraw,
or do what I  please with" (Collected Letters, vol. I, p. 117). When Swan et
al. responded b y offering hi m a  fifteen year leas e a t a  1 0 percent royalty ,
Shaw refused , demandin g a  highe r percentage , whic h h e justifie d b y
sketching the future o f the publishing industry ove r the next fifteen years.
Shaw correctly predicte d fallin g printin g costs , rising values o f monopol y
copyrights, the bankrupting o f compositors, the lowering of profits fo r the
selling an d publishin g o f work s wit h competitiv e value , an d a  ne w
preference fo r publishin g o n commission . I n the event o f a n Internationa l
Copyright Treaty, Shaw also correctly predicted tha t authors of reputation
would dea l directl y wit h publisher s i n th e U S (Collected  Letters, vol . I ,
pp. 124-25). Afte r agreein g i n th e mai n wit h Shaw' s forecast , th e firm
offered a  compromise o f a  seven years' lease at 1 0 percent royalty, renew-
able at their option at 20 percent. Shaw accepted on condition of specifying
additional points and concluded by proposing a 3 3 percent royalty rate on
foreign copyrights . Whe n th e revise d contrac t arrived , ther e wer e mor e
amendments, the most sensitive of them touching on the issue of copyright
assignment. Sha w wrote , " I hav e altere d 'shal l b e th e propert y o f t o 'i s
hereby assigne d b y th e autho r to. ' Althoug h a  copyrigh t i s persona l
property, I  believ e w e hav e n o powe r t o declar e b y a  dee d tha t i t i s the
property o f anyon e i n particular" (Collected  Letters, vol. I, p. 129). Shaw
clearly claimed the copyright as his and his alone.

The serializing of An Unsocial  Socialist brought Shaw no payment fro m
the editor s o f To-Day,  bu t i t di d brin g hi m t o th e attentio n o f Willia m
Morris an d Anni e Besant , th e socialis t publishe r o f Our  Corner,  who
eventually ran two more of his novels in serial form. The novels never drew
much notic e beyon d thi s circle , and Sha w eventually abandone d attempt s
to write long works of prose fiction, announcing five years after completin g
his third and last novel, "I tried novelizing again .  . .  but I could not stand
the form: i t is too clumsy and unreal . Sometimes in spare moments I write
dialogues. .  . .  When I  have a  few hundre d o f thes e dialogue s worke d u p
and interlocked, then a  drama wil l be the result" (Collected  Letters, vol. I,
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pp. 221-22) . Sha w th e faile d novelis t ha d n o desir e t o cour t furthe r
rejection, whil e Sha w th e Fabia n socialis t suspecte d tha t sermonizin g i n
dialogue repudiated "individualism " more readily than sermonizing in long
narrative blocks . I n th e 188 7 appendi x t o An  Unsocial  Socialist, Shaw
expressed wha t Michae l Holroy d ha s calle d hi s purita n preferenc e fo r
romantic fiction over social fact (Bernard  Shaw, p. 121). But the uneasiness
also coul d b e rea d a s Shaw' s suspicio n o f a  single-voice d narrativ e tha t
crowds out social facts.8 In the "hundred of these dialogues worked up and
interlocked," Shaw may have anticipated a  social reality emerging from the
interplay o f voice s i n conflict . I n an y case , lookin g bac k fifty years later ,
Shaw claimed " I really hated thos e five novels . . . I  wrote novel s because
everybody did so then; and the theatre, my rightful kingdom , was outside
literature." (Collected  Letters, vol . IV , p. 675) Durin g th e 1890s , Sha w
would wor k t o brin g Moder n Dram a withi n th e real m o f literatur e b y
securing the publication of his plays in carefully prepare d editions aimed at
the growing market of literate readers.

While struggling to write novels he would late r claim to hate, the Shaw
of the 1880 s was formulating a  political identity that would have implica-
tions for hi s dealings with the publishing trade . Shaw's reading of the first
volume o f Kar l Marx' s Das  Capital  (i n Frenc h translation ) i s widel y
described a s occurrin g agains t th e backdro p o f hi s prio r reverenc e fo r
Henry George's land nationalism and single tax doctrine, his flirtation wit h
H. M . Hyndman' s Socia l Democrati c Federatio n (SDF) , an d hi s earl y
involvement wit h Secularism , Iconoclasm , an d othe r varietie s o f free -
thinking.9 Joining the Fabian Societ y o n May 16 , 1884 , and it s executive
committee i n January o f 1885,  marked Shaw' s shif t fro m anarchis m an d
the Marxism of the SDF toward the middle-class evolutionary socialism of
the Fabians. By 1886, the Fabians had broke n with the revolutionary SDF
and wit h th e anti-constitutiona l anarchist s an d th e Socialis t League . The
Fabian Manifest o o f 188 7 declare d thei r "permeation " strategy b y which
they woul d influenc e nationa l polic y b y becomin g politicall y activ e a t al l
levels, especially the local , or municipal level . From such loca l activism, a
national socialist movement would grow.10

Like mos t Englis h reader s o f Mar x throughou t th e 1880s , Sha w sub -
scribed to three essential political principles: a belief in "a labour theory of
value, a n iro n la w o f wages , an d th e ide a tha t monopolie s underli e
exploitation" (Bevir , "Th e Marxis m o f Georg e Bernar d Shaw, " p . 303).
Beyond thes e commonl y hel d principles , Sha w ha d uniqu e belief s wit h
regard t o huma n natur e an d economi c competition , severa l o f whic h h e
illustrated i n his early novels.11 The practice o f economics, believed Shaw,
grew fro m th e essentiall y self-intereste d natur e o f eac h huma n being .
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Competition betwee n capitalist s would favor th e economy of larger firms ,
thus creatin g a  tendency towar d monopolie s an d trusts . Breaking u p an d
preventing monopolie s an d trust s woul d "naturally " lea d t o a  free-trad e
Utopia (Bevir, "The Marxism of George Bernard Shaw," pp. 305-06).

Shaw encourage d capitalis t publisher s t o compet e fo r hi s wor k a s a
means o f safeguardin g hi s authorial interes t an d securin g favorable royal -
ties and othe r terms . His effort s i n this regard coul d onl y be described a s
prodigious, a s witnesse d b y hi s exchang e o f letter s wit h publisher s an d
editors. I n Marc h o f 1885 , Time  published Shaw' s shor t stor y o f sixtee n
pages, "Th e Miraculou s Revenge, " togethe r wit h hi s boo k revie w o f
Michael Davitt' s "Leave s from a  Prison Diary," a  review Sha w undertoo k
at th e reques t o f Time  publishe r Mis s Abdy-Williams, who requeste d th e
review a t a  meeting o f th e Fabian Society . When sen t a  check fro m Time
publishers Swa n Sonnenschei n &c  Co . for £ 3 3sod, Sha w returned i t with
the reques t tha t h e b e pai d th e ful l amoun t owin g him , £ 9 9s od. Soo n
thereafter h e wrote Mis s Abdy-Williams fo r clarification , explaining , "[I] t
is quite impossible for me to express to you how emphatically I would have
refused t o review Michael Davit t fo r a  capitalist magazine fo r nothin g . . .
We said nothing at all about payment: I concluding that there would be no
question abou t th e usua l terms " (Collected  Letters, vol . I , p. 122) . Shaw
defined fo r Swan et al. the "usual terms" to be \ guinea per page, "the usual
rate of payment for a  shilling magazine," adding acidly, "and the rate paid
to th e contributor s t o Tim e whe n i t wa s \  it s presen t price " [Collected
Letters, vol. 1, p. 123).

Shaw delivered t o the same publisher i n October o f 188 5 a  brie f lesso n
on the role of the free market in setting his value as a writer: "My standing
and the value of my work are fixed by the operation of the market; and you
are no more in a position to fix my price at four an d threepence than I  am
to fix  i t a t 40 0 an d threepence " [Collected  Letters,  vol . 1 , p. 144). In a n
exchange lasting eight months, Shaw and Swan et al. illustrated competing
views o f th e literar y market , wit h Swa n claiming to determin e fee s base d
upon thei r persona l judgmen t o f a  particula r writer' s worth , an d Sha w
insisting tha t thei r judgmen t wa s no t independen t o f th e sam e marke t
forces controlling his own worth and other publishers' pricing practices. It
does no t appea r tha t Sha w "won " i n thi s exchange , bu t h e secure d th e
satisfaction o f deliverin g " a coupl e o f essay s o n P[olitical ] E[conomy] "
(Collected Letters, vol . I , p. 144) to publisher s wh o were fighting to kee p
the uppe r han d i n negotiation s wit h authors . Th e 188 4 formin g o f th e
Society of Authors, which Shaw joined in 1887, signaled the beginning of a
shift in the balance of power that would eventually favor the author during
publishing negotiations.
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By 1889 , Sha w th e Fabia n wa s relishin g th e prospec t o f publishin g
Fabian Essays, approaching many of the same publishers who had rejected
his fiction an d notin g privately , "Ther e i s nothing lik e [th e Essays] in the
market &c  it i s commercially  unproducible"  (Collected  Letters,  vol . I ,
p. 225) . Th e volum e woul d appea l b y virtu e o f it s uniqueness , whil e
retaining it s Fabia n differenc e fro m commercia l best-sellers . Th e Essays
were originall y t o hav e bee n undertake n b y Unwi n Brothers ' firm  a t
Chilworth, which, since 1889 , had been involved in a union wage dispute.
When chairma n Edwar d Unwi n refuse d t o permi t th e secretar y o f th e
London Societ y o f Compositor s to attend a  conference i n 188 9 to discuss
fair wages , Sha w withdre w th e Essays  and redirecte d th e printin g jo b t o
Arthur Bonner' s "fai r house " (Collected  Letters, vol . 1 , p. 283). Signifi -
cantly, Sha w supervise d al l facet s o f production , pai d fo r entirel y b y the
Fabians. Th e Essays  first  appeare d i n Decembe r o f 1889 . Th e origina l
1,000 copies , distributed fro m Edwar d Pease' s flat , "wen t u p like smoke"
and the volume proved a  surprisingly stead y seller . Later, in September of
1890, the Fabians published a "cheap" (six shilling) edition with the Walter
Scott Publishing Co., using the plates they purchased from Bonner.

By September o f 1890 , Shaw was writing to Will H. Dircks, editor an d
reader o f the Walter Scot t Publishing Co. , who had offered t o increase the
royalty rat e o n the essays by a halfpenny. Sha w retorted tha t th e increas e
had bee n owin g th e Fabian s al l along . Sha w furthe r rejecte d Dircks' s
presumption tha t th e Fabians would agre e to a  two-shilling cloth edition ,
suggesting instead , "W e might no t objec t t o allowin g yo u t o prin t a  hal f
crown edition on large paper, provided you gave us sixpence a copy or so"
(Collected Letters, vol . I , p. 260). (Durin g Shaw' s absence , a  spli t Fabia n
executive committe e accepte d Dirck' s proposa l fo r a  tw o shillin g clot h
edition, provokin g Sha w t o writ e t o Pease , "As s tha t I  was t o trus t m y
copyright to a council of pigeons!" [Collected Letters, vol. I, p. 265].)

When Sha w complete d th e financial analysis i n hi s lette r t o Dircks , he
turned t o a n aestheti c critique , blastin g Scott' s cove r desig n an d rejectin g
the handbil l "wit h disdain. " Typeface , typ e size , and choic e o f reviewers '
extracts al l called forth Shaw' s mock rage, topped b y a threat that , should
Scott eve n conside r redesignin g th e cove r o f hi s novel , Cashel  Byron, t o
include a  desig n "o f som e pugilistic kin d .  . .  without first submitting th e
cover t o me , I  wil l hav e you r heart' s blood " (Collected  Letters, vol . I ,
p. 260) . The pugilis t figure did appear o n the cover o f the novel , presum-
ably with Shaw's approval (se e Figure 3a) . With the publication o f Fabian
Essays, Sha w bega n t o exercis e contro l ove r th e design , printing , an d
publishing o f hi s books in a manner consisten t with hi s Fabian principles ,
which included using union (or equivalently paying) printers, protecting his

30



Cambridge Companions Online © Cambridge University Press, 2006

Imprinting the stag e

3 a Cove r of the American edition of Cashel Byron with pugilist figure as a
marketing device
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copyright a s a  propert y right , maximizin g hi s royaltie s b y stimulatin g
competition, and exercising control over book production, from th e setting
of plates to the setting of prices.

The success of the Essays  boosted Shaw' s career as an (unpaid ) lecturer ,
whose appearance s o n th e platfor m had,  unti l thi s time , bee n limite d
primarily t o Sundays . B y Septembe r o f 1890 , Sha w record s i n a  letter ,
"[T]hirteen lectures within thirteen days" (Collected Letters, vol. 1, p. 262),
and note s on e mont h later , "M y addresse s wer e magnificen t -  mos t o f
them; bu t the y neede d t o b e multiplie d b y dozen s t o b e o f muc h use "
(Collected Letters,  vol . 1 , p . 267). Shaw' s devotio n t o Fabia n publi c
speaking both in London and in the provinces coincided with a near tripling
of Londo n Fabia n membership s (fro m 30 0 t o nearl y 900 ) betwee n th e
years 1890 and 1899 . Provincial memberships increased rapidly from 189 0
to 1893 , peaking at about 1,50 0 (McBriar , Fabian Socialism, pp. 165-66) .
In retrospect , however , Sha w judge d hi s orator y harshly , tellin g Len a
Ashwell, "My career as a public speaker was not only futile politically . .  .
It was sometimes disgraceful an d degrading" (quoted in Holroyd, Bernard
Shaw, p. 196) . Public speaking , the contingent , embodie d performanc e o f
political convictio n t o a  randomly gathere d audience , later embarrassed a
Shaw who had becom e adept a t professionalizing hi s political an d artisti c
efforts.

Ibsen: artform meet s platfor m

In hi s nex t publication , The  Quintessence  of Ibsenism  (London , Walte r
Scott Publishin g Company , 1891) , Sha w reconcile d hi s politica l an d
aesthetic principles , finding in Ibsen a  compelling criti c o f Victoria n can t
and a  symbo l fo r hi s ow n iconoclas m an d tha t o f hi s fello w Secularists ,
Richard Aveling, Eleanor Marx, and others. Shaw's iconoclasm - a  cheerful
rejection of dogmatism in favor of skepticism - wa s illustrated by his claim,
"I never gave up an old belie f withou t feeling incline d to give three cheers
and jum p int o th e air " (Collected  Letters, vol . I , p. 302). I t wa s roughl y
synonymous wit h "freethinking " an d evolutionar y i n it s progress . Th e
"freethinking will " could gro w an d develo p withi n a n individual' s worl d
view, just a s Fabian socialis m would grow and spread throughou t Englis h
society. But freethinking wa s not compatible with al l forms o f socialism, a
strategic poin t Sha w made befor e th e Fabia n Society , where h e embrace d
Ibsen as a freethinking Fabia n socialist and an enemy of idealist socialism.

The Quintessence  bega n a s Shaw' s contributio n t o th e Fabia n lectur e
series, "Socialism in Contemporary Literature," proposed in the late spring
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of 1890 . Shaw selected Ibsen as his subject and spent two months writing a
lecture tha t eventuall y raise d a  stor m o f controvers y (Holroyd , Bernard
Shaw, p . 197) . Fo r th e mos t part , th e publishe d essa y expand s upo n th e
lecture, but Shaw deleted several fragments o f the original lecture from the
published book . Thes e fragments , printe d i n J . L . Wisenthal' s Shaw  and
Ibsen,12 revea l th e particula r politica l contex t withi n whic h Sha w con -
structed Ibsen as an anti-idealist. "With Ibsen's thesis in one's mind," wrote
Shaw in an excised fragment, "i t is impossible to think without concern of
the appalling adaptibility [sic]  o f Socialism to idealist purposes .  . .  and [a]
consequent numbe r o f member s whos e entir e devotio n t o th e idea l o f
Socialism enable s the m t o enlis t unde r th e re d fla g a s revolutionar y
socialists withou t meanin g anythin g whateve r b y th e word . I  know tha t
many of my colleagues believe that we shall never enlist enthusiasm for our
cause unles s we, like the gentleman i n [Ibsen's ] Pillar s o f Society , hold u p
the banne r o f th e ideal " (quote d i n Wisenthal , Shaw  and  Ibsen,  p . 89).
Shaw continues , "Socialis m mean s practicall y th e nationalizatio n o f lan d
and capital , an d nothin g else . Ye t w e ar e constantl y tol d b y ou r ow n
members that we lay too much stress on the economic side of socialism . . .
The idealis t Socialis t alway s rebel s agains t a  reductio n o f socialis m t o
practice .  . ." (Wisenthal, Shaw and Ibsen, p. 90). The lecture provided the
political occasio n fo r Shaw' s frontal attac k o n what h e called the "idealis t
socialism" of the Marxists, an attack tha t used Ibsen's plays as a powerfu l
aesthetic springboard . Bu t in revising and expanding th e two-hour lectur e
for th e first  publishe d editio n o f 1891 , Sha w woul d relegat e th e intra -
socialist quarre l t o a  submerged , simmerin g text , lendin g subterranea n
intensity to his defense o f Ibsen as a debunker o f the ideal . Of the several
lecture segments omitted from th e published version , the longest pointedly
condemns th e anarchis t Socia l Democrati c Federatio n an d th e Socialis t
League, calling down - b y name - those Shaw felt had sacrificed the practice
of socialis m fo r th e satisfactio n o f proclaimin g it s ideals . I n revisin g hi s
lecture fo r publication , Sha w strategicall y avoide d exposin g socialis t di -
visions, bending hi s energies instea d o n expanding hi s literary analysi s t o
give his work the heft o f an extended and current critical analysis of Ibsen's
plays. With the significan t omissio n o f hi s pointed attac k o n the SDF and
the Socialis t League , Shaw's lecture provided th e majorit y o f th e materia l
for th e 189 1 published edition . The new material -  a n essay entitled "Th e
Two Pioneers " comparing Shelle y and Ibsen , a n analysi s o f Emperor  and
Galilean and Hedda Gabler, as well as expanded analyses and descriptions
of othe r individua l play s -  concentrate d solel y o n hi s literar y an d philo -
sophical analysis of Ibsen. The layering of art and politics accomplished in
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Shaw's Quintessence  foreshadowed th e late r Preface s writte n t o lengthe n
and mediate the reader's introduction to his published plays.

Five month s afte r readin g hi s lectur e befor e th e Fabia n Society , Sha w
wrote t o Frenc h socialis t Jule s Magny , " I hop e soo n t o ge t i t int o print .
When Ibsen's new play appears, I shall complete my paper by an analysis of
it, and then se t to in earnest t o get i t published" (Collected  Letters,  vol. I,
p. 277) . Shaw recognized th e potentia l o f hi s lecture -  widel y reported i n
London newspaper s a s wel l a s Europea n capitals , whic h als o covere d
Ibsen's responses to reports of the lecture - t o attract a  readership, writing
in the Preface to his 1891 edition: "I had laid [th e lecture] aside as a piece
d* occasion which had served its turn, when the production of Rosmersholm
at the Vaudeville Theatre .  . .  the inauguration o f the Independent Theatr e
by Mr . J.T . Grei n .  . . an d th e sensatio n create d b y th e experimen t o f
Elizabeth Robin s an d Mario n Le a wit h Hedda  Gabler,  started a  franti c
newspaper controversy, in which I could see no sign of any of the disputants
having .  . . ma[d]e u p hi s mind definitel y a s to what Ibsen' s plays meant ,
and to defend hi s view face to face .  . . And I came to the conclusion tha t
my explanation migh t as well be placed in the field until a  better could be
found" (Wisenthal , Shaw and Ibsen, p. 104). Controversy created readers ,
and it was no doubt the wave of public interest in "Ibsenism" together with
a heated response to his lecture, that prompted Shaw to try his fortunes by
expanding i t int o a  short , book-lengt h monograp h eventuall y titled , The
Quintessence of Ibsenism.

Shaw appears to have intended al l along to offer th e first edition of The
Quintessence to Walte r Scot t fo r publication , i n spit e o f goadin g Fishe r
Unwin in March of 189 1 to make an extravagant counter-bid : "I have .  . .
attacked th e Ibsen essay. .  . Scott is immensely on to it . . . I  suppose you
are no t particularl y swee t o n it . I f yo u are , sen d m e b y return o f pos t a
cheque for £5,000, with an agreement securing me a 66^%  royalty , not to
commence unti l th e sixteent h copy " (Collected  Letters, vol . I , p . 286).
Three week s late r Sha w advise d Unwi n i n a  statemen t balancin g gentle -
manly honor with free market socialism, "I am in a certain degree bound to
Scott, provided  he  offers  me  no  worse  terms  than  anyone  else  [m y
emphasis]: partl y becaus e h e ha s behave d handsomel y t o Ibse n .  . . an d
partly becaus e h e published Cashe l Byro n .  . .  (The shilling edition o f the
Essays [i.e . the Fabian  Essays] -  20,00 0 o f the m al l sol d a t on e volle y -
must hav e recoupe d hi m a  bit) " (Collected  Letters, vol . I , p . 293). Scot t
published 2,10 0 copies of the book in September of 189 1 at a price of two
shillings, si x pence. 13 Tw o pirate d U S editions -  a  commo n occurrenc e
during thi s perio d -  wer e issue d i n 189 1 an d 1894. 14 Al l told , The
Quintessence sold 2,000 copies between 1891 and 1897.
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Play publishing begins: Widowers9 Houses

During the next three years, from 1891-94 , Shaw became generally known
as a public figure in London (Collected  Letters,  vol. I, p. 107) , publishing
seven distinct political tracts, and, in May of 1893 , a smal l run (500) of his
first publishe d play , Widowers'  Houses,  brough t ou t b y Henr y an d
Company as the first in the newly established "Independen t Theatre Series"
edited by J. T. Grein.

Begun in 1884 as a William Archer-G. B. Shaw collaboration, what was
originally title d Rheingold  proceede d fro m a  serie s o f "dialogues " fo r
which Willia m Arche r provide d th e outlin e an d Sha w th e language , t o a
Shaw-only project , picke d u p again i n 189 2 and complete d a s Widowers'
Houses. On November 22 , 1892, two weeks before it s opening date, Shaw
wrote t o Joh n Lan e proposin g a  "limite d editio n a t a  hig h price " an d
advising that if the play is to be printed, "i t will need all the send-off i t will
get from the criticism and discussion of the performance." As always, Shaw
had given the edition som e thought, proposing photographs o f the cast in
costume and a largish (quarto ) page, both designed to justify a n edition de
luxe (Collected  Letters,  vol . 1 , p . 370). Lan e di d no t tak e u p Shaw' s
invitation, although Shaw reported to prospective publisher Alfred T . Nutt
one mont h late r tha t h e ha d receive d thre e offer s fo r it s publication . H e
repeated th e term s offere d b y Henry an d Compan y ( a half-crown editio n
with a  sixpenn y royalty ) i n hope s Nut t woul d surpas s them . Admittin g
himself somewha t beholde n t o Grei n t o accep t Henry' s offer , h e never -
theless tempte d Nut t t o surpas s thes e terms , noting mor e tha n 13 0 press
cuttings (severa l of them his own) devoted to the play: "[I]t i s the value of
the curiosit y tha t i s now i n the market, " wrot e Sha w candidly (Collected
Letters, vol. I, p. 373).

Two lessons learne d fro m hi s earlier experience s a s a  published autho r
set his strategy fo r attemptin g to secure a publisher: (1 ) the play's "value"
was of two kinds, intrinsic or literary and extrinsic or market-determined .
These two kinds of value did not necessarily coincide, but in the absence of
market value , determined b y the public's curiosity an d interes t i n a  piece,
its intrinsic or literary value was moot, particularly i f one wrote plays fo r
the purpose o f becomin g recognized an d rewarde d a s a professional play -
wright. (2 ) Th e public' s curiosit y wa s no t entirel y self-generating . Boo k
sales depended in part upon an author's reputation at the time of publishing
and i n par t upo n a  publisher' s willingnes s t o advertis e a n author' s work .
Shaw agree d t o publis h wit h Henr y an d Company , late r complainin g
bitterly tha t th e firm "never advertize d i t even once; and the sale .  . . was
150 copies!" (Collected Letters, vol. 1, p. 424).
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The arrangement bega n and ended unhappily for Shaw. With a keenness
fed by years of frustrated dealing s with capitalist publishers, Shaw drew up
a contrac t fo r th e publicatio n s o formidabl e tha t Henr y an d Compan y
found i t necessar y t o advis e him , "[W] e d o no t thin k suc h a n elaborat e
agreement necessary , especially as we do not expect the sale . . . t o recoup
us for ou r outlay, and as we are publishing your work chiefly to oblige our
Mr. Grein" (quoted in Laurence, Bibliography, vol. I, p. 23). The publisher's
subsequent refusa l t o advertis e th e pla y adde d t o Shaw' s disgust . H e
prepared o n his own an advertising sheet , and wrote a  letter to be sent by
the publishe r t o pres s correspondents . Bu t sale s appea r no t t o hav e
exceeded tw o o r thre e hundre d copies . O f course , Sha w ma y no t hav e
expected great sales from the play, subtitled "An Original Didactic Realistic
Play i n Thre e Acts, " suited t o th e coteri e audience s o f th e Independen t
Theatre Society , but , i n Shaw' s words , "to o experimental " t o b e pu t o n
elsewhere (Collected Letters, vol. I, p. 372).

The hazards of publication

For fiv e year s followin g th e disappointin g publicatio n o f Widowers'
Houses, Shaw wrote and produced plays at a prodigious rate, but withheld
them fro m publication . Focusin g o n playwritin g an d productio n repre -
sented an economy of effort a s well as a recognition o f the vexed status of
copyright i n England an d the US. There were, in fact, disincentive s a t this
period fo r dramati c authors to publish thei r playscripts . As J. R. Stephens
has demonstrated , Englan d an d th e U S had distinct , mutuall y exclusive ,
and mutuall y discouragin g law s governin g dramati c copyright . Englis h
publication o f a  scrip t meant , i n effect , forfeitin g th e Britis h playwright' s
US rights; US publication effectivel y deprive d America n author s o f British
copyright protection . Wilso n Barret t warne d playwrigh t Henr y Arthu r
Jones in 1879 , "Are you aware that b y printing your plays and publishing
them, yo u forfei t you r America n rights ? A  play kep t i n MS or printe d i n
slip a s M S fo r us e o f actor s onl y i s t o a  certai n exten t protecte d i n th e
United States " (quote d i n Stephens , The  Profession  of  the  Playwright,
p. 104) . British law treated U S stage performance a s "publication"; there -
fore, whe n a  British play was pirated i n a US city in advance o f perform -
ance in Britain, the author forfeite d hi s or her British copyright protectio n
(p. 104) . Shaw was typical of British playwrights in expressing uncertainty
about th e "international " situatio n regardin g copyrigh t a t thi s time . H e
asked T . Fisher Unwin i n 1895,  "IP]o I  forfeit m y American stagerigh t if
publication precede s performance ? I f I  could secur e bot h copyright s an d
stagerights intact here and in America, I should be strongly tempted to try a

36



Cambridge Companions Online © Cambridge University Press, 2006

Imprinting the stage

volume o f dramas " (Collected  Letters,  vol . I , p . 574). Suc h uncertaint y
would have discouraged publication , given the long-established practic e of
piracy on both sides of the Atlantic. In an 1896 letter attempting to interest
Grant Richards in publishing what became the two-volume Plays Pleasant
and Unpleasant,  Shaw note d tha t tw o o f th e play s ha d no t ye t bee n
performed, addin g "[I]t would be better to wait until after thei r production
before printin g them" (Collected  Letters, vol. I, p . 698). Shaw coined the
term "stagerighting " t o describ e wha t becam e hi s an d others ' commo n
practice o f stagin g a t leas t on e (typicall y hast y an d low-budget ) Britis h
production of a play to secure its copyright. The point of stagerighting was
to prohibi t th e first  performanc e o f a  Britis h pla y occurrin g i n th e US ,
which would nullify it s copyright protection in Britain. Shaw had the belief
(eventually proved true by Man and Superman) tha t hi s stage reception in
the US was more favorable tha n i n England, and tha t h e therefore ha d t o
secure U S productio n an d publicatio n right s fo r hi s work s quickl y an d
efficiently.

Shaw wrote all three of what came to be called the "unpleasant" plays -
Widowers3 Houses  (1892) , Th e Philandere r (1893) , an( ^ Airs . Warren's
Profession (1893) ~ f°r t n e Independen t Theatre Society , but only the first
of thes e actuall y premiere d a t J. T . Grein' s theatre . In each o f thes e earl y
plays, Shaw worked towar d adaptin g dramati c conventions to his critique
of moder n capitalism , an d i n eac h th e critiqu e becam e mor e deepl y
submerged. Widowers'  Houses,  showing "the rich suburban vill a standin g
on th e rent s o f th e fou l rookery, " wa s designe d t o pleas e th e audienc e
artistically while inducing them "to vote on the Progressive side at the next
County Counci l election in London."15 Whether or not i t succeeded a t the
polls, the play failed amon g critics , including William Archer , and ran fo r
only tw o performances . Bu t th e popula r press' s genera l condemnatio n o f
the piec e was a  powerfu l for m o f advertisin g an d indicate d tha t th e play
had hi t a nerve. Shaw wrote on . The Philanderer, Shaw' s second play, was
to b e a  fronta l attac k o n capitalis t marriag e an d divorc e custom s tha t
would incorporat e th e emergin g figure  o f "Th e Ne w Woman " an d he r
opposite "The Womanly Woman" in a parody of Ibsenite progressives. J. T.
Grein woul d no t eve n conside r th e piec e fo r th e Independen t Theatre ,
calling i t "excessivel y verbose. " Sha w himsel f ha d intende d tha t i t b e
"unspeakably improper, " wit h th e understandin g tha t suc h impropriet y
would stimulate interest, attention, and even perhaps reform. He hoped for
commercial success , telling Harle y Granvill e Barker , "Whe n I  work [The
Philanderer] up with a little extra horse play, it will go like mad" (quoted in
Holroyd, Bernard  Shaw,  p . 288). Bu t h e recognize d tha t h e wa s stil l
learning th e ar t o f playwriting : "I'v e al l bu t finished  anothe r play, " h e
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wrote Archer chidingly in May of 1893 , "a s te P neare r to something more
than talk about what plays ought to be" (Collected Letters, vol. I, p. 395).
Shaw periodically urged Archer to write plays rather than talk about what
they shoul d be . On e yea r later , h e too k u p dramati c criticis m fo r th e
Saturday Review,  bu t di d s o t o suppor t hi s effort s a s a  playwright .
Optimistic and determined, Shaw swallowed the failure o f his second play
and si x week s late r wa s agai n playwriting , returnin g thi s tim e t o th e
didactic mode of his first play, cleansed o f the autobiographical reference s
he came to despise in The Philanderer, and even more defiantly outrageou s
in his choice of subject: prostitution. He originally subtitled Mrs.  Warren's
Profession "A Tragic variatio n o n th e them e o f 'Cashe l Byron' s Profes -
sion,'" using the socially disreputable profession a s a metaphor for the way
in whic h societ y actuall y conduct s it s busines s (Holroyd , Bernard  Shaw,
p. 290) . I n Mrs.  Warren's  Profession,  Shaw directe d hi s correctiv e pe n
toward th e fiction  o f "clean " moneymakin g an d exposed , throug h th e
metaphor o f prostitution, capitalism' s coupling of gender, money, sex, and
freedom disguise d b y middle-clas s "famil y values. " When Mrs.  Warren's
Profession was not only refused a  license by the Lord Chamberlain but also
refused productio n b y J. T . Grein who found i t "unfi t fo r women' s ears, "
Shaw backed off from thesi s drama and began to write plays with a chance
of bein g produce d -  romanti c comedie s o f th e "privat e imagination "
(Holroyd, Bernard Shaw, p. 297).

Shaw wrot e hi s first  thre e play s throug h hi s dee p engagemen t wit h
socialism and the theatre. But how he wrote them expressed his determina-
tion t o gaug e th e public' s interes t an d t o gai n i f no t popularity , a t leas t
notoriety, fo r himself . Later , perhaps , the y woul d b e publishe d an d
purchased by readers already familiar with the phenomenon of G. B. Shaw.
Notoriety ha d t o preced e publication , sinc e th e growin g Englis h book -
buying publi c was no t a t thi s time incline d t o purchas e playtext s a s mid-
priced "books" but as inexpensive mementoes of performances.

On Novembe r 26 , 1893 , Sha w bega n a  "romantic " pla y fo r Florenc e
Farr that was to become Arms and the Man. When it opened on April 21,
1894, i t prove d a  success , an d Shaw' s caree r a s a  dramatis t bega n i n
earnest: "[Arms  and the Man] has produced reputation , discussion , adver -
tisement; it has brought me enough money to live on for six months, during
which I  wil l writ e tw o mor e plays " (Collected  Letters, p . 458). T o b e a
dramatist meant to be produced, to be applauded, to be paid, and, if he had
his way, to be published.

The next three years would b e crucial in establishing Shaw' s future a s a
published author . I n Jul y o f 1894 , Sha w announce d (somewha t prema -
turely, a s i t turne d out ) tha t h e wa s surrenderin g journalis m fo r play -
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writing, droppin g hi s World  columns a t th e en d o f th e seaso n (Collected
Letters, vol. I, p. 448). By 1895, Shaw was hoping to follow the example of
John Ruskin , who had acte d a s his own publisher , binder , and distributor .
He describe d hi s plan s t o Londo n bookselle r Frederic k H . Evans , com -
plaining that publishers "combine commercial rascality with artistic touchi-
ness and pettishness, without being either good business men or fine judges
of literature." Authors and booksellers can carry on the business of bringing
good book s int o the world withou t parasiti c intermediaries . The strengt h
of th e author' s no t th e publisher' s nam e woul d determin e th e succes s o r
failure o f a  book. Pricing , typically determine d b y publishers, could mor e
accurately b e se t b y authors , a s author s kno w thei r book-buyin g public .
"My public is small and select," Shaw wrote; "if people will go past half a
crown net for a book they will go . .. t o six shillings gross: that is, four and
sixpence net " (Collected  Letters, vol . 1 , p. 543) . Shaw's description o f the
"net" an d "gross " price s o f a  boo k i s a  referenc e t o th e Ne t Boo k
Agreement, first proposed i n 189 0 by Frederick Macmillan, by which new
books would b e divided int o tw o categories , ne t books , to b e sold a t th e
published pric e without discount , and subjec t books , to be sold subject t o
discount at each bookseller's discretion. Publishers could choose whether to
publish net books, and authors could make their own terms with regard to
net publishing . B y 1899 , the recentl y forme d Publishers ' Associatio n an d
the Associate d Bookseller s agree d o n a  joint schem e fo r adoptin g th e ne t
plan.16 Book s unde r si x shilling s (wha t cam e t o b e th e typica l pric e fo r
Shaw's early volumes) did not fall under the Agreement. The spread of free
libraries justified , i n Shaw' s mind , settin g hi s price s abov e th e "popular "
level - i.e . presumably the two shillings six pence price of Quintessence and
Widowers' Houses,  published severa l year s earlier . Bu t Sha w di d no t ye t
have sufficient capita l to afford payin g outright for publishing services, and
by Marc h o f tha t year , h e tol d Elle n Terr y h e wa s "bein g presse d t o
publish" his plays, by which he meant i n the traditional fashion , wit h the
publisher assumin g the costs and agreeing to a copyright fee. The pressure
came from a  young member of the profession wh o would bring out a total
of six titles by Shaw before undergoin g his first bankruptcy proceedings in
April of 1905.

Plays Pleasant and Unpleasant

Grant Richards, son of Oxford University classics scholar Franklin Thomas
Grant Richards , followe d Sha w hom e afte r th e theatr e on e evenin g i n
November of 189 6 in an attempt to secure an agreement to publish Shaw's
first collection o f plays. Richards's publishing house would no t ope n unti l
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January o f 1897 , bu t h e was solicitin g i n advanc e th e wor k o f carefull y
selected writer s t o launc h hi s ne w enterprise . Sha w responde d wit h a
challenge: "As far a s I have been able to ascertain .  . . the public does not
read plays, or at least did not a very few years ago. Have you any reason to
suppose tha t i t ha s change d it s habits? " Bu t h e continue d t o propos e
conditions fo r suc h a  venture, one of which was simultaneous publicatio n
in America (Collected  Letters, vol. I, p. 698). With severa l stage successes
behind him , an d arme d wit h a  critica l mas s o f publishabl e pages , Sha w
agreed t o Richards' s offer . Th e attentio n t o detai l h e brough t t o th e
volumes made publishing history.

Shaw ha d writte n eigh t play s b y thi s time , th e first  si x o f whic h h e
initially propose d t o Richard s a s a  one-volume, piebald publicatio n t o be
called "Play s Pleasant and Unpleasant," with the unpleasant play s printed
in an ugly type style on light brown paper and the pleasant ones on white
paper i n Kelmscott style . Shaw fel t sur e a piebald volum e would "mak e a
sensation." In May of 1897 , Shaw announced tha t h e had accepted Gran t
Richards's offer t o publish his plays, feeling compelled to add: "I am not a
disappointed dramatis t .  . .  But in the present condition o f the theatre i t is
evident that a  dramatist like Ibsen, who .  . . throws himself o n the reading
public, is taking the only course in which any serious advance i s possible,
especially i f hi s drama s deman d muc h technica l skil l fro m th e actors "
(Collected Letters,  vol . I , p . 754). I n strikin g th e high-ar t pose , Sha w
appeared to be choosing publication over the vagaries of production, when
in fact , h e remained committe d t o the initia l productio n o f hi s new plays
and to revivals of his published plays over the next few decades. In refusing
to be described as "disappointed," Shaw was addressing the perception that
publication o f a  play signaled it s exhaustion o r failure o n the professiona l
stage, a  perception linke d t o the practice describe d earlie r o f withholdin g
publication o f a  play unti l afte r a  successful stag e run i n order t o protec t
the author' s copyright . Shaw' s mention o f Ibsen , with who m h e had lon g
felt sympathetic , was intended to substitute for an y suspicions of dramatic
failure o r stalenes s a  militan t assertio n o f artisti c integrit y i n th e fac e o f
"the present conditio n o f the theatre," including it s implied lack of skilled
actors.

The propose d projec t change d ove r severa l month s o f discussion s
between Sha w an d Richards . B y May o f 1897 , Plays  Pleasant and Un-
pleasant ha d becom e a  two-volum e publicatio n wit h volum e one , "Un -
pleasant," containing a reprint of Widowers'  Houses, The Philanderer, and
Mrs. Warren's  Profession,  and volum e two , "Pleasant, " containin g You
Never Can  Tell,  Arms and  the  Man, Candida,  and The  Man of  Destiny.
While producin g thes e tw o volume s with Gran t Richards , Sha w pu t int o
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action a publishing strategy that would last many years, centered on union-
friendly printers , simultaneous U S publication, Willia m Morri s aesthetics ,
and mid-level pricing.17 After some discussion with Richards, during which
Shaw referre d t o hi s preferenc e fo r a  "unio n house " an d subsequentl y
broadened this requirement to a fair paying house, Richards proposed R. &
R. Clark , Ltd . a s th e printe r o f th e tw o volumes . Sha w heartil y agreed ,
calling Clark a  "first-rate house " and enclosing a  letter "a s your certificat e
of complianc e wit h m y Fai r Wage s Clause " (Collected  Letters,  vol . I ,
p. 766).  Shaw used the firm for the next fifty years, writing in a centennial
tribute, "[E]ver since it printed m y first plays, Pleasant and Unpleasant, in
1898 [R. &c R. Clark] has been as natural a part of my workshop as the pen
in my hand."18 Shaw next agreed that Clark's US counterpart would be the
Chicago firm of Herbert S. Stone and his partner, Hannibal I. Kimbell, who
had been the US publishers of Widowers'  Houses in their founding yea r of
1893. Whe n Ston e an d Kimbel l separate d i n 1896 , Ston e continue d t o
publish Shaw as Herbert S. Stone & Company, until 1904.

The pricin g an d aesthetic s o f th e tw o volume s remaine d t o b e worked
out. I n pricing , Richard s prevailed , convincin g Sha w tha t th e author' s
preferred price - thre e shillings per volume and six for the set - wa s unwise.
Shaw initiall y hel d th e vie w tha t book s shoul d b e price d cheapl y t o sel l
more copies, even if this required choosing a cheaper paper. This had been
his strategy with his Fabian publications, designed to be read by the largest
possible numbe r o f readers . Richards's vie w was tha t th e volumes shoul d
be beautifu l an d five  shilling s each , sol d separately . Th e Fabia n Sha w
strenuously objected , offerin g th e (dubious ) exampl e o f a  common reade r
who would pay six shillings only for a  book o f sufficient lengt h to occupy
him for severa l Sundays. Plays, filling less reading time, could not sustain a
price equa l t o tha t o f novels . I n additio n t o length , Sha w doubte d hi s
reputation justifie d a  te n shillin g price , notin g tha t Ibsen' s play s sol d a t
three an d sixpenc e pe r volum e o f thre e play s an d tha t th e first  issue b y
Heinemann o f a  ne w pla y wa s price d a t five shillings (Collected  Letters,
vol. I, p. 808). At some point, however , Shaw relented. Richards added in
his memoirs, "I still believe I was right," and noted with satisfaction tha t by
June of 1900 , Shaw was advocating raising the price of each volume to six
shillings, t o ensur e a  profi t o f on e an d fourpenc e instea d o f a  shillin g
(Author Hunting, pp. 113 , 131).

But in aesthetics Shaw prevailed, riding - i n modest fashion -  th e wave
of the "Morris Revolution" announced by socialist William Morris, and his
colleagues, printe r Emer y Walke r an d binde r Thoma s Jame s Cobden -
Sanderson, i n Edinburgh a t a n 188 9 meeting o f th e National Associatio n
for the Advancement o f Art, and later published i n Arts and Crafts Essays
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printed in Edinburgh in 1893. Morris revived book design on the principles
established i n th e Essays  when h e founde d th e Kelmscot t Pres s i n 1890 .
The purpos e o f th e revolutio n wa s to recove r bookmakin g a s an ar t an d
craft through a knowledge of the history of papermaking, printing, illustra-
tion, an d binding . Emer y Walke r recommende d spacin g word s evenly ,
filling th e rectangle of the page with deeply black print, and selecting paper
with care. William Morris had the financial and artistic resources to put the
principles o f the revolution int o practice, turning his Hammersmith hous e
into the Kelmscot t Pres s in 1890 , commissioning his own private typefac e
and his own paper, a facsimile o f the Bolognese paper of c. 1473.19 Shaw's
acquaintance with the makers of the printing revolution dated from his pre-
Fabian days , when he attended meeting s of the Socia l Democratic Federa -
tion, from which Morris, Walker, and others withdrew in 1885 to form the
Socialist League . His membership i n the Fabian Societ y eventually settle d
the differenc e betwee n Shaw' s "municipa l socialism " an d thei r "idealis t
socialism," but he insisted on printing his books in sympathy with Morris's
principles t o th e exten t tha t h e coul d affor d t o d o so . I n fact , hi s
contribution t o publishin g histor y a t thi s tim e wa s t o demonstrat e th e
feasibility o f introducing elements of the "Kelmscott style" into the printing
of affordabl e books , includin g plays , whos e fracture d line s o f dialogu e
necessarily brok e th e solid-lookin g rectangl e o f blac k prin t prize d b y
Morris and his school. Shaw, that is , introduced a  performative prin t style
into play publishing that calle d attentio n to the singularity of hi s plays by
the materia l appearanc e o f type , paper , an d whit e spac e o n th e printe d
page. Th e "Sha w book " contribute d t o Shaw' s self-fashionin g b y estab -
lishing an instantly recognizable cover and print style. So much the better if
his book s gesture d -  modestl y -  towar d th e eleganc e o f Morris' s master -
pieces.

In his earliest correspondence with Richards, Shaw suggested that Walter
Scott's volumes of Ibsen's plays be used as a model for setting three plays to
a volume (se e Figure 3  b). The point lay both in the Ibsen example an d in
Scott's reputation a s a quality publisher. But Shaw would not settle merely
for adopting an existing template. He pushed for a closer approximation to
the Morris/Walker design , faulting the edition's setting of letterpress on the
page. Hi s objectio n presumabl y la y i n th e lac k o f unifor m spacing ,
disproportionate margins , an d faintnes s o f print . "Otherwise, " h e wrote ,
"it is not so bad" (Collected  Letters, vol. I, p. 767). As the volumes moved
into production , Sha w insiste d upo n hi s ow n syste m o f typ e an d type -
setting. H e eliminate d apostrophe s whereve r possible , encourage d tightl y
knit spacing within a  word, an d even spacing between words . This move,
inspired by Morris, was in part a corrective to a nineteenth-century practice
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3b A  page from Walter Scott's 1890 edition of Ibsen's Prose Dramas. Shaw considered this
an imperfect model for his Plays Pleasant and Unpleasant
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3 c A  sample of dialogue from a n original edition o f Three  Flays  for Puritans,  se t in
Caslon long primer soli d
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by whic h compositor s ha d permitte d excessivel y wid e spacin g betwee n
words, particularl y afte r ful l stop s an d othe r mark s o f punctuation , t o
minimize thei r typesettin g effort s an d maximiz e thei r fee s (McLean ,
Modern Book Design,  p. 34). Shaw called for eliminating "mutton quads,"
a type body used to create blank spaces at the beginning of paragraphs and
sometimes followin g a  ful l stop . I t was especiall y importan t t o eliminat e
extra spacin g in printing his plays, because he used spaces in lieu of italics
for emphasis , italics being the type style he selected for his infamously lon g
stage directions . Sha w complained o f in k tha t wa s no t blac k enoug h an d
not applie d evenly . And h e insisted o n "Morri s Margins, " broa d margin s
below an d a t th e side s o f th e pag e wit h narro w one s abov e an d a t th e
inside. These h e shrewdly characterize d a s practical rathe r tha n "artistic "
preferences, havin g dismisse d imitatio n "artisti c printing " (e.g . Josep h
Dent's Everyman Library series with pseudo-Kelmscott title and end pages)
as unnecessar y an d besid e th e poin t (Collected  Letters,  vol . I , p . 550).
Unable t o affor d a  rigi d adherenc e t o Morris' s methods , Sha w signale d
approval o f hi s revolutionar y principle s whil e applyin g them , i n Fabia n
fashion, to a practical and affordable printin g strategy.

Morris's Roots of the Mountains had been printed in Caslon Old Face at
the Chiswic k Pres s in 1892 . Shaw's pages were hand-se t (althoug h b y the
late 1880s , machine composition wa s beginning to overtake hand-setting )
in typefounder' s Caslon , lon g primer soli d (se e Figure 3c) . Determined t o
create a  visua l signatur e fo r hi s works , Sha w retaine d thi s typographica l
style unti l th e lat e 1920s , whe n h e assented , bu t onl y afte r consultin g
Emery Walker, to a  machine justified pag e set in Monotype Caslon . Shaw
succeeded i n creatin g a  visua l signatur e fo r hi s works . Th e titl e pag e o f
Plays Pleasant and Unpleasant  (see Figure 3d) was striking in its off-cente r
placement and use of bold capitals. Shaw tried variations, such as all lower
case, befor e settlin g o n 24-poin t Caslon , uppe r an d lowe r case , breakin g
words t o achiev e clos e spacing , an d endin g wit h shor t line s tha t wer e
neither space d ou t no r centered . Sha w designe d hi s titl e pag e a s a  no -
nonsense replica of his text style that became, together with the gray-green
binding of his books, an immediate identifier o f works by G. B. Shaw.

Yet, whe n al l wa s sai d an d done , sale s wer e les s tha n brisk . Richard s
brought out Plays Pleasant and Unpleasant in a first edition of 1,240 sets at
five shilling s per volume and sold 756 sets in six months. In the US during
the same period, 734 sets were sold. Shaw had not expected great sales, but
Richards was apparently disappointed . Judging from Shaw' s letter o f May
29, 1899 , the heavily indebted Richards was having regrets and so, in fact ,
was Shaw, who was threatening to move to "commission publishing" as he
would reluctantl y d o in 1903 , to avoid becomin g implicated i n Richards's
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3d Titl e page of Plays Pleasant and  Unpleasant.  Firs t example of Shaw's off-cente r
placement. Se t by R. and R. Clark , Edinburg h

financial difficulties : " I propose to take the responsibility [fo r producing my
books] on myself i n future .  . . the blame and los s will be mine .  . .  [S]end
me an exac t accoun t o f the whole transaction, an d le t me readjust i t on a
commission basi s as from th e beginning . In this way I  will make good al l
your loss ; an d yo u ca n sel l th e remainde r o f th e editio n fo r m e o n
commission" (Collected Letters, vol. II, p. 91). This does not appear to have
happened, although one year later Shaw repeated hi s offer t o publish with
Richards o n commissio n withou t makin g th e fac t publicl y known : "An d
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now, wha t abou t Three  Plays  for Puritans}  .  . .  Yo u hav e no t don e s o
amazingly well with Plays P. and Unpl (an edition of 1200 in two years) as
to feel certain tha t thi s book i s going to be a treasure. I offer t o pay for i t
(instead o f Clark) , and hold you harmless. The public and the press won't
know . . . I  wan t t o kno w definitel y an d a t once , becaus e i f i t i s t o b e
commission, I  mus t se t abou t th e printin g a t once ; an d i f i t i s t o b e a s
before, I  mus t dra w u p a n agreement " (Collected  Letters,  vol . II ,
pp. 163-64) . Thei r arrangement s remaine d "a s before, " bu t Richards' s
losses wer e quickl y catchin g u p wit h him . Th e 190 2 Mrs.  Warren's
Profession, issued as a separate impression with a new preface, was the last
of Richards' s Sha w publications . B y 1904 , Shaw's relations wit h th e no w
virtually bankrup t Richard s ha d deteriorated . I n a  lette r writte n o n
December 3 1 o f tha t year , a n exasperate d Sha w informe d Richard s that ,
due to th e publisher' s failur e t o kee p hi s plays i n print , h e was forced t o
join other autho r creditor s to have Richards adjudicated a  bankrupt. This
episode conclude d Shaw' s relianc e o n conventiona l publishin g methods .
His next play, Man and Superman, was, he believed, too long to serve as an
acting play, at least for the contemporary stage. It was, above all, a "book,"
a sustained , philosophica l comed y o f sufficien t length , breadth , an d con -
troversy to serve as Shaw's first commission publication.

Man and Superman  an d commission publishing

It was one thing to threaten Gran t Richard s with commission publishing ,
but quit e anothe r thin g t o undertak e it . Commissio n publishin g require d
two things : an autho r wit h a  reputation t o guarantee a  profitable leve l of
sales and sufficient capita l to advance the costs of composition, machining,
paper, an d binding . Sha w had bee n talkin g fo r year s abou t publishin g i n
this fashion, bu t had not, before this time, taken the risks implicit in such a
plan. Publishers ' fear s o f th e controversia l subject s addresse d b y the new
play forced Shaw' s hand and the healthy profits o f £3,000 or more earned
from th e U S ru n o f Devil's  Disciple  mus t hav e bolstere d hi s courag e
(Collected Letters, vol. 11, p . 30) . When Man and Superman failed t o bring
an offe r fro m Britis h o r American publishers , Shaw took th e decisive step
in the summer o f 190 3 an d commissione d Archibal d Constabl e &  Co . to
serve as the distributing agent for his works. Shaw liked to do business with
politically sympatheti c firms  o r a t leas t wit h firms  recommende d b y hi s
political/artistic allies . At Shaw' s request , th e photographe r Frederic k H .
Evans ha d suggeste d th e firm  o f Constable . A  subsequen t agreement ,
executed i n a few scribbled line s on a single sheet of paper ( a radical shif t
from Shaw' s ultra-legal contrac t fo r Henr y &  Co. ) lasted from 190 3 unti l
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his death. Clark's of Edinburgh, as always, set the edition. Eager to publish
simultaneously o n bot h side s o f th e Atlantic , refusin g t o us e Ston e wh o
(Shaw believed) had failed t o market his works aggressively, and without a
willing US substitute, Sha w found himsel f force d t o ac t o n a  commission
basis. He sent the edition already se t and printed b y Clark's of Edinburg h
to William Dana Orcutt of the University Press, Cambridge, Massachusetts,
with instructions to set it following Clark's example. The results occasioned
one o f Shaw' s mor e thoroug h lesson s o n th e economic s an d aesthetic s of
book publishing , includin g a  referenc e t o "Morri s Margins":  "You r
margins are very far from the Mazarin Bible. Your top margin is a full inch
- much  too wide .  . .  and the lower only i± " . . .  Try ±" for the top margin
. .  . measurin g fro m th e to p lin e o f th e tex t .  . .  The inne r margin s ar e
monstrous -  | " eac h .  . . The rul e her e i s simple : the book , whe n open ,
should look as if there were no division (down the middle) at all" [Collected
Letters, vol. n, pp. 353"54>-

After securin g U S copyright , Sha w planne d t o wai t unti l sufficien t
interest woul d b e wakened i n the US to come to an arrangement wit h a n
American publishe r an d orde r a n editio n t o b e printe d a t once . Sha w
claimed to have spent £70 cash (Collected Letters, vol. 11, p. 367; Laurence
lists £60, Bibliography,  vol . 1, p. 54) securing the American "electros, " or
printed plates , which mad e hi m "maste r o f th e (publishing ) situation " i n
the US. But it wasn't unti l 1904 , when he formalized a  printing agreement
with Brentano's , the US firm recommended to him by James Huneker, that
had fo r severa l year s bee n publishin g pirate d edition s o f hi s works , tha t
Shaw could ensure the commission publishing of this and later works in the
US. Brentano's took ove r the stereos of Man and Superman after agreein g
to pay Shaw a royalty o f 2 5 percent on sales, an agreement that remaine d
in effect unti l 1933 (Collected Letters, vol. II, p. 420). Assuming ownership
of hi s plate s gav e Sha w leverag e t o secur e a  slightl y mor e favorabl e
copyright, on e of the greatest advantage s o f his commission arrangement .
The res t o f th e term s o f th e agreemen t woul d likel y hav e matche d thos e
regularly insiste d upo n b y Sha w an d describe d t o Methue n &  Co . i n a
letter solicitin g thei r interes t i n Man and Superman:  an exac t counting of
copies (thirtee n copies being counted a s such and not , following th e usual
custom o f th e time , a s twelve) ; inclusion o f a  "fai r wages " clause (whic h
Shaw attempte d t o pas s of f a s politica l expedienc y fo r th e "defenc e o f
parliamentary author s agains t hostil e electioneerin g agents") ; a  limited ,
five-year license t o publish ; an d simultaneou s cross-Atlanti c publicatio n
(Collected Letters, vol. II, pp. 310-11). Methuen respectfull y declined . In
the cas e o f Man  and  Superman,  commissio n publishin g raise d Shaw' s
royalties fro m 2 0 to 2 5 per cent ; retained th e "fai r wages " provision an d
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the requirement fo r simultaneou s publicatio n i n England an d the US; and
put Sha w i n contro l o f selectin g a  printer , binder , an d distributor . Fou r
years later, Shaw told an old friend tha t the "blazing" American succes s of
Man and Superman - o n the stage rather than the page -  ha d largely been
responsible fo r raisin g hi s writin g incom e t o £13,00 0 fo r a  singl e yea r
(Collected Letters, vol. II, p. 792). As a published book, it received initially
very different treatment , having been briefly removed from the open shelves
of the New York Public Library in 1905. In the US, production rather than
publication initiall y brough t Shaw' s succes  de  scandale  befor e larg e
numbers o f theatregoers . Bu t Sha w wa s satisfie d tha t hi s commissio n
experiment wa s workin g t o hi s advantage . I n a  lette r t o Gran t Richard s
dated Marc h 20 , 1904 , he too k car e t o poin t ou t th e relativ e benefit s o f
publishing o n commission , notin g tha t a t a  customary U S price o f $1.2 5
and a British price of six shillings, Constable sold 2,707 copies of Man and
Superman in the first six months following publication, with a net author's
profit of £148 2 s iod . Over an eighteen month period, Grant Richards had
sold only 1,42 1 copie s of Three  Plays for Puritans for a  net author's profi t
well under £100.

Conclusion: "Moder n Drama " and the printe d pla y

By 1903 , Sha w ha d worke d throug h a  printing , pricing , an d publishin g
strategy that agreed with his Fabian principles while claiming for the mid-
priced printed drama an aesthetic and economic status previously reserved
largely for novels and poetry. Both Shaw's Prefaces and his stage directions,
inserted fo r th e benefi t o f the reader rathe r tha n the playgoer, looked an d
functioned lik e glosses to the printed text , giving them the appearance and
the "value " o f novels . A s mentione d earlier , Sha w believe d tha t reader s
equated the value of a printed work in part with the length of time it would
take them to read th e work . Preface s adde d lengt h a s well a s literary an d
political interest to his playscripts, ensuring readers their "money' s worth"
with a n entertainmen t o f novelisti c scope , politica l topicality , an d comi c
levity. Shaw als o believe d tha t th e sal e o f hi s work reste d o n a  smal l bu t
growing public's acquaintance with his (public) self. Consequently, he titled
his publishe d Prefac e i n Plays  Pleasant  and Unpleasant  "Mainly abou t
Myself," a n essa y intende d t o enlarg e hi s marke t shar e b y increasing th e
public's knowledge of hi s opinions, his history, and his checkered fortune s
as a published author . Bu t while Shaw actually disclose d very little abou t
"himself," he gave a professional's behind-the-scene s accoun t of the devel-
opment and difficulties o f dramatic authorship imposed by several business
and institutiona l practices , chie f amon g the m th e offic e o f th e Lor d
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Chamberlain. Offerin g inside r knowledg e abou t th e controversie s withi n
the playwriting profession, Sha w rewarded his readers with "investigative"
discoveries counterpointed b y Fabian polemic.

In this two-volume collection, the longest preface accompanie d the most
controversial play , Mrs.  Warren's  Profession, suggesting Sha w use d Pre -
faces no t onl y t o engag e an d rewar d th e reade r bu t als o t o mediat e th e
reader's reception o f the drama. The Prefaces, that is , served as condition-
ing rooms through which readers were invited to pass on their way to the
plays. Thi s practic e continue d i n hi s nex t collection , Three  Plays  for
Puritans (Grant Richards, 1901), whose general Preface, running half again
as lon g a s the genera l Prefac e t o Plays  Pleasant and Unpleasant,  focused
once more o n inside r knowledg e o f the conditions o f th e Englis h theatre ,
while rehearsing the arguments made by the three plays in the volume. But
in this volume, Shaw resorted to using "notes," and placed these at the end
of th e playtex t rathe r tha n a t it s front . Th e materia l i n these note s take s
several forms , reprint s o f Shaw' s ow n criticis m publishe d elsewhere ,
historical explanatio n o f th e play' s characters o r events , and response s t o
other critics ' comments about the play. They again show Shaw's eagerness
to exploit the print medium to condition the reader's reception of the play
both befor e an d afte r readin g it . Man and Superman, with it s thirty-two-
page Epistl e Dedicatory , Preface t o "Th e Revolutionist' s Handbook, " tex t
of the "Handbook," an d "Maxim s for Revolutionists " is perhaps the most
complex and self-referring exampl e of Shaw's glossing, prompted, again, by
critics' disapprova l o f th e play' s controversia l conten t an d b y Shaw' s
ambitions for his "comic philosophy." It would appear that , between 188 3
and 1903 , th e mor e controversia l th e play , th e greate r th e numbe r o f
narrative layer s Shaw was likely to give it, layers that functione d t o ward
off misreadings , to build up ironical and complex readings, and to give the
work the material weight and protective coloration of a novel.

Shaw's contributio n t o th e constructio n o f Moder n Dram a durin g thi s
period wa s to extend i t from th e stage, where i t had the status of a  scarce
commodity performe d fo r shor t run s i n small , coteri e theatre s b y selec t
actors before selec t audiences, to the page, where it assumed the distinctive
look o f a  mid-priced "book, " printed reverentl y i n accord with revisionis t
bookmaking conventions , lengthene d an d decorate d b y prefaces , conclu -
sions, production photographs , and stage directions, and priced to sell to a
growing marke t o f book-buyin g consumers . I n takin g pla y publicatio n
seriously, Shaw proved a  shrewd forecaste r o f a  growing interest i n drama
as a literary genre . By 1910, professional critics , amateur enthusiasts , and
academics wer e fashionin g th e cano n o f "moder n drama " a s a  focu s o f
national and international dramatic writing. In England and the US, dozens
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of anthologies , histories , an d full-lengt h critcia l studie s o f "modern, "
"new," "continental, " an d "changing " dram a bega n t o appear , th e vas t
majority o f whic h include d Sha w a s on e o f th e noteworth y writer s fo r th e
modern stage . Over th e firs t tw o decade s o f the twentieth century , Moder n
Drama assume d it s identit y a s a  continenta l cano n (translate d int o
English), comprised almos t exclusivel y o f Western mal e writer s praise d fo r
avoiding specificall y political , historica l reference s an d fo r aimin g instea d
at th e "universal " concern s o f modernity , concern s suc h a s th e natur e o f
human consciousnes s and the value of individual expression. The translate d
and publishe d continenta l cano n o f Moder n Dram a -  play s b y Ibsen ,
Strindberg, Shaw , Chekhov , Brieux , etc . -  becam e a  subjec t o f organize d
reading an d discussio n i n universit y classroom s an d amon g societie s o f
drama enthusiasts . Thes e play s wer e performe d a s moder n "classics " i n
professional an d universit y theatres .

Shaw's attempt s t o provok e an d profi t fro m a  "play-readin g habit "
among larg e number s o f middle-clas s reader s coincide d wit h widesprea d
efforts i n Englan d an d th e U S to regulat e an d professionaliz e th e produc -
tion o f literature . Th e vexe d stat e o f dramati c copyrigh t delaye d an d
complicated th e publicatio n o f dram a a s mid-price d "books " suitabl e fo r
reading pleasure . I n additio n t o callin g fo r expande d copyrigh t protectio n
for bot h performe d an d printe d texts , playwright s lik e Sha w an d Henr y
Arthur Jone s strov e t o entic e a  book-buyin g publi c t o purchas e printe d
drama fo r readin g pleasure . Sha w develope d a n elaborat e syste m o f
enticements, adaptin g Morris' s publishin g "revolution " t o giv e his book s a
distinctive and unifor m appearance , and creating multiple glosses to engag e
readers i n a  continuou s performin g o f thei r interpretiv e strategies . Sha w
did no t single-handedl y refor m th e practic e o f dram a productio n an d
reception, nor did he grow wealthy fro m th e publication o f his plays durin g
the period I  have examined. Bu t he correctly anticipated an d ma y well hav e
encouraged b y hi s exampl e th e productio n o f play s a s mid-price d book s
aimed a t a growing market o f literate, middle-class readers .

NOTES
By the "performing canon" of Modern Drama, I mean those plays selected to be
performed a t theatres devoted to the new drama, e.g. J. T. Grein's Independent
Theatre Society . By a "readin g canon " o f Moder n Drama , I  mean a  subse t of
printed drama s limited to (almos t exclusively) male European playwrights tha t
began to appear i n histories and anthologie s o f "Modern Drama" c.  1910 and
later in the US and England. These anthologies and histories of Modern Drama,
typically containing works by Henrik Ibsen, August Strindberg, Eugene Brieux,
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Maurice Maeterlinck, etc., were directed to the mature student reader, the adult
drama enthusiast , an d th e amateu r performer . Barret t H . Clark' s The  Con-
tinental Drama  of  To-day:  Outlines  for  Its  Study;  Suggestions,  Questions,
Biographies, and  Bibliographies  for  Use  in Connection  with the  Study of  the
More Important  Flays  (Ne w York : Henr y Hol t an d Co. , 1914) , o r J.W .
Marriott's Modern  Drama  (London : Thomas Nelso n an d Sons , Ltd. , n.d . bu t
post-1928) are typical of literate interest in the new drama on both sides of the
Atlantic.

2 A n avid reader o f Shakespeare , Shelley, and other earlie r dramatists , Shaw did
not present himself a s the first o f the literary playwrights but rather recognized
the changin g socia l an d economi c condition s o f th e playwritin g professio n a t
the en d o f th e nineteent h an d beginnin g o f th e twentiet h centuries . Placin g
himself squarel y on the side of the "author" (rathe r than the actor manager or
the publisher ) a s the primary produce r o f written drama , Sha w set ou t no t t o
remake drama as art - a s if it were not art already - bu t to change the material
conditions unde r whic h th e playwrigh t wrot e an d copyrighted , th e publishe r
printed, and the buyer read "literary" dramas.

3 J . R . Stephens , The  Profession  of the  Playwright: British  Theatre 1800-1900
(Cambridge: Cambridge University Press, 1992), see esp. chapter 4.

4 Quote d i n Michae l Holroyd , Bernard  Shaw: A Biography  Vol. I (New York :
Random House, 1988), p. 119.

5 Bernard  Shaw: Collected  Letters, ed . Da n H . Laurence , 4  vols . (Ne w York :
Dodd, Mead, 1965), vol. 1, p. 229.

6 Simo n Elio t describe s thi s marke t i n Some  Patterns  and Trends  in  British
Publishing 1800-1919,  Occasiona l Paper s 8  (London : Th e Bibliographica l
Society, 1994), pp. 1 3 ff .

7 I t i s difficult t o kno w wha t prompte d Sha w to believ e tha t th e Frenc h a t thi s
time ha d a  play-readin g habit . Hi s sourc e o f informatio n ma y hav e bee n
Augustin Hamon , Frenc h socialist-anarchis t autho r an d editor , wh o becam e
Shaw's French translator i n 1904 . In any case, I can find n o verification o f the
French public's "play-reading " habit , although F . W. J. Hemmings refers i n his
book, The  Theatre  Industry in  Nineteenth-Century France (Cambridge : Cam-
bridge Universit y Press , 1993) , t o t n e earl y nineteenth-centur y custo m o f
spectators buyin g playtexts to help them follow th e performance o f classics a t
the Comedie-Frangaise (p . 43). But Shaw seems to be referring t o a  large-scale
purchase of published playtexts at the close of the nineteenth century.

8 Th e Appendi x t o Shaw' s nove l take s th e for m o f a  humorou s Lette r t o th e
Author written by the novel's hero, Mr. Sidney Trefusis, in which he objects that
the author has fictionalized hi s (Trefusis's) lif e and thereby invited self-indulgen t
readers o f fictio n (chiefl y female ) t o conclud e tha t th e nove l i s a  satir e o f
socialism: "Action s describe d i n novel s ar e judge d b y a  romanti c syste m o f
morals as fictitious as the actions themselves." The Appendix acts as a kind of
dialogic commentary on the conventions of fiction and the relation of fiction to
social fact . A  typical Shavia n blen d o f overstatment , irony , an d mora l judge -
ment, i t prefigure s th e self-referrin g dialogu e o f Joh n Tanne r i n Man  and
Superman.

9 Se e Collected  Letters,  vol. I, p. 18; and Mark Bevir , "The Marxism o f Georg e
Bernard Shaw 1883-1889," History of Political Thought 13, (1992), p. 302.
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10 Fo r a  history o f th e Fabian Society , see A. M. McBriar , Fabian  Socialism  and
English Politics 1884-1918 (Cambridge : Cambridg e Universit y Press , 1962) ,
esp. chapter 1.

11 Fo r a  description o f the socialism implici t in Shaw's early novels , see Tracy C.
Davis, George  Bernard  Shaw and the Socialist Theatre (Westport, CT : Green-
wood Press, 1994), esp. chapter 1.

12 J . L . Wisentha l (ed.) , Shaw and  Ibsen:  Bernard Shaw's The  Quintessence  of
Ibsenism and Related Writings (Toronto: University of Toronto Press, 1979).

13 Publicatio n information fo r al l of Shaw's works is taken from Dan H. Laurence
(ed.), Bernard Shaw: A Bibliography,  2  vols. (Oxford: Clarendo n Press , 1983),
vol. I, p. 17.

14 Thi s wa s no t th e firs t tim e Shaw' s wor k ha d bee n pirate d i n th e US . Cashel
Byron's Profession  had bee n throug h tw o pirate d U S editions b y th e en d o f
1886, an d An  Unsocial  Socialist appeared i n a n unauthorize d U S edition i n
1900.

15 Fro m the origina l preface t o Widowers'  Houses, in The Bodley Head Bernard
Shaw: Collected  Plays  with  their  Prefaces,  ed. Da n H . Laurence , 7  vols .
(London: Max Reinhardt, The Bodley Head, 1970-74) , vol. I, p. 46.

16 Fo r furthe r informatio n o n th e Ne t Boo k Agreemen t an d othe r practices , see
Charles Morgan's The  House of Macmillan (1843—1943) (London : Macmillan
& Co. Ltd, 1943), esP- PP- I7° ff-

17 Th e detail s o f Shaw' s negotiations wit h Richard s ar e taken bot h fro m Shaw' s
Collected Letters and from Richards' s memoirs, Author Hunting  (London: The
Unicorn Press, 1934, rpt. i960), esp. chapter 13.

18 Fro m Shaw' s lette r date d Novembe r 13 , 1946 , reproduce d i n Jame s Shand ,
"Author an d Printer : G.B.S . and R . &c  R.C. : 1898-1948, " i n Rober t Hadin g
(ed.), Alphabet  and  Image:  A Quarterly  of  Typography  and  Graphic  Arts,
Volume II: Original Issues 5-8 (Ne w York: Arno Press, 1975), no. 8, p. 8.

19 Ruar i McLean, Modern Book Design from William  Morris to the Present Day
(New Jersey: Essential Books, 1959), pp. 8-11.

FURTHER READIN G
In addition to the works already cited in the notes, the following can provide more
information o n pla y publication : Bria n Corman' s "Wha t I s the Cano n o f Englis h
Drama, 1660-1737? " Eighteenth-Century  Studies  27: 2 (1992/93) , pp . 307-22,
describes th e relationshi p betwee n performanc e an d publicatio n i n a n earlie r
century, a s doe s Shirle y Stru m Kenny' s "Th e Publicatio n o f Plays, " in Rober t D .
Hume (ed.), The London Theatre World 1660-1800, Carbondale : Southern Illinois
University Press, 1980, pp. 309-36. Valuable background works on publishing and
authorship include: Roger Chartier, "Texts, Printing, Readings," in Lynn Hunt (ed.),
The New  Cultural  History, Berkele y an d Lo s Angeles : Universit y o f Californi a
Press, 1989, pp. 154-75 ; Gaye Tuchman and Nina E. Fortin, Edging Women Out:
Victorian Novelists, Publishers,  and  Social  Change, New Haven : Yal e University
Press, 1989 ; and Michae l Warner, "Professionalization an d the Rewards of Litera -
ture: 1875-1900, " Criticism  27:1 (1985), pp. 1-28 . Henr y Arthur Jones's appeals
for pla y publicatio n ar e wort h consulting . Se e especially " A Plea fo r th e Printe d
Drama," The  Theatre,  October , 6 , 1906 , pp . viii , 269-71 . Sha w biographe r
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Archibald Henderso n devote d a  chapter o f hi s book, The  Changing Drama,  New
York: Henry Hol t an d Company , 1914 , to "Th e Printed Play , A New Technic," in
which h e cast s Sha w a s a  pionee r o f "ne w drama " pla y publishing . Henderso n
describes play publishing, in its turn, as a means of raising the standards of drama
to the highest literary levels. His comments on play publication are less an attempt
at historica l understandin g tha n the y ar e a  means t o promot e Sha w a s a  man of
genius. The construction of Modern Drama as a reading and performing canon that
excluded works by women is addressed in the Introduction t o Katherine E. Kelly's
Modern Drama  by  Women  1880S-1930S:  An  International  Anthology, London :
Routledge, 1996.
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New theatres for ol d

"Bestial, cynical , disgusting , poisonous , sickly , delirious , indecent , loath -
some, fetid, literar y carrion , crapulous stuff": i n short, they did not much
care for the play.

Nor fo r it s admirers: "Lovers of prurience and dabblers in impropriety"
. .  . "Ninety-seven percen t o f the peopl e who go to se e Ghost s ar e nasty -
minded peopl e wh o find the discussio n o f nast y subject s t o thei r tast e i n
exact proportio n t o thei r nastiness " .  . . "Th e unwomanl y woman , th e
unsexed females .  . . Educated and muck-ferreting dogs . . . Effeminate men
and male women . . . Outside a silly clique, there is not the slightest interest
in the Scandinavian humbug or all his works" (Works, vol. xix, p. 17).1

The targe t wa s Henri k Ibsen' s Ghosts.  The yea r wa s 1891 , and thes e
snippets from pres s reports appear in Bernard Shaw's The Quintessence of
Ibsenism, published i n September. Historic revolutions in industry, society,
politics, science , trade, and economic s i n nineteenth-century Englan d ha d
scarcely been matched by important events in its theatre until this occasion.
But now, against al l expectations, a Norwegian, a  Scotsman, a Dutchman,
and a n Irishma n jolte d Victoria n conventions , morals , an d ideals , jump-
starting a thrust toward modern drama.

To the credit of England's honor and virtue, none of these troublemakers
was English . Bu t on e wa s to o nearl y s o fo r comfort . Willia m Archer , a
Scotsman an d majo r dram a critic , wa s th e primar y Englis h translato r o f
Ibsen's plays and a  friend o f Shaw, which should have warned the wary. A
performance o f hi s translation o f Ibsen' s A Doll's  House  had scandalize d
London in 1889 when its heroine violated the heart and hearth of Victorian
society by actually walking out on her husband and children - merel y to do
her "duty" towards herself!

Shocking as that was, however, it only prefaced the forthcoming torpedo.
In 189 0 Shaw , renowned a s a  music critic an d Fabia n socialist , delivere d
a tal k o n Ibse n fo r a  summe r sessio n o f th e Fabia n Society . H e shelve d
his note s afterwards , bu t a s luc k woul d hav e i t production s o f Ibsen' s
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Rosmersholm, Hedda  Gabler,  and Ghosts  caugh t London' s attentio n th e
next winter and spring. The first two were grim enough, but Ghosts,  which
inaugurated the Independent Theatre managed by J. T. Grein, a Dutchman,
was unspeakable. So the press screamed. Here Ibsen had answered critics of
A Doll's House with a heroine whose dutiful return to her husband leads to
debauchery, a  bastar d daughter , a  syphiliti c son , nea r incest , an d likel y
prostitution. Delighted by the outraged response, Shaw promptly expanded
his talk into The Quintessence.

Since then his book has been a classic point of reference in Ibsen studies.
Often begrudgingly . Ibse n scholar s complai n tha t Sha w exaggerate s th e
Norwegian's rol e a s a  radica l socia l thinker , neglectin g hi s greatness a s a
dramatic poet . A  favorit e critiqu e amon g the m i s tha t Shaw' s volum e
should have been called The Quintessence of Shavianism - a  clever quip, as
far as it goes, which is not very far.

Many overloo k Shaw' s poin t a t th e star t o f The  Quintessence  that hi s
book "i s not a  critical essay on the poetic beauties of Ibsen, but simply an
exposition o f Ibsenism," one showing "the existence of a discoverable and
perfectly definit e thesi s i n a  poet' s work " (Works,  vol . xix, p . 14) . They
also fail to notice that his claims in it for Ibsen's originality and power as a
moral pionee r wer e born e ou t i n the hysterica l pres s reactions t o Ghosts:
excepting Shaw , fe w Victorian s mentione d "poeti c beauties. " The n too ,
Ibsen scholar s show littl e awareness o f strikin g similaritie s betwee n Sha w
and thei r playwright . Fo r example , whil e Shaw' s youthfu l secon d novel ,
The Irrational Knot (1880), and Ghosts  (1881) have quite different plots , a
multitude o f thei r socia l issue s an d thei r ver y unorthodo x treatment s o f
those issue s ar e remarkabl y parallel , thoug h neithe r autho r kne w th e
other's works at the time.

And perhap s mos t tellin g o f all , Shaw' s perceptio n o f Ibsen' s socia l
radicalism closel y matche s sentiment s Ibse n expresse d i n persona l letters ,
where h e repeatedl y place s himsel f i n a  bol d vanguard : " I stan d lik e a
solitary sharpshooter at the outpost, acting entirely on my own"; "that man
is righ t wh o ha s allie d himsel f mos t closel y wit h th e future" ; "M y boo k
belongs t o th e future" ; "I n thes e time s ever y piec e o f creativ e writin g
should attempt to move the frontier markers." 2 Then too, such sentiments
spring fro m hi s plays . I n An  Enemy  of  the  People  (1882), fo r example ,
Dr. Stockmann i s nearly Ibsen's double: "Our entir e community rest s on a
muckheap of lies . . . the stupid are in a fearsomely overpowerfu l majorit y
. .  . The righ t i s with me , and th e othe r few , th e solitar y individual s .  . .
holding their positions like outposts, so far in the vanguard .  . . We fighters
on the frontiers .  . .  I'll sharpen my pen into a stiletto and skewer them; I'll
dip it in venom and gall; I'll sling my inkstand right at their skulls!"3
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With Ghosts  and the fury i t provoked as touchstones, The Quintessence
moves into Ibsenism: "every step of progress means a duty repudiated, and
a scriptur e tor n u p . . . dut y i s th e prima l curs e fro m whic h w e mus t
redeem ourselves" {Works,  vol. xix, pp. 20, 26). Reformers must repudiate
duty as an idol of the status quo. Duty to a theologically constructed Go d
or to society' s assertions o f it s authority equal s slavery ; one's duty shoul d
be to oneself. Social progress relies on the boldness of individual will s (the
soul or spirit of man) seeking freedom an d self-expression .

For Shaw , moral pioneer s such as Ibsen represen t th e spiri t o f mankin d
growing throug h th e age s by daring to face fact s a s opposed t o cowardl y
souls who conceal facts, such as death and sexual instinct, behind claims of
the immortalit y o f the sou l an d conventions o f marriage . He postulate s a
typical community o f a thousand persons : 700 will be Philistines, 299 will
be idealists , on e wil l b e a  realist . Easygoin g Philistine s generall y accep t
things a s they are . Idealists , however , suppress thei r terro r o f trut h abou t
themselves, their failures , and human nature by masking them and forcin g
the masks upon society as ideals. The one-in-a-thousand realist , in contrast,
sees through thi s deception. With self-respect an d faith i n his independen t
will, h e confront s realities , an d mus t consequentl y bea r th e ranco r o f
idealists. So it is with Ibsen, who particularly exposes the Victorian ideal of
the Womanly Woma n a s a n abomination , a n ido l throug h whic h societ y
demands th e self-sacrific e o f wome n t o preordaine d role s a s wive s an d
mothers. Wome n mus t emancipat e themselve s fro m suc h enslavement ;
theirs mus t b e th e pat h o f th e mora l pionee r wh o "repudiate s duties ,
tramples o n ideals , profane s wha t wa s sacred , sanctifie s wha t wa s infa -
mous" (Works, vol. xix, p. 45).

Shaw then views Ibsen's plays from Brand  (1866) through Hedda Gabler
(1890), emphasizing thei r divers e critiques o f idealism . He concludes tha t
in so far a s morality represents current ideals , Ibsen is immoral because he
shows that moralit y i s relative to differen t circumstance s an d t o point s of
view tha t shoul d no t b e fixed  b y la w bu t develope d accordin g t o one' s
living will. Not surprisingly , in drama suc h relativism makes sophisticate d
demands o n actors , audiences , an d critic s wh o hav e bee n bre d o n melo -
drama and ideals.

A league ahead o f late r critics who stress Ibsen's dramatic poetry above
his socia l thought , Sha w perceive s tha t origina l socia l view s ca n vitall y
inform dramati c poetr y an d vic e versa, and whil e historica l progres s may
date ideas in drama, energies wrought by ideas can give plays enduring life
(a poin t tha t help s explai n wh y Ibsen' s socia l drama s remai n popular) .
Besides, Shaw had first been attracted to Ibsen not by Ibsen's social dramas
but b y Willia m Arche r readin g Feer  Gynt, fro m hi s earl y poeti c period ,
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whereupon "th e magi c of th e grea t poe t opene d m y eyes in a  flash to the
importance o f the social philosopher" (Works,  vol. II, p. xxii). Contrary to
contemporary critic s and anticipatin g modern ones , Shaw admired Ibsen' s
symbolic an d psychologica l play s late r i n th e nineties , an d conclude d hi s
1913 editio n o f The  Quintessence  with ne w chapters o n Ibsen' s dramati c
innovations, emphasizing the discussion element i n his plays, his disuse of
old stag e trick s i n favo r o f ambiguou s character s an d circumstance s tha t
move audiences to confront themselves , and, finally, his combination of art
and spiritual revelation.

Thus Sha w caugh t th e quintessenc e o f hi s subjec t mor e adeptl y tha n
most o f hi s contemporaries an d mor e aptly than man y subsequen t critics .
While hi s extroverte d flair  an d comedi c talent s contraste d wit h Ibsen' s
introverted depths , leadin g hi m t o min e fro m thos e depth s wha t mos t
appealed t o him , similarl y unorthodo x mora l conviction s an d socia l in -
sights linke d th e two . Eve n thei r art , seemingl y s o divers e i n mood ,
developed throug h simila r taste s fo r paradox , irony , an d allegory . I n thi s
sense The Quintessence  grasped much of the quintessence of both and was
a critica l harbinge r o f fres h perspectives , depths , an d freedom s soo n t o
flourish in twentieth century drama.

Ibsen became a crucial influence on Shaw quite late in his self-education .
During th e 1880s , Sha w ha d spen t year s i n th e Readin g Roo m o f th e
British Museum, pouring over social studies, the arts, and modern thought,
besides writing five novels and anonymous reviews of music, literature, and
art. William Archer first noticed him there studying both Wagner's orches-
tral scor e fo r Tristan  and Isolde  and Marx' s Capital  (in French) . Wagner
impressed hi m aesthetically , Marx influence d hi m socially , and late r Ibsen
helped lin k hi s aesthetic s an d socia l views . Meanwhile , hi s diligen t stud y
increased hi s effectiveness a s a  socialis t spokesma n an d mad e him on e of
the bes t musi c critic s i n histor y -  achievement s contributin g t o The
Quintessence, which turned him toward playwriting.

These capacitie s le d t o hi s tenur e a s theatr e criti c fo r The  Saturday
Review from 189 5 to 1898 . A telling perspective on his thousand pages of
drama reviews appears in his preface t o their reprinting in 1906 , where he
explains tha t th e review s wer e "no t a  serie s o f judgment s aimin g a t
impartiality, bu t a  sieg e lai d t o th e theatr e o f th e xixt h Centur y b y a n
author wh o ha d t o cu t hi s ow n wa y int o i t a t th e poin t o f th e pen , an d
throw som e o f it s defenders int o the moat . . . I  postulated a s desirable a
certain kin d o f pla y i n which I  was destine d te n year s late r t o mak e m y
mark a s a  playwrigh t (a s I  very wel l forekne w i n th e dept h o f m y ow n
unconsciousness); an d I  brought everybody , authors , actors , managers, to
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the one test: were they coming my way or staying in the old grooves?" (Our
Theatres, I, p. vii).4

What were drama's old grooves? For the first hal f o f the century, mostly
melodramas, farces , burlesques , an d extravaganza s pitche d t o raucou s
lower-class audiences . I n th e 1840s , however , socia l tide s bega n t o alte r
matters. Young Queen Victoria happene d t o be stage struck, and late r her
son, th e popula r Princ e o f Wales , was smitte n b y th e celebrate d beauty ,
Lillie Langtry , th e firs t societ y woma n t o appea r o n stage . S o royalt y
started t o mi x with actors , actors with hig h society , theatre wit h fashion ,
and fashio n mad e theatregoin g respectabl e fo r th e burgeonin g middl e
classes. T o thes e ingredients , ad d hand y railwa y acces s fro m London' s
suburbs, the 184 3 repea l o f Paten t Act s which ha d give n Coven t Garde n
and Drury Lane a privileged grip on London theatre , an 185 6 law girding
dramatic copyrights , plu s dram a critic s superio r t o thei r counterpart s
earlier in the century, then sift lower-class rowdies into music halls, and one
has a recipe for success . Accordingly, from 185 1 to 1899 London's theatres
proliferated fro m ninetee n to sixty-one and became ever more luxurious in
decor, seating, lighting, and elaborate stage machinery.

The tastes of audiences, however, hung back. Many were ready for shift s
beyond melodram a an d farc e t o the domestic realism of Tom Robertson' s
plays i n th e 1860s , th e wi t o f W . S . Gilber t i n th e 70 s an d 80s , Henr y
Arthur Jones' s earnestl y idealisti c drama s an d Arthu r Win g Pinero' s var -
iously amusing, sentimental, or cautiously adventuresome social plays from
the 1880 s onward. Still , these succeeded b y observing Victorian propriety ,
perhaps tweaking it a bit now and then, but usually just to tickle patrons or
to make them thrill at their own liberality. Propriety girded the status of the
middle class . In On  Liberty  (1859) , John Stuar t Mil l diagnosed England' s
young democrac y a s "collectiv e mediocrity, " bu t wh y berat e success ?
Darwin's surviva l o f th e fittes t validate d th e middl e classes ; otherwis e
Darwin and Marx and social or philosophical or religious challenges could
upset apple carts. Against these, a bulwark of morals, constancy, and ideals
- a  solid status  quo  -  provide d comfort , reliability , safety , sanction . And ,
naturally, theatr e caterin g t o suc h sensation s o r offerin g a n escap e fro m
insecurities was right, sensible, satisfying.

Given these affirming grooves , what was Shaw's way? The Quintessence
provides a  majo r ke y a s i t expose s an d counter s Victoria n conventions ,
moralities, and ideals. Its definition o f phlegmatic Philistines and idolatrous
idealists capsulize s th e typica l Victoria n audience . Agains t thes e stoo d
Shaw th e realist , attende d b y th e revolutionar y spirit s o f Wagner , Marx ,
and Ibsen , bu t h e was hi s own ma n becaus e he was also Promethean, a n
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instinctive cultur e her o wit h a  spiritua l sens e o f missio n o n th e on e hand ,
and, balancin g i t on the other , a  lively sense o f humor . Hi s 190 6 preface t o
his drama review s presents his credentials:

Only the ablest critics believe that the theatre is really important: in my time
none of them would claim for it , as I claimed for it , that i t is as important as
the Churc h wa s i n th e Middl e Age s .  . .  Th e apostoli c successio n fro m
Aeschylus t o mysel f i s as serious and continuousl y inspire d a s that younge r
institution, the apostolic succession of the Christian Church.

(Our Theatres, 1, p. viii)

As ancien t Gree k dram a evolve d fro m religiou s rituals , s o di d drama' s
rebirth i n the Middle Ages, and as a successor to this tradition Sha w gives it
his particular twist :

Unfortunately thi s Christian Churc h .  . . has become the Church where you
must no t laugh ; and so it is giving way to tha t olde r an d greate r Churc h t o
which I belong: the Church where the oftener you laugh the better, because by
laughter only can you destroy evil without malice, and affirm goo d fellowship
without mawkishnes s .  . .  [Th e theatr e shoul d take ] itsel f seriousl y a s a
factory o f thought, a prompter of conscience, an elucidator of social conduct,
an armory against despair and dullness, and a temple of the Ascent of Man. I
took it seriously in that way. (Our  Theatres, I, pp. viii-ix)

The seriou s end s o f laughte r an d th e emphasi s o n th e theatre' s potentia l a s
a templ e o f th e Ascen t o f Ma n ar e Shaw' s mos t distinctiv e contributio n t o
the discussio n o f th e histori c lin k betwee n religio n an d th e stage . Th e
laughter i n his "older an d greater Church " i s akin to the laughter evoked b y
satyr play s whic h followe d tragedie s i n Gree k dram a festivals , prickin g
their blea k bubble s (henc e th e ter m "satire") . A  theatr e stimulatin g
thought, conscience , socia l awareness , coul d becom e a  templ e fo r man -
kind's spiritua l growth . Ultimately , "Th e clai m o f ar t t o ou r respec t mus t
stand o r fal l wit h th e validit y o f it s pretensio n t o cultivat e an d refin e ou r
senses an d facultie s .  .  .  this i s why ar t ha s wo n th e privilege s o f religion "
(Works, vol . xix, pp. 328-29) .

Other tha n fo r brie f comment s suc h a s "Th e theatr e i s really th e week -
day church " (Our  Theatres,  1 , p . 277) , however , Sha w seldo m ha d th e
occasion o r space in his reviews to write about linkin g the temporal and th e
spiritual. S o h e promote d th e goal s o f bot h throug h a  tempora l voic e o r
role. Fo r instance , i n describin g himsel f a s a  musi c criti c h e i s les s a n
evangelist in his zeal than a  partisan passionate fo r reform :

I a m a s muc h a  politicia n a t a  first-night or a  press-vie w a s I  a m o n th e
hustings . . . I  a m alway s electioneering . A t th e Oper a I  desir e certai n
reforms; and , i n orde r t o ge t them , I  mak e ever y notabl e performanc e a n
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example of the want of them . . .  Never in my life have I penned an impartial
criticism; an d I  hop e I  neve r ma y . . . I  kno w tha t th e criti c wh o accept s
existing circumstance s lose s fro m tha t momen t al l hi s dynamic quality . H e
stops the clock. (Works, vol. xxvn, pp. 135-36)

Energizing thi s passage i s Shaw's forcefu l sens e o f a n agenda , dedication , a
touch o f ruthlessness , an d cando r abou t the m all , while hi s admission tha t
he uses performances fo r end s greater than themselves flips a  Machiavellia n
deception int o a critical virtue .

Similarly agenda-oriente d legerdemai n occur s whe n h e discusse s Shake -
speare. Whil e mos t Victoria n audience s preferre d theatrica l far e tha t
appealed t o thei r relatively middlebrow tastes , some with more pretension s
also adore d Shakespeare , mos t famousl y serve d u p i n version s edite d b y
London's leadin g actor-manage r Henr y Irvin g fo r hi s mechanize d stag e i n
the Lyceu m Theatre . A s thi s adulatio n involve d idealis m or , a s The
Quintessence woul d say , idolatry , Sha w dubbe d i t "bardolatry, " an d wen t
after it s ido l a s an y pioneerin g realis t should . I n a  193 1 retrospectiv e h e
explained: "Unti l the n Shakespea r ha d bee n conventionall y ranke d a s a
giant amon g psychologist s an d philosophers . Ibse n dwarfe d hi m s o ab -
surdly i n thos e aspect s tha t i t becam e impossibl e fo r th e momen t t o tak e
him seriousl y a s a n intellectua l forc e . . . I f m y hea d ha d no t bee n ful l o f
Ibsen an d Wagne r i n th e ninetie s I  shoul d hav e bee n kinde r an d mor e
reasonable i n m y demands . Also , perhaps , les s amusing" (Our  Theatres,  I ,
pp. ix-x).

"Amusing" reflect s a  qualit y o f man y Sha w review s tha t ha s ofte n bee n
simply assume d o r overlooked , thoug h Sha w include s laughte r i n drama' s
link wit h religion . Tim e an d agai n hi s review s tak e deligh t i n ap t expres -
sion, felicitou s turn s o f phrase , rhetorica l waves , pugilisti c episodes , ironi c
twists, surprises , exaggeration , overstatement , microscopi c an d panorami c
shifts, colorfu l metaphors , wide-ranging allusions , ascending climaxes , an d
swift anticlimaxes .

Shaw's notorious 189 6 critique o f Cymbeline,  title d "Blamin g the Bard, "
offers a  goo d example . A  storm y paragrap h call s th e pla y stage y trash ,
"vulgar, foolish , offensive , indecent , an d exasperatin g beyon d al l toler -
ance," the n i n grea t wave s o f scor n Sha w declare s Shakespear e a  pre -
tentiously platitudinou s pilfere r o f othe r men' s stories and ideas , less subtl e
than a  polytechni c debatin g club , lik e transcendentl y platitudinou s grand -
mothers, an d aver s tha t "Wit h th e singl e exceptio n o f Homer , ther e i s n o
eminent writer , not eve n Si r Walter Scott , whom I  can despise so entirely a s
I despis e Shakespea r whe n I  measure m y min d agains t his, " then cap s thi s
with "m y impatienc e wit h hi m occasionall y reache s suc h a  pitch , tha t i t
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would positively be a relief to me to dig him up and throw stones at him,"
then deflate s wit h self-irony : "T o read Cymbelin e an d to think o f Goethe ,
of Wagner, of Ibsen, is, for me , to imperi l the habi t o f studied moderatio n
of statement which years of public responsibility a s a journalist have made
almost second nature in me" (Our Theatres, II, p. 205).

For th e uninitiated , wha t follow s ma y com e a s a  surprise : "Bu t I  a m
bound t o ad d tha t I  pity th e man wh o canno t enjo y Shakespear" ; where-
upon Shaw brings forth Shakespeare' s "enormous power over language .  . .
his miracle s o f expression ; hi s sens e o f idiosyncrati c character, " an d th e
vital energy of his genius, through al l of which "th e imaginary scenes and
people h e ha s create d becom e mor e rea l t o u s tha n ou r actua l life " -  a
reality which , Sha w admits , captivate s him . Thu s h e see s i n Rosalind' s
forthright pursui t o f a  man i n As You  Like  It  " a piec e o f natura l histor y
which ha s kep t Shakespeare' s heroine s alive " (Our  Theatres,  11 ,
pp. 282-83). And with "deviltry, humor, and character," Richard III is "the
prince of Punches: he delights Man by provoking God," while Petruchio in
The Taming  of  the  Shrew  is a masterful portrai t o f a n ambitious , selfish ,
healthily good-humored man - a  realistic portrait in contrast to Katherine's
disgusting servilit y t o hi m i n th e las t scen e (Our  Theatres,  II, p. 299 ; III,
pp. 252-53).

This last sentiment and Shavian characteristics in Rosalind, Richard, and
Petruchio sugges t that Sha w uses Shakespeare to further hi s own dramati c
agenda. His examples of lesser characterizations work that way as well. He
finds Othello's role "pure melodrama. There is not a touch of character in it
that goe s below the skin ; and the fitful attempts t o mak e Iago somethin g
better tha n a  melodramatic villai n onl y make a  hopeless mess of him and
his motives" (Our  Theatres,  in, p. 154) . Then too , "Ther e i s not a  single
sentence uttered by Shakespear's Julius Caesar that is, I will not say worthy
of him, but even worthy o f an average Tammany boss " (Our Theatres,  III ,
p. 314). Each of these three is quite unShavian.

In a review of Much Ado About Nothing,  Sha w provides the best key to
his reservations : paraphrase  Shakespeare. Paraphras e ever y ide a o f Bene-
dick and Beatrice, and see how little you have. In comparison, "Paraphras e
Goethe, Wagner , o r Ibse n i n th e sam e way , an d yo u wil l find  origina l
observation, subtl e thought , wid e comprehension , far-reachin g intuition ,
and serious psychological study." But then,

Give Shakespear a fairer chance in the comparison by paraphrasing even his
best an d matures t work , an d yo u wil l stil l ge t nothin g mor e tha n th e
platitudes of proverbial philosophy , with a  very occasional curiosity in the
shape of a  rudiment o f some modern idea, not followed up . Not unti l the
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Shakespearean musi c is added b y replacing the paraphrase with the origina l
lines doe s th e enchantmen t begin . The n yo u ar e i n anothe r worl d a t once .

(Our Theatres, in, p. 339)

The test is worth a try. Othello? Lear? Hamlet? Or how about Jaques in As
You Like  It,  "wh o spend s hi s time , lik e Hamlet , i n vainl y emulatin g th e
wisdom of Sancho Panza"? Shaw notes how Jaques's famous Seven Ages of
Man speec h become s especiall y paltr y a s Shakespear e let s th e grea t
metaphor o f "al l th e world' s a  stage " slip int o a  literar y to y "sill y i n it s
conceit and common in its ideas" (Our Theatres, II, pp. 280-81). - Bu t ahh
. .  . the enchantment.

Thus Shaw' s ambivalenc e abou t Shakespeare : o n th e on e hand , kee n
disappointment an d frustratio n wit h hi s mediocrity a s an original o r deep
thinker; on the other hand, enticement by the vividness of his characters and
scenes, admiration for his immense power over language, and enchantment
with hi s musica l expression . I n An  Essay  on Criticism,  Alexander Pop e
advanced a poetic gauge more flattering to Shakespeare: "True wit is Nature
to advantage dressed, / What oft was thought, but ne'er so well expressed"
(lines 297-98) . Sha w woul d disagree : fo r him , true wi t spring s foremos t
from what is true, and what is true is often not  commonly thought.

If on e dare s t o besmirc h th e Bard , wha t abou t th e Bard' s dramati c
contemporaries? Sha w has little patience with any bloating of their reputa-
tions: "Marlowe' s blan k vers e ha s char m o f colo r an d movement, " bu t
when he' s exhausted fro m ravin g he becomes "childis h i n thought, vulga r
and wooden i n humor, and stupid i n his attempts at invention .  . .  Nature
can produc e n o murdere r crue l enoug h fo r Webster , no r an y her o bull y
enough for Chapman .  . . Greene was really amusing, Marston spirited and
silly-clever, Cyri l Tourneur able to string together lines," while Jonson and
Beaumont and Fletcher had passable talents, but there is "much variety in a
dustheap," and without Shakespeare's light "they would now be as invisible
as they are insufferable" (Our  Theatres, II, pp. 190-92).

So much for dramatic luminaries of the seventeenth century. What about
the eighteenth ? Th e Lyceum' s reviva l o f Sheridan' s School  for  Scandal
(1777) prompte d Sha w t o conside r variou s test s o f tim e a  dram a mus t
survive befor e bein g dubbed "Immortal" : "Everythin g has it s own rat e of
change. Fashion s chang e mor e quickl y tha n manners , manner s mor e
quickly tha n morals , morals mor e quickl y tha n passions , and , i n general ,
the conscious, reasonable, intellectual life more quickly than the instinctive,
wilful, affectionate one . The dramatist who deals with the irony and humor
of the relatively durable sides of life, or with their pity and terror, is the one
whose comedies and tragedies will last longest" (Our Theatres, II, p. 175).
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If Ibsen was a century ahead of his time with A Doll's House, Shaw may
be even more ahead o f our time in finding The  School for Scandal morally
dated by its climax when Lady Teazle, caught in a man's rooms, "pleads for
sympathy an d forgivenes s a s a n innocen t youn g creatur e misle d an d
seduced by a villain," and does so "without the least misgiving on the part
of the dramatis t a s to the entire approva l an d sympath y o f the audience."
Shaw objects that were a man to do this under like circumstances we would
consider hi m a  cad : "s o Th e Schoo l fo r Scanda l date s o n th e Woma n
Question almos t a s badly as The Taming of the Shrew" (Our  Theatres,  II ,
pp. 177-79).

This twis t o n th e Woma n Questio n deliver s a  surpris e o f th e sor t tha t
often give s drama to Shaw's reviews: he takes original shots that strike key
issues sharply , o r i f the y mis s a  bull' s ey e ar e unsettlin g enoug h t o spu r
contention an d drive home allied points. Such shots are a good part o f his
mode with Shakespeare , and a  variant occur s in his review of a  revival of
Wilkie Collins' s New Magdalen,  To a theatre manager' s claim that twenty
years ag o th e play' s realis m influence d th e so-calle d "ne w movement " i n
drama, Sha w respond s b y detailing it s artificia l idealism , concluding : "t o
do al l thi s was no t t o anticipat e 'th e ne w movement, ' bu t t o provoke it "
(Our Theatres, 1, p. 243).

When a  reviva l o f Robertson' s Caste  moved th e cloc k bac k te n mor e
years, however , Sha w flexe d anothe r way : i n a  styl e tha t momentaril y
plunges his review into drama, he reminds young modernists who scorn the
play (disparaged as "cup-and-saucer drama") that in the past thirty years "a
great many things have happened, some of which have changed our minds
and morals more than many of the famous Revolutions and Reformations, "
yet Caste  survives a s a  dramati c landmark : "Afte r year s o f sha m heroic s
and superhuman balderdash , Cast e delighted everyon e by its freshness, it s
nature, its humanity. You will shriek and snort. .  . 'Nature! Freshness! . . .
In Heaven' s nam e [i f yo u ar e no t to o moder n t o hav e heard o f Heaven],
where is there a  touch o f nature in Caste?' I reply, 'In the windows, in the
doors, in the walls, in the carpet, in the ceiling, in the kettle, in the fireplace,
in th e ham , i n th e te a .  . .  the quiet , unpumped , everyda y utterance : i n
short, the commonplaces tha t are now spurned becaus e they are common-
places, and wer e then inexpressibl y welcom e becaus e they wer e th e mos t
unexpected of novelties'" (Our Theatres, m, pp. 173-75).

Unfortunately, th e memor y o f youn g modernist s ofte n goe s bac k les s
than ten years, and their modernism about four. How did some sort of New
Drama, other than Ibsen's, reflect the great changes of minds and morals in
the thirty years since Robertson staged a fresh sens e of realism? Put to this
question i n the 1890 s wer e plays b y Pinero , Jones, and Osca r Wilde , the

65



Cambridge Companions Online © Cambridge University Press, 2006

CHARLES A . BERS T

major commercial talents appearing in mainline theatres (no Shaw play had
yet score d a  Londo n success) . I f today' s playgoer s recogniz e onl y Wilde ,
little matter: the others' efforts proved perishable.

Pinero's early farces are infrequently revived , and plays on which he built
a serious reputation hav e fared eve n less well. When hi s The Second Mrs.
Tanqueray appeare d i n 1893 , William Arche r haile d i t a s courageousl y
virile, a n astonishin g dramati c advanc e bot h philosophicall y an d techni -
cally. Tw o year s later , however , Sha w observe s tha t Piner o jus t too k a
woman-with-a-past melodrama and gave it "an air of novel, profound, an d
original thought," conquering the public "by the exquisite flattery o f giving
them play s tha t the y reall y liked , whils t persuadin g the m tha t suc h
appreciation wa s onl y possibl e fro m person s o f grea t cultur e an d acute -
ness." Th e result ? Humbuggery , whic h Piner o manage d les s wel l i n The
Notorious Mrs.  Ebbsmith, where he has Mrs. Ebbsmith pitch a Bible into a
glowing stove, then suddenly scream and pull it out: "The Church is saved;
and th e curtai n descend s ami d thunder s o f applause " (Our  Theatres,  1,
pp. 63, 66).

When Pinero staged Philistine characters in The Benefit of the Doubt and
nostalgic theatre history i n Trelawny  of the  "Wells,"  Sha w approved an d
even felt touched, seeing these as grounds Pinero understood. Still, he much
preferred Henr y Arthur Jones, to whom time has been even less charitable,
and who had once converted Ibsen's Doll's House into the melodrama of a
kind, wise , nobl e husban d whos e erran t wif e repent s he r irresponsibl e
ways. Melodramatic echoes continued in his plays and he declared himself
no Ibsenist , a  fac t eviden t i n hi s Victorian underpinnings . Whence , then ,
Shaw's preferenc e fo r him ? Shaw' s contras t o f th e tw o i n Marc h 189 7
suggests a n answer : "I f [Pinero ] observe s life , h e doe s s o a s a  gentlema n
observes th e picturesquenes s o f a  gipsy . H e present s hi s figures  coolly ,
clearly, and just as the originals like to conceive themselves .  . .  Mr. Jones,
on the other hand , works passionately fro m th e real . By throwing himsel f
sympathetically int o hi s figures he gives them th e sti r o f life ; bu t h e also
often raise s thei r energ y t o th e intensit y o f hi s own " (Our  Theatres,  m,
P-97)-

Subsequently, Shaw likens Pinero to Thackeray, and Jones to Dickens -
the on e a  gentleman, a n inside r whos e views o f lif e ar e circumscribed b y
the parochia l boundarie s o f fashionabl e society , th e othe r a n outside r
whose unbounde d view s ca n mor e clearl y engag e an d apprais e lif e bot h
inside an d outsid e "Society " (Our  Theatres,  III , pp . 222-23). I n effect ,
Shaw create s a  dialecti c betwee n aestheti c camp s i n which almos t every -
thing related to Pinero's playwriting involves genteel limitations and much
related t o Jones's relates to - Shaw's . Like Ibsen, and like his portrayal of
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Jones, Sha w ha d lon g considere d himsel f a n outsider . S o in thi s portio n o f
his campaign fo r more original theatre Pinero is the loser .

Impressive sidelight s earl y i n the campaig n cam e fro m Henr y James an d
Oscar Wilde . Unlike Pinero and Jones, here were truly major talents , but a s
neither jibe d with Shaw' s agenda fo r Ne w Dram a hi s joint review o f a  play
by each -  Guy  Domville  an d An  Ideal  Husband  -  ha s uniqu e interest . Th e
review i s remarkabl y ope n t o thei r differen t qualities , an d t o thei r differ -
ences fro m himsel f a s bot h criti c an d playwright . Ye t Shaw' s definitio n o f
these qualities reveals common grounds of sophistication an d sensitivity :

There is no reason why life as we find it in Mr. James's novels - life , that is, in
which passio n i s subordinat e t o intellec t an d t o fastidiou s artisti c tast e -
should no t be represented o n the stage . If i t is real to Mr. James, it must be
real to others ; and why should no t these others have their dram a instea d of
being banished from th e theatre (to the theatre's great loss) by the monotony
and vulgarity of drama in which passion is everything, intellect nothing, and
art only brought in by the incidental outrages upon it. As it happens, I am not
myself i n Mr . James' s camp : i n al l th e lif e tha t ha s energ y enoug h t o b e
interesting to me, subjective volition , passion, will, make intellect the merest
tool. Bu t ther e i s i n th e centr e o f tha t cyclon e a  certai n cal m spo t wher e
cultivated ladie s and gentlemen liv e on independent income s or b y pleasant
artistic occupations . I t i s ther e tha t Mr . James' s ar t touche s life , selectin g
whatever is graceful, exquisite, or dignified in its serenity.

James's spoiled , idl e societ y i s certainly no t Shaw's . Still , Shaw gives  spac e
to it s intellect , fastidiou s taste , an d serenit y ove r th e brainless , vulga r
passions o f Victoria n melodram a an d it s insipi d sentimenta l offspring .
Rather tha n either , however, hi s agenda seek s drama i n which passion, will ,
action, and intellec t interrelate as they should in life (where intellect, thoug h
perhaps a  "mere" tool, is essential to the rest). Thus the vigor of dialogue i n
Shaw's plays. Yet James's style tantalizes: "Line after lin e comes with suc h a
delicate tur n an d fal l tha t I  unhesitatingl y challeng e an y o f ou r popula r
dramatists t o writ e a  scen e i n vers e wit h hal f th e beaut y o f Mr . James' s
prose" [Our Theatres,  I , pp. 6-8) .

Shifting t o An  Ideal  Husband,  Sha w take s a  ver y differen t tack , joshin g
critics who "laug h angrily " a t Wilde's epigrams, then protes t "tha t th e tric k
is obvious , an d tha t suc h epigram s ca n b e turne d ou t b y th e scor e b y an y
one lightminde d enoug h t o condescen d t o suc h frivolity. " O r s o the y
whimper: "Th e fac t tha t hi s plays , thoug h apparentl y lucrative , remai n
unique unde r thes e circumstances , say s muc h fo r th e self-denia l o f ou r
scribes." Anticipatin g volume s o f moder n literar y theory , Sha w diagnose s
the Wilde phenomenon i n two sentences : "In a certain sense Mr. Wilde is to
me our onl y thorough playwright . H e plays with everything : with wit , wit h
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philosophy, with drama, with actors and audience, with the whole theatre"
(Our Theatres, I, pp. 9-10).

After this , Shaw's reaction to The Importance of Being Earnest six weeks
later come s a s a  surprise : "I t amuse d me , o f course ; bu t unles s comed y
touches m e a s wel l a s amuse s me , i t leave s m e wit h a  sens e o f havin g
wasted m y evening. I go to the theatre to be moved to laughter , no t to be
tickled o r bustle d int o it " {Our  Theatres,  I , p . 44) . Shaw' s disconten t
springs from th e play's "stock mechanical fun," it s inhuman characters and
action. Gwendolen' s cu p o f te a i s poison fo r him : hi s ow n comedies , i n
contrast, revea l a  tast e fo r organic , character-oriente d humor . The n too ,
Earnesfs stage y contrivances resemble French dramatic mechanisms Shaw
derided a s "Sardoodledom " afte r th e "well-made " play s o f Victorie n
Sardou. At one point he declares, "To laugh without sympathy is a ruinous
abuse o f a  nobl e function, " an d late r h e decrie s th e delusio n "tha t a n
audience can be interested i n incidents and situations without believin g in
or carin g fo r th e peopl e t o who m thes e incident s an d situation s occur "
(Our Theatres,  11, pp. 12.4 , 214). Yet alas, audiences di d lik e Earnest  and
Gilbert an d Sulliva n a s wel l a s les s cleve r Frenc h an d Englis h farces ,
melodramas, and stage spectaculars, all infected with such qualities.

In his crusade for a  New Drama to transcend these trivialities Shaw had
some committe d colleagues , bu t the y wer e no t al l o f on e mind . Amon g
critical forebears , h e sa w th e mid-centur y philosopher-critic-dramatis t
George Henr y Lewe s (th e companio n o f novelis t Georg e Eliot ) a s a
forerunner. In describing "Lewes's variety of culture, flexibility, and fun" as
well as "his free us e of vulgarity an d impudenc e whenever the y happene d
to be the proper tools for his job" and his "rare gift o f integrity as a critic"
(Our Theatres,  11, p. 169) , Shaw migh t almos t b e sketching himself . The
integrity o f critics could no t b e assumed. Their pay was low, some editors
were cowardly , som e manager s sen t ticket s selectively , threatene d lega l
action, or could intimidate those who, like Shaw, were also playwrights in
need o f theatrica l friends . Ye t Shaw observed , "th e respec t inspire d b y a
good criticis m i s permanent , whils t th e irritatio n i t cause s i s temporary. "
Fundamentally, "The cardinal guarantee for a  critic's integrity is simply the
force o f th e critica l instinc t itsel f . . . I  spar e n o effor t t o mitigat e it s
inhumanity, [bu t if ] m y ow n fathe r wer e a n actor-manager , an d hi s lif e
depended o n hi s gettin g favorabl e notice s o f hi s performance , I  shoul d
orphan mysel f withou t a n instant' s hesitatio n i f h e acte d badly " (Our
Theatres, I, pp. 259-60).

Critics wh o mos t intereste d Sha w wer e thos e who , lik e Lewes , ha d
experience a s dramatist s o r translators . Thu s h e favor s "th e genuin e
excitement o f Mr . Clemen t Scott , o r the almos t Calvinisti c seriousnes s of
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Mr. Willia m Archer , [over ] th e gail y eas y what-does-it-matternes s o f
Mr. [Arthur Bingham ] Walkley " (Our  Theatres,  I, p. 262). Scot t ha d firs t
attracted a  vast body of readers and championed Robertson's naturalism in
the early 1860s , yet by 1891 Shaw used his hysterical assaul t on Ibsen fo r
fodder i n The Quintessence, As a translator of Ibsen, Archer was obviously
closer to Shaw's camp. Yet even he was not exactly in it. "For him," Shaw
remarked, "ther e is illusion in the theatre: for m e there i s none . . . fo r me
the pla y i s no t th e thing , bu t it s thought , it s purpose , it s feeling , an d it s
execution" (Our Theatres, I, p. 95).

Though Sha w commente d tha t "A n acto r o f th e sam e standin g i n th e
theatres a s I  have i n journalis m woul d dro p dea d wit h indignatio n i f h e
were offered m y salary" (Our  Theatres,  ill, p. 120), he saw a  consolation :
"Some day they will reprint my articles; and then what wil l al l your puff s
and lon g run s an d photograph s an d papere d house s an d chea p successe s
avail you , O  lovel y leadin g ladie s an d well-tailore d actor-managers ? Th e
twentieth century, if it concerns itself about either of us, will see you as I see
you" (Our  Theatres,  11, pp. 168-69) . ^ n mos t cases , s o i t has . Eve n hi s
preference fo r internationa l supersta r Eleonor a Duse' s skil l a t playin g
diverse roles, over Sarah Bernardt's playing herself i n all roles, informs The
Encyclopedia Britannica.  As som e o f Duse' s greates t successe s wer e i n
Ibsen's plays , sh e personifie d a n evolutio n beyon d hackneye d characte r
types which lingere d i n late Victorian drama , promptin g Sha w to deplor e
the stage lover as "always the same sort of young man," and declare , "We
would all , I believe, willingly push the stage old man into the grave upon
whose brin k h e ha s bee n cacklin g an d dodderin g a s lon g a s w e ca n
remember him" (Our Theatres, ill, pp. 260, 324).

Since New Drama involved relatively fresh and complex ways of looking
at life, its distinctive, often ambiguou s roles escalated an age-old theatrica l
issue: whose view of a play should prevail, the author's or the performers' ?
Countering th e powerfu l actor-manager s wh o adapte d plays , especiall y
Shakespeare's, to suit their tastes and egos, Shaw usually champions fidelity
to scripts : "Th e histor y o f th e Lyceum , wit h it s twent y years ' stead y
cultivation o f th e acto r a s a  persona l force , an d it s utte r neglec t o f th e
drama, is the history of the English stage during that period .  . .  And now I,
being a  dramatis t an d no t a n actor , wan t t o kno w whe n th e dram a i s to
have it s turn" (Our  Theatres,  m, p. 41). Yet he also admit s tha t th e issue
rests with the relative quality of the script and the players. As Shy lock, for
example, Henry Irving "simply played in flat contradiction of the lines, and
positively acte d Shakespea r of f th e stage, " a  fascinating feat , bu t "Shake -
spear at his highest pitch cannot be set aside by any mortal actor, however
gifted." O n the other hand , Irving as Iachimo, the melodramatic villain of
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Shakespeare's deplorabl e Cymbeline,  delighted Sha w as "a ne w and inde -
pendent creatio n .  . .  unbroken i n it s life-curren t fro m en d t o end " (Our
Theatres, II, pp. 208-9).

Similarly, Pinero' s artificia l Mrs . Ebbsmit h se t Mrs . Patric k Campbel l
free t o d o what sh e pleased wit h the role , "the resul t bein g an irresistibl e
projection o f that lady's personal genius" (Our Theatres, 1, p. 64); whereas
Ellen Terry , her refine d talent s wasted unde r Henr y Irving' s management ,
poured he r enchantment s int o a n insipi d part , overcomin g a  "transcend -
ently idioti c speech " onl y b y ravishing th e audienc e "wit h a n expressio n
that mean t 'Don t blam e me: I didnt write it' " (Our  Theatres,  m, p. 399).
And i n contrast t o Irving' s reinventing th e Bard , Johnston Forbes-Robert -
son's great Hamlet a t the Lyceum was remarkable for it s minimal cuts and
for his playing "as Shakespear should be played, on the line and to the line,
with th e utteranc e an d actin g simultaneous , inseparabl e an d i n fac t
identical" (Our Theatres, ill, p. 217).

Such critique s reflec t o n Shaw' s ow n playwriting . A  sourc e o f hi s
remarkable characte r description s surfaces : "On e facilit y offere d t o th e
stage by Dickens is a description o f the persons of the drama s o vivid and
precise that no actor with the faintest sens e of character could mistake the
sort of figure he has to represent" (Our Theatres, 11 , p. 141); and a citing of
Titian's "Assumption of the Virgin" for its triumphantly beautiful "unio n of
the flesh and th e spirit " clarifie s th e painting' s symboli c rol e i n Candida
(Our Theatres, I, p. 80).

Shaw's critica l objection s t o Shakespeare' s Caesa r precede d hi s ow n
Caesar b y just a  few months , yet it took twenty years for hi s put-down of
Othello's melodrama t o surfac e i n Heartbreak  House, where th e Moor' s
story-telling titillate s Ellie' s romanti c dreams . Meanwhile , Eliz a Doolittl e
could hav e develope d i n par t fro m poo r dictio n Sha w fault s i n Mrs .
Campbell, for who m h e created th e role (Our  Theatres,  I, pp. 142-43 ; II,
pp. 40-41) . An d seed s o f Passion,  Poison  and  Petrifaction,  an d The
Doctor's Dilemma  appea r i n Shaw' s amusemen t a t unintentiona l comed y
provoked b y a  vegetarian teetotale r wh o stuff s hi s wife a s i f sh e were a n
elephant an d woul d rathe r sh e die than drin k alcohol , then consideratel y
drops dead himself when she is about to elope with an incompetent docto r
(Our Theatres, ill, pp. 241-44).

More profoundl y linkin g th e criti c an d playwrigh t i n Sha w ar e critica l
views that inform hi s creative talent. For example, the fact tha t his dramas
are les s overtly socialisti c than on e might expec t relates to hi s disdain fo r
melodrama. Stabbin g a  melodramati c beast , and anticipatin g it s opposit e
in hi s Androcles  and  the  Lion  fifteen  year s later , h e ironicall y praise s
Wilson Barrett' s immensely popular Sign of the Cross for the "irony" of its
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"terrible contras t betwee n th e Roman s ('Pagans , I  regre t t o say, ' a s Mr .
Pecksniff remarke d of the sirens), with their straightforward sensuality , and
the strange , perverte d voluptuousnes s o f th e Christians , wit h thei r shud -
dering exaltation s o f longin g fo r th e whip , th e rack , th e stake , an d th e
lions" (Our  Theatres,  II, p. 13) . Socialist dram a ca n b e similarly nonsens-
ical: "we ar e comin g fas t t o a  melodramatic formul a i n which the villain
shall b e a  ba d employe r an d th e her o a  Socialist ; bu t tha t formul a i s no
truer to life than the old one in which the villain was a lawyer and the hero
a Jac k Tar " (Our  Theatres,  II, p. 202) . Then too , Shakespear e slip s int o
producing simplisti c villains . I n contrast , "Th e averag e norma l ma n i s
covetous, lazy , selfish ; bu t h e i s not malevolent , no r capabl e o f sayin g t o
himself, 'Evil: be thou my good.' He only does wrong as a means to an end,
which h e always represents to himself a s the right end " (Our  Theatres,  II ,
p. 4).

In suc h ways , Shaw' s reviews , fo r al l thei r "electioneering, " reflec t th e
ambiguous qualitie s o f hi s dramas. Paradoxically, hi s straightforwardnes s
as a  realis t lead s t o dramati c relativities , ironies , contradictions , circular -
ities, an d layerings , becaus e thes e ar e th e stuf f o f life , an d i f criticis m a s
well a s dram a wishe s t o engag e lif e honestly , i t must , perforce , engag e
these. Fo r example , Shaw' s critica l renderin g o f Si r Augustus Harris , the
impresario who had controlle d Londo n oper a durin g hi s years as a music
critic, evoke s th e mixe d natur e o f mos t "villainy " i n life . Afte r Harris' s
death, Sha w reports , someon e shocke d hi m b y remarkin g tha t hi s "ol d
enemy" wa s gone , a  vie w a s unlifelik e a s th e funera l eulog y declarin g
Harris "honest , honorable , straightforward. " Counterin g bot h views , h e
depicts a  manage r wh o trie d t o intimidat e critic s ye t becam e personall y
friendly; wh o cornere d th e market , exploite d singers , an d fough t fo r
"Italian fatuitie s agains t the German reforms," yet under whom the Opera
flourished an d the public received gorgeous value for it s money; all told, a
creature lik e "captain s o f industry " ( a culture d anticipatio n o f Bos s
Mangan o f Heartbreak  House), more connivin g an d fortunat e tha n grea t
(Our Theatres, II, pp. 182-89).

The ambiguity of this depiction corresponds to the mode and direction of
most o f Shaw' s review s a s the y forwar d th e Ne w Dram a b y thrustin g
beyond melodrama , sentimentality , stereotypes, and worn-out convention s
of th e Victorian stage . Advancing perspective s intelligen t an d sensitiv e t o
life as it is rather than life as many would like it to be, they stir up greater
theatrical aspirations, new freedoms, more sophistication. From the earliest
ones onward, Shaw's drumbeat is persistent: "The real history of the drama
for th e las t te n year s i s no t th e histor y o f th e prosperou s enterprise s o f
Mr. Hare, Mr . Irving , an d th e establishe d West-en d theatres , bu t o f th e
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forlorn hope s . . . o f the Impossiblists . . . I  always make friends with able
desperadoes, knowin g tha t the y wil l seiz e th e citade l whe n th e presen t
garrison retires " (Our  Theatres,  i,  pp . 20-21) . Th e Impossiblist s brave d
censure, neglect, and smal l receipts , in order to perform play s by Ibsen or
Shaw, or authentic stagings of Shakespeare. Their primary venues were the
Independent Theatre (founde d i n 1891) , the New Century Theatre (1897) ,
or the Elizabethan Stage Society (1894), which rented halls or courtyards.

Were the y successful ? No t very , bu t greatly . Afte r thre e years , Sha w
observes tha t "Englis h theatr e too k no t th e smalles t notice " o f Ibsen' s
seventieth birthday ; an d th e Elizabetha n Stag e Societ y "ha s issue d a
balance sheet which is a very genuine tragedy" (Our  Theatres, in , pp. 359,
380). During those years, however, he chronicles a tectonic shift in taste. In
1895: "a modern manager need not produce The Wild Duck; but he must
be ver y carefu l no t t o produc e a  pla y whic h wil l see m insipi d an d old -
fashioned t o playgoer s who hav e see n The Wild Duck " (Our  Theatres,  I,
p. 174) . In 1896 : ten years ago one of Sydney Grundy' s plays would hav e
seemed insanel y radical , bu t afte r Ibse n an d Nietzsch e "i t i s rathe r to o
crude, parochial , an d old-fashioned " (Our  Theatres,  11, p. 166) . An d i n
1897: "Ibsen's plays are at this moment the head of the dramatic body . . .
When an y perso n object s t o a n Ibse n pla y becaus e i t doe s no t hol d th e
mirror up to his own mind, I can only remind him that a horse might make
exactly the same objection" (Our  Theatres, in, pp. 30-31).

Although Ibsen' s play s neve r achieve d lon g run s the y wer e news , ha d
memorable productions,  an d attracte d arbiter s o f tast e wh o saw contem -
porary Englis h dramatist s a s second - o r third-rat e b y comparison . Bu t
where did this put Shaw as a playwright? Shortly before retiring as a critic,
he report s statistic s b y Willia m Arche r o n th e numbe r o f week s Britis h
playwrights' works held the stage during the past five years . From firs t t o
fifth cam e Jones, Shakespeare, Pinero, Grundy, Carton. And Shaw} At the
very bottom. Furthermore, four sociall y adventuresome plays by Jones and
Pinero were their leas t successfu l (Our  Theatres,  III, pp. 354-57). So afte r
Ibsen, whither New Drama?

Few prospects seemed promising, and at the end of the 1897-98 theatr e
season, Shaw , overworked , suffere d a  physica l breakdown , a n incapaci -
tating foo t operation , marriag e t o a  wealth y Irishwoman , physica l acci -
dents, and a prolonged recuperation i n the country, all forcing him to give
up Fabia n committe e work , lecturing , politica l activities , freedom s o f
bachelorhood, an d theatr e reviewing . Dow n a s he was , however , h e wa s
hardly out . Rather , free d fro m publi c activitie s an d th e weekl y grin d o f
reviewing, h e pursue d subject s mor e engagin g tha n mediocr e Victoria n
drama. His overload had included editin g his first seve n plays for publica -
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tion, the n startin g Caesar  and  Cleopatra  and The  Perfect  Wagnerite,  his
landmark boo k o n Wagner' s Der  Ring des  Nibelungen. So on hi s honey-
moon he had worthwhile things to do.

The Perfect  Wagnerite  fittingly climaxed Shaw' s reviewing career . Since
Wagner wrote the books as well as the music for his operas, the Ring cycle
called upon Shaw's expertise in both arts. Moreover, The Ring, like Ibsen's
plays, incorporate d radica l socia l views , callin g u p shade s o f Sha w a s a
young man studying Tristan and Capital  side-by-side.

Having use d allegor y i n hi s ow n plays , Sha w argue s tha t Wagner' s
persuasions as a social agitator and poet led him to render The  Ring as an
allegory of riches, power, and the defeat o f an obsolete establishment. This
interpretation -  recentl y stage d a t Bayreut h -  see s Alberic' s gree d an d
exploitation o f fello w dwarf s a s predator y capitalism ; th e tw o toiling ,
stupid, money-worshippin g giant s a s th e commo n ru n o f humanity ; an d
Wotan an d othe r god s a s intellectual , moral , talente d peopl e wh o devis e
and administe r state s an d churches . Fearles s an d instinctivel y Protestant ,
the her o Siegfrie d i s a  youthful agen t o f chang e a s he overcome s Wotan ,
whose authority has become increasingly dated, devious, and cruel.

In tandem with this interpretation, on e can also see a version of Shaw's
social distinction s i n The  Quintessence,  with th e dwar f an d th e giant s a s
Philistines, Wota n an d hi s godl y cre w a s idealists , an d Siegfrie d a s th e
realist. Yet now Shaw's sense of ambiguity and Wagner's allegory appear to
have matured his outlook: he sympathizes with Wotan as a figure bound to
uphold hi s godly position an d law s while covertly desirin g the higher and
fuller lif e his overthrow would bring.

Toward the end of his essay, Shaw's focus on The Ring's music, dramatic
qualities, an d stagin g reveal s hi s virtuosit y a s th e bes t musi c an d dram a
critic o f hi s day . He discusse s Wagner's us e of musica l theme s fo r object s
and characters , from th e simple Valhalla theme to the complex richness of
the ring and Wotan themes, a richness textured variously through differen t
dramatic contexts . H e observe s tha t "th e dramati c pla y o f th e idea s i s
reflected i n the contrapuntal play of the themes," interrelating thought and
diverse emotions , whil e musica l an d dramati c flexibility  transcen d th e
timeworn metrics of most musical theatre. With apt strokes he then define s
and compares gothic, baroque, rococo, and romantic music, finally empha-
sizing Wagner's greates t distinction : beyond hi s major forebears , "Wagne r
was the literary musician par excellence . . . h e produced his own dramatic
poems, thu s givin g dramati c integrit y t o opera , an d makin g symphon y
articulate" (Works, vol. xix, pp. 266-80).

While Shaw' s decad e o f reviewing ende d i n May 1898 , capped b y The
Perfect Wagnerite  that December , hi s publicatio n o f Plays  Pleasant and
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Unpleasant in April signaled a  new beginning for him, less as a playwright
- i n his spare time he was already pennin g plays a t a  fairly regula r cli p -
than a s a  write r o f prefaces . Befor e 189 8 h e ha d produce d jus t fou r
prefaces; subsequently , h e wrote nearly a  hundred, no t jus t o n his dramas
but als o o n a  grea t assortmen t o f personal , political , social , an d cultura l
subjects. I n prefacin g Three  Plays for Puritans  (1900), h e declares , "Th e
reason mos t playwright s d o no t publis h thei r play s wit h preface s i s tha t
they cannot write them, the business of intellectually conscious philosopher
and skilled critic being no necessary part of their craft . . . I  write preface s
as Dryden did, and treatises as Wagner, because I can; and I would give half
a doze n o f Shakespear' s play s fo r on e o f th e preface s h e ough t t o hav e
written" (Works,  vol. IX, pp.xxiii-xxv).

How abou t hal f a  doze n o f Shaw' s preface s fo r anothe r goo d play ?
Though som e ar e powerfu l an d mos t ar e pithy , man y ramble . Tw o ar e
twice as long as the plays they precede. Still, Shaw has a good rationale for
them: they give readers his viewpoint on subjects too large for staging; and,
like hi s stag e directions , the y als o giv e actor s an d director s informatio n
useful fo r interpretin g th e plays . As with Ibsen and Wagner , quintessences
and perfection i n thoughtful ar t may not be easily grasped at first; so artist-
critics who can clarify difficul t matter s might well do so.

Thus Sha w th e critic-artis t set s ou t a s a  Promethea n cultur e her o t o
replace stale, mediocre theatre with drama at the cutting edge of conscious-
ness, because drama and life cross-circulate: "Public and private life become
daily mor e theatrical : th e moder n [leader ] i s nothin g i f no t a n effectiv e
actor; al l newspapers are now edited histrionically ; and the records of our
law courts shew that the stage is affecting persona l conduct to an unprece-
dented exten t .  . .  The truth i s that dramati c invention i s the first effort o f
man to become intellectually conscious" (Works, vol. VIII, p. xiii).

NOTES
1 Her e an d later , Works  refer s t o th e first  collecte d editio n o f The  Works  of

Bernard Shaw (London, 1930-38) . The American Ayot St. Lawrence edition has
similar pagination.

2 T o Ola f Skavla n (Januar y 24 , 1882) ; to Geor g Brande s (Januar y 3 , 1882) ; to
Frederik Hegel (March 16 , 1882); to Leopold von Sacher-Masoch (December 12,
1882), in Ibsen: Letters and Speeches, ed . Evert Sprinchorn (Ne w York, 1964) ,
pp. 202 , 199, 206, 214. Selections from many such sentiments.

3 Ibsen , An  Enemy  of  the  People,  in Henri k Ibsen , The  Complete  Major Prose
Plays, trans. Rolf Fjelde (New York, 1978), pp. 353-57, 383.

4 Our  Theatres  in the  Nineties,  Volumes xxm , xxi v an d xx v i n The  Works  of
Bernard Shaw, but also sub-numbered there as a set: 1,11, and ill. For a clear sense
of sequence, the latter numbering will be used in citations.
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New Women, new plays, and Shaw
in the 1890 s

In a  moment o f crisi s in the 1890 s masculine contro l o f the theatre a s an
institution wa s shaken b y the efforts o f insurgen t wome n an d a  few mal e
sympathizers. Bernard Shaw , writing abou t th e London theatr e o f 189 4 ~
the annus mirabilis of the New Woman - describe d the importance of that
revolt with a  clearsightedness unusual , perhaps unique, among men of the
theatre. Sha w declare s i n th e prefac e h e wrot e fo r Willia m Archer' s
Theatrical "World"  of  1894,  assessin g development s o f tha t yea r i n th e
London stage:

We cannot but see that the time is ripe for the advent of the actress-manager-
ess, and tha t w e ar e o n the verg e o f somethin g lik e a  struggle betwee n th e
sexes fo r th e dominio n o f th e Londo n theatres , a  struggl e whic h failin g a n
honourable treaty , o r th e break-u p o f th e actor-manage r syste m b y th e
competition o f ne w forms o f theatrica l enterprise , mus t in the long run end
disastrously for the side which is furthest behin d the times. And that side is at
present the men's side.1

What is striking here is Shaw's recognition as a male commentator that the
theatre was on the threshold o f apocalypse, one that would be wrought by
the effort s o f newl y assertiv e wome n o f th e stage . I t woul d b e th e
manifestation i n the London theatr e o f the changes being wrought b y the
New Woman. But Shaw's enthusiasm fo r thos e changes was not nearly as
unqualified a s hi s remark s abou t a  "struggl e betwee n th e sexes " woul d
suggest, or as one might infer fro m hi s praise of the "unwomanly woman"
in The Quintessence oflbsenism (1891) .

For many , includin g Sha w himsel f a t times , th e Ne w Woma n create d
intellectual pani c i n he r functio n a s wha t Carrol l Smith-Rosenber g ha s
called " a condense d symbo l o f disorde r an d rebellion." 2 Sh e was no t s o
much a  person, o r even group o f people, as a constructed categor y which
expressed metonymicall y som e of the historic challenges being brought t o
bear in the 1890 s on traditional idea s of woman, in particular, and gender
as whole . Individual s di d no t ofte n identif y themselve s a s Ne w Women ;
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and when they were so identified b y others, the term seems usually to have
been freighte d wit h disparagin g meanings , although thes e meaning s wer e
different, o r contradictory , eve n whil e coherin g a s a  symbo l o f "disorde r
and rebellion." As Ann Ardis has pointed out, the term "New Woman" was
a way o f naming , and thu s controlling , a  range o f ongoin g disruptions i n
the social understanding o f gender. 3 That i s why the New Woman seemed
to be , and in one sense actually was, more an element o f discourse than a
real perso n o r grou p o f people . Commentator s i n th e 1890 s ofte n note d
this fact, labelin g the New Woman a  "figment o f the journalistic imagina -
tion" an d " a produc t oftene r me t wit h i n th e novel s o f th e da y tha n i n
ordinary life."4

On th e whol e th e Ne w Woma n wa s treate d wit h contemp t o r fea r
because in various incarnations, whether i n discourse o r in "real" life, she
reopened for discussion some deeply held assumptions about what it meant
to be a man or woman. One version of the New Woman defied traditiona l
codes o f femal e beauty , smokin g cigarette s an d dressin g i n a  simpl e an d
"manly" fashion which seemed to complement her discontented mouth and
a nose "too large for feminin e beauty " but indicative of intelligence.5 New
Women were often perceived to be masculine in other ways too, sometimes
devoting themselves to a profession o r business in preference to the bearing
and bringin g u p o f children . Thi s abrogatio n o f a  woman' s suppose d
highest duty was perhaps the chief illustration of what one writer described
as the New Woman's "restlessness and discontent with the existing order of
things." Sometime s th e Ne w Woma n wa s perceive d t o b e free r i n he r
dealings wit h me n tha n custo m allowed , an d a t othe r time s a  col d an d
"apparently sexless " creature wh o rejecte d ou t o f han d al l relation s wit h
men.6 In these varied forms the New Woman was consistently a symbol of
upheaval, threatening to dissolve the boundaries of gender and disrupt the
maternal activites which nature was thought to have ordained fo r women .
"The da y o f ou r acquiescenc e i s over, " a s Sara h Gran d announce d o n
behalf o f al l wome n i n "Th e Ne w Aspec t o f th e Woma n Question, "
published in 1894.7

Shaw's own response to the New Woman makes clear with what mixed
feelings eve n a  sympatheti c an d progressiv e ma n coul d regar d her . Fo r
example, The Philanderer (written in 1893, but not publicly produced unti l
1907), presents a  coterie of women who belong to an Ibsen Club , dress in
trousers, smoke, call each other by their surnames, and in general cultivate
a masculine aur a which makes them a s much the objec t o f ridicule a s the
"advanced" women lampooned in popular plays of the time such as Sydney
Grundy's The  New Woman  (1894) . So pronounced wa s this trend towar d
caricature of progressive women on stage that the theatrical newspaper the
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Era took notice of it by asking "Why hasn't the New Woman a word to say
for hersel f o n the stage?" Noting that male dramatists "carciature the poor
thing t o thei r hearts ' content, " th e newspape r suggeste d tongue-in-chee k
that women should begi n writing plays in response to the ridicule of New
Women i n play s b y men. 8 Whil e expressin g sympath y fo r wome n i n th e
impending "struggl e betwee n th e sexes " fo r contro l o f th e theatre , Sha w
actually contribute d t o the pattern o f ridicul e an d caricatur e tha t th e Era
noticed a s prevalen t i n play s abou t Ne w Wome n i n th e mid-i89o s -  a
pattern that i t believed would be reversed only when women began writing
plays of their own.

On the other hand Shaw' s Philanderer refers t o marriage as a degrading
arrangement b y which a woman sells herself, a declaration o f which many
New Women o f th e 1890 s would hav e approve d i f the pla y ha d foun d a
producer a t th e time . Similarl y Mrs.  Warren's  Profession,  writte n i n
1893-94 bu t banned b y the Lord Chamberlain , would hav e pleased some
New Women with its straightforward linkag e of prostitution and marriage,
but its representation of Vivie Warren surely would have been problematic.
Not onl y i s sh e a  caricatur e o f th e Ne w Woma n wit h he r manl y dress ,
bone-crushing handshake , and predilectio n fo r cigar s and whisky , but her
uncritical focu s o n workin g an d makin g mone y i n a  capitalis t an d sexis t
economy make s he r n o mor e appealin g tha n he r notoriou s mother , a n
underworld entrepreneu r wh o own s a  chai n o f brothel s bu t ha s though t
long and har d abou t wha t sh e does , and why . What i s wrong wit h Vivie
Warren, fo r Shaw , i s he r coldnes s an d calculation , he r immersio n i n th e
practical side of life, her estrangement from wha t he would eventually call
the Life Force. Vivie Warren is a strong woman, to be sure, but for Shaw a
woman's strengt h i s misdirecte d an d grotesqu e unles s fundamentall y
sexual, seekin g ou t an d compellin g a  superio r ma n t o mat e wit h he r an d
produce "supermen. " Like many men of the 1890s , therefore, Sha w could
be enthusiastic about the New Woman when he could imagine her disrup-
tions being confined t o the realm o f the domestic and sexual . Ann White-
field i n pursuit of Jack Tanner in Man and Superman, not the strong female
accountant o f Mrs.  Warren's  Profession, represents th e kin d o f woman' s
strength tha t mos t appeale d t o Shaw . Similarl y th e titl e characte r o f
Candida - writte n in 1894 and pre-eminently "TH E Mother Play, " as Shaw
put it - i s a woman of strength and intelligence who has no impact outside
the househol d an d make s th e youn g working woma n Proserpin e Garnet t
her ineffectual comi c foil.9

Shaw's attitud e towar d th e pre-eminen t Ne w Woma n o f th e theatrica l
world - Elizabet h Robins, a transplanted American - wa s for the most part
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adversarial, although he believed her work as an actress and producer to be
of th e highes t importance . To Shaw, what distinguishe d Elizabet h Robin s
was her performances i n plays by Henrik Ibse n of which she was also the
producer -  beginnin g with th e epoch-making Hedda  Gabler  and A  Doll's
House (both 1891 ) and continuing with The  Master Builder in 1893 a n^ a

subscription serie s of plays by Ibsen in the same year. None of these plays
was financiall y successful , o r likel y t o be , whic h explain s i n par t th e
reluctance o f mainstrea m theatre s an d thei r actor-manager s t o produc e
them. Indeed Robins sold her father's wedding gift to help pay the costs of
Hedda Gabler, which she co-produced with Marion Lea, another American
actress in London, and in which she played the titled role with electrifyin g
results. On the basis of these independent production s staged b y women -
Elizabeth Robins , Janet Achurch , Eleanor Calhoun , Marion Lea , Florence
Farr, and a few others - Sha w detected by 1894 the signs of a gender war in
the theatre, the first shots having been fired by women, and for good cause.
"A glanc e a t ou r theatre s wil l show, " write s Sha w i n hi s prefac e t o The
Theatrical "World" of  1894,  "that the highest artisti c career i s practically
closed t o th e leadin g lady. " Thu s actresse s i n th e employmen t o f actor -
managers, even the most succesful lik e Ellen Terry and Kate Rorke, merely
"support" the manager and give up any of the few good women's parts that
come along , from Ibse n o r others . Shaw points t o Elizabet h Robins , "th e
creator o f Hedd a Gable r an d Hild a Wangel, " an d t o Jane t Achurch ,
"virtually actress-manager " o f th e first  Englis h productio n o f A  Doll's
House, as the omens of revolutionary change.10

Shaw perceived the work of Robins and other actresses, particularly their
performances o f Ibsen , a s contestin g i n th e theatr e th e sam e masculin e
authority whic h was under attac k b y New Women elsewhere . Critic s less
sympathetic than Shaw also saw Ibsenite women as engaged in a "struggle
between th e sexes, " bu t revile d the m wit h th e sam e kin d o f excessiv e
language which conservatives used against New Women in other contexts.
One reviewer , fo r example , describe d wome n i n th e audienc e o f Madg e
Kendal's production o f Ibsen' s The  Pillars of  Society  (1889) a s monstrous
distortions of nature, "masculine women," disruptive and with a propensity
to violence.11 In Degeneration (1895) Max Nordau ca n make sense of the
women in Ibsen's plays only by seeing them as insane - "ravin g so wildly as
to requir e strait-jackets " -  th e casualtie s o f a n epidemi c o f menta l an d
physical "degeneration " underminin g th e foundation s o f th e socia l order .
For the enactment o f such characters Nordau imagine s a  fantastic, femin -
ized theatre with an audience of hysterics, nymphomaniacs, and prostitutes
who recognized their own lawless selves glorified in a Nora Helmer or Mrs.
Alving. The theatr e o f Nordau' s nightmar e thu s become s a  madhous e i n
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which a n audience o f lunatic New Women applauds "thei r own portrait" i n
representations o f women mad lik e themselves.12

Elizabeth Robin s would no t have recognized hersel f i n these wild attack s
against Ne w Wome n i n th e theatre , bu t neithe r woul d sh e hav e see n
herself, initiall y a t least , i n Shaw' s mor e sympatheti c portrai t o f a  heroi c
actress-producer makin g wa r agains t a  male-dominate d Londo n stage . A s
Robins hersel f remarke d i n a  lectur e t o th e Roya l Societ y o f Art s i n 1928 ,
her firs t attractio n t o Ibse n ha d nothin g t o d o wit h Ne w Wome n bu t
everything t o d o wit h th e ar t o f acting . "Ho w coul d w e find  fault, " sh e
asked, "wit h a  stat e o f societ y tha t ha d give n u s Nora , Hedda , an d
Thea?"13 Elizabet h Robins' s disillusionment , an d he r subsequent politiciza -
tion a s a  Ne w Woma n o f th e theatre , cam e i n th e wak e o f he r landmar k
production o f Hedda  Gabler  a t th e Vaudevill e Theatr e i n 1891 . Any hop e
that th e impac t o f Hedda  Gabler  woul d provid e Robins , o r an y actress ,
with meaningfu l opportunitie s i n th e usua l Wes t En d venue s wa s soo n
disappointed. Robin s note s i n a n unpublishe d memoir , "Height s an d
Depths," tha t part s wer e offere d t o he r an d he r coproduce r Mario n Lea ,
but alas , "not such parts as we had i n mind - bu t pretty little dears howeve r
much the y wer e calle d heroine s o r 'leadin g parts. '" 14 I n note s writte n an d
typed a t th e en d o f th e manuscrip t o f Whither  and  How,  Robin s adde d
these comments :

Marion Lea and I had started out to do something that hadn't ever been tried
before, never realising the peril of this, a peril the more should the first steps
show marke d succes s .  . . Offer s o f engagement s unde r regula r manager s
began to flow in . The first on record I  refused t o go further with , because I
knew t o wha t a  blind alle y i t would lead . Al l the theatres then wer e eithe r
frankly commercia l lik e the Adelphi , o r commercia l i n disguise , &  withou t
exception were under the management of men . . . Men who wrote plays for
women had long been seeing that they simply had little or no chance of being
acted.15

Recognizing he r dilemm a a s a n actress , Robin s recollect s tha t " a help -
lessness an d depressio n fel l upo n me , fo r I  saw wha t I  was facing. " Al l sh e
had reall y gotte n fro m th e spectacula r achievemen t o f Hedda  Gabler  ha d
been persona l an d transitory , fo r wha t sh e called th e "rationa l Theatre " o f
her hope s was no neare r no w tha n i t had bee n before . Thi s failure , an d he r
reaction t o it , complete d th e transformatio n o f Elizabet h Robin s int o a
New Woman .

Other voice s fo r theatrica l refor m wer e audible , o r soo n woul d be , bu t
none o f them , no t eve n Shaw's , addresse d th e issu e i n th e sam e wa y a s
Elizabeth Robins . Matthe w Arnold , fo r example , ha d pleade d fo r a
subsidized an d "irresistible " nationa l theatr e o f literar y merit , an d Henr y
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James espouse d a  simila r projec t i n The  Tragic  Muse.  Sha w himself ,
William Archer and J. T. Grein pursued in print and action their own hopes
for a serious and artistic English drama for which the West End venues had
shown littl e o r n o sympathy . Robins' s "Theatr e o f th e Future, " a s sh e
would eventuall y cal l it , deserves no t onl y to b e redeemed fro m oblivion ,
but distinguishe d fro m thes e an d othe r men' s proposal s fo r theatrica l
reform.16 Robins' s analysi s wa s marke d b y he r insigh t tha t inequitie s o f
gender conspire d wit h self-intereste d economi c motive s t o weake n th e
theatre a s a n artisti c institution . Refor m woul d com e abou t throug h th e
efforts o f wome n playwright s an d managers , alon g wit h thei r mal e
sympathizers, who would inaugurate a  noncommercial theatr e - a n "asso-
ciation o f workers " no t owne d b y any individua l -  i n which self-interes t
played no part and drama was more than a commodity. "Lifting highe r the
standard of dramatic work," writes Robins in an unpublished memoir, "we
should help actors, the stage - th e world."17

In thus linking the theatre, sexual justice, and social regeneration, Robins
anticipated i n mor e conciliator y tone s th e America n anarchis t Emm a
Goldman, wh o believe d th e dram a ha d powe r t o sho w tha t "societ y ha s
gone beyon d th e stag e o f patchin g up " an d tha t th e huma n rac e "mus t
throw of f th e dea d weigh t o f th e past. " Goldman , althoug h a n amateur ,
worked with an experimental theatr e group at the turn o f the century and
was a  ferven t admire r o f Ibse n fo r wha t sh e sa w a s hi s revolutionar y
opposition to every social arrangement that impinged upon personal liberty
and spontaneity, including the "bondage of duty" from which he frees Nora
Alving a t th e end o f A Dolls's  House. Plays - a t leas t plays like Ibsen's -
would b e the "dynamit e which .  . .  shakes the socia l pillars , and prepare s
men and wome n fo r reconstruction. " Bu t what rol e could women play in
this campaig n when , a s Goldma n write s i n The  Social  Significance of
Modern Drama  (1914) , the writing o f play s remained "s o fa r th e strong -
hold exclusivel y o f men " an d n o country , a t leas t unti l th e adven t o f th e
young Gith a Sowe r by, had produce d a  singl e woma n dramatis t o f note ?
Robins's own work in the theatre escapes notice in The Social Significance
of Modern  Drama,  bu t Goldma n devote s considerabl e spac e t o Shaw ,
whom sh e criticize s fo r writin g play s shape d to o rigidl y b y his moderat e
Fabian political views. Nor is Goldman impressed with Shaw's portrait of a
New Woman in Mrs. Warren's  Profession; fo r Vivie Warren, remote fro m
the grim circumstances tha t shaped her notorious mother , must in the end
be classified with the "bigots and inexperienced girls."18

Robins hersel f ha d given up on Sha w very early i n her ques t to change
the face o f late Victorian theatr e and society . She gave up on Oscar Wilde
eventually, too , despit e he r man y exhortation s tha t h e hel p organiz e an d

81

anacl
Realce

anacl
Realce

anacl
Realce

anacl
Realce

anacl
Realce



Cambridge Companions Online © Cambridge University Press, 2006

KERRY POWEL L

5 Sacrificin g companionship fo r a  male profession: Jan Alexandra Smit h as Vivie Warren
in the Shaw Festival's 199 7 production o f Mrs. Warren's  Profession

write fo r th e "Theatr e o f th e Future." 19 Robins' s visio n depende d upo n
redressing the grievances o f women i n the theatre an d the world a t large ,
yet me n themselve s rarel y wrote , an d stil l mor e rarel y produced , wha t
Robins called "women's plays." Like Vida Levering, the heroine of her own
play Votes  for Women!,  Robin s had t o face th e realization tha t "winnin g
over the men" - eve n the best and brightest men, even Shaw or Wilde - wa s
not enough . Th e struggl e fo r theatrica l refor m wa s basically , fro m he r
perspective, a woman's cause, and some battles concerning women, as Vida
Levering says in the play, "must be fought by women alone."20

Shaw was more hopeful tha n Elizabeth Robins herself by the mid-1890s in
forecasting a n apocalypse of the theatre being brought about by oppressed
and rebelliou s actresses . But at the same time, and without exactl y saying
so, Shaw found i t much easier to imagine actresses contesting the authority
of actor-manager s tha n writin g play s themselves . On thi s point h e was in
substantial agreemen t wit h a  long , ofte n unspoke n Victoria n traditio n
which deemed the writing of drama to require a cast of mind recognized as
masculine. An example o f the Victorian tendenc y to define pla y writing so
as to exclude women, implicitly at least, appears in Frank Archer's How To
Write a  Good  Play  (1892) . "Play-makin g ma y no t b e on e o f th e exac t

82

anacl
Realce

anacl
Realce

anacl
Realce

anacl
Realce



Cambridge Companions Online © Cambridge University Press, 2006

New Women, new plays, and Shaw in the 1890s

sciences," the autho r concedes , "bu t i t i s more nearly allie d t o them tha n
appears a t firs t sight . I t ca n fairl y b e describe d a s a  sor t o f sympathy  in
mathematics." The playwright, by this analysis, is a sort of architect whose
"constructive ability " arise s ou t o f a n analytica l min d tha t th e Victorian s
rarely associate d wit h women. 21 Thi s prejudice als o finds expressio n i n a
theatrical stor y b y Henr y James , "Non a Vincent, " i n which a  male play -
wright discovers with satisfaction that his craft relies upon qualities of "line
and law" that Victorians usually considered to be masculine. The "dramatic
form," observes dramatist Allan Wayworth in the story by James, "had the
high dignity of the exact sciences, it was mathematical and architectural. It
was full o f the refreshment o f calculation and construction." Women, with
their abundan t reserve s o f emotion , mus t b e calle d o n fo r th e "vulgar "
necessity o f actin g Wayworth' s firs t play , bu t onl y h e -  a  ma n -  coul d
actually write it.22 I f a woman wrote a good play, as critic William Archer
believed was the case with Constance Fletcher's Mrs. Lessingham in 1894,
the fact coul d b e explained b y the woman playwright' s masculine style . "I
fancy," Archer comments in his review of the play, "it would be a very keen
critic who should detect a feminine hand in the workmanship."23 Similarly,
in the play Our  Flat (1888), the success of a woman playwright's drama is
explained o n the grounds that , a s one characte r says , i t i s "impossibl e t o
tell it' s a  woman' s work." 24 An d th e autho r o f "Wome n a s Dramatists "
(1894) explains the success of Joanna Baillie' s writing for the pre-Victorian
stage on the basis of the supposed "masculin e strengt h an d vigour" of her
prose.25

Elizabeth Robin s hersel f wa s keenl y consciou s o f thi s deep-seate d
prejudice agains t wome n writin g fo r th e stage . "There wa s a  widesprea d
conviction," Robins recalls in Theatre and Friendship, "that no woman can
write a good full-length play. " Indeed, when she mentioned to Henry James
the possibility of writing one herself, he reacted "with a start, and a look of
horror."26 Eve n Willia m Archer , he r secre t collaborato r i n th e epocha l
production o f Hedda  Gabler,  foun d i t incredibl e tha t Robin s coul d writ e
good drama : "T o tel l yo u th e trut h I  don' t thin k yo u hav e th e powe r o f
concentration required for playwriting. Certainly you could find a novel far
easier than a  play."27 When Robins herself approache d Herber t Beerboh m
Tree about writing a play for the Haymarket, he was similarly incredulous,
telling he r i n a  hastil y scrawle d not e tha t h e had "neve r .  . .  read a  good
play from a  woman's hand."28 Nevertheless , if the "Theatre of the Future"
was ever to b e realized, i t seemed clea r to Robins that wome n would no t
only have to stage their own productions of plays, but write them too.

Robins, fo r he r part , persuade d Joh n Har e t o produc e Constanc e
Fletcher's Mrs. Lessingham at the Garrick Theatre in 1894, playing the lead
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role whil e als o rewritin g th e pla y i n collaboratio n wit h th e autho r an d
Hare. Althoug h Sha w wa s contempuou s o f Mrs.  Lessingham,  it i s none-
theless remarkable fo r it s sympathetic portrayal o f a  married woman who
elopes with he r lover an d late r comes into conflic t wit h the more conven-
tional heroin e to whom the leading man i s engaged.29 A n unconventiona l
play b y Robin s herself , calle d The  Mirkwater,  concern s Felici a Vincent ,
who assists in the suicide of her sister, a young woman stricken with breast
cancer wh o "dominate d ever y on e sh e came near." 30 The  Mirkwater  was
never produced o r published, no r was another pla y b y Robins, The Silver
Lotus, writte n in about the middle of the decade. The Silver Lotus focuse s
on a  young mother drive n to alcoholism b y the death o f her children an d
the shallo w grie f o f he r husband . However , "wha t th e worl d want s fro m
her," Sha w wrote o f Elizabet h Robin s in 1896 , was not writing a t al l but
"acting" -  o r rather , actin g o f a  particula r kind , i n play s b y Ibsen , fo r
example, and not in "that confounded Mrs . Lessingham business."31

Shaw woul d continu e t o complai n i n thi s vei n t o Robin s herself ,
characterizing he r a s "a n actres s neglectin g tha t everyda y wor k a t he r
profession whic h is the foundation o f al l real character an d power."32 But
Robins's infrequen t appearance s o n stag e afte r 189 4 wer e reall y th e
outcome o f he r "hopelessnes s an d depression " cause d b y th e lac k o f
suitable, challenging femal e roles . One way to dea l with the problem was
to write plays herself, which Robins first began to do, in collaboration with
Florence Bell , whe n sh e adapte d a  stor y b y Eli n Amee n unde r th e titl e
Alan's Wife,  staged by the Independent Theatre in 1893 . In writing Alan's
Wife she provided herself with the kind of role she desired but rarely found
in th e regula r theatres , a  woma n o f dept h an d power , i n thi s cas e a
working-class heroin e wh o celebrate s he r murde r o f he r sic k child a s the
strongest an d mos t courageou s actio n o f he r life . Beerboh m Tre e turne d
down th e chanc e t o produc e i t a t th e prestigiou s Haymarke t Theatre ,
finding it "to o horrible , too gruesome " when Robin s read hi m a  scenario
of it. 33

Even Shaw was made uncomfortable b y Alan's Wife,  so remote from the
drawing-room comed y i n whic h hi s ow n reformin g impuls e wa s finding
expression. The howling strengt h o f the heroine struc k hi m a s manic and
"most horribl y common, " an d furthe r t o discredi t th e play he ascribed t o
its heroine a n implausibl e repentanc e whic h i n fac t neve r actuall y occurs .
Then, a s he would ofte n d o with women playwrights , Shaw proceeded t o
"rewrite" the play to his own specifications. "I f I were to treat the subject,"
he says in a letter to William Archer, "I should represent Jean as a rational
being i n societ y a s i t exist s a t present ; an d I  should she w he r killin g th e
child wit h coo l an d successfu l precaution s agains t bein g found out. " The
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heroine would then proceed to live a normal life among her neighbors, and
even marr y th e parson . Shaw' s imaginar y rewrit e o f Alan's  Wife  thu s
purges i t of what were to his mind the emotional excesses associated wit h
sensational woma n novelist s an d popula r melodrama . Th e titl e role ,
according to Shaw, "uncorks the eye of the emotional actress" at the cost of
spoiling a play about an unconventional and independent woman. "When I
think o f tha t waste d opportunity, " Sha w says , " I fee l mor e tha n eve r
contemptuous o f this skulking author wh o writes like a female apprentic e
of [Robert] Buchanan."34

Soon thereafte r Sha w agai n venture d t o "rewrite " anothe r fledglin g
woman playwright . Jane t Achurch , th e actres s wh o helpe d produc e an d
starred i n th e origina l Londo n productio n o f A  Doll's  House  i n 1889 ,
suggested tha t Sha w conside r dramatizin g Yvette,  a  stor y b y Gu y d e
Maupassant. Achurc h summarize d i t fo r Sha w i n conversatio n wit h th e
result that both of them set out in 1893 to writ e plays about a woman who
becomes rich managing houses of prostitution. In a letter written at the end
of 189 3 Shaw refers to the leading role in Janet Achurch's version, entitled
Mrs, Daintree's Daughter, as "the original" of the title character of his own
Mrs. Warren's Profession.35 Although he encouraged Achurch to write Mrs.
Daintree's Daughter,  Sha w severel y attacke d th e complete d pla y afte r
learning that she had tried to interest Lewis Waller in staging it. "I am not
surprised about Mrs. Daintry," Shaw writes in early 1895; "the ending is not
the sort of thing for his audience" - th e "smart clientele" of the Haymarket
Theatre wher e Walle r wa s temporaril y actor-manager . Wha t wa s wron g
with Mrs.  Daintree's  Daughter,  fo r Shaw , wa s als o wha t ha d marre d
Elizabeth Robins' s writin g i n Alan's  Wife,  namel y a  surrende r t o a n
excessive pathos which was incompatible with "really good drama." Indeed
Janet Achurch' s pla y wasn' t dram a a t all , a s far a s Shaw was concerned :
"You know," he wrote in summing up the matter fo r her , "I told you tha t
you hadn' t writte n you r play. " Wha t Achurc h ha d writte n instea d wa s a
spectacle of emotional excess - no t a  play, but something "for a  Bernhardt
to sta r in." 36 Sha w claime d elsewher e tha t Sara h Bernhard t use d he r
spectacular talen t t o th e detrimen t o f "reall y goo d drama, " an d i n
particular t o th e detrimen t o f th e scrip t o f a  play : tha t sh e usurpe d th e
character fashione d b y the author i n order to stage herself  and, as herself,
overwhelm the audience. "She does not enter into the leading character: she
substitutes hersel f fo r it, " h e explained. 37 Shaw , wh o ha d declare d sym -
pathy with wome n i n the "struggl e betwee n the sexes," thus finds himself
locked i n struggle with Bernhard t an d othe r upstar t women of the theatre
such a s Janet Achurc h an d Elizabet h Robin s fo r contro l o f th e dramati c
text itself. Now he was on "the men's side," as he called it, resisting women
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as playwrights an d insistin g on the subjection o f actresses to the authority
of the (male-authored) script. 38

Thus the New Woman movement as it touched the theatre depended to a
large degree o n the abilit y o f women t o write plays , but repeatedl y Sha w
discredited th e effort s o f wome n a s playwrights . Hi s reaction s i n th e
aggregate suggest a  skepticism that women could write good drama a t all,
although h e stoppe d shor t o f th e sweepin g assertion s tha t Victoria n me n
often mad e abou t women' s lac k o f capacit y fo r playwriting . Fo r Shaw ,
women go t i t al l wron g whe n the y wrot e fo r th e theatr e -  echoin g hi s
comment to Janet Achurch when Dorothy Leighton' s Thyrza  Fleming was
produced b y the Independent Theatre in 1894 , Shaw's review included the
dismissive remark tha t "sh e has not written the play at all."39 He went on
to propose, as usual, a rewrite of the woman's play - arguin g that Thyrza
Fleming needed more "feeling" to qualify a s "true .  . .  drama," despite the
fact tha t earlie r h e ha d diagnose d Alan's  Wife  an d Mrs.  Daintree's
Daughter as no t "reall y goo d drama " becaus e o f a n excessiv e amoun t of
feeling in those plays by women. The rationale may shift, therefore, but for
Shaw these New Women's attempts to write plays were inappropriate, even
ludicrous, and the scripts they produced were not really plays at all.

In th e sam e yea r tha t he r pla y Thyrza  Fleming  was produce d b y th e
Independent Theatre , Doroth y Leighto n introduce d a  fictional  woma n
dramatist i n a  long-forgotten nove l entitled Disillusion  (1894). Leighton's
fictional heroin e Linda Grey is loath to make known her authorship of a hit
play, for although an ardent feminist, "her shy, reserved nature shrank from
any approach t o notoriety." 40 Th e credi t goe s to the New Woman' s male
collaborator, jus t a s i n th e pla y Our  Flat  (1889) a  woma n playwrigh t
allows all acclaim for he r hit play to fall to her husband, who wrote none
of i t himself. 41 Thes e representation s by , an d of , wome n writer s fo r th e
stage suggest that Virginia Woolf was correct in her assessment that women
were socially conditioned no t to write plays; or if they wrote them, to deny
authorship. Wome n wh o aspire d t o becom e playwright s di d no t alway s
realize the extent o f the bias against them unti l i t was pointed out . At the
close of the Victorian period Cicely Hamilton, another New Woman of the
theatre, "most of al l . . . desire d to write a good play," but learned from a
manager, whe n he r first  one-act piec e was abou t t o b e produced, tha t "i t
was advisable t o concea l the sex of it s author unti l afte r th e notices were
out, as plays which were known to be written by women were apt to get a
bad press."42 This point is not lost on the heroine of Our  Flat, an aspiring
woman playwrigh t wh o sign s he r first  pla y wit h he r husband' s name ,
withholding her own identity as author "til l the agreement is signed."43 In
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"real" life Florence Bell and Elizabeth Robins disguised their authorship of
Alan's Wife  from Beerboh m Tree, who they hoped would produce it, being
well awar e o f hi s vie w tha t "wome n can' t write." 44 Tre e decline d t o
produce Alan's  Wife  anyway, and ye t the hopes of these New Women fo r
reforming th e Londo n stag e hinge d t o a  considerabl e exten t o n play s
written as well as acted and produced by women. Shaw, belittling women's
attempts t o become playwrights , denying they had written "real " plays a t
all, contribute d t o th e subjectio n o f wome n i n th e theatr e eve n whil e h e
proclaimed himself their ally in the "battle between the sexes for control of
the London stage."

"In order to realize what a terrible person the New Woman is," Shaw wrote
in 1897 , i t i s necessary t o hav e read "tha t ruthlessl y orthodo x book , The
Heavenly Twins."  Sha w describe s Sara h Grand , th e author , a s a  "Ne w
Woman," but one who "will connive at no triflings with 'purity' in its sense
of monogamy. " I n on e stran d o f th e book' s complicate d plo t a  Ne w
Woman brid e name d Evadn e discover s tha t he r husban d ha s ha d sexua l
relationships befor e thei r marriage , makin g hi m a  "mora l leper " wit h
whom sh e can have no intimacy, physical o r emotional . Their marriage is
never consummate d becaus e th e Ne w Woma n ha s take n t o hear t a n
underlying premis e o f th e Victoria n doubl e standar d -  namely , tha t th e
"angel i n the house" is required t o save the male from hi s own depravity ,
feminizing him , requiring fro m hi m a  purity a s absolute a s her own . The
Heavenly Twins  was , a s Sha w himsel f wrote , a n "instan t an d hug e
success," an d mor e tha n an y othe r Ne w Woma n tex t i t create d a n
awareness o f wha t seeme d t o man y men , includin g Shaw , th e mos t
problematic demand of the developing women's movement.45 Sarah Grand
expressed that demand in her own voice in a magazine article that appeared
shortly afte r th e publicatio n o f The  Heavenly  Twins.  "Ma n morall y i s in
his infancy," she wrote in 1894 . "There have been times when there was a
doubt as to whether he was to be raised or woman was to be lowered, but
we hav e turne d tha t corne r a t last ; an d no w woma n hold s ou t a  stron g
hand to the child-man and insists . . . upon helping him up."46

But this demand fo r mal e purity was a  controversial aspec t o f the New
Woman movement , an d on e which made many men uncomfortable -  no t
just Shaw. It made some "advanced" women uncomfortable too , and male
playwrights sometimes turned this disharmony within the ranks of progres-
sive wome n int o ridicule . Fo r example , i n Sydne y Grundy' s The  New
Woman tw o women stak e ou t opposit e positions - Eni d Bethune arguin g
that men should be better, Victoria Vivash that women should be worse:
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Victoria: I want to be allowed to do as men do.
Enid: Then you ought to ashamed of yourself; there!
Victoria: I only say, I ought to be allowed.
Enid: And I say that a  man, reeking with infamy, ought not to be allowed to
marry a pure girl -
Victoria: Certainly not! She ought to reek with infamy as well.47

The targe t o f Grundy' s humo r i s no t onl y th e Ne w Woma n wh o woul d
claim som e o f th e libertie s traditionally belongin g t o men , bu t als o the on e
who would rais e men to the standard o f purity usually reserved fo r women .
The latte r type of New Woman i s also the satirica l target o f an unpublishe d
play b y Charle s Roger s calle d The  Future  Woman  (1896 ) i n whic h th e
husband Jenkin s agree s neve r t o "g o astray " agai n an d t o becom e a  mode l
husband, bu t onl y whe n hi s wif e agree s t o giv e u p th e "Societ y fo r th e
Advancement o f Woman' s Rights." 48 Similarly , i n thei r pla y Husband  and
Wife (1891) , F . C . Philip s an d Perc y Fendal l mak e spor t o f th e feminis t
Mrs. Greenthorne , founde r o f th e "Marrie d Women' s League " which , sh e
explains, "w e starte d fo r th e amelioratio n o f men' s moral s . . . t o elevat e
the standard o f husbands t o a  degree o f refinement an d purity." 49 O n othe r
occasions Ne w Wome n wer e represente d a s dauntin g adherent s o f a n
"ascetic ideal, " a s Rhoda Nun n call s i t i n Georg e Gissing' s nove l The  Odd
Women (1893 ) ~  "propagatin g a  ne w religion , purifyin g th e earth. " S o
when sh e hear s tha t th e ma n sh e love s i s a  ma n wit h a  past , Rhod a Nun n
scorns th e ide a o f marriag e wit h him , preferrin g t o becom e on e o f th e
unmated "od d women " o f th e book' s title. 50 Th e austerit y wit h whic h
Gissing invest s th e aptl y name d Rhod a Nun n ha s muc h i n commo n wit h
Shaw's ow n portrai t o f a n Ibsenit e Ne w Woma n i n The  Philanderer,
written i n 1 8 9 3 , t n e v e a r The  Odd  Women  wa s published . Grac e Tranfiel d
refuses t o marr y Leonar d Charteri s -  surel y a  self-portrai t o f th e autho r t o
some exten t -  becaus e o f a  libertin e caree r whic h ha s made hi m unabl e t o
respect even a woman he loves.

Shaw wa s thu s involve d i n thi s aspec t o f th e Ne w Woma n questio n a s
part o f a  nervou s mal e reactio n t o "thi s new-fangle d foll y tha t a  man' s lif e
must b e immaculate, " a s on e popula r bu t long-forgotte n pla y pu t it. 51

Shaw's reactio n t o "thi s new-fangle d folly " i n The  Philanderer  ma y see m
comparatively thoughtfu l an d restrained , especiall y i f compared , say , t o
Oscar Wilde' s An  Ideal  Husband  (1895) , whos e self-consciousl y feminis t
heroine no t onl y gives up the ide a tha t he r politician husban d shoul d b e a n
"ideal" man , bu t i n th e en d take s par t i n th e cover-u p t o shiel d hi m fro m
the consequence s o f hi s ow n crime . Lik e Wild e an d man y othe r men ,
however, Sha w foun d i t difficul t t o sympathiz e wit h th e Ne w Woman' s
advocacy o f a  highe r standar d o f conduct , o f "purity " even , wher e me n
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Parodying the "New Woman": Shauna Black as Sylvia Craven shocks Simon Bradbury
as Leonard Charteris in the Shaw Festival's 1995 production of The Philanderer

were concerned . H e confesses , indeed , tha t " I a m a  man ; an d Madam e
Sarah Grand' s solutio n fills  m e wit h dismay. " Shaw , despit e hi s ow n
hesitancy ove r sex , i s nostalgi c fo r a  doubl e standar d whic h provide s fo r
two types of women :

What I  shoul d like , o f course , woul d b e th e maintenanc e o f tw o distinc t
classes o f women , th e on e polyandrou s an d disreputabl e an d th e othe r
monogamous and reputable. I could then have my fill of polygamy among the
polyandrous ones with the certainty that I could hand them over to the police
if they annoyed m e after I  had becom e tired o f them, a t which dat e I  could
marry one of the monogamous ones and live happily ever afterwards.

Shaw the n reflect s tha t i f a  woman wer e t o sa y anythin g o f th e kin d abou t
men " I shoul d b e shocked " -  a  realization , h e says , whic h force s hi m t o
reconsider hi s position . Shoul d h e accep t fo r himsel f th e "asceticism " tha t
he ha s alway s demande d o f so-calle d respectabl e women , o r o n th e othe r
hand liv e freely, polygamously , an d exten d th e same righ t to women? Sha w
poses th e question , bu t doe s no t answe r it . "Spac e presses, " h e conclude s
abruptly, "an d thi s i s no t dramati c criticism " -  fo r hi s rumination s o n th e
"asceticism" o f Sara h Gran d an d th e Ne w Woman , o r rathe r some  Ne w
Women, ha d distracte d hi m fro m th e busines s a t hand , a  revie w o f a  pla y
called Nelson's Enchantress  (1897 ) by Risden Home .
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But was it really a distraction? That forgotten pla y by Risden Home, and
the meanderin g revie w o f it , allow s u s t o reconstruc t Shaw' s confuse d
response to the developing identity of the New Woman in the 1890s. Sarah
Grand i s mentioned i n thi s revie w onl y becaus e he r deman d tha t me n a s
well a s wome n b e "certifie d pure " contrast s starkl y wit h th e messag e o f
Nelson's Enchantress  - a  pla y b y "anothe r Ne w Woman, " accordin g t o
Shaw, but one extremely different fro m the author of The Heavenly Twins.
This pla y b y the daughte r o f a n admira l woul d scandaliz e no t onl y "th e
conventional male dramatist" but also the type of New Woman exemplified
by Sara h Grand. 52 It s sympathethi c heroin e start s ou t a s on e man' s
mistress, marries another , and ends up in love with the naval hero Nelson
himself. And what , ask s Shaw, is the woma n playwright' s verdic t o n thi s
notorious "polyandrist," Lady Hamilton?

Simply that what the conventional male dramatist would call her "impurity"
was an entirely respectable, lovable, natural feature o f her character, insepar-
ably boun d u p wit h th e qualitie s whic h mad e he r th e favorit e frien d o f
England's favorite hero. There is no apology made for this view, no conscious-
ness betrayed a t an y poin t tha t ther e is , or eve r was, a  general assumptio n
that it is an improper view.

For Shaw - "fo r my part, I am a man" - Risde n Home is the most appealing
kind of New Woman, one who makes it a priority to loosen the traditional
restraints o n th e sexua l behavio r o f women , leavin g th e time-honore d
liberties of men undisturbed.

But Shaw finds that, lik e so many othe r would-b e women playwrights ,
Risden Home "does not rise to the occasion" and her play is not "genuinely
dramatic." Why not? I n her play, Shaw believes, the rough-edged, unscru -
pulous, uncultured Nelson i s made out to be too good: "Though she deals
with Lad y Hamilto n lik e a  Ne w Woman , sh e deal s wit h Nelso n lik e a
Married one, taking care that he shall not set a bad example to husbands."
England's idol is contaminated by what Shaw's fellow dramatist of the mid-
1890s, Sydne y Grundy , terme d "thi s new-fangle d foll y tha t a  man' s lif e
must b e immaculate. " O n th e othe r hand , a s w e hav e seen , th e ide a o f
polyandrous wome n ha d it s appea l fo r Shaw , particularl y i f the y wer e
beautiful lik e Lad y Hamilto n o r Mrs . Patrick Campbell , th e actres s wh o
impersonated he r at the Avenue Theatre and whom Shaw tried his best (a t
least on paper) t o seduce . But Shaw hesitated an d sometimes mocked an d
resented the New Woman whenever he began to suspect that her project of
regenerating the world meant, as he put it, "purification" of the male sex.53

This conflic t amon g Ne w Wome n an d thei r sympathizer s -  whethe r t o
achieve sexual equality through raising the man or lowering the woman -
also concerned Shaw in his review of Thyrza Fleming. Here, again, he cites

90

anacl
Realce

anacl
Realce

anacl
Realce

anacl
Realce



Cambridge Companions Online © Cambridge University Press, 2006

New Women, new plays, and Shaw in the 1890s

Sarah Gran d disparagingl y a s the exempla r o f a n asceti c feminis m whic h
demanded "purity " o f th e mal e n o les s than th e female . Sha w interpret s
Dorothy Leighton' s pla y fo r th e Independen t Theatr e Societ y a s a  bol d
counterblast to the radical feminism o f Grand's novel The Heavenly Twins
and it s stor y o f a  woma n wh o "marrie d a  gentlema n 'wit h a  past' ;
discovered i t on her wedding day ; and promptl y went home, treating him
exactly a s he would hav e been conventionally expecte d t o treat he r unde r
like circumstances. " B y contrast , th e fastidiou s Ne w Woma n wh o leave s
her husban d i n Thyrza  Fleming  learns, as Shaw puts it , "wha t a  frightfu l
mistake i t i s for a  woman t o take suc h a  step." 54 A woman's business , as
Dorothy Leighton's heroine realizes by the end of Act ill, is to transcend her
own "isolate d notion s o f morality" and realize that men "can' t b e flogged
into perfection."55 This is the realization, of course, that eludes Shaw's own
New Woman in The Philanderer, Grace Tranfield, wh o suppresses her love
for Leonard Charteris because he is a man with a sexual past. Sarah Grand,
like Grace Tranfield, insisted that men, no less than women, had an ideal to
live up to. Although morally in their infancy, men could in fact b e brought
to perfection -  o r flogged into it , i f necessay, by the "strong hand" o f the
New Woman . "T o brin g thi s abou t i s th e whol e ai m an d objec t o f th e
present struggle, " Sara h Gran d wrot e i n he r essa y o n th e Ne w Woman ,
"and wit h th e discover y o f th e mean s lie s th e solutio n o f th e Woma n
Question."56

Shaw would return to these issues when he wrote You  Never Can Tell in
1895-96, a  pla y whic h appear s t o ech o The  Heavenly  Twins  i n certai n
respects an d contradic t i t i n others.  Th e twin s o f Grand' s titl e ar e tw o
madcap children named Angelica and Diavolo whose mischief i s in itself a
challenge t o Victorian authority . Bu t Grand , b y representing th e twins as
similar in intellectual power and in their turn for devilish behavior, creates
an androgynou s pai r who , despit e thei r names , show the falsenes s o f th e
Victorian classification o f woman as angel and man as lower, to be sure, yet
intellectually her superior. Indeed Angelica in Grand's novel turns out to be
stronger and smarter than her brother as they grow older, but her potential
is smothered i n an early marriage while Diavolo is sent off t o be educated
at Sandhurs t an d enjoys th e prospect o f a  fine career. Shaw, in You  Never
Can Tell,  create s i n Doll y an d Phili p Clando n a  se t o f twin s whos e
irrepressible behavio r recall s unmistakabl y th e "heavenl y twins " of Sara h
Grand. Instead o f making the case for th e New Woman, however , Shaw' s
characters mak e fu n o f thei r mother , Mrs . Lanfre y Clandon , a  long-tim e
advocate of woman's rights and author o f many books on that and related
subjects. "No household i s complete without he r works," says Philip, who
then expresses his urgent desire "to get away from them." He concedes that
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his emancipate d mother' s writing s ma y "improv e you r mind " -  but ,
interjects hi s sister Dolly, "not till weve gone, please." Their mother may be
the well-know n autho r o f Twentieth  Century  Women,  bu t th e twin s
perceive her ideas as old-fashioned -  an d so they are, at least in the world
of You  Never Can Tell where socialism (as the solicitor M'Comas explains
in Act il) has made the women's rights movement obsolete.

Shaw's irreveren t twins , therefore , evok e th e atmospher e bu t moc k th e
content of Sarah Grand's "heavenly twins." They mock feminism instead of
illustrating th e need fo r it , and rathe r tha n attackin g Victorian patriarch y
they are in search of a patriarch - searching , that is , for their "lost" father .
"My knowledge of human nature leads me to believe that we had a father,"
says Philip, teasing his mother, "and that you probably know who he was."
Mrs. Clandon would say , perhaps, that she knows him all too well. Like a
character i n a  nove l b y Sara h Grand , sh e lef t he r husban d year s ag o
because o f hi s flawed character . " I discovered hi s temper," as she explains
to he r frien d M'Comas , "an d hi s -  [she  shivers] the res t o f hi s commo n
humanity." Thi s intoleranc e fo r th e mora l fallibilit y o f th e mal e i s wha t
distinguished Sarah Grand in particular and the New Woman movement in
general fo r Shaw , who becam e uneasy , even resentfu l o r confused , when -
ever he thought about it . A corollary of Mrs. Clandon's austere morality is
her own lack of passion, for "thoug h I  am a married woman , I have never
been in love; I have never had a  love affair." Eve n her dress , although no t
masculine, rule s ou t "all  attempt  at  sex  attraction."  Sha w pointedl y
contrasts Mrs . Clandon wit h he r daughte r Gloria , a  New Woman who is
"all passion"  an d wh o i n th e en d reject s he r mother' s emphasi s o n
intellectual qualitie s for women and a  high moral and sexua l standard fo r
men. Thus Glori a Clandon , following he r mother' s lead , means a t firs t t o
walk awa y from he r love for Valentine when she learns of hi s past sexua l
escapades. In the end , however , Glori a succumb s t o Valentine' s argumen t
that a  ma n mus t experienc e lov e man y time s t o fin d ou t wh o i s reall y
worthy o f it . And Gloria i s worthy of i t not because of her New Woman's
intellect - fo r intellect , Valentine declares, is a "masculine speciality" - an d
not because of her austere morality . Gloria i s worthy of Valentine because
of he r sexua l magnetism , he r abilit y t o "stir " the depth s o f him , to make
him adore her as the agent of biological forces beyond the control of either
of them . "Let' s cal l i t chemistr y .  . .  th e mos t irresistibl e o f al l natura l
forces," Valentin e explains. 57 Gloria' s strength , bein g purel y sexual , ha s
nothing to do with the intellectual and political development o f women or
with the moral amelioration of men.

In an article written a few years before the rediscovery of Sarah Grand by
feminist critics , Stanle y Weintrau b argue s tha t The  Heavenly  Twins  pro -
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vided Sha w with inspiration fo r You  Never Can  Tell, focusing o n similar -
ities between Philip and Dolly Clandon and the twins in Grand's novel and
on Shaw's having credited Grand with "a touch of genius." There can be no
doubt that Grand' s novel was an important influence o n Shaw's play, but I
argue that Shaw's "borrowings" as such are comparatively insignificant and
indeed are enlisted to help express his revulsion against what The Heavenly
Twins represente d i n the 1890 s -  " a reductio  ad absurdum of ou r whol e
moral system, " a s Sha w complaine d i n a  revie w writte n i n 1896 . Sara h
Grand, he writes, demands that "the man shall come to the woman exactly
as moral as he insists that she shall come to him. And, of course, not a soul
dares den y tha t claim." 58 You  Never  Can  Tell  was written , i n part , t o
supply tha t deficienc y -  t o provid e a  resounding denia l o f Sara h Grand' s
"claims" o f th e intellectua l equalit y o f th e sexe s an d he r insistenc e upo n
male (as well as female) rectitude.

From anothe r perspective , however , You  Never  Can  Tell  rewrite s
another pla y b y a  woman , on e muc h mor e successful , o r rathe r mor e
popular than Dorothy Leighton's , even though we have lost all memory of
it today. A Mother  of Three,  by Clotilde Graves , an actress known for he r
masculine dress and manner, opened a t the Comedy Theatre in April 189 6
to favorabl e review s an d enthusiasti c crowds . Sha w himsel f reviewe d it ,
expressing admiratio n fo r th e "fun " i n it , bu t regrettin g th e lac k o f
"philosophy" wit h whic h Cl o Grave s wrot e th e piece . Onc e again , a
woman dramatis t ha d starte d wit h a  good idea but , Shaw believed , got i t
all wrong in the execution, for in A Mother of Three Clo Graves wastes on
farce " a talen t whic h evidentl y ha s a  rar e intensit y o f emotiona l forc e
behind it." 59 Shaw saw A Mother of  Three  on April 8 , 1896, just when he
was working o n th e secon d ac t o f You  Never  Can  Tell, uncertain abou t
how to develop the action of his own play.60

Much o f th e materia l i n You  Never  Can  Tell  that i s no t traceabl e t o
Sarah Gran d seem s modeled o n Clo Graves' s forgotten comedy , even as it
undercuts A  Mother  of  Three  i n othe r respects . Bot h play s dea l wit h a
woman bringin g u p he r thre e children o n he r own , apar t fro m th e fathe r
who i n bot h play s ha s bee n absen t fo r precisel y eightee n years . I n bot h
plays, moreover , th e thre e childre n find  thei r socia l standin g calle d int o
question becaus e they are unable to produce a  father -  tha t "certificat e o f
respectability," a s on e o f th e daughter s say s i n A  Mother  of  Three-,  tha t
"indispensable par t o f you r socia l equipment, " a s Sha w write s i n You
Never Can  Tell.61 Bot h Shaw and Grave s return the long-absent fathe r t o
his family - bu t the similarities end precisely there. In You  Never Can  Tell
Mrs. Clando n lef t Fergu s Crampto n eightee n year s ag o becaus e o f hi s
moral shortcomings. In A Mother of Three, by contrast, Mrs. Murgatroyd's
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husband abandoned he r eighteen years ago for reasons of his own, and his
own belated moral awakening brings him home again. "Conscience tore at
me," explains Professo r Murgatroyd , realizin g tha t a  man ha s a  responsi-
bility, neglected i n hi s case, to b e "activel y engage d i n assisting hi s bette r
half in the discharge of her domestic duties."62

Even thoug h Sha w coul d fin d n o seriousnes s o r "philosophy " i n A
Mother of  Three,  Clo Graves' s farcica l comedy , fa r fro m bein g empt y of
thought, agree s ultimately with the New Woman posture o f Sara h Grand ,
that ther e shoul d b e onl y on e standard , an d a  high on e a t that , fo r bot h
men and women. What i s required i s a "feminizing" o f the male like that
produced b y th e transformatio n o f Professo r Murgatroyd , a s wel l a s a
"masculinizing" o f th e woma n -  represente d i n A  Mother  of  Three  in a
comic vein by Mrs. Murgatroyd's cross-dressing as a male, and, more to the
point, b y he r succes s a s provide r an d hea d o f th e famil y durin g he r
husband's eighteen-yea r absence . "Th e voi d yo u lef t behin d wa s ver y
great," Mrs. Murgatroyd tell s her reappearing spouse, "but I  tried my best
to fill it - an d though I was very young and inexperienced a t first, I haven't
done so very badly."63 What Shaw took to be a brainless farce was instead
a deepl y thoughtful a s well a s funny pla y i n which the Victorian sens e of
"male" an d "female " wa s refigure d entirely . I n rejectin g Cl o Graves' s
credentials a s a  playwright , the n rewritin g he r farcica l comed y a s You
Never Can Tell, Shaw was actually resisting that aspect of the "philosophy"
of the New Woman which made him most uncomfortable -  tha t part which
challenged th e polarizatio n o f mal e an d femal e an d dare d t o requir e
modification i n the behavior of men.

Looking a t Sha w in this way makes him something les s than "woman' s
champion," the phrase by which Margot Peters expressed her first, but not
final opinion o f him. 64 Hi s relationshi p wit h Elizabet h Robins , th e mos t
important New Woman in the London theatre of the 1890s , helps explain
what Peters refers t o as Shaw's "ambiguous attitudes" on issues of gender.
On on e han d h e looks to Robin s a s a  moving forc e behin d th e emergin g
"struggle between the sexes for control of the London stage," declaring his
sympathy wit h he r an d othe r Ibsenit e actresse s suc h a s Jane t Achurch ,
Florence Farr, and Marion Lea. "I take my hat off to them," he declares in a
review of 1894, for in their defeated hopes for a new kind of theatre lay the
"real history " o f th e dram a o f th e 1890s. 65 A t th e sam e time , however ,
Shaw resisted a  cornerstone of Robins's agenda for reform o f the theatre -
the necessity , as she saw it , fo r wome n to write play s of a  type tha t male
dramatists woul d not , o r coul d not , produce . Shaw' s repeate d assertion s
that women "Impossibilists" were not writing good drama, or even plays at
all, were founde d o n th e Victorian wisdo m tha t playwritin g require d th e
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kind o f intellectua l powe r that , a s Valentine remark s i n You  Never  Can
Tell, is a "masculine speciality."

In resistin g wome n playwrights , therefore , Sha w se t himsel f agains t a
main current of the New Woman movement as it existed in the theatre. He
became part o f the problem that Elizabeth Robins, who was about to give
up o n th e stag e i n th e mid-i89os , fel t sh e coul d neve r overcome . Bu t
Shaw's experienc e wit h Robin s als o illustrate s a  secon d are a i n which he
found himsel f a t times troubled by, at times in conflict with, what he called
the "terrible " New Woman . Robins' s rejectio n o f Shaw' s gallantries -  sh e
threatened to shoot him during an interview that he conducted with her in
1893 ~ became a sore point that vexed their relationship for many years to
come. Shaw reacted in a tone of comic indignation in a letter of February 5,
1893: "I have interviewed beautifu l wome n before ; but none of them were
ever so noble as to threaten to shoot me."66 A few months later he wrote to
Robins again, confessing "bein g in love with you in a poetic and not in the
least ignoble way," mocking her once again for having terrified hi m with a
pistol and complaining that on another occasion she flung him out of a cab
into th e mud. 67 Wha t cam e betwee n the m wa s wa s wha t cam e betwee n
Shaw and th e New Woman mor e generally , whether insid e or outside the
theatre -  he r emphasi s upo n a  hig h mora l standar d fo r me n a s wel l a s
women. This angle of attack upon the double standard for men and women
had bee n displayed mos t famously i n Sarah Grand's  The  Heavenly Twins;
and as Shaw had written, "For my part, I am a man; and Madame Grand's
solution fills me with dismay."

Elizabeth Robins was the Sarah Grand of the theatre as far a s Shaw was
concerned, and many of his subsequent references to Robins are colored by
that perception . A  lette r tha t h e wrot e t o Robin s i n 189 9 contain s a
sneering referenc e t o he r a s "St . Elizabeth, " an d i n a  lette r t o Willia m
Archer h e expresses frustratio n tha t Robin s coul d no t conceiv e hi s "anti -
ethical, anti-virtuous view of life" as anything but blackguardism.68 Shaw's
biographers have generally accepted his interpretation o f Robins's behavior
toward hi m a s symptomati c o f he r bein g "squeamish " abou t me n i n
general.69 She felt convinced , offers Michae l Holroyd i n the mocking tone
of Sha w himself, tha t "al l men were potentia l rapists." 70 Such caricatures
ignore th e fac t tha t Robins' s objection s t o Sha w wer e i n respons e t o hi s
unwanted advances . I f Sha w coul d hav e rewritte n th e lif e o f Elizabet h
Robins, and not just her play Alan's Wife,  she would hav e been more like
Proserpine Garnet t i n Candida,  the "new " working woma n enthralle d b y
the golden-tongued hero of the play, the Rev. James Morell. Prossy's name,
as Ellen Gainor point s out , recalls the myth of Proserpine and her rape by
Pluto - bu t in Shaw's play Prossy and many other women are magnetized
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by Morell, and so the guilt of rape or sexual aggression is transformed int o
Proserpine's undeclare d bu t arden t attractio n t o him. 71 I t wa s sexua l
attraction that Shaw hoped for from Elizabeth Robins despite the emphatic
"no" wit h whic h sh e responde d t o hi s overtures . Fro m thi s perspectiv e
women desir e o r eve n invit e the me n who haras s them , eve n i f thei r rea l
feelings are covered by an outward show of reluctance. Proserpine Garnet t
could hav e "taught " Robin s this , bu t onl y Glori a Clando n i n You  Never
Can Tell could have modeled a  complete new narrative fo r Robins' s life -
the story of a  high-minded New Woman who gives up her feminism whe n
her ow n surgin g womanlines s make s i t impossibl e fo r he r t o resis t an y
longer the call of sex.

NOTES
1 Bernar d Shaw , prefac e t o William Archer , The  Theatrical "World" of  1894

(London: Scott , 1895) , PP - xxix-xxx. Ly n Picket ha s proposed 189 4 as the
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America (New York: Oxford University Press), p. 247.
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4 Athenaeum,  Marc h 23 , 1895, p. 375; Mrs. Morgan-Dockrell, "I s the Ne w
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her famil y i s a t leas t Candida' s own . Likewis e i n Man  and  Superman,  first
produced i n 1905 , Watson finds a reversal of gender roles with Ann Whitefield
as the sexual aggressor and Tanner as her prey ("The New Woman and the New
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these heroines are limited in the exercise of their power to the realms of home,
sex, and private feeling, and in this respect are characteristically Victorian.
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he referre d t o a s "Impossibilists. " H e wa s sensitiv e a t a n earl y dat e t o th e
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Mead, 1962], vol. ill, p. 113).
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the basis of her best-known drama, Votes  for Women!  (1907). But some of her
friends an d allie s - suc h as Florence Bell , co-author o f Alan's Wife,  and Mary
Augusta Ward , th e novelis t an d dramatis t wh o wrot e Eleanor  (1902) , a n
unconventional "woman' s play " which provide d Robin s wit h he r las t profes -
sional stage role - wer e vehement "Anti's" even though they matched the profile
of the New Woman in many respects. Indeed, as Angela John points out, Robins
admired Mrs . War d a s a  "socia l activist " (Angel a John , Elizabeth  Robins:
Staging a Life,  1862-1952  [London : Routledge , 1995] , p . 94) . Eve n Emm a
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Shaw's early plays

Especially durin g th e formativ e year s leadin g u p t o hi s emergenc e a s a
playwright with Widowers'  Houses (1892), the course of Shaw's career was
deeply influenced b y his friend an d self-proclaimed mentor , William Archer.
Archer, born in the same year as Shaw (1856), became one of the foremos t
early translators o f Ibsen' s dramas and , next to Shaw, their most vigorous
advocate in the English theatre of the late nineteenth century. He first came
across Shaw, at the age of 26, in the British Museum Reading Room, where
he noticed both the pale young man with the bright red beard and "the odd
combination o f authors whom he used to study - fo r I  saw him day afte r
day porin g ove r Kar l Marx' s Das  Kapital  an d a n orchestra l scor e o f
Wagner's Tristan  und Isolde"1 No t long afterwards, earl y in 1884, Archer
was hired by Edmund Yates' s World  as that newspaper's drama critic , and
he soon persuaded hi s publisher to take on his unemployed frien d a s well,
to serve as the paper's art critic. Some time later, Archer recalls, "the post of
musical critic fell vacant, and I secured it for Shaw by the simple process of
telling Yates the truth: namely, that he was at once the most competent and
most brilliant writer on music then living in England."2 Shaw himself could
not have put it better in one of his prefaces.

In spit e o f al l thi s serendipity , however , i t wa s inevitabl e tha t Archer' s
attempt t o collaborat e wit h Sha w o n th e pla y tha t eventuall y becam e
Widowers' Houses  wa s doome d t o catastrophe . Th e shar p differenc e
between their attitudes to drama and dramatic construction is , after all , the
difference tha t mad e Sha w a  brillian t an d excitin g (i f sometime s erratic )
playwright an d Arche r a  forgotte n one . "I t wa s m y deliberat e an d un -
accountable disregar d o f th e rule s o f th e ar t o f pla y constructio n tha t
revolted him, " Shaw later observed in a genial preface writte n a  couple of
years after Archer' s death i n 192 4 and published i n a posthumous editio n
of three of his friend's plays . For Shaw a play had to be "a vital growth and
not a mechanical construction," and hence he refused t o be held hostage by
Archer's quasi-Aristotelia n principles . A  play shoul d nee d n o plot , Sha w
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continues, because "i f it has any natural lif e in it, it will construct itself ; it
will construct itself , like a flowering plant , far more wonderfully tha n the
author ca n possibly construc t it." 3 This is , of course , the Shaw of Heart-
break House speaking, not the Shaw of The Philanderer. Nevertheless , the
growing disagreement s betwee n hi m and Archer ove r Widowers 3 Houses
and othe r earl y Shavia n play s bea r unmistakabl e evidenc e o f th e new
direction i n which h e was already tryin g t o go in the 1890 s -  towar d a
more organic, dialectical, "musical" form o f composition focused squarel y
on "a conflict of unsettled ideals" (to borrow an operative phrase from The
Quintessence oflbsenism).

Archer disagree d wit h muc h o f this , no t leas t wit h Shaw' s ideologica l
interpretation o f Ibsenism . "Ibse n i s a psychologis t o r he is nothing," he
declares flatly in Play-making (1912), "a manual of craftmanship" devote d
to an exposition o f the clockwork mechanis m o f the well-made pla y and
the suprem e importanc e o f characte r an d psycholog y withi n tha t mech -
anism. Archer's view of drama was undividedly characterological. "Drama-
tic actio n ough t t o exis t fo r th e sake o f character, " h e insists: "when the
relation is reversed the play may be an ingenious toy, but scarcely a work of
art." Needles s to say, there was little roo m fo r the aberrations o f a Shaw
("a despise r o f the niceties o f craftmanship") withi n suc h a  tightly seale d
system. "Mr . Sha w i s not , primarily , eithe r a  character-drawe r o r a
psychologist bu t a  deale r i n personifie d ideas, " Arche r declare s withou t
much discrimination . "Hi s leading figures are , as a rule, either his mouth-
pieces o r hi s butts." 4 Candida,  not surprisingly , seem s t o hav e bee n hi s
favourite Sha w play, and as his "all-too-candid mentor" (as he calls himself
in a final, wistfu l lette r to Shaw in 1924) , he never tired o f urging him to
write more such well constructed, character-based comedies.

Widowers' Houses,  however , i s a  pla y o f a  ver y differen t sort , "un -
pleasant" rather than "pleasant " in more ways than one. (In his preface to
the first edition , Shaw calls it "a propagandist pla y . . . saturated wit h the
vulgarity of the life it represents.") It s theme is the ruthless exploitation of
the destitute and homeless by the mercantile and the upper classes alike; its
avowed intentio n i s to implicat e ever y membe r o f th e audienc e i n tha t
social crime . Hence , whe n the y sa t dow n i n 188 5 t o collaborat e o n
Rhinegold (as Archer first titled their proposed play), it seems unlikely that
either writer quite realized the full exten t to which their aims and methods
differed. Archer' s scenari o apparentl y calle d fo r a  well-mad e romanti c
comedy o f courtshi p an d renunciation , harkin g bac k t o th e popula r
sentimental comedie s o f To m Robertson. Shaw , o n the othe r hand , was
busy writin g dialogu e aime d a t achievin g wha t The  Quintessence  of
Ibsenism later defines as "a forensic technique of recrimination, discussion,

104



Cambridge Companions Online © Cambridge University Press, 2006

Shaw's early plays

and penetration throug h ideal s to the truth." With only two act s finished,
the project collapsed after Archer withdrew from it . "The public will accept
open vice , bu t i t wil l hav e nothin g t o d o with a  mora l problem " h e had
warned i n a n earlie r book . "Especiall y i t wil l hav e nothin g t o d o wit h a
piece to whose theme the word 'unpleasant ' ca n be applied. This epithet is
of undefine d an d elasti c signification , bu t onc e attach i t t o a  play an d al l
chances for it are past."5

Despite such repudiations , Widowers'  Houses was finally completed b y
Shaw and given two performances b y J. T. Grein's struggling Independen t
Theatre i n 1892 . In his review of thi s event i n The  World  (December 14 ,
1892), Archer acknowledge d hi s participation i n the earlie r collaboratio n
("I dre w out , scen e b y scene , the schem e o f a  twaddlin g cup-and-sauce r
comedy"), but he denied that any of his ideas had actually been adopted by
Shaw i n hi s final  text . Bot h i n th e editio n publishe d b y th e Independen t
Theatre following it s premiere and in his later preface t o Plays Unpleasant
(1898), Shaw strenuously insists that he not only made use of Archer's well-
made schem e bu t "perversel y distorte d i t int o a  grotesquel y realisti c
exposure" of the social corruption that provides the comedy's subtext. The
result i s a deliberate , "revoltingl y incongruous " inversio n o f th e dramati c
situation an d it s familia r conventions , designe d t o manipulat e an d ulti -
mately invalidate the standard assumptions and responses of the previously
complacent spectator . "Sartoriu s i s absolutel y typica l i n hi s unconsciou s
villainy. Like my critics, he lacks conviction o f sin," Shaw continues in the
first edition. "Now, the didactic object of my play is to bring conviction of
sin -  t o mak e th e Pharise e .  . . recogniz e tha t Sartoriu s i s hi s ow n
photograph."6 Thus , behind th e absur d antic s o f hi s reconstituted stereo -
types -  th e swee t reasonablenes s o f th e rent-gougin g slumlord , th e foul -
tempered eroticis m o f hi s daughter, the ineffectua l contritio n o f the good-
natured bu t spineles s hero - remain s the condemnation implici t i n Shaw's
"farfetched" Scriptura l title , with it s allusio n t o "th e greate r damnation "
which Jesu s call s dow n o n th e Pharisee s an d hypocrite s wh o "devou r
widows' houses" (Matthew 23:14).

In the first act of Widowers'  Houses, the situation, the tone, and even the
setting all contribute to the expectation of a polite Robertsonian comedy of
class-crossed lover s - o r possibly even a Gilbertian farce , akin to Engaged,
about th e vicissitude s o f romanc e i n a  money-ma d world . Affabl e Harr y
Trench, th e younge r {ergo  impecunious) so n o f a n aristocrati c family , i s
taking a n Augus t holida y i n German y afte r finishing medical school . Hi s
older an d wise r companion , Willia m d e Burg h Cokan e (pu n n o doub t
intended), i s a perfect specime n o f the theatrica l typ e know n a s the Stage
Swell, with "a little tact, a little knowledge of the world, a little experience
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of women" to get him by. As they ponder their Continental Bradshaw over
beers i n th e garde n restauran t o f a  touris t hote l o n th e Rhine , th e tw o
travellers ar e joined i n the garden b y Blanche Sartorius , the very girl with
whom Harr y ha s flirted  o n thei r rive r cruise , an d he r wealth y an d
domineering father , a  self-mad e businessma n wit h a n inaccessibl e air .
Undaunted, Cokane suavely tackles the tycoon and pilots him off to see the
sights, clearing the stage for a  love scene (one of Shaw's funniest) betwee n
Blanche an d th e besotte d youn g doctor . Ever y inc h he r vulga r an d iron -
willed father's daughter, she supplies Trench with the courage and words he
needs:

B LANCHE : (giving him up as hopeless) I dont think theres much danger of your
making up your mind, Dr. Trench.

TRENCH : (stammering) I only thought - (He  stops and looks at her piteously.
She hesitates amoment, and  then puts her hands into his with calculated
impulsiveness. He snatches her into his arms with a cry of relief.) Dear
Blanche! I thought I should never have said it. I believe I should have stood
stuttering here all day if you hadnt helped me out with it.

BLANCHE: (indignantly  trying to break loose from him) I didnt help you out
with it.

TRENCH: (holding  her) I dont mean that you did it on purpose, of course. Only
instinctively.

BLANCHE: (still  a little anxious) But you havent said anything.
TRENCH: What more can I say than this? (He kisses her again.)
BLANCHE: (overcome  by the kiss, but holding on to her point) But Harry -
TRENCH: (delighted  at the name) Yes.
BLANCHE: When shall we be married?7

The excerpt illustrate s Shaw's technical control o f comic dialogue, even as
a beginner , as well as his determination fro m th e outset to direct his plays
on paper , dow n t o th e smalles t movemen t o r inflection . I n term s o f th e
action, meanwhile , th e passag e als o pinpoint s th e momen t a t whic h th e
play start s t o gravitat e fro m romanti c comed y towar d somethin g muc h
darker. Th e enigmati c Sartoriu s readil y agree s t o th e matc h (th e "trans -
action," as he calls it) - bu t only on the condition tha t Harry wil l provide
written guarantee s fro m hi s aunt Lad y Roxdale an d hi s other aristocrati c
relatives tha t Blanch e wil l b e welcome d int o th e socia l circle s tha t ar e
obviously close d t o he r father . Th e bargai n i s struck , a  lette r t o Trench' s
people i s drafted , bu t overhangin g i t al l i s the operativ e secret : th e rea l
source fro m whic h Sartorius' s prosperit y derive s ("th e renta l o f ver y
extensive real estate in London").

In the second act - which , in a sense, might almost mark the beginning of
an entirely new play - th e tone and development o f the courtship comedy
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7 Th e attack on idealism (i) Reversing the sex-roles: Elizabeth Brown as Blanche Sartorius
dominates Blair Williams as Dr. Harry Trench in the Shaw Festival's 1992 production of

Widowers' Houses

are no w subverte d b y melodrama . (Th e ironi c interfac e betwee n melo -
drama an d lif e seem s full y a s centra l t o thi s pla y a s th e comparabl e
interface betwee n melodrama and history is to The Devil's Disciple.) From
the carefree atmospher e of the hotel garden on the Rhine, we are moved to
the chilly opulence of Sartorius's summer establishment in Surrey, where he
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conducts hi s affair s i n a  librar y line d wit h unifor m row s o f "smartl y
tooled" bu t obviously unread books . Lickcheese, an unctuous, melancholy
rent-collector of Dickensian format, i s introduced, i t seems, for the express
purpose o f revealin g th e tru e natur e o f hi s employer' s business , a s th e
proprietor o f th e mos t notoriou s an d run-dow n tenemen t house s i n
London. Whe n th e unfortunat e bagma n admit s tha t h e has use d twenty -
four shilling s of his master's takings to repair a  dangerous staircase in one
of hi s squali d buildings , h e i s promptly sacke d b y the ruthles s Sartorius .
Lickcheese, however, takes his revenge by telling Trench - wh o has arrived
in th e meantim e wit h th e promise d guarantee s o f Blanche' s acceptanc e -
the trut h abou t hi s future father-in-law' s heinou s practice s a s a  slumlord .
Harry i s overwhelmed, bu t his sophisticated companio n takes the news in
his stride:

coKANE: (looking  compassionately at him) Ah, my dear fellow, the love of
money is the root of all evil.

LICKCHEESE: Yes, sir, and we'd all like to have the tree growing in our garden.
(P. 3i)

The cynica l humou r o f th e wisecrac k capture s th e growin g sens e o f
universal corruptio n tha t invade s th e pla y an d ultimatel y engulf s it .
Business i s business , Harr y learns , eve n i n affair s o f th e heart . Whe n h e
informs Blanch e (whil e stubbornl y refusin g t o explai n himself ) tha t the y
must renounc e he r father' s mone y afte r thei r marriage , hi s sharp-tongue d
fiancee flies into a towering rage and breaks off their engagement.

The crucial scene in Shaw's reconstituted versio n o f the Archer scenario
is not, however, the lovers' quarrel over money but the ensuing confronta -
tion between the naive idealist and the cunning and unscrupulous Sartorius,
who blandl y justifie s hi s iron-handed treatmen t o f hi s tenants a s the bes t
means "to provide additional houses for the homeless, and to lay by a little
for Blanche. " Charit y i s impractical , h e reason s ("whe n peopl e ar e ver y
poor, yo u canno t hel p them , n o matte r ho w muc h yo u ma y sympathiz e
with them") , an d s o hi s cours e o f actio n i s no t onl y reasonabl e bu t
inevitable: "Ever y ma n wh o ha s a  hear t mus t wis h tha t a  bette r stat e o f
things was practicable . Bu t unhappily i t i s not." Trench's scruple s tur n t o
ashes when he is told that he , too (like Lady Roxdale and her entire social
circle) live s o n "tainted " mone y derive d fro m investment s i n Sartorius' s
slums. "Morall y beggared, " h e i s reduce d t o " a livin g pictur e o f disillu -
sion." I n thi s play , however , th e disillusionmen t o f th e her o i s no t th e
process o f educatio n t o somethin g better , a s i t subsequentl y become s i n
"pleasant" play s suc h a s Arms and  the  Man  an d Candida,  Harry Trenc h
learns nothing save his own guil t and his powerlessness to change society .

108



Cambridge Companions Online © Cambridge University Press, 2006

Shaw's early plays

In this respect, he resembles the "average homebred Englishman" described
by Shaw i n th e prefac e t o Plays  Unpleasant, willin g a t onc e "t o shu t hi s
eyes to th e mos t villainou s abuses " i f hi s own welfar e i s threatened. An d
even thoug h th e wretche d Harr y allow s himsel f t o b e persuade d b y
Sartorius's arguments , h e i s stil l chucke d ou t b y hi s angr y fiancee , wh o
refuses "t o marry a fool."

The final movement of the play is a grotesque and vigorous scherzo that
recapitulates th e mai n theme s i n dissonant , eve n striden t tones . Fou r
months hav e passed , an d Blanch e an d he r fathe r si t "glumly " befor e a
winter fir e i n thei r fashionabl e Londo n drawin g room . Th e actio n i s
generated b y th e arriva l o f unexpecte d visitors , th e firs t o f who m i s
Lickcheese -  a  veritabl e Alfre d Doolittl e suddenl y transforme d fro m dir t
and penur y t o th e eleganc e o f ful l evenin g dress , complete wit h diamon d
stud an d sil k ha t o f the glossiest black . (Lik e Doolittle's return i n the las t
act o f Pygmalion,  thi s entranc e i s als o a  sta r tur n that , b y Shaw' s ow n
admission, enable d Jame s Welch' s Lickchees e t o stea l th e sho w i n th e
Independent Theatre production.) In this case, the startling transmogrifica -
tion is the result of a lucrative con game, in which slums known by insiders
to be scheduled for demolition are bought up and superficially renovated to
make the m eligibl e fo r exorbitan t compensatio n b y th e expropriatin g
authorities. Sartorius , whose rent-gouging activitie s hav e bee n noted b y a
Royal Commission inquiry , is happy enough to join Lickcheese's profitabl e
and mor e "respectable " new swindle . Blanche, her thought s stil l obsesse d
by her ex-suitor, finally discover s the truth about her father's mone y - an d
hence Harry' s refusa l o f i t -  i n th e page s o f a  parliamentar y repor t
conveniently left by the playwright for her to read. Her "ladylike" revulsion
is directed, however, not at her father's actions but at the socially unsavoury
character o f his clientele. ("Oh, I  hate the poor. At least, I hate those dirty,
drunken, disreputabl e peopl e who live like pigs. If they mus t b e provided
for, le t other people look after them." ) This caricature o f a  strong Shavian
heroine get s jus t the man sh e deserves , i t seems , in Harry Trench , who is
brought i n by Lickcheese ("coarsene d an d sullen") to be convinced, as the
mortgagee of Sartorius's property, to take his share of the risks and profit s
involved i n th e ne w speculation . Astutely , Lickchees e recognize s tha t a
marital alliance will be the best solution for all concerned:

I know Miss Blanche: she has her father's eye for business. Explain this job to
her; and she'll make it up with Dr. Trench. Why not have a bit of romance in
business when it costs nothing? (p . 61)

To further thi s purpose, Sartorius, Lickcheese, and Cokane (the parvenu's
new "sekketerry") retir e to the adjoining study , leaving the stage to Harry
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and Blanche for a  reconciliation scene that becomes an outright travesty of
the conventional conclusion to a well-made courtship comedy. Discovering
her pre y alon e an d abou t t o kis s he r portrait , Blanch e launche s int o a n
angry, uninterrupte d harangu e tha t begin s "shrewishly " an d build s t o a
climax when she seizes his cheeks and twists his head around, kneels beside
his chair "with her breast against his shoulder," and finally "crushe s him in
an ecstati c embrace," adding ("wit h furiou s tenderness") : "How dar e you
touch anything belonging to me?" The meaning of her tantrum i s correctly
diagnosed by the doctor, however, as a purely erotic display of "undisguised
animal excitement." As the other conspirators join the reconciled lovers for
supper, th e joyfu l unio n o f se x an d mone y i s consummate d i n Trench' s
salutation t o his father-in-law: "I'l l stand in , compensation o r no compen-
sation."

Widowers' Houses  i s on e o f Shaw' s darkes t an d bleakes t comedies ,
concerned mor e wit h huma n depravit y tha n wit h th e traditional  comedi c
subject o f human folly . I n the original , more overtl y propagandis t versio n
of the play, Shaw declared that it "deals with a burning social question, and
is deliberately intende d t o induce people to vote on the Progressive side at
the nex t Count y Counci l electio n i n London. " I n th e mor e finel y tune d
edition published in 1898, the plea for a  socialist alternative to what seems
an irremediable state of moral and social corruption is a more indirect one.
The ongoing parody of theatrical, psychological, and moral conventions is
the strategy Shaw uses - i n a manner tha t foreshadows Brech t - t o disrupt
the accepted ideas of his audience and readers and to force them to take an
objective critical stance to the social issues at stake. The spectator must not,
in other words, be allowed to escape into an empathetic concern with what
Shaw calls "the tragedy an d comed y o f individua l characte r an d destiny. "
His deconstruction of the typical pattern of courtship comedy in this play is
one means of preventing that escape. Another, more recurrent means is his
obliteration o f wha t hi s prefac e t o Plays  Pleasant  call s "th e obviou s
conflicts o f unmistakable good and unmistakable evil" which result only in
"the crud e dram a o f villai n an d hero. " Similarl y i n The  Quintessence  of
Ibsenism, the earliest version o f which was published onl y the year befor e
Widowers' Houses was completed, he writes: "The conflict i s not between
clear right and wrong: the villain is as conscientious as the hero, if not more
so: i n fact , th e questio n whic h make s th e pla y interestin g (whe n i t is
interesting) i s which is the villain and which the hero."8 Especially on this
point, his analysis of the "novelty" of Ibsen's technique strongly influence d
the way in which he himself began to write plays. The method he chose was
precariously balance d betwee n th e conventionalit y o f popula r theatr e
(which he loved and despised) and a  deliberate inversion of its cliches that
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his detractor s calle d -  an d stil l cal l -  mer e "paradox-making. " "Tak e
Widowers' Houses"  h e observe s i n a  review o f a n unimportan t pla y b y A.
W. Gatti e whic h attempte d t o imitat e hi s own metho d withou t noticin g it s
subversion o f stereotypes :

cut ou t the passages which convict the audience o f bein g just a s responsible
for the slums as the landlord; make the hero into a ranting Socialist instead of
a perfectl y commonplac e youn g gentleman ; mak e th e heroin e a n ange l
instead of her father's daughte r only one generation removed from th e wash-
tub; and have the successful melodrama of tomorrow.9

William Archer might , of course, have been happier with just such a result .

Although hi s first  play "ha d no t achieve d a  success," Shaw remarks dril y i n
Flays Unpleasant,  " I ha d provoke d a n uproar ; an d th e sensatio n wa s s o
agreeable tha t I  resolve d t o tr y again. " Althoug h The  Philanderer,  whic h
was written an d submitte d t o Grein' s Independent Theatre i n 1893, 1S ofte n
regarded b y critic s a s a  mino r work , it s ton e an d it s focu s o n "th e due l o f
sex" make i t an interesting forerunner o f such later plays as You  Never  Can
Tell an d Man  and  Superman.  Thi s "topica l comedy " o f sexua l intrigu e
among th e Ibsenite s an d "Ne w Women " o f th e mid-ninetie s wa s widel y
unpopular amon g Shaw's friends (Arche r called i t "an outrage upo n ar t an d
decency"), an d i t di d no t actuall y reac h th e Wes t En d stag e unti l 1907 ,
when i t wa s performe d durin g Harle y Granville-Barker' s epoch-makin g
Shaw campaig n a t th e Cour t Theatr e (eleve n Shavia n production s b y
Barker durin g th e thre e season s o f hi s co-managemen t wit h Joh n
Vedrenne). On e reaso n fo r Grein' s rejectio n o f th e pla y i n 189 3 n a d bee n
his feeling "tha t the English actor s of that da y could no t possibly cope wit h
the floo d o f dialogu e -  tha t thei r tongue s wer e no t gli b enoug h t o rattl e i t
off a t the lightning speed required." 10 Sha w himself share d the concern tha t
his rhetorical , disquisitor y dramaturg y wa s goin g t o nee d a  "new, " anti -
naturalistic style of acting to bring it off :

In a  generation tha t kne w nothin g o f an y sor t o f actin g bu t drawing-roo m
acting, and which considered a speech of more than twenty words impossibly
long, I went back to the classical style and wrote long rhetorical speeches, like
operatic arias , regardin g m y play s a s musica l performance s precisel y a s
Shakespear did . . .  Yet so novel was my post-Marx post-Ibsen outlook on life
that nobody suspected that my methods were as old as the stage itself. They
would have seemed the merest routine to Kemble or Mrs. Siddons, but to the
Victorian leading ladies they seemed to be unleadinglady-like barnstorming. 11

This was written a s "A n Aside" for th e autobiography o f Lilia n McCarthy ,
who emerge d a s a  majo r forc e i n th e Barke r enterpris e a t th e Cour t i n
1904-07. I t was sh e who, to the playwright' s surpris e an d delight , brough t



Cambridge Companions Online © Cambridge University Press, 2006

FREDERICK J . MARKE R

just the right measure of declamatory passion and authority to such strong
Shavian heroines as Ann Whitefield an d Dona Ana in Man and Superman
and Jennifer Dubeda t i n The  Doctor's Dilemma.  Sha w had conceived th e
tempestuous an d problematic figure o f Julia Crave n in The  Philanderer in
much th e sam e vein , an d henc e whe n sudde n illnes s prevente d Lilia n
McCarthy fro m playin g tha t par t a s well , th e failur e o f th e play' s first
major production was inevitable.

The Philanderer  is, in essence , a  ver y divide d play , filled with stylisti c
contradictions -  par t anti-realisti c farce , par t "unpleasant " pla y aime d a t
taxing th e audienc e fo r it s indifferenc e t o manifestl y rea l "crime s o f
society," a s see n "fro m th e poin t o f vie w o f a  Socialis t wh o regard s th e
basis of that society as thoroughly rotten economically and morally."12 No
doubt th e shee r verbosit y o f th e pla y -  "th e flood  o f dialogue " Grei n
complained o f -  i s intende d b y Sha w t o underscor e th e affecte d an d
flatulent natur e o f it s character s an d o f th e worl d o f "clandestin e sen -
suality" the y inhabit . Bu t loquaciou s i t is , al l th e same . Th e particula r
target of its social satire is the allegedly inhumane and immoral practice of
bourgeois marriag e -  describe d i n th e prefac e a s "a n institutio n whic h
society ha s outgrown bu t no t modified , an d whic h 'advanced ' individual s
are therefore force d to evade." Thus baldly stated, the subject matter might
as easily have served for a  problem play by Brieux (whom it pleased Shaw
to refer t o as the most important Western dramatis t afte r Ibsen). 13 Shaw's
own approach , however , has much close r affinit y t o the classical manner s
comedies of Wycherley and Moliere, taking from th e former a  trace of his
cynical vie w o f sexua l hypocris y an d fro m th e latte r hi s arc h satir e o f
preciosity (here "Ibsenism"), pomposity, and medical quackery.14

Leonard Charteris , the uninhibited amoris t whose escapades furnish The
Philanderer with it s slender action , uses his Ibsenite pose the way Horne r
uses hi s simulate d "Frenc h pox " i n The  Country  Wife,  a s a  mean s o f
gaining sexua l advantage and securing an escape. (As there i s not a  single
functioning marriag e to be found in Shaw's plays, cuckoldry does not arise;
the threa t t o Charteris' s safet y i s matrimony, no t a n irat e husband. ) Th e
play open s with a  lovemaking scen e (stringentl y Victorian , no t a  whiff o f
Wycherley) betwee n Charteri s an d hi s newest conquest , th e young widow
Grace Tranfield; it ends on a potentially comedic note, with the betrothal of
Grace's riva l t o anothe r ma n an d he r ow n rejectio n o f th e "degradin g
bargain" Charteri s call s marriage . Despit e thes e vestige s o f conventiona l
romantic comedy , however , th e outcom e o f th e pla y remain s blea k an d
mechanical, leavin g th e character s trappe d i n thei r empt y intellectua l
"emancipation." Grace' s rathe r bitte r conclusio n i s als o Shaw's : "The y
think this a happy ending, Julia, these men: our lords and masters!"
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Neither melodram a no r Ibse n prove s t o b e th e mean s o f arrivin g a t a
satisfactory resolutio n (in that a true resolution lies outside the scope of the
play, i n socia l reform) . Th e firs t ac t take s plac e entirel y i n th e real m o f
melodrama - literall y so, in that it is set in the London flat of Grace's father,
a drama criti c named Cuthbertso n whose drawing-room walls are covered
with theatrica l print s o f nineteenth-centur y stag e idol s wh o loo k dow n
with approval on the farcical melodrama being played out before them: the
love scene; its sudden interruptio n b y the frantically jealou s Julia Craven ;
Grace's indignan t exit ; then th e obligatory fight scene betwee n th e sexua l
duelists; and finally the unexpected return of the fathers of both the women
(old, long-los t friends , i t turn s out , coincidentall y reunite d tha t ver y
evening a t th e theatre!) . I t i s common t o mentio n tha t Cuthbertso n wa s
meant a s a  caricatur e o f th e note d Londo n criti c an d Ibse n antagonis t
Clement Scott, but we are not usually told why this might be so. For Shaw,
the falsit y o f th e theatrica l patho s an d mora l conventionalit y idealize d i n
Scott's reviews was a mirror image of the greater falsity of the social system
itself an d th e outmoded value s and prejudice s i t perpetuates. Shaw point s
out tha t Scott , a s th e leade r o f th e oppositio n t o Ibse n i n England ,
demanded th e suppression o f Ghosts  on the grounds that Ibsen had urge d
him, as a spectator, "t o laug h a t honour , to disbelieve i n love, to mock a t
virtue, to distrust friendship , an d to deride fidelity."15 The statement could
as well have been made by Cuthbertson, as these same abstractions are the
ethical cliches being held up for satirical scrutiny in The Philanderer.

From the world o f melodrama, the middle acts of the play move to the
world o f Ibse n -  or , rather , t o a  worl d o f "advanced " Ibsenit e though t
professed b y the members of the Ibsen Club.16 Although said to be situated
at 90 Cork Stree t ("a t th e other end of the Burlington Arcade") , the Ibsen
Club is a fantastica l stat e o f mind , like Cloud-Cuckoo-Land i n The  Birds
or, fo r tha t matter , Hel l i n Man  and  Superman.  Here, beneat h a  bus t o f
Ibsen i n th e clu b library , Charteri s freel y preache s an d practice s hi s
previously enunciated philosophy of enlightened sexual politics: "Advanced
people for m charmin g friendships . Conventiona l peopl e marry. " The Ol d
Order, represente d b y Cuthbertso n an d hi s frien d Colone l Crave n (V C
Egyptian campaign , retired) , naturall y tak e umbrage , bu t Cuthbertson' s
liberated daughter Grace now embraces the philanderer's views:

I am quite in earnest about them too, though you are not. That is why I will
never marry a man I love too much. It would give him a terrible advantage
over me: I should be utterly in his power. Thats what the New Woman is. Isnt
she right, Mr. Philosopher? (p . 109)

Julia Craven , o n th e othe r hand , show s alarmin g sign s o f disqualifyin g
herself fro m th e Clu b b y pursuin g Charteri s (a s sh e ha d don e i n Ac t 1 )
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around the library in a jealous rage, disempowerment clearly uppermost in
her mind. The ruination of Doctor Paramore, who has diagnosed her father
as mortally il l from a  live r diseas e th e doctor claim s t o have discovered ,
gives Charteris the opportunity h e needs of ridding himsel f o f Julia. Once
Paramore learn s tha t hi s discover y ha s bee n discredited , hi s reputatio n
demolished, an d his diagnosis o f the Colonel thu s nullifie d a s a blunder ,
Charteris use s al l his sophistry t o persuade th e self-righteous quac k tha t
proposing to Julia is the best way to make amends to the Cravens.

No time is wasted. Over afternoon te a in Percy Paramore's smar t Savile
Row surgery (where a photograph of Rembrandt's School of Anatomy now
takes the place of Cuthbertson's theatre portraits), Julia reluctantly accepts
Paramore's rathe r clinica l offe r o f marriag e -  evidentl y becaus e h e i s
prepared to believe that she "is not the shallow, jealous, devilish tempered
creature" everyone else thinks she is. Although the use of "word-music" -
the consciou s musica l scorin g o f languag e i n term s o f rhythm , counter -
point, tempo, and sound sens e ("precisely a s Shakespear did" ) - i s usually
thought o f as a characteristic o f Shaw's late r plays , there ar e moments in
The Philanderer  when dialogu e i s transformed i n just thi s way. The most
obvious instanc e come s i n the last-ac t encounte r betwee n Charteri s and
Julia, after she has accepted Paramore. Notice how even the punctuation is
used to score Charteris's speech for actor and reader alike:

JULIA: According to you, then, I have no good in me. I am an utterly vile
worthless woman. Is that it?

CHARTERIS: Yes, if you are to be judged as you judge others. From the
conventional point of view, theres nothing to be said for you, Julia, nothing.
Thats why I have to find some other point of view to save my self-respect
when I remember how I have loved you. Oh, what I have learnt from you!
from you! who could learn nothing from me! I made a fool of you; and you
brought me wisdom: I broke your heart; and you brought me joy: I made you
curse your womanhood; and you revealed my manhood to me. Blessings for
ever and ever on my Julia's name! (With genuine emotion, he takes her hand
to kiss it again.)

She may both love and despise the philanderer, but she is no longer foole d
by him:

JULIA: (snatching  her hand away in disgust) Oh, stop talking that nasty
sneering stuff. (p . 136)

And moreover , sh e is perfectly righ t abou t "tha t nast y sneerin g stuff" : in
this pla y Sha w give s hi s best writin g t o the hypocrite -  th e "fraud " an d
"miserable littl e plaste r saint " Juli a no w recognizes Charteri s t o be - a s
ironic evidence of his deceitfulness and his love of acting.
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It was Bergson who called emotio n th e true enemy o f laughter , arguin g
that the comic depends on "something like a momentary anesthesi a o f the
heart" fo r it s effect. 17 Thi s aptl y characterize s The  Philanderer  and it s
forced "happ y ending," which retains a well-mannered insensibilit y to true
feeling unti l it s unexpecte d (an d unspoken ) final  emotiona l transition .
Charteris himsel f remain s "amuse d an d unconcerned, " eve n afte r Grac e
denies hi m th e satisfactio n o f bein g slappe d b y Juli a o r wors e ("Neve r
make a  hero o f a  philanderer"). At last , the other character s then loo k a t
Julia "with  concern,  and even  a little  awe,  feeling  for the  first  time  the
presence of a  keen  sorrow"  Thi s fleetin g glimps e o f th e secre t i n Julia' s
heart, s o to speak , i s afforded onl y to th e reader  of th e play , much a s in
Candida. Whether playing Marchbanks or Julia Craven, however, it is with
that final direction that an actor must begin the analysis of the role.

By contrast , th e greate r dept h o f passio n t o b e fel t i n Mrs.  Warren's
Profession, the las t and mos t effective o f the Plays Unpleasant, sounds an
entirely ne w not e i n Shaw' s dramati c writing . I n hi s long , argumentativ e
Author's Apology in the Stage Society edition o f the play in 1902 , he still
maintains staunchl y "tha t onl y i n th e proble m pla y i s ther e an y rea l
drama," henc e allowin g "n o futur e no w fo r an y dram a withou t musi c
except th e dram a o f thought. " Th e witt y an d openl y sarcasti c ton e o f
G.B.S.'s voice in this seriocomic address must , however , be borne in mind
when he proclaims, for example:

The drama of pure feeling is no longer in the hands of the playwright: it has
been conquered by the musician, after whose enchantments all the verbal arts
seem cold and tame. Romeo and Juliet with the loveliest Juliet is dry, tedious,
and rhetorica l i n comparison with Wagner's Tristan, even though Isolde is
both fourteen stone and forty, as she often is in Germany.18

Assuredly, Mrs. Warren's Profession is an "unpleasant" play and hence also
a "problem " play , i n th e sens e tha t i t i s seriou s rathe r tha n frivolou s i n
intent, is again concerned with social corruption (i n this case prostitution),
and i s determined t o faste n th e blam e fo r suc h vice not o n the individua l
(the brothel madam) bu t on a (male, capitalistic) socia l system that foster s
it. (In other words, as Shaw writes in the preface to Plays Unpleasant, "rich
men without convictio n ar e more dangerous i n modern societ y than poo r
women withou t chastity." ) Thi s bein g said , however , ther e i s nothin g
"cold" o r "tame " about Vivi e Warren's emotiona l confrontatio n wit h th e
truth abou t th e nature o f he r mother' s profession . Th e rea l poin t a t issu e
for Sha w i s tha t th e crucia l proces s o f he r disillusionmen t mus t no t b e
allowed to degenerate into the sham sentiment of melodrama. "The drama,
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of course , lie s i n th e discover y an d it s consequences, " h e explaine d i n a
letter t o Goldin g Bright , a  young journalist. "Thes e consequences, though
cruel enough , ar e al l quit e sensibl e an d sober , n o suicid e no r sensationa l
tragedy of any sort."19

The accusations of immorality leveled against the play by its early critics
were prompted, Sha w argues i n his Author's Apology , not s o much b y its
subject a s b y it s antimelodramati c treatmen t o f huma n emotion s -  "th e
unexpectedness wit h whic h m y character s behav e lik e huma n beings ,
instead of conforming to the romantic logic of the stage," as he puts it. The
actions o f bot h Vivi e an d he r mothe r ar e governe d no t b y the knee-jer k
motivations of romantic stage morality ("the axioms and postulates of that
dreary mimanthropometry"!) bu t by unromantic common sense. Inevitably,
perhaps, th e resul t wa s tha t it s firs t audience s wer e bot h bewildere d an d
offended b y its unusual point of view.

No doub t addin g t o th e confusio n wa s th e fac t tha t Mrs.  Warren's
Profession, like The Philanderer, did not actually reach the stage until afte r
the author' s reputatio n a s a  dramatis t ha d bee n establishe d b y the muc h
"pleasanter" and more popular kind of play that began with Arms and the
Man. After completin g Mrs.  Warren  in 1894 , Shaw submitted i t to Grein ,
who seems to have indicated that his Independent Theatre was preparing to
perform "Mrs . Jarman's Profession," as he apparently called it.20 To Shaw's
fury, meanwhile, the censor refused t o issue the required license, and public
performances o f the work remained banne d in Britain unti l 1925 . Already
in 1902 , however , th e intrepi d Stag e Societ y proceede d t o pu t o n tw o
private performances o f the controversia l pla y a t the Lyric Club, with the
popular comedienn e Fann y Broug h i n the titl e role . Joining the chorus of
reactionary outrage , Grein' s unperceptiv e revie w expresse d "th e opinio n
that the representation was unnecessary and painful": "Here , as in most of
G.B.S.'s work , the sublim e i s constantly spoil t b y the ridiculous."21 Three
years later , America n audience s prove d similarl y antagonisti c whe n th e
young actor Arnold Daly brought the play to New York for th e first time ,
as part o f his ambitious two-month repertor y seaso n of Shaw. After bein g
tried ou t an d promptl y banne d i n New Haven , Daly' s productio n laste d
only a  singl e stormy nigh t a t th e Garric k Theatr e i n New Yor k (Octobe r
30, 1905). Afterwards, bot h the manager and his cast - whic h included the
celebrated Ibse n actres s Mar y Sha w i n th e rol e o f Kitt y Warre n -  wer e
arrested an d jaile d b y the vic e squad fo r appearin g i n a n immora l work .
"Its presentatio n amount s simpl y t o offendin g goo d tast e b y clownis h
methods o f telling disagreeable facts, " the critic for th e New York Mirror
(November 11 ) agreed . Th e formidabl e Willia m Winte r was , character -
istically, muc h harshe r i n hi s evaluatio n o f Sha w (" a crack-brained ,
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mischief-making English-Iris h socialist" ) an d hi s notions o f socia l reform :
"No right-minded , well-bre d perso n introduce s a n indelicate , no t t o sa y
foul, subjec t fo r conversation i n a drawing-room .  . . and there is no more
justification fo r insultin g peopl e i n a  theatr e tha n ther e woul d b e fo r
insulting them in a parlor."22

Winter migh t hav e take n hi s answe r fro m Shaw , speakin g (a s h e
frequently doe s i n thi s play ) throug h Vivie : "Ther e i s nothin g I  despis e
more than the wicked convention that protects these things by forbidding a
woman to mention them." On one level, at least - th e only level recognized
by th e majorit y o f reviewer s a t th e tim e -  Mrs.  Warren's  Profession
attempts to paint a frank an d (debatably) realistic picture of prostitution as
a purely economic alternative impose d upo n underprivilege d wome n b y a
paternalistic society . ("Th e onl y wa y fo r a  woma n t o provid e fo r hersel f
decently," Mrs . Warren claim s t o hav e learned , "i s fo r he r t o b e good t o
some man wh o can affor d t o b e good t o her." ) There i s no spokesperso n
and n o provision i n the play itsel f fo r th e overthro w o f suc h a  iniquitous
social system, for -  i n Shaw's rosy view of social ameliorism - suc h action
must and will result from the recognition by the audience of its own guilt.

In this connection, the play functions a s a quotation, so to speak, of the
commonly cherishe d stereotype s o f th e "courtesan " an d "falle n woman "
plays that ha d bee n popular i n the Victorian theatr e ever since Dumas fils
had create d a  sensatio n wit h La  dame  aux  camelias  (better know n a s
Camille in th e Englis h theatre ) i n 1852 . A t th e tim e Mrs.  Warren  was
written mor e than fort y year s later, the newest hi t in this hardy sub-genr e
was Arthur Win g Pinero' s The  Second Mrs. Tanqueray  (1893). Although
the suffering an d delicately sensual heroine of Camille  dies of consumption,
the passionate , remorse-drive n Paul a Tanquera y take s he r ow n lif e whe n
she realizes , i n th e tru e Ibse n manner , tha t sh e i s trappe d becaus e "th e
future i s onl y th e pas t again , entere d throug h anothe r gate. " Befor e sh e
married Aubre y Tanqueray , on e o f Paula' s numerou s socia l aliase s wa s
Mrs. Jarman; hence Grein's slip (if it was a slip) about Shaw's title suggests
a significant connectio n between these two works. When we first encounter
Paula Ray (as she was also known in the past) in Tanqueray's chambers in
the Albany, she is "a beautiful , fresh , innocent-looking " young woman of
twenty-seven "in superb evening dress." Kitty Warren, the dowdy quotation
of the Mrs. Jarman persona, is by contrast " a genial and fairly presentabl e
old blackguard o f a woman" in her forties o r early fifties, "formerly pretty ,
showily dresse d i n a  brilliant ha t an d a  gay blouse fitting tightly ove r her
bus t . . . " Ther e is not a shred of Cleopatra in this sturdy old pro - n o trace
either o f Paula' s "tragic " leaning s o r o f th e temptin g sexualit y o f th e
traditional stag e courtesan. ("It' s not work tha t an y woman would d o fo r
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pleasure, goodness knows ; though t o hear th e pious people talk you woul d
suppose i t wa s a  be d o f roses, " Kitt y tell s he r daughter. ) This , Shaw' s
counter-portrait proclaims , represent s th e unvarnishe d trut h abou t th e
fictional Mrs . Jarman s o f thi s world . B y contrast , a s h e argue s i n a  late r
review o f the Pinero play, "Paula Tanquera y i s an astonishingly well-draw n
figure a s stag e figures  g o nowadays " -  bu t n o mor e tha n that , a  purel y
theatrical constructio n draw n fro m Pinero' s "ow n poin t o f view in terms of
the conventional system s of morals." 23

On quit e anothe r level , meanwhile , Mrs.  Warren's  Profession  i s (n o
matter wha t Sha w may profess t o think abou t it ) no more a  work "about "
prostitution a s a social crime than Ghosts  i s "about" syphilis as a commun -
icable disease . The rea l dramati c tensio n i n thi s earl y pla y o f Shaw' s arise s
from it s inne r action , whic h migh t b e describe d a s th e ambiguou s an d
inconclusive spiritua l educatio n o f Vivi e Warren. A t the outse t o f th e play ,
as sh e lounge s i n a  hammoc k i n a  bucoli c garde n settin g i n Surrey , Vivi e
appears a s a n almos t comedi c imag e o f th e self-possesse d Ne w Woma n o f
the age . A  practica l thinke r wit h first-class  honor s i n mathematic s fro m
Cambridge, she has (so she tells Praed, an admiring visitor and old friend o f
her mother's) no patience with life' s frivolities :

VIVIE: I shall set up chambers in the City, and work actuarial calculations and
conveyancing. Under cover of that I shall do some law, with one eye on the
Stock Exchange all the time. Ive come down here by myself to read law: not
for a holiday, as my mother imagines. I hate holidays.

PRAED : You make my blood run cold. Are you to have no romance, no beauty
in your life?

VIVIE: I dont care for either, I assure you.
PRAED: You cant mean that.
VIVIE: Oh yes I do. I like working and getting paid for it. When I'm tired of

working, I like a comfortable chair, a cigar, a little whisky, and a novel with
a good detective story in it. (p . 181)

Rather lik e Blanche Sartorius , however, Vivie seems not to have trouble d
herself abou t th e sourc e o f th e mone y wit h whic h he r mother , who m sh e
rarely see s an d hardl y knows , ha s pai d fo r he r expensiv e schoolin g an d
comfortable lif e style . Prae d know s an d i s abou t t o tel l whe n h e i s
interrupted b y th e arriva l o f th e overbearin g Mrs . Warre n an d he r vulgar ,
brutish companion , Si r Georg e Crofts . Th e underlyin g tensio n betwee n
mother an d daughte r rapidl y rise s t o th e surfac e until , i n a  confrontatio n
between th e tw o wome n late r tha t night , Mrs . Warre n i s forced t o revea l
the sordi d realit y o f he r pas t life . Sha w display s a  ne w gras p o f drama -
turgical techniqu e i n thi s scene , whic h move s skilfull y fro m Vivie' s initia l
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callous denunciatio n o f he r mothe r ("Peopl e ar e alway s blamin g thei r
circumstances fo r wha t the y are . I  dont believ e i n circumstances") t o he r
growing understandin g o f th e grindin g socia l condition s tha t drov e thei r
victims int o prostitutio n ("Everybod y dislike s havin g t o wor k an d mak e
money; bu t the y hav e t o d o i t al l th e same") . The secon d ac t end s o n a
deceptively harmoniou s not e o f tende r reconciliatio n ("M y dea r mother :
you are a wonderful woman : you are stronger than al l England"), visually
reinforced b y an idyllic view of the Surrey countryside outside , "bathed in
the radiance of the harvest moon rising over Blackdown."

In a conventional melodrama (wher e it seems to belong) a  scene such as
this would mark the end of the young heroine's ordeal; in Shaw's play it is
only th e beginnin g o f it . I n th e followin g act , tw o paire d scene s i n th e
Rectory garde n th e nex t mornin g dramatiz e th e untenabl e natur e o f th e
alternatives whic h Vivi e has befor e her . Her holida y romanc e wit h Fran k
Gardner, the boyishly handsome bu t utterly undependable so n of the local
vicar, ha s n o mor e emotiona l o r physica l substanc e tha n th e children' s
game o f "babe s i n th e wood " tha t the y pla y togethe r ("covere d u p wit h
leaves .  . . fast asleep , hand i n hand, unde r th e trees") . On thi s particula r
occasion, as Frank "nestle s against her like a weary child," their fantasy i s
interrupted b y Crofts , whos e siniste r unctuousnes s strike s a n eve n false r
note tha n Frank' s childis h cunnin g o r hi s father' s sha m piet y (fo r th e
Reverend Samue l Gardner , too, has been one of Kitty's lovers in his young
days). Vivie's new-found fait h i n her mother's honesty i s soon shattered as
well b y Si r George' s revelatio n tha t h e an d Mrs . Warre n stil l ow n an d
operate a  veritable chain o f brothel s stretching from Brussel s to Budapest .
His proposa l o f marriag e t o Vivi e i s linked t o hi s cynica l reminde r tha n
both she and her fine schools have profited amply from this same enterprise:
"It paid for your education and the dress you have on your back. Dont turn
up your nos e a t business , Miss Vivie ; where woul d you r Newnham s an d
Girtons be without it?" Nor - a s Sartorius also told Harry Trench in similar
circumstances in Widowers9 Houses - i s there any escape from the universal
moral taint : "I f your e goin g t o pic k an d choos e you r acquaintance s o n
moral principles, " Croft s remind s her , "you d bette r clea r ou t o f thi s
country, unles s you want t o cu t yoursel f of f fro m al l decent society. " The
final blow fall s whe n th e loathsom e Si r George , havin g bee n rejecte d b y
Vivie an d abou t t o b e drive n fro m th e garde n a t gunpoin t b y Frank ,
spitefully inform s them that Sam Gardner, the fatuous clergyman, is Vivie's
real father , making her Frank's half-sister. Whether this assertion i s true or
not w e neve r learn , however , fo r Sha w agai n invoke s th e situation' s
potential fo r melodrama , onl y t o dispe l it . Thus , whe n th e disillusione d
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8 Th e attack o n idealism (2 ) Rejecting romance : Nora McLella n a s Kitty Warren refusin g
to listen to Norman Brownin g as Sir George Crofts i n the Shaw Festival's 199 7 productio n

of Mrs. Warren's  Profession

Vivie rushes fro m th e Rector y garde n i n disgust , i t i s not t o pursue som e
"tragic" course of action but simply to catch a train back to where she can
begin again to live her own life.

In the last act of the play, which takes place two days later in a cluttered
modern offic e i n Chancery Lane , far fro m th e mock pastoralism o f Surrey
gardens an d cottages , Vivie' s protes t agains t th e "horribl e cant " an d
blandishments o f conventiona l happines s i s summe d u p i n on e singl e
sentence: "Life i s what it is, and I am prepared to take it as it is." She now
believes neither i n Praed's poetic vagaries about "th e beaut y and romanc e
of life" nor in Frank's equally airy notion o f "love' s young dream": "I f we
three ar e t o remai n friends, " sh e warn s them , " I mus t b e treate d a s a
woman o f business , permanentl y singl e (to  Frank)  and permanentl y un -
romantic (t o Praed)"  He r thir d tempter , i n th e perso n o f Mrs . Warren ,
represents a  more insidious threa t t o her self-determination -  no t becaus e
Vivie regard s he r a s "immoral, " no r becaus e th e wealt h sh e offer s he r
daughter hold s no attraction fo r her , bu t precisel y becaus e sh e recognizes
herself an d he r ow n fiercely independent spiri t i n her mother . The crucia l
difference betwee n them is hence not in the choice the latter has made, but
in the hypocrisy with which i t had bee n overlaid with socia l respectability
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and maternal sentiment . Vivie, the true anarchist , demands instead "al l or
nothing" - a n uncompromising union of action and belief:

Yes: it's better to choose your line and go through with it. If I had been you,
mother, I might have done as you did: but I should not have lived one life and
believed in another. You are a conventional woman at heart. That is why I am
bidding you goodbye now. I am right, am I not? (p . 246)

There i s one particula r maxi m i n Jack Tanner' s "Revolutionist' s Hand -
book" (printe d a t the end of Man and Superman) tha t seems to crystallize
the emotiona l struggl e a t th e cor e o f Mrs.  Warren:  "Youth, whic h i s
forgiven everything , forgives itself nothing: age, which forgives itsel f every-
thing, is forgiven nothing." From this characteristic paradox springs Shaw's
treatment o f th e final  unfilia l encounte r betwee n Kitt y Warre n an d he r
daughter -  a  scene which n o Victorian audienc e could possibl y forgiv e o r
endure. (Grein, himself a  Dutchman, was so offended b y it that he rebuked
Vivie not only fo r bein g "so cold o f heart " bu t in particular fo r bein g "so
un-English in her knowledge of the world."24) I n essence, this is a play fo r
the twentieth century , not for the nineteenth. Its open, muted ending - th e
image of Vivie delving into the great sheafs of paper on her desk in order to
lose hersel f i n wor k -  i s perfectl y Chekhovia n i n th e contrarines s o f it s
signals: despair and contentment , disillusionmen t an d hope for th e future .
A recurrent patter n i n Shaw' s writin g emerge s fo r th e first  time i n Mrs.
Warren's Profession. As in many of his later works, the events in this early
play becom e stage s i n a  spiritua l educatio n -  a  cumulativ e proces s o f
disillusionment tha t leave s it s subjec t decimate d bu t stronge r an d mor e
resilient, better able to bear life without illusion.

In this respect and others, Mrs. Warren's Profession clearly foreshadow s
the futur e directio n o f Shavia n dram a -  ye t i t als o mark s th e en d o f a
distinct phas e i n th e playwright' s development . Th e publicatio n o f Plays
Unpleasant and Plays  Pleasant as companio n volume s i n 189 8 serve d t o
highlight the contrast between his earlier preoccupation with specific social
problems in his first three plays and the broader concern with human foll y
in general that takes over in the "pleasanter" plays which follow. With the
subsequent publicatio n tw o year s late r o f th e anti-romanti c Plays  for
Puritans, the shif t awa y fro m th e earlie r socia l realism becam e stil l more
pronounced, a s the scope of Shaw's subject matte r broadened and the grip
of Ibsenism on his writing relaxed. He himself describe s his first plays, the
purpose of which had been "to make people thoroughly uncomfortable," as
"criticisms of a special phase, the capitalist phase, of modern organization."
The difference betwee n them and the Plays Pleasant, he goes on to explain
in a letter, is that the latter "ar e not 'realistic ' plays. They deal with life a t
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large, wit h huma n natur e a s i t present s itsel f throug h al l economi c an d
social phases."25 Nevertheless, despite the radical changes in tone, purpose,
and subjec t matte r tha t occu r afte r Mrs.  Warren's  Profession, the struggl e
to propound a  transvaluation of values in the interest of progress remained,
as it had bee n from th e outset , the guiding force i n Shaw's engaged theatr e
of ideas . I n thi s sense , hi s earl y experiment s for m a n indispensabl e
preamble to a body of work and a theory of dramatic action based squarely
on "th e defianc e o f dut y b y the reformer : ever y ste p o f progres s mean s a
duty repudiated and a scripture torn up."26
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Shavian comedy and the
shadow of Wilde

The careers of Bernard Sha w and Oscar Wilde followed ver y similar paths
up unti l 1895 . Both wer e bor n o f Protestan t stoc k i n Dubli n aroun d th e
mid-fifties, an d launche d themselve s a s writer s afte r settlin g i n Londo n
during th e seventies . Fo r abou t five years bot h wrot e apprentic e wor k -
trying out genres, seeking a style. At the same time, both were developing
considerable skil l a s public speaker s with a  theatrical flair. From 188 5 t o
1888 they worked together, along with William Archer and George Moore,
as anonymous boo k reviewers on the Pall Mall Gazette, Both were drawn
to socialism, and probably it was an address of Shaw's at a Fabian meeting
that inspired Wilde' s "Th e Soul of Man Under Socialism." 1 At the turn of
the decad e eac h wrot e an d publishe d a n important , definin g volum e o f
criticism: The Quintessence oflbsenism an d Intentions (the latter including
"The Decay of Lying," "The Criti c as Artist," and the essay on socialism).
And durin g th e nex t fe w years , unti l tha t fatefu l Februar y o f 1895,  e a c n

wrote five accomplished an d stil l produced plays : by Wilde, Salome, Lady
Windermere's Fan, A Woman  of  No Importance,  An Ideal  Husband, and
The Importance  of  Being  Earnest;  b y Shaw , Widowers'  Houses,  The
Philanderer, Mrs, Warren's Profession, Arms and the Man, and Candida,

At almos t ever y ste p Wild e seem s t o hav e enjoye d a n advantage ,
although ther e i s onl y a  littl e t o sugges t tha t Shaw , competitiv e bu t
generous, envied or resented his compatriot. Wilde came to London trailing
clouds o f academi c glor y fro m Trinit y Colleg e an d Oxford ; th e self -
educated Sha w arrived afte r fou r year s of clerical work i n a Dublin estat e
office. Thei r persona l acquaintanc e (th e familie s wer e acquainte d i n
Dublin) probabl y bega n i n 188 0 a t on e o f Lad y Wilde' s at-homes : Shaw
later acknowledge d tha t "Lad y Wilde wa s nic e to m e in London" durin g
that difficul t perio d (Pen  Portraits, p. 299). Althoug h Sha w wa s gettin g
known a s a Fabian orator , Wilde was already famou s enoug h b y 188 1 to
have been invited by D'Oyly Carte to do a year's lecturing in America as an
apostle o f aestheticism, eve n if Shaw felt tha t Wilde's familiarity wit h any
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art othe r tha n literatur e wa s secondhan d compare d t o hi s ow n (Pen
Portraits, pp . 301 , 305) . Whe n i t cam e t o revie w assignment s fo r th e
Gazette, Shaw , according t o Michael Holroyd , wa s assigned trivia l book s
whereas "othe r Irishmen on the paper were given major writer s to review.
George Moore wrote on Huysmans and Zola; Oscar Wilde on Dostoevsky,
William Morris , Tolstoy, [and] Turgenev."2 And as for the comedies of the
nineties, Wilde' s wer e al l produce d promptl y i n majo r theatre s (An  Ideal
Husband an d The  Importance  of  Being  Earnest  were , i n fact , runnin g
together an d ver y successfull y a t th e tim e o f hi s disgrace ) wherea s
Widowers' Houses,  in the words of Stanley Weintraub, "had managed two
unrewarding performances i n December 1892 , while The  Philanderer had
frightened awa y producer s an d Mrs.  Warren's  Profession had bee n pro -
scribed b y th e Censor." 3 Despit e al l this , Sha w praise d Wilde' s wor k
directly an d indirectly . H e (an d Archer , an d the y alon e amon g critic s o f
reputation) defende d Salome  against censorship. 4 H e wrote t o on e corre-
spondent i n 1889 : Wilde' s "wor k [o n th e Gazette]  wa s exceptionall y
finished in style and very amusing";5 to another, in 1894 : "Wilde's wit and
his fine  literar y workmanshi p ar e point s o f grea t value." 6 H e warml y
praised An  Ideal  Husband in one of his first contributions to the Saturday
Review,7 an d admire d i n incidenta l comment s bot h Lady  Windermere's
Fan and A Woman  of  No Importance. 8 After th e trials, Shaw drafted tw o
petitions fo r a  release fro m priso n an d a  reduction o f sentence . Again in
1897, jus t month s afte r th e releas e fro m prison , h e nominated Wild e fo r
membership to a British Academy of Letters. The one real blot on this good
record wa s hi s impercipien t revie w o f The  Importance  of  Being  Earnest,
which describe d th e pla y a s "inhuman, " "mechanical, " amusin g bu t no t
touching, mos t likel y a  much earlie r pla y refurbishe d (Our  Theatres,  vol.
xxiii, pp . 43-46) . An d h e compounde d thi s insensitiv e judgmen t twent y
years later , callin g i t Wilde' s "firs t reall y heartles s play, " "essentiall y
hateful" (Pen  Portraits,  p. 302). Stanley Weintraub comments with sympa-
thetic insigh t (bu t ignorin g th e renewa l o f th e attack) : "Tw o play s [pro -
duced an d acclaimed ] i n tw o month s wa s to o muc h eve n fo r Shaw . One
had t o hav e bee n manufactured earlier , an d h e took th e secon d comedy' s
apparent lack of surface seriousness as its core" (Shaw's People, p. 45).9

Personal relation s betwee n th e tw o writer s wer e alway s courteou s bu t
the courtesy was strained. In a letter of February 23 , 1893 Wilde acknowl-
edges th e receip t o f The  Quintessence  of Ibsenism  an d send s Salome  in
return: "You have written well and wisely and with sound wit. .  . England
is the land of intellectual fogs but you have done much to clear the air: we
are both Celtic , and I like to think that we are friends: fo r these and many
other reasons [mainl y Shaw' s effort t o lif t th e censorship] Salom e presents
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herself to you in purple raiment."10 Shaw has not yet received Wilde's play:
"Salome i s stil l wanderin g i n he r purpl e raimen t i n searc h o f me , an d I
expect he r t o arriv e a  perfec t outcast , brande d wit h ink y stamps " (Shaw ,
Collected Letters,  p . 384). 11 I n retur n h e wil l sen d Widowers'  Houses,
"which you wil l find tolerabl y amusing " (Shaw , Collected Letters, p . 384).
And Wilde acknowledges thi s with a  conceit tha t graciously arranges thei r
current an d forthcomin g play s i n a n alternatin g patter n definin g a  ne w
"Celtic School" [Wilde Letters, p. 339).

But i t i s apparen t that , despit e mutua l respect , the y di d no t reall y lik e
each other , a s Shaw indicate d i n the Harri s lette r whe n h e remembers th e
"queer shyness" between them: "We put each other out frightfully; an d this
odd difficulty persiste d between us to the very last" (Fen Portraits, pp. 300 ,
299). Mor e important , the y di d no t lik e eac h other' s ideas . I n particula r
Shaw dislike d th e doctrin e o f aestheticis m tha t Wild e ha d take n ove r an d
developed fro m Walte r Pater . Holroy d (Bernard  Shaw,  p . 75 ) finds  thi s
antagonism expresse d a s early a s hi s first  novel , Immaturity,  i n whic h a n
earnest an d industriou s youn g ma n name d Smit h i s contraste d t o a
dilettante named Hawksmith who courts the favor o f society. In its mature
form, a s in the Epistle Dedicatory to Man and Superman, i t is expressed a s
a protest against style for it s own sake (rather than as an aspect of effectiv e
assertion), a  protest agains t "'art' s sak e alone ' fo r whic h I  would no t fac e
the toi l o f writing a  single sentence." Richard Ellman n i s at pains to sho w
that "Ar t for Art' s Sake" was a slogan Wilde repudiated becaus e i t implied
a les s energeti c an d morall y comple x vie w tha n h e espouse d (Wilde,
pp.310, 318) . Sha w did , i n fact , ten d t o degrad e th e aestheti c positio n
associated wit h Wild e and , conversely , t o exaggerat e th e contrastin g
quality o f hi s own art , sometime s eve n calling i t propaganda. Probabl y h e
sensed tha t hi s dee p quarre l wit h th e aestheti c positio n gre w ou t o f
fundamental similaritie s with his own.

Both writer s fro m th e star t attacke d simila r targets : duty, respectability ,
the sentimenta l vie w o f poverty , th e dange r o f self-denia l an d o f ideal -
driven goodness . Both shared a  belief i n the cardinal value of individualit y
- th e major them e of "The Soul of Man Under Socialism" but also stressed
in The  Quintessence  an d i n Shaw' s wor k generall y i n th e nineties . (Afte r
the tur n o f th e centur y Sha w wa s more incline d t o believ e tha t "W E MUST
REFORM SOCIET Y BEFOR E WE CAN REFORM OURSELVES, " a  headin g i n th e
preface t o Misalliance.)  As co-disciples o f Ruskin , neithe r write r regarde d
Art an d Lif e antithetically , believin g instea d tha t on e enhance d th e other .
But Wilde obscure s thi s becaus e h e uses the wor d "Life " i n severa l sense s
(individuality, socia l custom , natura l fact) , jus t a s Sha w obscure s i t b y
sometimes (an d quit e passionately) defendin g th e words "art " an d "artist "
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and sometimes belittling them: "Wilde wrote for the stage as an artist. I am
simply a  propagandist. " Thi s provocative self-libe l ("Playwright, " p . 127 )
is matche d b y hi s prefac e t o Mrs.  Warren's  Profession  in whic h Sha w
claims tha t h e wrot e abou t prostitutio n "t o dra w attentio n t o th e truth "
and "expos e th e fact " -  althoug h ther e ar e no such bal d assertion s i n the
play, onl y idea s carefull y presente d a s characteristi c o f thos e wh o spea k
them.

The underlyin g similaritie s hel p t o explai n th e fac t tha t som e word s
elevated in Wilde's vocabulary - beauty , passion, joy, romance, art - ar e by
no means always degraded in Shaw's but are first purged o f their degraded
component an d the n embrace d a t a  highe r level . Words lik e "joy " i n the
mouth of Man and Superman's Devil ("I call on [the world] to sympathize
with joy , with love , with happiness , with beauty" ) stigmatiz e him because
they nauseate Don Juan, but the Epistle Dedicatory eloquently invokes "the
true joy i n life , th e bein g use d fo r a  purpose recognize d b y yoursel f a s a
mighty one" (my emphasis). In connection with Arms and the Man, we will
see again that the word "romance" is first purged of its degraded sense and
that a  highe r sense , associate d wit h powe r rathe r tha n passivity , the n
acquires a positive meaning.

But the differences growin g out of these likenesses are what matter most,
and the y involv e Shaw' s and Wilde' s opposite views of ar t -  o f thei r ow n
art in practice and of the place of art itself in relation to life.

The artistic ideal which Shaw embraced from early on favored the robust
and strenuous. Its models were found in the work of artists such as Bunyan,
Handel, Blake, Shelley, Wagner, and Ibsen, antagonistic in spirit to Wilde's
Romanticism, to the tradition of Keats, Swinburne, Pater, and the decadent
movement derivin g fro m Huysmans . I f Wilde' s creativ e imaginatio n wa s
stirred b y th e sociall y transgressiv e ac t o r wor d mad e charmin g b y hig h
style, Shaw' s wa s stirre d b y the ide a o f a  Lif e Force , somethin g betwee n
Schopenhauer's remorseles s Wil l t o Liv e an d Blake' s exuberan t Wil l t o
Create. If Wilde's aestheticism morally polarized the beautiful an d the ugly,
Shaw's vitalis m morall y polarize d energ y an d conventionality . A  con -
trasting styl e o f wi t aros e therefrom , bes t indicate d b y an example . With
Proudhon's "Propert y I s Theft" i n mind , Shaw' s John Tanne r riposte s (t o
Mendoza's "I am a brigand. I live by robbing the rich"): "I am a gentleman.
I live by robbing the poor." This is a paradox with a  strong ethical thrust ,
exploiting ou r perceptio n o f a n absurdit y inheren t i n th e structur e o f
capitalism. Wilde' s Lad y Bracknel l als o ha s somethin g t o sa y abou t
property: "I t give s on e positio n an d [becaus e o f encumberin g 'duties' ]
prevents on e fro m keepin g i t up . That's al l tha t ca n b e said abou t land. "
Her contradictio n i s les s a  parado x tha n a n elegan t irony , les s a  socia l
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protest tha n a n enforcemen t o f clas s superiorit y b y th e wa y th e speake r
rises above distress through a recourse to style alone.

Although Sha w was seldom a  propagandist in  his art (hi s art i s didactic
in tendency, bu t i t does not preac h socialism , an d indee d onl y refers t o i t
ironically), he certainly believed that ar t itsel f refined an d improved u s - a
view share d b y many educate d peopl e i n hi s time eve n i f i t i s now, afte r
Auschwitz, a view put into serious question:

Every step in morals i s made by challenging the validity o f existing concep-
tions . .. o f conduct... The claim of art to our respect must stand or fall with
the validity o f it s pretension t o cultivate and refine ou r senses and faculties .
Further, ar t shoul d refin e ou r sens e of character an d conduct , o f justice and
sympathy, greatl y heightenin g ou r self-knowledge , self-control , precisio n of
action, an d considerateness , an d makin g u s intoleran t o f baseness , cruelty ,
injustice, and intellectual superficiality o r vulgarity

("The Sanity of Art," in Works, vol. xix, pp. 314, 328-29).

For Wilde , i n contrast , ar t leads , an d shoul d lead , nowhere . Speakin g
through Lor d Henr y Wotto n o f Dorian  Gray  h e writes : "Ar t ha s n o
influence upo n action . I t annihilate s th e desir e t o act . I t i s superbl y
sterile."12 Shaw , lik e Carlyle , woul d emphasiz e wor k or , mor e exactly ,
what th e criti c Alfre d Turco , highlightin g a  phras e i n Cashel  Byron's
Profession, calls "executive power."13 Again like Carlyle, Shaw believed the
road t o freedo m la y throug h sel f (an d social ) control : "anarchism " con -
stituted a  temptation fo r a  socialist , but , a s the titl e o f on e o f hi s Fabian
Essays in Socialism indicates, i t i s an "Impossibility. " Wilde, on the othe r
hand, was unworried abou t control , and admitte d t o being "something of
an Anarchist " (Ellmann , Wilde,  p . 328) . Indeed , i n "Th e Sou l o f Ma n
Under Socialism, " h e writes emphatically : "Al l mode s o f governmen t ar e
failures"; "The mode of government that is most suitable to the artist is no
government a t all " (Works,  pp . 1087 , 1098-99) . Wild e lik e Sha w wa s
drawn t o th e ide a o f socia l evolution , but , rathe r tha n developin g it s
implications, he was content to believe that the progress of which socialism
speaks will heighten individualism.

When Shavian drama directly introduces opposing views of Art and Life,
as i t doe s mos t notabl y i n th e Hel l scen e o f Man  and  Superman,  th e
presence o f Wilde' s shado w i s unmistakable . Harol d Bloo m wit h som e
reason finds an anxiet y o f influenc e evidence d i n the tension betwee n th e
hedonist Devil and the Shavian Don Juan who cannot rest as long as he can
conceive something better than himself. Bloom puts it pithily:

Shaw was genial only when he was not menaced, and he felt deeply menaced
by the Aesthetic vision of which his Socialism never quite got free. Like Oscar
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Wilde and Wilde's mento r Walte r Pater , Shaw was a  direct descendan t of
Ruskin, and his animus against Wilde and Pater reflect s th e anxiety o f an
ambitious son toward rival claimants to a heritage ... Shaw's lifelong animus
against Pater and his repressed anxiety caused by Wilde's genius as an Anglo-
Irish dramatist, emerge with authentic sharpness and turbulence as Don Juan
and the Devil face off.14

A major reason that this act retains its vibrancy is that Shaw participates
in his antagonist's argument; his Devil is never stronger than when he turns
directly against man's vaunted brain and the capacity for self-improvement ,
the basis of Don Juan's (an d Shaw's) faith. Bloo m could have gone furthe r
in seein g Man  and  Superman  a s a  quarre l wit h Wilde , fo r Octavius' s
worship of art vs. Tanner's friendly scorn is another version of it - a  weaker
version, t o b e sure , bu t significan t i n tha t i t show s u s that , eve n i f th e
Shavian artist thinks of himself a s a revolutionary rather than an artist, his
verbal energ y -  no t onl y i n hi s dream bu t als o in the comedy , the Hand -
book, and the Maxims - give s him away. And, although thi s has not been
noticed, th e Epistl e Dedicator y i s also a  version o f the sam e debate , with
the criti c A . B . Walkley (t o who m i t i s addressed ) standin g i n fo r Pate r
(whom Walkley admired) an d Wilde. That, I  think, i s why Shaw flatters a
critic who had written abou t hi s plays with distaste and why Walkley can
serve as someone to react agains t in the fiercely eloquent peroration abou t
the true joy of life, which seeks, in the spirit of Nietzsche, to raise selfhoo d
from the merely human to the superhuman level.

It is surely not coincidental that this elaborate, threefold attac k on Wilde
occurs in a play written during the years immediately after Wilde' s death, a
play much wider i n scope than anythin g Shaw had trie d before . I t i s as if
Wilde's death aroused in him a need to come to terms with the shadow of a
persisting presence . Shaw' s wor k thereafte r i s muc h les s intens e i n thi s
regard, consisting (apart from the role of Lady Britomart, genially indebted
to tha t o f Lad y Bracknell ) mainl y o f statement s requeste d b y Wilde' s
former friends (especiall y Frank Harris and Alfred Douglas ) in which Shaw
tries to judge the man more than his ideas.

During Wilde's lifetime, Shaw wrote nothing so suggestive of an anxiety
of influence as his review of The Importance of Being Earnest. But his own
comedies written about the same time develop contrasting comic strategies,
and it is this contrast to which I now turn.

It is convenient to focus the contrast around a limited number of plays, and
from Wild e thi s mean s th e singl e pla y i n which hi s comic genius i s most
completely represented. In the earlier comedies there was a certain disjunc-
ture between the morality of melodrama and that of the dandy.15 Edouard
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Roditi observed o f Wilde's first comedy that the "unrelieved earnestnes s of
Lady Windermere contrast s too violently with the frivolit y o f most o f the
other characters." 16 Ia n Gregor , writin g o n "Comed y i n Osca r Wilde, "
added that the problem of the earlier comedies was "finding a  world fit for
the dand y t o liv e in." 17 Pete r Rab y contraste d th e worl d o f An  Ideal
Husband wit h it s one o r two dandie s to th e world o f The  Importance of
Being Earnest in which "every character participated in the role and stance
of the dandy."18 There seems to be a sense of guilt concerning the idea of a
double life in the earlier comedies, but I would agree with Gregor that the
world i n Earnest is for onc e "a world o f idyll, of pure play" (Bloom, "The
Importance" p . 20) ; with Rober t J . Jordan, i n hi s "Satir e an d Fantas y in
The Importance  of  Being  Earnest"  tha t i t i s a  worl d o f "innocence, "
"without evil " (Bloom, The  Importance"  p . 30) ; and wit h Harold Bloo m
who strongly denies in this play "any understructure of sin and guilt" (p. 9).
It is as i f the apparent  sourc e o f unease in the earlier plays bubbles to the
surface o f Earnest  and, sportivel y calle d "Bunburying, " i s bandied about .
The plot taken literally suggests that Bunburying is having a last fling before
marriage, but it is clear from the spirit of the whole play, capped by the final
exchange between Jack and Gwendolyn ("Gwendolyn , i t is a terrible thing
for a man to find out suddenly that all his life he has been speaking nothing
but th e truth . Ca n yo u forgiv e me? " " I can , fo r I  fee l yo u ar e sur e t o
change"), that the spirit of Bunburying is irrepressible. What Shaw himself
wrote abou t An Ideal  Husband fits Earnest better tha n anythin g he wrote
about th e latte r play : "Wild e i s to m e our onl y thorough playwright . H e
plays with everything : with wit , with philosophy, with drama , with actor s
and audience, with the whole theatre" {Our Theatres, vol. xxm, p. 10).

From Shaw' s comedie s o f th e nineties , I  selec t thre e groupe d aroun d
Earnest: Arms  and  the Man (1894) , Y° u Never  Can  Tell (1896), and The
Devil's Disciple  (1897) . Arms  and  the  Man,  th e first  o f th e "pleasant "
plays, i s also the first to mak e apparent  Shaw' s own comi c genius, and i t
was the first  to enjo y som e public succes s ( a run o f fifty performances a t
one of the smaller West End theatres). You  Never Can  Tell was composed
just a  fe w month s afte r th e productio n o f Earnest  tha t Sha w sa w an d
reviewed, an d i s actually indebte d t o i t in specifi c ways . And The  Devil's
Disciple, the first of the Three Plays for Puritans, discriminates further th e
moral positioning o f characters in Shaw's comedies and thus sharpens our
sense of the contrast between his and Wilde's technique.

About The Importance of Being Earnest two principal points will furnish
the grounds fo r compariso n wit h these plays of Shaw's . One concerns the
basic lac k o f differentiatio n amon g characters ; th e othe r pertain s t o th e
genre of the play itself, its peculiar place in the comic tradition.
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The characters o f Wilde's masterpiece are , of course , played of f agains t
one another i n different scene s but more fo r th e sake of repartee an d plo t
movement than to establish signficant difference s i n moral position. It is of
little importanc e t o contrast , i n any systemati c way , the dandyis m o f on e
character t o th e earnestnes s o f another , thoug h som e critics hav e tried o r
partly trie d t o d o so . Al l th e character s spea k wha t Ia n Grego r call s th e
"language o f th e dand y . . . a t onc e critica l an d self-delighting " (Bloom ,
"The Importance" p . 21). "Almost everything [the characters] say is spoken
for effect," observe s Peter Raby (A Reader's Companion, p. 58). All seek to
realize their own individualities in the "aesthetic Utopia" of Earnest, writes
Susan Laity in an essay called "The Soul of Man Under Victoria: lolanthe,
Earnest, and Bourgeois Drama" (Bloom , "The Importance"  pp . 139-40) .
Even the secondary character s "ar e erudit e verbalists, " comments Camill e
Paglia in "Oscar Wilde and the English Epicene," and she wittily describes
Wilde's "origina l language " fo r hi s characters i n this play a s "monologue
exterieur" (Bloom, "The Importance" pp. 91, 89). And Katharine Worth, in
"The Triumph o f the Pleasure Principle, " catches the single quality o f the
speakers in Wilde's farce b y noting that "n o one is ever so agitated that he
cannot take time to round a sentence" (Bloom, "The Importance" p. 59). In
effect th e pla y a t ever y poin t turn s substanc e int o styl e an d conten t int o
form. Fo r me this is epitomized i n Lady Bracknell' s remark tha t th e "tw o
weak point s in our ag e are its want o f principle and it s want o f profile" -
the neat alliteration quickly leveling morality and aesthetics.

The dandie s o f Earnest  an d th e heroe s o f Shaw' s play s ar e equall y
remarkable fo r thei r aplomb , and muc h comi c effect i s generated b y both
playwrights exploitin g th e incongruit y betwee n a  bland , self-possesse d
manner o f speech and startling , outrageous, or absurd matter . But Wilde's
dandies are self-possessed because , paradoxically, there is no single self fo r
them to defend, onl y a mask or persona t o adopt opportunistically; i t is in
fact Wilde's main argument against "sincerity" that it must be false because
there ar e many selves. 19 The Shavia n hero , in contrast , i s self-possessed -
"keeps his head like a god" - because , like Karl Marx, "He has discovered
the la w o f socia l development , an d know s wha t mus t come." 20 I f th e
Shavian her o implicitl y promise s t o stee r u s toward a n improve d future ,
confident tha t destroyin g ideal s wil l no t resul t i n chaoti c drifting , th e
Wildean dandy , wit h n o les s aplom b (thin k o f th e Algernon/Jac k muffi n
dialogue a t th e en d o f Ac t 2) , finds a dizzying o f one' s sense of directio n
delightful, an end in itself.

The questio n o f characterizatio n involve s th e large r questio n o f wha t
kind o f comedie s w e ar e comparing . Wildea n an d Shavia n comed y bot h
seem to be initiated by satire but before long they slide into something else.
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Can w e sa y tha t Earnest  i s a  satir e o n upper-clas s manners ? Certainl y a
number o f snobbish , class-consciou s attitude s ar e amusingl y reflected , bu t
satire soo n turn s fantastical . I n th e openin g scen e betwee n Algerno n an d
his servant Lane , for example , we seem to understand tha t the institution o f
marriage, a s i n a  Restoratio n play , i s providing th e occasio n fo r ridiculin g
remarks. Bu t suc h remark s (numerou s i n the play ) ar e mer e pinpricks . Th e
unique qualit y o f th e wor k lie s elsewher e an d start s t o com e int o focu s i n
this exchange:

ALGERNON: Good heavens! Is marriage so demoralizing as that?
LANE: I believe it is a very pleasant state, sir. I have had very little experience o f it

myself up to the present. I have only been married once. That was in
consequence of a misunderstanding between myself and a young person.

ALGERNON: (Languidly.)  I don't know that I am much interested in your family
life, Lane.

LANE: No, sir; it is not a very interesting subject. I never think of it myself.
(Act i, scene i)

What i s funn y her e i s no t exactl y tha t marriag e ha s take n a  cleve r hi t bu t
that Lan e refer s t o a  seriou s subjec t i n s o drol l an d insoucian t a  way . Hi s
style, no t hi s sincerit y o r insincerity , i s wha t matters . Suc h dialogu e
trivializes a  serious subjec t or , more exactly , displaces Wilde's ow n earnest -
ness from subjec t matte r to style.

Because the freedom fro m car e that make s thi s sor t o f posturing possibl e
is associate d wit h th e uppe r classes , w e ca n sa y tha t th e pla y no t onl y
displays the snobberie s o f thi s class (neve r mind tha t Lan e i s a servant ) bu t
also supports the privilege tha t make s them possible . As Raby put s it : "Th e
intention i s no t primaril y t o satiriz e th e ridiculou s natur e o f som e socia l
rituals and taboo s .  .  .  but to infuse the m wit h a  new and independen t life "
(A Reader's  Companion,  p . 44) . H e shrewdl y observe s tha t Lad y Brack -
nell's reference s t o th e horro r o f revolutio n ar e no t just  a  jok e becaus e
social orde r i s wha t provide s th e basi s fo r he r lif e o f privileg e (p . 7) . I n
Ellmann's words , i n thi s styl e o f wit , "W e hav e th e pleasur e affirmin g th e
ancien regime  an d o f rebellin g agains t i t a t th e sam e time " (Wilde,  p . xvi) .
On th e whole , class-relate d freedo m fro m seriousnes s seem s stronge r tha n
class-directed satire . That i s to say , and i n contras t t o Shavia n comedy , th e
subversive aspec t o f th e pla y ha s littl e t o d o wit h an y implie d desir e t o
undermine a  socia l orde r bu t muc h t o d o wit h it s underminin g o f sense ,
with it s comi c anarchy . Rab y comment s tha t th e worl d o f Earnest  "i s a
mixture o f th e reassuringl y stabl e an d th e chaoticall y surreal " (A  Reader's
Companion, p . 81) . I t is , one migh t say , a  worl d wher e cigarett e case s ar e
lost an d returned , wher e suitor s propose , diarie s ar e kep t an d muffin s ar e
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eaten, bu t wher e th e logi c use d t o describ e thes e worldl y activitie s keep s
sliding off the rails.

To wha t genre , then , doe s th e pla y belong ? I f ther e i s an y consensu s
among critics, it is in locating it somewhere between the Anglo-Irish comic
tradition establishe d b y Congreve , Goldsmith , an d Sherida n o n th e on e
hand, and,  o n th e other , th e Victoria n genr e o f "nonsens e literature " a s
represented b y Lewis Carroll and Edward Lear . To put i t another way, it is
satire turnin g repeatedl y int o farc e bu t farc e wit h a  peculia r seriousnes s
because i t seek s not merel y t o resolv e plo t complication s but , through it s
language, to define an aesthetic Utopia, a guiltless "triumph of the pleasure
principle." It s final  recognitio n scen e exploit s th e convention s o f melo -
drama, th e mos t moralisti c o f dramati c genres , bu t send s the m up : th e
discovery of a long-lost mother is deflected ont o an all-important handbag ,
of a long-lost father onto an all-important name in a reference book .

The Shavian comedies I will consider here for their contrasting strategies
do not s o much slid e away fro m satire , as Earnest does; instead, the y use
satire t o ridicul e a n entrenche d bu t outwor n mora l positio n an d then ,
reactively, sprin g forwar d t o a  ne w mora l positio n mor e vigorou s an d
heroic. Th e forme r positio n i s calle d i n The  Quintessence  of  Ibsenism
"idealist" because it idealizes in order to conceal its vulnerability, the latter
"realist" because, as in Plato's antithesis of real and ideal , it has the power
to dispe l erro r an d rais e u p truth . I n Arms and  the Man  Bluntschl i help s
Raina to abandon her out-of-date idealization s of love and war whereupon
the two will lead the way towards a new kind of realism; in You Never Can
Tell, the parents whose grievances are nourished by Victorian ideals of duty
and respec t ar e force d t o surrende r the m b y the combine d energ y o f th e
independent younger generation an d the executive power of the mediating
waiter an d hi s formidable son ; in The  Devil's Disciple the position o f the
romantic, idealizin g wif e an d tha t o f th e suav e gentlema n resis t bu t ar e
overcome by the love-and-life-defying herois m of a seemingly unlikely saint
and a seemingly unlikely soldier. Shaw's heroes solve problems as agents of
a progressive force, yet always some qualifying iron y attends their head-of-
the-pack achievements . I n th e traditiona l comed y o f Shakespear e o r
Moliere, a blocking figure stands apart from the social group and threatens
its cohesio n wherea s i n Sha w th e her o himsel f stand s agains t th e socia l
group. But Shavian comedy never forgets that there is something absurd as
well as wonderful abou t an idiosyncratic stance.

The comic energy of Arms and the Man is generated a t first by the clash
between the romantic heroine (whose "Byronism" is seconded by her fiance
and b y th e Bulgaria n unworldlines s an d aristocrati c pretensio n o f he r
family) an d th e practica l an d prosai c Swis s mercenary ("bourgeoi s t o hi s
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9 Incurabl e Romanticism: the opening scene in Arms and the Man: Andrew Gillies
as Bluntschli and Donna Goodhand as Raina in the Shaw Festival's 1986 production of

Arms and the Man

boots") wh o strip s awa y he r fals e idealism . T o mak e tha t chang e i n he r
credible, sh e mus t b e show n a s rip e fo r it , and,  onc e th e chang e i s
accomplished, she demonstrates an energetic realism in the most effectivel y
set u p farcica l busines s o f th e play , whe n sh e an d Bluntschl i skillfull y
cooperate to extract a compromising photograph from the pocket of a coat
under th e nose s o f th e confuse d family . Bu t Bluntschli' s herois m i s no t
merely a matter of undermining error: in a fine surprise, we discover that he
reinstates romanc e a t a  higher level . He claims to Sergius' s amazement t o
have "a n incurabl y romanti c disposition, " show n b y th e fac t tha t h e
"climbed the balcony of this house when a man of sense would have dived
into the nearest cellar...and cam e sneaking back here to have another look
at the young lady when any other man of my age would have sent the coat
back." Mor e important , h e the n demonstrate s a  powe r t o amaz e i n th e
marvelously efficient wa y he solves the practical problems - to o difficult fo r
Major Petkof f an d Colone l Saranof f -  involve d i n sendin g th e Bulgaria n
troops back home. This prosaic or Shavian idea of romance is capped when



Cambridge Companions Online © Cambridge University Press, 2006

Shavian comedy and the shadow of Wilde

io Pragmatis m vs. Idealism: the opening scene in Arms and the Man-. Simon Bradbury
as Bluntschli and Elizabeth Brown as Raina in the Shaw Festival's 1994 production of

Arms and the  Man

he reads his hotelkeeper-father's will , which proves that he can offer a  bride
the appurtenances o f a  good home - tablecloths , silverware, horses, etc. -
in quantitie s ridiculousl y beyon d th e mean s o f an y aspirin g gentry . Suc h
achievements give new meaning to the word "bourgeois" - an d to the word
"romance." Th e fina l lin e o f th e pla y -  Sergius' s "Wha t a  man ! I s h e a
man!" - capture s the double view of him and clinches Shaw's comedy.21 As
hero, Bluntschl i i s a  bi t lightweight , an d hi s "chocolat e crea m soldier "
romance wit h Rain a a  bi t sentimental , bu t Arms  and  the  Man  i s stil l
effective comedy , an d th e ethica l thrus t o f it s action , th e wa y i t seek s t o
alter rathe r tha n dissolv e identity , mark s a  clea r contras t t o th e Wildea n
mode.

You Never  Can  Tell  offer s tw o comi c situations . On e i s a  due l o f
experienced lover s each of whom takes pride in making conquests without
falling in love and each of whom, having unwillingly fallen in love, defeats
the resistanc e o f th e othe r b y appealin g fro m hea d t o hear t rathe r tha n
heart to head. (Thi s situation i s a more elegant version o f what we find in
The Fhilanderer  and anticipate s the main plo t o f the comedy in Man and
Superman where matrimonia l reluctanc e i s extende d t o fantasti c length s
before a  final capitulation. ) The other situation involve s a family o f five in
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which th e estrange d parent s ar e stubbornl y a t odds : h e call s himsel f
Mr. Crampton an d morosely nourishes a  vague grievance agains t hi s wife;
she call s hersel f Mrs . Clandon , ha s live d i n Madeir a befor e movin g t o a
hotel on the Devon coast where Crampton lives, and has written a series of
"Twentieth Centur y Treatises " whos e ethica l cas t i s unfortunatel y mor e
Victorian tha n modern . The eldest child and mother' s sta r pupi l i s Gloria,
locked i n amorous comba t wit h a  young dentis t name d simpl y Valentine.
The other two children, Philip and Dolly, are youthful twins , and it is their
witty an d engagin g insolenc e directe d a t th e olde r generatio n (father ,
mother, an d a  lawye r know n t o both ) tha t provide s muc h o f th e play' s
charm.

Their spiri t i s iconoclastic, but in order for i t to be effectual i n bringing
about a measure of reconciliation sufficient t o prepare for the festive finale ,
it must be supplemented b y the executive power o f the ever tactful waiter ,
William, an d hi s imperiousl y forcefu l son , a n attorne y name d Bohun .
Bohun's repeated wisdom is: "You think you won't but you will"; William's
gentler version is "you never can tell." The force of the one and (especially)
the easy suavity of the other win the day.

As a  numbe r o f critic s hav e noticed , th e pla y i s indebte d t o Wilde' s
Earnest in severa l ways . The mos t obviou s i s th e searc h fo r th e missin g
father and , in particular, the resemblance between Lady Bracknell's advice
to Jack "to produce at any rate one parent, of either sex, before the season
is quite over" and Valentine's advice to the twins: "in a seaside resort theres
one thing you must have before anybody can afford t o be seen going about
with you ; an d that s a  father , aliv e o r dead. " Th e similarit y i n th e us e of
name-changes has also been noted, a s has the wordplay o n "earnestness, "
"too pervasiv e t o b e coincidence, " accordin g t o Stanle y Weintraub. 22 I f
Shaw's borrowing s reflec t rivalry , the y ar e nonetheles s use d i n a  non -
rivalrous spirit . Wild e want s t o sho w tha t th e nam e (th e appearance ) i s
more importan t tha n th e thin g (th e reality) . Shaw , i n contras t an d mor e
conventionally, want s t o show tha t nam e difference s reall y poin t t o mor e
fundamental differences . You  Never Can Tell actually produces the missing
father s o that a  reconciliation an d a  marriage can go forward, an d i t does
not s o much pu n o n th e word "earnest, " lik e Wilde' s play , a s show ho w
jesting an d earnestnes s ar e closel y related . Wilde' s farc e i s in ever y sens e
gay throughout, its earnestness consisting of keeping out any judgment that
forces a  distinction betwee n level s of seriousness , whereas Shaw' s play, in
his own opinion , "ough t t o b e a  very seriou s comedy , dancin g gail y t o a
happy ending round th e grim earnest o f Mrs . Clandon's marriage an d her
xixth century Georg e Eliotism" (quoted b y Raby, A Reader's  Companion,
p. 17) .
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The Devil's  Disciple  i s subtitle d a  melodrama , and , accordingly , a
morality of good and evil is well defined i n it, but with a Shavian twist, as
the pla y attempt s t o imitat e th e "diabolonia n ethics " o f Blake' s "Th e
Marriage of Heaven and Hell" in which good is aligned with a conventional
Christianity an d evi l with a  vitalistic one . The mora l underpinnin g o f the
play is a kind of vitalism ( a better term for i t than Shaw's prefatory phras e
"diabolonian ethics") , but i t is no less a  melodrama fo r that . Wilde's play
has moment s (lik e th e final  recognitio n scene ) tha t imitat e th e form  o f
melodrama, but, as Katharine Worth comments about Miss Prism's recogni-
tion of her long-lost handbag, "no melodramatic morality could survive the
absurdity o f this " (Bloom , "The  Importance"  p . 74) . The structur e o f hi s
play also allows Shaw to differentiate hi s characters' moral positions more
finely tha n before , and thus sets off hi s art of characterization al l the more
clearly from Wilde's . The Dudgeon uncles who assemble for the reading of
the wil l ar e satirize d a s hypocrite s keepin g u p appearances , bu t Mrs .
Dudgeon, though lik e them i n this, verges on being a  tragic figure as well
since we are allowe d t o sens e her bitte r frustration , an d i t i s pertinent t o
remember that Shaw modeled her on two of Dickens's tragicomic mothers,
Mrs. Clenham and Mrs . Gargery. Richard's brothe r Christi e is too doltish
even to have an understanding o f good an d evi l except a s a mere form o f
words, while Richard himself is clever enough to understand these words in
so original a  sense that h e confuses o r frighten s al l the other s - excep t of
course, for different reasons , Parson Anderson and General Burgoyne. This
is the first play Shaw wrote in which there are two heroes, the "saint" and
the "soldier " (abou t whic h mor e i n a  moment) , bu t h e also provides tw o
dramatically significan t form s o f resistanc e t o thei r heroism . On e come s
from Anderson' s wif e Judith , describe d i n stag e direction s merel y a s "a
sentimental character  formed  by  dreams"  but , thoug h sh e remain s con -
fused an d mus t b e se t dow n a s on e o f Shaw' s conventiona l idealists , she
makes some telling protests agains t the inhuman aspec t of the heroism of
both her husband and the man whose self-sacrificing dee d arouses her love.
The other form o f resistance to heroism comes from Burgoyne , whose role
is not a large part in terms of lines but is likely to steal the show. Although
lacking any itch for a higher vision (and wittily remarking on such desire in
Richard), Burgoyne is free of the cant of his time and class, as shown in his
scorn for Colone l Swindon, and he is, in contrast to Swindon, utterly self-
possessed. According to th e terms o f The  Quintessence  of Ibsenism,  he is
less th e idealis t tha n th e Philistine , bu t hi s cando r give s hi m strengt h t o
match th e strengt h o f th e Realist . (A n earlie r versio n o f th e rol e i s Mrs.
Warren, a  late r An n Whitefield , bot h consciou s hypocrite s who m Sha w
admires for using rather than being used by their society.)
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The tw o heroe s o f The  Devil's  Disciple  bot h hav e executiv e power ;
acting i n a  crisi s wit h sudde n courage , Richar d save s Anderso n an d
Anderson save s th e town . Th e minister-turned-soldie r i s bolde r i n a
physical sense , bu t th e scapegrace-turned-ministe r i s th e her o whos e
motives the play i s interested in . Why does Richard d o it? He tells us that
"a law of [his ] own nature" prevented hi m from allowin g another ma n to
die i n hi s place , an d h e implie s tha t a  particula r othe r man , Anderson ,
inspired th e elevatio n o f hi s ow n character . Judit h o f cours e want s t o
believe he did it for love of her - wrong , to be sure, but Act 2 does suggest
that i t was in fac t a  reaction against  the lower happines s o f marriage and
domestic tranquilit y tha t stimulate d hi s access of mora l strength . Perhap s
the tw o motivationa l line s ar e congruen t becaus e Sha w a t thi s tim e wa s
working ou t (i n wha t woul d becom e th e argumen t o f The  Perfect
Wagnerite, published i n 1898 ) a  dialectica l o r Hegelia n conceptio n o f
heroism tha t "attempt s t o formulat e it s ow n revol t agains t itsel f a s i t
develops int o somethin g higher. " I  quot e fro m th e 189 8 prefac e t o
Candida, a pla y whos e Marchbanks , a  poe t tempte d b y domesticit y bu t
plunging a t las t ou t int o th e nigh t (presumabl y towar d a  mor e heroi c
future), anticipate s such a conception. The role of Dick Dudgeon develops
this conception , an d on e migh t sa y tha t Shaw' s Caesa r -  alon g wit h hi s
critical interpretation of Wagner's Siegfried - provide s its culmination.

The conception i s evolutionary. Wilde himself a s a man of his time was
influenced b y th e ide a o f a n evolutionar y progres s i n social , no t merel y
biological life , a s h e show s i n "Th e Sou l o f Ma n Unde r Socialism. "
Evolution is the law of life, he says, and evolution will lead us to to furthe r
individualism, further self-realization , through the elimination of degrading
poverty. Bu t tha t i s pretty muc h a s fa r a s his interes t i n th e ide a extend s
whereas Sha w wa s becomin g deepl y committe d t o a n ide a o f "creativ e
evolution." A two-pronged attac k on both the rich and the poor remaine d
an importan t par t o f hi s political philosophy , bu t wha t wa s required als o
was raising th e mora l leve l of th e individual , an d th e principa l agenc y of
this improvemen t wa s th e will , a n unconsciou s forc e bu t on e workin g
inexorably and capable o f enlisting something like conscious participatio n
("a will of which I am a part" is Andrew Undershaft's phrasing of the idea).
Wilde does not attemp t t o represent an y such idea dramaticall y bu t Shaw
does, and thi s ideologica l differenc e ca n accoun t fo r th e differenc e i n the
tone of their satire. When it is a question of protesting some form of moral
degradation, Wilde' s touc h i s light, a s when (i n A Woman  of  No  Impor-
tance) hi s dand y score s a n Englishma n gallopin g afte r a  fo x a s "th e
unspeakable i n ful l pursui t o f th e uneatable. " A  comparabl e protes t i n
Shaw, the openin g stag e direction s o f The  Devil's  Disciple,  aimed a t th e
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slaughter of the Revolutionary War, is Swiftian i n style: "their idealizations
. .  . convinced  both  Americans  and  English  that  the  most  highminded
course for them to pursue is to kill as many of one another as possible"

During the hal f centur y betwee n Wilde's death (1900 ) an d Shaw' s (1950) ,
Shaw's reputatio n wa s hig h an d Wilde' s depressed . Bu t thi s ha s bee n
reversed during the second half of the twentieth century, and Shaw may be
said once again, in a different way , to be shadowed b y Wilde. Since Wilde
is not self-evidently a  stronger writer , and was certainly a less prolific one ,
the change is worth inquiring into by way of concluding this essay.

Wilde's increased appeal in our day has to do primarily, I think, with his
tapping int o ou r postmoder n skepticis m regardin g objectivity , truth , an d
art. One is inclined to trace this skepticism back to Nietzsche, and, in so far
as this is justified, i t is significant tha t Nietzsche's influence i n the first half
of th e centur y (o n such writer s a s Yeats, Lawrence, Dreiser , London , an d
O'Neill) concerne d mainl y th e questio n o f powe r wherea s i n th e secon d
half i t has concerned mainly the question of truth. Although Wilde remains
a lat e Romanti c an d no t a  postmodern figure, he wrote wit h memorabl e
flair about objectivit y a s an aspect o f subjectivity , o f truth a s an aspect of
fiction, an d of art as an aspect of criticism.

Matthew Arnold famousl y tol d us , in "The Function o f Criticism a t the
Present Time," that the critic's aim is "to see the object a s in itself i t really
is." Walter Pate r subtl y altere d thi s in his Preface t o The  Renaissance:  "i n
aesthetic criticism the first step towards seeing one's object as it really is, is
to know one' s impression a s it really i s ..." An d Wilde, in "Th e Criti c as
Artist," sharpens Pater's idea to the point of wit and at the risk of absurdity:
the tru e ai m o f th e criti c i s "to se e the objec t a s i n itsel f i t really i s not "
(Works, p. 1030). Criticism had long wrestled with the problem that fiction
can b e see n a s eithe r a  kin d o f trut h o r a  kin d o f lying , bu t Wild e wit h
engaging boldnes s put s thi s questio n t o th e sid e and , i n "Th e Deca y o f
Lying," locates as crucial the distinction between splendid lying and vulgar
misrepresentation. A s for Art , of course that word i s often a  shibboleth in
Wilde's work, bu t in "The Criti c as Artist" ( a title phrase meant to startl e
but whic h woul d pas s toda y a s wwremarkable) , ar t i s show n t o be ,
paradoxically, an aspect of an activity traditionally considered subordinat e
to it: "There is no such thing as Shakespeare's Hamlet," his Gilbert declares,
going on t o develo p the ide a no t onl y tha t critic s se e different thing s bu t
that they ought to, because individuality i s developed in the act of reading
(Works, p . 1034) . Shaw could neve r have written, a s Wilde did, "I t i s the
spectator an d no t lif e tha t ar t reall y mirrors " (Collected  Letters, p . 268) .
And such a view is flattered by the critical biases of our own time.
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On the other side of the equation, some Shavian values, especially those
involved wit h socialis m an d communism , hav e suffere d a  clea r los s o f
prestige in the latter half of the twentieth century. The fault of course is not
Shaw's. A socialist ethos was in the intellectual air at the turn of the century
whether one was strictly a socialist or not, but it is in the air no more. Our
society, our technological civilization, faces problems that seem intractable
to us and that Shaw was not in a position even to recognize. We hope now
for survival or mitigation, hardly for the sort of moral progress that formed
the basis of his vision. Self-improvement i s not a dead idea, but the notion of
collectively improving the quality of human beings by either political or bio-
logical means seems to most of us impracticable, perhaps even dangerous.

Harold Bloom sums up sharply the current reputation of the two writers:
"the Aestheti c Visio n o f Pate r an d Wild e no w appear s t o b e Ruskin' s
abiding legacy, while Shaw's Fabian Evolution would see m to have been a
Ruskinian dea d end. " (George  Bernard Shaw,  p . 2) . Bloom , however ,
underrates Shaw both as stylist and as artist (vs . propagandist). Where the
comedies of the nineties now appear weakest is not in being too doctrinaire
but to o timid . Th e Petkof f pretension s (library , bell , bathin g mor e tha n
once a week) and the seductions at century's end of "Byronism," the weak
Victorianism of the parental generation in You Never Can Tell, the attempt
to establish Richar d a s "the devil' s disciple" because he i s said t o consor t
with smugglers and gypsies - suc h stuff i s too easy, not vigorously enough
imagined. Bu t where the dramatic effec t centers , in the tension betwee n a
heroic style of feeling and thinking and what resists or opposes it, the plays
still come alive.

Finally the difference betwee n the artisti c goals of these two masters of
dramatic comed y shoul d not , I  think , b e expresse d i n term s o f aestheti c
evaluation but in psychological and historical terms. Shavian comedy seeks
to resolve the will and firm up ego boundaries, Wildean comedy to dissolve
the wil l an d loose n eg o boundarie s -  an d bot h goals , althoug h entailin g
different comi c effects , ca n giv e audience s pleasure . Historically , Sha w
derives from th e Enlightenment; his test for ar t is whether i t is true to "real
life" and the "rea l world" - phrase s used repeatedly i n his 189 4 essay, "A
Dramatic Realis t t o Hi s Critics. " Wilde , i n contrast , derive s fro m th e
Romantic movemen t an d test s ar t b y it s unreality , th e vividnes s o f it s
artifice: in his "Phrases and Philosophies for the Use of the Young," he tells
us tha t "Th e first  dut y i n lif e i s t o b e a s artificia l a s possible " (Works,
p. 1205) . I wish to avoid stating the comparison invidiously. One may have
a preference her e but it is not one that can be defended o n strictly aesthetic
grounds. As far a s we can see, both playwrights will continue to hold their
audiences for some time to come.
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NOTES
1 Th e basi s fo r thi s inferenc e i s a  remark o f Shaw' s i n hi s 191 6 lette r t o Fran k

Harris published a s a preface t o Harris' s Life  of Wilde  and reprinted b y Shaw
with mino r change s in Pen Portraits and Review's, vol . xxix o f The  Works  of
Bernard Shaw (London: Constable, 1930-38) . I quote it from thi s source (cited
hereafter a s Pen Portraits), p. 300: "Robert Ross surprised me greatly by telling
me, long after Oscar' s death, that i t was this address of mine that moved Oscar
to try his hand at a similar feat by writing 'The Soul of Man Under Socialism'."

2 Bernard  Shaw: The Search for Love (New York: Random House, 1988), p. 210.
3 Shaw's  People:  Victoria  to  Churchill  (Universit y Park : Pennsylvani a Stat e

University Press, 1996), pp. 31-32. One might add that Arms and the Man was
first produce d i n 1894 , Candida  in 1897 , Mrs.  Warren's  Profession in 1902 ,
and The Philanderer (professionally) i n 1907.

4 Richar d Ellmann, Oscar Wilde (New York: Knopf, 1987), p. 373.
5 Lette r o f Ma y 9 , 188 9 t o Davi d J . O'Donoghue , i n Bernard  Shaw: Collected

Letters, ed. Dan H. Laurence (New York: Dodd, Mead, 1965), vol. 1, p. 210.
6 Lette r of November 19 , 1894 to R - Golding Bright (Collected  Letters, p. 460).

Shaw further defende d Wilde in another letter to Bright (Ibid., p. 480).
7 Our  Theatres  in the  Nineties:  Criticism Contributed Week  by  Week  to  The

Saturday Review from January 1895 to May 1898  in Three  Volumes,  in The
Works of Bernard Shaw, vol. xxm, pp. 9-12. Hereafte r cite d as Our Theatres,
vol. xxm (or vol. xxiv).

8 O n Lady Windermere's  Fan, see the comment tucked into Shaw's self-interview
concerning Widowers'  Houses,  "The Playwrigh t o n Hi s Firs t Play " (hereafte r
cited as "Playwright'), reprinted in The  Bodley Head Bernard Shaw: Collected
Plays with their  Prefaces, ed . Dan H. Laurence (London : Max Reinhardt , The
Bodley Head , 1970) , vol . I , p . 127 . Se e als o Ellmann , Wilde,  p . 397 . O n A
Woman of  No Importance,  see Shaw, Letters,  p. 491. Shaw also commended
Wilde generally a s a  playwrigh t i n Our  Theatres,  vol. xxm (p . 115 ) an d vol .
xxiv (p. 228).

9 I n trying to understand Shaw' s judgment o f Earnest,  on e should conside r als o
that "heartless " i s i n thi s connectio n a  peculiarl y loade d word . Sha w ha d
applied i t t o himsel f i n hi s letters t o Ellen Terry an d would agai n i n those t o
Mrs. Campbell. The Devil of Man and Superman, a Wildean figure, applies it to
the Shavia n Do n Juan . Th e criti c A . B . Walkley, the addresse e o f th e Epistl e
Dedicatory, ha d implie d i t when h e wrote o f Shaw' s plays generally (i n 1902 ,
just befor e th e Epistl e wa s written) : "N o characte r exhibit s rea l emotion "
(Drama and Life [Freeport , NY: Books Libraries Press, 1967], p. 45). Finally, it
is a word Wilde also used in his plays concerning characters like himself: Lord
Goring in An Ideal Husband is several times called "heartless" by his father, and
Algernon by Jack in The Importance of Being Earnest - an d of course Shaw had
very recently seen these two plays.

10 The  Letters of Oscar Wilde, ed. Rupert Hart-Davis (New York: Harcourt, Brace
& World, 1962), p. 332.

11 Sall y Peters makes much of the words "branded" and "outcast," concluding that
Shaw himself incline d to homosexuality. (See her Bernard Shaw: The Ascent of
the Superman  [Ne w Haven : Yal e Universit y Press , 1996] , p . 22 6 an d
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throughout). The record of his life and work does not support such an inference,
nor d o thes e word s i n context , whic h respon d t o Wilde' s diction , requir e it .
Shaw's sexua l imaginatio n wa s governe d no t b y homoeroti c bu t b y mother -
related incestuous wishes. Shaw's view of Wilde's homosexuality, moreover, was
emotionally neutral , unlik e hi s vie w o f Wilde' s drinkin g an d othe r persona l
failings. Hi s mos t direc t commen t o n Wilde' s homosexualit y reflect s th e
prejudices of its time, mitigated by a measure of enlightened doubt: "My charity
to hi s perversion , an d m y recognitio n o f th e fac t tha t i t doe s no t impl y an y
general depravit y o r coarseness o f characte r cam e to me through readin g an d
observation, not through sympathy. I have all the normal, violent repugnance to
homosexuality -  i f i t b e reall y normal , whic h nowaday s on e i s sometime s
provoked to doubt" (Pen Portraits, p. 303).

12 Complete  Works  of  Oscar  Wilde,  introd. Vyvya n Hollan d (London : Collins ,
1968), p. 163.

13 Shaw's  Moral Vision: The  Self and Salvation (Ithaca: Cornel l University Press,
1976).

14 Harol d Bloom , ed. and introd. , Modern Critical Views: George Bernard  Shaw
(New York: Chelsea House, 1987), pp. 2, 10.

15 Elle n Moers, in The Dandy: Brwnmell to Beerbohm (New York: Viking, i960),
defines th e dandy , whic h "haunte d th e Victoria n imagination, " a s " a ma n
dedicated solely to his own perfection throug h a  ritual of taste. The epitome of
selfish irresponsibility , h e wa s ideall y fre e o f al l huma n commitment s tha t
conflict wit h taste : passions , moralities , ambitions , politics , o r occupations "
(p. 13) . Wilde , Beerbohm , an d th e ne w dandie s o f th e 1890s , sh e implies ,
carried BrummelPs sartorial "art of the pose" into literature, using wit, epigram,
and paradox "to confound the bourgeois" (p. 288).

16 Oscar  Wilde (New York: New Directions, 1947), p. 138.
17 I n Harol d Bloom , ed . an d introd. , Modern  Critical  Interpretations: "The

Importance of Being Earnest" (Ne w York: Chelsea House, 1988) , p. 12 . Here-
after cited as Bloom, "The Importance"

18 "The  Importance  of  Being  Earnest 9: A Reader's  Companion  (Ne w York :
Twayne, 1995), p. 34.

19 "I s insincerity such a terrible thing? I think not. It is merely a method by which
we can multipl y ou r personalities. " Thi s i s from The  Picture  of Dorian  Gray
(Works, p. 112), and almost the same phrasing is used in "The Critic as Artist"
(Works, p. 1048): "What people call insincerity is simply a method by which we
can multiply our personalities."

20 R . W . Elli s (ed.) , Bernard  Shaw and Karl  Marx: A Symposium  (Ne w York :
Random House, 1930), p. 6.

21 Originall y th e final words were simply : "What a  man! What a  man!" (Britis h
Library Additiona l M S 50601) . Th e chang e incorporate s a  suggestio n o f
inhumanity i n th e superman . I n Ceci l Lewis' s film  versio n o f th e play , th e
phrasing wa s change d bac k t o it s origina l form , presumabl y t o spar e th e
audience a subtle effect .

22 Shaw's  People,  p. 51 . See also Peters , Ascent,  p . 227 ; and Raby , A  Reader's
Companion, pp. 93-96.
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Structure an d philosophy in Man and
Superman an d Major Barbara

UNDERSHAFT: [startled] A Secularist! Not the least in the world: on the contrary,
a confirmed mystic.

(Major Barbara, Collected Flays, vol. in, p. no ) 1

Although ver y muc h a  participan t i n th e secula r fervo r o f hi s times ,
Bernard Shaw , like his creation Andrew Undershaft, wa s also a  confirme d
mystic, an d graduall y thi s mysticis m le d hi m t o a  long-rang e solutio n t o
human problems , a  solution h e called the Life Forc e and a  philosophy he
called Creativ e Evolution . Ove r time , Shaw' s play s becam e les s socia l
diatribes an d mor e parable s addressin g wha t h e sa w a s the basi c huma n
paradox: b y the time the human min d begin s to achiev e it s potential , the
human body is ready for the dustbin. Creative Evolution, and its concurrent
human development , wer e therefor e base d o n a  premis e tha t tha t whic h
furthered th e evolution o f the species toward th e true developmen t o f the
intellect was good, and that which hindered it was bad.

However, Sha w wa s awar e o f th e nee d fo r clearl y define d dramati c
structures which would support his polemics without reducing the text to a
lecture an d th e audienc e t o lecturegoers . Whil e h e utilize d man y o f th e
structures o f the nineteenth-century theatre , the basic structure mos t ofte n
found i n Shavian dram a i s the triangle , with it s strong characte r conflict s
allowing him to present hi s theories in a form tha t coul d bot h amus e and
educate on stage.

This idea of a  triangle, comprising three opposing points of view, as the
basic structural element in Shaw is not new: he himself first called attention
to i t i n the guise o f hi s discussion o f Ibsenism , where h e labeled it s three
components the Realist, the Idealist and the Philistine.2 Others have labeled
the triangles by their plot components: the Father/Daughter/Suitor triangle ,
the Two-Suito r triangle , etc . I  propos e anothe r nomenclature , usin g th e
characters Sha w himself place d in two corners o f the triangle in Man and
Superman, the Superman and the Devil, and naming the third corner by its
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function, th e Objec t o f thei r conflict . However , I  am no t usin g th e ter m
Superman i n the Nietzschean , no r th e term Devi l i n the Miltonic , senses.
Rather, I  mean them as the personification o n stage of the basic conflict i n
all of Shaw's work: the battle between those who serve Creative Evolution,
attacking "wha t is" and advocating the new, the different, th e difficult, th e
unconventional; an d thos e wh o unwittingl y foi l th e progres s o f Creativ e
Evolution by defending the old, the status quo, the easy, the conventional.

Although i t wa s no t unti l Man  and  Superman  that Sha w assigne d th e
attacker th e titl e o f Superma n an d the defender tha t o f Devil , these terms
can b e carrie d backwar d an d applie d t o character s an d attitude s foun d
from hi s first play onward . I n these earlie r plays , Shaw was definin g an d
then refining thi s basic triangular dramati c structure and exploring how it
could b e bes t utilize d t o expres s hi s developing ide a o f th e Superman , a n
idea h e wa s attemptin g t o presen t no t abstractly , a s a  philosophica l o r
literary conceit , bu t a s an activ e dramati c characte r functionin g withi n a
framework o f dramati c conflict . Wherea s th e contextua l position s o f th e
Superman an d Devi l ar e fixed, the Objec t i s a  variabl e whos e movemen t
propels much of the dramatic action of each play.

It i s i n Man  and  Superman,  Shaw's first  play o f th e twentiet h century ,
that these character and philosophical concerns first clearly converged. This
is the pla y i n whic h Sha w first turned awa y fro m th e nineteenth-centur y
dramatic structures which had originally supported hi s work and began to
develop th e ne w form s whic h woul d sustai n hi s late r play s an d influenc e
the theatr e o f th e twentieth century . Structurally , a s Margery M . Morga n
has noted : "Th e cru x o f Man  and  Superman,  is th e relatio n o f th e Hel l
scene in Act in to the rest of the play. Without it, as F. P. W. McDowell has
observed, th e titl e Sha w gav e th e whol e i s reduce d t o a  mer e quip :
'Superman' coul d onl y hav e referenc e t o th e woma n wh o overrule s th e
man."3 Shaw, in his preface to the play, sanctioned the cutting of the entire
third ac t includin g th e drea m sequenc e whic h ha s com e t o b e know n a s
Don ]uan  in  Hell.  However , t o d o s o strip s th e pla y o f it s philosophica l
import, leavin g onl y a  basi c Shavia n comed y -  granted , n o smal l accom -
plishment - bu t not the first great play of the twentieth century.

What are the triangular structures of both the inner and outer plays; how
are they constituted; how do they operate within bot h plays; how do they
tie the two plays together? An examination of these questions will not only
show the interdependence o f the inner and oute r plays , but also how they
combine to express Shaw's philosophical purpose.

Does one triangle describe both the inner and oute r plays? Shaw is very
clear which characters in the outer play embody the characters in the inner
one, and hence the triangle in the inner play is obvious. Shaw designates the
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11 Th e "inner" triangle: the Hell scene, with Carole Shelley, Tony van Bridge,
Ian Richardson, Norman Welsh in the Shaw Festival's 1977 production of

Man and Superman

character in one corner of the triangle to be the Devil, the defender o f Hell
where th e easy , conventiona l lif e hold s sway ; accord s th e positio n o f
Superman to his philosophical opponent Don Juan, the defender of Heaven
where the few who see its import strive to bring about the higher life ; and
establishes tha t i t i s the newcome r t o th e afterlife , Don a Ana , who i s the
Object o f their conflicting arguments . (The Statue is clearly shown to have
already chosen Hell, although he can acknowledge the soundness of certain
of Juan' s arguments. ) Althoug h ther e ar e overtone s o f conventio n an d
unconvention i n the two positions (alway s keeping in mind Shaw' s uncon-
ventional ide a o f wha t i s Heave n an d wha t Hell) , th e philosophica l
differences betwee n th e tw o ar e fa r greate r tha n thes e simpl e terms ,
extending beyond actions and behavior to purposes and reasons.

Given thi s triangl e i n th e inne r play , th e triangl e i n th e oute r pla y
obviously shoul d b e Tanner a s Superman, Mendoz a a s Devil, and Ann as
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Object. Bu t ho w muc h philosophica l differenc e i s ther e betwee n Tanne r
and Mendoza ; i n what contex t ar e we t o se e the forme r a s unconventiona l
when compared t o the latter? Thei r politics are basically the same; each is a
socialist, with a  clear-eyed view of his economic situation :

MENDOZA: I  am a brigand: I live by robbing the rich.
TANNER: I  am a gentleman: I live by robbing the poor.

(Collected Plays,  vol . n, p . 621)

Moreover, eac h i s th e mos t conventiona l o f lovers . Tanne r i s th e las t t o
know tha t An n ha s se t he r ca p fo r him , an d th e leas t effectiv e i n dealin g
with he r whe n h e doe s know ; Mendoz a i s a  hopeles s romantic , wh o ha s
taken t o a  lif e o f brigandag e onl y i n respons e t o rejectio n o f hi s love . I t i s
true tha t Tanne r run s whil e Mendoz a swoons , bu t thi s differenc e i s th e
result o f th e response s o f thei r respectiv e lovers , an d agai n underscore s
their romanti c conventionality . I t i s har d t o vie w thes e tw o a s Superma n
and Devil , notwithstanding th e fac t tha t Mendoza , outsid e o f Act 3 , hardly
exists as a character i n the outer play .

Beyond this , i s Ann th e Object ; i s she i n an y wa y converte d b y eithe r o f
the men? O n the contrary , i t is she who i s unchanging throughou t th e oute r
play, a t al l times certai n o f wha t sh e wants an d ho w t o go abou t gettin g it ,
and i t is she who convert s Tanner , while having littl e i f anything to do wit h
Mendoza. I t i s only a s Dona Ana , i n the inne r play , tha t An n i s uncertain ,
and then onl y while the others are dealing in abstractions. When a  concret e
need i s announced , tha t o f a  mothe r fo r th e Superman , sh e immediatel y
announces hersel f read y t o fill  the position . Moreover , th e opposit e i s tru e
of Tanne r an d Mendoza . They , a s Superma n an d Devil , ar e quit e a t hom e
amid th e philosophica l abstraction s o f th e inne r play , eac h certai n o f an d
unconvertible fro m hi s position ; wherea s i n th e oute r play , thei r absolut e
certainty o f the rightness o f thei r positions lead s to thei r constantly makin g
fools o f themselves .

With th e inne r triangl e fixed,  an d th e absenc e o f on e triangl e tyin g
together th e inne r an d oute r plays , we ar e force d t o loo k elsewher e fo r th e
triangle i n th e oute r play . Wha t ar e th e need s o f thi s triangle ; specifically ,
must i t hav e Tanne r a s the Superman ? Othe r tha n hi s dreamin g himsel f s o
in Ac t 3 , is there an y justificatio n fo r placin g hi m i n thi s position ? A s Eri c
Bentley has pointed out :

Tanner i s a windbag. Indeed, the mere fact o f the woman courting the man
would probabl y no t yiel d comedy a t al l were i t no t fo r a  further an d more
dynamic reversal: the woman, who makes no great claim for herself , has all
the shrewdness , the rea l Lebensweisheit,  while the man , who know s every-
thing and can discourse like Bernard Shaw, is - a  fool. Tanner is, in fact, like
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Moliere's Alceste , th e traditiona l foo l o f comed y i n highl y sophisticate d
intellectual disguise . Ann Whitefield , int o whos e tra p Tanne r falls , i s the
knave - in skirts.4

Not onl y i s An n mor e unconventiona l tha n Tanner , sh e i s als o mor e
committed. Sh e canno t (o r wil l not ) nam e it , bu t An n Whitefiel d i s i n
service to a cause: the Shavian Life Force. Instinctively, she understands the
need t o improv e th e specie s throug h generationa l reproduction , th e con -
stant striving upward toward " a mind's eye that shal l see, not the physical
world, bu t the purpose o f Life , and thereby enable the individual t o work
for tha t purpos e instea d o f thwartin g an d bafflin g i t b y settin g u p short -
sighted persona l aim s as at present" (p . 663). It i s this battl e betwee n th e
Life Forc e an d "shortsighte d persona l aims " which i s the Superman/Devi l
conflict i n th e oute r play , an d i n thi s contex t i t i s eas y t o locat e th e
Superman, Devil, and Object , and to see how the dramatic structure of the
triangle sustains Shaw's agenda.

On on e sid e i s Ann , th e instinctiv e Superman . No t onl y ca n sh e no t
articulate o r defen d he r position , t o b e abl e t o d o s o woul d betra y he r
position. Fo r articulatin g an d defendin g a  positio n i s servin g th e short -
sighted personal aims of the Devil. Man (used here as a non gender-specifi c
term), as s/he exist s in the rea l world o f the oute r play , does not have the
Superman's capacit y t o dea l wit h idea s o r philosophies ; ou r humannes s
keeps gettin g i n ou r way . We are constantl y sidetracke d b y egotism , th e
need for love , social proprieties, class differentials, politica l ideologies, and
so forth. I t is only in the incorporeal realms , where we will be free o f our
human failings, that we will have the ability and the time (eons and eons of
it) to develop , shape, debate and reshape idea s worth having . In the brie f
life span that we know, the human brain has only time to begin to function ,
only tim e t o begi n t o assimilat e al l o f experienc e an d diges t i t int o a
coherent philosophy . Befor e w e can begi n t o d o justic e t o ou r ideas , our
bodies begi n t o fai l us ; our short-live d brain s begi n to deteriorat e an d al l
the great thinking we are poised to achieve is lost forever. The Shavian Life
Force i s th e mean s o f freein g th e intellec t fro m it s corporea l bonds , o f
defeating thi s dichotom y o f bod y an d brain , th e "misalliance"  of a  late r
play.

Shaw introduce s thi s concep t earl y i n bot h th e oute r an d inne r plays .
Ramsden's comment on Ann's father's death, "its the common lot, we must
all face i t some day" (p . 535) , states the reason wh y al l should b e serving
the Life Force. Later, Dona Ana tells Juan that she was "younger [a t 70]: at
30 I  was a  fool " (p . 637) . Bu t o f wha t us e i s i t t o fee l younge r (i.e . be
smarter) a t 7 0 when you r bod y canno t sustai n thi s an d yo u wil l onl y be
taking this greater wisdom to the grave? If we lived "as  far as thought can
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reach" (th e titl e Sha w gav e t o hi s onl y pla y portrayin g th e result s o f
Creative Evolution) , w e coul d kee p applyin g thi s wisdo m t o gai n eve r
newer and greater wisdom.

Arrayed agains t Ann are a  variety o f Devils , for ever y man i n the oute r
play is in the service of shortsighted personal aims. The first, and easiest to
see, i s Roebuc k Ramsde n (whos e nam e evoke s hi s bull-in-a-china-sho p
approach). Ramsde n i s th e Devi l o f tempora l social/political/economica l
ideas, theories which, as Shaw makes clear, are transitory: in this "drama of
ideas .  . . everything depend s o n whethe r hi s adolescenc e belong s t o th e
sixties o r th e eighties " (p . 534) . Twenty year s ago , Ramsde n wa s i n th e
forefront o f social thought, on the so-called "cutting edge." But the slash of
this cuttin g edg e i s quick ; i n twent y year s Ramsden' s idea s hav e becom e
conservative an d accepted . The y hav e bee n replaced b y those o f the ma n
one generation his junior, John Tanner.

Tanner certainl y ca n b e see n a s unconventiona l whe n compare d wit h
Ramsden i n th e worl d o f socia l ideas , bu t thi s i s a n eve r changin g
condition: Ramsde n wa s onc e th e ma n o f unconventiona l ideas , an d
Tanner's idea s wil l als o becom e conventiona l wit h time . I t i s not radical s
who become conservative with age ; rather, radical ideas become accepted ,
and henc e becom e conservative . Fo r Shaw , trul y unconventiona l peopl e
keep changing their ideas to stay on the cutting edge; staying true not to a
set of ideas, but rather to the idea of new ideas.

Accordingly, i n Ac t 1 , Ramsde n i s th e Devil , believin g idea s ar e all -
important (whether they be conventional or unconventional); and Tanner is
the Object , wh o begin s the play as the devil' s disciple, in revolt abou t the
specifics o f ideas , bu t no t thei r importance . Opposin g the m i s Ann , th e
Superman, knowing (instinctively) that all ideas are transitory, and that the
real importance is serving the Life Force by propagating the species. In the
overall action of the outer play, she will convert Tanner to the service of the
Life Force , away fro m politica l an d socia l action s whic h ar e shortsighte d
personal aims , self-satisfyin g bu t unproductive . However , a s he r las t lin e
indicates, if he will serve the Life Force she will le t him keep playing with
his toys or ideas: "Never mind her , dear. Go on talking" (p . 733). (On the
other hand, Ramsden, like Shaw, has never served the Life Force; he has no
biological children, only godchildren and wards.)

But Ramsden is not the only Devil in the play; how could he be, for afte r
Act 1  Ramsden himsel f i s barely i n the play ? Instead , Sha w introduce s a
new Devil in each act: Straker in Act 2, Mendoza i n Act 3  and Malone Sr.
in Act 4. Not only do they serve to keep reenergizing the action, these three
characters mak e u p thei r ow n triangl e o f me n wh o migh t appea r t o b e
Supermen i n th e rea l world : th e mechani c (maste r o f machines) , th e
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12 A n "outer" triangle: Act i of Man and Superman with Julie Stewart as
Violet Robinson, Kate Trotter as Ann Whitefield, and Michael Ball as John Tanner in

the Shaw Festival's 1989 production

romantic adventurer (maste r of his soul), and the new industrialist (wh o is
buying mastery of England's social and historical institutions) . But each of
them i s serving a  shortsighted persona l aim , and eac h o f thes e character s
can be said to be the Devil in his act, the representative o f the temporally
important.

Hence, in Act 2, Straker is the Devil. His machines, like Ramsden's ideas,
will soon become outdated and be replaced by ever newer machines; it is he
who tell s Tanne r o f Ann' s intentions , precipitatin g Tanner' s fligh t an d
temporarily short-circuitin g the workings of the Life Force ; and bot h here
and i n Act 3 , he i s as ful l o f middle-clas s moralit y a s any Shavia n Devil .
Nevertheless, Sha w ha s a  fondnes s fo r thi s Devi l o f machinery , becaus e
however temporar y eac h specifi c machine , machiner y itsel f ca n hel p t o
bring about the longer-lived bodie s the Life Forc e is seeking. Accordingly,
he gives Straker some "new" ideas about class and heritage (although these
"new" idea s wil l als o becom e outmode d an d replaced) , an d h e allow s
Straker t o se e through Tanne r a s Tanner sa w through Ramsden : Straker' s
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knowing description of his boss, "he likes to talk" (p . 589), is a preview of
Ann's last line. As the Devil of the short Act 2, which bridges the real world
of Ac t 1  and th e eternity worl d o f Act 3 , Straker stand s halfway betwee n
man and Superman and serves as a possible bridge between them.

Mendoza, the Devil in Act 3 , sees himself a s a romantic adventurer , bu t
romance o r lov e i s no t necessar y t o serv e th e Lif e Forc e an d i n fac t
emotions ten d t o ge t i n it s way . Moreover , Mendoza' s adventure s belon g
spiritually t o Louisa an d financially t o Malone Sr . For al l his bluster, he is
passively fatalistic ; sharin g more than hi s occupation wit h William Boon ,
the waiter who believes "you never can tell" Ironically , although he is the
Act 3  Devil , i t i s he wh o impede s Tanner' s flight,  thereby servin g rathe r
than hindering the Life Force.

While a  representativ e characte r i n hi s ow n right , Mendoz a i s als o
Octavius Robinson's surrogate in Act 3. Tavy is too young and poetic to be
Shaw's idea o f the  Devil; for tha t Sha w needs an older , more experience d
cynic like Mendoza, wh o provides a  bette r opponen t fo r Tanne r tha n th e
easily vanquishe d Tavy . Sha w i s continuin g a  dichotom y h e ha s use d i n
previous plays, the practical man versus the poet: Bluntschli and Sergius in
Arms and  the  Man,  Morel l an d Marchbank s i n Candida,  Anderson an d
Dudgeon i n The  Devil's  Disciple;  bu t her e i t i s a  dichotomy o f romanti c
Devils, as if to reposition his previous "real world" Supermen.

Finally, Hecto r Malon e Sr. , th e Devi l i n Ac t 4 , ha s th e prid e an d
arrogance tha t come s with money . He believe s he can bu y anythin g -  hi s
son's obedience or an English abbey - b y offering o r withholding his wealth
(which, lik e al l things tempora l ha s no value i n the eternit y worl d o f th e
Superman). But the industrialist is at the mercy of the same parochial pride
that drove him to seek wealth, and he would stand i n the way of his son's
happiness to assuage his Irish need to best the English. His son, meanwhile,
is the mirror of his father and would condemn his wife to poverty to satisf y
his pride . Fortunately , bot h ar e easil y manipulate d b y Violet, who , bein g
pregnant, i s in even greate r servic e to the Life Forc e than Ann , bu t ha s a
Devil's commitment to the shortsighted personal aims of money.

Thus, Ramsden may be called the shortsighted Devi l of ideas, Straker of
machinery, Mendoza an d Tavy of love, and the Malones (including Violet)
of money, and the complete triangle for the outer play, with one Superman
and seve n Devils , expresse s jus t ho w weighte d dow n th e rea l worl d i s
against th e true Superman . However , Sha w does no t rigidl y stratif y thes e
Devils, an d thu s th e Devi l o f ideas , Ramsden , doe s no t understan d An n
because o f hi s romanti c illusion s abou t her ; whil e th e romanti c Devil ,
Mendoza, leads a group of scruffy brigand s who spend more time debating
ideas than snatching purses.
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In a  worl d populate d b y s o man y shortsighte d Devils , th e Lif e Forc e
demands a man worthy of serving it, and it is indicative of Ann's Superman
qualities tha t sh e can recognize Tanner a s such. Although i n the throes of
shortsighted persona l aim s - The  Revolutionist's Handbook  -  Tanne r ha s
integrity an d honor ; h e mean s t o d o th e righ t thing , bu t a s h e neve r
understands wha t i s reall y happening , hi s goo d impulse s lea d hi m int o
foolishness. I n Ac t i , hi s decen t motivation s couple d wit h hi s misunder -
standing of Violet lead him to make a fool o f himself; and to show us that
he has learned nothin g durin g the course o f the play , he does the same in
Act 4 with Hector. In addition, he is impossibly dense in realizing that he,
and no t Tavy , i s Ann's prey . Bu t hi s basi c goodness , couple d wit h Ann' s
basic shrewdness, will combine to produce children with qualities of each,
and thus move the species slightly up the evolutionary ladder.

Therefore, th e structura l triangle s o f th e inne r an d oute r play s d o no t
correspond, and the two parts of Man and Superman do not duplicate each
other. Rather, they stand in contrast, each commenting upon the other and
in combination expressin g Shaw' s developing philosoph y o f the true nee d
and plac e fo r th e Superman . Previously , th e Superma n ha d bee n th e
defender o f a  specifi c secula r se t o f ideas , an d Sha w ha d attempte d t o
establish the character in a theatrical "real world," what Bentley calls "The
World As It Is."5 Here, Shaw is separating the Superman, establishing two
different conflicts , two different goals , and two different world s for he r or
him to operate in . Only when the Life Force provides the longevity which
allows for ful l developmen t o f our mental capacities (no w only possible in
the death-induce d immortalit y o f th e inne r play ) ca n idea s take primacy ;
and thus , in "the world a s it is," the true Superman eschews the temporal,
shortsighted personal aims of ideas (as well as machinery, love, and money)
to serv e th e Lif e Force . Whe n th e need s o f th e Lif e Forc e hav e bee n
accomplished, whe n ou r brain s hav e bee n advance d t o primac y ove r ou r
bodies, the n th e Superma n o f idea s ca n ste p forward , an d th e Superma n
who serves the Life Force will be useless and out of place.

In the outer play , Ann is the Superman an d Tanner the Object , whil e in
the inner play these positions are reversed. In the outer play it is Ann who is
effective: manipulatin g an d dominatin g everyon e wit h who m sh e come s
into contac t a s sh e selfishl y serve s th e greate r nee d o f th e Lif e Force .
Tanner, on the other hand, is, as Bentley says, a fool and a windbag; whose
lengthy expression s o f bombas t An n neatly deflates , Ac t by Act: " I am so
glad you understand politics , Jack: i t will be most usefu l t o you i f you go
into parliament " (p . 575) ; "I suppose yo u wil l go in seriously fo r politic s
someday, Jack" (p . 599) ; and th e aforementione d "Neve r min d her , dear .
Go on talking" (p. 733).
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When we move to the inner play , Ann is out of her element. Her concern s
are temporal: her appearance, her honor, her reputation, her repentance. She
is decidedly a spectator to the central debate, only able to enter fully near the
end, when the subject shifts to worldly male-female relations . In the opening
scene betwee n Don a An a an d Do n Juan , Sha w reverse s th e roles : h e i s
constantly deflating her bombast. Her final line, "A father fo r the Superman "
(p. 689) , expresses he r misunderstanding : th e Superma n alread y exist s an d
fathers an d mother s ar e useless here, but sh e is still thinking i n those terms .
The line is thus ironic, foolish, an d transitional, back to the real world o f the
outer play , where a  father fo r th e Superman i s a legitimate concern .

Similarly, Tanne r goe s fro m bein g th e foolis h pamphletee r o f th e oute r
play t o th e insightfu l exponen t o f th e Shavia n philosoph y o f Creativ e
Evolution i n th e inne r play . Hi s speeches , whil e ramblin g a t times , ar e a
coherent statemen t o f Shaw' s ideas , an d althoug h th e Devi l i s certainl y
given the opportunit y t o defen d hi s position, ofte n brilliantly , Juan/Tanner /
Shaw is never at a  loss for idea s or words to counteract the Devil. 6

Underlying Shaw' s theor y o f Creativ e Evolutio n i s a  belie f tha t th e
ultimate goa l o f th e Lif e Forc e i s brai n unencumbere d b y body , pur e
consciousness whic h wil l liv e eternally . Th e desir e t o appl y one' s wil l
toward thi s end , is , t o Shaw , th e wor k o f Heaven , whil e th e passiv e
acceptance o f our current state is the sloth of Hell :

. .  . heaven, which i s . . . th e home of the masters o f reality , and .  . . earth,
which is the home of the slaves of reality. The earth is a nursery in which men
and women play at being heroes and heroines, saints and sinners; but they are
dragged down from their fool's paradise by their bodies: hunger and cold and
thirst, ag e and deca y an d disease , death abov e all , make them the slave s of
reality: thrice a day meals must be eaten and digested: thrice a century a new
generation must be engendered: ages of faith, o f romance, and of science are
all driven at last to have but one prayer "Make me a healthy animal." (p. 650)

This sam e contras t betwee n inne r an d oute r play s hold s tru e i n Shaw' s
use of the Devil . In the outer pla y there are a  number o f Devils ; in the inne r
play there i s only the Devi l o f love , Mendoza, fo r th e romanti c min d i s the
most antithetica l t o tha t o f pur e ideas . However, i n this eternity o f Heave n
and Hell , wher e idea s tak e primacy , th e questio n o f th e importanc e an d
viability o f eac h specifi c ide a i s vali d an d wort h discussing . Hence , th e
Devil o f ideas , Ramsden , als o exist s i n thi s world . Bu t her e h e i s no t the
Devil, merely a  participant . Th e natur e o f hi s ideas precludes hi s bein g th e
Superman, an d hi s rigidit y (h e i s afte r al l a  statue ) preclude s hi s bein g th e
Object. B y no t bein g par t o f th e Shavia n triangle , h e serve s a s a  philo -
sophical groun d wire : th e voic e o f middle-clas s reasonin g keepin g th e
philosophical debat e anchore d t o th e rea l world , bu t withou t Don a Ana' s
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still existin g tie s to huma n concerns . Although h e has alread y decide d t o
throw i n hi s lo t wit h th e Devil , h e ca n appreciat e th e point s o f th e
Superman; even the Philistines are more advanced here.

In addition to these triangles, Shaw, in a brilliant twist of stagecraft, uses
his ow n enemies , time (ou r mortality ) an d plac e ("th e worl d a s i t is" ) t o
dramatically suppor t hi s arguments ; tim e an d locatio n underscor e th e
contrast between the two parts of the play. The three acts of the outer play
appear t o follo w th e neo-classica l unit y o f time , a s al l ar e se t i n daytim e
with each progressively a little later (this is indicated but not specified): Act
i i n th e mid-morning , Ac t 2  a t noon , Ac t 4  i n th e earl y afternoon . Bu t
actually, each is part of a different da y and the unity of time is an illusion.
Act 3 , on th e othe r hand , i s set i n the evening : out o f sequenc e an d thu s
separated fro m th e others. The first two acts, where Tanner resists the Life
Force, ar e se t i n England , wher e th e Devi l tell s u s h e ha s "th e larges t
following" (p . 648) . Th e first  act , th e onl y interior , i s se t i n a n actua l
drawing room which reflects the act's roots in "drawing room" comedy; the
second act is an exterior, but set close to the house: a driveway which serves
to connec t th e (inner ) hous e t o th e (outer ) road , a s th e ac t connect s th e
inner an d oute r plays . The las t two act s are se t in Spain , earthly home of
the eterna l Superman , Do n Juan , an d i t i s in thes e tw o act s tha t Tanne r
stops resisting the Life Force. Both are exteriors and both suggestive. Act 3,
which contains both the inner and outer plays, is set along a road that is so
remote that i t could be anywhere at any time, even eternity; whereas Act 4
removes us from the road, suggesting we have reached our destination, and
locates us in the garden of a Spanish villa. It is here that the service to Life
Force i s finally acknowledged, an d th e garde n suggest s th e mythologica l
starting point of man's evolutionary journey, the Garden of Eden.

Earlier, referenc e wa s made t o F . W. P. McDowell's clai m tha t withou t
the inne r an d oute r play s th e titl e i s "mer e quip : 'Superman ' coul d onl y
have referenc e t o th e woma n wh o overrule s th e man. " Bu t eve n a  mere
Shavian quip can have great depth and profundity, an d in this case the title
is a  parado x whic h work s o n a  numbe r o f levels . I n th e oute r play ,
McDowell's qui p i s operative . Th e titl e differentiate s Tanne r an d An n -
man and woman, man and Superman - th e former th e involuntary slave of
shortsighted persona l aims , th e latte r th e voluntar y servan t o f th e lon g
range need s o f th e Lif e Force . I n th e inne r play , i t bot h combine s ma n
(Tanner) and Superman (Do n Juan) intellectually, as well as differentiatin g
them physically: man (corporeal , mortal, inhabitant of the real world these
characters have left behind ) and Superman (incorporeal , immortal , inhabi-
tant o f the eterna l world o f ideas) . Finally, this paradox connect s the two
plays. The outer play is set in the real world of man, while the inner play is



Cambridge Companions Online © Cambridge University Press, 2006

Man and Superman and Major Barbara

set in the eterna l world o f the Superman , and the title expresses the basi c
conflict inheren t both in the play and in Shaw's evolving philosophy of the
purposes and goals of man and Superman.

Thus, as Michael Holroyd puts it, "the message of Man and Superman is
that biological progress must precede intellectual development."7 However,
Shaw's next play, the mystical John Bull's Other Island, deal t despairingl y
with the relationships between his native Ireland and adopted England, and
perhaps i t was the intractabilit y o f thi s relationship (stil l apparen t today )
that led him to make another attempt to address man's abilities to influence
this world . Thre e year s afte r Man  and  Superman,  Sha w wrot e a  mor e
worldly and radical version of the demands of Creative Evolution in Major
Barbara.

UNDERSHAFT: My religion? Well, my dear, I am a Millionaire. That is my
religion.

(Major Barbara, Collected Plays, vol. in, p. i n )

If Man and Superman argues the limits of intellectual salvation unti l our
bodies catc h u p with ou r brains , Major  Barbara argue s th e possibilit y o f
religious an d economi c salvation ; o r mor e exactl y th e dependenc e o f th e
former upo n th e latter . Sha w i s still acknowledgin g th e limitation s o f th e
body and man's temporal/corporeal inabilitie s to change the world; but, as
with Strake r i n th e earlie r play , h e i s acknowledgin g th e powe r o f
machinery (economics ) t o do the job, if we are willing to le t i t and suffe r
the dislocation of the consequences, including the need to disown our own
middle-class morality: "That is what is wrong with the world a t present. It
scraps it s obsolet e stea m engine s an d dynamos ; bu t i t won t scra p it s old
prejudices an d it s ol d moralitie s an d it s old religion s .  . . Dont persis t i n
that folly . I f you r ol d religio n brok e dow n yesterday , ge t a  newe r an d a
better one for tomorrow" (p. 171).

Again, the basic structure o f the play is triangular: Barbara Undershaft ,
the Salvation Army lass who is a true believe r in her ability to do good in
"the worl d a s i t is" ; he r fiance,  Adolphu s Cusins , tor n betwee n love ,
religion, an d classica l though t a s the mean s t o serv e mankin d an d henc e
not quit e committin g t o any ; an d he r father , Andre w Undershaft , who ,
whatever we may think o f it , has a functional philosoph y for dealin g with
the realities of this world, where poverty is "the worst of crimes" (p. 172).
(As i n Don  Juan  in  Hell,  thi s triangl e i s supplemente d wit h a  Philistin e
ground wire in the character of Lady Britomart.)

However, while the triangle in Major Barbara is not difficult t o see, it has
proven almos t impossibl e fo r man y t o accept , fo r Sha w frame s th e
argument paradoxically, making the merchant of death and destruction the
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Superman voic e o f reaso n an d progress , and th e ange l o f religiou s mercy
the Devilish voice of the easy and ineffective. Just as Tanner must learn the
transitory nature of ideas, so Barbara finally realizes that to honestly bring
salvation t o others , she must first get "rid o f the bribe of bread " (p . 184),
and, by logical extension, the need for it . Finally, in this triangle it is Cusins
who i s th e Objec t o f thi s debate , synthesizin g bot h side s b y comin g t o
understand Plato' s paradox tha t "societ y can not b e saved unti l eithe r the
Professors o f Gree k tak e t o makin g gunpowder , o r els e th e maker s o f
gunpowder become Professors of Greek" (p. 178).

Undershaft, whos e morality and religion "must have a place for cannons
and torpedoe s i n it" (p . 90), is Shaw's greatest radical , and a s such a  true
Shavian Superman. Possibly more than any other Shavian character, Under-
shaft engender s critical disagreement and discussion, even among the other
characters i n the play who cal l him "wicked " and "immoral " and refe r t o
him i n Devilis h term s suc h a s "Mephistopheles " an d "Th e Princ e o f
Darkness." A  touchston e o f Shavia n Realism , h e force s u s t o confron t
Shaw's premise that to truly serve the Life Force in "the world as it is," one
must hav e Andrew' s ruthles s philosophy , fait h i n destruction , an d under -
standing o f th e nee d fo r an d sanctit y o f th e dolla r whic h destructio n
engenders. In three short years, Shaw has moved from a n association with
Tanner, th e younge r lover/husband/pamphletee r ineffectuall y an d selfishl y
saving hi s bachelorhood , t o a n associatio n wit h Undershaft , th e matur e
mentor/father/doer savin g souls by making guns.8

Barbara, on the other hand, is a Shavian Idealist who is also recognizable
as the Devil in the play's triangle. While Shaw begins the play with Barbara
as the focus, with her conflict betwee n religion and action prefiguring Saint
Joan, slowly Undershaft come s to dominate the play, until i n the final act
Barbara i s almost los t in the battl e betwee n Andrew and Cusins , as Dona
Ana i s lost between Don Juan an d the Devil . (I t is interesting to note tha t
although it is Barbara who is the title character, Shaw originally thought to
call th e pla y Andrew  Under  shafts Profession,)  In thi s regard , th e tw o
worlds o f Major  Barbara paralle l th e two worlds o f Man  and Superman.
Like Ann , Barbar a i s th e Superma n o f he r earthl y domain , bu t sh e ha s
moved beyond Ann, whose domain was strictly private - th e domesticity of
the drawing room - t o dominance in both her private and public worlds -
the drawin g roo m an d th e Salvatio n Arm y yard . However , bot h ar e
temporal domains, and in Perivale St. Andrews, a world where true change
can b e effected , Barbara , lik e An n i n Hell , i s helpless an d overwhelmed .
Although sh e declares herself read y to actively serve Andrew's philosophy,
our las t vie w o f he r i s on e o f childishness : "Mamma ! Mamma ! I  wan t
Mamma" (p. 184).
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13 Fro m "Hell" to "Heaven": the triangle of Jim Mezon as Adolphus Cusins, Martha Burns
as Barbara Undershaft, and Douglas Rain as Andrew Undershaft in the Shaw Festival's 1987

production of Major Barbara

As i n Man  and  Superman,  Major  Barbara  appears t o follo w th e neo -
classical unity of time, without the separate world o f eternity: Act 1  takes
place in the evening, Act 2  in the morning, Act 3  in the afternoon. But , as
before and underscoring Andrew's call for scrapping the old, this is not the
classical twenty-fou r hou r da y bu t rathe r thre e successiv e ones . Th e
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locations also serve Shaw, and Barbara and Andrew's domains may be seen
literally as Hell and Heaven. Unlike the ironic Hell of eternity, the Salvation
Army yar d i s a  litera l Hel l -  dirt y an d poverty-stricke n -  wher e th e
Salvation Army preaches acceptance o f the earthly status  quo, and,  giving
in to its corporeal needs, shortsightedly takes money for its immediate ends
with n o realizatio n o f lon g term ruin . Similarly , it s clientele exis t onl y in
"the worl d a s i t is, " and wil l d o an d sa y anything fo r immediat e relie f -
both hypocritically , like Rummy Mitchums and Snobb y Price, or sincerely
but ineffectually, lik e Peter Shirley and Bill Walker. Paradoxically, Barbara ,
the only one to see beyond the immediate need for money, is "cast out" of
this Hell as Satan was from Heaven , echoing Jesus' words: "My God: why
hast thou forsaken me?" (p. 136).

Perivale St . Andrews , o n th e othe r hand , i s a  litera l hillto p Heave n -
clean, financially sound, and because of the nature of what i s done there -
destruction -  rip e fo r salvation ; Cusin s tell s u s tha t "i t need s onl y a
Cathedral t o b e a  heavenl y city " (p . 158) . It i s only th e Philistines , Lady
Britomart an d Charle s Lomax , wh o dar e expres s hypocris y here , an d
Andrew's othe r tw o biologica l children , Sara h an d Stephen , bot h sho w
themselves rip e fo r thei r father' s for m o f salvation. 9 I t i s here wher e th e
needs of serving the Life Force can be properly debated and a realistic plan
of actio n -  Cusins' s inheritanc e -  pu t forward . (Th e third location , Lad y
Britomart's drawin g room, is simply a middle ground, where the domestic
issues which drive the plot are discussed and resolved.)

However, while it is easy to see the literal uses of the settings, the Hell of
the grim y an d hypocritica l Salvatio n Arm y yar d an d th e Heave n o f th e
hilltop overlooking the paradise of Perivale St. Andrews, it is also possible
to look at these settings figuratively, and as such relate them closer to Man
and Superman. In this view, the Salvation Army yard is the "world as it is,"
where ou r corporea l need s preven t u s fro m dealin g wit h th e ide a o f ou r
salvation in any but self-serving ways; and the hilltop overlooking Perivale
St. Andrews is, ironically, Hell, the Hell of Don Juan and the Devil, which
is a place t o debat e idea s bu t no t institut e them . Accordingly , th e unsee n
town of Perivale St. Andrews is the same as the unseen Heaven of Man and
Superman - th e actual laboratory or crucible where the work of raising the
species goes forth; and in the end Barbara and Cusins, like Juan, commit to
it.10

From thi s perspective , thes e tw o play s for m th e literatur e o f Shaw' s
religion of Creative Evolution: Man and Superman being the gospel of the
Life Forc e an d Major  Barbara  bein g the parabl e o f th e word mad e flesh.
Just a s An n Whitefiel d mus t triump h i n thi s worl d s o Do n Jua n ma y
triumph i n th e next , Andre w Undershaf t mus t first  triumph s o Adolphus
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Cusins (aide d b y his wife) ca n late r triumph b y bringing true religious and
humanistic concern s t o th e powe r o f Andrew' s economi c engine . Bu t i n
Major Barbara,  Sha w i s shortenin g th e tim e frame , an d throug h hi s
Superman o f this world, Andrew, saying that the only way to shorten i t to
our lifetimes i s to "make war on war" (p. 178), through radical and violent
means:

Poverty and slavery have stood up for centuries to your sermons . . . they will
not stan d u p to my machine guns . Dont preac h a t them: don t reaso n wit h
them. Kill them . . . When you shoot, you pull down governments, inaugurate
new epochs, abolish old orders and set up new. (p . 174)

Turn you r ought s int o shalls , man . Come an d mak e explosive s wit h me.
Whatever can blow men up can blow society up. The history of the world is
the history of those who had courage enough to embrace this truth, (p . 175)

Major Barbara  can b e see n a s Shaw' s mos t realisti c an d radica l play ,
perhaps hi s most despairing . Blo w i t al l up and star t over , he seems to b e
saying; radica l chang e i s necessar y an d withou t i t w e ca n onl y wai t an d
hope for the long haul of Creative Evolution. To accomplish any significan t
change now will require much more than bread and treacle, erudite knowl-
edge of dead languages and ideas, or even conventional moral horror.

However, althoug h h e woul d late r becom e fascinate d b y wha t h e
perceived a s attempts t o d o s o on bot h th e politica l lef t (Stali n i n Russia )
and the political right (Mussolin i in Italy), at heart Shaw knew that neithe r
he nor we really want to take so radical a step, and thus we must continue
to serv e the Lif e Forc e an d awai t th e slow, continual progres s o f Creativ e
Evolution.

NOTES
1 Al l quotations are from The  Bodley Head Bernard Shaw: Collected Plays with

Their Prefaces, vols . 11 (Man  and Superman) and m (Major  Barbara), ed . Dan
H. Laurence (London: Max Reinhardt, The Bodley Head, 1971).

2 Fo r a fuller discussio n o f these terms and their applicatio n to specific Shavia n
characters, see Arthur H. Nethercot, Men and Supermen: The  Shavian Portrait
Gallery (Cambridge, MA: Harvard University Press, 1954).

3 Marger y M . Morgan, The  Shavian Playground: An  Exploration of the Art of
George Bernard Shaw (London : Methuen , 1972) , p. 100. The reference i s to
F. P. W. McDowell, "Heaven , Hel l an d Turn-of-the-Century London : Reflec -
tions upo n Shaw' s Man  and Superman" Drama  Survey  2 , no . 3  (Februar y
1963), PP. 245-68.

4 Eri c Bentley , Bernard  Shaw (reprin t edn. , New York: Prosceniu m Publishers ,
1975), p. 170 .

5 Ibid.,  p. 170 .
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6 S o long as Juan is expressing Shaw, his arguments are logical and cogent; when
Shaw trie s t o expres s Juan , whe n h e turn s t o earthl y male-femal e relations ,
marriage an d fidelity, the arguments become weak an d a t times foolish. Juan' s
speech beginnin g "'Perfectly ' i s a  stron g expression " (p . 671) , i s a  perfec t
example o f th e hole s in Shaw' s thinking. He compares a  married coupl e with
galley prisoners , bu t despit e Tanner' s claim s t o bein g railroade d b y th e Lif e
Force (whic h ma y ver y wel l b e a  reflectio n o f Shaw' s feeling s abou t hi s own
marriage), one hardly exercises as much choice in entering prison as one does in
entering marriage , an d marrie d couple s ar e no t selecte d randomly , a s Sha w
acknowledges that prisoners are: "chain me to the felon whose number happens
to be next before mine" (italics mine). Moreover, an incompatible marriage can
be ended , bu t eve n Sha w can't  believ e jailer s t o b e tha t accommodatin g t o
incompatible galle y companions . Eve n i f Sha w i s merel y arguin g fo r th e
freedom t o remain married bu t change one's sex partner, the prison analogy is
pointless: th e prisoner s aren' t fre e t o briefl y ro w wit h anothe r partner ; it' s a
monogamous relationship . Finally , th e las t lin e o f th e speec h i s th e mos t
ridiculous; no one pretends a prisoner is happy, that's why he's still in chains. As
Shaw himsel f states , prisoners hav e only "accepte d th e inevitable, " which i s a
far cry from being happy.

7 Michae l Holroyd , Bernard  Shaw: The  Pursuit  of  Power,  1889-1918  (Ne w
York: Random House, 1989), p. 78.

8 Fo r a  fulle r discussio n o f thi s approac h t o Andrew , se e Anthon y S . Abbott ,
"Assault o n Idealism : Major  Barbara,"  in Ros e Zimbard o (ed.) , Twentieth
Century Interpretations of Major Barbara (Englewood Cliffs, NJ: Prentice-Hall,
1970), pp. 42-57.

9 However , in order to become an active part of Perivale St. Andrews's salvation,
one mus t embrac e it s violen t methods . Barbar a i s described , i n explosiv e
imagery, as having gone "right up into the skies" (p. 185), and Sarah, a character
who mos t commentator s ar e a t a  los s t o explai n a s anythin g mor e tha n
decorative, become s a n Undershaf t whe n sh e announces he r willingness to le t
her bod y b e blow n up , a t whic h momen t Andrew , he r fathe r an d "savior, "
appears to first see her as a person:

LOMAX: Your own daughter, you know!
UNDERSHAFT: S o I  see. (p . 179 )

10 Fo r thos e wh o migh t wonde r ho w thi s could b e played o n stage , I  offer tw o
examples from a  recent production I  directed. Near the end of the play, when
Bilton refuse s Andrew , wh o i s carryin g Lomax' s matches , admissio n t o th e
gunpowder shed , Andrew replies, "here you are" (p. 179), and, in Shaw's stage
directions, give s th e matche s t o th e workman . Instead , Andre w crosse d t o
Cusins and, saying the line, offered hi m the matches - obviousl y the symbolic
keys to the kingdom - whic h Cusins, after hesitating , accepted. Similarly, at the
end o f th e play , rathe r tha n al l remainin g o n stag e fo r Andrew' s las t line ,
Barbara shooe d Cusin s an d th e other s of f t o hous e hun t wit h her , leavin g
Andrew alon e o n stag e t o knowingl y say , "Si x o'cloc k tomorro w morning ,
Euripides" (p. 185), leaving no doubt that the flustered Cusin s would be there at
Andrew's command.
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"Nothing bu t talk, talk, talk - Sha w
talk": Discussion Plays and the making

of modern dram a

In 1890 , before h e even began his career a s a playwright, Sha w identifie d
what h e considere d t o b e the definin g qualit y fo r a  new , non-traditiona l
form o f drama. From Aristotle on, action had been the core of drama; now
Ibsen offered a  radically different model . In The Quintessence of Ibsenism
Shaw presented Ibsen as a socialist and a realist, whose naturalistic drama
exposed all collective abstractions as damaging illusions, and promoted the
"individual will " against "th e tyranny o f ideals. " But beyond this , the key
factor wa s that instead o f the standard final-Act climax, Ibsen's characters
sat dow n an d talked . Th e clas h o f opinio n replace d physica l conflict , s o
that a play's resolution was the outcome of discussion.

As with s o much o f Shaw' s writing , al l thi s ma y see m a n idiosyncrati c
distortion o f it s subject , bu t reveal s a  grea t dea l abou t it s author . Th e
pamphlet wa s publishe d i n 1892 , shortly befor e hi s first play Widowers'
Houses appeared, and served as a manifesto fo r hi s theatrical aims . When
Shaw delivere d i t a s on e o f th e lecture s fo r a  Fabia n Societ y serie s o n
"Socialism i n Contemporar y Literature " tw o year s earlie r "Th e Quintes -
sence o f Ibsenism " ha d a  mor e immediat e target ; an d it s politic s wer e
deliberately provocative in attacking the collectivist beliefs of other leading
Fabians, such as Annie Besant (who had chaired Shaw's lecture) and Sidney
Webb. However, the switch from actio n to discussion , that Sha w detected
in Ibsen' s work , correspond s wit h th e fundamenta l Fabia n approac h t o
social change . Name d afte r Fabiu s Cuncator , th e Roma n genera l wh o
defeated Hannibal' s superio r force s b y avoidin g battle , th e movemen t
sought to reform societ y from within , by education, rejecting th e violence
of open revolution. And when carried over into drama, this commitment to
the political effectiveness o f intellectual persuasion i s exactly analogous to
resolving a  play's action throug h dialogue . Ibsen thu s become s the proto-
type for a  specifically Fabia n form of theatre - an d indeed Shaw makes the
connection explici t b y including the bust of Ibsen in the setting for on e of
his early plays, The Philanderer.
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But these Ibsenite qualities also become the basis for Shaw' s drama i n a
far more direct way. In fact The  Quintessence of Ibsenism could be seen as
a blueprin t fo r th e element s tha t ar e mos t quintessentiall y Shavia n i n
Shaw's plays. The internal political argument over Fabian principles carried
over into some of his major themes : the fallacies of idealism being ridiculed
or demolishe d fro m Arms  and  the Man and The  Devil's  Disciple  to Saint
Joan, while the moral primacy of the individual will forms the basis for the
concept o f the Superman , which i s expressed i n the characterization o f so
many o f hi s protagonists . Th e preferenc e fo r dialogu e ove r plo t i s eve n
more central , sinc e i t lead s t o th e on e uniqu e theatrica l for m tha t Sha w
evolved: the Discussion Play.

Shaw was continually experimenting with theatrical form throughout his
long career a s a playwright: inverting melodrama, reshaping the historica l
chronicle-play, exploring musical structures, creating social and sublimina l
parallels in the outer and inner plays of Man and Superman, expanding the
limits o f performanc e i n his eight-hour "metabiologica l pentateuch " Back
to Methuselah.  Bu t al l o f thes e experiment s eithe r rel y o n pre-existin g
forms, o r have analogues in other contemporary dram a o f the period. The
only distinc t theatrica l for m Sha w originate d wa s wha t h e labele d th e
"Disquisitory Play." The first to be given this subtitle was Getting  Married
in 1908 ; and thi s i s closely linked to Shaw's next majo r play , Misalliance,
completed in 1909 though not staged until 1910 and originally subtitled "A
Debate in One Sitting."

It i s striking tha t thes e hav e received les s critical attentio n tha n an y of
Shaw's other major plays . This may be partly due to the fact that followin g
their firs t performance s the y almos t vanishe d fro m th e stag e unti l afte r
Shaw's death . Eve n Misalliance,  whic h ha s achieved a  major plac e i n the
repertory ove r th e las t twent y years , only ra n fo r eleve n performance s i n
1910. Apar t fro m a n America n productio n i n 191 7 i t ha d jus t tw o brie f
revivals i n Englan d (193 0 an d 193 9 -  t o respectfu l bu t puzzle d reviews) ;
and i t was not unti l 1953 , when a  production was mounted o n Broadway,
that i t first  enjoye d publi c success . Ye t thes e tw o play s hav e a  centra l
position i n Shaw' s work, an d mar k a  culmination o f Shaw' s developmen t
over the first half of his career. Although several short plays - The  Shewing
Up of  Blanco  Posnet,  The  Glimpse  of  Reality,  Press  Cuttings and The
Fascinating Foundling -  interven e betwee n Shaw' s writin g o f Getting
Married and Misalliance,  thes e were clearly conceived a s a pair; and the y
are th e fulles t expressio n bot h o f subject s whic h ha d bee n preoccupyin g
Shaw since his first novel, and of the style of drama which Shaw had been
evolving over several of his preceding plays. At the same time, both were so
far from th e theatrical norms of the first half of the century as to be almost
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automatically disqualifie d fro m dramati c criticism . In fact thes e play s are
among Shaw's most extreme stylistic experiments.

They represen t suc h a different approac h t o dramati c constructio n tha t
the reviewer s of the tim e wer e unabl e to understand them . Indee d i t has
been argued that the vision of existence incorporated i n Misalliance had to
wait until the absurdist drama of Ionesco had been accepted, before it could
be appreciated. 1 Ye t the experimenta l natur e of each pla y wa s effectuall y
disguised b y its apparently normativ e surface . Thi s was clearly deliberate .
Even more than wit h hi s earlier plays , Shaw controlled ever y detai l of the
first Londo n productions , includin g recognizabl y naturalisti c settings ,
which h e designed himself : a twelfth-century Norma n hal l entirely appro-
priate to an episcopal palace; a very contemporary Edwardian conservatory
attached to a nouveau-ricbe mansion in Surrey. In fact, (tongue-in-cheek )
Shaw even summarized Getting  Married as a stock farce, pointing out:

It is the wedding day of the bishop's daughter. The situation is expounded in
the old stage fashion b y that old stage figure the comic greengrocer, hired for
the occasio n a s a butler . . . The fun grows fas t an d furiou s a s the guest s
arrive, invited and uninvited, with the most distracting malaprosity. 2

With such a stylistic contradiction, it is perhaps hardly surprising that the
initial critica l reaction was (a s Shaw accurately described it ) "violen t press
hostility." By contrast Shaw always claimed that the public was appreciative.
Thus at the openin g of Getting Married "There wa s a splendid audience ;
and th e excitement wa s immense " -  whil e th e critics "almos t withou t
exception, in articles of great length , assured th e public tha t th e play ha d
been a n unexample d failure ; tha t it was intolerabl e an d monstrousl y dull ;
that it was not a play at all; that it was . . . unintelligible" (accusations that
Shaw late r parodie d in Fanny's First Flay)? Typica l comment s wer e tha t
Shaw ha d "degenerated int o dullnes s fo r the very reaso n tha t h e is s o
tremendrously i n earnest" (The  World  on Getting Married) , or reduced
drama to the "debating society of a lunatic asylum - without a motion, and
without a chairman. . . What [th e characters] do is of little importance. . .
they d o no t kee p to the poin t becaus e there is no poin t to keep to" (The
Times on Misalliance). Later critic s wer e equall y negative , bu t fro m the
opposite perspective, for instance dismissing Misalliance as "a tolerably dull
entertainment base d on an aimless narrative."4 It is only very recently that
their significance has been realized, but they still count as "Neglected Plays"
(the title of the 1987 Annual of Bernard Shaw Studies).

Shaw's plays attack a remarkably wide range of issues, from specifi c abuses
like rack-renting an d medica l malpractice , through socio-economi c force s
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like industria l capitalis m o r imperialism , t o philosophica l generalitie s lik e
eugenics an d th e conflic t betwee n intellectua l an d biologica l imperatives .
However, the subject o f Getting  Married and Misalliance  is a topic that he
returns t o mor e frequentl y tha n an y other . Indeed , thi s subjec t underlie s
most of Shaw's other concerns because of his choice of comedy as a vehicle,
with it s traditional focu s o n love relationships leading to marriage; and in
fact i t could be argued tha t Sha w chose the standard comic form precisel y
because it deal t wit h this . The marriage law s - an d contemporar y Parlia -
mentary debate s o n marrie d women' s propert y -  ha d alread y fuele d th e
action i n Shaw' s novel , The  Irrational  Knot  (writte n i n 1880) , wher e
various femal e character s advis e the heroine . On e makes the (deliberatel y
shocking) equatio n betwee n "respectable " marriage "t o secure ourselves a
home an d a n income " and "wha t w e - bles s our virtuou s indignations ! -
stigmatize a s prostitution. I  don' t mean ever to be married, I  can tell you,
Marian. I would rather die than sell myself forever to a man." Another - a n
actress, ironicall y dresse d i n hare m costum e -  propose s th e solutio n o f
monogamy without marriage, having "refused, a s any decent woman in my
circumstances would" to "make a regular legal bargain of going to live with
a man. I don't care to make love a matter of money; it gives it a taste of the
harem. .  ." Ignoring their advice, Marian experiences the loss of economic
and psychologica l independenc e i n marriage , whic h force s he r t o see k a
divorce an d lead s he r t o ru n awa y t o Americ a wher e "On e ca n ge t fre e
without sacrificin g everythin g except bare existence. .  . our marriage laws
are shameful." 5

Mrs Warren's  Profession  thirteen year s late r pick s u p directl y o n th e
marriage/prostitution comparison , whil e th e immediatel y precedin g play ,
The Philanderer  (also written i n 1893 ) ls  a n illustratio n o f "th e grotesque
sexual compact s mad e betwee n me n an d women " whic h sprin g fro m th e
current "marriag e laws." 6 Notoriously , it s dramati c situatio n an d mai n
characters als o mirro r Shaw' s persona l life , wit h th e Ne w Woma n bein g
based on the jealously possessive Jenny Patterson - Shaw' s first and possibly
only sexual lover - an d the fleeing "philanderer " as a very Shavian critic of
idealism, describe d i n th e pla y a s "th e famou s Ibsenis t philosopher "
(Collected Plays, vol. 1, p. 156). The original Act 3 of The Philanderer - cu t
because Shaw came to realize that " I have started on quite a new trail and
must reserv e thi s ac t fo r th e beginnin g o f a  ne w play " -  ha s bee n calle d
Shaw's first attemp t a t a  discussion play. The whole of this deleted section
focused o n th e issu e o f divorce . Again , a s i n The  Irrational  Knot,  th e
characters decid e t o leav e fo r Americ a t o avoi d th e intolerabl e lega l
requirements fo r divorcin g i n Britain ; an d th e dialogu e clearl y form s th e
basis for one of the situations in Getting Married.
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PARAMORE: .  . . Julia doesn't care a button for me, and never did. We have no
children: she has money enough of her own to be quite independent from me:
there's no reason why we shouldn't remarry and make ourselves comfortable.
Unfortunately ou r pig-headed law provides no decent way of doing this . . .

CHARTERIS: .  . . Couldn't you give her a harmless smack in the presence of a
witness and elope with some lady who has no character to lose and who
would stay at a hotel under your name for a consideration . . .

PARAMORE: No. I'd rather defy the law openly than circumvent it by a squalid
farce involving the degradation of a third party. 7

The course of action indignantly rejected her e has been carried ou t by one
of the couples in Getting Married, fifteen years later. Nothing has changed;
and the opprobrium is emphasized by the reaction of other characters, who
fail t o realize th e wife' s collusion , whil e th e contras t betwee n honorabl e
motives an d publi c sham e reveal s th e lega l requirement s fo r divorce as
ludicrously unreasonable:

REGINALD: (out  of patience) Whats the good of beating your wife unless there's
a witness to prove it afterwards? Yo u dont suppose a man beats his wife for
the fun of it, do you? How could she have got her divorce if I hadnt beaten
her? Nice state of things that!
. . . I  had to go to Brighton with a poor creature who took a fancy to me on
the way down, and got conscientious scruples about committing perjury afte r
dinner. I had to put her down in the hotel book as Mrs. Reginald
Bridgenorth. . . Do you know what that feels like to a decent man? Do you
know what a decent man feels about his wife's name? How would you like to
go into a hotel before all the waiters and people with - with that on your
arm? Not that it was the poor girl's fault, of course: only she started crying
because I couldnt stand her touching me; and now she keeps writing to me.
And then I'm held up in the public court for cruelty and turned away from
Edith's wedding. [Collected  Plays, vol. in, pp. 568-69)

While thi s migh t wel l soun d simpl y comi c - particularl y today , whe n
divorce is almost on demand and free from socia l stigma, even in England -
the preface t o the play emphasizes the reality an d seriousnes s of the legal
problems a t th e time, an d a 193 3 Postscript affirm s it s continuin g
relevance, sinc e legislativ e reform s ha d stil l no t addresse d th e underlyin g
problem. In fact prefaces have a special role in the Discussion Play, with the
ancillary materia l attache d t o Getting  Married  and Misalliance being
among the most fully develope d examples of Shaw's practice. In each case
they were written three to four years after the play itself, and (like the rest of
the prefaces) adde d for commercia l reasons: to give each three-play collec-
tion a  page-length comparabl e to a serious novel , thus no t onl y allowin g
them to be published for a viable retur n bu t als o encouragin g reader s to
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approach plays as significant literature , rather than ephemeral performanc e
scripts. However, unlike Shaw's early prefaces, they are neither straightfor -
ward introductions to the material of the plays, nor part of his campaign to
establish th e publi c person a o f "G.B.S. " Wit h Man  and  Superman  th e
ironic "Dedication" an d the appendix o f "The Revolutionist' s Handbook "
become semi-fictiona l extension s o f th e dram a o n a  differen t plane : th e
"Handbook" supposedl y bein g th e publishe d politica l maxim s o f th e
intellectual geniu s i n th e play . Bu t th e preface s writte n fo r bot h Getting
Married an d Misalliance  ar e eac h considerabl y longe r tha n th e play s
themselves.8 While addressin g th e primar y topi c o f conversatio n betwee n
the character s -  indee d pickin g u p o n specifi c point s i n thei r arguments ,
and (particularl y i n Getting  Married)  even echoin g specifi c phrase s fro m
the dialogue - the y also cover a far wider spectrum of related issues.

Each preface ha s betwee n fifty and sevent y sections , with heading s tha t
range fro m definin g th e topi c ("Wha t doe s th e Wor d Marriag e Mean?" /
"What i s a Child?") and outlining the problem ("Th e Economic Slavery of
Women"/"The Manufacture of Monsters") to suggesting solutions ("Wanted:
An Immoral Statesman" ; "Divorc e a  Sacramenta l Duty"/"W e mus t refor m
Society befor e w e ca n refor m Ourselves" ; "Wanted : a  Child' s Magn a
Charta"). Notably these solutions contradict the dramatic resolutions arrived
at b y the character s i n the plays . For instance , the variou s couple s spen d
much o f Getting  Married  attempting (wit h th e bes t lega l an d religiou s
advice) to draw up a "private contract" on the model of "ancient Rome" as a
replacement for standard marriage - on e of the key recommendations in the
preface (Collected Plays, vol. in, p. 492) - only to find the task impossible:

s o AMES : (after a silence of utter deadlock) I am still awaiting my
instructions .  . .
(rising with the paper in his hands) Psha! (He tears it in pieces) So much for
your contract! (Collected  Flays, vol. m, p. 621)

These preface s als o mov e beyon d th e play s i n othe r ways , comparin g
oriental an d occidenta l variant s o f polygam y o r discussin g Darwinia n
theories o f natura l selection , an d analyzin g th e socia l cause s o f th e
characters' problem s tha t b y definitio n li e outsid e thei r consciousness .
Among these, the most striking to a modern eye are the connections Shaw
draws betwee n th e famil y an d imperialism , o r betwee n childhoo d educa -
tion and economic exploitation.

The preface s ar e clearl y intende d t o counterbalanc e th e comed y o f th e
dramatic representation ; an d Sha w deliberatel y attempt s t o shoc k th e
readers wit h overstatement s -  fo r instanc e i n assertin g tha t "marriag e
enjoys th e credi t o f a  domesti c peace which i s hardly mor e intimat e tha n
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the relation s o f prisoners i n the same gaol " (Collected  Plays,  vol . in,
p. 476) - or Swiftian "modes t proposals" such as:

I have more than once thought of trying to introduce the shooting of children
as a  sport , a s the children woul d the n b e preserved ver y carefull y [lik e
pheasants] fo r te n months i n the year , thereby reducin g thei r deat h rat e far
more than the fusillades of the sportsmen during the other two would raise it.

(Collected Plays, vol. iv, p. 101)

At the sam e time, se t side by side with th e prefaces , th e play s are clearly
ways of humanizing the issues, giving them an individual dimension - even
though on that level the social problems are insoluble.

At firs t glanc e th e two preface s woul d see m t o indicate tha t Getting
Married an d Misalliance  deal wit h differen t subjects : the Marriage an d
Divorce Law s versus Children' s Right s an d Education . Bu t closer readin g
shows tha t thes e ar e a continuum, complementar y aspect s o f the sam e
topic: famil y lif e a s the immediate sourc e o f socia l exploitatio n and
inequality. The first preface raise s issues that ar e pursued a t greater lengt h
in th e second , as with a  characteristically Shavia n critiqu e o f all Britis h
personal relationships as slavery: "The theory that the wife i s the property
of the husband o r the husband o f the wife i s not a whit less abhorrent an d
mischievous tha n th e theor y tha t th e chil d i s the propert y of the parent .
Parental bondag e wil l go the way of conjugal bondage " (Collected  Plays,
vol. in , p. 540) . I n the same way , th e second prefac e refer s bac k to
arguments made in the first: for instanc e the destructive effec t o f idealized
visions of marriage (Collected Plays, vol. iv, p. 138). And there is crossover
too between the dialogue of one play and the preface o f the other, as when
the would-b e philosophe r tycoo n o f Misalliance denies tha t hi s philan -
dering makes him "a bad husband . I' m not . Bu t Ive a superabundance o f
vitality. Read Pepys' Diary" (Collected Plays, vol. iv, p. 197). This gnomic
apostrophe to Pepys is only explainabl e b y a comment in the prefac e to
Getting Married: "I f we take a document like Pepys' Diary, we learn that a
woman may have an incorrigibly unfaithful husband , and yet be better of f
than if she had ill-tempered .  . . one, or was chained for life to a criminal, a
drunkard, or a lunatic" (Collected Plays, vol. 111, p. 515). The plays are also
explicitly linke d a s steps in a single lin e o f stylistic development . I n a n
"interview" (drafted b y Shaw as self-promotion a  week before the opening
of Getting  Married) Shaw pointed out that the play is closely related to the
"Dream of Don Juan i n Hell" from Man  and Superman,  which ha d bee n
performed separatel y at the Court Theatre the previous year - an expansion
of th e sam e stati c disquisitor y technique , bu t withou t th e musi c whic h
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structures the argument betwee n Don Juan and the Devil (Collected Plays,
vol. in , p . 665) . A similar "interview " whic h followe d th e productio n o f
Misalliance emphasized the parallels with Getting Married, presenting both
plays as examples of "the higher drama" (Collected Plays, vol. iv, p. 257).

Indeed, the overall form o f each is almost identical. Both are designed to
be played without interva l - althoug h for Misalliance  Shaw noted that "As
the debat e i s a  lon g one , th e curtai n wil l b e lowere d twice " fo r th e
"convenience" o f the audience , who were asked "t o excuse these interrup-
tions" (Collected  Plays, vol . iv , p . 11) . I n bot h almos t al l th e physica l
activities which would be high points in conventional drama are deliberately
kept offstage . Thu s the wedding o f th e young engage d couple , which on e
would expec t t o b e the clima x o f an y pla y entitle d Getting  Married,  not
only takes place behind the scenes, but comes as a surprise when it is finally
reported sinc e the las t time they were seen the would-be brid e an d groo m
had both been declaring marriage impossible (an d indeed since none of the
other character s ar e awar e the y hav e left , w e ar e no t eve n suppose d t o
notice their absence). Even in Misalliance - whic h appears at first glance to
have far more physical activity with an airplane crashing into the roof of the
conservatory, a  courtship carrie d ou t a s a  litera l chase , and a n acroba t a s
one of the leading characters, to say nothing of the standard melodramati c
scene o f a  desperat e revolutionar y thrustin g a  pisto l int o th e fac e o f th e
capitalist tycoon with lurid oaths of vengeance (in advice to the actor Shaw
stressed th e rhetorica l natur e o f these speeches) -  wha t w e see on stag e is
merely anticlimactic . The tycoon i s completely unfaze d b y the pistol , an d
the confused revolutionar y disarme d without effort . Acrobatic s are limited
to a  discussion o f jugglin g oranges while reading a  Bible , while an y more
strenuous display s take place ou t o f sigh t i n a  gymnasium; and al l we are
shown i s the exhaustio n o f th e men a s each return s fro m thei r "exercise "
with th e fascinating femal e acrobat . The chase may star t an d finish in the
conservatory, bu t it s climax i n which th e pursue r become s the pursue d i s
reached wa y outsid e o n a  hilltop . A s fo r th e plan e cras h -  notionall y a s
spectacular a s anything the modern megamusical could offer, combinin g as
it does the helicopter of Miss Saigon with the falling chandelier in Phantom
of the  Opera  - Sha w insisted tha t everything be left t o the imagination b y
using a boxful of broken glass and having the actors look up and shout.9

Denying audiences ' expectation s o f visua l spectacl e o r physica l excite -
ment i s o f cours e on e o f Shaw' s standar d techniques : th e mos t obviou s
example being the total omission of the Embassy Ball in Pygmalion which
is not only explicitly buil t up to from th e beginning of the play, but would
(if played) provide the scene of Eliza's triumph ove r the false standards  of
society, an d th e vindicatio n o f Higgins' s linguisti c educatio n a s wel l a s
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Shaw's belief in social equality. However, the two Discussion Plays take this
denial fa r further. Sha w claim s t o be matching th e theatrical purit y of
ancient Gree k dram a i n observing th e unitie s o f time an d place ; an d in
classical tragedy all physical actions are also reported instead of staged. It is
specifically fo r these two works that Shaw coins the term "a play of ideas"
- perhap s the most influential concep t for later twentieth-century theatrica l
development - an d in his view "the Gree k for m i s inevitable when drama
reaches a  certai n poin t i n poetic an d intellectual evolution " (Collected
Plays, vol. in, p . 449). Getting Married and Misalliance  are the only plays
in whic h Sha w completel y followe d thi s formula , althoug h Heartbreak
House is sometimes grouped with them as a third Discussion Play.

Claiming antiqu e model s for a future-oriented moder n for m o f drama
seems contradictory ; an d indeed Shaw' s classica l reference s ar e merely
attempts to wi n critica l suppor t fo r somethin g entirel y ne w by aligning it
with a n equally unconventiona l typ e o f theatre (b y turn-of-the-century
standards), bu t on e tha t evoke d automati c respect . This becomes obviou s
in Shaw's provocative denial that Getting Married has any plot:

If you look at any of the old editions of our classical plays, you will see that
the description of the play is not called a plot or a story, but an argument.
That exactl y describe s th e materia l o f my play . It is an argument -  an
argument lasting nearly three hours, and carried on with unflagging cerebra-
tion by twelve people and a beadle. (Collected  Plays, vol. in, p. 667-68)

However (a s Shaw would hav e been well aware) when Claudiu s demands
to know "the argument" of Hamlet's Mousetrap he is referring to the thesis
of th e play : b y contrast Shaw' s "argument " i s not a description o f the
subject of Getting Married, but its theatrical form.

To illustrate the incongruity and unnaturalness of Christian marriage and
its legal implications in England, Shaw's large cast of characters represents
a rang e of conjugal relationships . These are designe d to appear "normal "
(despite pres s accusation s o f immorality 10). Non e o f the husband s are
criminals, drunkards, o r lunatics , or even ill-tempered; the wives show no
evidence o f bein g economicall y exploited . Quit e apar t fro m seriou s
problems bein g inappropriat e to comedy, Shaw' s ai m is to show tha t th e
law canno t accommodat e th e mos t "ordinary " couples , eve n whe n the y
try wit h th e best wil l i n the world. Onl y on e of the three marrie d
pairs, howeve r happy, corresponds to the legal fiction: Collins, the caterer-
greengrocer an d hi s wife, bu t sh e is so smotheringly materna l an d single -
mindedly uxoriou s tha t hi s "childre n al l ra n awa y fro m home " while he
sees "family life " as being "in a cage." By contrast his brother's marriage is
kept "fresh" becaus e his wife (Mrs . George) is continually running off with
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other men and "the variety of experience made her wonderfully interesting "
as wel l a s providin g conversationa l partner s fo r he r husban d (Collected
Plays, vol. in, p. 553). Even the most "respectable" marriage is a menage a
trois, the Bishop (whose daughter's wedding is the excuse for gathering all
the character s together ) carryin g o n a n affai r wit h a  marrie d woma n -
though, with typical Shavian irony, it turns out that this is purely spiritua l
since th e relationshi p wit h hi s Incognit a Appassionat a wil l onl y b e con -
summated "in heaven when she has risen above all the everyday vulgarities
of earthly love" (Collected Flays, vol. in, p. 579).

These three variations on married blis s are set beside three other set s of
people at different distance s from th e altar. One of the Bishop's brothers, a
General, has proposed to Lesbia (th e sister of the Bishop's wife) nine times
over th e pas t twent y years , an d i s refuse d a  tent h tim e durin g th e pla y
because, even though she believes it her eugenic duty to have children, she
refuses to sacrifice her independence by subordinating herself to a husband,
as the law would require. The Bishop's other brother Reginald has arranged
for hi s much younge r wife , Leo , to divorc e hi m becaus e sh e has fallen i n
love with someone her own age, though in fact she wants to keep both men
and would "lik e to marry a  lot of men. .  . to have Rejjy for everyday, and
Sinj on fo r concert s an d theatre s an d goin g out i n the evenings , and som e
great austere saint for about once a year at the end of the season, and some
perfectly blitherin g idio t o f a  bo y t o b e quit e wicke d with " (Collected
Plays, vol. in, p. 572). As for the Bishop's daughter, she and her fiance have
both been sent pamphlets on the law (wit h characteristically bol d Shavian
titles: DO YOU KNOW WHAT YOU ARE GOING TO DO? B Y A WOMAN WHO HAS
DONE IT , and MEN' S WRONGS ) which hav e opened thei r respective eyes to
the impossibility of getting a divorce even if a husband becomes a murderer,
and to a husband's responsibility for his wife's debts. Since Edith is a social
activist, whos e publi c attack s o n unscrupulou s manufacturer s fo r ex -
ploiting th e femal e workforc e wil l ruin Ceci l b y heavy damage s fo r libel ,
both ar e callin g th e marriag e of f -  eve n thoug h th e churc h i s alread y
packed with waiting wedding guests.

The whol e pla y consist s o f a  serie s o f discussion s t o resolv e thes e
impasses, culminating in the unsuccessful attemp t to draw up an alternative
form o f "private " marriage contract , an d th e summonin g o f Mrs . George
(who being the Lady Mayoress i s escorted b y a Beadle "in cocked hat and
gold-braided overcoat, bearing the borough  mace") a s a  clairvoyant wit h
the powe r t o spea k throug h trance s "a s i f i t wa s th e whol e huma n rac e
giving you a  bi t o f it s mind" (Collected  Plays, vol. 111 , pp. 62 2 and 555) .
But the dramatic status of Getting  Married as an "argument" goes beyond
this. The Bishop, General, and Beadle - al l in ostentatiously ful l unifor m -
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14 Discussio n - with benefit of Clergy and Beadle, in the Shaw Festival's 1989 production
of Getting Married

represent symboli c positions, together with a  curate in cassock and birett a
standing for the law: the authorities of church, military and civil power, the
all-male hegemon y tha t uphold s th e socia l order . The y for m th e officia l
frame fo r argument , eve n i f (i n a  typica l Shavia n reversal ) a s individual s
they contradict the stereotypes, the Bishop becoming a devil's advocate and
the General' s medal s bein g th e resul t o f tryin g t o ge t himsel f kille d fo r
rejected love . And the structure of the play itself embodies a logical pattern
of antithesi s and accretion . The characters, each presenting on e postulate ,
are introduce d singly , on e afte r th e othe r -  analogou s t o a  discursiv e
sequence. A s alternativ e position s o n marriage , the y ar e juxtaposed ,
organized i n differen t combinations , an d conflate d i n a  demonstratio n o f
rational process , while th e numerica l balanc e (thre e marriages , an d thre e
unwedded relationships) represents the formality of the reasoning.

At the same time, demonstrating the unreasonable nature of the legal and
religious context fo r th e argument, no logical process can offer a  solution.
Instead th e conclusion s ar e arbitrary , evad e the problem, o r rever t t o th e
original (unsatisfactory ) premise . Thu s althoug h Mrs . George' s oracula r
trance expresse s a  mysti c sexualit y tha t transcend s marriage , i t i s he r
physical presence that b y attracting Leo' s lover reduces Leo to remarryin g
Reginald. Edith and Cecil finally get married (i n an empty church, since all
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the weddin g guest s hav e give n u p waitin g lon g before ) afte r takin g ou t
insurance agains t libe l suit s -  thoug h Edith' s reservation s ar e simpl y
ignored. An d Lesbia , force d t o refus e th e Genera l fo r th e las t time , wil l
never bea r the children societ y needs.

Perhaps i n an attempt t o get around th e failure o f traditional reasonin g in
the previou s play , Misalliance  incorporate s a  quit e differen t logica l struc -
ture. Fro m Willia m Arche r on , critics hav e complaine d tha t thi s play lack s
focus, i s incoherent, o r fail s t o define an y central topic. 11 Bu t rather tha n
standard sequentia l reasoning , the pattern her e embodies dialectical , latera l
thinking; an d Shaw gives  a  metaphori c imag e o f the process throug h th e
acrobat's juggling display (which , promised bu t never performed, remain s a
purely intellectual construct) :

LINA: Put [the Bible] up before you on a stand; and open it at the Psalms. When
you can read them and understand them, quite quietly and happily, and keep
six balls in the air all the time, you are in perfect condition. .  .

(Collected Plays, vol. iv , p. 200)

The ball s - o r "silver bullets " that Lin a woul d prefe r a s the hardest tes t of
dexterity -  ar e th e multipl e issue s raise d b y th e character s an d kep t i n
suspension durin g the play: parent-child relationship s and the education of
the public , clas s distinction s an d politica l revolution , imperialis m an d
democratic government , gende r role s and eugenics, behaviora l convention s
and individua l freedom , eve n actin g versu s talking . Althoug h distinct , al l
can b e brought int o synthesi s (th e broader visio n tha t Lina' s Bibl e on one
level represents) as a synoptic analysis of the whole socia l system.

The intellectua l proces s operate s throug h inversion , paradox , an d diver-
gence within repetition : al l characteristic technique s o f Shaw's drama , her e
subsumed int o a  mod e o f reasoning . Thu s i t i s a n aristocrati c colonia l
governor wh o gives th e most subversiv e socia l commentar y (s o much s o
that fifty  year s o n Jo e Orto n picke d a  phras e fro m th e speec h a s the
epigraph for Loot):

LORD SUMMERHAYES: Men are not governed by justice, but by law or
persuasion. When they refuse to be governed by law or persuasion, they have
to be governed by force or fraud, or both . . . anarchism is a game at which
the police can beat you. (Collected  Plays, vol. iv, p. 237)

By contras t th e pistol-waving Marxis t revolutionar y turn s ou t to have the
most conventiona l bourgeoi s morality , an d to b e motivate d b y outdate d
and sentimenta l melodram a i n seeking vengeanc e o n Tarleton, th e manu -
facturing magnat e o f underwear , no t as a  capitalis t exploiter , bu t (bein g
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Tarleton's illegitimate son) for the supposed "wrong" done to his mother. 12
Paradox i s both physicall y embodie d i n Lina Szczepanowska , th e Polis h
acrobat, a  free spiri t an d gender-bendin g "man-woma n o r woman-man"
who preserve s he r independence b y risking he r life daily , an d in he r
profession. Th e descriptio n o f her as an acrobat wh o walk s "backward s
along a taut wire without a balancing pole and turn[s] a somersault in the
middle" (Collected  Plays, vol. iv , p. 197) ha s bee n compare d t o one o f
Oscar Wilde's metaphors: "the way of paradoxes is the way of truth . . . T o
test realit y w e mus t se e i t on the tight-rope . Whe n th e veritie s becom e
acrobats we can judge them."13 And the action of the drama itself is shaped
by reprises. Hypatia, Tarleton's bored daughter, asks her fiance to invite his
friend Perciva l t o visit , an d Bentley replie s "You d thro w m e over the
moment you se t eyes on him" - whil e her father describe s her a s wanting
"things t o happen. Want s adventure s t o drop ou t of the sky " an d he r
brother smashe s a china bow l to relieve hi s frustratio n (Collected  Plays,
vol. iv, pp. 168 and 185) . This prefigures the much larger "  appalling crash
of breaking  glass"  whe n th e airplane hit s th e conservatory; an d th e
aviators, wh o literall y dro p fro m th e sky , are indeed adventur e (i n th e
exotic form o f Lina) and Percival , whom Hypatia i s immediately attracte d
to and arranges to marry, leaving Bentley to be slung over Lina's shoulder
and carried off by her in the airplane.

Although Shaw' s voic e i s everywhere in Getting Married,  with al l th e
characters' point s bein g echoed in th e preface , hi s own marriage-mode l -
sexless wedloc k -  i s not included . However , Misalliance  directly reflect s
Shaw's own family experience . The triangular relationship between Shaw's
father, hi s Uncle Walter Gurly , and hi s mother's musica l coac h Vandaleu r
Lee is played o n in the descriptio n o f Percival's idea l famil y upbringin g
through havin g thre e fathers : a  freethinking philosopher , a n Italian pries t
(his mother's confessor) an d his biological father wh o "kept an open mind
and believe d whateve r pai d hi m best " (Collected  Plays, vol. iv , p. 166).
Gunner, the illegitimate son who has just lost his mother and is shut into a
dead-end jo b in a counting house , echoe s Shaw' s abandonmen t b y hi s
mother while working in a Dublin land agents.14 And the play is also self-
referential on other levels.

The characters are recognizable variations on figures from Shaw' s earlier
plays. Hypatia, with her animal energy and ruthless approach to husband-
hunting - once she finds a suitable mate demanding that her father "bu y the
brute fo r me" - i s a throwback t o Blanche i n Widowers'  Houses,  Th e
highly intelligent bu t infantile Bentle y is a clone of the poetic Marchbanks
from Candida:  as Shaw commented , "onl y th e same han d coul d hav e
produced both." 15 Tarleton, as a "captain of industry" who would prefer to
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15 Adventur e from the sky - ente r the Deus ex Machina: Sharry Flett as
Lina Szczepanowska and Peter Krantz as Joseph Percival in the Shaw Festival's 1990

production of Misalliance

be a philosopher an d i s an enlightened philanthropist , echoe s Undershaft' s
mix of financial power, realism, and progressive social engineering in Major
Barbara. Even the eccentric and strikingly unique Lina is not only the most
fully develope d feminist , buildin g o n al l hi s earlie r version s o f "th e Ne w
Woman," who ca n legitimately declar e hersel f "a n Hones t woman : I  earn
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my living. I am a free woman : I live in my own house . I am a woman o f th e
world. .  . I am strong: I  am skilful: I  am brave: I  am independent: I  am
unbought: I  am al l tha t a  woman ough t t o be " (Collected  Plays,  vol . iv , p.
249). Sh e i s also th e female equivalen t o f the Do n Jua n fro m Man  and
Superman, complet e wit h noteboo k listin g "proposals " fro m would-b e
lovers that duplicate s Don Giovanni' s famous recor d o f female conquest s in
Mozart's opera .

The effec t i s to theatricalize th e action , revealing the persona of "G.B.S."
behind ever y aspec t o f Misalliance-,  and thi s is carried throug h int o a highly
contemporary typ e o f deconstruction. Th e ostensibl e dramati c situation ,
which i s specificall y pointe d b y the play' s title , i s dismisse d b y th e
characters a s a "questio n tha t occupie s al l the novel reader s an d al l the
playgoers. Th e questio n the y neve r ge t tired of . . . Th e questio n whic h
particular youn g ma n som e youn g woma n wil l mat e wit h . . . As if it
mattered!" Discussin g literature , a  youn g philistin e demand s "plot " and
rejects dram a "wit h nothin g i n it but som e ide a tha t th e chap tha t write s it
keeps worrying, like a cat chasing it s own tail, " demanding escapis t theatr e
that makes him "forge t th e shop and forge t mysel f from th e moment I go in
to th e momen t I  come out " -  whil e Tarleto n refer s specificall y t o Shaw's
own work : "th e superma n ma y come . The superman' s a n idea . I believe in
ideas. Rea d whatshisname " (Collected  Flays,  vol . iv , p. 238 , 170 , and
169).

This ironi c deconstructio n eve n extend s t o the Discussion Pla y for m
itself. Almos t th e first  lin e o f the pla y i s "Let s argu e abou t somethin g
intellectual" (Collected  Plays,  vol . iv, p. 145 ) - and the final lines are:

TARLETON: Well I - er. .  .1 suppose - er -1 suppose there's nothing more to be
said.

HYPATIA: (fervently) Thank goodness! (Collected  Plays, vol. iv, p. 253)

In announcin g Getting  Married,  Sha w ha d defined hi s new drama a s
"Nothing bu t talk , talk , talk - Sha w talk" (Collected  Plays,  vol . 111 , p. 665)
and now this is explicitly quoted b y Hypatia :

It neve r stops : talk , talk , talk , talk . That' s al l my life . Al l da y I  listen to
mamma talking ; at dinner I listen to papa talking ; and when papa stop s fo r
breath I listen to Johnny talking. (Collected  Plays, vol. iv, p. 176 )

Inevitably thi s expresse s a  deep ambivalenc e abou t reason , whic h i s also
reflected i n the action o f bot h plays . Al l the arguments ar e ultimately
ineffective; an d in each Shaw calls in a spiritual Deus ex  Machina  t o resolv e
the problems : th e clairvoyant Mrs . Georg e i n Getting  Married  an d th e
"magical" Lina , literall y a  goddes s descendin g fro m a  machin e i n Mis-
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alliance whose speeches all (as Shaw pointed ou t to Lena Ashwell, the first
actress to play the role) carried "mystic meaning."16

By inventin g th e "pla y o f ideas " Sha w create d a  prototyp e tha t se t th e
conditions fo r a  whol e lin e i n moder n theatre , i n Englan d a s wel l a s
abroad, from Bertol t Brecht and Edward Bond (both of whom labeled their
work "rational drama") to Joe Orton. In extending the logic of argument to
deconstructing an d theatricalizin g self-reference , h e anticipate d principle s
that hav e becom e associate d wit h postmodernism . However , alway s a
pragmatic playwright , Sha w seem s t o hav e conclude d tha t thes e experi -
ments wer e to o fa r ahea d o f hi s time ; an d th e critica l reactio n t o the m
formed th e fram e fo r Fanny's  First  Play,  stage d jus t on e yea r afte r
Misalliance. Setting a  "moder n play " withi n a  satir e o n (easil y recogniz -
able) Edwardian theatre critics, the whole piece becomes an ironic farewel l
to straigh t Discussio n Drama . Th e pompou s Trotte r (ak a A . B . Walkley,
theatre critic for The  Times,  to whom Shaw had ironically dedicated Man
and Superman) claims that

these productions , whatever els e they may be , are certainly no t play s .  . .  one
author, wh o is , I  blush t o sa y a  persona l frien d o f mine , resort s freel y t o th e
dastardly subterfug e o f callin g them conversations , discussions , an d s o forth ,
with th e expres s objec t o f evadin g criticis m . . . I  sa y the y ar e no t plays .
Dialogues, i f yo u will . Exhibition s o f character , perhaps : especiall y th e
character o f the author. (Collected  Plays,  vol . iv, p. 365 )

After Fann y ha s performe d he r (anonymous ) play , th e critic s al l argu e
about wh o migh t hav e writte n i t -  Piner o an d Granvill e Barke r ar e
suggested, eve n Barri e -  thoug h Sha w i s the las t nam e t o b e mentioned .
And i n rejectin g Sha w a s a  possibilit y the y ru n throug h al l th e stoc k
criticisms o f hi s drama : intellec t withou t emotion ; character s a s puppets ,
indistinguishable mouthpiece s fo r thei r author ; n o plot ; a  down-marke t
preference fo r "second-rat e middle-class" instead o f high society; "unplea-
santness" instea d o f entertainment . Mirrorin g it s dramati c situation ,
Fanny's First Play itself was produced anonymousl y (wit h Shaw mounting
a tongue-in-chee k rumo r campaig n pointin g t o Barri e a s the author ) a s a
mocking challeng e t o th e reviewer s wh o ha d stereotype d hi s wor k an d
condemned his intellectualized, specifically modern theatrical form.

In many ways Fanny's  First Play  is a parody o f Shaw' s "play o f ideas,"
with it s heroin e a s a  vociferousl y Fabia n bluestockin g suffragett e fro m
Cambridge - bu t paradoxically i t was also a vindication o f the Discussion
Drama, transferring fro m th e Court to the West End and running for over
600 performances . However , b y tha t tim e Sha w ha d alread y discarde d
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unadulterated argument s fo r more conventional compromises , with Andro-
cles and the Lion (1912 ) playin g of f Wilson Barrett' s immensel y popula r
religious melodrama , The  Sign  of  the Cross,  an d Pygmalion  returnin g to
the successfu l formul a o f Plays Pleasant  i n its inversion o f conventiona l
comedy.

NOTES

All quotation s fro m Shaw' s play s an d prefaces ar e taken fro m Bernard  Shaw:
Collected Plays with their  Prefaces, ed. Dan H. Laurence (New York, 1975) .
1 Fo r instance, R . J Kaufman , i n G. B. Shaw: A Collection  of  Critical  Essays

(Engelwood Cliffs , NJ, 1965) , p. 11.
2 Cite d i n Michael Holroyd , Bernard  Shaw:  A  Biography,  vol . 1 1 (New York ,

1989), p . 199. Marti n Meise l ha s even argue d tha t Getting  Married  i s an
adaptation o f Sardou: Shaw  and  the Nineteenth Century  Theater  (Princeton ,
1963), pp. 265-66 .

3 Sha w in The Observer, Jun e 12 , 1910 , and Bernard Shaw: Collected  Letters:
1898-1910, ed . Dan H. Laurence (New York, 1972) , p. 781.

4 Th e review s ar e cited b y Holroyd, Bernard  Shaw,  pp . 204 and 244; Mauric e
Valency, The Cart and the Trumpet (Oxford , 1973) , P- 29 2-

5 The  Irrational  Knot  (Ne w York , 1918) , Boo k 1 , pp. 121-22 ; Boo k 11 , p. 220 ;
Book iv, p. 357. For a discussion of British laws on women's rights and marriage
in the nineteenth century, see Dolores Kester, in Rodelle Weintraub (ed.) , Fabian
Feminist: Bernard Shaw and Woman  (Universit y Park, PA, 1977), pp. 68ff.

6 The  Irrational Knot, Boo k iv, p. 357.
7 Diar y entry , June 17 , 1893, a nd BM M S 5059 6 E  pp. 31-33 : cite d i n Brian

Tyson, "Shaw' s Firs t Discussion Play : An Abandoned Ac t of The Philanderer,"
Shaw Review (Septembe r 1969) , pp. 93 and 94.

8 I n the case of Misalliance, for instance , quite apart from th e difference betwee n
printed dialogue and consecutive prose, the preface run s 13 0 pages to the play's
i n page s o f dialogue, an d appended materia l add s a  further 8  pages i n the
Laurence edition.

9 Undate d lette r t o Willia m Faversham , wh o mounted a  U S production o f
Misalliance in 1917: cite d i n Bernard Dukore , Bernard  Shaw,  Director  (Uni -
versity of Washington Press, 1971), p. 117.

10 Lor d Alfred Douglas , for instance , carried on a campaign in The Academy fro m
May 1 3 to Jun e 6 , 190 8 against Getting  Married  a s "not only dull , but
immoral" and corrupting "th e British home. " The "controversy" is reprinted in
The Annual of  Bernard Shaw Studies 9 (1966), pp. 66-74.

11 Cf . Valency , The  Cart and the Trumpet, p . 293 , Willia m Archer , The  Old
Drama and  the  New (London, 1923) , pp. 352ff. , o r John Dawick , "Stagecraf t
and Structur e i n Shaw' s Disquisitor y Drama, " Modern  Drama  (Decembe r
1971), p. 280 .

12 A s an underwea r manufacture r whos e illegitimat e so n proves incapabl e of
shooting him , Tarleton i s a  parodi c amalga m o f the haberdasher Gordo n
Selfridge an d Willia m Whitely , a  contemporary businessma n murdere d b y an
unacknowledged illegitimat e so n in 1907 (cf . Holroyd, Bernard  Shaw, p. 245).
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His underwea r busines s i s also a  deliberately batheti c paralle l t o th e trad e i n
womens' fashions tha t symbolizes Western decadence in Granville Barker's The
Madras House.

13 The  Picture  of  Dorian  Gray  i n The  Portable  Oscar  Wilde,  ed . Richar d
Aldington and Stanley Weintraub (New York, 1981), p. 183. The comparison is
made b y J . L . Wisenthal , i n "Wilde , Shaw , an d th e Pla y o f Conversation, "
Modern Drama (Spring 1994), p. 216.

14 Se e Holroyd, Bernard Shaw, p. 246
15 Cite d in ibid., p. 245.
16 Collected  Letters, p. 903.
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The roads to Heartbreak House

On June 8 , 1917 , Bernard Sha w invited a  few friend s t o hea r hi m read a
new play, his first full-length piec e since Pygmalion, written in 1913 . Four
of them were people with special knowledge of the materials that had gone
into Shaw's cauldron: Henry Massingham, Gilbert Murray, Sydney Olivier,
and Kathlee n Scott , th e wido w o f Scot t o f th e Antarctic . The y seeme d
likelier tha n mos t listener s t o understan d wha t h e was u p t o i n this , hi s
most difficul t work . Some perhaps were in a better position to understan d
it tha n h e wa s -  Kathlee n Scott , undoubtedly , kne w bette r tha n th e
playwright wha t motives had driven her husband to try and outface deat h
in the hardest, most dangerous place on earth. Shaw may even have hoped
they might help him to understand his play better himself.

For Heartbreak House had given more trouble coming to birth than any
of hi s previou s plays . He ha d starte d t o writ e i t o n Marc h 4 , 1916 , bu t
three months later stil l had no clear idea where it was going. "I, who once
wrote plays d'un seul trait" h e wrote to Mrs. Patrick Campbell on May 14,
"am creepin g throug h a  ne w on e (t o preven t mysel f crying ) a t od d
moments, two or three speeches at a time. I don't know what it is about."1

In November he read the first act to Lady Gregory, but told her he did not
know ho w t o g o on , what h e had writte n wa s s o wild.2 I n December h e
confessed to William Archer that he still had only one act, and was stuck.3

Something broke the logjam fo r him early in 1917 . It may have been his
visit t o th e Wester n Fron t a t th e invitatio n o f Dougla s Haig , th e Britis h
commander-in-chief. Sha w tol d th e Daily  Chronicle  that h e foun d th e
nightly bombardment s finer  than Tchaikovsky' s 181 2 overture. 4 Twenty -
three year s later , durin g anothe r Worl d War , h e told Virgini a Wool f i n a
letter tha t th e conception o f Heartbreak House came to him the weekend
of June 17, 1916, when the Shaws, Webbs, and Woolfs found themselves in
a housepart y a t Wyndha m Crof t i n Sussex. 5 Sittin g o n th e terrac e afte r
dinner, they hear d th e distan t thunde r o f artiller y launchin g th e offensiv e
on the Somme. It sounds as if his tour of Flanders the following year linked

180



Cambridge Companions Online © Cambridge University Press, 2006

The roads to Heartbreak House

with that experience, and with his memory of watching a German zeppelin
sail over his house in Ayot St. Lawrence and fall "like a burning newspaper"
near Potter s Bar , brough t dow n b y fighte r planes , o n Octobe r i , 1916. 6

They crystallize d int o Elli e Dunn' s lin e i n th e las t scen e o f Heartbreak
House, as a zeppelin roars overhead: "By thunder, Hesione, it is Beethoven."

Stanley Weintraub' s chronicl e o f Shaw' s activitie s betwee n 191 4 an d
1918, Journey to  Heartbreak  (1971) , suggests how thes e wartime experi -
ences combined i n the play . The boo k doe s an admirabl e jo b o f showin g
how Shaw' s oppositio n t o th e wa r place d hi m fo r th e first  tim e o n th e
sidelines o f publi c events , in the limbo where Heartbreak  House seems to
take place , talkin g abou t histor y fro m somewher e outsid e o f it . Bu t b y
limiting itself to the years of the Great War, it fails to account fully fo r the
play. In his preface to it, written in 1919, Shaw said that he began it before
the first  shots o f 191 4 wer e fired,  at a  time whe n "onl y th e professiona l
diplomatists and the very few amateurs whose hobby is foreign policy even
knew that the guns were loaded."7 This is confirmed b y the letter he wrote
to Lor d Alfre d Dougla s tellin g ho w th e figure  of th e play' s protagonist ,
Captain Shotover , formed itsel f in his mind in 1913, when the actress Lena
Ashwell told how her father, a  retired sea captain, refused extrem e unction
unless h e coul d hav e chees e with hi s communion bread. 8 (Th e ol d man' s
home in retirement, a sailing vessel moored in the Tyne, with living quarters
for hi m i n it s ster n an d a  drawin g roo m an d conservator y o n it s uppe r
deck, inspire d th e play' s setting. ) Bu t some of th e concerns treated i n the
play reached even further bac k into Shaw's past. It seems clear that much of
his difficult y i n writin g i t cam e fro m tryin g t o reconcil e th e wartim e
experiences which gave him its ending with the notions with which he had
embarked on it six years or more earlier.

Working withou t a  developed plo t lin e in his head, h e drew more tha n
ever befor e o n persona l emotion s an d memories , conscious an d semicon -
scious. Man y o f th e feeling s h e neede d t o expres s wer e abou t thing s h e
needed t o concea l fro m th e public , and i n some case s hi s wife . Bu t more
than that , h e foun d himsel f needin g t o squar e a n apocalypti c wartim e
ending wit h idea s h e had ha d abou t play s he wanted t o writ e befor e th e
war. Much o f the power and richness of the play comes from th e sense of
emotions a t work behin d i t too large to be expressed i n its characters and
situations. Muc h o f it s densit y an d myster y come s fro m th e shadow y
movement belo w it s surface o f deeper , drowne d pattern s o f meaning , the
shapes of other plays it might have become lying like submerged mountai n
ranges beneath the play it is.

One o f thos e play s wa s t o b e a  variatio n o n Englis h theme s i n th e
manner o f Chekhov . Sha w acknowledged thi s intention i n hi s subtitle fo r
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the play , " A Fantasia i n the Russia n Manne r o n Englis h Themes, " but i n
the finished play hi s intentio n i s clearer tha n Chekhov' s direc t influence .
Shaw ha d first  hear d o f Chekho v i n 1905 , possibl y fro m hi s Germa n
translator Siegfrie d Trebitsc h when the Moscow Art Theatre made its first
foreign tou r t o Berlin . He wrote to ask Henry Irving' s son Laurence, who
read Russian, whether any of Chekhov's plays might suit the Stage Society,
short of playwrights now that Shaw and Granville Barker were succeeding
commercially a t the Cour t Theatre . It was probably Shaw' s advocacy tha t
led th e Societ y t o stag e The  Cherry  Orchard in Ma y 1911 , in a n under -
rehearsed and much derided production. Shaw attended i t loyally, and also
the first London stagin g of The  Seagull by Maurice Elvey in March 1912 .
The Stage Society then mounted Uncle  Vanya in May 1914. Coming out of
its first  performance , Sha w sai d t o a  friend : "Whe n I  hea r a  pla y o f
Chekhov's, I want to tear my own up."

The friend t o whom he said this was Henry Massingham. He and Shaw
had known each other since 1888, when Massingham, deputy editor of the
Star, hired Sha w behin d th e editor' s bac k t o writ e musi c criticisms unde r
the pseudonym Cornet o di Bassetto. Shaw came to regard Massingham a s
"the perfec t maste r journalist " an d tha t rares t o f rar e birds , a  first-rate
editor. He was to value his qualities as an editor particularly during the war
years. When Shaw's Common Sense About the  War,  published i n the New
Statesman i n Novembe r 1914 , le d t o hi s ostracis m b y ever y journa l i n
London (includin g th e Statesman  itself , launche d wit h £1,00 0 o f hi s
money), Massingham mad e space in his non-party weekly The  Nation fo r
the unhonored prophet's  voic e to b e heard cryin g in the wilderness . They
saw more or less eye to eye on the subject of the war. But their closest bond
was probably the theatre. Massingham's daughter Dorothy had played the
juvenile lead in Shaw's Great  Catherine in 1913 . Massingham had himself
been a  theatre critic , one of the few in Britain to recognize the nature and
quality o f Chekhov' s play s whe n the y first  appeare d i n Britain . H e ha d
taken A. B. Walkley of the Times  to task for complaining of implausibilit y
in The Cherry  Orchard, and of the play's mixture of tragedy, comedy, and
farce. "Lif e i s al l thes e things , bein g mad e u p o f chang e an d loss , and a
certain sparkling recovery, and a grimly ludicrous, ironic play of unknown
forces ove r i t all, " he wrote i n the Nation  o n June 3 , 1911 . After seein g
Uncle Vanya in 1914 , he analyzed th e ensemble nature o f it s writing an d
construction, "th e wa y i n whic h al l thes e creature s ar e repelle d fro m o r
attracted to each other, like the tremulous oscillations of electric needles."9

If anyon e coul d b e relie d o n t o understan d wha t Sha w ha d take n fro m
Chekhov in writing his play, it surely was Massingham.
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The tentative title Shaw gave to his first draft o f Heartbreak House  was
The House in the Clouds. (Later it became The Studio in the Clouds.) This
indicates tha t hi s fantasi a i n th e Russia n manne r wa s als o th e pla y h e
discussed before the war with his friend Gilber t Murray, which was to be a
contemporary imitatio n o f Aristophanes ' The  Clouds.  Shaw ha d becom e
intimate wit h Murra y durin g th e Vedrenne-Barke r season s a t th e Cour t
Theatre, whic h gre w ou t o f Granvill e Barker' s productio n o f Murray' s
version o f Euripides ' Hippolytus  i n Octobe r 1904 . Within th e followin g
year, Murra y an d Sha w becam e sufficientl y clos e fo r Sha w t o mode l hi s
Greek scholar Adolphus Cusins in Major Barbara on the Oxford classicist ,
and t o see k Murray' s hel p whe n i n difficultie s writin g a n endin g fo r th e
play. During the war, Murray embraced Shaw's suggestion that the postwar
world shoul d b e police d b y a  supranationa l Leagu e o f Nations , an d h e
became one of the League's most faithful champion s between the wars.

Aristophanes' Clouds  i s a  satir e o n educatio n i n th e Athen s o f th e
Sophists. Socrates , lumpe d inaccuratel y an d unfairl y amon g them , i s
caricatured i n i t a s a  subverte r o f traditional  decenc y an d decorum ,
teaching the young by twisted logi c the right o f sons to bea t their fathers .
The play' s Chorus , dresse d a s clouds , presen t themselve s a s symbols an d
presiding deitie s o f th e ne w learning : volatile, shape-shifting , woolly , an d
chaotic. That Shaw should have visualized a contemporary comedy on such
themes lending itself to treatment "in the Russian manner" suggests that he
may hav e ha d Chekhov' s Seagull  in min d a s a  mode l rathe r tha n Uncle
Vanya or The Cherry Orchard.

Because The  Cherry  Orchard is the Chekhov play invoked mos t specifi -
cally in Shaw's preface, and because of a few obvious parallels - bankrup t
house, undiscipline d servants , impendin g disaste r -  i t i s th e wor k b y
Chekhov to which Heartbreak House has been most frequently compared .
But in its concern for wha t one generation passes to the next, what values
parents rais e thei r childre n t o hono r an d pursue , Heartbreak  House  i s
much closer to The Seagull, itsel f an oblique homage on Chekhov's part to
the Russia n nove l h e mos t admired , Turgenev' s Fathers  and Sons.  Th e
miasma o f romantic bohemianism tha t hang s over the Shotovers' stranded
ship o f fool s come s muc h close r t o th e atmospher e o f th e Sorins ' love -
infested hous e by its magic lake than to that of Madame Ranevsky's fadin g
mansion among its cherry trees. Two-thirds of the way through the play, at
the point where Aristophanic comedies usually bring forward th e leader of
the Choru s t o spea k th e parabasis , th e statemen t o f th e play' s seriou s
purpose, Sha w gives Captai n Shotove r hi s longes t speech . I t i s about th e
generations rising to replace his own, and what they value.
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I se e m y daughter s an d thei r me n leadin g foolis h live s o f romanc e an d
sentiment and snobbery. I see you, the younger generation, turning from thei r
romance an d sentimen t an d snobber y t o mone y an d comfor t an d har d
common sense . I  wa s te n time s happie r o n th e bridg e i n th e typhoon , o r
frozen int o Arcti c ic e fo r month s i n darkness , tha n yo u o r the y hav e eve r
been. You are looking for a  rich husband. At your age I looked for hardship ,
danger, horror, and death, that I might feel the life in me more intensely.10

What h e say s ha s mor e i n commo n wit h Nin a a t th e en d o f The  Seagull,
walking int o th e stor m t o pursu e he r vocatio n a s a n actress , tha n i t doe s
with th e muted , relieve d farewell s Gayev , hi s siste r an d famil y sa y t o thei r
old lives in the last act of The  Cherry  Orchard.

Shaw ha d n o childre n o f hi s own , o f course , t o broo d ove r a s Captai n
Shotover brood s ove r hi s progeny . Bu t a s h e ha d turne d i n hi s twentie s t o
his friend s i n th e Fabia n Societ y fo r a  surrogat e famil y t o replac e th e
broken on e which starve d hi m for love , so in his fifties he tended t o look o n
the new generation o f Fabians as substitutes for th e children he and hi s wife
Charlotte woul d neve r have . Bot h treate d Harle y Granvill e Barker , wh o
joined th e Societ y i n 1901 , as a n adore d adoptiv e son . A  simila r parenta l
feeling seem s t o hav e le d Sha w t o pus h H . G . Well s int o th e Societ y tw o
years later , an d t o invit e Rober t Loraine , wh o ha d playe d Jac k Tanne r i n
Man and  Superman  i n New York , to join the first Fabian Summe r Schoo l in
North Wale s a s hi s gues t an d Charlotte's . (Sha w an d Lorain e nearl y
drowned togethe r swimmin g i n Tremadoc Bay. ) Bu t his highes t hopes , an d
those o f othe r ol d Fabians , centere d o n th e Cambridg e Fabia n Club , a
brilliant grou p o f youn g peopl e draw n towar d socialis m b y th e Libera l
Party's landslide victory i n 1906 . Among its members were the poet Ruper t
Brooke, "th e handsomes t youn g ma n i n England" ; Hug h Dalton , th e
economist wh o becam e Chancello r o f th e Excheque r i n th e 194 5 Labo r
government; Jame s Strachey , younge r brothe r o f th e biographe r Lytton ;
and Arthu r Waley , th e futur e Chines e scholar . Wome n fro m Girto n an d
Newnham Colleges , though stil l denied membership o f the university , wer e
admitted t o th e club . Severa l wer e daughter s o f ol d Fabians . Among the m
was Rosamund , daughte r o f th e journalis t Huber t Blan d -  thoug h illegiti -
mate, th e produc t o f on e o f Bland' s extramarita l affairs , sh e ha d bee n
reared i n th e famil y b y hi s wife , th e children' s write r Edit h Nesbit . Ambe r
Reeves wa s th e daughte r o f th e directo r o f th e Londo n Schoo l o f
Economics, founde d b y Sydne y Webb . Marger y Olivie r wa s th e eldes t o f
the four beautifu l daughter s o f Shaw' s old friend Sydne y Olivier , one o f th e
founding Fabians .

Shaw an d Olivie r ha d first  me t i n 1884 , brough t togethe r b y Sydne y
Webb, with whom Olivie r shared the duties of resident clerk at the Colonia l
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Office. Althoug h i t had bee n officiall y launche d som e months earlier , thi s
was really the birth of the Fabian Society. Shaw, Webb, and Olivier became
its three musketeers , with Olivier' s Oxfor d frien d Graha m Walla s as their
ingenuous d'Artagnan . I t wa s the y wh o wrot e th e ke y Fabian  Essays in
1889 an d dominate d th e society' s activitie s wel l int o th e ne w century .
Olivier ha d t o withdra w somewha t i n th e 1890s , a s colonia l servic e
overseas too k hi m abroa d fo r longe r an d longe r periods , t o Britis h
Honduras, th e Leewar d Islands , an d othe r colonie s i n th e Caribbean . I n
1899, whe n appointe d Colonia l Secretar y o f Jamaica, h e moved wit h hi s
family to the island for five years. But the moment he returned in 1904, the
Fabians seized on him to arbitrate the various disputes that had broken out
in the society, mainly instigated by H. G. Wells.

Olivier was fitted for th e task by an openness to new ideas (he instantly
took t o Wells ) combine d wit h a n ai r o f unquestionabl e authority . Ac -
cording t o Shaw , wh o visite d hi m ther e later , h e rule d Jamaic a a s a n
enlightened despot , makin g n o secre t o f th e fac t tha t hi s sympathie s la y
with the island' s black peasantry rathe r tha n it s white plantocracy . A tall,
commanding figure  wit h th e pointe d bear d o f a  Spanis h grande e (hi s
nephew Laurenc e modele d hi s Sh y lock o n hi m i n 1969) , h e pai d littl e
attention t o an y judgments bu t hi s own -  peopl e usuall y cam e around t o
agreeing with him in a year o r two, he told Shaw. 11 He followed hi s own
judgment i n th e educatio n o f hi s daughters . I n Jamaica , the y learne d t o
play pol o i n th e ground s o f King' s House , an d wer e taugh t a t hom e b y
tutors, until the new Sussex coeducational school Bedale's became available
for hi s youngest daughter , Noel . Rupert Brooke' s attemp t t o persuad e hi s
mother, the domineering "Ranee," to invite two of the Olivier daughters to
visit thei r hom e i n Rugb y wa s scotche d b y a  woma n sh e me t wh o ha d
recently returne d fro m Jamaica . "Th e Oliviers! " sh e exclaime d t o th e
alarmed Ranee. "They'd do anything, those girls!"12

What th e Olivie r girl s did most , apparently , wit h th e help of th e Cam -
bridge Fabian Clu b and it s summer schools , ski trips, and othe r activities ,
was fal l i n lov e wit h Ruper t Brooke . H . G . Wells' s chie f interes t i n th e
Fabian Society , apart from takin g i t over and displacing its old rulers, was
to make it the instrument of his desire for a  new, freer sexua l morality. He
found eage r disciple s i n th e Cambridg e Fabia n Club . I t wa s sai d tha t
Hubert Blan d arrive d i n the nic k o f tim e t o sto p Well s an d hi s daughte r
Rosamund fro m boardin g a  train togethe r a t Paddington statio n fo r som e
clandestine destinatio n i n the west . In 190 9 Well s embarked o n a n affai r
with Amber Reeves, then the club's treasurer, and fathered a  child with her.
The scanda l migh t hav e bee n hushe d u p -  Ambe r accepte d a n offe r o f
marriage from a  chivalrous young Fabian barriste r named Blanco White -
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had Wells not made it the subject o f his next novel, Ann Veronica.  The old
Fabians jus t succeede d i n holding the societ y together b y forcing Well s to
resign and say it was because of political differences .

By then Olivier and his wife were back in Jamaica. He had been recalled
by publi c deman d t o b e governo r o f th e islan d whe n a n earthquak e
destroyed Kingston, the capital, in 1907. Their daughters stayed in England
to pursu e thei r educations , chaperone d b y Margery . Ruper t Brook e use d
his Fabian friendshi p wit h Marger y a s a  means to pursue them . The firs t
object o f hi s admiratio n wa s Brynhild , th e beaut y o f th e family , name d
after th e heroin e o f Willia m Morris' s Sigurd  the Volsung.  Then i n Jun e
1908 th e whol e famil y visite d Cambridg e t o se e th e Marlow e Societ y
perform Milton' s Comus,  with Brooke, its founder, a s the Attendant Spirit .
Brooke met for th e first tim e and was instantly fascinated b y the youngest
of th e sisters , Noel , the n fifteen . Fo r th e nex t tw o year s the y wrot e eac h
other jokil y flirtatiou s letters , me t occasionally , an d Brook e wrot e Noe l
poems, th e bes t o f the m hi s 190 9 sonne t "Oh ! Deat h wil l find  me lon g
before I  tire / Of watching you." Then in September 1910 , when Noel was
seventeen and Brooke twenty-three, they entered into a secret engagement ,
which Brooke proceeded t o break two years later by having an affair wit h
another Cambridge Fabian, Katherine Cox.

How muc h o f thi s th e Olivie r parent s kne w whe n Sha w an d hi s wif e
visited them in Jamaica in January 191 1 is impossible to tell. It seems likely
that Margery, fulfilling he r responsibility fo r her younger sisters, prevented
Noel's relationshi p wit h Brook e fro m developin g int o a n affair . I t seem s
more than likely that, recognizing Brooke's attentions to herself as a way of
gaining acces s to he r sisters , she fel t used . She may have told he r mothe r
that much . But it seems unlikely tha t th e friends spen t a  week together in
the new, earthquake-proof King' s House without discussing the convulsive
history of the Cambridge Fabian Club under Wells's tutelage, and the acid
comments passed b y Beatrice Webb on the Fabian summer schools , to the
effect tha t thei r participant s seeme d mor e interested i n each other tha n in
social reform. Shaw's surrogate children included Olivier's daughters. Years
later, i n th e 1930s , h e gav e Brynhil d mone y t o rescu e a  far m whic h he r
feckless husband was in danger of losing. One of the many reasons why he
may have invited Olivier to hear his play was perhaps to make sure he had
not to o obviousl y le t th e figures of hi s ol d frien d an d hi s childre n sho w
behind thos e o f th e ancien t Ulysse s wit h a  Jamaica n wif e an d sire n
daughters.

There was another way that Shaw might have heard o f Rupert Brooke' s
courtship o f th e Olivie r girls . Durin g th e 1905-0 6 seaso n a t th e Court
Theatre, h e receive d a n anonymou s fa n lette r fro m "Mis s Charming, "
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Poste Restante , Godalming , whic h h e coul d no t resis t answering . Mis s
Charming turned ou t to be Erica Cotterill , a  first cousi n o f the Brookes, a
daughter o f a  Fabia n schoolmaster . Fo r th e nex t seve n years , sh e kep t
bursting i n o n hi s life , unti l Charlott e Sha w insiste d h e forbi d he r thei r
house. Whe n h e advise d Eric a t o joi n a  socialis t society , sh e joine d th e
Fabians an d followe d hi m hom e fro m lectures . Whe n h e invite d he r t o
lunch i n th e country , sh e campe d i n th e wood s nea r Ayo t St . Lawrenc e
and roared u p to their house next day on a motor bicycle . Having learned
in th e theatr e wha t a  Shavia n superwoma n shoul d b e like , sh e trie d t o
make hersel f on e i n rea l life . Sh e wa s a  nuisance , possibl y slightl y
unhinged, bu t Shaw saw something touching in her. Nobody, not even he,
seemed t o b e abl e t o tel l he r wha t t o d o wit h he r life , excep t t o ge t
married an d rais e children . Understandably , sh e refuse d al l advice . A s
imperious in her way as her aunt , Rupert Brooke' s mother th e Ranee, she
followed he r ow n impossibl e course , demandin g tha t Sha w lov e her ,
insisting o n arrangin g he r lif e t o sui t he r ow n idea s rathe r tha n othe r
people's. Many Sha w biographer s hav e observe d tha t somethin g o f Eric a
turns u p i n th e characte r o f Elli e Dun n i n Heartbreak  House,  bu t fe w
point ou t th e exten t t o whic h Elli e share s Erica' s unshakeabl e feminis t
obduracy about leading her own life as she thinks best.

Erica Cotterill' s cousinshi p t o hi m i s th e onl y reaso n fo r Ruper t
Brooke's name to appear in any biography of Shaw, but he is an important
if invisible presence at the center of Heartbreak House, The play is Shaw's
meditation o n why so great a  majority disagree d wit h him and welcome d
the Grea t Wa r wit h inflammator y excitement . Brooke , th e brightes t an d
best o f th e Cambridg e Fabians , wh o migh t hav e bee n expecte d t o joi n
Bertrand Russel l an d Lytto n Strache y i n socialis t pacifis t resistanc e t o the
war, instead ha d made himself th e voice of hi s generation with the sonnet
"Now Go d b e thanke d Wh o ha s matche d u s wit h Hi s hour. " Afte r hi s
death fro m bloo d poisonin g i n th e Aegea n i n Apri l 1915 , Winsto n
Churchill describe d hi m i n th e Times  a s "al l tha t on e woul d wis h
England's nobles t son s t o b e i n day s whe n n o sacrific e bu t th e mos t
precious i s acceptable. " A  few week s earlier , th e Dea n o f St . Paul' s rea d
his sonnet "Th e Soldier " - "I f I  should die , think onl y thi s o f me " - a t a
Sunday service . From then on , Brooke was the hero of ever y war-lover in
Britain, th e stronges t o f th e voice s tha t drowne d ou t Shaw' s Common
Sense About the  War,  Heartbreak House  wa s Shaw' s attemp t t o under -
stand th e feeling s Brook e ha d summe d up . I t ask s lik e Yathers  and Sons
and The  Seagull "Where did we go wrong?"

Brooke's answers in his sonnet are imprecise. He talks of how the God of
the war has "wakened us from sleeping" and caused the young
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To turn, as swimmers into cleanness leaping,
Glad from a world grown old and cold and weary,
Leave the sick hearts that honour could not move,
And half-men, and their dirty songs and dreary,
And all the little emptiness of love.

It is possible to detect a certain amount of posturing in the poem, the relief
of a young man with doubts about his sexuality welcoming the opportunity
to prove himsel f manl y to the core . But Shaw could recogniz e the disgus t
with Britain' s prewa r societ y a s something Brook e hel d i n commo n wit h
others, includin g himself . Was what h e ha d t o sa y s o differen t fro m th e
statement made implicitly by Robert Scott in his ill-fated Antarcti c expedi-
tion o f 1912 ? Sha w ha d imbibe d enoug h Mar x a t a n earl y ag e t o b e
accustomed t o dialectical thinking. Captain Shotove r expresses in the play
the need for human beings to feel the fear o f death sharply in order to feel
the lif e i n themselves mor e intensely . Presumably Sha w had invite d Kath -
leen Scott to hear his play's final speeches to this effect an d respond to them
from th e poin t o f vie w o f Scott' s widow. Unfortunately , wor n ou t b y her
war work at the Ministry of Pensions, Kathleen Scott dozed off an d had to
be excused befor e th e end o f Shaw' s reading. He forgave her , insisting on
reading the end of the play to her the following day.

In the event, there was no way of representing the voice of Brooke's and
Scott's generation i n Heartbreak House, Shaw's stage direction describin g
the first entrance of Randall Utterword, the youngest male in the play, is a
reminder that there were no actors to be found i n wartime of conscriptable
age: "He has an engaging air of being young and unmarried , bu t on close
inspection is found to be at least over forty." Hector Hushabye, a handsome
fifty-year-old, ca n represent H. G. Wells, winning the love of Ellie Dunn as
Othello won that of Desdemona by telling far-fetched storie s about anthro-
pophagi an d me n whos e head s gro w beneat h thei r shoulders . Elli e ca n
speak fo r Eric a Cotteril l an d th e brigh t youn g wome n o f th e suffragett e
movement suc h a s Rebecc a West , wit h who m Well s ha d ha d a n affai r
similar to the one with Amber Reeves, and fathered anothe r child, in 1914.
The Shotove r sister s ca n b e prevente d fro m bringin g th e Olivie r girl s t o
mind b y incorporatin g element s o f Lesli e Stephen' s daughters , Virgini a
Woolf an d Vanessa Bell , as well a s characteristics, i n the case o f Hesion e
Hushabye, o f Shaw' s ow n Circ e Mrs . Patrick Campbell , an d o f Ottolin e
Morell, th e fantasticall y dresse d quee n o f a  cour t o f Bloomsbur y an d
Cambridge conscientiou s objector s o n he r estat e a t Garsington . Captai n
Shotover ca n combine the voices of Shaw himself an d Sydney Olivier. But
there can be no young men of fighting age in the play. The small change of
young people' s flirtations  an d infatuation s whic h provid e th e actio n o f
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earlier countr y hous e comedie s suc h a s Misalliance  are no t possibl e i n
Heartbreak House.

This make s i t har d t o describ e precisel y wha t th e actio n o f th e pla y
consists of . Sha w obviousl y use d th e labe l "i n th e Russia n manner " a s a
license fo r writin g a  play i n which nothin g seem s to happen , bu t h e was
perfectly awar e that beneat h the apparent boredo m o f Chekhov's inconse-
quent conversations, hearts are broken, lives blighted, and hopes destroyed
just as dramatically a s in any Pinero melodrama. But the speech-to-speech
action o f Heartbreak  House  i s elusive fo r othe r reasons . It i s hard t o say
what outcome s resul t fro m th e variou s encounter s betwee n characters ,
scene b y scene , unles s on e follow s u p a  clu e Sha w dropped , apparentl y
artlessly, whe n writin g t o Lawrenc e Langne r o f th e Ne w Yor k Theatr e
Guild befor e th e play' s worl d premier e i n 1920 . H e tol d Langne r o f hi s
habit o f workin g ou t th e move s i n hi s play s wit h ches s piece s o n a
chessboard -  "i f th e actor s follo w th e stage directions exactl y a s they ar e
written i n th e play , the y canno t possibl y g o wrong. " Ther e i s plent y o f
evidence that thi s had long been Shaw's custom. But Heartbreak House is
the onl y play o f Shaw' s i n which th e character s coul d actuall y b e said t o
correspond t o th e piece s o n a  chessboard , an d th e actio n o f th e pla y t o
consist o f a  series of confrontations i n which one character eithe r "takes "
another or fails to do so, as chess pieces do.

The analogy breaks down only at the absence of the chessboard's castles
- instea d o f actua l castle s o n th e board , Sha w ha s hi s tw o imaginar y
entities, Heartbreak Hous e and Horseback Hall , the palaces of the liberal-
intellectual bohemia he described in his preface, and of the English Junker-
class he identified i n Common Sense  About the  War.  The two houses have
their whit e quee n an d blac k queen , Ariadn e Utterwor d an d Hesion e
Hushabye, an d ther e ar e a  whit e kin g an d blac k king , Captai n Shotove r
and Boss Mangan, who look imposing but turn out to be circumscribed in
their movement, as the kings of the chessboard are . (Mangan makes a less
regal figure than Shotover , bu t i t shoul d b e notice d tha t whe n th e blac k
king i s removed fro m th e boar d b y a  Germa n bomb , th e gam e i s over. )
Each queen als o has a  knight caracolin g in broken-backed motion s abou t
her - Hecto r Hushabye about his wife, Randall Utterword about his sister-
in-law - an d I  would argu e that the play's two male Dunns can be seen as
black an d whit e bishops : Bill y Dun n a  forme r pirat e wh o ha s reduce d
burglary t o a  pious form o f mora l blackmail ; Mazzini Dunn , a  martyr o f
old-fashioned liberalis m wh o ha s becom e a  well-meanin g tyran t t o hi s
child. Elli e Dunn, o f course , begins the pla y a s everybody's pawn , bu t a s
she makes her way across the board , immobilizing first one king and then
the other , sh e triumphantl y turn s hersel f int o ye t anothe r queen , th e
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spiritual bride of Captain Shotover, as ordinary pieces do in chess's younger
cousin, draughts.

It woul d probabl y b e a  mistake t o dres s a  production o f th e pla y i n a
manner tha t recalle d Alice  Through  the  Looking  Glass,  but i t coul d b e
helpful t o actors to think of what their characters are up to as "taking" one
another, in the chess sense of the word. Hector has "taken" Ellie before the
play begins . Ariadn e proceed s t o "take " Hector , an d Elli e t o "take "
Mangan, while Hesione Hushabye, to her surprise, fails to "take" Mazzini
Dunn, the only man she ever met "who could resist me when I made myself
really agreeable." Mazzini literally takes Billy Dunn prisoner when he finds
him burgling the house, and Ellie , discarding Mangan in the last act, takes
Captain Shotove r a s he r "spiritua l husban d an d secon d father, " a  mysti c
marriage o f the kind Sha w claimed late r to have fel t betwee n himsel f an d
William Morris's daughter May, and perhaps the relationship Shaw would
have wished for himsel f when young with Morris in his messianic old age.
The action of the scenes in which these takings happen i s not really action
in th e norma l sens e o f th e word . Character s measur e themselve s agains t
each other in a Darwinian fashion, and decide either to embrace or discard
each other . They ar e lik e the subtext s t o th e debate s i n Getting  Married,
with most of their texts abandoned -  i n effect, eac h character executes the
kind of judgement on each other that i s executed o n the characters of The
Simpleton of  the  Unexpected  Isles, a pla y with man y affinitie s t o Heart-
break House,  whe n Judgmen t Da y comes . I n The  Simpleton,  heaven' s
judgment consists of sweeping off the board those characters who serve no
useful purpose . Thos e whos e live s can b e said t o b e usefu l ar e spare d t o
continue them. Hector Hushabye cries out fo r suc h a  judgment i n the last
act of Heartbreak House, declaring that its denizens are useless, dangerous,
and ought to be abolished. In their small way, the two-character scene s of
Heartbreak House  ar e microcosm s o f th e universa l judgmen t i t move s
toward.

They ar e onl y indirectly , however , par t o f tha t movement . A s th e
equivalencies I  have suggested indicate , there i s no coherent oppositio n of
black an d whit e i n Shaw' s ches s game , onl y a  se t o f individua l contests ,
some betwee n blac k an d blac k (Hesion e Hushabye , th e blac k queen , fo r
example, "takes " Mangan , th e blac k king ) o r whit e an d whit e (fo r
example, Ariadne Utterword chastising her knight Randall at the end of the
second act) . Sha w neve r foun d th e consisten t plo t tha t woul d joi n th e
Graeco-Russian comed y h e muse d o n befor e th e wa r t o th e apocalypti c
ending tha t hi s wartim e experience s brough t him . Th e apocalypse , a s i s
presumably the supernatural nature of such events, arrives out of nowhere,
heralded b y some foreboding prophecie s b y Shotover an d Hecto r Husha -
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16 Th e palace of sleep - Elli e Dunn dreaming of Othello: Marti Maraden as Ellie Dunn,
with Jim Jones and Ric Sarabia as the Gardener's Boys, in the Shaw Festival's 1985

production of Heartbreak House

bye, but having no direct causal connection with the previous events of the
play. The bridg e tha t connect s th e beginnin g o f Heartbreak  House  t o it s
ending is of a  non-narrative kind , constructed b y means that belon g more
to music than to drama. The real action of the play is its movement away
from narrative sequence toward its final fire from heaven. Shaw described it
as well a s anyone ha s i n an intervie w wit h th e Sunday  Herald before th e
play's Londo n openin g i n 1921 : "The heartbrea k begins , an d get s wors e
until the house breaks out through the windows, and becomes all England
with all England's heart broken."13

In the end , the uniqu e brillianc e o f Heartbreak  House, which make s i t
unlike any play written before it , was the result of Shaw's recognition tha t
there was no narrative connection to be made between the play's beginning
and ending. Its action consists of the unmooring of the play from the reality
in which it begins, floating it above and beyond that reality like an airship,
and bringin g i t home on target t o the reality o f ai r war i n 1917 . Had th e
play been staged in 1917 , as Shaw presumably intended when he gave it a
cast o f over-fort y mal e actors , th e audienc e woul d hav e watche d th e
curtain g o up o n a  country hous e weekend o f th e kin d tha t provide d th e
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matter o f innumerabl e Edwardia n comedies . Sinc e Elli e i s penniless ,
Hesione wears Pre-Raphelite draperies, and Ariadne has just returned fro m
the colonies , non e o f th e play' s wome n ente r i n clothe s tha t betra y an y
particular year . One would be free t o suppose that the reality in which the
play i s se t i s th e unrealit y o f an y upper-clas s Edwardia n pla y o f wit ,
flirtation, an d snobbis h clas s warfare . Bu t graduall y tha t unrea l realit y
becomes mor e an d mor e unreal , it s character s protestin g tha t norma l
people do not behav e as they do, as they behave less and les s theatrically.
And suddenl y a n aimless , typicall y Edwardia n discussio n abou t th e
frequency o f local night trains ushers in the thunder of zeppelins overhead,
and th e tim e i s clearly 1917 , the realit y i n which th e pla y end s the sam e
chilly wartime realit y that wait s for th e audience in the streets outside the
theatre.

The real action o f the play is the artifice wit h which Shaw brings abou t
this passage from a n illusion o f unreality t o an illusion o f reality . He uses
two main devices . The first is presenting the Shotovers ' ship-shaped hous e
on the Downs as a palace of sleep, where everything may have been asleep
for a  hundred year s o r alternativel y ma y just hav e dropped off , t o drea m
uneasily o f a  nightmare future . Th e play begin s with Elli e nodding of f t o
sleep over her copy of Othello,  while her hostess has drowsed of f upstair s
arranging flowers (poppie s and mandragora, no doubt) in a guest room. In
the second act , Elli e puts Boss Mangan t o sleep in a hypnotic trance , and
Ariadne tongue-lashes Randall to tears, like a fractious child , to make him
drowsy fo r bed . I n th e thir d act , Mazzin i Dun n come s dow n t o joi n th e
dreamers o n th e terrac e i n pyjama s an d a  flamboyant  dressing-gown ,
declaring tha t h e feels perfectly a t home so dressed a t Heartbreak House ,
and is reminded by Ariadne that this would not be the case in any normal,
well-run Englis h countr y hous e o f th e kin d sh e would prefer . Meanwhil e
Captain Shotover , deprived o f the rum tha t keep s him awake , has drifte d
off t o sleep in Ellie's arms. After th e initial sound of a clock striking six at
the opening of the play, the audience never knows the time. The night takes
on the endlessness and formlessness o f the small hours, while the watchers
in the house sit entranced b y moonlight that reminds Hesione of the night
in Tristan  and  Isolde,  Part o f th e sens e tha t th e hous e ha s drifte d awa y
from it s moorings in reality comes from thi s carefully create d illusio n tha t
time has stopped, and the mundane reality of daytime receded.

Shaw's other devic e is an equivalent unmoorin g o f the Shotovers ' house
from it s geographical position in the here and now. Mostly this is achieved
by letting Captain Shotover expand the world of the play into the world of
his memory an d ancien t perspectiv e o n life . The means b y which h e does
this vary from detail s as small as his asking Ellie to "favou r m e with your
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name," a usage with the period courtlines s o f hi s Regency youth , an d hi s
talk o f the wooden figurehead of his ship the Dauntless , which hi s son-in-
law Hasting s Utterwor d s o resembled , bac k i n th e ag e befor e iro n an d
steam conquere d th e seas , to hi s refusa l a t hi s ag e "t o mak e distinction s
between on e fello w creatur e an d another. " Ther e ar e als o o f cours e th e
hundred smal l way s i n whic h h e treat s th e hous e a s i f i t wer e a  ship ,
blowing hi s captain' s whistl e an d shoutin g "Al l hand s aloft! " whe n a
burglar i s discovered upstair s an d tellin g Nurse Guinnes s to "tak e hi m t o
the forecastle. " Abov e all , he makes th e hous e fee l a s i f i t wer e a  flimsy ,
impermanent structure . " I cam e her e o n you r daughter' s invitation, "
protests Mangan , whe n th e captai n upbraid s hi m fo r wantin g t o marry a
young girl . "Am I  in her house o r yours?" "You are beneath th e dom e of
heaven, in the house of God," Shotover replies . "What i s true within these
walls i s tru e outsid e them . G o ou t o n th e seas ; clim b th e mountains ,
wander throug h th e valleys . She is still too young." 14 Whenever Shotove r
comes on stage, he makes the floor seem to heave like a deck, the timbers of
the house seem to creak like a ship's at sea. A director might do worse than
to make these effects happe n i n a production, i f his stage were capable of
them.

Much of the difficulty Heartbreak  House encountered fro m critic s in its
early productions was surely the result of the fact tha t i t was never played
as it was designed to be played, in wartime. Its world premiere was staged
by the Theatre Guild in New York in 1920 , its first London production by
J. B. Fagan the following year. Shaw says in his preface that he withheld the
play from productio n i n 191 7 because he recognized tha t nationa l moral e
must come first in time of war, and Heartbreak House might have lowered
morale. H e ma y als o hav e recognize d tha t n o managemen t wa s likel y t o
take a  chance o n i t while theatres were filled by such things as Chu  Chin
Chow and The Maid of the Mountains, unless it could boast a star as great
as Mrs. Patrick Campbell . He read her the play in July 1917 . She admired
it with reservations; but the only parts she would b e interested i n playing,
she told Shaw , would b e either Elli e Dunn o r Shotove r himself . Not unti l
twelve year s late r di d Sha w admi t t o he r tha t h e ha d modele d Hesion e
Hushabye on her.

As a result, Heartbreak House had to wait for real success in the theatre
until the Second World War, when Robert Donat staged it at the Cambridge
Theatre i n Londo n i n Marc h 1943 , playin g Captai n Shotove r himself .
Deborah Kerr , the n twenty-two , playe d Elli e Dunn . B y then , th e wors t
German air raids on London were over and the V-i rocket raids had not yet
begun. But audiences seeing the play could receive directly the unique effec t
Shaw ha d designe d i t t o produce . What bega n a s a n Edwardia n comed y
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lifted ou t o f it s period, t o floa t i n a  timeless twentieth-century mixtur e of
disillusion an d presentiment s o f disaster , an d ende d i n th e present , wit h
bombs rainin g dow n o n England . Ther e ha s scarcel y bee n a  year sinc e in
which Shaw's extraordinary theatre poem, as authentic a myth for imperia l
Britain a s Blake' s propheti c books , ha s no t seeme d uncannil y relevan t t o
the civilization whose end it foresaw.
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Reinventing the history play:
Caesar and Cleopatra,  Saint Joan,

"In Good  King  Charles's  Golden Days"

Defining th e history play

When th e Player s arriv e a t Elsinore , Polonius detail s th e genre s an d sub -
genres o f th e Elizabetha n theatr e i n whic h the y excel : "tragedy , comedy ,
history, pastoral , pastoral-comical , historical-pastoral , tragical-historical ,
tragical-comical-historical-pastoral, scen e individable , or poem unlimited "
{Hamlet, Il.ii). The joke makes clear tha t eve n a t the time when historie s
were enjoyin g thei r greates t popularity , a s Herber t Lindenberge r put s it ,
"the boundaries betwee n historica l drama an d recognizable genres such as
tragedy an d romanc e ar e ofte n quit e fluid." 1 Definin g historica l dram a i n
the age of Shakespeare, Irving Ribner draws a distinction betwee n plays in
which th e playwrigh t "assume s th e functio n o f th e historian, " an d "ro -
mantic drama usin g historical figures" with "no attempt to accomplish the
serious purpose o f the historian." 2 Wha t Ribne r see s as the distinguishin g
feature o f the Elizabethan history play Shaw singles out as his own special
claim: Shaw, too, insists that he is a serious historian and that such dramas
as Caesar and Cleopatra, Saint Joan, and "In  Good King Charles's Golden
Days3' must b e evaluated a s contributions t o historical knowledge . At the
same time, Shaw, with characteristic playfulness, suggest s that attention to
detail, one "serious purpose of the historian," is of little interest to him: "I
never worry mysel f abou t historica l detail s unti l th e play i s done; human
nature i s very muc h th e sam e alway s an d everywhere, " h e told Clarenc e
Rook. "Give n Caesar , an d a  certai n se t o f circumstances , I  kno w wha t
would happen , an d whe n I  hav e finished  the pla y yo u wil l find I  hav e
written history." 3 Shaw' s clai m t o find a  higher historica l trut h tha n tha t
found b y pedants worrying the details draws its force from a  long tradition
of rivalry between historians and playwrights that characterizes discussion
of historical drama ever since Shakespeare.

Shaw shows his awareness o f this rivalry by identifying Saint  Joan with
the Elizabetha n chronicl e histor y pla y for m (it s subtitl e i s " A Chronicl e
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Play i n Si x Scenes") . Caesar  and Cleopatra  he call s mor e bluntl y " A
History"; an d "In  Good  King  Charles's  Golden Days,"  " A True Histor y
That Neve r Happened." In this last instance, he explicitly raises questions
about the relationship between historical fact and historical truth that also
have a  lon g tradition . Aristotle , i n th e Poetics,  first raise s th e distinctio n
between plays about events that have happened and plays about events that
may happen, and declares that poetry "i s more philosophical and a higher
thing tha n history : fo r poetr y tend s t o expres s th e universal , histor y th e
particular."4 Renaissanc e critic s lik e Si r Phili p Sidne y agreed , rindin g
history deficien t i n it s bondage to particulars . Thomas Rymer , in A Short
View of  Tragedy  (1692 ) pugnaciousl y paraphrase d Aristotle' s famou s
dictum: "Poetry is led more by Philosophy, the reason and nature of things,
than History; which only records things higlety, piglety, right or wrong, as
they happen."5 Sha w recasts the ancien t dialecti c of poetry and histor y in
the Preface  to Saint  Joan. Onl y b y mean s o f a n "inevitabl e sacrific e o f
verisimilitude" can h e secure "sufficien t veracity " i n hi s representation o f
figures from the past.6

While Sha w makes hi s most pointe d clai m t o th e statu s o f historia n i n
these thre e plays , singlin g the m ou t fro m Shaw' s outpu t a s specificall y
belonging t o the genre o f histor y play i s to se t aside a  profusion o f othe r
plays tha t touc h o n histor y i n a  number o f ways . Martin Meise l add s t o
these thre e The  Man of  Destiny,  "A Fictitious Paragrap h o f History" ; of
Shaw's dramas, Meisel argues , this short pla y mos t closely resembles "th e
Scribe-Sardou strai n o f historica l romance , wit h it s diplomati c intrigues ,
contested papers, and amorous concerns."7 The Devil's Disciple, labeled by
Shaw " A Melodrama, " als o belong s t o tha t nineteenth-centur y popula r
form o f melodrama i n which a  historical figure enter s into a fully fictiona l
plot, as General Burgoyne does here. The Dark Lady of the Sonnets could
well be classified wit h plays about the lives of famous poets : a brief vogue
for such "Dichterdramen"  existed during the 1840s in Germany. Arms and
the Man  i s set agains t th e backdro p o f th e Serbo-Bulgaria n wa r o f 1885,
though Shaw admitted to requesting the facts from an authority and adding
them t o a  play that wa s substantially finished ; an d o f Great  Catherine he
confesses tha t th e play offers a  bravura tur n fo r a n actress but wil l "leave
the reader a s ignorant o f Russian history now as he may be before h e has
turned th e page" [Collected  Plays,  vol. IV, p. 899). J. L . Wisenthal argue s
that "man y o f Shaw' s play s ca n profitabl y b e see n i n th e ligh t o f hi s
thinking abou t history, " no t onl y thos e se t i n a  historica l present , lik e
Heartbreak House, Major Barbara, and John Bull's Other Island, bu t also
those, lik e Back  to  Methusaleh,  tha t projec t presen t histor y int o th e
future.8
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Such uncertaint y abou t namin g an d definitio n dominate s discussio n o f
historical drama . It s statu s a s a  genre separat e fro m comed y an d traged y
dates from th e First Folio's division of Shakespeare's works into Polonius's
first thre e categories . Bu t Elizabetha n practic e wa s mor e vague : The
Merchant of Venice,  for example , first appeared i n Quart o a s "The Mos t
Excellent Histori e o f the Merchant o f Venice," and Richard  HI, which we
now classify wit h the history plays , was first published a s The Tragedy of
Richard the Third. King Lear enjoyed publication first as a "True Chronicle
Historie" and then was classified amon g the tragedies in the Folio. Shaw's
assertion that in Saint Joan he runs the gamut of the genres - "th e romance
of her rise, the tragedy of her execution, and the comedy of the attempts of
posterity t o mak e amend s fo r tha t execution " (Collected  Plays, vol. VI,
p. 66)  - refer s back to the infinite variety of the Elizabethan history plays.

Reinventing th e histor y pla y (i) : English historica l dram a
after Shakespear e

Shaw's reinventio n o f th e histor y pla y take s plac e mos t importantl y i n a
context o f Englis h theatrica l practice . The Victorian theatr e prize d abov e
all the historical . Nineteenth-century productio n o f Shakespeare' s plays in
England was dominated b y the desire for historicity in settings. Lavish and
accurate costuming , expensiv e reconstructio n o f palace s an d castles ,
detailed reenactments of coronations and royal weddings, were all feature s
of production s tha t severel y cu t Shakespeare' s text s a s the y ravishe d th e
eyes o f th e spectators . Antiquarians offere d thei r expertis e t o ensure , fo r
example, that the courtiers in James Robinson Planche' s King John (1823 )
would b e "sheathed i n mail, with cylindrica l helmets and correct armoria l
shields."9 Whe n playin g W . G . Wills' s Charles  I (1872) , Henr y Irvin g
carefully imitate d th e famous Va n Dyke portraits i n his stage makeup: "I t
was as though one of Van Dyke's portraits had stepped out of its frame and
been endowed with life," one critic enthused.10

This kind o f pictoria l accurac y was challenged i n the 1890 s by William
Poel and the Elizabethan Stag e Society, who staged amateur performance s
of the plays of Shakespear e an d hi s contemporaries o n stages designed t o
emulate th e Elizabetha n platfor m stage , an d als o i n authenticall y Eliza -
bethan sites , such as the halls of the Inns of Court . As theatre reviewer fo r
the Saturday Review, Shaw agreed with Poel's principal goal: "It is only by
such performance s tha t peopl e ca n b e convince d tha t Shakespear' s play s
lose more than they gain by modern staging." Poel's productions did away
with th e pictoria l se t an d stresse d instea d th e costume s an d musi c o f th e
Elizabethan period . "[NJothin g lik e th e dressin g o f hi s production s ha s
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been seen by the present generation," Sha w wrote in 1898 : "our ordinar y
managers have simply been patronizing the conventional costumier' s busi-
ness i n a  ver y expensiv e way , whils t Mr . Poe l ha s achieve d artisti c
originality, beauty , an d novelt y o f effect , a s wel l a s the fulles t attainabl e
measure of historical conviction .  . . The result, on the whole, is that those
who have attended th e performances hav e learnt to know the Elizabetha n
drama i n a way that no extremity o f reading the plays - o r rather readin g
about the plays and pretending to have read them - coul d have led them to,
and this , I  tak e it , i s wha t Mr . Poe l promise d ou r literar y amateurs." 11

Shaw's enthusias m fo r Poel' s experimen t wa s o f cours e tempere d b y hi s
critique o f particula r performers , an d indee d Poel' s liberatio n o f Shake -
speare from th e tyranny of the Victorian se t designer often le d to a quirky,
equally pedantic Elizabethanism. Poel's claim to a higher degree of authen-
ticity i n stagin g coul d b e countere d b y th e sceni c designer' s clai m t o a
higher degree of authenticity to history.12 Planche's barons in Shakespeare's
King John looke d lik e rea l medieva l barons ; Poel' s Elizabethan s alway s
looked like Elizabethans. In both instances the claim of historicity evokes a
counterclaim o f anachronism: a charge which, as we shall see, Shaw came
to delight in inviting for his historical plays.

The kin d o f authenticit y represente d b y Henr y Irvin g i n th e guis e o f
Van Dyke's portraits of Charles I was prized not only in staging, but also in
a play's portrayal o f historical figures. Just as Irving was supposed to look
like Charles , his actions and conduc t i n the play were expected t o coher e
with a reputation fixed in narrative and pictorial sources, a whole tradition
of "Victoria n historica l iconography, " a s Stephen Wat t put s it . Historica l
figures wer e in a sense stock characters: the sentimentalization of Charles Ps
domestic life led in Wills's play to a focus on the king as husband and father .
Wills cause d a  smal l outburs t o f outrag e b y characterizin g Cromwel l a s
greedy and ambitious, a "slanderous invention" according to critics, which
Wills defended as attested in "numerous contemporary pamphlets."13

In concentrating on Charles's devotion to his family and wringing pathos
from Henriett a Maria' s desperat e interventions , Charles  I i s typica l o f
English historica l dram a eve r sinc e th e Restoration . Daunte d b y vigilan t
censorship, Englis h dramatist s fro m abou t 168 0 shie d awa y fro m th e
political implications of their stories. Censorship was fully institutionalize d
in th e Licensin g Ac t o f 1737 . The first  play supprese d b y the act , Henr y
Brooke's Gustavus Vasa (1739) was a historical play, thought to offer i n its
portrayal of a Swedish patriot ("The Father of His Country" is the subtitle)
an invidiou s paralle l wit h th e government . Bu t Brooke' s pla y actuall y
relocated th e cause o f Gustavus' s rebellion agains t th e Danes in a  privat e
amorous intrigue . Englis h dramatist s generall y focuse d o n th e domesti c
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lives o f historica l figures , stagin g thei r privat e passion s an d sorrow s an d
leaving the business of history - th e story-lines of their plays - i n the hands
of villainous statesmen. Secre t loves, private jealousies, misdirected letters ,
trivial cause s o f grea t publi c events : thes e al l ad d u p t o a  dramati c
historiography tha t dominate d th e nineteenth-century stag e as thoroughly
as did the elaborate, authenticated pageantry of set decor.

English historical drama before Shaw also featured wha t Nicholas Rowe
called, introducin g hi s Tragedy  of  Jane  Shore  (1714) , "Imitatio n o f
Shakespeare's Style. " Rowe' s clai m calle d dow n immediat e ridicul e fro m
such contemporaries as Swift and Pope. Oaths, archaisms, clumsy locutions
- "Avaunt , base groom!" - became , despite the scorn of some, the language
of histor y o n th e Englis h stage . Suc h overcharge d languag e als o ruine d
experiments in verse tragedy like Shelley's Cenci,  as Shaw argued: working
within the form originated by Otway and Rowe, Shelley "certainly got hold
of th e wrong vehicle. " Shaw continues: "The obligations impose d o n him
by this form an d its traditions were that he should imitate Shakspere in an
un-Shaksperean fashio n b y attemptin g t o writ e constantl y a s Shaksper e
only wrote a t the extreme emotional crises in his plays .  . ,"14 Finding the
right vehicle for dramatizing past history becomes for Shaw a quest to find
a languag e fo r th e pas t tha t i s not a n inadvertentl y parodic  emulatio n o f
Shakespearean style . "Henc e th e shoc k o f Londoners, " effuse s Niloufe r
Harben, "whe n Shaw' s Juliu s Caesa r cam e o n th e stag e speakin g plai n
English!"15

Reinventing th e histor y pla y (2) : Shakespeare an d Europea n
Romanticism

The identification o f Shakespeare with historica l dram a wa s absolute , not
only on the English stage in the eighteenth and nineteenth centuries, but on
the French and German stages as well. Neither country had a  Renaissance
tradition of historical drama. French drama in the seventeenth century was
resolutely uninterested i n the French past, recent or otherwise. Instead, the
classical dramatist s concentrate d o n ancien t Greec e an d Rom e fo r thei r
stories; Voltaire , who se t ou t t o flou t th e restraint s an d decorum s o f th e
classical stag e i n hi s dramati c work , wa s th e first  t o introduc e medieva l
French setting s int o hi s plays . Voltair e professe d admiratio n o f Shake -
speare, whom h e saw as a cudgel with which to bludgeo n th e eighteenth -
century Frenc h literar y an d theatrica l establishment . Afte r Voltaire , th e
French Romanti c playwrights , suc h a s Victo r Hug o i n hi s prefac e t o
Cromwell (1827) , an d critic s suc h a s Stendha l i n hi s highl y influentia l
Racine and Shakespeare (1823) actively championed Shakespeare' s irregu -
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larities o f structur e an d inconsistencie s o f styl e a s a  wa y t o rejuvenat e
French drama . Likewise , Germa n playwright s o f th e lat e eighteenth -
century Sturm  und Drang  school sa w in the Shakespearean histor y play a
way to shru g of f th e dominance o f Frenc h classica l forms an d to create a
uniquely German dramatic tradition.

Shaw's insistenc e tha t th e Englis h theatr e recogniz e it s ow n Europea n
context - mos t conspicuous in his championship of Ibsen - carrie s through
into his approach t o the problem o f historica l drama . While Shakespeare ,
as understoo d an d stage d b y th e professiona l Londo n theatre , wa s a
stultifying influence , t o Schille r and Goeth e hi s raw Gothi c power was an
inspiration. Germa n dramatists , a s Benjami n Bennet t ha s pu t it , ha d th e
advantage ove r Englis h dramatists , wh o "obviousl y coul d no t drea m o f
becoming the English Shakespeare."16 The dream of becoming the German,
or, fo r Victo r Hugo , th e French , Shakespeare , o n th e othe r hand , le d
Shakespearean imitatio n i n a  differen t directio n fo r thos e no t disadvan -
taged by being forced to compete in the same language.

"Shakespearo-Manie," th e passio n t o imitat e Shakespear e an d creat e a
national historica l dramatic tradition, was a widespread phenomenon. "At
the end o f the eighteenth century, " Philip Edwards argues , "Shakespeare' s
English histor y plays , whic h ha d contribute d powerfull y t o England' s
national awarenes s a t th e en d o f th e sixteent h century , bega n a  new life ,
profoundly importan t an d long-lasting , i n developin g a  sens e o f nationa l
awareness i n othe r countries." 17 I n Germany , Friedric h an d Augus t
Wilhelm Schlegel , Shakespeare' s translators , calle d fo r a  nationa l poe t t o
give t o German s a  past , a s Shakespear e ha d give n a  pas t t o th e English .
Schiller, in particular, seemed to fill this bill.

No playwrigh t befor e Sha w dramatize s s o powerfull y th e rivalr y
between historia n an d dramatis t a s doe s Schiller . Schille r serve d a s
Professor o f History at the University of Jena, and wrote a narrative history
of the Thirty Years ' War. Schiller found th e partisanship o f the sources he
consulted in his research for this work distasteful . A t one point, describing
the deat h o f Gustavu s Adolphus , Schille r contrast s contemplatio n o f th e
higher trut h o f Providenc e t o th e mudan e dut y o f th e historian : "B y
whatever han d h e fell , hi s extraordinar y destin y mus t appea r a  grea t
interposition o f Providence . History , to o ofte n confine d t o th e ungratefu l
task o f analyzin g th e unifor m pla y o f huma n passions , i s occasionall y
rewarded b y th e appearanc e o f events , whic h strik e lik e a  han d fro m
heaven int o th e nicel y adjuste d machiner y o f huma n plan s an d carr y th e
mind to a higher order of things."18 Schiller carried this desire to think of a
"higher orde r o f things " rathe r tha n confin e himsel f t o th e "ungratefu l
task" o f histor y int o hi s tragic trilogy , Wallenstein.  Here Schille r add s t o
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history a  fictitious couple, Max an d Thekla , wh o no t onl y functio n a s a
love-interest bu t als o rebe l agains t th e limitation s o f th e moral , political ,
historical worl d i n whic h the y find  themselve s cas t adrift . Wallenstein ,
Schiller's character , onl y reluctantl y perform s th e action s histor y record s
him as performing, wondering aloud at his own motivations. The challenge
to historical fac t i n Schiller's historical drama , though , reaches it s peak in
The Maid of Orleans,  where, according to Shaw, we find Joan "drowned in
a witch' s caldron o f raging romance." Schiller provided Joan wit h a  love-
interest, of course; but he went further an d deprived her of her trial and her
death a t th e stake . Instead , sh e fall s gloriousl y o n th e field  o f battle .
"Schiller's Joan ha s no t a  singl e poin t o f contac t wit h th e rea l Joan, no r
indeed wit h an y morta l woma n tha t eve r walke d thi s earth, " Sha w
complained. Whil e Sha w deplore d "Schiller' s romanti c nonsense "
(Collected Plays, vol. VI , pp. 40 , 41-42) , Schille r i n hi s historica l play s
sought, a s Shaw would do , to offse t th e deficiencie s o f history b y drama-
tizing higher, essential truths.

Also insisten t o n th e primac y o f th e artis t ove r th e mer e historia n wa s
Shaw's near-contemporar y Augus t Strindberg . Strindberg' s astonishin g
output includes twelve plays on Swedish history and four "world-historica l
plays," devoted to Luther, Socrates, Moses, and Christ . Most of these were
written between 1898 and 1902 ; Strindberg planned cycles of both Swedish
and world-historical plays , but never completed either . In 1903, Strindberg
published an essay entitled "Th e Mysticism of World History" in which he
projected a  vision of history as "a colossal chess game with a solitary player
moving both black and white."19 Characters in Strindberg's historical plays
find themselves in the grip of forces they do not understand, rewarded and
punished by an inscrutable Providence.

Hegel, Buckle , an d Mar x

Shaw seems to b e unaware o f Strindberg' s historica l plays , but , a s Strind-
berg's use of the phrase "world-historical" makes clear, Strindberg was, like
Shaw, attracted to Hegel's view of history. According to Hegel, history is a
dialectical process , a  constan t oppositio n an d negotiatio n betwee n th e
poles of Freedom and Necessity. The human spiri t pushes toward freedo m
and self-knowledge, bu t as it moves from one phase to the next it generates
contradiction an d opposition . Onl y th e world-historica l individua l ca n
intuit the next phase, and act "instinctively to bring to pass that which the
time required. " Suc h individual s deriv e thei r "purpos e an d vocatio n no t
from th e calm , regular cours e o f things , sanctioned b y the existing order ,
but fro m a  secre t sourc e whos e conten t i s stil l hidde n an d ha s no t ye t
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broken throug h int o existence." 20 Hege l i s here speaking of Julius Caesar ,
but his language can apply accurately not only to Saint Joan, but also to the
Isaac Newton o f "In  Good  King Charles's Golden Days"; Napoleon an d
even Genera l Burgoyne , i n Shaw' s historica l melodramas , likewis e see m
prescient, i n touc h wit h th e "secre t source " fro m whic h th e futur e wil l
spring.

"Did yo u eve r rea d Buckle' s Histor y o f Civilization? " Sha w aske d a
friend; "I f not , do."  Strindberg , too , professe d himsel f fascinate d b y th e
work o f Henry Thomas Buckle , whose History  of  Civilization  in  England
(1857-61) applied scientific principles to the writing of history and pointed
out the operation in history of evolutionary laws. "One error conflicts with
another; each destroys its opponent, and truth is evolved," Buckle declared.
Strindberg, lik e Shaw , admire d Buckle' s celebratio n o f iconoclas m an d
skepticism, an d i n his first histor y play , Master Olof  (1872) , he offered a
hero wh o challenge d receive d ideas . Subtitle d "Wha t i s Truth?, " Strind -
berg's play endorsed Buckle's contention that "the authors of new ideas, the
proposers o f ne w contrivances , an d th e originator s o f ne w heresies , ar e
benefactors o f thei r species." 21 Fro m Buckl e bot h Strindber g an d Sha w
derived a  view o f histor y a s an evolutionar y struggl e o f idea s i n conflict .
Strindberg, converte d t o a n idiosyncrati c Christia n mysticis m afte r hi s
mental breakdow n i n the late 1890s , came to repudiate Buckle' s positivist
methodology. Whil e Shaw , too , wa s skeptica l o f Buckle' s full-throate d
endorsement o f material, technological, and industria l progress , his histor-
ical drama s sho w heroe s i n conflic t wit h thei r societies , "author s o f ne w
ideas, proposers of new contrivances, and originators of new heresies," and
indeed propos e the m t o b e "benefactor s o f thei r species. " "Sha w a s
historian belonge d ver y muc h t o th e idealis t school s o f th e nineteent h
century; for he presented ideas, embodied in men, as the realities of history,
and will, not accident, as its driving energy," declares Martin Meisel.22

Shaw recommended i n The Intelligent Woman's Guide  to Socialism and
Capitalism further readin g no t onl y i n Buckle but , o f course , in Marx. " I
was completely Marxed," Shaw said (i n 1934 ) of his early reading of Das
Kapital; "When I  read Das  Kapital by Marx," Bertol t Brech t declare d i n
1926, "I understood my plays." For Brecht, Marx was "the only spectator"
for who m he would write . "Karl Marx changed th e mind of the world by
simply tellin g th e purseprou d nineteent h centur y it s ow n villainou s
history," th e So n declare s i n Buoyant  Billions  (Collected  Plays, vol. vn ,
p. 318) , and Sha w in numerous locations endorse s this view. The celebra-
tion o f materia l progres s b y Victoria n historians , especiall y Thoma s
Babington Macaulay , invited "Marxia n debunking." 23 As a Fabian social -
ist, Sha w adopte d muc h o f Marx' s theor y o f th e economi c force s tha t
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shaped histor y an d applie d Marxia n critiqu e t o Macaulay' s vie w o f
Victorian capitalism as the highest expression of personal liberty.

In Macaulay , the idea o f progres s animate s the history o f England , an d
the goa l t o whic h progres s lead s i s Macaulay' s ow n time . Thi s "Whi g
interpretation o f history," a s Herbert Butterfiel d calle d it , uses the present
as a  historica l endpoint , a  vantag e poin t fro m whic h th e pas t become s
intelligible. In a sense, it is winner's history: every earlier event can be seen
as contributin g t o curren t condition s whic h ar e wholl y satisfactory . Fo r
Shaw, as for Brecht, current conditions, based upon savage inequities in the
distribution o f propert y an d exploitatio n o f labor , ar e deplorable . Mor e
Hegelian than Marxist in his dramaturgy of ideas and in his celebration of
world-historical individuals , Sha w sa w Mar x a s a  stron g counte r t o th e
late-Victorian complacency enshrined in Macaulay's Whig interpretation of
English history.

Anachronism

According t o Butterfield , viewin g th e pas t fro m th e perspectiv e o f th e
present lead s inevitabl y t o anachronism : "Th e stud y o f th e pas t wit h on e
eye, so to speak, upon the present is the source of all sins and sophistries in
history, starting with the simplest of them, the anachronism."24 Anachron -
ism is also the means by which Shaw most plainly shocks the audiences of
his historical plays and challenges their preconceptions about the past. Just
as Poel's Elizabethan experiment s challenge d Victorian idea s abou t repre -
sentational authenticit y i n staging , Sha w use s anachronis m t o offe r a
serious critique of the positivist Whig historiography o f popular historian s
such a s Macaulay . Similarly , Brech t -  wh o offere d u p "Thre e Cheer s fo r
Shaw" earl y i n hi s caree r (1926 ) -  insiste d late r o n th e importanc e o f
"historicizing": "B y means o f historicizing , a n entir e socia l syste m ca n be
observed fro m th e viewpoin t o f anothe r socia l system." 25 Wha t Brech t
would develop into a full-fledged theor y of theatre based upon making the
strange familia r an d th e familia r strang e -  a  strateg y o f "alienation " o r
Verfremdung -  Sha w anticipate s i n hi s persisten t an d playfu l us e o f
anachronism in his history plays.

Caesar and Cleopatra  (1899)

A glarin g exampl e o f thi s strateg y i s Shaw' s portraya l i n Caesar  and
Cleopatra of Britannus, Caesar's secretary. A Romanized Briton , dressed in
blue, his "serious air and sense of the importance of the business at hand is
in marked contrast to the kindly interest of Caesar, who looks at the scene,
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17 Anachronisti c detail s - Ancien t Briton with Eyeglass: Caesar (Douglas Rain) discussin g
civilization with Britannus (Her b Foster) in the Shaw Festival's 198 3 production o f

Caesar and Cleopatra

which is new to  him, with the  frank curiosity  of a child*'' {Collected  Plays,
vol. II , p . 198). Britannus , pompou s an d humorless , defend s hi s bureau -
cratic blu e suit . "I s i t tru e tha t whe n Caesa r caugh t yo u o n tha t island, "
Cleopatra asks , "you were painted al l over blue?" "Blue is the color worn
by al l Briton s o f goo d standing, " Britannu s stiffl y responds . "I n war , we
stain ou r bodie s blue ; s o tha t thoug h ou r enemie s ma y stri p u s o f ou r
clothes and our lives , they cannot strip us of our respectability" (Collected
Plays, vol. II , p. 222). Here Sha w conflate s th e blu e body-paintin g o f th e
primitive Brito n wit h th e imperia l civi l servant' s cul t o f "respectability. "
Likewise, Britannu s invoke s th e regula r churchgoin g o f th e responsibl e
Victorian i n confrontin g Caesar : "Wha t Brito n speak s a s you d o i n you r
moments of levity? What Briton neglects to attend the services at the sacred
grove? Wha t Brito n wear s clothe s o f man y color s a s yo u do , instea d o f
plain blue , a s al l solid , wel l esteeme d me n should ? Thes e ar e mora l
questions with us" (Collected Plays, vol . 11, p. 241). Here the juxtaposition
of British domestic sobriety with the paganism of the "sacred grove" takes
on a further dimensio n of anachronism in the biblical echo of Joseph's coat
of many colors.
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Shaw carries th e joke furthe r i n his endnote t o th e play : " I find among
those wh o hav e rea d thi s pla y i n manuscrip t a  stron g convictio n tha t a n
ancient Brito n coul d no t possibl y hav e bee n lik e a  moder n one. " Sha w
parodies the theories of Hippolyte Taine , whose history o f Britain insisted
on the centrality of race and climate in determining national character. "We
have me n o f exactl y th e sam e stock , an d speakin g th e sam e language ,
growing i n Grea t Britain , i n Ireland , an d i n America, " h e argues . "Th e
result i s three o f th e mos t distinctl y marke d nationalitie s unde r th e sun. "
The characteristics of the British type, he continues, would have been more
pronounced i n ancient Britain : indeed "exaggerated , since modern Britain ,
disforested, drained , urbanified , an d consequentl y cosmopolized , i s pre -
sumably les s characteristicall y Britis h tha n Caesar' s Britain " (Collected
Plays, vol . II , p . 300). Th e intellectua l footwor k her e i s dazzling . Th e
putative critic , discomfite d b y th e appearanc e o f a  moder n bureaucrati c
character-type in what calls itself, after all , "A History," is disarmed by the
invocation o f climatologica l theory . Th e accusatio n tha t Britannu s i s a
modern type is turned on its head; an ancient Briton would have to be even
more quintessentiall y "British " tha n a  modern , Sha w counters . B y pre -
tending to universalize the type of the Macaulayan complacent imperialist ,
Shaw i n effec t point s t o it s narro w identificatio n wit h it s ow n clas s an d
place in time.

Shaw insiste d i n a  190 2 lette r proposin g a  production i n Vienna upo n
changing Britannu s s o tha t th e Austria n audienc e coul d mak e th e prope r
identification: h e requeste d "Britannu s change d int o a n ech t Wiene r
bourgeois, an d a  splendi d mise  en scene."  This remar k o f cours e make s
nonsense ou t o f the whole climatological argumen t tha t Sha w would late r
offer i n the published version of the play. He wants his audience, British or
Viennese, t o se e i n Britannu s a  representative o f a  particula r class , not a
particular "nationality. " Fo r a  Polis h productio n o f th e play , Sha w
suggested replacin g Ra' s reference s t o Englan d i n th e Prologu e wit h
references t o Poland , an d h e helpfull y explaine d t o th e play' s Frenc h
translators tha t "Egyp t fo r th e Egyptians " wa s a  "phras e o f th e Libera l
politician Si r Willia m Harcourt. " Britannu s i s eve n describe d i n a  stag e
direction as " unconsciously anticipating a later statesman" when he echoes
Disraeli's formulation, "Peac e with honor."26

The play satirize s the decorum s o f Britis h imperia l cultur e whil e a t the
same tim e celebratin g th e imperia l visio n o f Caesar . Fo r i n Julius Caesa r
both Hege l an d Sha w sa w a  world-historica l figure,  an d Shaw' s source ,
Theodor Mommsen's History of Rome, similarly saw Caesar as a magnetic
hero -  "th e entir e an d perfec t man, " i n Mommsen's words. 27 But Shaw' s
presentation o f hi s hero i s complex, part debunking , par t glorification . I n
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Caesar's address to the Sphinx, at the beginning of the play, both elements
mingle: Caesar's portentous declaration that he has found "n o air native to
me, no man kindred to me, none who can do my day's deed, and think my
night's thought " i s undercu t b y Cleopatra' s greetin g -  "Ol d gentleman "
(Collected Plays, vol. II, p. 182). Nonetheless, the action of the play shows
Caesar t o b e i n tun e wit h th e Lif e Forc e an d ou t o f sympath y wit h
Britannus's advocacy of business as usual in the empire.

In writin g abou t Caesa r a s a  world-historica l figure,  Sha w wa s als o
throwing down the gauntlet to Shakespeare. "The truce with Shakespear is
over," h e trumpeted i n a  review o f a  production o f Julius Caesar. Shake -
speare stands exposed in Julius Caesar as "a man, not for al l time, but fo r
an ag e only , an d tha t age , too, i n al l solidl y wis e an d heroi c aspects , the
most despicable of all the ages in our history." Shaw lambasts Shakespeare
for his inability to dramatize Caesar as a "great man": instead we are given
a "sill y braggart": "There is not a  single sentence uttered b y Shakespeare's
Julius Caesa r tha t is , I will not say worthy o f him, but even worthy o f an
average Tammany boss."28 Ra, in the 1912 prologue to the play, chides the
audience fo r expectin g Antony and  Cleopatra:  "D o ye crave for a  story of
an unchast e woman ? Hat h th e nam e o f Cleopatr a tempte d y e hither? "
(Collected Plays, vol. 11, p. 166). As Wisenthal wittily observes, Shaw makes
it clear how littl e Cleopatr a ha s learned fro m Caesar , when, a t the end of
the play , sh e dream s o f Mar k Antony : "Th e ful l measur e o f Cleopatra' s
inferiority i s he r preferenc e t o b e i n Shakespeare' s pla y rathe r tha n
Shaw's."29

In his attack upon Shakespeare, Shaw sets himself u p as a historian who
can se e throug h Shakespeare' s prejudice s an d limitations . Shakespeare ,
Shaw argue d i n "Bernar d Sha w an d th e Heroi c Actor, " create d i n Julius
Caesar "nothin g bu t th e conventiona l tyran t o f th e Elizabetha n stag e
adapted to Plutarch's Roundheaded accoun t of him." There is a staggering
anachronism i n the identification o f Plutarch a s a "Roundhead": fo r wha t
Shaw i s actuall y takin g o n i s the Whi g historiograph y o f Macaula y tha t
saw i n th e Civi l Wa r a  ste p i n th e directio n o f liberty . "Shakespear' s
sympathies were with Plutarch and the Nonconformist Conscience , which
he personified a s Brutus," Shaw continues. "From the date of Shakespear' s
play onward England believed in Brutus with growing hope and earnestness
until the assassination in the Capitol was repeated in Whitehall, and Brutus
got hi s chance fro m Cromwell , who found hi m hopelessl y incapable , and
ruled in Caesar's fashion unti l he died, when the nation sent for Charle s II
because it was determined to have anybody rather than Brutus" (Collected
Plays, vol. II , pp. 309-10). Thi s ran t utterl y misread s Shakespeare' s play ,
transforms Shakespear e int o a  kind o f Macaulay , and wildly stretches the
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18 Debunkin g mythologies - heroe s as ordinary people: Douglas Rain as Caesar and
Marti Maraden as Cleopatra in the Shaw Festival's 1983 production of

Caesar and Cleopatra

parallel t o th e breakin g point . Ye t i n i t Sha w represent s himsel f a s
defending historica l accurac y agains t Shakespeare's , Plutarch's , an d
Macaulay's depredations.

Shaw acts out hi s rivalry with Shakespeare b y reinventing Julius Caesar
as a  simplisti c Whi g allegor y o f th e Englis h Civi l Wa r an d the n chidin g
Shakespeare fo r perpetratin g suc h a  slander . I n a  simila r strateg y o f
appropriation, h e claime d tha t Caesar  and Cleopatra  was " a chapte r o f
Mommsen and a page of Plutarch furnished wit h scenery and dialogue, and
that a  boy brought to see the play could pass an examination nex t day on
the Alexandrian expedition without losing a mark" [Collected Plays, vol. II,
p. 312). That is , Shaw act s ou t hi s rivalry wit h professiona l historian s b y
suggesting that he has had exper t advice (consulting with Gilber t Murray)
and tha t hi s critics cannot distinguish betwee n pure fancy an d transcribe d
Plutarch. Shakespear e become s a n all y i n th e campaig n t o establis h th e
play's historical authenticity: like a Shakespearean chronicle play, Shaw's is
"the rea l thing , th e pla y i n whic h th e playwrigh t simpl y take s wha t th e
chronicler brings him and puts it on the stage as it is said to have happened"
(Collected Plays,  vol . 11 , p. 311). Tellingly , Sha w her e recast s Ranke' s
famous dictu m tha t histor y report s the past "wie  es eigentlich gewesen" -
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as i t reall y happene d -  wit h th e suggestio n tha t historica l narrative s
themselves ma y no t b e trustworthy . Betwee n wha t really  happened an d
what "is said to have happened" opens up the gulf of historical narrative.

In a n intervie w abou t Arms  and  the  Man,  Sha w argue d tha t historica l
narratives necessarily followed the rules of literary composition. "Why, you
cannot even write a history without adapting the facts to the conditions of
literary narrative, which are in some respects much more distorting than the
dramatic condition s o f representatio n o n stage, " Sha w pointe d out . Lik e
Schiller, h e finds  tha t sourc e materia l i s alread y contaminate d b y th e
interests o f th e creator s o f origina l document s themselves : "[A ] 11 reports ,
even by eyewitnesses, all histories, al l stories, all dramatic representation s
are only attempts to arrange the facts in a thinkable, intelligible, interesting
form - tha t is, when they are not more or less intentional efforts t o hide the
truth, as they often are. " Here Shaw gives voice to ideas that are currently
associated wit h th e wor k o f Hayde n White . I n a n extensiv e stud y o f
nineteenth-century historians , Whit e argue d tha t historica l narrative s
follow rule s of literar y genre even as they claim a  higher responsibilit y t o
fact than literature. "The contributions of Marx and Nietzsche to the 'crisis
of historicism' o f the late nineteenth century, " White argues , "consisted in
their historicizatio n o f th e very concept o f objectivit y itself." 30 Fo r Shaw,
too, the category of historical "fact" itself is suspect, dependent upon narra-
tive for its intelligibility. History never represents "what really happened."

Saint Joan (1923 )

Shaw thu s straddle s a  fenc e b y o n th e on e han d adoptin g a  postur e o f
skepticism towar d historica l sourc e materia l an d o n th e othe r han d
insisting tha t hi s historica l play s ar e mor e faithfu l t o th e sources , mor e
seriously researched , tha n thos e o f hi s predecessors . I n Saint  Joan, Shaw
takes car e t o plac e hi s play amon g othe r play s abou t Joan , amon g the m
Shakespeare's hostile representation of "Joan the Pucell" in Henry VI,  Part
One. Shaw speculates that Shakespeare began by making Joan a "beautifu l
and romanti c figure,"  bu t wa s persuade d b y hi s "scandalize d company "
that suc h a  representation woul d neve r do . Or, possibly, Shakespeare was
called i n a s a  pla y doctor , t o tinke r wit h a  "wholl y scurrilous " earlie r
version, "sheddin g a  momentar y glamo r o n th e figure  o f Th e Maid. "
Voltaire's mock-epic , La  Pucelle,  comes i n fo r critique , an d o f Schiller' s
play Shaw concludes "that it is not about Joan at all, and can hardly be said
to preten d t o be " {Collected  Flays,  vol. VI, pp. 39-40). Sha w set s ou t t o
stage Joan, a s bot h a  rea l perso n an d a  world-historica l figure,  i n touc h
with the Hegelian "secret source" of the future.
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Because tellin g th e trut h abou t th e rea l Joa n involve s assessin g he r
historical importanc e i n the long term, Shaw insists upon dramatizing no t
only he r lif e bu t it s subsequen t re-evaluation s i n he r rehabilitatio n an d
canonization i n th e Epilogue . Unlik e th e run-of-the-mil l Jeann e d'Ar c
melodramas, Shaw's play takes into account the Maid's continued presence
in history. In so doing, it pushes the limits of the form o f historical drama .
Caesar and  Cleopatra,  Meise l argues , "thoug h aggressivel y heterodo x
toward certai n convention s o f contemporar y historica l drama " remain s
bound t o Victoria n convention s o f "spectacl e an d costume. " However ,
Shaw also teases the Victorian reliance on spectacle by listing scenes such
as the Burning of the Library and the Capture of the Pharos in the program
for th e 189 9 copyrigh t performance : scene s whic h the n remai n firmly
offstage. I n Saint  Joan, Sha w promise d t o "ignor e th e limitation s o f th e
nineteenth centur y sceni c stage as completely a s Shakespear did, " and the
play moves toward the Shavian genres of Discussion, in its presentation of
the debate s amon g Cauchon , Lemaitre , and Warwick , an d Extravaganza ,
in the Epilogue.31

Again the effect i s of startling and audacious anachronism. Taking a leaf
from Thucydides ' pages - i n which the Greek historian admits to inventing
appropriate speeches for his figures to deliver - Sha w insists that Cauchon ,
Lemaitre, and Warwick ar e represented a s "saying the things they actually
would hav e sai d i f the y ha d know n wha t the y wer e reall y doing . An d
beyond thi s neither dram a no r history can go in my hands." Thus Shaw' s
trifling wit h "verisimilitude " i n matter s o f fac t serve s th e highe r goa l o f
"veracity." The anachronistic ability of Warwick and Cauchon to anticipate
Joan's late r significanc e allow s a n audienc e t o appreciat e implication s o f
which the historical originals of these characters must have been unaware.
As Sha w put s it , "the y wer e par t o f th e Middl e Age s themselves , an d
therefore a s unconscious of its peculiarities as of the atomic formula o f the
air they breathed " {Collected  Plays,  vol. VI, pp. 73-74). Pondering Joan's
insistence upon following he r voices, Warwick comments: "It is the protest
of the individual soul against the interference o f priest or peer between the
private ma n an d hi s God . I  should cal l i t Protestantism i f I  had t o find a
name fo r it. " "Scratc h a n Englishman , an d find a  Protestant, " observe s
Cauchon, dourly . "Well , i f yo u wil l bur n th e Protestant , I  wil l bur n th e
Nationalist," Warwic k concludes , fo r hi s primary anxiet y i s about Joan' s
threat to the feudal system.

Shaw even includes a Britannus-type in this debate about Joan. "Certainly
England fo r the English goes without saying, " concurs the Chaplain: "i t is
the simple law of nature. But this woman denies to England her legitimate
conquests, given her by God because of her peculiar fitness to rule over less
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19 Shiftin g th e time scale - bringin g history into the present: George Dawson a s Warwick
and Michae l Bal l as Cauchon i n the "ten t scene," in the Shaw Festival's 199 3 productio n

of Saint Joan

civilized race s fo r thei r ow n good. " I t i s a  measur e o f th e Chaplain' s
benighted simplicitas  that he echoes the Macaulayan imperia l theme at the
same moment in which he fails to notice what Shaw sees as the truth abou t
Joan. " I d o no t understan d wha t you r lordship s mea n b y Protestan t an d
Nationalist," he says, "y°u a re t o ° learne d and subtle for a  poor clerk like
myself. But I know as a matter o f plain commonsense that the woman i s a
rebel; and that is enough for me" {Collected Plays, vol. VI, p. 139-40) . For
two authors whom Shaw admires, Buckle and Ibsen, the figure of the rebel
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embodies the challenge of the future to the past. "In short," Shaw declares in
the preface, "though all society is founded on intolerance, all improvement is
founded on tolerance, or the recognition of the fact that the law of evolution
is Ibsen's law of change" (Collected Plays, vol. VI, p. 57).

"And now tell me," Joan asks after sh e learns that sh e has been made a
saint i n 1920 , "shal l I  rise fro m th e dea d an d com e bac k t o yo u a  living
woman?" Nobod y want s that : eve n th e Gentlema n wh o bring s he r th e
news must "return to Rome for fres h instructions. " Joan i s as much ahead
of her time in 192 0 as she was four hundre d year s before. He r plea a t the
end of the play - " O God that madest this beautiful earth , when will it be
ready t o receiv e thy saints? Ho w long , O Lord , how long? " - look s back
over th e spa n o f tim e betwee n he r trial , he r rehabilitation , an d he r
canonization. I t als o look s forwar d t o a  futur e whic h onl y rebel s an d
visionaries can imagine (Collected Plays, vol. VI, p. 206-08) .

The Epilogu e t o Saint  Joan epitomizes a  paradoxica l historiography. 32

Generally speaking , historians tend t o think teleologicall y -  seein g history
as movin g towards  a  goal , lik e Macaulay' s fre e Britis h Empir e -  o r
cyclically -  seein g histor y a s a  consistin g o f repetitio n an d return . Sha w
portrays Joan i n the Epilogue as the rebel, unwelcome to the intolerant in
any age, and as an embodiment o f the possibility, over the very long term,
of change . Shaw' s historiograph y i s i n th e shor t ter m pessimisti c an d
cyclical - th e hidebound attitudes of Britannus and the Chaplain are always
with us - an d in the long run evolutionary. The contrast with W. B. Yeats,
whose theory of history is precisely the reverse - i n the long run cyclical but
in the short run evolutionary - i s illuminating. The idea of geological time,
which fascinate d th e Victorians, suddenly allowin g th e possibility o f eons
of evolutio n rathe r tha n th e orthodo x 6,00 0 o r s o years o f histor y sinc e
creation calculated b y Archbishop Ussher, liberated Sha w to see history as
both constantly repetitive and always subject to the law of change.

"In Good  King Charles's  Golden Days" (1939 )

"Did no t th e lat e Archbishop Usshe r fi x th e date s o f everythin g tha t eve r
happened?" Charles I I asks Isaac Newton o n the day in 168 0 when Shaw
brings thes e figures  (who neve r met ) togethe r i n hi s "Tru e Histor y Tha t
Never Happened. " "Unfortunatel y h e did no t allo w fo r th e precessio n of
the equinoxes," Newton counters (Collected  Plays, vol. Vii, p. 223). By the
end o f th e first  scene , Newto n ha s experience d wha t Sha w call s i n th e
preface " a flas h o f prevision, " an d h e "foresee s Einstein' s curvilinea r
universe" (Collected  Plays, vol. VII, p. 206). The irruptio n int o Newton' s
quiet hous e i n Cambridg e o f Kin g Charles , the Quake r Georg e Fox , and
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the painte r Godfre y Knelle r (alon g wit h Charles' s brothe r James an d thre e
of Charles' s mistresses ) ha s no t onl y ruine d Newton' s day , bu t changed th e
universe. Hi s "life's  wor k turne d t o waste , vanity , folly " Newto n mus t
repudiate th e boo k correctin g Ussher' s chronolog y tha t h e ha s bee n
working on :

And wha t hav e yo u an d Mr . Fo x don e t o tha t book ? Reduce d i t t o a
monument o f the folly o f Archibishop Ussher, who dated the creation of the
world a t four thousand and four, BC, and of my stupidity in assuming that he
had proved his case. My book is nonsense from beginning to end. How could
I, who have calculated that God deals in millions of miles of infinite space, be
such an utter fool as to limit eternity, which has neither beginning nor end, to
a fe w thousan d years ? Bu t thi s ma n Fox , withou t education , withou t
calculation, without eve n a schoolboy's algebra , knew this when I, who was
born one of the greatest mathematicians i n the world, drudged over my silly
book for months, and could not see what was staring me in the face.

(Collected Plays,  vol . vil, p. 274 )

Newton's epiphan y come s a s th e resul t o f a n anachronis m tha t Sha w
singles out for his reader's attention in the preface. Alluding to the "eternal
clash betwee n th e artis t an d th e physicist, " Sha w "invente d a  collisio n
between Newto n an d a  personag e who m I  shoul d lik e t o hav e calle d
Hogarth; fo r i t was Hogarth wh o said 'th e lin e of beaut y i s a curve,' and
Newton whos e first  dogma i t wa s tha t th e univers e i s i n principl e recti -
linear." Instead , Sha w give s th e quot e an d th e rol e o f artis t t o Godfre y
Kneller, endowin g hi m als o wit h "Hogarth' s brains. " Why ? "I n poin t o f
date Kneller just fitted in." Apparently i t is not historically irresponsible to
invent a  collisio n betwee n physicis t an d artist , an d no t intolerabl y
anachronistic t o pu t i n th e artist' s mout h word s no t spoke n unti l muc h
later by another artist : but it would be unacceptable to transpose Hogarth ,
"by any magic," to 1680.

Later on , Sha w confesses , " I hav e mad e Newto n awar e o f somethin g
wrong with the perihelion o f Mercury. Not since Shakespear made Hector
of Tro y quot e Aristotl e ha s th e stag e perpetrate d a  mor e staggerin g
anachronism. Bu t I  find the perihelio n o f Mercur y s o staggerin g a  laug h
catcher (like Weston-super-Mare) tha t I cannot bring myself to sacrifice it. "
Here the rule s o f history an d th e rules of comedy come into conflict , an d
Shaw cheerfully resolve s the conflict in favor of comedy, though, of course,
he i s "actuall y prepare d t o defen d i t a s a  possibility " (Collected  Plays,
vol. VII, p. 205).

Shaw ma y rul e her e i n favo r o f th e "laug h catcher, " bu t th e pla y als o
insists o n offerin g a  versio n o f Charle s I I tha t i s corrective o f th e imag e
portrayed b y Macaulay. Macaulay's Charle s is indolent and affable , easil y
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run by his mistresses, secretly a pawn of Louis XIV. Shaw's Charles is witty,
percipient, an d quit e awar e tha t h e i s takin g Loui s XIV' s mone y an d
returning nothin g o f value . H e foresee s wit h (anachronistic ) clarit y th e
troubles hi s brothe r Jame s wil l ru n int o an d th e eventua l invitatio n t o
"Orange Billy " an d Macaulay' s Gloriou s Revolution . Charle s enjoy s
playing his mistresses off agains t each other, and in the play's second scene
he disclose s th e ful l measur e o f hi s loyalt y an d affectio n fo r hi s wife .
Catherine of Braganza sets the record straight: "You have never been really
unfaithful t o me," she declares; "You are not lazy: I wish you were: I should
see more of you." At the end of the play she reminds him to put on his wig:
"Nobody woul d tak e you fo r Kin g Charle s the Secon d withou t tha t wig "
(Collected Plays,  vol.vn , p . 292; 295 ; 301) . Wit h thi s tribut e t o th e
tradition of Victorian pictorialism the play comes to a close.

Shaw, history , an d dram a

Shaw "give s th e theatr e a s muc h fu n a s i t ca n stand, " Brech t wrot e i n
"Three Cheer s fo r Shaw, " and i n hi s engagemen t wit h histor y w e see his
playfulness i n ful l force. 33 Hi s deligh t i n th e staggerin g anachronism , hi s
assault a s a  kin d o f intellectua l "terrorist " (th e wor d i s Brecht's ) upo n
preconceived, heroic, pictorial notions of appropriate representation o f the
past, his bumptious arrogation t o himself o f tota l authorit y ove r history -
all thes e constitut e a  seriou s challeng e t o th e hig h prestig e enjoye d b y
narrative history in the late nineteenth century. By recognizing that history
follows rule s o f narrativ e construction , Sha w i s abl e t o exploi t wha t i s
fictive in hi s source s an d contras t i t t o th e mor e immediat e trut h o f
dramatic representation . Shaw' s histor y play s ar e modern , Stephe n Wat t
argues, i n tha t the y "heighte n th e audience' s consciousnes s o f it s ow n
participation in a theatrical event" by breaking illusion.34 The technique of
anachronism, blurring categories and forcing the question of what, exactly,
changes over time and what remains the same, is crucial to this enterprise.
Shaw demand s tha t hi s audiences , lik e the reader s o f th e extra-theatrica l
discussions which accompany hi s plays, actively think abou t the historica l
vision he expresses . As he forces hi s audiences t o engag e in debate , Shaw
anticipates Brecht's vision of a new theatre for the scientific age.

Historical drama , a s Lindenberge r insists , enact s th e tensio n betwee n
literature and reality, between the present and the past, between theatrica l
immediacy an d historica l distance . Sha w insist s o n makin g hi s audience s
think historically , an d h e doe s s o b y emphasizin g th e artificialit y an d
arbitrariness o f th e kind s o f historica l narrative s the y ten d uncriticall y t o
accept. Proclaiming hi s drama's higher truth , critiquing the bia s of histor -
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ians and th e fragmentary natur e o f historica l documentation , Sha w antici-
pates Hayde n White' s critiqu e a s h e a t th e sam e tim e return s t o a
Shakespearean clai m o f equa l authorit y wit h th e historian . "History , Sir ,
will tel l lies , a s usual, " Shaw' s Genera l Burgoyn e say s i n respons e t o th e
question, "Wha t wil l Histor y say? " (Collected  Plays,  vol . II , p . 131).
Strindberg entitled on e of his Blue Book essays "Lie-History," and enjoye d
pointing ou t tha t Herodotus , the Father o f History , was also the Father of
Lies. This skepticism is modern, to be sure, but i t also has a long tradition,
in whic h historica l dram a necessaril y participates . Shaw' s reinventio n o f
the histor y pla y restore s t o lyin g it s ful l fictive  dignit y an d give s t o
anachronism an d factua l erro r th e statu s o f alternativ e truth . I n their
glorification o f paradox , th e histor y play s figure  importantl y i n Shaw' s
larger project of the constant reinvention of himself.
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Shaw's interstices of empire:
decolonizing a t home and abroa d

Playing aroun d th e edge s o f monolithi c binarie s i s on e o f Shaw' s trade -
marked strategies . Som e migh t cal l i t hi s perversity , other s th e commo n
stock o f comedi c reversal . A  mor e precis e technica l ter m migh t b e
parataxis: th e settin g sid e b y sid e o f statement s o r concept s withou t
explicitly indicatin g thei r relationship . A s an ironicist , Sha w consistentl y
draws ou t ou r assumption s abou t th e relationship , tease s ou t unexpecte d
complications fro m th e logica l follow-through o f thos e assumptions , then
displays the fallacy o f the universe being as simple and stable as we might
ever assume. The paratactic concepts frequently resembl e the most familia r
tropes o f dramati c literature : th e struggl e betwee n th e sexes , monogam y
versus infidelit y o r polygamy , clas s conflict , an d th e nativ e versu s th e
foreign. But just as Britain was a hybrid of many nations, the Empire was a
hybrid of many peoples, and iconoclasts were made by many forces, Shaw's
plays are complicated b y more than merely the rivalry of women and men,
the contes t betwee n poe t an d philistine , th e incompatibilit y o f her o an d
coward, or the mutual exclusivity of respectability and unfettered naturism .
Rather, hi s play s frequentl y ar e exercise s i n th e theatricalizatio n o f per -
formances aroun d an d betwee n suc h concepts . Altogether , the y sugges t
prolonged meditatio n o n th e dilemm a o f colonization : neve r achievin g
postcolonialism becaus e institution s o f powe r ar e no t dismantled , bu t
exploring th e varietie s o f subjectio n resultin g fro m policie s o f hegemon y
metonymically embodied.

In severa l o f th e play s mos t blatan t i n thei r critique s o f colonialism ,
Caesar and Cleopatra (1898), John Bull's Other Island (1904), and St. Joan
(1923), Sha w engage s th e colonia l metapho r i n culture s resistan t o f a
colonizing nation' s charms , a s th e cal l o f "Egyp t fo r th e Egyptians " i s
echoed b y "Irelan d fo r th e Irish " an d "Franc e fo r th e French, " utilizin g
anachronism to draw parallels to contemporary British politics of the most
high-blown sor t an d foregroundin g hi s own identificatio n a s an Irishma n
within debates about Home Rule. In another set of plays forming the focus
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of thi s essay , Shaw alternate s betwee n settin g his polemics i n the hear t of
Britain an d th e imaginar y outpost s o f empire . I n mundan e detail s o f
plotting, Shaw consistently likens the micropolitics of households and inter-
gender relation s t o question s o f statecraft , invitin g comparison s betwee n
the state of marital bonding and the utterly unnatural coupling of ruler and
colony. Candida  (1895 ) provide s th e paradigmati c exampl e o f Shaw' s
ability t o relat e th e microeconom y an d powe r o f a  househol d t o th e
macroeconomic concern s o f globa l capitalism , it s produc t (colonialism) ,
and the complicity o f colonialism in gender ideology and racism. Here, as
elsewhere, the menage  a trois  inspired Shaw . Perhaps becaus e i n hi s own
life he kept finding himsel f o n different point s of the romantic triangle , he
experienced the interstitial poignancy of "betweenness" to great paratacti c
effect.

In th e parsonag e o f St . Dominic' s (Eas t London) , th e Reveren d Jame s
Morell believes he is a responsible socialist, operating on the principle that
"We have no more right to consume happiness without producing it than to
consume wealth without producing it."1 Morell is kind and equitable to his
employees, askin g the m t o shar e n o hardship s greate r tha n hi s own . Hi s
father-in-law Burges s used to offer les s than subsistenc e wages to sweated
female garmen t workers , bu t Morel l no w accept s hi m a s a  self-style d
"moddle hemployer " becaus e he fired all the women, replaced the m wit h
machines, and pays excellent wages to the men who remain to oversee the
equipment. This i s the chink i n Morell's thinking: he does not loo k a t the
root caus e o f capitalis t profi t tha t motivate s Burgess , and thereb y misse s
the fundamental relationshi p between the exploitation of women and their
dispensability fro m th e economi c equation . Wha t h e think s i s merel y
"Prossy's Complaint " -  hi s stenographers' propensit y t o stay with him fo r
low wage s an d participat e i n househol d labo r simpl y becaus e the y ar e
enamored wit h hi m -  i s merely a  trumped-u p sentimentalize d versio n o f
Burgess's methods , displacin g th e dependenc y o f economi c necessit y fo r
romantic attraction. This is not simply a matter of class exploitation -  th e
transliteration o f Burgess's Cockney accent precludes that conclusion - bu t
a matter of one gender's willingness to extend unlimited credit (i n the form
of fidelity and nurturing ) an d the other gender's willingness to exploi t this
credit fulsomel y fo r it s ow n glor y o r profit . Ther e i s no denying , i n thi s
formulation, tha t domestic work has everything to do with the relationship
of wage labor to capital which, for a  socialist such as Shaw, is the relation-
ship at the heart of all that ails society.2

The young idealist poet Eugene Marchbanks questions the equilibrium in
the parsonage . Hi s involvemen t i n the Morel l househol d i s seemingly hi s
first experience with a stable nuclear family. He establishes himself, at least
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in Morell' s mind , a s a  riva l fo r Candida' s affections . Discoverin g tha t
Candida take s par t i n household labo r b y rilling the lamps , blackleading ,
and slicing common onions, he is struck with "poetic horror," preferring t o
hold t o Patmorea n value s o f th e househol d ange l wit h unsullie d hands ,
equating th e "idle , selfish , an d useless " with th e "beautifu l an d fre e an d
happy."3 Morel l believe s tha t th e contex t i n whic h h e earne d Candida' s
love (i n the scullery o r the pulpit ) doe s not matte r a s long as i t was done
honorably: " I did no t tak e th e moment o n credit ; nor di d I  use i t to stea l
another man' s happiness, " a s Marchbank s clearl y aim s t o do. 4 Morel l
believes himself to be an honest trader. He believes himself on solid ground
as long as this model of transaction i s stable. He wants to be the husband-
as-honest-broker, wit h hi s wif e a s recipien t o f th e fai r deal , returnin g
affection fo r socia l good. But Morell's tussle with Marchbanks i n Act 3  is
motivated b y his sudden uncertainty about Candida's affections. H e suffer s
a crisis of categories and wants Candida to resolve it by choosing between
them. Shaw composes a delightful moment of dramatic irony:

MORELL: We have agreed - h e and I - tha t you shall choose between us now.
I await your decision.

CANDIDA: (slowly  recoiling a step, her heart hardened by his rhetoric in spite of
the sincere feeling behind it) Oh! I am to choose, am I? It is quite settled that I
must belong to one or the other.

In this moment, the Doll's House resonance is clearest. The Candida who,
earlier that day, pulled her husband to the easy chair and sat on the carpet
beside hi s knee in order t o su e for mor e time together , might  in this late r
moment turn thoroughly conventional or utterly defiant. Without missing a
beat, Morell responds firmly, "Quite. You must choose definitely." Candid a
says nothin g -  bu t i t i s a n interstitia l nothin g tha t Marchbank s compre -
hends, at least in part.

MARCHBANKS: (anxiously)  Morell: you dont understand. She means that she
belongs to herself.

CANDIDA: (turning  on him) I mean that, and a good deal more, Master Eugene,
as you will both find out presently. And pray, my lords and masters, what
have you to offer fo r my choice? I am up for auction, it seems. What do you
bid, James?5

She take s th e hig h ground , morall y an d literally . Seatin g Morel l i n th e
children's chair , Marchbanks i n the visitor' s chair , an d hersel f i n the easy
chair, she reveals that she has no crisis of categories. She theatricalizes the
two men' s statu s and,  claimin g th e powe r t o choos e rathe r tha n merel y
being allowed it , takes the weake r o f th e two . Explaining Morell' s lif e t o
him (how his coddled childhood and idolized manhood have caused no end
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20 Th e triumph of the female over the poet: Duncan Ollerenshaw as Marchbanks
appealing to Seana McKenna as Candida in the Shaw Festival's 1993 production

of Candida

of trouble to the women who cared for him) and revealing herself to be all
the female categories wrapped up into one (wife, mother, sister, and mother
to hi s children) , i t i s a  scenari o tha t Marchbank s promptl y abandons .
Whether repelled , matured, enlightened , or hardened i t is not clea r bu t he
departs, claiming to know a secret.

This prima l scen e o f middle-class , Christian , socialist , monogamous ,
heterosexual, procreativel y successfu l famil y lif e demonstrate s perfectl y
how i f we understand a  household w e have understood th e world , an d if
we understan d housewor k w e hav e understoo d th e world' s economy .
Through Marchbanks , Sha w force s attentio n awa y fro m th e pumped-u p
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socialist orator onto the domestic front. Throug h the sharing of household
duties in the parsonage there is a claim to dispersing the economic servitude
that normally goes to married women (an d the Third and Fourth Worlds),
yet by holding rigidly to categories Morel l clings to the most fundamenta l
dyads of nineteenth-century Britis h life: the husband an d wife, and master
and servant . Candid a proclaim s i n the las t moments , " I make him master
here, thoug h h e doe s no t kno w it , an d coul d no t tel l yo u a  momen t ag o
how i t came to b e so."6 By making him master , over an d ove r o n a  daily
basis, he never really is  master. Instead, Morel l exist s on the feminine sid e
of the binary , not a  husband bu t a  dependent, no t a  provider o f economic
opportunity bu t one who is protected an d enabled b y the silent complicity
of another in his fictions about his strength, industry, and dignity. But while
he exists on the feminine side , he is still the man. And while the feminin e
side is typically aligned with the colonized in terms of global politics, the lie
that colonizers tel l themselves about the colonized nation' s dependency on
them is more than evident in Candida's superior strength, yet she is still the
woman.

Homi Bhabh a refer s t o Nadin e Gordimer' s My  Son's  Story  bu t coul d
well b e describin g Candida  when h e insist s "I t .  . . require s a  shif t o f
attention from the political as a pedagogical, ideological practice to politics
as the stressed necessity of everyday life - politic s as a performativity."7 I n
Candida, this comes out clearly during Morell's moment of public triumph
(a rousin g speec h t o th e Guil d o f St . Matthew) , whe n Sha w focuse s
attention ont o th e private realm o f the parsonage b y dramatizing a  scene
between Candid a an d Marchbank s rathe r tha n dramatizin g Morell' s con -
current declamation. It would seem to be a clear contrast of the Habermas-
ian binary of public and private, yet by the end of the Act this comfortabl e
split i s questioned b y the multiple demonstration o f the inappropriatenes s
of simple categories. To give a single example, Proserpine Garnett discovers
she likes champagne, breaks her pledge of abstention, yet claims she is only
a "beer tee-totaller." Thus, categories can be disposed of without importan t
consequences, bu t wha t actuall y remain s i s probabl y wha t operate d al l
along: a n existenc e interstitia l t o th e binaries , tha t flexes ideology i n th e
everyday vicissitudes of responding to desires. The play ends as Morell and
Candida embrac e -  a  taci t acceptanc e tha t the y wil l continu e t o perfor m
"marriage" much as before - bu t a more complex picture underpins it as an
institution.

Getting Married  (1908) , writte n a  decad e afte r Sha w we d Charlott e
Payne-Townshend, concern s anothe r frocke d household , thi s tim e th e
bishopric of Chelsea in the west of London. Categories are rather elastic in
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this topsy-turvy househol d wher e the Bishop' s study i s in the scullery , the
family council s are in a medieval kitche n ou t o f al l human an d budgetar y
proportion, th e greengroce r i s th e family' s confidant , an d polyandrousl y
inclined wome n are welcome as long as they are charming. For a bishop's
household, th e sacrament s ar e remarkabl y ou t o f vogue . Th e Bishop' s
brother Reginal d i s in the divorce court, his sister Lesbia criticizes the law
for no t allowing her to have children without the appendage of a husband,
and the Bishop himself ha s recommended t o four prim e ministers that the
divorce la w mus t b e amended o r th e propertie d classe s may finally strike
against the institution of marriage.

Lesbia presages the crisis when she remarks that "a n English lady is not
the slav e o f he r appetites . Tha t i s wha t a n Englis h gentlema n seem s
incapable of understanding."8 On the morning of her wedding, the Bishop's
daughter Edit h ha s receive d th e pamphle t "D o Yo u Know wha t Yo u are
Going to Do? By a Woman Who has Done It." Meanwhile, her fiance Cecil
has received Ernes t Belfor t Bax' s essays on men's wrongs.9 These writings
enlighten the m abou t th e laws prohibiting wome n fro m suin g for divorc e
except o n ground s o f adultery , n o matte r ho w heinou s th e husband' s
behavior, an d th e law s tha t wil l obligat e Ceci l to tak e financial responsi-
bility if his wife is sued for libel . Edith rejects whatever appetites she might
have fo r Cecil , an d th e afternoon' s weddin g i s calle d off . Cecil , wh o i s
responsible fo r hi s mother' s an d sister' s upkeep , i s justifiabl y concerne d
about hi s liability , fo r i f afte r marriag e Edit h proclaim s publicl y tha t th e
factory owne r Slatto x ha s "tw o hundre d girl s i n hi s powe r a s absolut e
slaves" he could los e al l hi s ne t wort h an d hi s mother coul d g o starving .
Edith's politica l convictio n take s precedenc e ove r th e "private " arrange -
ment of marriage, and she refuses to censor her speech.

It is noteworthy that fear of naming an industrial slavery in their midst is
what motivates the play's crisis and most of its serious consideration of the
marriage sacrament. The alternative of a legal contract is proposed, and the
Bishop's solicitor-turned-cleric attempt s to draw it up to suit everyone. The
debates reveal the underlying ideologies that gruesomely prop up marriage.
When Lesbia proposes that children should belong to the mother, Reginald
swears "I'l l fight  for th e ownershi p o f m y ow n childre n toot h an d nail, "
showing tha t th e relationshi p i s on e o f property , no t affection. 10 Bu t
countering th e idea tha t childre n ar e the resul t o f non-productiv e labo r -
and thu s "free " lik e th e earth , water , nativ e peoples , o r othe r form s o f
"Nature" available for capita l exploitation -  Edit h insists that procreatio n
is work that should be rewarded with a  stake in the offspring a s realizable
property.
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ED ITH : It seems to me that they should be divided between the parents. If Cecil
wishes any of the children to be his exclusively, he should pay me a certain
sum for the risk and trouble of bringing them into the world: say a thousand
pounds apiece. The interest on this could go towards the support of the child
as long as we live together. But the principle would be my property. In that
way, if Cecil took the child away from me, I should at least be paid for what it
had cost me.11

Believing i n th e sam e ethi c bu t takin g i t t o a  sexis t extreme , Reginal d see s
the whol e ventur e o f marriag e a s i f i t shoul d b e a  guarantee d investmen t
against risk : " I thin k i t joll y har d tha t a  ma n shoul d suppor t hi s wif e fo r
years, an d los e the chanc e o f gettin g a  really goo d wife , an d the n hav e he r
refuse t o be a wife to him."12 A  slave could not so refuse .

The lat e entranc e o f th e fable d Mrs . George , wif e t o a  coa l merchan t
who happen s t o b e th e Mayor , sharpen s th e term s o f th e debat e whil e
supposedly brokerin g a  solutio n t o th e stalemate . In  love , sh e say s whil e
possessed b y a  trance , wome n giv e th e ultimat e gift : "eternit y i n a  singl e
moment, strengt h o f th e mountain s i n on e clas p o f you r arms , an d th e
volume o f al l th e sea s i n on e impuls e o f you r souls." 13 Thi s i s shee r
essentialism, bu t th e fac t tha t wome n bea r th e pric e o f sexua l unio n -  th e
torture o f childbirth -  whereupo n me n onl y heap more burden s upo n the m
is biologically axiomatic . Sha w takes the analog y further , int o th e realm o f
marital politics :

MRS. GEORGE : I carried the child in my arms: must I carry the father too?. .  .
Was it not enough? We spent eternity together; and you ask me for a little
lifetime more. We possessed all the universe together; and you ask me to give
you my scanty wages as well. I have given you the greatest of all things; and
you ask me to give you little things. I gave you your own soul: you ask me for
my body as a plaything. Was it not enough? Was it not enough?14

It i s economi c coercion . I t i s exploitation . I t i s th e enslavemen t o f al l
married women , no t a  mere two hundred i n a  factory, fo r lik e slavery ther e
is no wa y fo r a  wome n t o sa y n o othe r tha n t o ru n t o anothe r master ; n o
way to end hi s unrestricted appropriatio n o f her body; no way to refuse th e
tyranny o f a  husband' s demand s excep t b y colludin g t o brea k th e la w an d
deceive society . I t i s stron g stuf f fo r 1908 , an d littl e wonde r Sha w coul d
only portray i t as spoken i n a mesmeric fit . I t goes way beyond th e practica l
reform o f suffrag e t o th e ver y hear t o f the domesti c an d politica l econom y
of the British, at home and abroad .

Misalliance (1910 ) resume s the idea , meditating o n childrearing t o mak e
a broade r contex t fo r famil y life . Lor d Summerhays , formerl y governo r o f
"a plac e twic e a s bi g a s England " wher e th e interracia l mixin g "civilize s
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them" while it "uncivilizes us" to the detriment of the British, is completely
incapable of managing his son, Bentley. Having lived "so long in a country
where a man may have fifty sons , who are no more to him than a regiment
of soldiers .  . .  I'm afrai d Iv e lost the English feeling abou t it." 15 Tarleton ,
the underwea r entrepreneur , i s made to ironicall y proclai m imperialis m a
fine thin g tha t broaden s th e mind s o f th e English , whethe r the y ar e
subjected t o i t by the Romans or propagate i t themselves as at the present
moment.16 Summerhay s unhesitatingl y proclaim s governmen t b y tyrann y
and fraud acceptabl e i f it maintains order ; a parallel between the governor
abroad an d th e industrialis t i n hi s factor y o r th e patriarc h a t hom e i s
tempting, stemming from hi s daughter Hypatia's hint that to keep her from
earning a living she was kept a prisoner.17 Bonds of love, it seems, stand in
the wa y o f femal e independence , whic h i s wh y Lin a th e Polis h acroba t
(who literally drops in from th e sky) proclaims her refusal t o be supported
by an y ma n "an d mak e hi m th e maste r o f m y bod y an d soul." 18 This ,
evidently, i s wha t separate s Pole s fro m Britons . Member s o f he r famil y
regularly risk life and limb, but marriage just goes too far.

In Pygmalion  (1913) , Sha w agai n depict s femal e dependenc e a s th e
central theme , tyin g i t metaphoricall y t o th e classi c dyad s o f mal e an d
female, maste r an d slave , colonize r an d colonized . Henr y Higgins , th e
Pygmalion who understands al l about how  peopl e talk bu t grasps nothing
of what they mean, thinks he can dispose of the new improved Eliza into the
marriage market, but explicitly disavows this as an economic relationship:

LIZA: I sold flowers. Now youve made a lady of me I'm not fit to sell anything
else. I wish youd left me where you found me.

HIGGINS: Tosh, Eliza. Dont you insult human relations by dragging all this cant
about buying and selling into it.19

He canno t se e th e brutalit y o f hi s ow n behavio r i n usin g Eliz a a s a n
amusing experiment , objectifyin g he r a s a  produc t o f hi s ow n skill , the n
taking her presence as perpetual slipper-fetcher fo r granted. The colonizing
metaphor i s solidifie d b y th e marita l them e o f th e las t act : no t onl y i n
Doolittle th e dustman' s sadl y reverse d circumstance s whic h n o longe r
enable him to cohabit with Eliza's stepmother (the "natural way"), but also
in the question of Eliza's disposal. By taking away Eliza's independence as a
kerbstone flowe r seller , Higgins i n effec t enslave d her , an d sh e complied .
Higgins deludes himself int o thinking that she can return to his household
after he r triumph a t the ball, and in the name of good fellowship assum e a
new position neither as experiment nor slave but as someone he really cares
for bu t wit h who m h e has no romanti c entanglement. 20 Th e self-satisfie d
manner i n which Higgin s i s left o n stage , abandoned b y women (jus t lik e
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Torvald i n A  Doll's  House,  wh o face s a  ne w lif e bu t barel y know s it) ,
rattling th e chang e i n hi s pocke t an d chucklin g t o himself , i s completel y
ironic. Fo r al l hi s knowledge , h e i s maste r o f nothin g an d n o one . H e
knows muc h abou t ho w peopl e talk , bu t nothin g o f wh o the y are . Eliz a
likened hersel f t o a  chil d i n a  foreig n country , havin g forgotte n he r ow n
language, ye t sh e learne d enoug h o f th e master' s knowledg e t o abando n
him yet coexist. 21

Writing Heartbreak  House  (1919 ) i n th e mids t o f globa l war , Shaw' s
parataxis o f empires and households implie s an outcome with highe r stake s
than before . Men' s worl d is , supposedly, tha t o f busines s whil e women' s i s
marriage.22 Bu t thi s i s sustaine d mostl y b y shams . Th e imposin g industri -
alist Mangan i s just the front ma n fo r syndicate s and has no great wealth of
his own ; th e dashin g Hecto r i s n o adventure r a t al l bu t merel y hi s wife' s
pet; th e burgla r i s n o burgla r a t al l bu t jus t a n extortioner ; an d eve n th e
Captain wh o seek s "the seventh degree of concentration" i s an old duffer o f
an invento r addicte d t o rum, whose greates t prid e i s his Caribbea n Africa n
wife. Amids t th e standar d romanti c permutation s o f th e countr y hous e
weekend plot , Sha w counterpoint s th e Captai n -  wh o "sol d himsel f t o th e
devil i n Zanzibar " -  agains t hi s son-in-law , Lor d Hasting s Utterword ,
governor o f ever y Britis h colon y i n succession . Thes e ar e th e tw o me n o f
the world , an d perhap s Hastings' s non-appearanc e i n th e pla y (lik e th e
Captain's allege d wife ) underline s th e metaphori c impor t o f hi s value . Th e
Captain perpetuate d exoti c rumor s abou t himsel f i n orde r t o maintai n
discipline i n unrul y an d unjus t circumstances , bu t argue s tha t nothin g lik e
this applies to the ingenue  Elli e Dunn, an d henc e she should no t sel l hersel f
into marriage .

CAPTAIN SHOTOVER: I ha d to deal with men so degraded that they wouldnt
obey me unless I swore at them and kicked them and beat them with my fists.
Foolish people took young thieves off the streets; flung them into a training
ship where they were taught to fear the cane instead of fearing God; and
thought theyd made men and sailors of them by private subscription. I tricked
these thieves into believing I'd sold myself to the devil. It saved my soul from
the kicking and swearing that was damning me by inches.23

He migh t b e referrin g t o distan t ports , bu t o n th e othe r han d h e i s als o
accurately describin g th e Britis h syste m o f nava l impressmen t i n plac e fo r
hundreds o f year s an d onl y recentl y (th e pla y premiere d i n 1919 ) aban -
doned i n favo r o f a  les s predator y for m o f conscription . Hi s daughte r
Ariadne's philosoph y i s similar, regulated i n proportion t o whomever sh e is
disciplining. Childre n sh e "smacke d .  .  .  enoug h t o giv e the m a  goo d cr y
and a  health y nervou s shock, " whereupo n the y "wer e quit e goo d after -
wards."24 A  thief , a t leas t abroad , coul d b e beate n an d sen t away : sh e
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recommends th e applicatio n o f " a goo d suppl y o f bambo o t o brin g th e
British nativ e t o hi s senses " too , a s remed y fo r wha t ail s th e nation. 25

England, it is asserted through the analogy of house as ship and domesticity
as the ship o f state , must lear n t o navigate o r i t wil l founder an d b e lost .
Perhaps anothe r wa y o f statin g Ariadne' s positio n i s tha t Englan d mus t
revert to its indigenous brutality, indigenously applied.

However exoti c the Captain' s lov e life ha s been , apparently hi s English
daughters ar e no t th e strengthene d product s o f miscegenation . Hesione' s
black hair , a t an y rate , i s onl y a  wig . If , i n th e typica l formulatio n o f
colonialism, white males are free a t the expense of women's domestication
and th e racia l other' s colonization , Heartbreak  House  depict s th e emo -
tional dependenc e o f me n upo n women , th e capitalist' s complet e lac k o f
autonomy, th e corruptio n o f Englis h countr y lif e wit h sof t Bohemianism ,
and the asserted but never staged discipline of colonial rule. In the mise-en-
scene, there are no children, foreigners, or even horses present to subjugate,
and wome n ver y consistentl y rul e ove r men . Thus , thi s pla y i s a s muc h
about England foundering blindl y on the brink of destruction by a German
dirigible a s the lie s embedded i n an entir e belie f syste m base d o n empire ,
entrepreneurial savvy , rul e b y consent , an d th e superiorit y o f leisure d
British gentility . I n th e final  moments , a s th e Zeppeli n drift s overhead ,
destruction boomin g like Beethoven, the public world comes spectacularly
crashing int o th e private , disrupting th e garden idyll . Nothing could b e a
more ap t theatricalizatio n o f th e en d o f Britis h insularity , the delusio n of
glory, or the question o f which home fires are to be kept burning : hearths
or house s i n th e cataclysmi c death s o f th e tw o practica l me n o f busines s
(Mangan an d th e burglar ) an d the demolition o f manse and clergyman. If
free enterpris e an d religio n ar e s o vulnerable , i t bode s ver y badl y fo r
empire. Still , Sha w stoppe d shor t o f dismantlin g empire . Perhap s h e fel t
optimistic (thoug h mistakenly) , o n th e ev e o f th e Leagu e o f Nations '
inauguration, that history was doing the work for him.

Twenty years earlier , Shaw wrote anothe r meditatio n o n the concept of
justice i n th e scrambl e fo r empire . I n Captain  Brassbound's Conversion
(1899) a n Englis h judge , Si r Howar d Hallam , i s hel d t o ranso m i n a
Moroccan castl e b y th e pirat e Captai n Brassbound , whos e Wes t India n
mother was maltreated b y Sir Howard. I t just so happens that Brassboun d
is Sir Howard's nephew, which renders this something of a family feud even
though Halla m readil y grant s Brassboun d hi s rightfu l plantatio n lands ,
glad t o b e ri d o f th e mone y pi t overseas . O n th e fac e o f things , Halla m
seems doomed -  Englan d wil l certainly not treat this incident like a replay
of Genera l Gordon' s sieg e a t Khartou m an d sen d whal e boat s an d came l
corps to his rescue - bu t the Sheikh Sidi el Assif readily trades Sir Howard
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21 Woma n and Empire : captivating the Sheikh in Shaw Festival's 197 9 production o f
Captain Brassbound's  Conversion

for hi s sister-in-law , Lad y Cicel y Waynflete , th e iconoclasti c lad y travele r
modeled afte r Mar y Kingsley. 26 He r habi t i s t o gree t al l me n civill y b y
looking the m i n th e fac e an d sayin g "howdyedo. " Thus , th e Sheik h i s
captivated b y hi s ow n prisoner . Sh e ha s a  talen t fo r takin g charge ,
reorganizing ever y masculin e institutio n int o a  bette r regulate d an d har -
monious entity in such a way that "hal f a  dozen such women would make
an end o f law in England i n six months."27 Gunboat diplomacy , however ,
courtesy of the Americans, breaks the impasse much faster .

Brassbound is tried by the American gunboat captain, but excused when
he learns of the insults showered on Brassbound's mother by the complain-
ant. Lady Cicely - th e only woman in the cast - i s the key to all of this, for
she not only tames the "ferocious" infidels and improvises rules of evidence

228



Cambridge Companions Online © Cambridge University Press, 2006

Shaw's interstices of empire

in the makeshift courtroom , but completely subjugates Brassbound with all
his piratical ways, in the course of exercising her great leadership potential.
Brassbound offer s t o serv e unde r he r -  i n matrimon y -  a s h e di d unde r
Gordon a t Khartoum . With al l his bullying ways and comman d b y force ,
until he met her he had missed the real secret of command: look people in
the face and say "howdyedo." But the play averts a matrimonial ending by
Lady Cicely's timely break from Brassbound' s mesmerism, and in so doing
theatricalizes the parataxis. By breaking the mesmeric gaze she rescues him
while he, in Lady Cicely's words, makes a glorious escape. A white woman,
daughter of a peer, will not rule over a miscegenated, non-English, colonial,
pirate captain . By maintaining the one hierarchy o f man over women, the
hierarchies of empires, nations, and peoples remain intact . Justice, govern-
ance, an d biologica l se x roles ar e al l depicte d a s unstable , bu t ultimatel y
the forces of history and incident do not succeed in changing anything.

Despite the steady state ending, Captain Brassbound's Conversion might
be said to speak ambiguously an d reverberate with crisis as Lady Cicely is
left alon e on stage "in a  strange ecstasy" and proclaiming glory . As David
Spurr asks of all colonial travel writing:

Is it the voice of a n individual writer , the voice of institutiona l authority , of
cultural ideology? . . . I n the colonial situation as well as in its aftermath, thi s
ambiguity i n writin g itsel f join s wit h th e logica l incoherenc e o f colonia l
discourse t o produc e a  rhetori c characterize d b y constan t crisis , jus t a s
colonial rule itself continually creates its own crisis of authority. The anxiety
of colonial discourse comes from th e fact that the colonizer's power depends
on the presence, not to say consent, of the colonized.28

In som e ways , the tex t speak s paradigmaticall y o f colonia l relation s an d
their continuance, for the primitive and the civilized are juxtaposed and the
existence of one justifies the supremacy of the other. But Shaw ironizes the
formula b y juggling the element s betwee n Cicel y an d Brassbound . Just a s
Cicely reject s th e weake r sid e o f assigne d femininity , Brassboun d com -
pounds the authority accorded masculinity with the abjection o f not being
fully whit e o r full y British . Fo r th e duratio n o f Cicely' s trance , chao s i s
explored; bu t sinc e thi s chao s i s paratacti c t o marriage , wha t i s Sha w
suggesting abou t tradition s o f ho w th e comi c genr e restore s orde r b y
concluding wit h a  wedding ? An d wha t categorie s ar e lef t fo r thi s non -
couple wh o ar e respectivel y rescue r an d escapee ? Sha w take s u s t o th e
brink of a border region but, as usual, can only theatricalize what exists in
tension with it.

Another play , se t largel y o n a  mountainou s coastlin e and , lik e Heart-
break House, also meditating o n the war o f 1914-18 , uses Shaw's system
of antithese s t o sugges t tha t thoug h somethin g ha s irrevocabl y change d
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since World War I, its aftermath i s not yet known. Too  True  To Be Good
(1931) depict s a  supposedly invalide d daughte r wh o decide s to ru n awa y
with he r felo n nurse/chambermai d an d th e nurse' s burglar/clerg y accom -
plice. Al l thre e abscon d wit h th e Patient' s pearl s an d diamond s t o a
climatically auspiciou s British outpost, where they live off th e proceeds of
the jewelry and scheme to add to the coffers b y collecting a ransom for the
Patient. (Th e cas e i s patterned afte r Rediviou s Oliver , wh o a s a  teenage r
traveled in Italy and sent word to his step-father tha t he had been captured.
The ranso m wa s pai d an d Rediviou s live d handsomel y of f it.) 29 Th e
Patient, no w sunburned , muscular , an d agile , masquerade s a s th e nativ e
servant o f the nurse , who poses as a  Countess . The pretences o f nativis m
and ran k ar e bot h extreme , fo r Sha w describe s th e Patien t a s "en  belle
sauvage by headdress, wig, ornaments, and girdle proper t o no locality on
earth excep t perhap s th e Russia n ballet, " an d th e Countes s -  lackin g a
Higgins to tutor he r up from th e rank of chambermaid -  assume s a dialect
that is "a spirited amalgamation of the foreign accents of all the waiters she
has known." 30 Thus , the y hav e transparentl y assume d thei r cultura l
"other": fo r th e wealthy invali d i t is ruddy native servitude , while fo r th e
chambermaid thie f i t is the titled pan-European. But the Patient is the only
character who , in Shaw's convoluted manne r o f assigning names , is never
given a  forenam e an d i s addressed onl y b y a  nicknam e (Mops , afte r he r
surname Mopply ) o r he r origina l functio n a s th e "Patient. " Sh e i s never
personalized, and thus remains emblematic, as in a morality play.

The militar y me n assigne d t o recove r th e Patien t fro m he r suppose d
brigand captors are also topsy-turvy: the Colonel holds fast to principles of
discipline an d rank , advocatin g tha t enliste d me n no t eve n b e treate d a s
human, bu t really prefers t o keep himself idl e by painting in watercolours;
Private Meek (modeled after Lawrence of Arabia) is the thoroughly capable
fellow wh o appears to the Colonel to be a halfwit bu t has in fact resigne d
several commissions in favor o f his present rank; and the brawny Sergeant
who captivates th e Countess' s attentio n i s a theologian an d feminist . I t is
this Sergeant who supplies one of the unifying theme s of the play through
his ponderin g o f Bunyan' s meanin g o f th e Pilgrim' s wanderin g i n th e
wilderness o f th e world , withou t trails , an d i n horro r o f th e destructio n
that wil l com e t o thos e waitin g lik e shee p in th e Citie s o f Destruction. 31

This metaphor is especially applicable to the Patient, who tires of being free
and happy , awa y fro m he r mother' s overindulgence , an d grow s t o se e
nature as both dull and full o f wanton evil (her Eden turned to the earthly).
It als o applie s t o th e government s responsibl e fo r th e wa r tha t ha s
disillusioned so many, and which now do not know where to flee from their
accumulations of corpses and debts. An Elder evangelist (actuall y father t o
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Reverend Aubrey , th e Countess' s accomplice ) proclaim s th e en d o f New -
tonian rational determinism. Science has replaced it with an atomic algebra
that mocks both Free Will Catholicism and the Protestant's belief in private
judgment. N o purpos e o r desig n i s apparen t i n th e electron' s path : th e
world i s neither create d a  la Creationism no r engineere d a  la  Darwinism,
but random. On e by one, the characters recognize themselves in an abyss,
seeking th e mean s t o b e saved . Lik e postmodernists , th e character s ar e
stuck i n a  worl d whos e meaning s ar e a s immateria l a s discourse , whil e
Shaw, th e stalwar t modernist , seek s t o understan d cause s an d t o vainl y
prescribe and not just criticize.

Too True To Be Good sets up several important questions for the world's
decolonization an d prospectiv e transitio n int o postcolonialism . Th e mal -
ingering feminin e apparent  i n the Patien t o f Ac t i  i s easily expunge d b y
contact with a mountainous outpost of British colonialism, but her recovery
began wit h th e openin g o f a  window an d contac t wit h fres h ai r an d th e
pragmatism o f the thieving clas s which suggeste d a  way ou t o f he r sickly
confinement. Thus, her cure was not really abroad but always near at hand.
The surreal giant measles microbe at her bedside , made il l by the Patient' s
feminized invalidis m -  a  topsy-turvy jok e whereb y th e patien t make s th e
disease sick - i s instantly cured. The microbe, which Shaw refers to as The
Monster, i s likened to the colonized native : a sor t o f invalided Caliban . I t
was goin g abou t it s busines s doin g it s ow n thin g whe n thi s particularl y
noxious woman sickened it beyond measure. While one usually thinks of a
disease invading a host, in Shaw's paradoxical world the Patient colonized
the Monste r b y feignin g weaknes s whe n sh e wa s reall y strong . With th e
microbe cured, the Patient is freed of one colonial burden and embarks on a
tourist's quest for escape, using her wealth to plunge into the world beyond
her country's shores. A metaphoric colonizing of disease is replaced with an
economic version . I n th e process , sh e i s besiege d b y parasiti c "touris t
agencies, steamboat companies , railways, motor ca r people, hotel keepers,
dressmakers, servants , al l tryin g t o ge t m y mone y b y sellin g m e things I
don't reall y want " al l ove r th e world , a s i f i t wa s no t th e sam e su n
everywhere.32 Thus , jus t a s sh e directe d he r "tourist' s gaze " o n th e "un -
civilized world," her own people attempted to exploit her. She really wanted
to settle down, nest, and raise children, but instead she was preyed upon by
these capitalist s sellin g soporifics . I n othe r words , i n orde r t o develo p a
conscience and a critique of the global economy, the Patient in turn becomes
the exploited, just as the invading disease was sickened by its victim.

The military has no authority over the indigenous peoples of Act 2 and 3,
yet Privat e Meek' s ingenuit y i n settin g of f harmles s maroon s (explosive s
such as those used in World War I to warn of ai r raids) deceives the tribes
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22 Invertin g hierarchies: Simon Bradbury as Private Meek issuing commands t o
William Webster as Colonel Tallboys in the Shaw Festival's 199 4 production o f

Too True to be Good

into thinkin g tha t ther e i s a  sizeabl e Britis h garriso n rathe r tha n a  mer e
handful o f soldiers . I t i s th e empir e i n it s fina l phase , literally , a s a
crumbling presenc e o n far-flun g shores , al l boo m an d littl e bite , pro -
claiming sovereignt y ove r Crow n Colonie s bu t no t eve n abl e to muste r a
representative government . Nevertheless , i n a  nostalgi c refrai n o f greate r
empire, anothe r Gordonesqu e missio n t o sav e a  Brito n (thi s tim e a
supposedly delicat e female ) win s the Colone l more kudos than woul d th e
rescuing o f the titled judge in Captain  Brassbound. Both the maroon ploy
and th e recover y o f th e Patien t ar e du e t o Meek , ye t th e Colone l i s
knighted. Th e Britis h office r increase s hi s authorit y a t hom e (a s Si r Tall-
boys, wit h hi s wif e Lad y Tallboy s a t hi s side ) i n a  cynica l allusio n t o a
government improvin g it s chance s o f reelectio n b y populis t association ,
and Mee k no t inheritin g th e world (thoug h th e Colone l ha s no authorit y
whatever in the foreign land) . The Colonel not only gives Meek the control
of the outfit, but also is without authority in respect to his relationship with
the natives: he has no contact with genuine indigenes and hence can have
no mastery over them. But how much longer will the native peoples be as
easily fooled b y a few detonated maroon s as are the Britons at home by a
titled indolent watercolorist?
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The metapho r o f th e colonizin g ma n an d th e colonize d woma n i s
overthrown b y the Countess , long known fo r he r ficklenes s i n discardin g
men after te n days, but this time restrained by the Sergeant who forces her
to engag e he r "to p storey " (intellect ) a s wel l a s he r "groun d floor " o r
"lower centres " (sexua l drives). 33 I t i s only high-clas s status , suc h a s the
Patient's, tha t enable s a  woma n t o b e broke n sufficientl y t o b e dul l and
remain constant . Sinc e th e war , th e Countes s ha s bee n knockin g dow n
domestic institutions like an earthquake, but it is she who at the end of the
play goes off to be married, and the Patient who will found a n unorthodox
sisterhood. A s a  ric h woman , th e Patient' s sou l ha d starve d o n a  die t of
religious selfishnes s an d he r class' s snobbery ; thus , the sisterhoo d wil l be
neither religious nor elitist. But the flaw in her thinking is that she idealizes
it as an army, and the recent war has put an end to any peace of mind that
comes from militar y organizations . The military existe d t o kil l the wrong
people -  innocent s slaughtering innocent s - an d doin g so at grea t remove
since ne w technolog y enable d bomb s t o b e detonate d fro m fort y mile s
away. Playing with the binary of male and female, and reversing the usual
assignments of civilized and savage, Shaw suggests that the Patient will not
succeed i n forgin g a  ne w femal e civilizatio n eve n thoug h sh e wil l com e
closest, amongst all the characters, to progress.

So, i n thi s Patient/Pilgrim' s "dream " o f journeyin g t o a  mountainou s
place, suffering perils , shedding lies, and spouting the refrain to the childish
pastoral "Mar y ha d a  Littl e Lamb " (bac k t o front) , wher e wil l sh e find
salvation? No t a t home , fo r Sha w despair s o f makin g Englan d sensible .
Not abroad , fo r sh e mus t b e i n a  compromise d positio n vis-a-vis  the
peoples with whom she cohabits. If she is to clean up the world, and keep it
clean, where will she reside and how shall she proceed? In the aftermath of
such horrifi c war , youn g peopl e esche w disguisin g themselve s fro m eac h
other wit h idealism ; thei r fait h wa s destroyed , alon g wit h building s an d
scenery. The young see through the holes in their elders ' rags and wonde r
what to do. But ultimately, Shaw offers littl e guidance in this regard. As he
says i n hi s concludin g stag e directions , "fin e word s butte r n o parsnips" :
evangelists ar e th e ho t ai r tha t fa n th e flam e o f tru e Pentecostalism , an d
though women of action may be his idea of the way forward, thei r actions
are a s yet unimaginabl e (an d unstageable? ) i n any detail . Also, a feminis t
would likel y add, as long as Shaw remains the spouting evangelist there is
unlikely ever to be a clearer picture. The Patient is actually thwarted in her
desire t o breed , s o Shaw' s optimis m i n th e strengthenin g o f successiv e
generations, show n i n muc h earlie r play s suc h a s Man  and  Superman
(1903) and Major Barbara (1905), has no place here.

If there is any ambiguity about the ascription of these paratactic readings
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of an y o f th e earlie r plays , abou t The  Simpleton  of  the  Unexpected  Isles
(1934) there can be no doubt whatsoever. Michael Holroyd reads the play
as steeped i n Shaw' s infatuatio n wit h th e Sovie t Union, an d reflectin g hi s
belief i n i t a s a  socialis t heaven , bu t i t ha s many othe r contemporaneou s
resonances with the decay of Britain in the latter phase of Empire.34 World
War I not only challenged British ideas about the glory of war, but brought
the Dominion nation s into battl e on a  large scale in defense o f the United
Kingdom. Whil e experiencin g greate r independenc e -  going , i n Shaw' s
terms, fro m th e world' s childhoo d int o a  perio d o f it s "responsibl e
maturity" - th e colonies peopled principally by whites may have reluctantly
sent their soldiers yet they upheld British ideas about racial superiority and
preferred Britis h affiliation t o cultural or political domination by any other
power.35 Afte r all , i t wa s Australi a tha t le d th e movemen t t o exclud e a
covenant recognizing racial equality from the League of Nations' charter in
1918. In colonies where whites governed a large indigenous population, the
path t o commonwealt h wa s mor e ideologicall y fraught . India' s Congres s
was declared illegal in 1932, and its leader Mahatma Ghand i was arrested.
A campaign of civil disobedience against British rule absorbed India during
the perio d whe n Sha w wa s travelin g i n Asi a an d th e Pacific , an d a s h e
wrote The Simpleton. The independence of colonies was widely sought but
the course by which they would achieve it was yet to be determined.

Shaw seem s t o sa y i n The  Simpleton  tha t fo r European s lif e i n th e
colonies wa s intolerabl e s o lon g a s the y insiste d o n retainin g Europea n
ways and values exclusively. The clerk in the Isles' emigration office (note :
not an immigration office ) regard s himself a s an indispensable functionary ,
building Empir e i n th e styl e o f Ceci l Rhodes . Bu t hi s problem i s that h e
always "throws back" what i s given him, and abruptly ends his life with a
bullet throug h th e head . Hi s supervisor , th e Emigratio n Office r (late r t o
emerge as Hugo Hyering, political secretary to the Isles) weeps "A man's a
slave here worse than a  nigger," yet discovers that when he takes life a s it
comes o n th e behes t o f a  femal e visito r fro m abroa d an d assimilate s t o
indigenous ways, life becomes more than tolerable (he later marries her).36

In th e Prologue , th e climat e i s blamed , ye t late r o n th e Unexpecte d Isle s
newly emerge d fro m th e sea ar e depicted a s an Edenic garden. I t literall y
took Hyering a kick in the butt and a flying leap from a  cliff t o realize the
intrinsic value of the place.

This play is chiefly concerned with moral worth rather than any form of
monetary economics . Nevertheless , th e arrangement s o f domesticit y an d
the heterosexua l marriag e compac t mov e th e plot . Hyerin g formerl y
complained tha t h e coul d no t affor d t o marr y a  whit e woma n an d tha t
native women were too well educated and refined t o be interested in white
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men, who are ignorant and foul-smelling. But financial problems are not at
the root of the European's doomed sterility: it is that Englishmen are taught
useless things such as classical languages and sports rather than vital things
such as how to feed an d cloth e themselves and reproduce . It is the typical
Shavian formul a o f character s seein g i n th e worl d wha t the y themselve s
are, whil e bein g unabl e t o kno w themselves . Th e indigenou s islan d
Priestess, Prola , appropriatel y wonder s whethe r i t i s "really kin d t o trea t
them according to their folly instead of to our wisdom?"37 Sir Charles and
Lady Farwaters succumb to fascination abou t the culture, but other visitors
must be strongarmed into paying due attention.

In the twenty-four year s that intervene between the Prologue and first act
(i.e. a similar interva l a s between the commencement o f World War I  and
the premiere of the play), the Priest and Priestess Pra and Prola unite with
the Farwaters and Hyerings in a domestic experiment of six parents raising
four progen y meldin g Easter n an d Wester n culture s an d bloodlines . Th e
parents ar e neve r specified , an d s o thes e progen y ar e perhap s th e mos t
blatantly theatrical of all Shaw's parataxes: six made four, but which six, or
rather whic h pairing s amongs t th e six ? No w i n earl y adulthood , th e
children named Maya, Vashti, Janga, and Kanchin - whic h Shaw glosses as
Love, Pride , Heroism , an d Empir e -  regar d themselve s collectivel y a s a
single entity. 38 Bu t anothe r entit y mus t b e provide d i n orde r t o le t th e
females breed, for this is no Ptolomeic dynasty.39 Enter the Simpleton, Iddy
(for "Idiot"), a Church of England clergyman marooned on the Unexpected
Isles afte r bein g kidnappe d b y pirate s fro m hi s Somerse t parish . Th e
menage a six  wan t Idd y t o len d respectabilit y t o thei r enterpris e an d a
moral conscienc e t o th e children , while the offspring ar e driven b y lower
desires. Idd y i s reluctan t t o joi n th e Superfamil y o n th e ground s tha t
Church o f England clergyme n generally have only one wife a t a  time. But
when he finally interlinks his arms with Maya and Vashti, and they "vanish
in black darkness," all scruples are set aside.40 He prefers th e fairer o f the
two, but the morality of Clapham Common does not extend much beyond
British shores: in the majority o f the Empire, polygamy and miscegenatio n
are th e orde r o f th e day . Thus , fo r a  potentia l secon d generation , racia l
purity is challenged, while for a  third generation the basic domestic unit of
the nuclear heterosexual family is scorned.

The momentousness o f thi s for empir e i s spectacularly dramatized . The
Empire's fleets  assembl e i n th e harbo r o n behal f o f thi s "impoten t
simpleton."41 Si r Charles, the governor, is besieged with as many demands
to end the relationship as he receives congratulations. Every faction i n the
Empire, and many outside it , seek to impose their ideas on everyone else.
But diplomats' ultimata ar e ignored , and the old orde r collapses . England
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dissolves it s Empire , "Downin g Stree t declare s fo r a  righ t tigh t littl e
island," an d a  ne w scrambl e fo r dominatio n i s unleashed. 42 Irelan d i s
enraged by this treason, Canada proclaims its status as premiere Dominion,
Australia pronounce s itsel f th e metropolita n Dominion , Ne w Zealan d
challenges thi s an d instigate s a  butte r blockade , Sout h Afric a announce s
the expulsion of all Britons from the continent, and the Pope celebrates the
"passing away of the last vain dream of earthly empire."43 If this is a Soviet
parable, the n th e hast y announcemen t o f Prola' s promotio n t o Empres s
seems ou t o f keepin g wit h an y socialis t Utopi a tha t eve n Sha w coul d
muster. Instead , thi s coul d b e see n a s th e newl y independen t stat e repli -
cating al l th e foll y o f foreig n systems , an d significantl y i t i s the childre n
who are most keen on this plan. The children advocat e killing the world's
human lemmings, and living for their flag and Empress, anything to defend
the Isles' eternal queendom.

A peel o f gunfir e an d volle y of trumpets herald s the adven t o f a n angel
announcing Judgmen t Da y whil e shakin g bullet s an d lea d sho t fro m it s
robes. The English-speakin g people s wil l b e judged first , followe d b y the
USA, Australasia, Scotland, and Ireland (whos e languages, as far as heaven
is concerned , ar e no t English) . Those wh o canno t justif y themselve s ar e
stricken, an d disappear . I t i s a  wonderful applicatio n o f th e Goo d versu s
Bad dyad, but of course it is by Shaw's rules. Thus, judgment is particularly
devastating to politicians, peers, the stock exchange, Anglicans, physicians,
and celebrities . Th e Easter n parts  o f th e Empire , however , ar e almos t
untouched apar t from th e four hedonisti c children of the Superfamily. And
in what may be regarded as Shaw's most progressive statement on the ideal
marriage, Prola explains to Pra:

Ive never allowed you or any other man to cut me off my own stem and make
me a parasite on his. That sort of love and sacrifice i s not the consummation
of a  capabl e woman' s existence : i t i s the temptatio n sh e mus t resis t a t al l
costs.44

They mad e a  good pair , sustainin g eac h other' s intellect , supportin g eac h
other's dreams , and keepin g each other fro m socia l ruin . The Unexpected
Isles, they conclude , an d th e world -  a s a  synecdocha l contiguit y -  mak e
the sam e error s an d suffe r fro m th e sam e response s t o insecurit y an d
calamity. Creativ e lif e (preferabl y th e unpredictable ) need s thi s combin -
ation o f mal e and female , takin g lif e a s i t comes, living with imaginatio n
and brains, and looking eastward.

So, wha t migh t Sha w b e suggestin g a s possibl e route s t o a  tru e post -
colonialism? Ne w hybridities , certainly . A  generou s helpin g o f socia l
reductionism. A  culture tha t redistribute s th e ide a o f gende r assignments ,
respecting biolog y bu t regardin g th e origin s an d keeper s o f wealt h a s
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broadmindedly a s the definitio n o f wealth itself . A society tha t know s th e
relatedness o f behavio r a t hom e t o behavio r abroad , an d th e attitude s o f
the privat e citize n t o th e conduc t o f governments . An enlightened politic s
that i s performed , no t jus t espoused , an d whic h reache s int o th e mos t
fundamental aspect s of private life.

Perhaps wha t goe s alon g wit h thi s i s a  close r examinatio n o f wha t
constitutes Shaw' s parataxes , an d wh y the y ar e acceptabl e i n a  comedi c
frame. Shaw rarely, if ever, recalibrates the binaries, but the paratactic pairs
can provide more surprise s fo r th e productive politic s o f home and world ,
work an d economics , liberation an d power , or discipleship and wisdom by
siting the interstices. Sometimes, the antitheses collapse, and therein lies the
drama. Bu t bein g a  produc t o f hi s times , an d henc e a  modernist , Sha w
never abnegates his characters of responsibility: the means to full decoloni -
zation, an d th e goa l o f som e da y achievin g th e tru e posfcolonia l rest s
heavily upon them.
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The later Sha w

In 1923 , Sha w wrot e Saint  Joan,  whic h h e calle d " A Chronicle, " a
description tha t h e ha d neve r previousl y give n t o a  play . Th e pla y wa s
performed wit h great success , first in New York in December 192 3 and in
London i n th e followin g year . Sha w wa s awarde d th e Nobe l Priz e fo r
literature fo r 192 5 (despit e his well-known aversio n to such awards), and,
although the prize was given for the entire corpus of a writer's contribution
to literature, there can be little doubt that the judges were greatly influenced
by the success of Saint  Joan. After Saint  Joan Shaw did not write anothe r
play for five years. In 1924, however, his sister-in-law Mrs. Mary Cholmon-
deley, asked him to send her "a few of your ideas of Socialism." She wanted
the note s fo r a  stud y circl e i n he r hom e count y o f Shropshire . Thi s wa s
when the Sovie t Union ha d com e into bein g and Britai n had ha d he r first
Labor government . Sha w thre w himsel f int o th e tas k wit h energ y an d
enthusiasm. He said that he enjoyed th e exercise because it was "real brain
work, no t romancing an d inventin g bu t reasoning hard" and " a rea l hard
literary job, all brains instead o f writing plays."1 Exasperatingly, the work
proved mor e demandin g tha n h e ha d expected . Originall y planne d a s a
booklet o f abou t 50,00 0 words , i t ende d a s a  larg e volum e o f wel l ove r
200,000 words. The book was finally published i n 1928 with the title The
Intelligent Woman's Guide to Socialism and Capitalism.

The title of the book has given some readers (and perhaps more of those
who hav e not read it ) the impression tha t i t was specifically planne d a s a
primarily feminis t work . Thi s wa s no t so . Sha w chos e th e title , partl y
because th e wor k was , i n fact , writte n i n respons e t o a  reques t fro m
intelligent wome n an d partl y becaus e h e wa s determine d t o writ e some -
thing a s fa r remove d a s possibl e fro m conventiona l work s o n economic s
and politic s an d allie d subject s becaus e th e grea t majorit y o f suc h work s
were writte n i n dr y an d unreadabl e academi c jargon . I n additio n al l th e
books were addressed to men. Shaw declared that, "You might read a score
of them without ever discovering that such a creature as a woman had ever
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existed. I n fairnes s le t me add tha t yo u migh t read a  good man y o f the m
without discoverin g tha t suc h a  thin g a s a  ma n eve r existed." 2 H e wa s
determined, therefore, to write in an understandable language, although, as
several critics have been only too ready to point out, he was not writing for
the "ordinary" woman or man so much as for the more middle-class type of
reader wh o ha d certainl y ha d mor e tha n a  rudimentar y o r elementar y
education. Th e boo k i s written i n a n almos t lighthearte d o r jaunt y styl e
even whe n i t i s dealing wit h question s o f financ e o r politic s tha t ar e no t
readily understoo d b y thos e wh o hav e onl y a  superficia l knowledg e o f
those subjects. It is open to speculation to what extent Shaw's experience in
writing stag e dialogu e contribute d t o hi s abilit y t o expres s himsel f s o
fluently an d easil y on matters o f abstruse content , bu t he had spen t many
hours i n earlie r year s i n committe e wor k an d speakin g o n platform s t o
audiences who might not be expected to respond easil y to the language of
the universit y senio r commo n roo m o r th e leadin g article s o f The  Times.
Whatever th e backgroun d o f hi s approach , th e wor k i s a n astonishin g
production an d i t has been seriously neglected b y students and scholar s of
Shaw.3

He threw himself int o his subject i n his opening paragraph, advising his
reader, "dear madam," not to read anything else that had bee n written o n
socialism before she and her friends had settled the question of how wealth
should b e distributed i n a  respectabl e civilize d country . Hi s solutio n wa s
equality. Everybod y shoul d hav e th e sam e income . I t i s impossibl e t o
summarize such a  work bu t i t can be said that fe w readers who las t unti l
the end will fail to see a little more clearly than before many features of the
economic an d politica l system . Ramsa y MacDonald , th e Labo r Prim e
Minister o f th e 1920 s wh o becam e th e leade r o f a  later , Conservative -
dominated coalition , n o doub t wen t fa r beyon d rationa l bound s when he
said, i n a  conversatio n reporte d b y Shaw' s Germa n translator , Siegfrie d
Trebitsch, that the work was "after th e Bible . . .  the most important boo k
that humanit y possesses," 4 bu t ther e i s a n inheren t nobilit y i n i t tha t
outweighs the sense of exasperation fel t by those who cannot accept all, or
even any o f the conclusions . Shaw' s peroration, i n which he declares tha t
his socialist remedy for the ills of society will result in a view of life where
"the bas e woman wil l b e she who takes more fro m he r countr y tha n sh e
gives to i t . . . an d th e lad y wil l b e she who, generously overearnin g he r
income, leaves the nation in her debt and the world a better world than she
found it, " will not impress all readers but even some who are not converted
to socialism may nevertheless find it moving. Shaw's final word is "By such
ladies and their sons can the human race be saved, and not otherwise."5

The publicatio n o f The  Intelligent  Women's  Guide  lef t Sha w fre e t o
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return t o writin g plays . The wor k involve d i n writing th e Guide,  intense
and demandin g a s i t had been , had affecte d neithe r hi s determination no r
his ability to continue to write for the theatre. In the years that followed the
appearance o f the Guide,  from th e end of 192 8 to the outbreak o f war in
1939, he wrote te n plays , seven o f which wer e full-length . I n view of the
time an d effor t tha t h e ha d spen t o n non-dramati c work , i t wa s hardl y
surprising that , whe n h e returned t o th e theatre , politica l theme s becam e
prominent i n his plays. Thus, of the ten plays, four, al l of them full-length ,
had th e word "political " i n thei r descriptiv e subtitles , a  term tha t h e had
never previously applied to any of his plays. The effect o f the concentration
on political themes that ha d produced th e Guide  may be discerned clearly
in severa l o f th e othe r play s a s well. I t seeme d tha t hi s dramatic creatio n
was given a new incentive in the political direction as a result of his labors
on what he had called the "confounded book. " It is beyond doubt that the
failure o f Labo r government s t o brin g abou t i n practic e an y o f Shaw' s
socialist ideal s an d wha t h e cam e t o conside r th e failur e o f Britis h
parliamentary government in general during the years before the 1939 war,
and the serious deterioration i n the internationa l situation , had a n impor -
tant effec t o n the plays that Sha w wrote durin g the decade. In November
1928, h e bega n The  Apple  Cart,  his firs t pla y sinc e Saint  Joan an d h e
finished i t on December 29 . It was first presente d i n Warsaw in June 192 9
and the first Englis h production wa s at Malvern o n August 19 , 1929. The
Malvern Festiva l ha d bee n conceive d b y Shaw's friend , Barr y Jackson, i n
part as a tribute to Shaw, and Shaw had agreed to write a new play for the
festival. For the next decade, Shaw felt under an obligation to provide plays
for th e annual festiva l an d four o f the full-length play s in the thirties were
given their first Englis h performances a t Malvern. It may be that Shaw felt
a greater freedom i n writing plays for first production in a small provincial
festival tha n i n th e Wes t En d o f London . A n additiona l caus e o f th e
remarkable burst of regular productivity during the decade could well have
been the sense that time was passing - h e was eighty in 1936 - an d while he
still felt capable of writing, he realized that this could not go on forever. As
he wrote t o Nor a Ervine , the wif e o f hi s friend an d fello w dramatist , St .
John Ervine on May 12 , 1934: "Old age is telling on me. My bolt is shot as
far a s any definit e targe t i s concerned an d now , as my playwright facult y
still goes on with the impetus of 30 years vital activity, I shoot into the air
more an d mor e extravagantl y withou t an y premeditatio n whatever." 6

There ma y b e a  connectio n her e betwee n th e us e o f th e wor d "extrava -
gantly" an d hi s descriptio n o f severa l o f th e play s o f thi s late r perio d a s
"extravaganzas."

Shaw's entire background a s a political campaigner , a Fabian socialist , a
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vestryman an d boroug h councillor , an d hi s genera l politica l disposition ,
meant tha t h e wa s alway s oppose d t o th e establishe d Conservativ e o r
Liberal parties and, when i t became a political force , he always supported
the Labor part y i n national an d loca l government elections . Nevertheless,
he was never a slavish follower o f any party line and he always set himself
against th e crudit y o f usin g hi s play s a s propaganda . I n fact , i t wa s
frequently observe d tha t h e tende d t o giv e thos e o f hi s character s wh o
might b e putting forwar d a  poin t o f vie w whic h wa s no t hi s own , a  fa r
more sympatheti c presentatio n tha n migh t hav e bee n expected . Whe n h e
considered this question late in his career, he summed up what had always
been hi s attitud e b y sayin g i n a  lette r t o Eric h Strauss , date d Augus t 4 ,
1942, "you cannot make out why I, being a Republican and a Communist ,
do not write plays in which al l the kings are villains and al l the Socialist s
angels. Tha t i s th e ver y crudes t dramati c practice , an d i s neve r convin -
cing."7 The words are particularly appropriate to the first play of the series,
The Apple Cart,  which i s set in a  future som e years ahead an d present s a
conflict betwee n th e Britis h King , Magnus , an d a  government , le d b y a
Prime Minister, Proteus, clearly based on Shaw's one-time admirer Ramsay
MacDonald, who, however, is said not to have recognized himself when he
saw the play.

The pla y concern s a  seriou s crisis , whe n th e governmen t minister s
contend that Magnus, the King, has gone beyond his constitutional powers
by flagrantly interferin g wit h the functions o f government. The strength of
the pla y lie s i n the conflic t betwee n th e Kin g an d hi s ministers , with th e
dramatically effective pictur e of one man against the majority. The conflic t
has been found b y some critics to be unfairly unbalance d because the King
is seen as a man of charm and integrity as opposed to a collection of either
rogues o r simpleton s wh o ar e merel y playin g th e usua l politica l game .
Shaw himsel f deal t with th e criticism i n the preface t o the published pla y
(written as were all the prefaces, after the play, not before). He said that he
did not accept that the conflict ha d been unfairly presented. He wanted the
King and the ministers to meet on a basis of equality in personal ability and
good sense . H e assume d th e equalit y bu t wen t o n t o sa y tha t i t wa s
"masked b y a strong contrast o f character an d methods which has led my
less considerate critics to complain that I have packed the cards by making
the King a wise man and the minister a fool." (I t is possible here that D. H.
Lawrence's advic e should b e followed that , i n interpreting literar y works ,
the reader should trust the tale and not the artist.) What Shaw maintained
that h e intende d t o emphasiz e i n th e play , an d h e doe s giv e thi s ide a
important prominence, was that the real conflict was not between the King
and th e minister s bu t "betwee n bot h an d plutocracy , which , havin g
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destroyed th e roya l powe r b y frank forc e unde r democrati c pretexts , ha s
bought and swallowed democracy" (Collected Plays, vol. vi, p. 252). There
is much tha t i s prophetic i n the play , ranging fro m th e attac k o n uncon -
trolled plutocrac y t o views on the changing position o f the Royal Family .
(The King, a man of great charm and ability , bears no resemblance to any
real occupant of the British throne.)

Continuing topicalit y ha s helped The  Apple Cart  to b e very popular i n
regular revivals . Amon g th e actor s wh o hav e playe d Magnu s wa s Noe l
Coward, wh o a s a  fello w playwrigh t wa s a  grea t admire r o f Shaw' s
dramatic technique . Criticis m throug h th e year s ha s varied fro m declara -
tions tha t th e pla y i s "verbose " an d a  mino r work , t o a  clai m b y Irvin g
Wardle in The Times,  writing on a production i n central London in 1986,
that there is a major reviva l of the play every ten years and "each time it is
rediscovered a s a play for today." 8 Certainly i t always speaks to the public
mind when there is a mood of disillusion with politicians and when Shaw's
view o f th e deca y o f parliamentar y democrac y appear s t o b e gatherin g
public acceptance . Sometimes , th e criticis m o f th e pla y i s swaye d b y
specifically politica l consideration s as , fo r exampl e i n th e respons e o f
another criti c who , whe n h e sa w a  reviva l i n 1977 , sai d tha t thoug h h e
generally admire d Shaw , h e foun d th e pla y marke d an d marre d b y
"contempt for the masses" and Shaw's attitude of "blinkered elitism."9

The nex t play , whil e called , a s wa s The  Apple  Cart,  " A Politica l
Extravaganza," differ s greatl y fro m it s predecesso r i n bot h ton e an d
temper. The pla y was called Too  True  to be  Good  and,  i n a  lette r t o hi s
French translator , whe n h e ha d jus t finished writing th e play , Sha w sai d
that i t contained "burglars , brigands, a stolen necklace , a military expedi-
tion an d a  battl e actuall y fough t o n th e stage. " H e adde d tha t "thes e
stirring incident s ar e onl y pretext s fo r speeche s o f unprecedente d lengt h
and solemnity." 10 The play is an odd mixture o f realism an d fantasy wit h
settings in a luxurious English bedroom and a sea beach near the edge of a
desert in a mountainous foreign country. It concerns the adventures of three
young people, a man and two women, of the post-1918 generation . Shaw
purports to show them setting out "to have a thoroughly good time with all
the modern machiner y o f pleasure to aid them. The resul t i s that they get
nothing fo r thei r mone y bu t a  multitud e o f worrie s an d a  maddenin g
dissatisfaction" (Collected  Plays, vol. vi, p. 400). While these elements are
present i n th e play , i t woul d b e a  remarkabl y perceptiv e membe r o f th e
audience who would describe the play in these terms after seein g it without
the benefit of Shaw's preface from which these words are taken. Kidnapped
by a  clergyman-burgla r an d hi s accomplic e wh o i s he r nurse , a  youn g
woman escape s from a n overpowering mother . At the end of the first act,
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the audience i s addressed directl y by a microbe, who has been infected b y
the diseas e fro m whic h th e youn g woma n patien t ha s bee n sai d t o b e
suffering. H e declare s tha t "Th e pla y i s no w virtuall y over ; bu t th e
characters wil l discus s i t a t grea t lengt h fo r tw o act s more " (Collected
Plays, vol. vi, p. 455).

The fina l ac t o f th e pla y include s lon g exposition s o f differen t views ,
touching principall y o n religio n an d politics , b y th e variou s characters .
Shaw wrote in the Malvern Theatre Book fo r 193 2 in connection with the
first production i n England, a t Malvern, after th e play had bee n presented
in New York, that he knew his business as a playwright

too wel l t o fal l int o th e commo n mistak e o f believin g tha t becaus e i t i s
pleasant to be kept laughing for an hour, it must be trebly pleasant to be kept
laughing for three hours. When people have laughed for an hour, they want to
be serio-comically entertaine d fo r the next hour ; and when that i s over they
are s o tire d o f no t bein g wholl y seriou s tha t the y ca n bea r nothin g bu t a
torrent of sermons.11

This reasoning , whic h i s sophistr y t o som e extent , give s Sha w th e
opportunity t o en d th e pla y wit h a  lon g sermo n fro m th e clergyman -
burglar. Shaw wrote in his final stage direction tha t "fin e words butte r n o
parsnips" an d adde d tha t "th e author , thoug h himsel f a  professiona l tal k
maker, does not believe that the world can be saved by talk alone." In spite
of thi s assertion , i t i s hard no t t o assum e tha t Aubre y i s speaking Shaw' s
own thoughts , bu t th e autho r appear s t o hav e i t bot h way s b y declarin g
that "hi s own favourite i s the woman of action", that is, the patient herself
(Collected Plays, vol. vi, p. 528).

The nex t full-lengt h pla y wa s On  the  Rocks,  writte n a  yea r afte r Too
True to  be  Good  an d first  presente d no t a t Malver n bu t i n Londo n i n
November 1933 . The play is termed "political " but i t is not labele d a s an
extravaganza. I t may be weaker than the first plays of the group, perhaps
because it is not relieved by farce or knockabout comedy but consists solely
of talk. The talk is excellent, and carries on Shaw's analysis of the political
situation, showing an even more marked concern with what he considered
the failur e o f Britis h parliamentar y democracy . Th e leadin g figure  i s
another British Prime Minister, Sir Arthur Chavender , under whom Britain
has gone "o n th e rocks. " A Liberal confronte d b y the seriou s problem of
rapidly growin g unemployment , h e turn s t o Mar x fo r a  solution . Th e
situation proves too much for him and he admits it, deciding to retire, but
telling his wife that he will hate the man who carries through the necessary
reforms "for his cruelty and the desolation he will bring on us and our like"
(Collected Plays, vol. vi , p . 734) . The pla y end s inconclusivel y wit h th e
mob marching on Downing Stree t and being dispersed b y mounted police.
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In th e distance , a s th e curtai n falls , ca n b e hear d th e voice s o f th e
unemployed continuin g t o sin g Edwar d Carpenter' s socialis t hymn ,
"England Arise," to the accompaniment of the baton-thwacks of the police.

On the Rocks is not of the quality of either The  Apple Cart  or Too True
to be Good. The political analysis is not as convincing as in The Apple Cart
and i t lacks both the depth and the entertaining variety of Too  True to be
Good. It has not been revived in central London, but a performance a t the
Chichester Festival Theatre in 1984 did bring out some of the quality of the
play. I t wa s enhance d b y bein g playe d a t a  tim e whe n ther e wa s seriou s
discontent i n connectio n wit h th e strik e o f th e coalminers , an d th e
appearance o n the stage at the end of the play of armed police in full rio t
equipment gave the play a touch of urgent topicality in which much of the
rhetoric an d discussio n coul d b e see n t o b e mor e relevan t tha n migh t
otherwise have been thought.

If i t wa s surprisin g tha t On  the  Rocks  ha s bee n neglecte d b y centra l
London fo r s o long , i t i s eve n mor e astonishin g tha t th e nex t play , The
Simpleton of the Unexpected Isles, written in 1934 , has been performed i n
central London in a club theatre only, and has thus still to be seen in either
one o f th e big subsidized theatre s o r the commercia l Wes t End. The play,
which perhap s deserve s mos t o f al l Shaw' s late r play s th e ter m "extra -
vaganza," i s not s o described bu t i s called " A Vision of Judgment." I t was
written a  year afte r On  the  Rocks  an d wa s firs t performe d b y the Guil d
Theatre o f New York early in 193 5 a nd a t Malvern late r in that year . The
Simpleton i s certainl y a n od d pla y an d unlik e anythin g tha t Sha w ha d
previously written, except , perhaps, parts o f Back to Methuselah. It defie s
adequate summary but it concerns among other subjects a group marriage,
which i s raciall y mixed , o f thre e couple s wh o produc e fou r children ,
delightful i n thei r ow n wa y bu t no t endowe d wit h conscience ; th e inter -
vention o f an English clergyman who is engaged to supply that deficiency ;
the futur e o f th e Britis h Empire ; th e superiorit y o f easter n religion s t o
western, an d th e imminenc e o f th e Da y o f Judgment . Thi s las t even t i s
announced b y a  ver y unorthodo x ange l wh o alight s t o declar e tha t a
judgment i s bein g execute d whereb y "th e live s whic h hav e n o use , n o
meaning, n o purpose , wil l fad e ou t .  . . Only th e elec t shal l survive. " He
goes on to explain that "th e Day of Judgment i s not the end of the world ,
but the end of its childhood and the beginning of its responsible maturity"
(Collected Plays, vol. vi, p. 825) . Shaw noted wit h sardonic humour that ,
in the view of a New York critic who saw the first performance o f the play,
he ha d show n himsel f a s a  dignifie d monke y peltin g th e publi c "wit h
edifying coconuts. " H e too k th e criticis m lightheartedly , sayin g tha t hi s
latest pla y wa s alway s considere d a  disaste r an d tha t whe n h e wrot e
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2.3 Th e Angel of Judgment as minor bureaucrat: Roger Honeywell as the Angel explains
the End of the World to disbelieving denizens of the Unexpected Isles in the Shaw Festival's

1996 production

another, th e critic s woul d poin t t o th e grea t qualitie s o f The  Simpleton.
This has not happened, and, as indicated above, the play has been seriously
neglected. The unfavorable vie w taken b y the critics in New York and by
many readers of the printed text elsewhere is to be accounted for , partly at
least, by the views expressed by Shaw in the preface. There, he argues, as he
had don e i n th e prefac e t o On  the  Rocks,  fo r th e extermination , a s a
political necessity, of "untameable persons who are constitutionally unabl e
to restrai n thei r violen t o r acquisitiv e impulses " (Collected  Plays, vol. vi ,
p. 576) .

Shaw complete d The  Simpleton  o n Apri l 26 , 1934 . H e bega n writin g
The Millionairess  the followin g day . This ha s ha d a  stag e histor y almos t
as bizarre a s that o f it s predecessor . The  Millionairess  wa s first presented
in Vienn a i n Januar y 193 6 an d th e first  productio n i n Englis h wa s i n
Melbourne i n March o f the same year, followed b y the first production in
England, whic h wa s b y a  smal l repertor y compan y i n Bexhill-on-Sea ,
Sussex, i n November . I t wa s performe d a t th e Malver n Festiva l i n 193 7
and i n Westport , Connecticu t i n 1938 . A production planne d fo r centra l
London, wit h Edit h Evan s i n th e leadin g role , fel l throug h wit h th e
outbreak o f the war , although i t was staged a t on e of the little theatres in
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24 Takin g the pulse of power: Nicola Cavendish as Epifania Fitzfassenden and
George Dawson as The Egyptian Doctor in the Shaw Festival's 1991 production of

The Millionairess

1944. I t wa s onl y finall y presente d i n th e Wes t En d o f Londo n i n Jun e
1952 and the production wen t to New York in October. The leading par t
in bot h citie s was taken b y the fil m actress , Katherine Hepburn . Sh e had
been thought b y Shaw to be ideally suited to the role in the 1930 s but the
part di d no t the n attrac t her . At the time o f Stalin , Mussolini , an d Hitler ,
and hi s ow n eve r growin g disillusio n wit h Britis h democracy , Sha w wa s
becoming mor e an d mor e attracte d b y the ide a o f th e ol d trad e unionis t
Hipney in On  the  Rocks who had sai d that h e was "for an y Napoleon o r
Mussolini o r Leni n o r Chavende r tha t ha s th e stuf f i n hi m t o tak e bot h
the peopl e an d th e spoiler s an d oppressor s b y th e scruff s o f thei r sill y
necks an d jus t slin g the m int o th e wa y i n whic h the y shoul d g o with a s
many kick s a s ma y b e needfu l t o mak e a  thoroug h jo b o f it " (Collected
Plays, vol. vi, p. 719). The eponymous heroine of The  Millionairess, wh o
bears the striking name o f Epifani a Ognisant i d i Parerga Fitzfassenden , i s
a non-politica l femal e incarnatio n o f al l th e kin d o f moder n dictator s
called t o min d b y Hipney , althoug h th e pla y i s no t overtl y politica l i n a
narrow sense . (Th e play, when printe d wa s given a  "Prefac e o n Bosses." )
The othe r sid e o f he r characte r i s show n whe n sh e meet s a n Egyptia n
doctor who is totally overwhelmed b y her powerful personality , and, afte r
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a caree r i n whic h sh e ha s impose d he r wil l brutall y o n everyon e wit h
whom sh e come s int o contact , sh e end s th e pla y wit h a  strikin g an d
moving declaratio n i n favo r o f wha t sh e call s "thi s infinitel y dangerou s
heart tearin g everchangin g lif e o f adventur e tha t w e cal l marriage "
(Collected Plays, vol. vi, p. 966).

Shaw's powers a s a playwright wer e now clearly on the wane bu t there
were still works to come in which some of his old gifts revealed themselves.
His concern wit h th e rapidly deterioratin g internationa l situatio n an d th e
inexorable drif t towar d anothe r grea t war , le d hi m t o hi s next play . This
was Geneva,  "another politica l extravaganza, " written i n three months a t
the beginnin g o f 193 6 and first played o n the stage a t Malvern i n August
1938 an d transferre d t o centra l Londo n i n Novembe r 1938 . I t thu s
straddled th e crisi s tha t wa s temporaril y resolve d b y th e agreemen t a t
Munich in September and Shaw, for all his eighty years, could certainly not
be blamed fo r bein g behin d th e times . When th e pla y wa s first presented
and publishe d i n boo k form , i t wa s give n th e descriptiv e subtitle , subse -
quently dropped , o f " a fancie d pag e o f history. " I n a  not e printe d i n the
program t o the first London production , Sha w wrote tha t th e critics were
sure to complain that he had "not solved all the burning political problems
of the present and future i n it, and restored peace to Europe and Asia. They
always do." 12 H e professe d himsel f flattere d bu t exasperate d b y bein g
considered bot h ominiscien t an d omnipoten t bu t he was also infurated b y
the demand s mad e upo n him . Al l h e coul d do , h e said , wa s "t o extrac t
comedy and traged y fro m th e existing situation an d wai t t o see what wil l
become of it." Geneva  was very well received as an up-to-date comment on
the international scen e at the time but with the passage of the years, such
figures as Hitler , Mussolini , an d Franc o los t thei r topica l appea l an d
revivals hav e tende d t o sho w tha t th e pla y wa s perhap s no t wel l enoug h
written or constructed to survive without it.

Fortunately, the next full-length play , the last to be written before the war
and the one which almost brought to an end Shaw's career as a playwright,
restored th e balanc e t o a  great exten t an d ma y well b e the bes t play ever
written b y an octogenarian , certainly in English. This was "I« Good  King
Charles's Golden  Days," a  title which is a quotation fro m th e anonymous
eighteenth-century song , "The Vicar of Bray." Shaw returned t o a  favorit e
method of his, in taking a fresh look at historical characters. The result was
a stylis h an d witt y serie s o f conversation s betwee n Kin g Charle s I I and a
number o f hi s subjects . Thes e includ e th e astronome r Isaa c Newton , th e
Quaker Georg e Fox , th e painte r Godfre y Kneller , a s wel l a s th e King' s
brother, James, Duke of York (later to become King James II), a selection of
the King's mistresses, and, in the final short scene, his Queen, Catherine of
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Braganza. Shaw's friend, St . John Ervine ranked the greater part of the play
among Shaw's best work, commenting that "th e characters are mature and
brilliantly drawn, each full o f his own idiosyncracy, each stamped with the
ineradicable line s of life. " I t was only late in the play, in Ervine's opinion ,
that Sha w fel l awa y an d allowe d Charle s I I "t o spou t lik e a  lecturer a t a
Fabian Summer School."13 The first production of the play was at Malvern
in Augus t 193 9 an d i t wa s transferre d t o centra l Londo n i n Ma y o f th e
following year. The Dunkirk evacuation took place during the short London
run an d i n view of what wa s happening i n the present , i t was not easy to
think o f pas t histor y no r t o focu s o n th e futur e change s called fo r i n the
preface -  which , in a special return to the theme of the intelligent woman,
expounded the idea of the "coupled vote" in elections with each vote being
cast for a pair of candidates, one man and one woman. (The play proved its
continuing popula r appea l i n a  brillian t 199 7 Sha w Festiva l production ,
and a revival in England by the National Theatre is long overdue.)

It has been suggested earlier that the plays of the 1930 s were marked by
a greater and certainly more obvious concern with politics than any series
of play s a t earlie r period s i n Shaw' s caree r a s a  playwright . Ther e wa s
always a  tensio n i n Sha w betwee n th e politicia n an d th e dramatist . A t
times, hi s ow n comment s cause d confusion . Thus , whe n hi s first  play ,
Widowers' Houses,  was publishe d i n boo k for m i n 1893 , ne declared , a t
the en d o f th e prefac e (whic h h e di d no t hav e reprinte d i n th e Standar d
Edition in 1928) , that the value of the play of which he had no doubts was
"enhanced b y the fac t tha t i t deal s with a  burning socia l question , an d i s
deliberately intended to induce people to vote on the Progressive side at the
next County Counci l election in London" (Collected  Plays, vol. vi, p. 46).
The fact tha t Shaw later omitted this preface ma y indicate that he thought
that to say that the play was written with a  definite vote-winnin g purpos e
might be going too far . In fact, i t is very much to be doubted whethe r any
of Shaw' s play s take n b y itsel f coul d induc e anyon e t o chang e votin g
intentions. It would be a very shrewd reader or spectator who could decide
how t o vot e a s a  resul t o f studyin g an y o f th e specificall y politica l play s
from, fo r example , John Bull's  Other  Island  to the serie s that bega n with
The Apple Cart.  Late in his life, Shaw dealt specifically wit h his approach
in hi s repl y t o Eric h Straus s i n th e lette r o f Augus t 4 , 1944 , alread y
mentioned above . Strauss had appeared to suggest that, because Shaw had
apparently given the better of the argument i n The Apple Cart  to the King
and not to the democratically elected politicians, he had rejected democracy
in favor of a dictatorship, royal or otherwise. His reply was:

As a Socialist it is my business to state social problems and to solve them. I
have done this in tracts, treatises, essays and prefaces. You keep asking why I
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do not keep repeating these propositions Euclidically in my plays. You might
as well ask me why I dont wear my gloves on my feet o r ea t jam with a
spade.14

This does not altogether dispose of the criticism, or solve the dilemma. To
lighten the tone of The Apple Cart  in some places, he had, in fact, presented
some of the members of the cabinet as boobies or scoundrels. In a letter to
J. E . Vedrenne i n 1907 , h e wrot e o f hi s wor k a s " a serie s o f music-hal l
entertainments thinl y disguise d a s plays" 15 but , theatricall y attractiv e
though thi s practic e usuall y was , i t wa s no t fre e fro m dange r whe n th e
dramatist was trying to say something really serious beneath the surface of
the fun. He appeared to think, at times at least, that, as he wrote in a letter
to Graha m Walla s i n 1927 , anyone wh o ha d t o ge t a  grip i n Parliamen t
had to be either an actor o r an ambitious scoundrel.16 In any event, Shaw
wrote to Harold Lask i on July 27 , 1945 that William Morris "sa w clearly
that th e sophisticate d politician s wer e eve n mor e hopeles s tha n th e
romantic tinker s an d costers , an d tha t th e Hous e o f Common s wa s
impossible as an organ for Socialism." 17

If Shaw was often though t to be primarily a  "political" dramatist an d if
this view, although to o simpl e to b e strictly accurate , was partly hi s own
fault, i t spran g fro m hi s continuin g interes t i n politic s throughou t th e
whole o f hi s life , a n interes t tha t coul d no t fai l t o b e represente d i n hi s
work for the stage. Only second, however, to his interest in politics, was his
interest in religion and he remarked ofte n tha t these two subjects were the
only ones of real value to thinking men and women. Some of his plays were
directly and deeply concerned with different aspect s of religious belief. For
example, a s suggeste d above , Too  True  to  be  Good  contain s importan t
elements o f Shaw' s thinkin g o n religious themes . Religion i s both promi -
nent an d importan t i n The  Simpleton.  Th e pries t an d priestess , Pr a an d
Prola, adopt a specifically quietis t oriental attitude with their insistence that
the futur e wil l no t belon g t o thos e wh o follo w th e ol d rule s but , i n th e
words o f Prol a "t o thos e wh o prefe r surpris e an d wonde r t o security "
{Collected Plays, vol. vi, p. 840). This almost mystical approach sounds the
note on which the play ends as they hail the life to come.

There i s on e final  commen t o n th e play s o f thi s las t decad e o f th e
playwright's caree r an d thi s concern s technique . Whe n Sha w bega n a s a
critic o f th e Londo n theatre , h e too k u p tw o positions . Th e first  wa s
opposition t o th e concentratio n o f a  leadin g theatre , th e Lyceum , o n th e
works of Shakespeare , in whose social views he asserted tha t n o educated
and capable person of the day had the faintest interes t and whose work he
considered, i n part a t least , artificia l an d foolish . The second an d comple-
mentary positio n wa s a  determine d advocac y o f th e wor k o f Ibsen . Thi s
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championing of Ibsen was concerned not simply with the subject matter of
the play s bu t wit h th e technique . I n The  Quintessence  of Ibsenism,  firs t
written i n 1891 , Sha w maintaine d tha t whe n th e pla y wa s simpl y a
question of a love affair o r of a crime, there was nothing for the characters
to discuss. 18 When , however , peopl e wen t t o th e theatr e fo r somethin g
other tha n th e repetitio n o f stereotype d plot s o f thi s kind , wha t wer e
needed wer e "interesting " plays . By this term Sha w meant play s in which
problems of conduct and character o f personal importance to the audience
were raised an d discussed . Sha w gradually develope d th e type o f what he
called "a disquisitory play" (Getting Married) and "a debate in one sitting,"
the descriptio n h e gave to th e full-lengt h Misalliance.  I n 1912 , his frien d
William Arche r sai d tha t h e suspecte d Sha w "o f sometime s workin g
without an y definit e scenario , an d inventin g a s h e goe s along." 19 Sha w
declared i n a newspaper articl e "My Way with a Play" in The Observer  as
late in his life as September 29, 1946:

Instead of planning my plays I let them grow as they came, and hardly ever
wrote a page foreknowing what the next page would be. When I tried a plot,
I found that it substituted the absorbing interest of putting it together like a
jigsaw puzzle (the dullest of all operations for the lookers-on) for communic-
able dramatic interest, loading the story with deadwood and spoiling it.20

Shaw did not have a closed mind to theatrical experiment. This was shown
very clearl y i n hi s reaction s t o Sea n O'Casey' s experimenta l work , The
Silver Tassie, which was rejected b y W. B. Yeats, when it was submitted to
the Abbe y Theatr e i n 1928 . Sha w wa s deepl y impresse d an d wrot e t o
O'Casey praisin g the variety i n the work, with , especially , "th e climax of
war imagery in the second act."21 He was in a small minority in his appre-
ciation o f O'Casey' s expressionis m i n this work bu t i t has to b e admitted
that Sha w doe s no t see m t o hav e take n a  grea t interes t i n expressionis t
developments in the theatre elsewhere, in Germany for example.

By the time he reached Too True to be Good, he had adopted the idea of
the extravaganza, which gave him the liberty to abandon the conventional
style of plot altogether. It was not surprising, therefore, that when this play
was revived in London i n the years after th e war, comparisons were made
with what seemed to be the plotless plays of such avant-garde dramatists as
Beckett, Ionesco , and Pinter . This play and The  Simpleton  had a s little in
keeping wit h th e conventiona l Wes t En d play s o f th e 1960 s a s Shaw' s
earliest play s had had with the orthodox constructions o f the stage of the
1890s.

It was not onl y in the contents and construction o f hi s plays that Sha w
revealed his ability to move with the times. He found himsel f looking for a
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changing style of the actual presentation of the plays in the theatre and also
changes in the physical construction o f the playhouse itself. Thus, as in the
1890s, h e ha d mocke d an d deride d th e Irvin g styl e o f presentin g Shake -
speare an d ha d champione d th e reform s o f suc h a s Poel and Barke r wh o
almost wen t bac k t o Shakespeare' s ow n playhous e an d styl e o f presenta -
tion, s o Sha w rejecte d th e conventiona l Wes t En d typ e o f theatr e audi -
torium an d calle d fo r somethin g mor e appropriat e t o th e styl e o f pla y t o
which he was turning himself. Thus, as long before the final plays as 1923,
he had writte n a  paper fo r hi s friend , th e New Yor k producer , Lawrenc e
Langner, who was to b e responsible fo r pionee r production s o f severa l of
the late r Sha w plays . Hi s articl e wa s entitle d "Wanted : a  Ne w Sor t o f
Theatre fo r a n Ol d Sor t o f Play." 22 Delighting , a s always , i n paradox ,
Shaw, who sometimes called himself a new and revolutionary dramatist but
at othe r time s declare d tha t h e wa s a  mos t old-fashione d playwright ,
advocated a  return to the theatre on more or less Shakespearean lines . He
was greatly impresse d b y the possibilitie s o f th e then growin g cinema , i n
which he saw that photography could do, in rapid changing of scenes, what
all th e designer s an d carpenter s employe d b y Irvin g a t th e Lyceu m ha d
failed t o do , despit e th e tim e an d mone y lavishe d o n them . Sha w main -
tained that "no theatre is likely to be generally useful in the future unles s its
stage i s so constructed tha t i t can presen t a  play i n fifty scenes without a
break." He went on to mock the methods of presentation in the nineteenth-
century theatre with "the stage being a mere hole in the wall at the narrow
end, throug h whic h yo u peepe d a t a  remot e tableau  vivant resembling a
pictorial advertisemen t o f th e bes t room s in the lates t hotel. " He stoppe d
short of advocating a "theatre in the round" but his views do not seem very
different fro m thos e of the directors and producers who have gone in that
direction. The  Simpleton  wa s playe d i n th e roun d i n th e Orang e Tre e
production in 1995 and succeeded admirably.

Shaw wrot e on e final  full-lengt h pla y afte r th e remarkabl e decad e o f
playwriting tha t ende d wit h "In  Good  King  Charles's  Golden Days' 9 in
1939. Thi s wa s Buoyant  Billions,  which h e ha d actuall y begu n i n 1936 ,
abandoned in 1937, taken up again in August 1945 , and completed in July
1947. He described the play in the preface as "a trivial comedy which is the
best I  can d o i n my dotage." He aske d fo r forgivenes s fo r th e piece , and
added that i t would not rub in the miseries and sins of recent wars, which
he urged his readers to forget. He made no greater claim for this late work
than tha t i t wa s a n exampl e o f "smilin g comed y wit h som e hop e i n it "
(Collected Plays, vol. vn, p. 311).

This was in 1947 . Before that , however , his thoughts had taken a  more
constructive direction . When , i n 1912 , he had writte n t o hi s friend , Mrs .
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Alfred Lyttelton , that he had " a book on Socialism to write - the  book on
Socialism," thi s ide a became , afte r lon g delay , The  Intelligent  Woman's
Guide. H e ha d tol d Mrs . Lyttelto n tha t thi s mean t tha t h e woul d b e
"replunged int o Socialis m .  . . even int o journalism , perhaps : a  horro r a t
my age."23 At a  very much late r age , he threw himsel f int o socialism an d
even "journalism " onc e again . At the beginning o f the 193 9 war , he took
on the task of writing another book on economics and politics. He told his
friend Gilber t Murray tha t thi s was to b e "a Penguin sixpenny stating the
facts that persons ought to know before they are allowed to vote or present
themselves for election. " The book was published i n 194 4 as Everybody's
Political What's What?  (not a  Penguin an d costin g very much mor e tha n
sixpence). A s wit h The  Intelligent  Woman's  Guide,  h e foun d tha t th e
writing wen t rathe r mor e slowl y than h e would hav e liked . In a  lette r t o
Lord Alfred Douglas , he wrote on December 27 , 1941: "My book, which I
thought woul d b e finished  thi s year , i s a  mas s o f senil e rambling s an d
repetitions. I shall never get it into any very orderly sequence. But perhaps
my second childhood may go down with the mob better than my maturity
did."24 H e ma y hav e don e himsel f a n injustice . Certainly , th e boo k doe s
not stan d compariso n wit h The  Intelligent  Woman's  Guide.  After nearl y
twenty year s an d whe n th e author , practise d thoug h h e wa s i n clea r
exposition both on the stage and off , ha d los t something of his energy and
skill, the late r boo k lack s the clarit y an d coherenc e o f th e earlie r and , a t
times, seem s bot h joke y an d jerky . Nevertheless , th e America n critic ,
Edmund Wilson, who, while admiring most o f Shaw's plays of the 1930s ,
had writte n scathingl y o f hi s politics a t tha t time , now fel t tha t "eve n a t
the points where Shaw's thinking conspicuously fail s in coherence, there is
still a  kin d o f genera l wisdo m tha t soak s throug h th e crack s o f hi s
argument."25

The final period o f Shaw' s dramatic production , fro m Saint  Joan to his
plays of the 1930s may be seen as, in themselves, a paradoxical representa-
tion o f th e whol e o f hi s writin g life . Fo r on e wh o employe d parado x t o
such a great extent in his own style of writing and thought , this in itself is
an exquisite example of paradox. Thus, while it may be an exaggeration to
suggest tha t Sha w proved t o b e most facetiou s whe n tryin g t o b e serious
but showed himself as most serious when, in fact, intending to be facetious,
it has certainly something of the truth i n it. This may be illustrated b y the
summing-up of the critic Martin Meisel after he had examined Shaw's plays
of the later period:

As a  group , Shaw' s Extravaganza s ar e unquestionabl y th e mos t under -
appreciated of his plays. Just as the best of the Discussions are thought to be,
from a theatrical point of view, static, argumentative, and dialectically over-
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Intellectual Extravaganzas : Shaw (Al Kozlik) and fantasy (Lis a Waines as Maya) i n the
Shaw Festival's 199 6 production of The Simpleton of  the Unexpected  Isles

refined, while in fact they are full o f farcical activity , vigorous character, and
broad theatricalism , s o th e Extravaganza s ar e though t t o b e theatricall y
crude, allegorically dull, and relatively empty, while in fact they are inventive,
exciting, and as full of meat as an egg.26

Meisel went on to suggest that the disregard of realistic canons in the later
plays could be "deplored as evidence of Shaw's declining abilities only from
the standpoin t o f doctrinair e dramati c naturalism. " H e conclude d b y
remarking on the paradox that Shaw "capped his heterodox career, having
always mad e th e greates t intellectua l claim s fo r th e drama , b y makin g
nineteenth-century Extravaganz a the vehicle for his drama of ideas." From
a differen t angle , G . K . Chesterton , a  regula r sparrin g partne r o f Shaw ,
always took the view that hi s old friend an d adversary was more likely to
be right when he was being flippant than when he was trying to be serious.

Despite th e effort s tha t h e mad e sometime s t o spea k i n on e capacit y
rather than the other, it was almost impossible for Shaw the "clown" to be
absent from Sha w the "serious thinker" and vice versa. Thus, while in The
Intelligent Woman's Guide,  he made a deliberate attempt to write a  work
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of exposition rather than entertainment , i t was impossible for him to write
in a  styl e tha t wa s essentiall y differen t fro m tha t i n whic h h e wrot e hi s
plays an d prefaces . Admittedly , th e deliberatel y facetiou s o r flippan t i s
rarely to be seen in The Intelligent Woman's Guide  but, in both this work
and th e late r Everybody's  Political  What's  What?  hi s abilit y t o us e th e
homely or everyday illustration in his arguments makes his style of writing
far nearer to that employed in his plays and as remote as possible from tha t
of al l bu t a  smal l numbe r o f th e usua l writer s o f book s o n politica l o r
economic subject s whic h h e foun d "writte n i n a n academi c jargon " tha t
was "unbearabl y dry , meanin g unreadable " t o th e reade r wh o wa s no t
specialized. It was not only in style that the works of exposition resembled
the plays . The symmetr y o f th e appearanc e o f th e tw o works , almos t a s
bookends a s i t were , a t eithe r sid e o f th e corpu s o f play s writte n i n th e
decade may tend to suggest the idea of essential difference . Thi s is not so.
Ideas worke d ou t i n The  Intelligent  Woman's  Guide  ar e clearl y t o b e
discerned i n th e plays . Example s are , o f course , th e discussion s o f th e
working o r failure s o f parliamentar y democrac y i n various play s an d th e
disquisition o n economi c matter s i n The  Millionairess,  I n th e revers e
direction, a s i t were , Sha w consider s hi s profession a s a  dramatis t i n the
chapter o n "Th e Aestheti c Man " i n Everybody's  Political  What's What?
and says that "th e artist' s workshop i s the whole universe a s far a s he can
comprehend it ; and he can neither contrive nor dictate what happens there:
he can only observe and interpret events that are beyond his control."

In the last year of his life, an opportunity arose for Shaw to make a final
public pronouncement o n the function o f the dramatist. Terence Rattigan ,
himself a  popula r an d successfu l dramatist , wrot e a n articl e i n th e New
Statesman and Nation with the title "The Play of Ideas." He contended that
the theatr e wa s dominate d b y "th e pla y o f ideas " unde r th e continuin g
influence o f Ibsen and Shaw, but he thought that plays should be primarily
"about people and not about things." The editor invited Shaw to reply. He
agreed, bu t suggeste d tha t othe r dramatist s shoul d firs t b e invited t o pu t
their views and he would come in at the end and "wip e the floor wit h the
lot."

In his reply, Shaw admitted that there were ideas at the back of his plays
but this did not make them mere speeches or leading articles. The criticism
was "an old story" and he contended firmly that "without a  stock of ideas,
mind canno t operat e an d play s canno t exist . The qualit y o f a  play i s the
quality o f it s ideas." 27 He the n abandone d Rattiga n an d launche d int o a
long exposition o f hi s own developmen t a s a dramatist , influence d b y the
Greeks, Shakespeare , an d opera . Perhap s hi s shrewdes t thrus t i n hi s own
defense was the observation tha t there were differences i n mental capacity
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between playwrights . "On e playwright i s capable o f nothing deepe r tha n
short-lived fictitious police and divorce court cases of murder and adultery.
Another ca n rise to the masterpieces o f Aeschylus, Euripides , and Aristo-
phanes, to Hamlet, Faust,  Peer Gynt, an d - well , no matter." Six months
after thes e characteristically self-confiden t assertions , Shaw's long career as
public entertainer and "the greatest world teacher ever to have arisen fro m
these islands"28 came to an end.
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Shaw and the Cour t Theatr e

Introduction

In hi s introductor y remark s t o Lilia n McCarthy' s autobiography , Myself
and My Friends  (1933), Shaw wrote o f th e Cour t Theatr e experience : "I t
did no t see m a n importan t chapte r whe n w e wer e makin g it : bu t now ,
twenty years after it s close, it falls into perspective as a very notable one."1

When the Court Theatre venture was properly launched in the autumn of
1904 b y Harle y Granvill e Barke r an d J . E . Vedrenne , G . B . Sha w was '
known a s a  minor novelist , a  highly rated musi c and dram a critic , and a
failed playwright . A leading article in The  Era (May 14 , 1904 ) attribute d
his incontestabl e lac k o f succes s t o hi s didacticism , hi s dehumanizin g o f
characters, an d hi s idiosyncrati c egotis m tha t reveale d itsel f eve n mor e
distastefully whe n hi s play s wer e performe d rathe r tha n read . I n Marc h
1905, the leader in the same paper referred t o '"The Bernard Sha w Boom"
at the Court Theatre. By 1907 when the Barker-Vedrenne partnership was
planning a  move to the larger Savoy Theatre afte r a n artistic triumph an d
at leas t a  respectabl e financial outcome a t th e Court , n o les s a  theatrica l
knight tha n Si r Herbert Beerboh m Tre e was extollin g Shaw' s virtues a s a
dramatist who had by this time been happily acknowledged by the presence
of th e King , th e Princ e an d Princes s o f Wales , th e Prim e Minister , an d
numerous notable politicians at his Court productions.

The Cour t betwee n 190 4 an d 190 7 was , i n fact , th e "Sha w Theatre, "
since 701 out of 988 productions were of Shaw's plays. These financed the
experimental matinee s o f th e wor k o f Barker , Galsworthy , Hankin , an d
Masefield an d kep t th e enterpris e viable . I n return , th e Barker-Vedrenn e
management provide d Sha w with th e idea l theatrica l condition s i n which
his plays could succeed. He was able to direct his own work with a group
of actor s sympatheti c t o hi s political stanc e an d t o hi s dramaturgica l an d
theatrical technique of harnessing tradition in the pursuit of the innovative.
The commercial set-up of the West End was anathema to him, as were the
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star-system, the hierarchy of the actor-managers, and the fashion fo r lavish
settings and exquisite costumes. The Court management believed that "the
play wa s th e thing " and , i n a n idea l contex t fo r innovation , buil t u p a n
audience prepared t o be shocked, amused, o r jolted fro m complacenc y by
Shaw, the arch-iconoclast.

In three years, a new dramatic genius had been created in an unfashion -
able littl e theatr e outsid e the West End orbit , wit h th e help of a  group of
actors whose name s were unknow n beyon d th e Sunda y evening perform -
ance circuit.

The legacy of the 1890 s

Much of the groundwork fo r the success of the Court experiment had been
done b y th e smal l "alternative " stag e companie s tha t spran g u p i n th e
1890s, notabl y th e Independen t Theatr e Societ y (ITS ) founde d b y J . T .
Grein, "th e prince of theatre enthusiasts, " in 1891 , William Archer's New
Century Theatre , an d abov e all , th e Stag e Society , whic h ros e fro m th e
ashes o f th e defunc t IT S i n 1899 . Th e endeavor s o f th e pioneer s wh o
worked i n difficult circumstance s with no regular company, no permanent
theatre o r rehearsa l space , an d extremel y limite d funds , nevertheles s
resulted i n the establishmen t o f a  group o f youn g actor s intereste d i n the
challenge of "difficult" role s presented by the best of continental drama, in
a growing body of native playwrights who sought to create an intellectua l
literary alternative to the postprandial escapism of society drama, and in a
small but increasing audience for a theatre of social commitment and moral
debate. Most specifically, the Societies provided the Court with its principal
dramatist, G . B. Shaw, its director, Harley Granvill e Barker and a  nucleus
of actors on which the management could draw with confidence.

While Sha w wa s inevitabl y critica l o f th e shor t rehearsa l periods , th e
difficulties o f recruitin g actor s an d th e lac k o f technica l facilities , h e was
quick to acknowledge the importance to the dramatis t o f the right to fail .
"The mai n poin t i s tha t th e Stag e Societ y gam e i s b y n o mean s t o b e
despised, and tha t i f the people who scorned th e old Independent Theatr e
had writte n fo r i t al l they could , severa l o f them woul d hav e been exper t
dramatists now."2

Shaw's first play, Widowers 9 Houses, was produced b y the ITS in 1892 .
"It was the existence of the Independent Theatr e tha t made me finish that
play, an d b y givin g m e th e experienc e o f it s rehearsa l an d performance ,
revealed th e fac t (t o mysel f amon g others ) tha t I  possesse d th e gif t o f
"fingering" the stage. Everything followed from that." 3

The Stag e Society' s inaugura l productio n wa s You  Never  Can  Tell  in

262



Cambridge Companions Online © Cambridge University Press, 2006

Shaw and the Court Theatre

1899 and between that date and the establishment of the Barker-Vedrenne
management a t the Cour t i n 1904 , the Society produced Candida  (1900),
Captain Brassbound's  Conversion  (1900) , Mrs.  Warren's  Profession
(1902), and The Admirable Bashville (1903).

On th e incorporatio n o f th e Stag e Societ y i n 1904 , Sha w an d hi s wif e
were the first (an d only) life members. He was a member of the council of
management an d serve d o n bot h th e castin g an d th e production commit -
tees. In acknowledgin g tha t " I ow e the Societ y a s much a s i t owe s me,"4

Shaw wa s no t referrin g onl y t o th e provisio n o f a  stage fo r hi s dramati c
experiments. I t wa s throug h th e Stag e Societ y tha t h e cam e int o contac t
with Harle y Granvill e Barker , "altogethe r th e mos t distinguishe d an d
incomparably th e most cultivated perso n whom circumstances ha d drive n
into the theatre at that time."5

The stor y o f Shaw' s initia l dismissa l o f Charle s Charrington' s choic e of
the young Barker to play Marchbanks i n the Stage Society's production of
Candida and his subsequent conversion to wholehearted admiratio n o f the
latter's talent has been well rehearsed. Barker's success in the role led to his
being cas t a s Captai n Kearne y i n Captain  Brassbound's Conversion  and
Frank in Mrs. Warren's  Profession. Soon Shaw was convinced no t only of
his histrioni c ability , despit e reservation s tha t Barke r wa s to o "fastidiou s
and low-toned " fo r th e full-bloode d Shavia n drama , bu t als o o f hi s
originality as a dramatist an d a director. Barker's directorial debut was for
the Stag e Societ y i n Apri l 1900 , a  tripl e bil l o f tw o Maeterlinc k plays ,
Interior an d Death  of  Tintagiles,  an d The  House  of  Usna  b y "Fion a
McLeod." I t was als o fo r th e Stag e Society tha t h e directed hi s own play
The Marrying  of  Ann  Leete  i n 1902 , an d co-directe d wit h th e author ,
Shaw's Cashel  Byron's Profession  in th e followin g year . "Sha w foun d i n
Barker first the juvenile actor he wanted, then the manager and co-director
he needed; for sixteen years Barker was his chief stage resource."6

Barker, like Shaw, was always to acknowledge the opportunities and the
encouragement proffered b y the Stage Society and its predecessors but also
like Shaw, he became increasingly frustrated b y its limitations. "I think that
the Independen t Theatr e -  Th e Ne w Centur y -  th e Stag e Societ y hav e
prepared th e ground an d th e time is ripe for startin g a  theatre upo n thei r
lines upon a regular however unpretending basis."7

The principle s o f th e Cour t experimen t

In his much quoted lette r to William Archer of April 21 , 1903, "a seminal
document i n th e Edwardia n refor m o f th e stage," 8 accordin g t o Denni s
Kennedy, Barker suggeste d tha t thi s theatre migh t b e the Cour t i n Sloane
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Square wher e h e propose d t o "ru n a  stoc k seaso n o f th e Uncommercia l
Drama: Hauptman n -  Suderman n -  Ibse n -  Maeterlinc k -  Schnitzle r -
Shaw -  Brieux , etc. " Pace  the "etc. " Sha w i s th e onl y English-speakin g
dramatist included. Despite Archer's reservations about the youth - Barke r
was onl y twenty-thre e -  an d inexperienc e o f hi s correspondent , h e ha d
none about his vision, a vision that would culminate in a National Theatre
for which Archer himself had tirelessly worked throughout the 1890s. Thus
when almos t a  year late r J. H . Leigh of the Cour t Theatr e aske d Archer' s
advice o n a  directo r fo r Two  Gentlemen  of  Verona  to featur e hi s wife ,
Thyrza Norman , h e suggeste d Harle y Granvill e Barker , wh o agreed ,
provided tha t h e could als o produce si x matinees o f Candida,  which ha d
not yet had a  public performance. Sha w reputedly took ver y little interes t
in th e event , bu t Charlott e Sha w secretl y promise d £16 0 a s a  guarante e
against loss , fortunatel y neve r claimed , a s th e pla y wa s popula r an d
brought th e sceptica l Sha w royaltie s o f £3138 . Nonetheless , th e totall y
uninterested Sha w had a  few words to say on the advertisements : "Unless
every advertisemen t i s heade d TUESDAYS , THURSDAY S an d FRIDAY S i n
colossal prin t th e scheme wil l fai l becaus e people wil l get confused abou t
the dates which are perfectly idiotic." 9

The succes s o f Candida  was consolidate d b y Barker' s productio n o f
Hippolytus, Gilber t Murray's translation of Euripides' drama, for the New
Century Theatre. J. E. Vedrenne, the Court's business manager saw that the
avant garde could be profitable an d entered into a partnership with Barker
that was to last four years.

The Court  repertoire fel l into four categories : first, example s of the best
of European contemporary drama , plays by Ibsen, Hauptmann, Schnitzler ,
and Maeterlinck ; secondly , Gilber t Murray' s lyrica l (an d totall y anglified )
translations o f Euripides ' tragedies , Hippolytus,  Electra,  and The  Trojan
Women; th e largel y naturalisti c wor k o f th e "new " dramatists , suc h a s
Barker, Hankin , an d Masefield ; and , finally,  and mos t importantly , th e
dramas of G. B. Shaw. During the three seasons from 190 4 to 1907 , there
were premieres of six plays by Shaw. John Bull's Other Island launched the
project i n November 1904 , Man and Superman, a co-production wit h the
Stage Society , was produced i n May 1905 , followed b y Major Barbara i n
November. The  Doctor's  Dilemma  (Novembe r 1906) , The  Philanderer
(February 1907) , and Don Juan in Hell, the hitherto unperformed thir d act
of Man and Superman (June 1907) , were all mounted i n the last season at
the Court . Ther e wer e i n additio n regula r revival s o f Candida  and You
Never Can Tell and Captain Brassbound's Conversion.10

In some quarters there was disquie t abou t th e domination o f the Cour t
repertoire b y Shavia n drama , notabl y fro m Willia m Archer , a  staunc h
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supporter of the venture and a good friend t o Barker and to Shaw. But with
the possible exception of Barker himself, and he was certainly less prolific,
there wer e fe w playwright s o f calibr e wit h wor k read y fo r production .
Shaw's attempts to encourage his literary friends, for example, H. G. Wells,
to writ e fo r th e stag e wer e unsuccessful , an d Joh n Galsworthy , a  recen t
convert to the theatre, was only beginning his career with The  Silver Box,
produced at the Court in 1906.

Significantly, the actors, and particularly actresses, were highly supportive
of th e variet y o f role s offered . Lilia n McCarthy , wh o create d th e par t o f
Ann Whitefield i n Man and Superman, wrote: "[Ann Whitefield] was a new
woman and she made a new woman of me"11 and Edith Wynne Mattison's
reply t o th e toas t t o th e Cour t actor s a t th e en d o f th e managemen t
concluded: "Our authors have fitted u s out with an entirely new gallery of
theatrical portraitures , freein g u s fro m th e conventiona l classification s
which have done injustice for humanity too much on the English stage."12

Yet although Sha w was the dramatis t whos e work was most frequentl y
performed a t the Court, his contribution went beyond that of providing as
he put it "a series of first-rate music hall entertainments, thinly disguised as
plays."13 He directed hi s own work, advised on the direction of others, on
the choice o f repertoir e an d othe r artisti c matters , and fro m tim e to tim e
took a  practical interes t in the theatre's finance and administration . Above
all, despite hi s own succes s and th e opportunitie s i t brough t fo r persona l
remuneration throug h lon g run s o n th e commercia l stage , h e remaine d
unfalteringly tru e t o th e principle s o f th e compan y an d t o it s pioneerin g
mission.

The radica l etho s o f th e company suite d Shaw' s own politica l outlook .
The mos t successfu l Cour t play s (thos e b y Barker , Galsworthy , an d
Hankin, a s wel l a s Shaw's ) pu t forwar d wha t th e critic , Desmon d
MacCarthy, calle d " a critica l dissentin g attitud e toward s conventiona l
codes of morality."14 Lilian McCarthy, who played many Shavian heroines,
referred t o th e Cour t Theatr e a s a  "missio n hall " an d t o Sha w a s "th e
General Booth of this Salvation Army." 15 The atmosphere of commitmen t
to social reform, usin g the stage as a platform, suite d very well the Fabian
Society stalwar t wh o wrote , "Althoug h m y trade i s that o f a  playwright ,
my vocation is that of a prophet."16 The Court audience of serious-minded
intellectuals, writers, artists, and socialists, who found littl e to amuse them
in the self-reflecting upper-middle-clas s dramas of the West End commercial
stage, was hungry for these prophecies. Shaw insisted that i t was less of an
audience than a congregation. Punch (December 13 , 1905) detected "no t a
theatre-going bu t rather a  lecture-going, sermon-loving appearance" in the
spectators of Major Barbara,
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Backstage, n o les s than i n the auditorium , suc h egalitaria n an d radica l
principles prevailed . Th e hierarch y o f th e actor-manager' s compan y wa s
toppled i n th e Court' s commitmen t t o wha t th e actress , Edit h Wynn e
Matthison, describe d a s " a sens e o f brotherhoo d an d sympathy , firml y
based on economic equity and artistic opportunity." The Court could never
afford hig h salaries , no r di d th e managemen t wan t t o pa y them , fo r th e
actor who demanded a  star salary was probably not a Court actor anyway,
and Barke r firml y believe d tha t econom y i n managemen t ofte n helpe d
rather tha n hindere d artisti c achievement . Lewi s Casso n write s tha t
£i iso d pe r matinee was paid to first-rate actors a t the Court , althoug h a
few actors , of which he was one, were on low-salaried seasona l contracts .
Many actors , including Lilian McCarthy, who turned dow n a  £30 a  week
contract fro m Charle s Frohma n t o kee p he r Cour t "twelve-poun d look, "
willingly accepte d a  dro p i n salar y i n retur n fo r interestin g wor k wit h
serious-minded and talented fellow actors.

Although Court  salarie s wer e lo w b y Wes t En d standards , th e actor s
were in no sense exploited, as Edith Wynne Matthison makes clear: "There
were n o groan s o f th e ill-pai d an d sweate d i n ou r midst." 17 Indeed , i t
would hav e bee n surprisin g i f ther e ha d been , fo r Cour t actor s wer e
prominent in the reform o f the Actors' Association in 1907. The aim of the
Reform Party , which include d Barker , Henry Ainley , Lewis Casson , Edit h
Wynne Matthison , an d Clar e Gree t fro m th e Court , wa s t o preven t th e
Association turnin g int o a  mer e socia l clu b an d t o forc e i t t o conside r
seriously the financial difficulties o f the profession. Largel y thanks to their
activities, the minimum weekly wage for a speaking part was established at
£2 per week.

Many of the Court  performer s wer e deeply involved with the Actresses'
Franchise League , the theatrica l win g o f th e women' s suffrag e movemen t
and th e Cour t stage d wha t i s probably th e bes t propagandis t pla y o n the
subject, Elizabet h Robins' s Votes  for Women!  i n 1907 , bot h Sha w an d
Barker having a hand in the final version.

The spiri t o f thi s compan y o f pioneer s tha t sough t t o refor m th e
theatrical profession and,  indeed, society itself was expressed artistically in
the commitment to the idea of ensemble playing and the eradication of the
"star system. " Barker , i n thankin g hi s actor s fo r thei r wor k ove r thre e
seasons a t th e Court , said , " I would rathe r thin k o f the m a s a  compan y
than a s individuals , brillian t individuall y a s the y ma y be , fo r I  fee l ver y
strongly tha t i t i s the playin g togethe r o f a  goo d compan y whic h make s
good performances." 18 Lilia n McCarth y maintaine d "a t th e Court , th e
whole was greater than the part. .  . there were no stars. We were members
of a theatrical House of Lords: all equal and all Lords."19 As early as 1894,
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Shaw ha d criticize d th e actor-manager/sta r syste m i n tha t i t limite d th e
production o f ne w play s t o thos e wit h part s suite d t o th e actor-manager ,
thereby excludin g works , fo r exampl e Ibsen' s socia l pros e dramas , which
have female protagonists. It also prohibited experimentation as commercial
considerations o f necessity took precedence over the impulse to encourage
any pla y o r productio n tha t migh t b e a  financial risk. He advocate d "th e
break-up o f the actor-manager syste m by the competition o f new forms of
theatrical enterprise" 20 - exactl y what the Cour t season s were to prove to
be.

The cul t o f th e "star " personality , Sha w believed , le d t o play s bein g
performed simpl y a s a  vehicle fo r his/he r self-expressio n rathe r tha n a s a
cohesive wor k o f art . Whe n th e "star " i s given somethin g worthwhil e t o
say o r do , s/h e i s a t a  loss . "T o you r sta r acto r th e pla y doe s no t exis t
except a s a  mountin g block . Tha t i s wh y comparativel y humbl e actors ,
who do not dare to think they can succeed apar t fro m th e play, often giv e
better representations than star casts."21

Apart fro m an y artistic reservation Sha w had abou t sta r performers , he
quickly realized that in the Court context, they were a financial burden. In
a letter to Vedrenne (May 16 , 1906) he wrote, "All our real successes John
Bull an d Superma n hav e bee n wit h modes t youthfu l cast s .  . . Wil l a
fashionable leadin g lady i n The D's D. [Th e Doctor' s Dilemma ] dra w th e
difference betwee n her salary and Miss Lamborn's?"22

A second principle of the Court philosophy was to avoid at all costs the
pernicious long-ru n system , whereb y largel y fo r commercia l reason s i n a
bid to recou p the vas t investmen t i n scenery an d costumes , management s
sought to keep a production on stage for as long as possible in London and
then tour i t in the provinces. This blatant commercialism di d little for th e
acting profession: first, the actors were bored and unstimulated, playing the
same role s ove r a n extende d period , an d secondly , wit h al l th e mai n
theatres bein g committed t o long-running shows , there were fewer oppor -
tunities for experience d actor s to gain employment o r for youn g actors to
learn. Barke r ha d decrie d th e long-run , maintainin g tha t "i t reduce d t o
automatism the art of acting." Shaw, in an essay entitled "Qualifications of
the Complet e Actor " i n the Drama  Review (Septembe r 19 , 1885) , wrote,
"The number of parts played by a metropolitan actor must be astonishingly
small i n proportio n t o th e numbe r o f night s the y hav e played. " H e i s
particularly concerne d abou t th e effec t thi s paucit y o f experienc e woul d
have on their future careers.

The Court Theatre operated a system whereby new work was introduced
as a  serie s o f si x matinee s an d i f th e pla y wer e successfu l i t woul d b e
revived later in an evening bill. This gave the author and the actors time to
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rework th e productio n wit h th e experienc e o f havin g played i t befor e a n
audience. Bu t n o production , howeve r successful , ra n fo r mor e tha n si x
weeks.

The actor s were appreciative o f a  system tha t allowe d the m a  range of
playing opportunities and were happy to be cast in small parts as well as in
major roles . Bu t fo r th e syste m t o work , actor s o f bot h versatilit y an d
stamina were required. In May 1905 , Granville Barker played John Tanner
in matinees of Man and Superman and Eugene Marchbanks in the evening
performances o f Candida-,  Loui s Calvert , i n th e sam e season , playe d Th e
Waiter i n You  Never  Can  Tell  i n th e afternoo n an d Broadben t i n John
Bull's Other  Island  in the evening; Lewis Casson i n October 190 5 played
"another gentleman " i n The  Wild  Duck  matinee s and Octaviu s Robinso n
in Man and Superman in the evening bill ; and Edith Wynne Matthison i n
January 190 6 wen t fro m Electr a t o Mrs . Baine s i n Major  Barbara.  A
regular feature of the Court actor's work was the movement from one large
part to another, from a  walk-on to a major role and from a  Greek play to a
play by Shaw. No actor or actress could coast through a Court season with
a goo d profil e an d a  prett y dress . The short-ru n syste m stretche d actors ,
who had the ability to develop in different style s and to meet the challenges
of the system.

Shaw recognized tha t h e had littl e in common with the dominant mod e
of theatre a t the turn o f the century an d tha t hi s plays would neve r enjo y
success in tha t context . The ideal s and etho s o f the Cour t unde r Barker' s
direction provide d hi m wit h a  perfec t opportunity , whic h h e seized ,
bringing distinction both to himself and to the management.

G. B . Sha w a s a  director

"The art of producing [i.e . directing] plays . .. i s as much in my profession
as writing them,"23 proclaimed Bernar d Shaw . Indeed he believed that the
best directo r wa s th e play' s autho r i f a t al l possibl e bu t i f s/h e wer e no t
directing s/h e shoul d kee p wel l awa y fro m th e production . Wit h typica l
flamboyance h e announce d himsel f t o b e th e onl y goo d directo r fo r hi s
plays, indeed a  sine qua non to their successful staging : "Amateurs canno t
perform m y plays . Professional s canno t unles s I  am ther e t o hel p them "
{The Era, December 29, 1906).

He was indeed largely responsible for the direction of all his own plays at
the Court , an d eve n when hi s absence necessitate d Barker' s initiatin g th e
rehearsals, h e invariabl y cam e i n a t th e en d o f th e process , dismisse d
Barker's delicat e effects , replace d th e younge r man' s "Debussy " wit h hi s
own "Verdi," let the actors rip, and raised the production into the realms of
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grand opera. Yet when he undertook his first major Cour t production, John
Bull's Other  Island  i n 1904 , h e wa s comparativel y inexperienced . H e
certainly learned "on the job" as it were, and does admit, in a more modest
mode, that he was taught by excellent actors.

Shaw wrote two major essay s on his principles and practice of directing,
namely "Th e Ar t o f Rehearsal " (1922 ) an d "Rule s fo r Directors " (1949) .
These togethe r wit h th e literall y thousand s o f note s h e too k durin g
rehearsals for m th e basi s o f Bernar d Dukore' s Bernard  Shaw: Director
(1971), which remains the principal work in this area.

Shaw believe d tha t th e firs t an d mos t importan t ste p i n th e directin g
process was the choice of a good and appropriate cast. "Get your cast right,
and ge t the m intereste d i n themselve s an d i n th e occasion , an d stag e
management [i.e . directing] can be done without , though i t does no harm
when it does not get in the way of the acting."24 His letters and notebooks
in colour-coded inks display the various combinations and permutations he
explored befor e reachin g a  conclusion . Ofte n actor s who m h e admire d
were the basis of his characters, although the initial model was not always
in th e even t abl e t o play . But , i n th e main , h e chos e a  tea m tha t woul d
complement on e another' s skills , actors o f suitabl e age s and personalitie s
who would, above all, provide the correct orchestration and vocal contrasts
for the play. Ann Casson, daughter of Lewis Casson, a regular Court player
commented:

Shaw worked orchestrally. When he cast his plays, he always cast them [thus]
. .  . you need a tenor voice for that, you need a bass voice for that, a soprano,
an alto. You're casting them as instruments, and if you want to know how to
play a part, you've got to know what quality of voice is needed for it.25

Shaw expecte d actor s wit h skil l an d training , technica l expertis e i n
movement and diction, who could rehearse the phonetic alphabet as singers
rehearse scales . "As a  producer I  went bac k t o th e forgotten heroi c stage
business and the exciting or impressive declamation I  had learnt from old -
timers like Ristori, Salvini and Barry Sullivan."26 He was indeed fortunat e
as many of the Court company, including Granville Barker , himself "craz y
mad abou t elocution, " ha d worke d wit h th e pionee r Shakespearia n pro -
ducer, Willia m Poel , wh o ha d insiste d o n "learnin g th e tunes " o f a  pla y
before an y move s wer e mad e an d whos e dedicatio n t o th e ar t o f stag e
speech was handed on to the company in Sloane Square. As Lewis Casson
confirmed, "Barke r an d Sha w would no t hav e bee n abl e to achiev e wha t
they did had they not had at their disposal actors of a distinct type, trained
speakers brough t u p i n a  traditio n wher e ther e wa s a n ar t o f stag e
speech."27
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z6 Th e rhetoric of melodramatic acting: Deborah Lambie as The Lady and Stuart Hughes
as Napoleon in the Shaw Festival's 1993 production of The Man of Destiny

Shaw wa s correc t i n seekin g ou t actor s wit h highl y develope d skill s in
diction as his plays presented three difficulties fo r the actors: first, the length
of the speeches, from the point of view of memory as well as of delivery, and
secondly, they ofte n containe d difficul t an d highl y intellectua l arguments .
The third difficulty was that Shaw was an Irishman. "Shaw wrote and spoke
in an Irish idiom and the English actor couldn't reproduce it," wrote Lewis
Casson. All his pleas for rhetoric may have been an attempt to transfer th e
subtlety of his own Irishness to the English actor. Certainly all his rehearsal
notes and letters show a desire for a bigger style than the actors were used to
employing i n moder n plays . Sha w wante d mor e actor s wit h Lilia n
McCarthy's trainin g i n melodrama -  "saturate d wit h declamator y poetr y
and rhetori c fro m he r cradle , sh e learned he r busines s ou t o f Londo n b y
doing work in which one was either heroic or nothing."28

Shaw was somewhat contradictory in his statements regarding the degree
of intellectua l o r interpretativ e skill s tha t h e required fro m hi s cast -  "I n
selecting th e cas t n o regard shoul d b e given to whethe r th e actor s under -
stand the play or not (player s are not walking encyclopedias)" 29 - an d he
satirizes amusingly that species of director who enters into long discussions
about Nietzsch e o r th e Oedipu s complex rathe r tha n focu s o n the practi -
calities o f gettin g a  performanc e together . Ye t i n seekin g t o cas t Major
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Barbara, he proclaimed tha t "Nothin g but a cast of geniuses will be of the
slightest use." 30 Barke r maintaine d Sha w wante d " a Barr y Sulliva n wit h
your brains" 31 i f suc h a  thin g wer e possible . J . T . Grein' s revie w o f th e
revival o f You  Never  Can  Tell at th e Cour t i n May 190 5 atteste d t o th e
fact: "Shaw' s play s requir e 'brainy ' actor s al l round : ther e ar e n o mino r
parts, and no room for the animated automata who crowd our stage today.
Vedrenne an d Barke r hav e gathere d togethe r a  littl e compan y o f player s
who in intelligence and keenness could hardly be bettered" (Sunday Times,
May 7, 1905).

Shaw, himself, in an open letter to Alexander Baksh y in The  New York
Times (Jun e 12 , 1927 ) clearl y state s th e idea l balanc e o f imagination ,
intelligence, and technical skill in a Shavian performer .

. .  . my plays require a special technique of acting, and in particular, great
virtuosity in sudden transitions of mood that seem to the ordinary actor to be
transitions from one "line" of character to another. But, after all , this is only
fully accomplishe d acting ; for ther e is no other sor t o f acting , except bad
acting, acting that is the indulgence of imagination instead of the exercise of
skill.

Yet there was a further dimensio n that Shaw and Shaw's dramas demanded
of actors . Denni s Kenned y assert s tha t Sha w neede d "actor s capabl e o f
projecting a  socially critical attitud e insid e comic characters."32 The critic
of The  Spectator  (Februar y 26 , 1910 ) i n a  revie w o f Misalliance  had
reached a  similar conclusion , commenting on the fac t tha t Sha w appeared
to have established "a new convention of acting, rather formal, and tending
a little towards caricature - th e very opposite of the acting in Justice" (that
is of psychological naturalism).

Shaw ha s bee n accuratel y describe d a s bein g "of " th e Ne w Dram a
movement rather than "in" it. He was not a disciple of naturalism, although
he admired Barker' s dramaturgical and directorial skill s in this vein. While
he maintaine d tha t hi s ai m wa s t o "mak e th e audienc e believ e tha t rea l
things are happening to real people," he was in fact introducin g a  further ,
nonnaturalistic, level into his work, by promoting a style of writing and of
performance tha t encourage d distanciatio n rathe r tha n identification ,
seeking a  comi c objectiv e respons e rathe r tha n a n empatheti c subjectiv e
one. A twentieth-century critic , Daniel Leary , expressed i t as follows: "H e
was attemptin g t o confron t hi s spectator s wit h glimpse s o f reality , hav e
them shift thei r habitual stance, question their professions o f belief. He did
it by making the audience feel uneasy, by reversing reversals, by disturbing
patterns of coherence."33

Sybil Thorndike , a n actres s wh o worke d frequentl y wit h Sha w an d
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whose husband, Lewis Casson, was a regular player at the Court, said the
same thing fro m th e poin t o f vie w o f a  performer : " A landscape i s much
more vivid if one looks at i t head downwards - on e sees colour in greater
contrast, everything is heightened in tone, and Shaw stood on his head, and
made us stand on our heads also to shock us into awareness."34

This "alienation effect " i s evident in his stage directions, lengthy admit -
tedly becaus e s o many o f hi s earl y play s ha d bee n publishe d befor e the y
were performed, bu t also of great value to a director an d to actors as they
indicate what i s to be thought o f a  character, outlining the actor's attitude
toward a  role , rathe r tha n seekin g th e performer' s empath y wit h a
character. Like Barker and Galsworthy , Shaw establishes a  credible milieu
and socia l environmen t bu t h e goe s furthe r i n providing , an d simulta -
neously demandin g fro m th e actor , a n objectiv e assessmen t tha t mus t
become part of the "showing" of the part to the audience.

In this he is nonnaturalistic, pursuing more than a representation of "real
life," rathe r a  blatan t theatricality : "m y dramati s persona e are , a s the y
should be , of the stage , stagey, challenging the actor t o ac t up to them o r
beyond them, if he can"35 -  tha t is , actors with the skill not only to retain
"inner truth " bu t t o broade n th e interpretatio n sufficientl y t o conver t i t
into a representative of a social type, a prefiguring of later Brechtian theory.

Shaw prepared meticulously before the rehearsal period.
Every move, every piece of business, indeed the placing of every piece of

furniture an d prop on stage was worked ou t beforehand wit h the aid of a
chessboard and its moving pieces. With the promptbook alread y prepared,
there was no room for improvisation. This blueprint, one might almost say
"modellbuch", wa s made ready ou t o f courtes y t o th e actors , who, Shaw
believed, di d no t wan t t o wast e thei r tim e i n doing the director' s jo b fo r
him. In any event, the actors, each involved in his/her own part or piece of
action, cannot manipulat e th e audience' s focus o f attention . That was the
task of the director or "conductor" :

. . . i f you take care that they never distract attention from one another. . .
that when the audience is looking at one side of the stage and somebody cuts
in on the other, some trick (which you must contrive) calls the attention of the
audience to the new point of view or hearing .  . . then you will at the first
rehearsal ge t a  command o f the production tha t nothin g wil l shake after -
wards.36

Shaw was, without a  doubt, the author o f the performance a s well as of
the script . His firs t meetin g with th e company generall y took th e form o f
his reading of the text to the performers , a  fairly commonplac e procedur e
at th e time , bu t Shaw' s executio n o f it , togethe r wit h hi s capacit y i n
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rehearsals t o demonstrat e th e wa y h e wante d somethin g done , ha s bee n
commented upo n frequentl y b y hi s actors . Ther e wa s n o questio n o f
imitation: Sha w conveye d a n idea , a  ton e o n whic h th e performer s coul d
build. John Pollock , hi s secretary whil e directing a t the Court , commented :
"His syste m wa s base d o n th e ton e i n which eac h lin e o f th e dialogu e wa s
delivered .  .  .  famou s artist s lik e Kat e Rorke , Loui s Calver t an d Sydne y
Fairbrother too k fro m hi m precisel y th e ton e h e wante d .  .  .  McCarthy ,
Gwenn, Page and Casso n learned o r perfected thei r ar t from G.B.S." 37

Lilian McCarthy , on e o f thos e "learnin g he r art " accordin g t o Pollock ,
was mos t appreciativ e o f th e teacher : "Wit h complet e unselfconsciousnes s
he would sho w us how to draw the full valu e out of a line. He could assum e
any role, any physical attitude, and make any inflection o f his voice, whether
the part was that o f an old man, a budding girl or an ancient lady." 38

Yet these brillian t demonstration s wer e signpost s o f a  way t o follow , no t
molds to be filled. One of Shaw's "Rules for Directors " was: "show how th e
passage shoul d b e done a s a  suggestion , no t a n order ; an d exaggerat e you r
demonstration sufficientl y t o prevent th e player givin g a  mere indicatio n o f
it. A  performanc e i n whic h th e player s ar e al l mimickin g th e director ,
instead o f followin g hi s suggestion s i n thei r ow n differen t ways , i s a  ba d
performance."39

Lewis Casson , throug h hi s daughter , Ann , hersel f a n actress , cas t a n
interesting glos s o n Shaw' s demonstratio n sketche s o f a  speec h o r a
character:

I believ e h e was a  marvellous acto r [whe n readin g hi s plays]. So person t o
person he could do it absolutely superbly, but Father didn't think he would be
able to sustain a n entire performance . . . H e was very good a t getting [th e
actors] t o understan d th e character , an d .  . . line reading s .  . .  bu t no t an y
good a t translatin g tha t int o technica l term s s o that the y woul d b e abl e t o
play it in a large auditorium.40

Hence his reliance on the actors ' own technical skills .
Shaw woul d hav e like d t o follo w Poel' s exampl e i n spendin g severa l

weeks wit h hi s actor s roun d a  tabl e discussin g no t th e meanin g bu t th e
"tunes" o f th e play , but , unlik e Poe l an d th e Elizabetha n Stag e Society ,
Shaw wa s par t o f a  commercia l enterpris e a t th e Court , howeve r enligh -
tened tha t commercialis m migh t be . H e wa s constraine d b y th e norma l
four-week rehearsa l perio d an d h e realize d full y tha t on e ha s t o writ e fo r
the theatr e on e i s in . Nevertheles s h e wante d a  six-wee k lon g preparatio n
time an d fel t tha t onl y afte r abou t th e tent h performanc e wa s th e produc -
tion reall y takin g shape . Th e Cour t syste m o f "tryout " matinee s followe d
by a n evenin g ru n i f th e productio n wer e prove d successfu l wa s a n idea l
model fo r writin g an d directin g o f a n experimenta l kind . Unlik e Barker ,
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who wa s famou s fo r workin g himsel f an d hi s actor s lat e int o th e night ,
Shaw only rehearsed for three hours at a stretch, from 9am to 12 noon.

The first  wee k wa s spen t largel y i n blockin g th e play , answerin g
questions o n meaning and runnin g each ac t through wit h actor s stil l very
much "o n th e book. " I n weeks two an d thre e whe n th e performer s wer e
learning an d absorbin g thei r lines , h e withdre w fro m th e stage , neve r
interrupting bu t writing hi s famous littl e notes on detail s o f performance ,
staging, an d settin g tha t wer e eithe r conveye d verball y t o actor s afte r
rehearsal o r delivere d b y letter . H e hel d i t t o b e quit e unreasonabl e t o
interrupt a n actor searching for a  line or coming to terms with a  role. The
final week , Sha w wa s bac k o n stage , interrupting , pullin g th e whol e
together, primaril y dealin g wit h matter s o f pace , pitch , orchestratio n
(again), an d focus . H e looke d fo r contras t i n mood , tone , an d temp o
between th e unit s o f th e play , an d betwee n th e voice s o f th e actor s wh o
should beware of taking pitch or speed from each other.

Shaw's treatmen t o f hi s actors , a t an y rat e fac e t o face , wa s almos t
invariably courteous . Whil e a s Lilia n McCarth y pu t it , h e wa s "serious ,
painstaking, concentrate d an d relentles s i n pursui t o f perfection, " h e had
perfect manners , a  real respec t fo r th e individual' s personality , an d never ,
according t o Sybi l Thorndike "gav e a  performance o f bein g of producer. "
Although, significantly , h e viewed rehearsal s a s "art," the creative ac t was
executed in private with no outsiders allowed. Even William Archer, a good
friend t o Shaw , Barker , an d th e whol e Cour t enterprise , an d Lilia n
McCarthy's mothe r wer e exclude d fro m rehearsal s o f The  Doctor's
Dilemma. The actors should no t be asked to "perform" publicl y too soon,
and the director should not perform qua  director a t all. Actors were called
only when they were needed s o that thei r time was respected. He believed
that on e shoul d no t commen t o n a  faul t unles s one knew exactl y ho w t o
correct it . Lilia n McCarth y verifie d tha t thi s principl e wa s uphel d i n th e
Court rehearsals: "Even when something was wrong he would say nothing
until he had found out how to get it right. He never criticised unless a scene
was hopeless ; an d the n h e mad e fu n o f i t an d o f everybody , includin g
himself."41

He wa s oppose d t o endles s repetitio n o f th e sam e scen e -  anothe r
difference fro m Barke r wh o i s reputed t o hav e gone through th e Messen-
ger's speec h i n Hippolytus  som e fifteen times. Sha w wrot e t o Barke r i n
April 190 6 giving advice on Captain  Brassbound's Conversion in the early
stages of which the latter was involved: "Go straight through and don t le t
them stop for anything . In any case, the policy of sticking at it until we get
it is a vulgar folly. Let them take their failure and the shame of it home and
they will think about it and pull it off next time."42
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Shaw was clearly of the opinion that in "the art of rehearsal" the number
of contact hour s betwee n directo r an d acto r wer e of no more importanc e
than th e wor k whic h th e acto r di d o n his/he r own , aided , o f course , b y
Shaw's paperchase of "notes."

In Shaw's opinion, "The perfect produce r let s his actors act; and is their
helper a t need not their dictator." 43 H e saw himself no t as a schoolmaster
but as a collaborator wit h fellow artists . Indeed, much of the "hard work "
of directing lay in "the social effort o f keeping up everyone's spirits in view
of a  grea t event. " Ba d temper , i n the guis e o f "temperament, " ruine d th e
social interaction, and just as in any social situation, different peopl e had to
be treate d differentl y accordin g t o thei r personalitie s an d thei r artisti c
competence. H e distinguishe d betwee n "bor n actors " whom on e jus t lef t
alone an d "spoo k actors " who neede d a  grea t dea l o f help . There wa s a
wide spectrum in between, with Lilian McCarthy very much at the top end:

The rewar d fo r bein g perfec t wa s t o b e absolutel y ignored , an d perhap s
corrected for a misplaced comma. When he came along with his notebook, an
actor who had done very well would sa y "Have you nothing for me , Mr.
Shaw?": and the reply would be, "Nothing. You're all right. I don't take the
least interest in you," a maddening sort of compliment.44

While Shaw' s conduc t o f rehearsal s ca n b e gleane d onl y fro m th e
comments o f hi s actors an d hi s own post  hoc  writings o n th e rol e o f th e
director in the theatre, many of his notes and letters to his casts still exist.45

These commen t regularl y o n movement , th e interpretation , delivery , an d
intonation o f individual lines , on timing, and on the overall rhythm o f the
scene. The mos t commo n instructio n i s "Pla y to-, " meaning eithe r "pla y
to" a particular line, thus indicating a "phrase" in the overall rhythm of the
scene or, more commonly, "play to" another actor , clearly indicating bot h
the need for interactio n and fo r focu s of attention. An example of the firs t
comes i n th e note s fo r Man  and  Superman  in the scen e betwee n Hector ,
Violet, Octarius, and Ann in Act 4.

Hector It is a blow. Oct play to this
Violet - Play to "I want to be a man."
Oct - "She'l l accept you" play to this.
Ann - Play to "not so sure of that".

The creatio n o f a n ensembl e prove d a  proble m t o Sha w i n Major
Barbara as Louis Calvert as Undershaft ha d great difficulty wit h the part. A
sympathetic note to Granville Barker read, "You - poo r devil - hav e to play
with Calver t al l the way through , pla y to him, play a t him , play o n him ,
play aroun d him" 46 an d a n impassione d tirad e t o th e offendin g acto r
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showed Sha w a t hi s mos t barbed : " y ° u a r e ruinin g th e en d o f th e secon d
act b y you r enormous , desolating , obliviou s t o everybod y absent -
mindedness: yo u mus t tr y t o hel p th e other s . . . a  goo d acto r mus t
work!"47

As fa r a s movemen t i s concerned , ther e ar e sometime s sketche s t o
indicate grouping s an d change s i n stag e position : sometime s th e instruc -
tions ar e give n verbally . A n exampl e fro m th e 190 5 reviva l o f You  Never
Can Tell reads:

Dolly cross more expressively before the explanation
Gloria sit at upper end of sofa
Barker keep R of C when talking to servant - don' t mask Phil

Movement an d rhythm ar e the subject o f an instruction t o Lillah McCarth y
as Ann Whitefield :

In the third act , when Malone , Ramsden an d Tanner g o off makin g a  great
cackle and fuss, do not begin the scene with Tavy until the noise is over and
the audience' s attentio n ha s quit e com e bac k t o you . Jus t wait , lookin g
provokingly a t Tavy , unti l ther e i s a dead silenc e an d expectatio n an d the n
say, without the least hurry, "Won't you go with them Tavy?" Otherwise you
will not get the new key and the slow movement.48

Notes o n intonatio n an d stres s abound . Fro m Man  and  Superman,
"Ramsden -  th e mos t infamou s unde r my  roo f -  violen t enoug h t o fil l th e
pause" and fro m Don  Juan  in  Hell,  "Juan' s sigh s are no t lou d enoug h wit h
his bac k t o th e audience , gestur e needed : Th e Lif e Forc e i s stupid-.  This i s
not fair : VhiMstine:  Hel l i s the home  o f unreality. " A  letter t o Ellen Terry i n
March 1906 , prio r t o he r appearanc e a s Lad y Cecil y Waynflete , gives  he r
both the stress and the subtext o f her lines .

(a) Hav e yo u though t o f th e GRANDEU R o f wickedness ? Grand ! That' s th e
word. Something grandly wicked.

(b) I f yo u tak e a  man an d pa y hi m £50 0 a  year , an d HAV E -  Ah , that' s it !
Beautiful phrase! Happy expression!
Just think of it HAVE policemen and courts and laws
and juries to DRIVE him into it. HAVE! Ah Havel49

Lewis Casso n maintaine d tha t Shaw' s interes t wa s solel y i n th e inter -
pretation o f th e word s o f th e play , an d tha t h e wa s totall y unintereste d i n
the visua l aspect s o f th e production . "I n hi s whole histor y a s a produce r o f
his ow n o r anyon e else' s plays , I  neve r kne w Sha w tak e an y seriou s
practical interes t in anything beyond the casting and the acting. All the rest ,
including scenery , costumes , lightin g an d groupin g wa s o f mino r impor -
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tance."50 Wit h respec t t o Casson , Shaw' s rehearsa l notebook s prov e tha t
this was not the case, and, although in accordance with Court policy costly
settings wer e avoided , hi s note s demonstrat e tha t h e ha d a  firm grasp of
practical point s abou t settin g tha t coul d mak e th e actor' s tas k easier , fo r
example in the notes for Candida,  "See that there is a hook for Pross in the
bookcase," "Readin g lam p mus t b e polished. " Hi s instruction s regardin g
the productio n o f John Bull  includ e th e followin g comment s o n th e set ,
which should not be "typically Irish,"

The same mountain backcloth will do for the three scenes in Act n but in the
second scene, the stone must be removed, the round tower pushed as a wing
and the scene disguised by the change in the lighting. Sc. I Act iv must be
shallow a s the hil l mus t b e ready se t behin d it : fo r th e change mus t not
occupy more than one minute at the very outside.

These are hardly the instructions of a man totally uninterested in scenery.
The notebooks show too that he had a keen eye for mistakes in costume

and makeup, for example, in Candida, "Pross, must have a plainer blouse"
and "Lex y too white behind the cheek"; in You  Never Can Tell, "Gloria -
dress wrong " an d "Waite r -  make-u p to o pal e an d draw n -  no t sunn y
enough"; an d Major  Barbara, "Barbara's make-u p i s too red , Undershaf t
too young, Cremlin's make-up absurd." A letter to Lilian McCarthy abou t
her dres s fo r An n Whitefiel d reveal s i n Sha w a n instinc t fo r gettin g a
nuance o f characte r int o eve n such a  smal l piec e o f costum e a s a  ribbon ,
"Don't have light blue ribbon with the white muslin: use violet or purple -
not artles s simplicit y -  pomegranat e splendour. " Lilia n McCarth y als o
recounts i n he r autobiograph y ho w durin g rehearsal s o f The  Doctor's
Dilemma, Sha w sent her to see Judith Lytton' s hair decoration a s a model
for Jennife r Dudebat' s jewelle d headdres s i n th e scen e immediatel y fol -
lowing he r husband' s death . " I wen t t o he r i n Londo n and , fo r m y
instruction and delight, she piled her hair high upon her head and strung it
with band s o f sapphires , rubies and pearl s . . . I  went bac k to the theatr e
and wit h m y suggestion s an d Shaw' s invention , Nevill e Lytto n mad e th e
head-dress which so shocked the first night audience."51

There i s in Shaw's notebooks an d letter s sufficien t evidenc e to disprov e
Casson's statemen t o n th e one-sidednes s o f Shaw' s directio n an d t o
demonstrate that , althoug h scenicall y spectacula r production s wer e cer -
tainly no t within th e financial means o r par t o f th e artisti c philosophy of
the Court , attentio n t o th e positionin g o f actor s o n stag e an d t o thei r
appearance within the set were matters to be taken seriously indeed.

The onl y designe r whos e nam e appeare d o n a  programm e durin g th e
Vedrenne-Barker season s was Charles Ricketts, who provided scenery and
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costumes fo r Don  Juan  in  Hell.  Sha w wa s ver y kee n t o wor k wit h hi m
although th e collaboration betwee n th e artis t an d th e wordsmith wa s no t
without difficulties . Rickett s wrote in his Journal, "Like all men of letters ,
speaking of beauty [Shaw] viewed it as a sort of agreeable compromise, and
the essence of moderation, instead of its being a supreme form of controlled
exaggeration."52 Ricketts' s plans for Don a Ana "in an Infanta hoo p and a
perfect collectio n o f virgins , Holy Heart s an d Mement o Mori s in nests of
lace," Don Juan " a creature of silver and purple," and the Commendator e
"in Roman armour, buskins, ruff an d sash," "frightened Sha w who wanted
nothing tha t woul d tak e awa y fro m th e dignity o f th e figure, the comedy
should be in the words . . ." Nonetheless , Shaw, admittedly with hindsight,
gave full approval to Ricketts's final design in an open letter to The Mask in
1926. "Twenty years ago Charles Ricketts made a stage picture of the third
act o f Ma n an d Superma n whic h neithe r h e nor an y othe r i n Europe ha s
surpassed, or can surpass."

Shaw receive d innumerabl e tribute s fro m hi s actors . J . L . Shine , wh o
played in John Bull's Other Island, wrote, "You are a man worth working
for, an d i f your brillian t pla y i s not efficiently rendered , we alleged actor s
and actresse s deserv e extermination , fo r you r god-like patienc e an d cour -
teous consideration, combined with your skilful and workmanlike handling
of detail has been a revelation to me."53

Annie Russell, in a talk entitled GBS  at Rehearsals of  Major Barbara i n
April 1908 , sai d " I hav e neve r see n actor s s o cleverl y handled . No-on e
taught, bu t w e wer e alway s encouraged , alway s tol d 'why' . Ou r talent s
were never belittled and we were made to feel proud of our powers. This is
one reaso n wh y th e Court  Theatr e o f Londo n .  . . has th e reputatio n o f
'discovering' so many good actors."54

The critics ' recognitio n o f Shaw' s powe r a s a  director , i s shown i n th e
Daily Chronicle's  review of Major Barbara on November 28 , 1905: "That
he does make people act as they never act elsewhere is at any rate one quite
indisputable proof of Mr. Shaw's genius."

The influenc e o f th e Court experimen t

Inspired b y th e succes s o f thei r ventur e a t th e Cour t Theatre , i n 190 7
Granville Barke r an d Vedrenn e move d t o the large r Savo y Theatre i n the
West End. The same formula o f experimenta l matinee s and shor t evenin g
runs wa s continued , man y o f th e sam e actor s wer e involved , an d th e
program o f play s wa s chose n o n th e sam e principles . Sha w mad e a
substantial financial investment i n the new venture and,  althoug h h e ha d
personal reservation s abou t th e chang e i n etho s tha t th e mov e inevitabl y
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implied - th e playing of the National Anthem at the first performance, fo r
example, he regarded as "a hideous solecism, a symptom of moral decay" -
he remained supportive. 55 Hi s letters show that h e was continually tryin g
to whip up enthusiasm in the rather jaded management, but, no doubt from
the best of intentions, he decided he should have a less high profile, leaving
the wa y clea r fo r younger , les s well-know n dramatists . Ye t i t wa s th e
success of the Shaw plays that had made the Court financially viable as well
as bringing i t artistic distinction. Further , Shaw, contrary to his practice a t
the Court, did not direct the three revivals of his plays staged at the Savoy,
You Never Can  Tell, Arms and the Man, and The Devil's Disciple, leaving
the task t o Barker , who was not a n idea l directo r o f Shavia n drama . The
Forbes Robertso n productio n o f Caesar  and  Cleopatra  "imported" fo r a
five wee k run was well below standard.

Shaw's professional an d psychological withdrawal from the Savoy season
was by no means the only reason for its failure, and he did after al l bear the
brunt o f th e financial  losse s whe n i t ende d i n Marc h 1908 . Bu t th e
unfortunate tur n o f event s does underline th e enormous contribution tha t
his plays and his directing of them had made to the success of the Court.

The rea l legac y o f th e Cour t experimen t la y i n th e establishmen t o f
repertory theatre s ou t o f London , i n Mancheste r (1908) , i n Glasgo w
(1909), and in Liverpool (1911). Residents of these cities had shown a keen
interest in the "new drama" movement by establishing avant-garde societies
as offshoots o f the ITS and the Stage Society. The people who belonged to
such societie s wante d seriou s play s o f literar y merit , wel l acte d an d wel l
directed. Th e Vedrenne-Barke r managemen t o f th e Cour t becam e thei r
inspiration an d thei r model and they presented man y plays by the drama-
tists whic h i t ha d nurtured . Glasgo w produce d nin e o f Shaw' s dramas ,
including Man and Superman, with Barker and Lilian McCarthy "guesting"
in thei r origina l parts . You  Never  Can  Tell  was revive d man y time s b y
popular plebiscite, and there was a private performance o f the banned Mrs.
Warren's Profession. All three companies staged Candida,  and Manchester
revived Shaw' s first  pla y Widowers'  Houses.  Wherea s Glasgo w almos t
adopted Sha w a s it s "hous e dramatist, " Mancheste r favore d Galsworthy ,
who wrot e ne w piece s fo r th e company , and , i n addition , i t too k u p th e
classical aspec t o f th e Court' s repertoir e wit h production s o f Murray' s
translations of Hippolytus and The Trojan Women. The Court tradition of
presenting th e bes t of European drama , most notably play s by Ibsen, was
likewise continued . Th e first production i n Britai n o f a  play b y Chekho v
was Glasgow Repertory Theatre's presentation of The Seagull in 1909.

The group of actors who worked in the provincial companies included a
great man y veteran s o f th e Court . Th e actin g styl e wa s praise d fo r it s
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intelligence i n representing th e author's meaning , it s integration o f al l part s
into a  coheren t whole , th e excellenc e o f th e diction , an d th e balanc e
between stylize d an d naturalisti c playing . Th e Cour t actor s als o provide d
directors fo r th e companies , mos t notabl y Lewi s Casso n an d Madg e
Mclntosh. Younge r performer s traine d i n the highes t standar d o f histrioni c
art wer e fe d int o th e Londo n theatre , an d th e province s onc e agai n
provided th e practica l experienc e tha t theatrica l novice s ha d lacke d sinc e
the demis e o f th e stoc k companies . Regrettably , onl y th e Liverpoo l Reper -
tory Theatre survive d th e Firs t World War , yet the seed s sown i n Manches-
ter an d Glasgo w bor e frui t later , s o tha t bot h citie s ar e no w center s o f
theatrical activity , professionall y an d academically . Th e flourishing  o f th e
repertory theatre s throughou t Scotlan d an d Englan d whic h ar e a s muc h
Britain's National Theatr e a s the edifice o n the South Bank, owes its origins
to the initiatives of the early pioneers, most notably Barker and Shaw at the
Court.
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J. L . WISENTHAL

"Please remember, this is Italian opera" :
Shaw's plays as music-drama

Stick to my plays long enough, and you will get used to their changes of key
& mode . I learnt my flexibility &  catholicity from Beethoven ; but it is to be
learnt fro m Shakespea r t o a  certai n extent . M y educatio n ha s reall y bee n
more a  musica l tha n a  literar y on e a s fa r a s dramati c ar t i s concerned .
Nobody nurse d o n letters alone will ever get the true Mozartian joyousnes s
into comedy.

(Shaw to Max Beerbohm, 1900)

[L]et the people in your nex t pla y have a  little wil l and a  little victory, and
then you will begin to enjoy yourself and write your plays in the Shavian Key
- D  flat major, vivacissimo.

(Shaw to Siegfried Trebitsch, 1906)

"It is not enough to see Richard III: you should be able to whistle it." Such
is Shaw's advice in his weekly music column in The Star in 1889 , which he
devoted t o a  curren t productio n o f Shakespeare' s histor y play . There wa s
orchestral musi c tha t ha d bee n compose d fo r th e production , bu t Shaw' s
comment is directed at Richard HI itself as a piece of music, and he reviews
the actin g a s a  musica l performance , talkin g abou t a  "magnificen t duet, "
for example , and a  "striking solo. " Richard Mansfield' s "executio n o f hi s
opening scena was . . .  deeply disappointing," and in a staccato passage "he
actually missed half a  bar" by dropping a syllable from a  word. Mansfiel d
occasionally "mad e fine music fo r a  moment, " bu t hi s performanc e a s a
whole was a musical failure. "It is a positive sin for a man with such a voice
to giv e th e word s withou t th e setting , lik e a  Coven t Garde n libretto "
(Shaw's Music, vol. 1, pp. 586-91).

This i s fro m on e o f th e hundred s o f musi c review s tha t Sha w wrot e
during his six years as a regular music critic (between 1888 and 1894) . And
all these weekly column s represen t onl y par t o f Shaw' s career a s a write r
about music , a  caree r tha t extende d ove r a  perio d o f seventy-fou r years ,
and tha t include d hi s stil l influentia l boo k o n Wagner' s Der  Ring  des
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Nibelungen - The  Perfect Wagnerite in 1898. Dan H. Laurence's edition of
Shaw's Music  collects the lifetime's wor k int o three volumes that run to a
total o f 2,68 8 wonderfull y readabl e pages . Shaw' s musi c i s a  cruciall y
significant elemen t in his non-dramatic writing, in his plays, and in his life.

Shaw's mother was a singer ( a mezzo-soprano) an d a  professional musi c
teacher; an d h e wa s brough t u p i n a n environmen t o f music-makin g i n
Victorian Dublin. In 1894 he recollected part of his musical background in
an essay on "The Religion of the Pianoforte," in which he emphasized - a s
he di d elsewher e a s wel l -  th e exten t t o whic h hi s artisti c educatio n wa s
musical rathe r tha n literary . A n importan t even t i n hi s life , h e said , wa s
learning to play the piano "a t the age of sixteen o r thereabouts." " I learnt
the alphabe t o f musica l notation fro m a  primer, an d th e keyboard fro m a
diagram. Then . . . I  opened Don Giovanni and began. It took ten minutes
to get my fingers arranged on the chord of D minor with which the overture
commences; but when i t sounded right a t last , it was worth al l the trouble
it cost." He then worked out his own fingering for scales, and

soon acquired a terrible power of stumbling through pianoforte arrangement s
and vocal scores; and my reward was that I gained penetrating experiences of
Victor Hugo and Schille r from Donizetti , Verdi, and Beethoven; of the Bible
from Handel ; of Goethe from Schumann ; of Beaumarchais and Moliere from
Mozart; and of Merimee from Bizet , besides finding in Berlioz an unconscious
interpreter of Edgar Allan Poe. When I was in the schoolboy-adventure vein, I
could rang e fro m Vincen t Wallac e t o Meyerbeer ; an d i f I  fel t piousl y an d
genteelly sentimental , I , who could no t stand the pictures of Ary Scheffer o r
the gentee l suburba n sentimen t o f Tennyson an d Longfellow , coul d becom e
quite maudlin over Mendelssohn and Gounod.

(Shaw's Music, vol. in, pp. I I I - I Z )

It is, I think, relevant to Shaw's own dramati c works that hi s main exposur e
to muc h nineteenth-centur y Europea n dram a woul d hav e bee n throug h
operas that use d plays by Scribe, Schiller, and Dumas fits,  for example , as
sources fo r libretti . This i s one o f th e reasons wh y he thinks o f dram a i n
musical terms.

It i s significan t tha t Shaw , accordin g t o thi s autobiographica l reminis -
cence in his Pianoforte essay , began his piano-playing career with Mozart's
Don Giovanni,  for thi s opera, which he knew from singin g it in the years
before hi s piano-playin g began , alway s remaine d fo r hi m on e o f th e
summits o f huma n accomplishment , an d a  wor k o f ar t tha t profoundl y
affected hi s own career as an artist. During the Mozart centenary in 1891,
Shaw wrote that "in my small-boyhood I  by good luck had an opportunity
of learnin g th e Do n thoroughly , an d i f i t wer e onl y fo r th e sens e o f th e
value of fine workmanship which I gained from it , I should still esteem that
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lesson th e mos t importan t par t o f m y education . Indeed , i t educate d m e
artistically i n al l sort s o f ways " (Shaw's  Music, vol. n , p . 482). And i t is
significant to o that Sha w in "The Religion of the Pianoforte" als o recalled
the pleasure that he gained from the operas of a composer like Gounod, for
in his plays he derived a  great dea l from work s that he regarded a s by no
means first rate.

One of the friends whom Shaw most liked and respected was Sir Edward
Elgar. I t wa s Sha w wh o persuade d th e BBC , lat e i n Elgar' s life , t o
commission his Third Symphony (lef t uncompleted) , and i t was Elgar who
dedicated hi s "Sever n Suite " t o Shaw . I t wa s Elgar , too , accordin g t o
Michael Holroyd , wh o whil e openin g a  Bernar d Sha w exhibitio n a t
Malvern, "told his audience that G.B.S. really knew more about music than
he did."1 Shaw also had some personal acquaintance with Richard Strauss,
whose operas he championed,2 most notably Elektra  when it was attacked
by Wagner's biographe r Ernes t Newma n i n 191 0 (Shaw's  Music, vol. in ,
pp. 594-623). Shaw had met Strauss in 1914, and then again at a luncheon
given b y Elgar i n London i n 1922, 3 and year s before ther e ha d bee n talk
about Sha w writin g a  librett o fo r him . I n 190 7 Sha w responde d t o th e
London opera impresario Henry Mapleson who had offered hi m a commis-
sion to provide a n opera librett o fo r Saint-Saens : "Unfortunately I  have a
prior engagement with Richard Strauss , which is at present rather hung up
by the fact that I want to write the music and he wants to write the libretto,
and we both get along very slowly for want of practice."4 During the same
year Sha w instructe d hi s Germa n translato r no t t o approac h Straus s t o
compose incidenta l musi c fo r The  Admirable  Bashville,  which wa s s o
trivial tha t th e composer woul d b e offended b y the suggestion . Bu t Shaw
had other collaborative possibilities in mind: "I wish he would compose the
incidental music for the Hell Scene in Superman - a  Mozartian fantasia b y
Richard woul d b e magnificent. Bu t I  should lik e enormously t o do a  new
libretto fo r him." 5 Sha w als o though t abou t th e possibilit y o f doin g a
libretto for Elgar . "I wonder whether Elgar would turn his hand to opera,"
he wrot e t o Mapleson . " I hav e alway s playe d a  littl e wit h th e ide a o f
writing a libretto; but though I have had several offers, nothing has come of
it" (Theatrics,  p. 86) . Da n H . Laurenc e introduce s thi s lette r wit h th e
information tha t "Sha w wa s frequentl y solicite d fo r oper a o r operett a
librettos," fo r composer s includin g Richar d Strauss , Si r Arthu r Sullivan ,
Andre Messager , an d Osca r Strau s (Theatrics,  pp. 85-86) . Another com -
poser wh o apparentl y -  an d intriguingl y -  wa s intereste d i n a n operati c
collaboration wit h Sha w was Puccini, who, according to Puccini' s biogra -
pher, "sounded out" the playwright for a possible libretto in around 1913. 6

Nothing cam e o f an y o f thes e inquiries , bu t the y d o revea l somethin g of
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Shaw's involvemen t i n the musica l lif e o f hi s day , which include d friend -
ships with other composers as well.

Shaw not only spoke of the importance of music in his education, but he
also frequently emphasize d the specific importance of music in his career as
a dramatist. Here is one of his characteristic statements on this subject:

My method , m y system , m y tradition , i s founde d upo n music . I t i s no t
founded upon literature at all. I was brought up on music. I did not read plays
very muc h becaus e I  coul d no t ge t hol d o f them , except , o f course ,
Shakespear, wh o wa s mother' s mil k t o me . What I  was reall y intereste d i n
was musical development. If you study operas and symphonies, you will find
a useful clue to my particular type of writing.7

And her e i s another, i n a  191 6 letter t o hi s would-be biographe r Demetriu s
O'Bolger:

[I]t is a pity you are not steeped in xvm and xix century music as deeply as in
literature; for m y plays bear very plain marks of my musical education . My
deliberate rhetoric, and my reversion to the Shakespearean feature of long set
solos fo r m y characters , ar e pur e Italia n opera . M y rejectio n o f plo t an d
denouement, and my adoption of a free developmen t of themes, are German
symphony . . . I  daresay I  learned somethin g fro m Gouno d a s well a s fro m
Fra Angelico as to the ease with which religious emotion an d refined sexua l
emotion can be combined. (Collected  Letters, vol. 111, p.374)

This comment to O'Bolger , an d other s like it , have not gone unnoticed i n
scholars' discussions of Shaw as a dramatist, but in my view such assertions
have not generally been taken with the full seriousnes s that they call for -
or rathe r tha t th e plays themselves cal l for . N o elemen t i n Shaw's drama -
turgy ha s bee n s o underestimate d an d under-explore d a s music . Whe n
Shaw declare s tha t h e learne d hi s trad e fro m Mozar t (Collected  Letters,
vol. iv , p. 432); or when he tells Molly Tompkins tha t "i f you dont kno w
Mozart yo u wil l neve r understan d m y technique"  (Collected  Letters, vol.
in, p . 754); or when in the year in which his first pla y appeared he argues
that the "quartets, &c, s o often foun d i n Donizetti and Verdi, to my mind
shew ho w muc h superio r oper a i s to th e spoke n drama " (Shaw's  Music,
vol. 11 , p. 535) ; o r whe n h e make s th e remarkabl e assertio n i n a  193 6
lecture tha t " I write exactly lik e Shakespear an d I  find if only people wil l
get the rhythm an d melod y o f my speeches, I  do no t trouble mysel f a s to
whether the y understand them , so to speak; once they get the rise and fal l
of them they are all right" (The  Drama Observed, vol. iv, p. 1473) - whe n
Shaw say s thi s sor t o f thing , h e i s providin g a n invaluabl e guid e t o th e
reading, watching, and producing of his plays.

It i s highly instructive , too , t o notic e Shaw' s wa y o f talkin g abou t th e
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theatre in musical terms (a s in the Richard III review) , and about musica l
works i n theatrica l terms . "Th e trut h is, " he proclaims i n an 189 0 musi c
column, "tha t n o ma n ca n conduc t a  Beethove n symphon y unles s hi s
instincts ar e no t onl y musical , bu t poeti c an d dramati c a s well " (Shaw's
Music, vol . 1 , p. 924) . The thre e composer s wh o ar e fo r hi m supremel y
dramatic ar e Beethoven , Mozart , an d Wagner . Mozar t h e see s a s " a
prodigiously gifte d an d arduousl y traine d musicia n who is also, by happy
accident, a  dramatis t comparabl e t o Moliere " (Shaw's  Music,  vol . in ,
p. 526) , and Don  Giovanni  in particular a s nothing less than "th e world' s
masterpiece i n stage art" (The  Drama Observed,  vol. n, p . 577) . The heir
of Mozart and Beethoven in the realm of music-drama i s Richard Wagner.
In The  Perfect  Wagnerite  ther e i s a  sectio n entitle d "Th e Nineteent h
Century," i n whic h Sha w (drawin g n o doub t upo n Wagner' s ow n 185 1
book Opera  and  Drama)  argue s tha t Mozar t an d Beethove n lai d th e
foundations o f musi c tha t dramaticall y expresse s huma n emotio n -  a s
opposed t o absolute , decorativ e musi c tha t merel y construct s a  pleasin g
sound-pattern. "Afte r th e finales  in Figar o an d Do n Giovanni , th e possi -
bility of the modern music-drama la y bare." Wagner went beyond Mozar t
in tha t a s hi s ow n librettis t h e ha d dramati c poetr y rathe r tha n inferio r
libretti to work with; and he went beyond Beethoven in that a  "Beethoven
symphony (excep t the articulate par t o f the ninth) expresses noble feeling ,
but no t thought : i t ha s moods , bu t n o ideas . Wagner adde d though t an d
produced th e music-drama " (Shaw's  Music, vol. in , pp . 528-33) . This i s
what Sha w saw himself a s doing fifty year s later to the theatre o f the late
nineteenth century: adding thought and producing music-drama. In Opera
and Drama, Wagner argue s fo r th e need t o make opera dramatic , and h e
violently reject s Meyerbee r a s a n operati c trivializer . Shaw' s desir e i s t o
make dram a operatic , an d wit h a  simila r (thoug h better-humored ) vehe -
mence he rejects Sardou as a theatrical trivializer . Shaw, working from th e
side of theatre rather than music, continues Wagner's campaign to create a
genuine music-drama , an d bot h composers 8 defen d thi s art-for m agains t
the degradation that emanates from Paris.

In this realm of music-drama, then , the heir of Mozart , Beethoven , and
Wagner is Bernard Shaw. We could look at just about any of his more than
fifty play s in this context, bu t I  have selected two of the bes t examples t o
examine in some detail. One is Shaw's musical re-working of Mozart: Man
and Superman-,  an d th e othe r i s Shaw' s musica l re-workin g o f Wagner :
Major Barbara. 9

The productio n o f Richard  III  tha t Sha w reviewe d i n 188 9 ha d a  smal l
orchestra, consisting of two flutes, two oboes, two clarinets, two bassoons,
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two horns, drums, and strings (Shaw's  Music, vol. i, p. 590) . The presence
of an orchestra as part of a dramatic production was a common feature of
theatres i n th e lat e nineteent h century ; see , fo r example , Shaw' s 189 2
review o f Beerboh m Tree' s Hamlet  wit h musi c b y th e compose r Georg e
Henschel, which is actually an article about "the position of the composer
in the theatre" (Shaw's Music, vol. 11, pp. 521-27) . A production today of
such play s a s Man  and  Superman  an d Major  Barbara  coul d benefi t
significantly, I  think, fro m a  reviva l o f thi s practic e o f orchestra l accom -
paniment. Eac h of these plays could be staged with a  small orchestra -  o r
even better, if financial and spatial resources permitted, a large one.

One part of Man and Superman where this orchestra would be particu-
larly valuabl e i s the Hel l scene , which i s not onl y a  kin d o f voca l strin g
quartet bu t i s also thoroughly operatic . The Hel l scene is at the themati c
and musical center of Shaw's version of Don Giovanni,  which is what the
whole of Man and Superman is, and it draws on other musical sources too.
"What ha s become of the music in the hel l scene of Man 8 c Superman?"
Shaw protested to the producer o f a BBC radio production in 1946 . "It is
needed a s a  blesse d relie f t o th e cackl e a s wel l a s fo r it s proper effect. "
Shaw insiste d tha t th e musi c b e included , an d h e tol d th e BB C what t o
play.

If you cannot add it to the record you must get the theatre orchestra to stand
by. At the entrance of the statue the two first chords of the overture to Don
Giovanni must crash out fortissimo in the broadest measure. When the devil
appears the opening staves of Le Veau d'Or, the song of Mephistopheles from
Gounod's Faust , rattles out . At the end, when Ana cries "A father fo r the
Superman" the band bursts out with "unto us a child is born" from Handel's
Messiah, and makes a resounding and triumphant finish.

(Collected Letters, vol. iv, p. 779)

In Shaw's printed text of the Hell scene, music is included for the entrance
of eac h o f th e fou r characters . Th e scen e begin s wit h a  sectio n o f th e
overture to Don Giovanni  (bars 193-204) . Tanner, Mendoza, and Straker
have fallen asleep, and the audience sees "utter void"

Then somewhere the beginning of a pallor, and with it a faint throbbing buzz
as of a ghostly violoncello palpitating on the same note endlessly. A couple of
ghostly violins presently take advantage of this bass

Then Don Juan appears.
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For a moment  he  raises his head as the music passes him  by.  Then,  with  a
heavy sigh, he droops in utter dejection; and the violins, discouraged, retrace
their melody in despair and at last give it up, extinguished by wailings from
uncanny wind instruments, thus: -

Horn

It is all very odd. One recognizes the Mozartian strain . . .
(Collected Plays, vol. n, pp. 631-22)

As Ana enters, we hear "Donna An[n]a's song to Ottavio"

"the whisper  of a  ghostly clarinet  turning this tune into  infinite  sadness"
(Collected Plays, vol. 11 , p. 632) ; thi s i s the beginnin g o f th e Mozartia n
Anna's plaintive, superbly beautiful Ac t 2 aria "Non mi dir, bell'idol mio."

Similarly, the entrance o f th e Statu e i s signaled b y the appropriat e bar s
from Don  Giovanni,  th e beginnin g o f th e overtur e -  th e chord s tha t
Mozart's scor e repeat s (wit h th e additio n o f trombones ) whe n th e Statu e
enters during the dinner scene in Act 2. In Man and Superman the dialogue
ensures an audience will not miss the musical point:

DON JUAN . Hush! Listen! (Two great chords rolling on syncopated waves of
sound break forth: D minor and its dominant: a sound of dreadful joy to all
musicians.) Ha! Mozart's statue music. It is your father.

Juan's first words to the Statue are "Ah, here you are, my friend. Why dont
you lear n t o sin g th e splendi d musi c Mozar t ha s writte n fo r you? " -  t o
which the Statue replies that "Unluckil y he has written i t for a  bass voice.
Mine is a counter tenor" (Collected  Plays, vol . 11, pp. 640-41). The Statue
music i s heard agai n a t th e momen t o f Juan' s departur e fo r Heaven : th e
Statue "wafts  a final blast of his great rolling chords after him as a parting
salute. A faint  echo  of  the  first  ghostly melody  comes  back in  acknowl-
edgment" (Collected Plays, vol. 11, p. 687).

The entrance o f the Devi l i s signaled i n a way that musicall y expresse s
the clash of values in the Hell scene. Into the sublime realm of Mozart there
obtrudes a  differen t kin d o f musi c altogether , th e second-rate , debase d
sound (a s Shaw heard it ) o f Gounod' s Faust.  "At the  wave of  the  statue's
hand the  great  chords  roll  out  again:  but this  time  Mozarfs  music  gets
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grotesquely adulterated with Gounod's 33 {Collected Plays, vol. n, p. 643) -
that is , with the passage from Faust  that Shaw identified i n the letter to the
BBC producer: "Le veau d'or," the brazen celebration of the golden calf by
which Mephistopheles vigorously introduces himself i n the Kermesse scene
in Act 2 . The contrast between this and the ominous solemnity of the Don
Giovanni passag e i s extreme; just th e typ e o f dramati c clas h tha t Shaw' s
plays characteristically seek. The passage from Gouno d has its own kind of
force, an d a n audience wil l be attracted rathe r tha n repelled b y it, so that
the musica l encounte r betwee n Mozar t an d Gouno d place s before u s two
kinds o f attraction : a  Blakea n marriag e o f Heave n an d Hell . Gounod' s
Faust, which represents the values of Hell, is no doubt the sort of thing that
is much enjoyed a t the "grand musical service" at the Devil's palace that is
to follow the defection o f Juan to Heaven (Collected  Flays, vol. 11, p. 688).
"Hell," says Don Juan, "i s full o f musical amateurs: music is the brandy of
the damned " (Collected  Flays, vol. 11 , p. 646),  and a  decad e befor e Man
and Superman Shaw remarked in a music column that he would decline to
attend al l the productions o f Faust  during the coming summer, in order to
prevent Gounod' s oper a "growin g o n m e lik e brandy " (Shaw's  Music,
vol. 11 , p. 464). So there is a rich subtext to the musical introduction o f the
Devil in the Hell scene, and this moment is an important par t of the whole
dramatic structur e o f Man  and Superman.  An operati c productio n o f th e
play would make the most of it, with the audience's attention being drawn
to such matters in the theatre program.10

The musica l contras t betwee n Mozar t an d Gouno d i s a  struggle , too ,
between Germa n an d Frenc h operati c composers, 11 which i s a prominen t
subject i n Wagner' s Opera  and  Drama  (wher e Frenc h degradatio n i s
represented by Meyerbeer). This national dialectic appears in another for m
later in the Hell scene, in a musical quotation from Act 2 of Don Giovanni.
Toward th e en d o f Mozart' s opera , jus t befor e th e Statue' s arriva l durin g
the dinne r scene , Donn a Elvir a revile s Do n Giovanni , provokin g hi s
defiant respons e i n "Viva n l e femmine, " exultantl y singin g th e praise s of
women an d wine . In the Hell scene of Man and Superman,  the Devi l and
the Statu e ar e recallin g Juan's forme r day s a s a  well-regarded denize n o f
Hell.

THE DEVIL : You remember how he sang? (He begins to sing in a nasal operatic
baritone, tremulous from an eternity of misuse in the French manner)

Vivan le femmine!
Viva il buon vino!

THE STATUE : (taking up the tune an octave higher in his counter tenor)
Sostegno e gloria
D'umanita. (Collected  Plays, vol. 11, p. 645)
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Here again there is a mingling of musical styles; and once again Mozartian
sublimities are adulterated wit h elements of French opera. And once again
an audience is musically reminded of the intimate connection between Man
and Superman and Don Giovanni.

There are other quotations from Don Giovanni  that are crucial to Shaw's
profoundly intertextua l music-drama. One of them is optional, and is not in
the text of the play but only mentioned by Shaw in the Epistle Dedicatory in
what migh t see m t o b e jus t a  playfu l suggestion . "Octaviu s I  tak e ove r
unaltered fro m Mozart, " h e says , "and I  hereby authoriz e an y acto r wh o
impersonates him , t o sin g 'Dall a su a pace 5 (i f h e can ) a t an y convenien t
moment durin g the representation" {Collected  Plays,  vol. n, p . 519) . I do
not know how many actors or directors have taken Shaw at his word, but in
my ideal production o f Man and Superman Don Ottavio' s tender , gracefu l
aria from th e first ac t of Don Giovanni  would indeed be sung by Octavius
(who, incidentally , wil l "g o a  goo d dea l t o th e opera " i n hi s permanen t
bachelorhood, accordin g t o An n [Collected  Plays,  vol. 11 , p. 715]). On e
good spot for his aria would be after hi s duet with Ann in Act 4 (Collected
Plays, vol. 11 , p. 718) which i s soon followed b y Tanner's scene with Mrs .
Whitefield.12 I n Don Giovanni,  Ottavio' s ari a i s followed immediatel y b y
the entranc e o f th e Do n an d Leporello , th e scen e tha t include s Do n
Giovanni's "Finch'han dal vino," the amazingly energetic, spirited aria tha t
contrasts s o strongl y wit h th e langui d decorousnes s o f Ottavio's . Ther e
should b e precisel y th e sam e contras t betwee n Man  and  Superman^
attractively energetic , intellectuall y licentiou s rebe l an d hi s conventional ,
lyric-tenor "rival. " The singin g o f "Dall a su a pace " would brin g ou t thi s
contrast musically , an d a t th e sam e tim e th e audience , luxuriatin g i n th e
aria, would feel that Octavius is not just a comic butt; he has his music too.

Two other importan t musica l quotation s fro m Don  Giovanni  are actu -
ally in the text of Man and Superman. One of these transposes a memorable
passage o f th e Commendatore' s t o Do n Juan : "D i ride r flnira i pri a
dell'aurora," the Commendatore threatens in his chilling opening utterance
in the cemeter y scen e i n Act 2 , calling Don Giovann i "Ribaldo , audace!"
("By dawn your laughter wil l be ended .  . .  Audacious ribald!").13 In Man
and Superman this passage is transposed into a comic key:

DON JUAN : Audacious ribald: your laughter will finish in hideous boredom
before morning.

THE STATUE : Ha ha! Do you remember how I frightened you when I said
something like that to you from my pedestal in Seville? It sounds rather flat
without my trombones.

DON JUAN : They tell me it generally sounds flat with them, Commander.
(Collected Plays,  vol . 11 , p. 652 )
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It woul d b e desirable fo r an audience t o hear the relevant musi c in this
piece of dialogue, and in my final example of musical quotation from Don
Giovanni i t woul d be , I  believe , a n eve n mor e valuabl e par t o f the
audience's dramatic experience . This is the scene near the end of Man and
Superman in which Tanner finally succumbs to Ann's desire to marry him.

TANNER: I will not marry you. I will not marry you.
ANN: Oh, you will, you will.
TANNER: I tell you, no, no, no.
ANN: I tell you yes, yes, yes.
TANNER: No .
ANN: (coaxing — imploring - almost exhausted) Yes. Before it is too late for

repentance. Yes.
TANNER: (struck by the echo from the past) When did all this happen to me

before? Are we two dreaming? (Collected  Plays, vol. n, p. 728)

In this passage we have a close reenactment of the famous confrontation in
Don Giovanni  betwee n th e Don and the Commendatore lat e i n Act 2.
"Pentiti, cangi a vita . /  E  l'ultim o momento, " th e Statu e threaten s -
"Repent! Change your way of life! It's your last chance!"

IL COMMENDATORE : Pentiti!
DON GIOVANNI:No !
IL COMMENDATORE: Si.
DON GIOVANNI : No! No!
IL COMMENDATORE : Ah tempo piu nonv'e! [Now there is no more time!]

(Mozart Libretti, pp. 214-15)14

The scenes occur in the same part of the dramatic and musical patterning of
each work : th e climacti c momen t jus t befor e th e end . In Man  and
Superman, just as in Don Giovanni, the other character s pou r bac k ont o
the stage right after the vanquishing of the protesting hero, and convention-
ally celebrat e hi s defeat i n a celebratory ensembl e finale  (wit h a  closing
chorus of "Universal laughter" [Collected Plays,  vol. 11 , p . 733]). In each
case the Don Juan figure is vanquished, but in Man and Superman Tanner
has come to the realization tha t to marry An n means a  eugenic evolutio-
nist's Heaven rather than (a s be believed before the dream sequence in Act
3) a  sentimental voluptuary' s Hell . Thu s Mozart' s traged y i s turned int o
Shavian comed y - a  transformation tha t i s highly characteristic of Shaw's
dramaturgy. Now, all of this would become much more part of the play in
a productio n tha t doe s the Tanner-Ann scen e in a manner tha t bring s its
original inescapably to mind - an d ear . The music can profitably b e heard
in a literal, orchestral way, as well as in the delivery of the dialogue, which
should come close to singing.
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In fact, the whole of Man and Superman, and all of Shaw's plays, should
be spoke n i n a  wa y tha t approache s singing . "Oper a taugh t me, " Sha w
wrote at the end of his life, "to shape my plays into recitatives, arias, duets,
trios, ensemble finales, and bravur a piece s to display the technical accom -
plishments o f th e executants"  (The  Drama Observed,  vol. iv , p. 1527). 15

Here is one good example of a Shavian aria:

DON JUAN : Pooh! why should I be civil to them or to you? In this Palace of Lies
a truth or two will not hurt you. Your friends are all the dullest dogs I know.
They are not beautiful: they are only decorated.
They are not clean: they are only shaved and starched.
They are not dignified: they are only fashionably dressed .
They are not educated: they are only college passmen.
They are not religious: they are only pew-renters.
They are not moral: they are only conventional.
They are not virtuous: they are only cowardly.
They are not even vicious: they are only "frail."
They are not artistic: they are only lascivious.
They are not prosperous: they are only rich.
They are not loyal, they are only servile;
not dutiful, only sheepish;
not public spirited, only patriotic;
not courageous, only quarrelsome;
not determined, only obstinate;
not masterful, only domineering;
not self-controlled, only obtuse;
not self-respecting, only vain;
not kind, only sentimental;
not social, only gregarious;
not considerate, only polite;
not intelligent, only opinionated;
not progressive, only factious;
not imaginative, only superstitious;
not just, only vindictive;
not generous, only propitiatory;
not disciplined, only cowed;
and not truthful a t all: liars every one of them, to the very backbone of their
souls. (Collected  Flays, vol. 11, p. 681 )

I have divided the text int o aria-like line s here (wit h a  bit of introductor y
recitative), bu t howeve r on e print s thi s speec h i t call s ou t fo r musica l
treatment. O n th e stag e i t shoul d b e almos t sung , an d i t coul d (fo r
example) be made to sound recognizably like Figaro's "Largo al factotum "
in the first act of Rossini's // Barbiere di Siviglia,16 with Rossini's orchestral
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accompaniment betwee n phrase s jus t a s in the origina l aria . Juan's "You r
friends ar e al l th e dulles t dog s I  know" ari a i s onl y on e instanc e o f th e
musical natur e o f Shaw' s dramati c language ; almos t ever y speec h i n th e
Hell scen e would d o ver y wel l too , an d o f cours e m y point i s that al l of
Shaw's dramati c work s are , a s h e himsel f said , shape d operaticall y int o
arias, duets, trios, and so on. To find more examples, one just needs to open
a collection o f Shaw's plays and whistle along to pieces of dialogue . Then
one can see what Sha w meant in telling a  correspondent i n 190 8 that on e
difficulty i n having Richard Strauss use one of his plays for a libretto is that
"my plays ar e already i n a  sense se t to music : that i s to say , to thei r ow n
music" (Theatrics, p . 91).17 And one can see, too, what Shaw meant when
he sai d tha t gettin g th e rhyth m an d melody , th e ris e an d fall , o f hi s
speeches, is more important than understanding them.

Another of Shaw's dramaturgical principles that derives from opera is the
importance o f contras t amon g th e voice s tha t w e hear . I n a  revealin g
statement ver y lat e i n hi s lif e (1949 ) Sha w advise d tha t directors , i n
selecting a cast, should ensure that actors ' "voices should not be alike. The
four principals should be soprano, alto, tenor, and bass. Vocal contrast is of
the greates t importance " (The  Drama Observed,  vol. iv, pp. 1516-17). 18

This i s certainly a  principl e fo r a  directo r t o kee p ver y muc h i n min d i n
casting Man and Superman, and I  will offer on e possible way of achieving
vocal contrast:

Tanner/Juan: teno r (cf . Faus t i n bot h Gounod' s Faust  an d Boi'to' s
Mefistofele)
Mendoza/Devil: bariton e (specifie d i n th e tex t -  "a  nasal  operatic
baritone")
Ramsden/Statue: bas s (cf . th e Commendator e i n Don  Giovanni-,  th e
counter-tenor business is a joke)
Ann/Ana: soprano (cf . Donn a Ann a i n Don Giovanni,  Marguerite i n
Faust, Margherita in Mefistofele)
Octavius: tenor (cf . Don Ottavio in Don Giovanni)
Straker: bass-baritone (cf. Leporello in Don Giovanni)
Violet: mezzo-soprano (i n Don Giovanni  her original , Donna Elvira ,
who rails against the Don as Violet rails against Tanner, is a soprano,
but I have lowered the pitch in the interest of contrast with Ann).

This i s no t th e onl y wa y t o d o it , an d on e might , fo r example , wan t t o
preserve the parallel with Don Giovanni  by casting the Don Juan figure as
a bariton e o r bass-baritone , bu t th e importan t poin t i s to hav e a s wide a
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range of vocal pitches as one can, so that on e part o f a duet (le t us say) is
noticeably distinc t fro m th e other . This , a s w e hav e seen , i s th e metho d
advocated b y Shaw, who said in a discussion o f radio drama i n 194 7 tha t
"A cast in which all the voices have the same pitch and pace is as disastrous
as it would be in an opera" (Shaw's Music, vol. in, p. 762).

It i s no t irrelevan t o r accidenta l t o Major  Barbara  tha t tw o o f th e
characters' name s com e fro m th e late-Victoria n musica l world : Cusin s
from Si r Willia m Cusins , wh o succeede d Wagne r a s conducto r o f th e
London Philharmonic in 186 7 and continued unti l 1883 ; and Undershaft' s
partner Lazaru s fro m Henr y Lazarus , a  leadin g clarinetis t o f th e period .
One of the very few things that we learn about thi s offstage silen t partne r
in Major  Barbara  is tha t h e like s chambe r music ; Undershaf t describe s
Lazarus a s " a gentl e romanti c Je w wh o care s fo r nothin g bu t strin g
quartets an d stall s a t fashionabl e theatres " (Collected  Plays,  vol . in ,
p. 167) .

Undershaft's ow n musical tastes are very different. Hi s particular instru -
ment i s th e trombon e -  tha t quintessentiall y Shavia n instrumen t tha t i n
Don Giovanni  is associated with Undershaft's fello w bass , the Commenda-
tore. In the first ac t of Major Barbara, Undershaft i s invited by Barbara t o
come to her Salvation Army shelter. "Can you play anything?" she inquires.
Her father replies that in his youth he earned money from stepdancing , and
"Later on , I  becam e a  membe r o f th e Undershaf t orchestra l society , an d
performed passabl y o n th e teno r trombone " (Collected  Flays, vol . in ,
p. 88) . Toward the end of the act he offers to play his instrument during the
alternative versio n o f famil y prayer s tha t h e proposes : "I f Barbar a wil l
conduct a little service in the drawing room, with Mr. Lomax as organist, I
will attend it willingly. I will even take part, if a trombone can be procured"
(Collected Plays, vol. in , p . 92). Th e nex t act , i n whic h a  trombon e i s
procured, culminate s wit h Undershaf t playin g i t exultantl y (Collected
Plays, vol. in, p. 136).

Other character s als o hav e thei r instruments . Cusins' s i s anothe r o f
Shaw's favorites , th e dru m (" I woul d giv e anythin g t o pla y th e drum, "
Shaw confide d t o hi s reader s i n a  musi c colum n [Shaw's  Music, vol . 1,
p. 858]) . Cusins' drum i s a conspicuous part o f the set for much of Act 2:
"A drum  is  heard  in  the  shelter  .  . . Adolphus  [Cusins]  enters from the
shelter with a  big drum" (Collected  Plays,  vol. in , p . 113) . Shortly there-
after h e kisses Barbara "over  the drum, evidently not for the  first time, as
people cannot kiss over a big drum without practice" (Collected  Plays, vol.
in, p . 115) , an d nea r th e en d o f th e ac t h e join s Undershaf t i n thei r
irresistibly high-spirite d orchestra l exi t (t o whic h I  wil l retur n i n a
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moment). Als o a  membe r o f this imprompt u Salvatio n Arm y ban d is
Barbara's colleague Jenny Hill, whose instrument is the tambourine.

In Act i, Charles Lomax's instrument is the concertina.

BARBARA: Cholly: fetch your concertina and play something for us.
LOMAX: (jumps up eagerly, but  checks himself to remark doubtfully to

Undershaft) Perhaps that sort of thing isnt in your line, eh?
UNDERSHAFT:Iam particularl y fond of music.
LOMAX: (delighted)  Are you? Then I'll get it. (He goes upstairs for the

instrument.)
UNDERSHAFT: Do you play, Barbara?
BARBARA: Only the tambourine. But Cholly's teaching me the concertina.

(Plays, vol. in, p. 87)19

Lomax is soon "heard  at the door trying the concertina" (Collected Plays,
vol. in , p. 88), and when it is time for him to play there is a characteristic
moment in which a musical choice expresses a clash of competing values in
the play.

LOMAX: Hadnt I better play something?
BARBARA: Yes. Give us Onward, Christian Soldiers.
LOMAX: Well, thats rather a strong order to begin with, dont you know.

Suppose I sing Thourt passing hence, my brother. It's much the same tune.
BARBARA: It's too melancholy. (Collected  Plays,  vol . 111, p. 91)

Of thes e tw o piece s b y Sir Arthu r Sullivan , Lomax' s choice , th e mor e
sombre "Tho u Ar t Passing Hence, " represent s traditional , controlled ,
conventional religiou s feeling ; it was part o f the music done wit h Wilson
Barrett's religiously conventiona l pla y The  Sign of the Cross  in 1896, and
its inclusion was noted by Shaw at the time (The Drama Observed, vol. 11,
p. 496) . "Onward, Christia n Soldiers, " on the other hand , represent s the
joyous, assertiv e religiou s lif e tha t i s the reall y positiv e elemen t i n th e
Salvation Army. The musical values of the Salvation Army are victorious by
the end of Act 1, when all the characters except Stephen have moved to the
drawing roo m fo r Undershaft's praye r service , with Loma x as "organist "
on hi s concertina an d Barbar a o n her tambourine : "Onward,  Christian
Soldiers, on the concertina,  with  tambourine  accompaniment,  is  heard
when the door opens" (Collected Plays, vol. 111, p. 94) .

In Act 2, the victory o f Undershaft's value s ove r those o f the Salvation
Army is also expressed musically, in the Dionysian orchestral scene that we
have alread y glance d at . But in this scen e it is the context tha t signifie s
Undershaft's triumph ; th e music itsel f i s fitting for bot h hi m and for the
Salvation Army , an d it expresses th e joyous energ y tha t the y share . For
Shaw, it is this energy of its music that define s the nature of the Salvation
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Army. The yea r afte r h e wrote Major  Barbara, h e reviewed a  concer t o f
Salvation Army bands, and he commented that one of the bands

had th e peculia r combinatio n o f brillianc y an d emotiona l qualit y whic h i s
and ough t to be the distinctive Salvationis t musica l characteristic. The other
bands had it occasionally when playing favorite hymn tunes; but the Clapton
band neve r los t it , and combined i t with a  joyous vivacity of style and clear
jubilant tone which stamped it as the Salvationist band par excellence.

(Shaw's Music, vol. in, pp. 590-91)

This would b e a good way of characterizing the nature of Major Barbara
itself, and all the qualities cited here are very much in aural evidence when
the band strikes up in Act 2. In a music review in 1889 Shaw mentioned in
passing tha t Donizetti' s choruse s "hav e bee n discovere d b y the Salvatio n
Army: I  hear d on e o f thei r band s playin g Per  te  d'immenso  giubilo
capitally on e Sunda y mornin g las t year " (Shaw's  Music, vol . 1 , p. 634) .
This i s th e choru s sun g b y th e guest s a t th e beginnin g o f th e heroine' s
wedding in Act 1, Scene 2. of Lucia di Lammermoor; while the heartbroken
(offstage) Luci a i s forced t o rejec t he r apparentl y unfaithfu l belove d an d
marry anothe r man , everyon e els e o n th e stag e i s celebratin g th e joyfu l
occasion. I n Major  Barbara,  the heartbroke n heroin e mus t watc h an d
listen while al l the others celebrate the defection o f her beloved Salvatio n
Army (the similarities of plot in this scene extend further, bu t let us stick to
the music) . Undershaf t ha s jus t hande d ove r th e chequ e wit h whic h h e
buys the Salvation Army:

CUSINS: (in a convulsion of irony) Let us seize this unspeakable moment. Let us
march to the great meeting at once. Excuse me just an instant. (He rushes into
the shelter. Jenny takes her tambourine from the drum head.)

MRS. BAINES : Mr Undershaft: have you ever seen a thousand people fall on
their knees with one impulse and pray? Come with us to the meeting. Barbara
shall tell them that the Army is saved, and saved through you.

CUSINS: (returning impetuously from the shelter with a flag and a trombone,
and coming between Mrs. Baines and Undershaft) You shall carry the flag
down the first street, Mrs. Baines (he gives her the flag). Mr. Undershaft i s a
gifted trombonist : he shall intone an Olympian diapason to the West Ham
Salvation March. (Aside to Undershaft, as he forces the trombone on him)
Blow, Machiavelli, blow.

UNDERSHAFT: (aside  to him, as he takes the trombone) The trumpet in Zion!
(Cusins rushes to the drum, which he takes up and puts on. Undershaft
continues, aloud) I will do my best. I could vamp a bass if I knew the tune.

c u s 1N s: It is a wedding chorus from one of Donizetti's operas; but we have
converted it. We convert everything to good here, including Bodger. You
remember the chorus. "For thee immense rejoicing - immens o giubilo -
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immenso giubilo." (With drum obbligato) Rum turn ti turn turn, turn turn ti
ta -

BARBARA: Dolly: you are breaking my heart.
(Collected Plays, vol. m, pp. 134-35)

Then afte r Barbar a refuse s th e tambourin e tha t Cusin s offer s t o her , an d
removes her Salvation army badge, the others march off .

CUSINS: (calling to the procession in the street outside) Off we go. Play up,
there! Immenso giubilo. (He gives the time with his drum; and the band
strikes up the march, which rapidly becomes more distant as the procession
moves briskly away).

MRS. BAINES : I must go, dear. Youre overworked: you will be all right
tomorrow. We'll never lose you. Now Jenny: step out with the old flag. Blood
and Fire! (She marches out through the gate with her flag.)

JENNY: Glory Hallelujah! (flourishing her tambourine and marching.)
UNDERSHAFT: (to  Cusins, as he marches out past him easing the slide of his

trombone) "My ducats and my daughter"!
CUSINS: (following him out) Money and gunpowder!

(Collected Plays, vol. in, p. 136)

The musica l quotatio n fro m Donizett i i n thi s scen e expresse s heightene d
emotion i n a  way tha t goe s beyon d language , an d th e dramati c impac t o f
the scene is decidedly intensified b y the music the audience hears.

Lucia di  Lammermoor  bring s actua l operati c musi c ont o Shaw' s stage ,
but i t is not the only operatic moment in Major Barbara.  The play is full of
effects tha t deriv e fro m oper a -  suc h a s Cusins' s recitativ e an d th e othe r
characters' chorus in Act 3:

CUSINS: Well, I have something to say which is in the nature of a confession.
SARAH:
LADY BRITOMART: C o n f e s s i o n ,
BARBARA:
STEPHEN:
LOMAX: Oh I say! (Collected  Plays, vol. m, p. 163)

Or tak e al l th e aria-lik e speeche s i n thi s thir d act , includin g th e tenor -
soprano scen e nea r th e en d wit h it s bi g arias . O r ther e i s the irruptio n o f
the Mephistophelia n Undershaf t int o th e respectabl e abod e o f Lad y
Britomart i n Ac t 1 , which musica l accompanimen t (alon g wit h a  suitabl e
note i n a  theatr e program ) coul d connec t wit h on e o f th e nineteenth -
century Faus t opera s tha t Sha w wa s ver y muc h familia r with : Boito' s
Mefistofele. Reviewin g a production o f this opera i n 1889 , Shaw described
the stron g effec t o f it s Prologu e i n Heaven , drawin g attentio n t o "th e
tremendous sonorit y o f th e instrumentatio n a t th e end , wit h th e defian t
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devil's whistl e recklessl y mockin g eac h clima x o f it s grandeur , [which ]
literally make s u s al l si t up " (Shaw's  Music, vol . I , p . 645) . The defian t
devil's whistl e whic h Sha w though t h e detecte d a t th e en d o f Boito' s
orchestral Prelude is explicitly heard in Act 1  of the opera, and then at the
end of its Epilogue: "Trionfa i l Signor," sings the defeated Mefistofele , "m a
il reprob o fischia! " ("Th e Lor d ha s prevailed , /  bu t th e reprobat e whis -
tles!").20 Versions of thi s whistle coul d b e heard i n a  number o f places in
Major Barbara, a s Shaw's Mephistophelian ironis t Undershaft disturb s the
complacencies o f othe r character s -  see , for example , hi s fina l lin e o f th e
play ("Six o'clock tomorrow morning, Euripides" [Collected Plays, vol. m,
p. 185]) , which is very much a devil's whistle recklessly mocking the climax
of Barbara's and Cusins's grandeur.21

Major Barbara  i s (amon g othe r things ) a  Faus t story , abou t th e
temptation o f the scholar by the Mephistophelian ma n of the world - an d
Cusins does in fact cal l Undershaft Mephistophele s (Collected  Plays, vol.
in, p . 124) . When Sha w thought abou t th e Faus t legend , he had i n mind
not so much Goethe' s verse-drama a s the two operatic versions that were
much mor e widel y know n i n th e secon d hal f o f th e nineteent h centur y
than they are now: Gounod's Faust and Boito's Mefistofele. Each of these,
at the end o f it s first act , ha s a memorable temptatio n scen e between th e
scholar-tenor an d th e Mephistophelian bass . Anyone who listens to these
two scenes and then reads Major Barbara's temptation scene in Act 2 will,
I think , b e struc k b y th e possibilitie s o f bringin g element s o f Gounod' s
and Boito' s version s int o a  production . A t th e hear t o f th e encounte r
between Cusins and Undershaft i s the contrast that we must hear between
the sonorous , authoritative , sometime s mockin g bas s an d th e muc h
lighter tenor ; an d thi s i s precisel y th e natur e o f bot h o f th e operati c
scenes. Listen to the recitative that opens the scene in Major Barbara, and
notice tha t i t begin s wit h Cusin s flourishing  "his drumsticks  as  if  in  the
act of  beating  a  lively  rataplan"  an d tha t i t end s wit h Undershaft' s
sonorous, authoritativ e bas s "Yes, " at whic h poin t "The  cadence  of this
reply makes  a  full  close  in the  conversation."  Wha t follow s i s Cusins' s
tenor aria , wit h hi s own accompanimen t o n th e dru m a t th e en d o f i t ( I
will no t divid e the line s this time , bu t th e reader wil l see how easil y thi s
can be done):

CUSINS: Father Undershaft: you are mistaken: I am a sincere Salvationist. You
do not understand the Salvation Army. It is the army of joy, of love, of
courage: it has banished the fear and remorse and despair of the old hell-
ridden evangelical sects: it marches to fight the devil with trumpet and drum,
with music and dancing, with banner and palm, as becomes a sally from
heaven by its happy garrison. It picks the waster out of the public house and
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makes a man of him: it finds a worm wriggling in a back kitchen, and lo! a
woman! Men and women of rank too, sons and daughters of the Highest. It
takes the poor professor of Greek, the most artificial and self-suppressed of
human creatures, from his meal of roots, and lets loose the rhapsodist in him;
reveals the true worship of Dionysos to him; sends him down the public street
drumming dithyrambs (he plays a thundering flourish on the drum).

(Collected Plays, vol. m, p. 115-17 )

One o f Undershaft' s bi g arias , th e "cold  and  sardonic"  "Hav e yo u eve r
been i n lov e with Poverty, " follows a  few minute s late r (Collected  Plays,
vol. in , p . 12.1) , and i t migh t b e listene d t o afte r on e ha s jus t hear d hi s
counterpart's aggressive , defian t "Son o l o spirito " i n Boi'to' s oper a -  th e
aria tha t feature s th e devil' s whistl e (an d Boito' s scene , b y th e way ,
includes a  handshak e betwee n th e tw o characters , jus t a s i n Major
Barbara).

Another operati c sourc e o f Major  Barbara tha t certainl y shoul d no t b e
left ou t of account in a reading or a production of the play is Wagner's Der
Ring des Nibelungen, which Shaw regarded a s "the central masterpiece of
religious musi c i n ou r times " (Shaw's  Music, vol . m , p . 393) . There ha s
been som e critica l attentio n t o relationship s betwee n Major  Barbara  an d
Der Ring, but i t has mostly confined itsel f t o themes in the literary rathe r
than th e musica l sense , an d thu s t o Wagner' s librett o a s oppose d t o hi s
score.22 I f musica l allusion s t o Der  Ring  ar e include d i n a  production o f
Major Barbara a s music-drama, the y could brin g out some of the striking
correspondences betwee n Shaw' s character s an d Wagner's . Unde r shaft
(bass) i s Shaw' s Wota n an d Alberic h (th e latte r o f who m i s bas s i n Der
Ring); Cusins (tenor ) i s his Siegfried; Barbar a (soprano ) i s his Brunnhilde;
and Lad y Britomar t (mezzo-sopran o o r contralto ) hi s Frick a (wh o i s
soprano i n Der Ring,  bu t I  have again altered th e pitch fo r Shavia n vocal
contrast). Thes e correspondence s wor k ou t wit h remarkabl e closeness ,
especially when one sees Der Ring in the light of Shaw's Perfect Wagnerite,
and th e connection s betwee n Shaw' s character s an d Wagner' s coul d b e
actually heard a s well as thought about . One excellent source of music for
Major Barbara  in Der  Ring  would b e the secon d ac t o f Die  Walkure,  in
which Wotan/Undershaft , Fricka/Lad y Britomart , an d Brunnhilde/Barbar a
sing i n way s tha t relat e t o thei r dramati c position s i n Shaw' s play . Th e
correspondences betwee n som e o f Wotan' s musi c her e an d Undershaft' s
major arias , it seems to me, are especially compelling.

When Sha w cam e t o revis e Major  Barbara  for Gabrie l Pascal' s 194 1
film (for which Sir William Walton wrote the score),23 one of the scenes he
added bring s -  i n a  wa y -  anothe r oper a int o th e play . I n Shaw' s
screenplay, soo n afte r everyon e ha s arrive d a t th e munition s foundr y a t
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Perivale St . Andrews the y visi t th e Labo r Churc h ther e fo r a  concer t o f
televised, recorde d musi c o n a  larg e screen . Undershaf t explain s tha t h e
has ha d hi s favorit e recor d pu t i n read y fo r them ; the n Lad y Britomar t
pushes a  switc h an d th e scree n i s filled with "an  orchestra  of a  hundred
performers in evening dress tuning their instruments" alon g with a chorus
and fou r principa l singers . A filmed announcer say s tha t "Wha t yo u ar e
about t o hea r i s a  fragmen t fro m a  dea d oper a b y th e Italia n compose r
Giacomo [sic]  Rossini , who in Europe a hundred years ago ranked as high
as Hande l i n ou r ow n country . Th e subjec t i s th e miraculou s passag e
through th e Red Se a by the Israelites in their fligh t fro m Egypt. " Because
this subject i s no longer of any importance to us, he explains, the libretto
has bee n brough t u p t o dat e b y makin g th e Re d Se a a  symbo l o f th e
socialist revolution.

ANNOUNCER: We have not altered a note of the music: we have only given it
such a wealth of orchestration as Rossini would himself have given it had the
great resources of Undershaft an d Lazarus been within his reach. The words
alone are brought up to date. For Rossini at his greatest today there is only
one conductor: Arturo Toscanini.24

(Toscanini enters, baton in hand, and takes his place at the conductor's
desk.)

ANNOUNCER: Ladie s and gentlemen: Arturo Toscanini. (He leaves the
platform.)

(Toscanini raises his baton; and the quartet and chorus from Rossini's
Moses in Egypt follows, accompanied by the Wagnerian orchestra. At the
famous modulation into G major the organ is added.)

What follows - o r at least what would have followed, if the whole sequence
had no t bee n omitte d fro m th e film - i s the inspiring Preghier a ("Da l tu o
stellato soglio") from th e third act of Rossini's Mose in Egitto, with a new
libretto that Shaw wrote with considerable difficulty (se e Collected Letters,
vol. iv, pp. 542-43) ; the revised words have to do with the task of moving
from destructio n to creation. This whole sequence (which is to be found in
Dukore's editio n o f Collected  Screenplays, pp . 335-37 ) ma y b e seen as a
late tribut e t o Rossin i fro m th e playwrigh t wh o durin g th e composer' s
centenary half a  century earlier had called him "one of the greatest masters
of claptra p tha t eve r lived, " an d ha d exclaimed : " I canno t sa y 'Res t hi s
soul,' for he had none; but I may at least be allowed the fervent aspiratio n
that w e ma y neve r loo k upo n hi s lik e again " (Shaw's  Music,  vol . 11,
pp. 562 , 570) . I n th e film version o f Major  Barbara,  we hav e a  furthe r
example o f Shaw' s play s drawin g o n composer s who m h e di d no t plac e
anywhere nea r th e fron t ran k -  a s Martin Meise l ha s show n h e did wit h
nineteenth-century playwright s a s well . An d w e hav e a  goo d reaso n t o
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27 Th e music of Shaw's words: Louise Marleau as Julia Craven with Paxton Whitehead as
Leonard Charteris in the Shaw Festival's 1971 production of The Philanderer

make us e o f th e powerful , faith-affirmin g Preghier a musi c fro m Mose  in
productions of Shaw's play.

In Man and Superman and Major Barbara, much of the music is operatic,
but music of all sorts pervades Shaw's plays. To note just a few conspicuous
examples, we hear two pianos in The Music Cure; a  saxophone in Buoyant
Billions; a bucina in Caesar and Cleopatra;25 two competing onstage bands
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in The  Devil's  Disciple;  a trumpe t i n The  Simpleton  of  the  Unexpected
Isles; whistling an d singin g i n John Bull's  Other  Island;  singin g i n Pyg-
malion (from Puccini' s La Fanciulla del West), and songs in Saint Joan, On
the Rocks, an d Passion,  Poison and Petrifaction (a play which specificall y
calls fo r a n orchestra) ; a  voca l "antiphona l quartet " i n The  Simpleton of
the Unexpected  Isles;  and a  carillon , a n organ , an d flute s i n Back  to
Methuselah. And there is Randall Utterword's flute-playing that forms par t
of th e sound-patter n i n Heartbreak  House.  Near th e beginnin g o f Ac t 3 ,
Lady Utterword "is  interrupted by the melancholy strains of a flute coming
from an open window above"  and , after al l the Beethoven-like thundering
of the Zeppelin and its bombs, this instrument provides the sound on which
the play ends: "Randall at last  succeeds in  keeping the home fires burning
on his  flute" {Collected  Plays, vol. v , pp . 161 , 181) . Heartbreak  House,
with it s musica l subtitl e (" A Fantasi a i n th e Russia n Manne r o n Englis h
Themes"), also has the weird chantin g a t the end o f it s first act and othe r
kinds o f musi c a s well , an d ther e i s somethin g t o b e sai d fo r Shaw' s
comment t o Elgar i n 192 9 that i t was "by far th e most musica l work" he
had written (Holroyd , Bernard Shaw, vol. 111, p. 14) - althoug h there is, as
we have seen, some strong competition.

All of this music in Shaw's plays is not just something added decoratively.
Their music - tha t is , their litera l music and thei r verbal music - i s part of
their very fabric, and it gives expression to their values and to their form. In
an 1894 piece on Wagner's theories about music, Shaw said that "there is a
great dea l o f feeling , highl y poeti c an d highl y dramatic , which canno t b e
expressed by mere words - becaus e words are the counters of thinking, not
of feelin g -  bu t whic h ca n b e supremel y expresse d b y music " {Shaw's
Music, vol . in , p . 91) , an d Shaw' s music-drama s d o expres s feelin g tha t
goes beyon d wha t mer e word s ca n convey . I f actua l musi c i s use d i n
productions, and if dialogue is spoken musically, then the intense feeling in
Shaw's work wil l be given expression. And there is a great dea l of intens e
feeling in Shaw's work, which is not always recognized because much of it
is determinedly non-sexua l feeling . Shaw' s characters ten d t o b e intensely
passionate abou t subject s lik e improving the world, an d ofte n i n context s
that lea d u s t o expec t somethin g amorous . Th e sexua l feelin g ha s bee n
displaced, a s in Barbara' s wooin g o f Bil l Walker's soul  in Act 2  of Major
Barbara, for example , o r a s i n th e non-lov e scen e betwee n Barbar a an d
Cusins lat e i n Ac t 3 , wher e th e teno r an d sopran o sin g lyricall y an d
passionately about what they wish to achieve for society in taking over the
munitions business . Another fine example o f non-sexua l feelin g expresse d
with lyrica l intensit y i n Shaw' s work woul d b e any o f Juan's aria s i n the
Hell scen e o f Man  and  Superman.  Whe n w e hea r Shaw' s play s a s ful l
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music-dramas, this element of intellectual ecstas y is much more potent tha n
if they remain mer e prose libretti .

And i f Shaw' s play s ar e hear d a s music-dramas , the n thei r sudde n
contrasts o f key , tone , tempo , an d volum e ar e mor e full y evident , a s
Edmund Wilso n ha s demonstrate d i n a  musica l accoun t o f th e firs t ac t o f
The Apple  Cart,  i n whic h h e show s ho w thi s ac t "i s a n exercis e i n th e
scoring fo r smal l orchestr a a t whic h Sha w i s particularl y skillful." 26 Th e
importance o f contrastin g sound s i n Shaw' s play s i s nicel y suggested , too ,
in thi s passag e fro m hi s ow n musi c criticism -  reviewin g a  performance o f
Beethoven's Eighth Symphony , which Shaw compares to his Seventh:

In all subtler respect s the Eighth is better, with it s immense cheerfulness an d
exquisite playfulness , it s perfec t cando r an d naturalness , it s filament s o f
heavenly melody suddenly streaming up from th e mass of sound , and flyin g
away cloudlike, and the cunning harmonic coquetry with which the irresist-
ibly high-spirited themes , after innumerabl e feints and tantalizing invitation s
and promises, suddenly come at you round the most unexpected corners, and
sweep you away with a delightful burs t of joyous energy.

(Shaw's Music, vol. in, p. 354)

Here i s a  passag e tha t tell s one mor e abou t Shaw' s play s tha n an y amoun t
of discussio n abou t socia l an d politica l issue s i n them . Attentio n t o thei r
music means attentio n t o thei r form , an d becaus e o f th e interes t tha t Sha w
has alway s attracte d t o hi s socia l an d politica l opinion s ther e ha s bee n to o
little emphasi s o n th e forma l qualitie s o f hi s play s -  o n thei r melody , thei r
harmony, their rhythm, their movements, their changes of key.

It i s not enough , then , to read o r t o see Shaw's plays ; you shoul d b e abl e
to whistle  them . And on e might continue thi s paraphrase o f the Richard  III
review by saying that i t is a positive sin for a  director o f a  Shaw play to give
the words without th e musical setting , like a Covent Garde n libretto . To do
so i s to depriv e Shaw' s play s o f thei r rea l natur e a s music-drama . A s he s o
often stated , this is the way he himself though t o f his work .

From my earliest recorded sign of an interest in music when as a small child I
encored m y mother' s singin g o f th e page' s son g fro m th e first  ac t o f Le s
Huguenots .  . . musi c ha s bee n a n indispensabl e par t o f m y life . Harle y
Granville-Barker was not far ou t when, at a rehearsal o f one of my plays, he
cried out "Ladies and gentlemen: will you please remember that this is Italian
opera." (Shaw's  Music, vol. 1, p. 57)
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subject.

6 Mosc o Carner , Puccini:  A  Critical  Biography  (1958; 3rd edn . London : Duck -
worth, 1992), p. 212.

7 Quote d i n R . F . Rattray, Bernard  Shaw: A Chronicle  (Luton : Leagrave Press ,
1951), p. 2on, as something that Shaw said at the 193 9 Malvern Festival. This
passage i s cite d i n Josephin e Lee , "Th e Skille d Voluptuary : Sha w a s Musi c
Critic," The  Annual  of  Bernard  Shaw Studies  12 (1992) , pp . 147-64 ; an d i t
serves as the epigraph for chapter 2 of Martin Meisel, Shaw and the Nineteenth-
Century Theater (Princeton: Princeton University Press, 1963). Meisel's chapter,
entitled "Opera and Drama," remains the best discussion of musical elements in
Shaw's plays.

8 Th e designation i s Shaw's own: "I am myself a  composer: that is , a planner of
performances, i n the specia l capacity o f a  playwright" (Shaw's  Music, vol. in ,
p. 756).

9 A s for Beethoven, see the novel that Shaw wrote in 1881 which includes a major
character modeled on the German composer - Love  among the Artists.

10 I n staging the Devil in the Hell scene , and hi s counterpart Mendoz a earlie r in
Act 3 , there i s also something t o b e done with tha t othe r popula r nineteenth -
century musica l expressio n o f Faustia n conflict s betwee n Heave n an d Hell ,
Boi'to's Mefistofele.

11 Th e nationa l issu e i s implici t i n Shaw' s referenc e t o Frenc h composer s i n the
Epistle Dedicatory to Man and Superman when he comments that "on e bar of
the voluptuous sentimentality o f Gounod o r Bizet would appear as a licentious
stain o n th e scor e o f Do n Giovanni " (Collected  Plays,  vol. n , p . 500) . For a
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discussion o f Shaw' s view o f Gounod , se e Richard Corballis , "Wh y th e Devil
Gets Al l the Goo d Tunes : Shaw, Wagner, Mozart , Gounod , Bizet , Boi'to , and
Stanford," The  Annual of  Bernard Shaw Studies 12 (1992), pp. 165-80 . This
article, one o f th e few reall y serious , detailed account s o f musica l element s in
Shaw's plays , discusses the plac e o f Gounod' s Faust  in the Hel l scen e o f Man
and Superman, and points illuminatingly to connections between the Hell scene
and Bizet' s Carmen,  and als o betwee n John  Bull's  Other  Island  and Boito' s
Mefistofele (and Sir Charles Villiers Stanford's Irish Symphony as well).

12 I n th e rathe r likel y even t tha t a  teno r canno t b e foun d t o pla y th e par t o f
Octavius an d t o sin g "Dall a su a pace " adequately , the n somethin g coul d b e
done with a recording.

13 [Lorenz o d a Ponte] , Three  Mozart Libretti,  trans. Rober t Pac k an d Marjori e
Lelash (New York: Dover, 1993), pp. 202-03.

14 I t i s difficult t o convey th e natur e o f th e music itself , an d mer e prin t mus t of
necessity dra w to o muc h attentio n t o th e "Coven t Garde n libretto " sid e o f
things. I hope that readers will complement my text with musical performance s
in some form, an d i n any case i t i s best to read -  o r see and hea r -  Man  and
Superman an d Major  Barbara  shortl y afte r listenin g t o Don  Giovanni,  Faust,
Wagner's Ring, and the various other relevant musical works.

15 Se e Paulina Salz Pollak, "Master to the Masters: Mozart's Influence o n Bernard
Shaw's 'Do n Juan i n Hell,' " The  Annual of  Bernard  Shaw Studies,  8 (1988),
pp. 39-68 , fo r a n interestin g discussio n o f structura l parallel s betwee n Don
Giovanni an d the Hell scen e o f Man and Superman.  Th e Don Giovanni  her e is
more da Ponte's libretto than Mozart's score, but Pollak does provide a detailed
look at relationships between the Hell scene and the opera.

16 "Th e Mozar t o f Englis h Letter s he is not -  th e music of th e Marbl e Statu e is
beyond him - the Rossini, yes," W. H. Auden wrote of Shaw in 1942. "He has all
the brio, the humor, the tunes, the clarity, and the virtuosity of that great master
of Opera Bouffe." Auden also described Shaw as "probably the best music critic
who ever lived," and said that "For all his theatre about propaganda, his writing
has an effect neare r to that o f music than the work of any of the so-called pure
writers" (rpt . i n Loui s Kronenberge r [ed.] , George  Bernard Shaw: A Critical
Survey, [Cleveland and New York: World Publishing, 1953], p. 156).

17 Cf . Shaw' s comment to the composer Rutland Boughto n in the same year tha t
music tha t ha d bee n propose d fo r The  Admirable  Bashville  would no t d o
because "i t spoil s my  music " (Collected  Letters, vol. 11 , p. 787) . Thi s i s one
reason why Shaw vehemently rejected musica l comedies based on his plays, as
he would undoubtedly have done with My Fair Lady had he lived long enough
to be outraged by it.

18 Se e the musica l analysi s o f a  scen e in Mrs.  Warren's  Profession, wit h carefu l
attention t o contrast s i n voca l pitch , i n Meisel' s Shaw  and  the  Nineteenth-
Century Theater, pp. 52-54.

19 Fo r Barbara, an alternative to playing vigorous hymn music on the tambourine
or concertina would have been wasting her life away playing Schumann on the
piano. "If I  were middle-class I  should turn my back on my father's business, "
she tells Cusins during their final duet in Act 3, "and we should both live in an
artistic drawing room, with you reading the reviews in one corner, and I in the
other a t the piano, playing Schumann: both very superior persons , and neithe r
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of u s a  bi t o f use " (Collected  Plays,  vol . in , p . 183) . Schumann' s musi c
represents th e values o f th e useles s leisure d middle-clas s lif e tha t Barbar a wil l
avoid b y taking ove r the munition s foundry ; i n The  Quintessence  of  Ibsenism
Shaw refer s t o "th e sentimenta l ideal s o f ou r amiable,  cultured , Schuman n
playing propertie d classes " i n Chekhov' s Cherry  Orchard  (The  Drama  Ob-
served, vol. iv, p. 1297).

20 Arrig o Boi'to , Mefistofele,  wit h Nicola i Ghiaurov , Lucian o Pavarotti , an d
Mirella Freni , cond. Oliviero de Fabritiis, London, 410 175-2 , 198 5 (Libretto ,
trans. Avril Bardoni, pp. 182-83) .

21 An d Faust' s principa l teno r ari a i n Boito' s Epilogue ("Giunt o su l passo") , like
Cusins's in Shaw's final bi g scene, passionately envisions a social transformatio n
to which he wishes to consecrate his life (Ibid., pp. 170-75).

22 Fo r example : J . L . Wisenthal , "Th e Undersid e o f Undershaft : A  Wagnerian
Motif i n Major  Barbara,"  Shaw Review  1 5 (1972) , pp. 56-64 ; Arthu r Ganz ,
"The Playwrigh t a s Perfec t Wagnerite : Motif s fro m th e Musi c Drama s i n th e
Theatre o f Bernar d Shaw, " Comparative  Drama  1 3 (1979) , pp . 187-207 ;
Robert Coskren, "Siegfried Elements in the Plays of Bernard Shaw," The Annual
of Bernard Shaw Studies 2 (1982), pp. 27-46.

23 The  Collected  Screenplays  of  Bernard  Shaw,  ed . Bernard F . Dukore (London :
George Prior, 1980) , p. 93. Shaw's screenplay adds some Salvation Army ban d
and hymn music to what is in the original play.

24 Sha w wante d Toscanin i himsel f t o b e engage d fo r thi s scene ; see hi s lette r o f
September 12 , 1939 to Pascal in Bernard Shaw and Gabriel  Pascal, ed. Bernard
F. Dukore (Toronto: University of Toronto Press, 1996), p. 64.

25 Bernar d F . Dukore, in his Bernard Shaw, Director  (London : George Allen an d
Unwin, 1971) , print s a  not e writte n b y Sha w fo r director s o f Caesar  and
Cleopatra, which carefully specifie s the ways the bucina music may be produced
- a  not e tha t take s fo r grante d th e presenc e o f a n orchestr a i n th e theatre .
Dukore als o quote s a  191 0 lette r i n whic h Sha w offer s a  numbe r o f detaile d
suggestions for music in The Dark Lady of the Sonnets (pp. 166- 67).

26 Edmun d Wilson, The Triple  Thinkers (1938 , rpt. New York: Oxford Universit y
Press, 1963), pp. 182-83.
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Shaw and the popular contex t

When Bernar d Sha w die d i n lat e 1950 , h e wa s a n internationa l literar y
figure whos e dramatic works were sought by the stage, cinema, radio, and
television. A  spokesperson fo r th e Societ y o f Author s note d tha t " a da y
never passes without a  performance o f some Shaw play being given some-
where i n th e world." 1 I n 195 1 five  differen t Sha w play s appeare d o n
Broadway, while si x full-length an d eightee n shor t script s ran i n London .
The actor s headlinin g thes e production s wer e amon g th e world' s mos t
renowned performers , includin g Laurenc e Olivier , Vivie n Leigh , Joh n
Clements, Ka y Hammond , Yvonn e Mitchell , an d Ut a Hagen . Shavia n
drama wa s s o ubiquitous i n 1 9 51 that th e Sha w estate feare d a  "debase -
ment of the coinage" and had "for the moment forbidden an y further Wes t
End productions of Shaw's works."2

One reaso n fo r thi s popularit y wa s (an d stil l is ) tha t actor s foun d i n
Shaw's energetic , articulat e character s attractiv e vehicle s b y whic h t o
showcase thei r talents , vehicle s wit h th e potentia l fo r bravur a perform -
ances. Basil Langton atteste d tha t Shavia n drama "offere d m e a multitude
of fascinating , meat y an d show y roles to ac t .  . . Man and Superman is a
good play, but above al l it has the most glorious role any actor can dream
of o r wis h for." 3 Danie l Masse y reflecte d tha t "Som e o f th e greates t
moments o f an y theatrica l lif e hav e bee n a t th e servic e o f GBS . I t i s a
thrilling privilege to be able to touch people' s emotions through tha t deep
and generous mind." 4 Sha w himself acknowledge d hi s genius fo r creatin g
extraordinary role s when he remarked tha t "i f you want t o flatter me . . .
tell me that, like Shakespeare, Moliere, Scott, Dumas and Dickens , I have
provided a  galler y o f character s whic h ar e realle r t o yo u tha n you r ow n
relatives an d whic h successiv e generation s o f actor s an d actresse s wil l
keep aliv e fo r centurie s a s thei r chevaux  de  bataille." 5 Thi s chapte r
examines Shaw's post-1950 reception with a focus on the multiple ways in
which performer s an d producer s used Shaw' s characters a s actor vehicles .
The essa y explore s no t onl y stag e production s bu t als o th e film  an d
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broadcast medi a a s i t chart s th e evolutio n o f Shaw' s growin g popularit y
with the general public.

Broadway and West End revivals depend in large measure on casting that
satisfies eac h generation' s desir e t o se e it s stag e celebritie s appea r i n
entertaining roles . Audiences attend these productions primarily to see the
star rather than the play, and Shaw's works receive frequent reviva l in part
because hi s canon offer s dominatin g majo r part s an d satisfie s a  variety of
casting combinations . Candida  offers a n attractiv e femal e sta r tur n an d
thus inspire d revival s featurin g Katharin e Cornel l (wh o appeare d i n five
different stag e productions) , Olivi a d e Havilland, Joanne Woodward, an d
Deborah Kerr . On e appea l o f The  Apple Cart  is its entertaining Interlud e
scene, and it s two character s attracte d pairing s such as Noel Cowar d an d
Margaret Leighto n (1953) , Maurice Evan s and Sign e Hasso (1956) , John
Neville an d Carme n Munro e (1969) , Keit h Michel l an d Penelop e Keit h
(1977), Pete r O'Tool e an d Susanna h Yor k (1986) . Major  Barbara  is a
three-character vehicl e whose many revivals included suc h trios a s Glynis
Johns, Charle s Laughton , Burges s Meredit h (1956 ) an d Jud i Dench ,
Brewster Mason , Richar d Pasc o (1970) . Heartbreak  House  fulfill s th e
commercial formul a fo r th e talent-crusted productio n tha t assemble s i n a
single cas t a n irresistibl e numbe r o f stage , film, and televisio n celebrities .
The 197 5 National Theatre revival of Heartbreak House brought togethe r
Colin Blakely (Shotover), Eileen Atkins (Hesione), Anna Massey (Ariadne),
Kate Nelliga n (Ellie) , Ala n MacNaughta n (Hector) , an d Pau l Roger s
(Magnan). Fillin g thos e sam e role s i n th e 198 3 reviva l a t London' s
Haymarket Theatr e wer e Re x Harrison , Dian a Rigg , Rosemar y Harris ,
Mel Martin, Paxton Whitehead, and Frank Middlemass.

Since most professional revival s exist a s star vehicles , these production s
are no t alway s wel l cast , adequatel y acted , o r thoughtfull y directed .
However, selec t Shavia n character s hol d th e promis e o f th e exceptiona l
dramatic experienc e becaus e thes e role s deman d a  leve l o f performanc e
that draws only the foremost actor s of each era. Saint Joan belongs to this
exclusive category , an d th e litan y o f stag e luminarie s undertakin g th e
challenge includes : Ut a Hagen , Siobha n McKenna , An n Casson , Sia n
Phillips (1950s) ; Zo e Caldwell , Joa n Plowright , Jud i Dench , Jan e Alex -
ander (1960s) ; Angela Pleasence , Lyn n Redgrave , Eilee n Atkin s (1970s) ;
Jane Lapotaire,  France s d e l a Tour , Robert a Maxwell , Nor a McClellan d
(1980s). Eac h acto r sough t t o plac e he r uniqu e stam p o n th e rol e an d
thereby reserve a place in the theatre's pantheon of renowned actors.

Siobhan McKenna' s associatio n wit h Joa n illustrate s th e professiona l
rewards awaitin g th e exceptiona l performance . McKenn a describe s he r
initial attractio n t o th e characte r b y notin g tha t "Sain t Joan , th e mos t
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remarkable woma n wh o eve r existed , stand s fo r th e spiri t o f freedom .
When the Hungarians revolte d I  thought, 'Ho w grea t i s the human spirit ;
when i t ha s n o chanc e t o survive , i t wil l flam e out. ' Th e huma n spiri t i s
Godlike to me."6 This association inspired he r not only to play the role in
1952 but also to provide the production's Gaelic translation. The following
year she performed th e play in English a t the Gate Theatre i n Dublin an d
appeared tw o year s late r i n a  ne w Wes t En d production . I n 195 6 sh e
portrayed th e French peasant gir l at the Phoenix Theatre (Ne w York) and
recorded th e productio n fo r Caemdo n record s befor e embarkin g o n th e
play's European tour . Later McKenna directe d the script and continued t o
perform Joan , mos t notabl y i n he r one-woma n sho w Here  Come  the
Ladies.

If actor s use d Shaw' s role s to furthe r thei r careers , thei r succes s repaid
the playwrigh t b y expandin g hi s popularity . Thi s wa s particularl y tru e
during th e 1950 s whe n a  plethor a o f Ne w Yor k an d Londo n revival s
attracted larg e audiences primaril y becaus e the names appearing ato p the
marquees were Olivier, Leigh, Coward, Hepburn, Clements, and Laughton.
These commercia l venture s enlarge d th e publi c interes t i n Shaw which in
turn motivate d actor s t o appropriat e Shaw' s play s an d perso n a s source s
for thei r ow n dramati c creations . Thes e specia l production s too k severa l
forms, including staged readings, epistolary drama, one-person shows, and
biographical plays.

The semina l even t fo r thes e variou s Shavia n offsprin g wa s Charle s
Laughton's 195 0 concert-style readin g o f Don  Juan in Hell (the third-ac t
dream sequenc e fro m Man  and  Superman),  a  presentatio n featurin g
theatrical celebritie s dressed i n evening attire an d seate d o n stools behin d
microphones. Calle d "Th e Firs t Dramati c Quartette, " th e cas t include d
Charles Boye r (Do n Juan) , Charle s Laughto n (Devil) , Agne s Moorehea d
(Dona Ana) , and Cedri c Hardwick e (Commander) . While the productio n
was eventually hailed a s "one of the most exciting experiences of this and
any other season," 7 its prospective succes s was not immediatel y apparent ,
even to it s playwright. When Laughto n sough t permissio n fo r th e experi -
ment, Sha w cautioned tha t "th e hel l scen e i s such a  queer busines s tha t I
can't advise you to experiment with it, but I should certainly like you to try
it."8

Laughton proceede d wit h th e projec t bu t h e looke d t o th e hinterland s
rather tha n Broadwa y fo r hi s audiences . Th e readin g premiere d i n
Stockton, California , followe d b y a tour o f thirty-four universit y towns in
twenty-three states . Thi s grass-root s approac h dre w a n averag e nightl y
audience of three thousand patrons and generated an impressive quarter of
a million dollars in revenue. The production captured the nation's imagina-
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tion and created a public response typified in a Los Angeles report that "fo r
a singl e night the greatest thril l was provided b y the Firs t Drama Quarte t
[sic] .  . . crowds literally stormed the auditorium to applaud the remarkable
Bernard Sha w presentation."9 Th e reading was the only American theatr e
production invite d t o th e Festiva l o f Britai n wher e i t appeare d i n th e
provinces during the summer months. In September the Quartette resumed
its America n tour , presentin g sixty-tw o performance s befor e arrivin g o n
October 22 , 19 51 in New York City for one performance eac h at Carnegie
Hall an d th e Brookly n Academ y o f Music . The deman d wa s s o frenzie d
that withi n eigh t hour s ever y ticke t wa s sol d wit h th e resul t tha t th e
forgotten seat s fo r th e critic s neede d t o b e repurchase d fro m th e publi c
through newspape r appeals . The respons e compelle d Laughto n t o exten d
his tou r throug h 195 2 an d t o retur n twic e t o Broadway . I n tota l th e
production played to a half million people in forty-two states with revenues
exceeding a million dollars.

Another measure o f the popular appetit e fo r thi s Don Juan in Hell was
the 195 2 issuanc e o f a  two-dis c album ; a s Feli x Grendo n noted , "an y
Shavian ca n no w hav e ninet y minute s o f Hel l i n hi s ow n hom e a t hi s
leisure."10 Thi s wa s a  significan t even t becaus e i t wa s th e first  recorde d
Shaw play and its popularity initiated a new Shavian marketplace. In 1956
RCA Victor produced th e first entire Shaw play, Saint Joan, with Siobha n
McKenna i n th e titula r role.  B y 1975 Sha w plays were issue d b y severa l
different recordin g label s wit h th e Caedmo n catalogu e offerin g seve n
complete play s includin g Pygmalion,  Misalliance, and John Bull's  Other
Island.

Given the extraordinary artistic and fiscal success of Don Juan in Hell, it
is not surprising that other s repeated Laughton' s formula. I n the 1955-5 6
season Agne s Moorehea d directe d a  Lo s Angele s productio n featurin g
Ricardo Montalban , Kur t Kasmar , Mar y Astor , an d Reginal d Denny . I n
1973 Montalban , Edwar d Mulhare , Moorehead , an d Pau l Henrei d
presented thei r versio n a t Broadway' s Palac e Theatr e fo r twenty-fou r
performances before undertaking a coast-to-coast tour.

Laughton's experiment also prompted other Shavian creations. Shaw was
a prolifi c an d entertainin g lette r writer , an d performance s base d o n hi s
correspondence contain the double appeal of a  Shaw impersonation an d a
glimpse int o hi s persona l life . I n 195 2 Sara h Churchil l an d Edwar d
Tommen devise d an d performe d Affair  of  Letters,  whic h presente d th e
correspondence betwee n Sha w an d th e Victoria n era' s leadin g femal e
performer, Ellen Terry. In 1959 two other versions were created, one for an
unrealized production involvin g James Mason and another fo r a  Caemdon
recording featuring Peggy Ashcroft and Cyril Cusack.
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One o f th e mos t popula r o f thi s genr e wa s Jerom e Kilty' s Dear  Liar,
which translate s int o dialogu e th e charming , forty-yea r correspondenc e
between Sha w an d acto r Mrs . Patrick Campbell . Th e firs t ac t center s o n
their brie f lov e affai r an d th e Londo n premier e o f Pygmalion  that Sha w
directed an d i n which Campbel l played Eliza ; the secon d ac t explores the
postwar years and the The Apple Carfs Interlude scene that Shaw based on
their relationship. The production includes brief scenes from th e two plays
and an episodic musical score.

This letter-dram a owe s it s initia l commercia l succes s t o it s star-vehicl e
potential. Th e letter s wer e publishe d i n 1952 , an d fiv e year s late r Kilt y
created an d performe d hi s sho w fo r variou s benefit s befor e seekin g play -
wright Lillia n Hellman' s advice on professional possibilities . Hellman sent
the scrip t t o tw o prominen t Shavia n performers , Elisabet h Bergne r an d
Katharine Cornell , both o f whom eagerl y agreed to portray th e legendar y
Campbell. I n Marc h 195 9 th e firs t professiona l productio n o f Dear  Liar
opened a t th e Sombrer o Playhous e (Phoenix) , starrin g Katharin e Cornel l
and Bria n Ahearn, an d the n toured smal l towns and college campuses fo r
two months . I n Octobe r Elisabet h Bergne r premiere d Dear  Liar  a t th e
Berlin Festival , whil e simultaneousl y Cornel l commence d a  secon d tou r
leading t o a  Broadwa y opening . The pla y wa s selecte d a s America's onl y
representative to the International Drama Festival , which in turn induced a
West En d appearance . Dear  Liar  won severa l distinguishe d internationa l
awards and received frequent productions , including a 19 81 Hallmark Hall
of Fam e televisio n presentatio n starrin g Jan e Alexande r an d Georg e
Hermann. I t als o inspire d othe r epistolar y drama s includin g piece s based
on Shaw' s correspondence s wit h a  Catholi c nun , th e wido w o f a n Arcti c
explorer, th e firs t Englis h actres s o f Ibsen , a  romanticall y determine d
student nurse, and a woman who believed her child was switched at birth.

Another popular form o f Shavian entertainment t o emerge following hi s
death wa s th e one-perso n show , a  tour  de  force  i n whic h a n acto r
impersonating Sha w recall s hi s life . On e o f th e mos t endurin g an d
endearing o f these vehicles was Michael Vorsey' s An Evening  with G.B.S.
(later title d By  George),  which premiere d a t th e 196 6 Edinburgh Festiva l
and featured th e preeminent classical actor Max Adrian. This biographical
portrait use s onl y thre e chairs , a  table , a  ha t stand , an d tw o change s of
makeup; i t draw s fro m Shaw' s letters , essays , an d criticis m t o char t hi s
creative lif e fro m hi s 187 6 London arriva l to a  touching television broad -
cast shortl y befor e hi s death . Alon g th e journe y Sha w discover s Fabia n
socialism, court s hi s futur e spouse , encounter s Isador a Duncan , an d
expounds upon sex, religion, vivisection, doctors, and vegetarianism.

Following th e premiere , thi s livin g biograph y playe d i n th e Wes t End ,
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toured Englan d an d Norther n Ireland , an d visite d th e Unite d States . I n
1968 Adria n returne d t o Londo n fo r thre e performance s a t th e Quee n
Elizabeth Hal l befor e embarkin g upo n a  world tour . Adrian recorde d hi s
performance an d continue d t o presen t th e sho w unti l hi s deat h i n 1973 .
Three year s late r Iris h acto r Done l Donnell y presente d a  revise d versio n
entitled "My Astonishing Self."

The public's fascination wit h Shaw also spawned script s based upon the
Irishman's life . The  Shaws of Synge Street (i960) portray s Shaw' s adoles-
cence, and The  Bashful  Genius  (1958) focuse s o n Shaw' s courtship o f his
future spouse . A  Fig  Leaf in  Her  Bonnet  (1961 ) capture s th e tensio n o f
Shaw's 1912-1 4 flirtatio n wit h Mrs . Patric k Campbell , whil e The  First
Night of  Pygmalion (1966) has its two actors portray some forty differen t
individuals involve d i n th e tempestuou s rehearsal s fo r th e play' s Londo n
premiere. Shaw' s associations wit h othe r artist s ar e depicted i n stage an d
television scripts such as The Magnificent Humbug (1958) , which examines
the dramatist's relationship with William Archer and Beatrice Potter Webb;
The Ghost of Adelphi Terrace  (1975) , which portrays Shaw's 1911 discus-
sions with fellow playwrigh t an d neighbor James Barrie ; and Isadora  and
GB (1977) , which concern s Sha w and dance r Isador a Duncan . There ar e
even play s concerne d wit h Shaw' s afterlif e -  Bernard  Shaw in  Heaven
(1952) and Bernard Shaw Arrives (1953).

Actors were no t th e onl y artist s t o mol d Shaw' s play s an d lif e t o thei r
own ends . Film directors an d composer s als o discovered enticin g materia l
for thei r own creations which in turn introduce d Sha w to a  far large r and
different audience .

In 1914 Shaw observed that the cinema will "form the mind of England.
The nationa l conscience , th e nationa l ideal s an d test s o f conduc t wil l b e
those of the film."11 Shaw was a political playwright intent on changing the
world, an d th e cinem a offere d th e opportunit y t o reac h an d influenc e
millions rather than thousands of people. While Shaw sought to penetrat e
this new industry and use it to preach his Fabian ideas, he moved cautiously
because of a concern that studios were interested only in his reputation and
would reshap e hi s script s int o mer e amusements . H e refuse d man y film
proposals, including a  192 0 offer o f one million dollars for the film rights
to all his plays. He also wrote his own screenplays and crafted contract s to
forbid textua l alterations . Consequently , th e majo r artisti c accomplish -
ments in film versions of Shaw's plays occurred during his lifetime, with the
productions o f Pygmalion  (1938), Major Barbara (1941) , and Caesar  and
Cleopatra (1945). Still, as the fate o f Pygmalion  demonstrates, he was not
completely successful in controlling what reached the public.

In 192 7 Shaw received a proposal for a  silent film version of Pygmalion
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to sta r Lyn n Fontanne , who ha d appeare d a s Eliza i n a  recen t Broadwa y
production sanctione d b y Shaw . Nevertheless , Sha w rejecte d th e offe r
because his form of drama rested on witty and thought-provoking dialogu e
that wa s no t reducibl e t o subtitles . Sha w explaine d tha t "askin g m e t o
write a  dumb sho w i s rather lik e asking Titian t o paint portrait s i n black
and white."12

By 1934 sound came to the movies, and it appeared tha t the first film of
Pygmalion would b e a  Franco-Italia n production . However , whe n Sha w
read th e screenplay , h e rejecte d th e proposal . No t onl y wer e scene s
rearranged an d passage s transpose d bu t als o a  ne w scen e wa s adde d i n
which Eliz a purchase d a  necktie fo r Higgins , an erroneous readin g o f the
play's final moments during which Eliza defiantly refused Higgins' s order to
buy him new gloves and a  tie. This impulse to romanticize Shaw' s conclu-
sion bega n wit h th e play' s Londo n premier e whe n it s Higgin s tosse d a
bouquet o f flower s fro m hi s balcony t o th e departin g Eliza . Mrs . Patric k
Campbell compounde d th e proble m o n he r America n tou r whe n sh e
concluded th e sho w b y returnin g t o as k Higgin s "Wha t size? " Bot h
performers catere d t o th e audience' s desir e fo r a  Cinderell a ending , an d
future producer s continued th e practice despite Shaw's protestations, clar-
ifications, and textual revisions. It is little wonder, then, that Shaw rejected
the Franco-Italian proposal and set about writing his own screenplay.

Two Europea n film  version s o f Pygmalion  appeared durin g th e nex t
three years. Despite a contract forbidding textual changes, the German film
added ne w materia l includin g a  final scene i n which walt z musi c accom -
panies Higgins' s romanti c reques t tha t Eliz a sta y wit h him . Th e 193 7
Dutch versio n wa s equall y distastefu l t o Sha w becaus e i t conclude d wit h
Higgins followin g Eliz a t o church , wher e th e coupl e exchange d lovin g
glances a s the y witnesse d th e marriag e o f he r father . Bot h films  wer e
commercial successes, but the only words Shaw could find to describe them
were "blunder," "abomination," and "loathe."

Shaw took a  fa r mor e activ e rol e in the 193 8 Britis h film. Its produce r
was a n enigmati c Hungaria n wh o arrive d o n Shaw' s doorste p i n 1935 ,
announced tha t a n Indian guru had foretold tha t h e was fated t o produc e
Shaw's films,  an d demande d Pygmalion.  Gabrie l Pasca l wo n Shaw' s
confidence an d th e film rights. Still , despite Pascal' s promise tha t th e film
would us e only Shaw' s words, Shaw revised the screenplay an d adde d a n
unequivocal endin g i n which Higgin s delight s a t a  vision o f th e futur e i n
which the happily married Eliza and Freddy operate a florist sho p in South
Kensington. Sha w participate d i n casting , securin g hi s choic e fo r Eliz a
(Wendy Hiller) but not for Higgins (Charles Laughton), who was portrayed
by matinee-idol Leslie Howard. Shaw also attended the first day of filming
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and sen t Pasca l note s o f advic e durin g th e shooting . On e missiv e i n
particular reflected Shaw' s lingering concern: "It is amazing how hopelessly
wrong Leslie is. However, the public will like him and probably want him
to marry Eliza, which is just what I don't want."13

The studio disliked Shaw's ending, and Pascal authorized two alternative
versions. The final cut contained a  new ending that again subverted Shaw's
intention b y having Eliza return to Higgins. One might wonder why Shaw
did no t tak e lega l actio n t o bloc k th e film's release. In par t h e could no t
because Pascal achieved this effect withou t altering a line of the text, for he
borrowed earlie r dialogu e (som e ove r th e voic e recording phonograp h i n
Higgins's laboratory ) an d directe d th e actors ' facia l expression s t o leav e
little doub t abou t th e couple' s emotiona l relationship . Th e film  wa s
extremely popular , earne d Sha w £25,00 0 i n a  singl e year , an d wa s re -
released i n 194 4 an d agai n i n 1948 . It als o received severa l internationa l
cinema awards , including the Academy Award fo r th e bes t screenplay , an
Oscar that must have caused Shaw at least a moment of consternation.

The films made following Shaw' s death fully justified hi s caution because
for th e most part they reduced his scripts to star turns and crowd-pleasin g
entertainment. Androcles  and  the  Lion  (1952 ) wit h Jea n Simmon s an d
Victor Mature , and The  Devil's Disciple  (1959) with Bur t Lancaster , Kirk
Douglas, an d Laurenc e Olivie r devolve d int o simpl e lov e stories . Ott o
Preminger mad e a  romanti c spectacl e o f Saint  Joan (1957) , whil e Great
Catherine (1968 ) serve d a s a  serie s o f farcica l opportunitie s fo r Zer o
Mostel an d Pete r O'Toole . Th e Germa n version s o f Arms  and  the  Man
(1958) and Mrs. Warren's Profession (i960 ) were without distinction. The
Doctor's Dilemma  (1958 ) feature d Dir k Bogard e and Lesli e Caron , while
The Millionairess  (i960) provide d a  comi c vehicl e fo r Sophi a Lore n an d
Peter Sellers . The most popular o f these Shaw-inspired films was one tha t
Shaw never would have tolerated, My Fair Lady (1964).

Shaw had n o interest i n musical theatre a s such. He rejected a  lucrative
offer t o writ e a  librett o fo r a  Col e Porte r oper a an d -  i n defenc e o f th e
vocal musi c inheren t i n hi s dialogu e -  rejecte d proposal s t o tur n The
Devil's Disciple  and Captain  Brassbound's Conversion into musicals . He
also refuse d al l request s t o adap t Pygmalion.  I n respons e t o compose r
Franz Lehar's plan for a  light opera , Shaw wrote "i f they attempt to use a
word o f m y dialogue , o r t o connec t m y name o r m y play i n an y way t o
their abominable opera I  will let loose all the engines of the Copyright law
to destro y the m utterly. " I n 194 8 Sha w turned dow n a  reques t t o se t the
play to music , and a  proposal involvin g Noel Cowar d wit h th e insistenc e
that "M y decisio n a s to Pygmalion i s final: let me hear no more abou t it .
This is final."14

316



Cambridge Companions Online © Cambridge University Press, 2006

Shaw and the popular context

Following Shaw' s death , however , Gabrie l Pasca l secure d th e right s t o
musicalize Pygmalion.  H e wa s th e appropriate  perso n t o overse e th e
project becaus e Shaw' s wil l grante d hi m al l fil m right s an d therefor e th e
1938 spectacle scenes that were indispensable to any musical version. With
the assistance of the Theatre Guild , Pascal obtained the full right s in April
1952; however, there were still sizable obstacles in writing and casting.

The majo r difficult y wa s th e incompatibilit y betwee n Shaw' s pla y an d
the prevailing formula fo r a  Broadway musical . The main story contained
no lov e interest ; th e subplo t lacke d onstag e development ; an d th e cas t
provided n o ensembl e fo r dancin g an d chora l numbers . Richard Rodger s
and Osca r Hammerstei n worke d o n th e projec t fo r a  yea r befor e con -
cluding tha t the y coul d no t shap e Shaw' s scrip t int o th e kin d o f musica l
expected b y Broadwa y audiences . Othe r composer s approache d withou t
success include d Fran k Loesser , Howar d Dietz , Col e Porter , an d Gian -
Carlo Menotti . In 195 2 Alan Jay Lerner an d Frederick Loew e worked fo r
six month s befor e als o abandonin g th e project . I n 195 3 a  discourage d
Pascal sought unsuccessfully firs t to interest Leonard Bernstein and then to
sell his option to Otto Preminger . It was only following Pascal' s death and
after Lerne r secured the rights from bot h the Shaw and Pascal estates tha t
the musical proceeded.

My.Fair Lady also faced seriou s casting problems because many leading
performers believe d tha t a  Shavia n musica l woul d fai l an d hesitate d t o
jeopardize thei r professiona l reputations . Lerne r an d Loew e wrot e th e
music an d lyric s wit h Mar y Marti n i n mind , bu t sh e refuse d th e role ;
Deanna Durbi n an d Dolore s Gra y wer e als o considere d befor e eighteen -
year-old Julie Andrews was selected. Simila r problems plagued th e casting
of Higgins. Michael Redgrave declined the role and Rex Harrison was not
initially enthusiasti c becaus e h e was not a  singer . Other actor s considere d
included George Sanders, John Gielgud, and Noel Coward.

My Fair Lady (cockne y slang for th e Mayfair Lad y that Eliz a aspires to
become) opene d o n Marc h 15 , 195 6 an d ra n fo r si x and a  hal f year s o n
Broadway (2,71 7 performances ) an d si x year s i n Londo n (2,28 1 perfor -
mances). The ticke t deman d wa s so large fo r th e 195 7 nationa l tou r tha t
one observer quipped that the musical "will probably go down in theatrical
history a s the show that had to turn bac k more money than i t took in." 15

The respons e i n Detroit , fo r instance , wa s tha t "M y Fair  Lady actuall y
became a  household wor d i n our city. Never before ha s such interest been
shown fo r an y attractio n i n th e city' s 169-yea r history." 16 Th e sho w
remained popula r with Broadway audiences after i t closed in 1962 , for it s
first reviva l came only twenty month s late r an d agai n i n 1968 , 1976 , and
1981.
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The Warne r Brothers ' fil m versio n opene d i n 196 4 ami d controvers y
because th e studi o passe d ove r Julie Andrews , who i t believe d lacke d th e
star statu s require d fo r th e internationa l marketplace . Instead , Audre y
Hepburn played Eliza and Marni Nixon dubbed her songs. The studio first
sought Car y Grant to play Higgins, but he responded tha t not only would
he not accep t th e rol e bu t h e would no t se e the film unles s Rex Harriso n
appeared. The studio also considered Rock Hudson for Higgins and James
Cagney fo r Doolittle . The fil m wo n numerou s award s includin g bot h th e
American an d Britis h academ y award s fo r bes t pictur e o f th e year ; bu t
ironically th e Osca r fo r bes t actres s tha t yea r wen t t o th e rejecte d Juli e
Andrews for her performance in Mary Poppins.

The musical' s extraordinar y popularit y stirre d interes t i n other Shavia n
scripts. As Lerner whimsically observed, " I was told the day after My  Fair
Lady opened tha t ther e was not a  theatrical agen t available in New York.
All o f the m wer e a t th e library " readin g Shaw' s othe r plays. 17 Thos e
seeking to replicate th e success of My Fair  Lady  soon discovered , though ,
that Shaw's plays do not easily adapt.

Androcles and the  Lion  wa s th e nex t Sha w scrip t t o receiv e a  musica l
treatment. With a book by Peter Store and music by Richard Rodgers , this
work premiere d t o a  nationwid e audienc e o n Novembe r 15 , 196 7 i n a
ninety-minute NB C televisio n specia l featurin g Norma n Wisdom , Ing a
Swenson, and Noel Coward. The production radically abridged Shaw's text
to accommodate th e time limitations , commercials, and musica l numbers .
A large r proble m wa s Rodgers' s music , whic h lacke d th e satir e an d wi t
needed b y a Shavian composer . Despite solid acting performances , critica l
reaction was very unfavorable.

The following yea r a  musical based on Caesar  and Cleopatra  fared littl e
better. Her First Roman opene d o n Broadway starrin g Lesli e Uggams and
Richard Kile y and includin g eyebrow-raising musica l titles such as "What
Are We Doing i n Egypt, " "Hai l t o th e Sphinx, " an d "Caesa r i s Wrong."
Clive Barnes encapsulated bes t perhaps th e genera l critica l reactio n whe n
he wrot e tha t "Speakin g frankly , I  think yo u woul d b e bette r advise d t o
hang around unti l 'Her Second Roman' turns up."18 The production closed
after seventeen performances and lost $575,000.

It was a decade before anothe r Shavia n musical appeared an d then only
on the regional theatre level . In 197 9 Peter Ekstrom se t two Shaw one-act
plays to music in Matrimomium: Overruled  Passion, Poison,  and Petrifac-
tion tha t premiere d a t th e Actors ' Studi o o f Louisville . Th e first  ac t se t
Overruled to music with appropriately bombasti c song titles such as "Oh,
Guilt! Ho w Grea t Tho u Art, " whil e th e secon d ac t presente d Passion,
Poison, and Petrifaction  with playful tune s such as "What D o You Think
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of My Bust?" and "Sleep , Dear Adolphine, Sleep!" The production ran fo r
nine performances.

The most persevering effort t o create musical adaptations of Shaw's plays
involves Benny Green . His firs t effort , a  musical biograph y entitle d Boots
with Strawberry  Jam, premiere d a t th e Nottingha m Playhous e t o a  les s
than enthusiasti c response . I n 1983 , however , Gree n an d Denni s Kin g
premiered Bashville,  a musica l versio n o f Shaw' s stag e adaptatio n o f hi s
novel The Admirable Bashville at Regent's Park Open Air theatre; the show
was so popular that it was revived at the same venue the following summer.
Green turned hi s attention next to You  Never Can Tell with the result that
in 199 2 Valentine's  Day premiere d a t th e prestigiou s Chicheste r Festiva l
before transferring to London's West End.

While the cinema and the musical introduced Sha w to new audiences, it
was the mas s media tha t brough t hi m int o millions o f homes . In it s long
Broadway run My Fair  Lady  playe d to some three million people ; on one
night i n 195 9 a  televisio n versio n o f Misalliance  reached approximatel y
twenty million viewers . It was this potential audienc e that attracte d Sha w
to the broadcast media, and i t was these media that were most responsible
for the expansion of the Shaw audience in the years immediately followin g
his death.

Shaw participated i n the early development of both radio and television.
British radi o broadcastin g commence d i n 192 2 an d immediatel y sough t
Shaw's assistanc e t o len d hi s internationa l reputatio n t o it s struggl e fo r
credibility. I n 192 4 Sha w appeare d i n perso n t o rea d O'Flaherty  VC ,
assuming th e differen t characters ' voice s an d eve n singin g "Tipperary. "
Two years later the first Shaw play was acted on radio. Shaw also appeared
on BB C television's inaugura l progra m o n Novembe r 2 , 1936 , an d eigh t
months late r How  He  Lied  to  Her  Husband  becam e th e firs t televise d
Shavian play. While Shaw encouraged an d approved subsequent radio and
television presentations , he did so only i f producers presented hi s plays in
their entiret y an d withou t alterations . H e als o insiste d o n approvin g th e
costs an d monitore d broadcasts.  H e reacte d t o a  192 9 productio n o f
Captain Brassbound's Conversion by writing to the BBC director tha t the
broadcast's "infam y wa s such that I  hereby solemnly renounce, curse, and
excommunicate everybody who had a hand in it. .  . If the producer has not
already been shot, I will pay for the cartridges."19

Shaw's restriction s cause d fewe r difficultie s i n Englan d becaus e bot h
radio an d televisio n wer e governmen t controlle d an d therefor e abl e t o
schedule without concern for rigid time blocks or advertising interruptions.
This freedo m allowe d BB C radio t o presen t Shavia n production s suc h a s
the complete Saint Joan starring Constance Cummings (1941 and 1947) . In
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the Unite d States , however , Shaw' s condition s severel y constraine d th e
airing of his plays. A 1946 radio broadcast of Pygmalion was only possible
by dividing the presentation into two parts; the first televised Shaw play did
not occur until 194 6 when the sketch Great  Catherine filled a sixty minute
program slot.

Following Shaw's death, however, radio immediately embraced th e Irish
playwright becaus e hi s plays were no w fre e fro m productio n limitations .
On Ma y 6 , 195 1 Katharin e Cornel l starre d i n a  one-hou r radi o versio n
(with commercials) o f Candida.  BB C radio broadcast Shaw's plays both in
complete an d abridge d for m includin g a  Sha w festiva l tha t presente d
twelve Sha w masterpieces i n a  six month perio d (1952 ) an d the complet e
Back to Methuselah (1958). Shaw was a staple of British radio drama, fo r
between 1950 and 197 5 BBC radio presented forty-one Shaw plays and ten
programs about Shaw for a total of nearly two hundred performances. 20

The liftin g o f Shaw' s restriction s cam e a t a  propitiou s tim e fo r th e
American television industry because it was just entering its boom years. In
1951 networ k televisio n linke d th e country , bu t th e industr y lacke d
programming. Live drama came to the rescue as the industry wed shrunken
versions of established masterpieces with popular radio and film celebrities.
In the nex t seven years "ove r five thousand drama s i n a new form wit h a
new emphasis were broadcast to the largest audiences in history."21

The Shavia n dram a foun d a  prominen t plac e o n televisio n becaus e i t
provided th e kin d o f entertainin g theatr e an d sta r vehicle s tha t attracte d
audiences. In January 195 2 NBC's Robert Montgomery Present s televised
Cash el Byron's Profession, featuring Charleto n Heston and June Lockhart .
CBS responded wit h Omnibus , whic h ove r fou r season s presente d trun -
cated version s o f Arms  and  the  Man  (Nanett e Fabray) , Man  of  Destiny
(Alan Badel), the trial scene from Saint  Joan (Kim Hunter), and Androcles
and the Lion (Ber t Lahr). NBC replied with a Cameo Theatre presentation
of Inca of Perusalem (Cedri c Hardwicke), and a Playhouse 90 broadcast of
Misalliance (Claire Bloom, Robert Morley, Siobhan McKenna).

The networks ' competitivenes s i s reflecte d i n it s varie d approache s t o
Caesar and Cleopatra,  a  scrip t particularl y wel l know n t o audience s
because of the 1952 Broadway revival starring Laurence Olivier and Vivien
Leigh. In 195 6 NBC's Producer's Showcase presented the play with a  star-
studded cas t includin g Clair e Bloom , Cedri c Hardwicke , Cyri l Richard ,
Farley Grainger , Anthon y Quayle , an d Judit h Anderson . AB C sough t t o
capitalize on the public's anticipation b y showing the 194 5 film version of
the play th e da y prior t o the NB C event . In 195 9 CB S presented it s ow n
production starring Maurice Evans and Piper Laurie.

The majority o f these early television dramas did little justice to Shaw' s
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plays. Producer s generall y emasculate d hi s script s int o amusin g episode s
that fitted between advertisements and that spotlighted performers who too
often lacke d th e trainin g t o handl e Shaw' s language . Review s fo r th e
ninety-minute Omnibu s Arms and the Man, for example , complained tha t
the textua l cut s wer e diabolical , th e productio n poorl y cast , an d th e
comedy totally lost . Moreover , with commercial s an d a  long introductio n
by Alistair Cooke , barely a n hour wa s devoted t o th e pla y itself . Still , an
estimated thirteen million viewers saw the production.

In th e 1956-5 7 seaso n magneti c tapin g replace d liv e productions , bu t
the drama remaine d a  popular programmin g element . Its most prestigiou s
representative wa s the Hallmark Hal l o f Fame because it s careful casting ,
high production values , and uninterrupte d presentation s produce d qualit y
television drama . It s first Shavian offering wa s a  ninety-minute versio n of
The Devil's  Disciple  (1955) wit h Mauric e Evans , Ralph Bellamy , Theresa
Wright, an d Margare t Hamilton . Ove r th e nex t doze n seasons , the serie s
presented Man and Superman (1956) with Maurice Evans and Joan Green-
wood; Captain  Brassbound's  Conversion  (i960) starrin g Gree r Garson ,
Christopher Plummer , Georg e Rose , an d Rober t Redford ; Pygmalion
(1963) featurin g Juli e Harris ; an d Saint  Joan  (1967 ) wit h Geneviev e
Bujold, Mauric e Evans , Raymond Massey , Rodd y McDowall , an d Davi d
Birney. Als o notabl e wa s th e WNDT-T V (Ne w York ) Sunday  Showcase
production o f Heartbreak  House, presented i n it s entirety wit h onl y one-
minute uncommercia l break s an d sponsore d b y th e Bristol-Myer s
company; th e distinguishe d cas t include d Mauric e Evan s (Shotover) , Lois
Nettleton (Ellie) , Eilee n Herli e (Hesione) , Margare t Leighto n (Ariadne) ,
Edward Mulhare (Hector) , and George Rose (burglar).

British televisio n als o mad e extensiv e us e o f Shaw' s play s durin g th e
decade followin g hi s death . Constanc e Cummings' s 195 1 appearanc e i n
Saint Joan was arguably the television event of the year. By 1956 the BBC
reported that it had virtually achieved its goal of providing television broad-
casting to the entire United Kingdom. That year viewers enjoyed productions
of Pygmalion, You Never Can  Tell, and The  Dark Lady of the Sonnets; in
1957, The  Devil's  Disciple  and Getting  Married; an d i n 1958 , The Apple
Cart an d Heartbreak  House.  Als o i n 195 6 commercia l televisio n com -
menced, and it s initial theatrical presentation was The  Man of Destiny. In
subsequent year s British television offere d th e public Shavia n production s
cast with prominen t stag e figures. In 196 8 Maggi e Smit h an d Eri c Porte r
appeared in Man and Superman; subsequently John Gielgud portrayed King
Charles an d Captai n Shotover . Othe r notabl e performance s includ e Lyn n
Redgrave a s Eliza Dootlittle , Geraldin e McEwa n a s Candida , Judi Denc h
and Zoe Caldwell as Major Barbara, and Peter O'Toole as John Tanner.
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One result of these Shavian broadcasts was a considerable increase in the
popular appreciatio n o f Shaw' s dramati c works , a n increas e tha t le d
literary criti c Edmun d Wilso n t o pronounc e tha t "Ther e i s no w a n
automatic Sha w audience." 22 This developmen t stimulate d th e emergenc e
of another cultural avenue by which Shaw reached the public, the dramatic
festival.

A festival i s a larger-than-usual numbe r o f plays offered i n a condensed
time perio d fo r th e purpos e o f honorin g th e dramatist . Perhap s th e bes t
known drama festival opened in 1879 at Stratford-upon-Avon, England , to
recognize Willia m Shakespeare . Stratfor d becam e th e worl d cente r o f
Shakespearean production , an d patron s mad e th e pilgrimag e t o thi s
cultural retrea t t o visi t it s museu m an d librar y a s wel l a s t o atten d
productions staged by its resident professional company . In 1929 Sir Barry
Jackson bega n th e Malver n Festiva l an d dedicate d i t t o Shaw' s genius .
Unlike Stratford , though , Malver n possesse d a  patro n wh o supplie d th e
festival wit h ne w play s an d mingle d wit h it s audiences . The first  season
lasted tw o week s and presente d i n repertory th e Englis h premier e o f The
Apple Cart,  Heartbreak House, Caesar and Cleopatra, and the five plays of
Back to  Methuselah.  Birmingha m Repertor y Theatr e (als o founde d an d
directed by Barry Jackson) supplied the core acting company that included
Cedric Hardwicke and Edith Evans. The festival wa s presented i n a newly
renovated nine-hundred seat theatre where a different pla y was staged each
evening s o tha t th e one-wee k visito r coul d atten d th e entir e season' s
offerings. I n 193 4 the festival expande d to four weeks . In its initial eleven
seasons Malvern presented a  total o f nineteen Shaw scripts (including two
world premieres) as well as the works of forty other playwrights.

A visit to Malvern offered mor e than theatrical incentives . Located in an
idyllic spa town in the Malvern hills and with particularly pleasant summer
weather, th e festiva l presente d a  tantalizin g arra y o f recreational , social ,
and educational activities. Professors presented morning lectures about that
evening's play , while gues t artist s offered entertainin g afternoo n te a talks .
There wer e hike s an d donke y ride s int o th e hills ; fol k dancing , putting ,
swimming, boating , bowling ; garde n parties , travelin g exhibitions , films,
and a  marionette theatre . Following the evening performance, ther e was a
pool for night swimming or an orchestra for dancing.

The Malvern Festival ended with the outbreak of war, but it inspired the
creation o f othe r Sha w festivals . I n 1934 , for example , Jasper Deete r an d
his Hedgerow Theatre outsid e Philadelphia presente d a  professional Sha w
festival comprise d o f si x Shavia n work s produce d i n repertory . Deete r
repeated th e festiva l eac h summe r an d create d innovativ e programmin g
such as the 1937 season that ran for four weeks and presented twelve Shaw
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plays chronologically t o focus attentio n o n Shaw's intellectual and drama -
turgical development . The theatre' s 193 9 season included a  production of
the complete Man  and Superman  that bega n a t seven-thirt y an d ende d in
time for patron s to catch the one-thirty trolley. The festival existe d fo r ten
summers, ceasin g onl y afte r th e draf t deplete d th e actin g company . I n
England durin g th e wa r th e Lyri c Theatr e (Hammersmith ) produce d a
mobile version of a Shaw festival when its Touring Bernard Shaw Repertory
Company travele d fo r fiftee n week s throughout th e islan d presentin g five
Shavian works . I n 1 9 51 Basi l Langto n attempte d t o creat e a  permanen t
Shaw festival o n the island o f Martha's Vineyard (Massachusetts) , bu t the
venture lapsed after tw o summers. By the early 1960s , however, there were
calls for th e establishment o f a  permanent professiona l Sha w festival , an d
the coming years saw the creation of Shaw festivals in rural, suburban, and
urban settings.

In 196 2 Bria n Doherty , a  Toront o lawye r wit h twenty-fiv e year s o f
experience as a theatre producer and playwright, founded a n annual Shaw
festival i n the small town of Niagara-on-the Lake, Ontario, Canada, where
he resided . Th e initia l seaso n assemble d a  compan y o f loca l actor s an d
presented fou r performance s eac h o f Candida  and Don  Juan in Hell  in a
small theatr e locate d i n th e town' s Victoria n courthouse . B y 196 6 a
professional compan y headed by Barry Morse and including Zoe Caldwell,
Pat Galloway , Lesli e Yeo , and Paxto n Whitehea d presente d a  nine-wee k
season of Man and Superman, Misalliance, and The Apple Cart. Today The
Shaw (as the festival is informally called) offers a n April-October season of
some ten plays and over seven hundred performances i n three theatres by a
resident professional compan y of seventy actors under the artistic direction
of Christophe r Newton . Th e festiva l present s no t onl y Shaw' s play s bu t
also those written b y dramatists during Shaw' s long lifetime. I n 1995 , the
theatre sold more than 290,00 0 tickets for a  season presenting three Shaw
plays, two musicals, a  murder mystery and fou r classic s from th e modern
repertory.

The Shaw is far mor e than a  commercial enterprise; it serves as a center
of Sha w stud y an d appreciation . Th e festiva l offer s a  lunchtim e readin g
series, Frida y chats , Saturda y conversations , an d post-performanc e talk -
back sessions . Its Academy sponsor s publi c educationa l activitie s suc h a s
annual Sha w seminars , teachers ' days , an d youn g audienc e programs .
Moreover, its productions reach for more than entertainment an d homage;
they see k t o enlarg e th e understandin g o f Shaw' s dramaturg y b y minin g
unexamined textua l area s an d b y explorin g ho w hi s script s addres s
contemporary concerns . One value of a  cultural institution lik e The Shaw
is it s ongoin g engagemen t wit h a  scrip t wit h th e resul t tha t eac h ne w
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28 Themati c interpretations - a  laboratory of language: Michael Ball as Colonel Pickering,
Andrew Gillies as Henry Higgins, and Joan Orenstein as Mrs. Pearce in the Shaw Festival's

1992 production of Pygmalion

production develop s upo n an d contribute s t o a  riche r understandin g o f a
text and its production possibilities . Pygmalion has been staged four times,
once i n eac h o f th e pas t fou r decades , al l with differen t director s an d al l
markedly differen t i n ton e an d themati c focus . Thi s continuou s textua l
reexamination save s Shaw's plays from bein g relegated t o amusing period
pieces and permit s provocative ne w staging approaches tha t allo w Shaw's
ideas to continue to address and influence the modern world.

The festival' s 199 3 production o f Saint  Joan provides a  salient exampl e
of th e powe r o f theatrica l revisionism . Directo r Nei l Munr o shifte d th e
play's location from fifteenth century France to a modern, eastern European
combat zon e no t unlik e Bosnia . Th e stag e worl d o f thi s productio n wa s
composed of a raked floor, two large rotating columns, and a giant crucifix,
to whic h individua l scene s adde d th e accouterment s o f moder n warfar e
such as machine guns, a jeep, field telephones, computers, paper shredders,
and amphibious fighter craft. The dress was modern with Joan appearing at
various times in khaki, camouflage, a  bomber jacket, and a dress uniform .
Munro explained that "I'm not interested in history; I'm interested in living
today. .  . I'm always looking for new ways to approach old subject matter
and make i t relevant - giv e people a  really thoughtful evenin g of what we
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are, where we've come from, ho w we're handlin g i t (and ) 'Ar e we indeed
any differen t no w tha n wher e w e wer e then?'" 23 B y transformin g th e
script's Hundred Years ' War into a  Bosnian-like holocaust , Munro sough t
to have the audience not only identify mor e fully with the social chaos and
political agendas that explained the emergence of a Joan and the conserva-
tive reactio n tha t destroye d he r bu t als o understan d th e immediat e rele -
vance o f Shaw' s epilogue argumen t that , despit e the current reverenc e fo r
the image of Joan, society would execute her again if she returned becaus e
her ideas are still too threatening.

Munro di d no t begi n hi s rehearsals i n the traditiona l manne r o f a  cas t
reading of the script; he showed film footage of atrocities committed during
the Bosnia n wa r an d the n provide d th e actor s a  perio d o f persona l
contemplation i n a  nearb y church . H e als o di d no t begi n hi s productio n
with Shaw' s initia l scene , bu t adde d a  prologu e compose d o f a  violen t
dumb sho w i n whic h moder n refugee s wearin g hospita l gown s wer e
gunned dow n b y militi a carryin g automati c weapons . Th e curtai n the n
lowered an d th e prologue' s staccato , pulsatin g musi c continued unti l th e
curtain rose again, this time on Shaw's opening scene.

Having prepare d th e audienc e t o vie w th e actio n wit h contemporar y
sensibilities, Munro provide d a  mise-en-scene  tha t placed the plot's events
in a modern time frame. Joan's initia l meeting with the Dauphin occurre d
before a military map that she ripped from its easel in her eagerness to raise
the sieg e o f Orleans . While sh e an d Dunoi s awaite d favorabl e condition s
for crossin g the Loire , they sa t upo n th e hood o f a  jeep examining map s
and plannin g strategy . Caucho n an d Warwic k me t belo w th e massiv e
wingtip of a  military bombe r in the English camp (see illus. 19) where the
two sipped tea and plotted Joan's downfall; their discussion was punctuated
by nearb y gunfir e an d heav y artiller y tha t a t moment s drowne d th e
dialogue. Joan' s confrontatio n wit h th e Frenc h cour t occurre d aroun d a
long conference tabl e under fluorescent lighting. The inquisition scene was
transformed int o a  public hearing i n which Joan sa t with he r bac k t o the
theatre audienc e facin g a  pane l tha t presente d it s question s ove r micro -
phones in a conversational tone and included references to ethnic cleansing
in th e forme r Yugoslavia ; tw o bank s o f fou r larg e monitor s provide d a
close-up pictur e o f Joan' s fac e an d compelle d spectator s t o follo w he r
emotional journe y a s thoug h seate d a t hom e befor e thei r ow n televisio n
sets. Only in the epilogue did the production return to Shaw's time scheme
with its medieval dress and its single 192 0 emissary, an effect enhance d by
an audienc e conditione d t o se e th e present-da y relevanc e o f Joan' s final
prayer " O Go d tha t mades t thi s beautifu l earth , when wil l i t b e ready t o
receive Thy saints? How long, O Lord, how long?"

325



Cambridge Companions Online © Cambridge University Press, 2006

ROBERT G . EVERDIN G

29 Updatin g Shaw with modern media: Troy Skog as an English Soldier and Mary Haney
as Joan in the Shaw Festival's 1993 production of Saint Joan

This production's effor t t o guide the spectator t o discover the source of
today's tragic world situatio n in his or her own lack of faith an d imagina -
tion succeeded with at least one patron. During the inquisition scene at one
performance, a n audienc e member ros e to hi s feet an d shoute d angril y a t
the investigating panel , "What are you people trying to do? What ar e you
trying t o say? " The acto r playin g th e chie f investigato r bange d hi s gavel
and called fo r order , and the play continued withou t furthe r interruption .
For that viewer, Shaw's word touched a contemporary nerve.

There hav e been othe r effort s t o create a n annual Sha w festival , on e of
which I  bega n i n 197 9 a t th e Universit y o f Houston-Clea r Lake . Th e
Houston Sha w Festiva l wa s locate d i n a  suburba n are a midwa y betwee n
Houston an d Galveston . Th e festival' s missio n wa s t o highligh t Shaw' s
contemporary relevance , and its commitment was to produce the complete
canon befor e repeatin g an y script . This mission guided bot h th e festival' s
play selectio n an d directoria l approach , fo r eac h seaso n sough t t o brin g
Shaw's insights to bear upon issues relevant to the lives of the community.
Fortunately Shaw' s play s ar e richl y texture d an d allo w multipl e perspec -
tives. While I preferred t o keep the plays in period, my casting and staging
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30 Updatin g Shaw with modern media: Michael Ball as Cauchon and Barry MacGregor
as The Inquisitor in the Shaw Festival's 1993 production of Saint Joan

decisions moved to the foreground thos e textual elements that underscored
that season' s them e whil e allowin g th e remainde r o f Shaw' s ideologica l
composition t o resonat e i n th e background . I n 1983 , fo r example , th e
festival stage d Misalliance  and Fanny's  First Play in orde r t o addres s th e
local community' s heightene d concer n ove r adolescen t behavior . Bot h
festival production s focuse d o n th e parent-chil d relationship s i n Shaw' s
texts and emphasized the children's shared predicament and the contrasting
manners i n whic h th e parent s (especially , th e fathers ) respon d t o thei r
rebellious offspring. The directorial intent was to focus audience perception
on thi s aspec t o f th e play s an d thereb y allo w Sha w t o contribut e t o th e
discussion of a current social problem.

The festival' s initia l summe r seaso n consiste d o f twelv e repertor y per -
formances o f Getting  Married and Arms  and  the Man. A discussion wit h
the audience followed eac h performance, an d special activities occurred on
July 2 6 to commemorat e Shaw' s birthday . Subsequen t season s wer e buil t
around Shaw' s view s o n variou s subject s -  religio n (Major  Barbara and
Androcles and the  Lion),  happines s (Heartbreak  House and Too  True  to
Be Good),  marriage (Candida  and The  Philanderer),  childrearin g (Misal-
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liance and Fanny's First Play), the human will (You Never Can Tell, Village
Wooing, The Man of Destiny).

The season that focused on religion engendered considerable controversy
in large part because Shaw's ideas clashed so directly with one of the most
pervasive an d entrenche d valu e system s o f th e America n south , Chris -
tianity. A t th e tim e ther e wa s considerabl e medi a attentio n give n t o th e
exodus from mainstream religions and the search for spiritual fulfillment i n
various eastern theologies and sects. I felt Shaw had insights to offer abou t
this sociological trend, and I selected a season that highlighted his religious
views. M y progra m essa y sough t t o ai d th e audienc e t o vie w th e play' s
action i n term s o f thei r worl d rathe r tha n th e Edwardia n on e i n whic h
Shaw set the piece. I cited Shaw' s preface commen t to Major Barbara that
"Creeds must become intellectually honest . At present there is not a  single
credible establishe d religio n i n th e world . Tha t i s perhap s th e mos t
stupendous fact in the whole world situation," and then appended my own
observation tha t "w e ar e stil l searchin g fo r a  relevan t cree d -  on e tha t
actively confront s th e world' s miseries , on e tha t welcome s change s a s
realities change, one that makes of religion a lifelong obligation rather than
a once-a-week diversion. " Not al l of our audienc e were ready to conside r
the fault s o f Christianit y le t alone a  humanistic substitute calle d "th e Lif e
Force." At two different performance s audienc e members exited during the
Salvation Arm y scene , a  particularl y visibl e for m o f protes t give n th e
production's intimat e thrus t staging . Th e post-performanc e discussion s
were th e mos t vociferou s o f m y tim e a t th e festival . On e evenin g th e
talkback sessio n lasted almos t a n hour i n an often heate d debat e over the
flaws and viability of contemporary religion . Were Shaw in attendance, he
would hav e delighte d a t th e unrul y spectacl e althoug h undoubtedl y h e
would have also plunged into and dominated the discussion.

Like Doherty, I  formed m y first company fro m communit y actor s as an
initial ste p in the creation o f a  resident professiona l company . The artisti c
director an d desig n staf f wer e faculty members . In 198 5 actor s were paid
and i n 198 8 the first Equity actor s appeared . Tw o years late r th e festiva l
became a n Equit y 1 1 small professiona l theatre . Durin g thi s perio d th e
audiences grew , necessitating a  mov e fro m th e University' s smalle r aren a
theatre int o it s 500-sea t auditorium . Unfortunately , th e Universit y an -
nounced th e terminatio n o f it s theatr e progra m afte r th e festival' s 199 2
season an d thereb y brough t a n en d t o th e Housto n Sha w Festiva l afte r
thirteen seasons.

Actor Montgomery Davis created a moveable, urban, non-summer Shaw
festival i n 198 3 whe n h e presented production s o f Don  Juan in Hell and
Dear Liar  a s par t o f hi s Milwauke e Chambe r Theatre' s season . Thi s
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professional company' s name derives from it s initial existence as a touring
group tha t performe d i n variou s intimate , informa l spaces . I n 199 3 i t
established residenc e i n th e 360-sea t Broadwa y Theatr e Cente r wher e i t
offers eac h winte r a  four-week Sha w festiva l o f som e twenty-four perfor -
mances a s par t o f it s subscriptio n season . Eac h festiva l examine s a
contemporary theme through the staging of one or more Shaw plays as well
as non-Shavian work s tha t provid e a  perspective o n tha t theme . In 1989 ,
for instance , the season explored the Irish question through its productions
of John Bull's Other Island, O'Flaherty VC, The Admirable Bashville, and
Ray Hutchison' s powerfu l 198 4 dram a Rat  in  the Skull. Recently festiva l
alumni forme d a  fringe troup e tha t enhance d th e festiva l b y presenting a
bill of short plays by Shaw and his contemporaries. The festival also has an
active educational componen t includin g public lectures, panel discussions ,
audience talkbac k sessions , and a  school outreach program . Including the
1997 season, the company has staged a total of twenty-six of Shaw's plays,
and Davi s announce d tha t h e plan s t o produc e th e complet e Back  to
Methuselah for the millennium year.

The 1989 season with its focus on the Irish question provides an example
of how this festival emphasize s the contemporaneousness o f Shaw's plays.
The festival joined three Shaw plays about Ireland with a 1984 drama in an
examination o f the historical attitudes that are embedded in the individual
Irish an d Britis h consciousnes s an d fue l today' s antagonis m an d violence .
John Bull's Other Island provided insigh t into what Shaw viewed from hi s
historical contex t a s the incompatibl e nationa l characte r o f an d mutuall y
exploitative relationship between the two nations. The Admirable Bashville
offered a  satiri c loo k a t th e disturbin g disjunctio n betwee n th e Britis h
attitude towar d boxin g a s a  spor t an d a s a n aggressiv e habit , whil e
O'Flaherty VC  capture d Ireland' s deepl y seate d suspicio n an d hatre d o f
England. Fro m thes e perspectives , th e spectato r woul d hopefull y se e th e
deeply embedde d attitude s tha t underli e an d motivat e th e ac t o f polic e
brutality a t the center of Ron Hutchinson's penetrating drama and thereby
understand mor e full y th e complexit y o f th e moder n Iris h troubles . Thi s
process wa s enhance d b y a  publi c lectur e an d radi o call-i n progra m
presented b y Tom Hadden, a  criminologist fro m Norther n Irelan d an d the
founder o f a  politica l periodica l i n Belfast , wh o brough t togethe r th e
various thread s o f Englis h colonialism , religiou s prejudice , an d terroris m
that appeared i n the four plays . These issues then served as the flashpoints
for the post-production talkback sessions with the audience.

It is now almost a half century since Shaw's death, and today he remains
popular through many of the same avenues by which he reached audiences
in the 1950s. In the present decade star-vehicle revivals have included Mary
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Steenburgen appearin g as Candida an d bot h Imogen Stubbs and Maryan n
Plunkett a s Sain t Joan . Heartbreak  House  returne d agai n t o London' s
Haymarket Theatre with a cast of Paul Scofield, Vanessa Redgrave, Felicity
Kendal, Imoge n Stubbs , Danie l Massey , an d Davi d Calder . Don  Juan  in
Hell was presente d i n a  199 1 Lo s Angele s readin g (Ricard o Montalban ,
David Carradine,  Lyn n Redgrave , an d Stewar t Granger ) an d th e 199 2
"Second Drama Quartet" (Harry Yulin, Rene Auberjonois, Judith Ivey, and
Ed Asner), which undertoo k a n extensive nationwide tou r befor e openin g
in New York where Dianne Wiest replaced Judith Ivey; Laughton's experi-
ment als o returne d i n 199 3 t o Carnegi e Hal l (Weil l Recita l Hall ) wher e
literary luminarie s Ga y Talese , Gor e Vidal , Susa n Sontag , an d Norma n
Mailer (Kur t Vonnegu t wa s originall y cas t bu t becam e ill ) provide d a
reading a s a benefit fo r th e Actors Studio with ticket s priced betwee n five
hundred and one thousand dollars . Dear Liar appeared off-Broadway wit h
Julie Harri s an d Alvi n Epstein , whil e Done l Donnell y performe d My
Astonishing Self frequently, includin g visits to the Canadian Shaw Festival
and th e Librar y o f Congress' s celebratio n o f Shaw' s 125t h birthday . Ne w
off-Broadway biographica l play s include d Mart y Martin' s Shaviana
(1993), which explored Shaw's adolescent years in Ireland, and Jesse Torn's
George Bernard and Stella (1994), which presented stil l another version of
the Shaw-Campbell relationship.

My Fair  Lady  experienced continua l reviva l during the 1990 s including
two majo r professiona l productions , one in England starrin g Edward Fo x
and the other in the United States featuring Richar d Chamberlain . In 1993
America issue d a  postage stamp honoring My  Fair  Lady,  while during the
following yea r Warner Brother s celebrated th e musical' s thirtiet h anniver -
sary by releasing a restored version of the film. There were also new attempts
to musicalize Shaw' s plays: Goodspeed Oper a Hous e an d th e Grea t Lak e
Shakespeare Festival both staged Blanco!,  music and lyrics written by Skip
Kennon; The Admirable Bashville (adapted by Charles Marowitz) premiered
at the Texas Stage Company; drama critic Benedict Nightingale and director
Tony Branch completed a  new musical version of You  Never Can Tell; and
the Colleg e o f Mari n (California ) premiere d Wings  of  Fire,  a musica l
adaptation of Saint Joan created by Patsy Garlan and Nicholas Scarim.

Shaw has also remained popular with cinema, radio, and television audi-
ences. While the major studio s long ago lost interes t i n Shaw, Pygmalion,
Caesar and Cleopatra,  an d Androcles  and  the  Lion  remai n particula r
favorites a t film festivals an d o n television . Britis h broadcas t medi a hav e
aired new productions of Shaw's plays as well as biographical specials such
as the 199 3 BB C production o f "Miste r Shaw' s Missing Billions" starring
IanMcKellen.
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In 190 5 Sha w wrot e t o a n acto r tha t " a par t tha t i s any goo d ca n b e
played fift y differen t way s b y fift y differen t people." 24 Thi s observatio n
accounts in large measure for Shaw' s post-1950 popularity because , as the
previous listing s o f theatrica l luminarie s illustrates , actor s hav e readil y
embraced bot h Shaw' s role s an d th e person a o f Sha w himsel f a s sta r
vehicles. Whethe r o n stag e o r televisio n o r recordings , performer s hav e
turned to his extraordinary gallery of characters as resources for displayin g
their talen t an d enlargin g thei r professiona l reputations . On e byproduc t
has been a  considerable expansio n o f a  Shavian audienc e tha t ha s discov-
ered and enjoyed th e witty old Irishman and raised him to the status of a
theatrical icon . This general popularity has rested, however, on a reductive
view o f th e playwright . I t wa s a s thoug h tw o Shaw s existed : th e comi c
genius wh o entertaine d an d mad e u s laugh , an d th e socia l gadfl y wh o
shocked an d mad e u s think . Popula r cultur e wante d onl y th e compellin g
stories an d th e benig n humor ; henc e i t reshape d hi s plays , simplifie d hi s
ideas and romanticized hi s life. However, to the same degree that commer-
cial enterprise s sough t t o capitaliz e o n Sha w fo r thei r ow n ends , Sha w
sought t o capitaliz e o n th e mas s audienc e fo r hi s sociopolitica l aims . He
battled to maintain the complete Shaw by blocking unworthy projects an d
insisting that productions link laughter to insight. As the fate of Pygmalion
suggests, though , th e powe r o f th e popula r wil l ca n b e overwhelming .
Today th e tensio n betwee n th e complet e Sha w an d th e popula r versio n
continues, for each new production begin s with a decision about its raison
d'etre. Som e venture s simpl y celebrat e th e ico n o f th e witt y an d enter -
taining ol d man; other production s discove r tha t th e icon has penetratin g
eyes and a  knowing smile. It is at these moments that Shaw again uses the
popular contex t fo r hi s purpose s an d thereb y continue s t o enric h ou r
culture and influence our lives.
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